
SHITAO

6r), as the Shunzhi emperor, accompanied by the appoint-
ment of Hong Taiji's younger brother, Dorgon (r 6r 2-50),
as regent.

APPENDIX ONE

Chronology of Shitao's Life

References are given here only for information that is not
presented elsewhere in this book in fuller form (especially
in Chapters 4-6) and accessible through the index. Here,
as throughout this study, years refer to Chinese lunar
years. Most of the places mentioned can be found on
Map 3. Where an existing artwork contradicts the dates
given here for the use of specific signatures and seals, this
will generally mean that I am not convinced of the work's
authenticity (though there will inevitably be cases of over-
sight or ignorance as well). With the existence and loca-
tion in mainland Chinese libraries of rare publications
and manuscripts by no less than thirty-six of his friends
and acquaintances newly established, providing a rich
new vein for biographical research, and with new works
by Shitao regularly coming to light, this chronology must
be considered provisional)

220. "Plum Blossom Branch," Flowers, dated 1707, album of 10
leaves, ink or ink and color on paper, each leaf 32.7 x 23.5 ern, leaf
2. © Sotheby's,Inc.

r642
Shitao was born into the family of the Ming princes of
Jingjiang, under the name of Zhu Ruoji. His father was
probably a relative of Zhu Hengjia, the prince of jing-
jiang. Although the Jingjiang palace was in the city of
Guilin in the southwestern province of Guangxi, Shitao
always identified himself in later life as a native of Quan-
zhou, some seventy miles to the northeast of Guilin.

point of breaking (Figure 220). Ultimately, Shitao's rest-
less search for closure contradicts his stated purpose.
The restlessness itself, the constant displacements, are
far more eloquent; for this is not solitary survival in the
mythic light of destiny, which could at least find its term,
hut the urban survivor's response to an isolation that
persisted into the liminality of dying.

r643
Death of the founder of the Manchu Qing dynasty, Hong
Taiji, and ascension of his five-year-old son, Fulin (r638-

r644
Fall of Beijing to the Shun regime of Li Zicheng, followed
shortly after by their abandonment of Beijing to Qing
forces. Dorgon proclaimed Qing rule over China in the
name of the Shunzhi emperor, who shortly after was
brought to Beijing. In south China, resistance to the Man-
chus crystallized around different claimants to the Ming
throne, whose regimes are collectively known as the
Southern Ming.

r645
Fall of Nanjing to Qing forces. In Guilin in the ninth
month, Zhu Hengjia was attacked and defeated by forces
of the Southern Ming Longwu emperor, Zhu Yujian,
under the command of Qu Shisi, and taken to Fuzhou,
where he later died in prison. The attack involved a mas-
sacre of the Jingjiang princely family, from which the
small child Shitao was saved by a retainer who smuggled
him to safety, the two subsequently taking refuge within
the Buddhist sangha.

r650
Death of Dorgon and assumption of power by the Shun-
zhi emperor himself.

323
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165I
By this year at latest, Shitao was living with his protector
in a temple in the city of Wuchang in Hubei, where they
took the names, respectively, of Yuanji Shitao and Yuan-
liang Hetao. Shitao subsequently referred to Hetao as his
"elder brother," while Herao called Shitao his "younger
brother."

According to Li Lin's Dadizi zbuan (hereafter DDZZ),
Shitao only started to read in this year, at the age of ten,
having begun by collecting (illustrated?) books.

1652-1654

Based in Wuchang. Although somewhat ambiguous, the
account in DDZZ would seem to suggest that he began
to study calligraphy around this time, after learning to
read and before learning to paint.

1655
Based in Wuchang. According to a later inscription, Shi-
tao had begun to study painting by the age of fourteen,
when he produced (an album of) fifty-six orchid paint-
ings. His first teacher (of orchids and bamboo) was a for-
mer Qing magistrate, Chen Yidao (1647 jinshi, d. 1661),
who would later return to official service. Orher artists
with whom he studied informally, possibly during his Wu-
chang sojourn (through c. 1663), include the local Wu-
chang artist Pan Xiaochi; the seal carver, calligrapher, and
Buddhist layman Liang Hong, from nearby Yunmeng;
and the monk-painter Chaoren Luzi, from Sichuan Prov-
Ince.

Based in Wuchang.

1657
Based in Wuchang. Probably early in this year, he made
a journey that took him south via Lake Dongting, where
he visited the Yueyang Tower, into Hunan Province, via
Changsha to Mount Heng. His earliest surviving poems
date from this year.

1658
Based in Wuchang.

Based in Wuchang.

In Zhejiang, Muchen Daomin (1596-1674), a leading
Chan abbot belonging to the Tiantong lineage of the Lin-
ji School, contradicted his earlier Ming loyalist stance by
accepted an invitation from the Shunzhi emperor to go to
Beijing. Muchen's entourage included his disciple Li.i'an
Benyue (d. 1676). When Muchen returned south later the
same year, Lu'an stayed behind.

1660

Based in Wuchang.

1661 before year's end. Over the next few years they would re-
side in several different area temples and monasteries.Based in Wuchang.

Following the death of the Shunzhi emperor from small-
pox, Lu'an returned south, establishing himself at Qing-
pu near Songjiang in southern Jiangsu Province.

1667
Based in Xuancheng, but also sojourned in Shexian,

In Xuancheng, probably in this year, Shitao joined a "po-
etry and painting society" organized by leading Xu an-
cheng literati, including Shi Runzhang (1618-83), Gao
Yong (b. 1622), Mei Qing (1623-97), Wu Sugong (1626-
99), and Mei Geng (1640-<:' 1722).

He also climbed Mount Huang in Huizhou Prefecture for
the first time, commemorating the experience in a impor-
tant hanging scroll (see Figure 158). While staying on the
mountain, he was contacted by the newly appointed pre-
fect, Cao Dingwang (1618-93), who commissioned from
him an album of seventy-two views of Mount Huang (see
Figure 85). In Shexian (Xin'an), which was the major
town of Huizhou Prefecture, Shitao then stayed at Luo-
han Temple within the Taiping Monastery complex as the
guest of the prefect. Cao commissioned him to paint a
handscroll depicting The Sixteen Luohans to commemo-
rate his restoration of the temple, which Shitao completed
after more than a year's work (see Figures ISS, 156). The
merchant families of Huizhou Prefecture, based there and
elsewhere in China, were to prove to be the mainstay of
Shitao's patronage throughout his life.

Signatures and seals:He signed The Sixteen Luobans for-
mally as "grandson" of Muchen Daomin and "son" of
Lu'an Benyue.

1662

Based in Wuchang.

Xuanye (1654-1722) ascended to the throne as the Kang-
xi emperor, but due to his youth political power was exer-
cised by a regency under the leadership of Oboi. Also in
this year, the last of the claimants to the Ming throne was
executed in Yunnan, ending the Southern Ming resis-
tance.

1663
Probably based in Wuchang.

1664
It was most likely sometime in late 1663 or early 1664
that Shitao left Wuchang accompanied by Hetao. Faced,
as Shitao later wrote, with the choice between moving to
Chu (i.e., Hunan, where there was a community of Ming
loyalist monks belonging to the Tiantong branch of the
Linji School) or traveling on to Wu (southern Jiangsu,
where Lu'an was based at Qingpu) in the southeast, the
two men chose the latter course. They traveled first to
Mount Lu in Jiangxi, where they sojourned at the Kaixian
Monastery (with which Muchen had previously been con-
nected) in 1664. An important autobiographical album
now in the Guangdong Provincial Museum may have
been painted during this sojourn, making it Shirao's earli-
est known surviving work (see Figures 47, 48,173)'

Death of the painter Hongren (1610-64).

Signatures and seals: In his signatures to the twelve leaves
of the Guangdong album, Shitao uses only three names,
which he would continue to use for the rest of his life: Shi-
tao, Shitao Ji, and Xiaocheng Ke (guest of Hinayana). He
also uses three seals, which again would be lifelong com-
panions: the double seal reading "Yuanji Shitao" and sin-
gle seals reading "lao Tao" (old Tao) and "famen" (gate
of the Law).

1668

Based in Xuancheng, but also sojourned in Shexian at the
Taiping Monastery.

1669
Based in Xuancheng, but also visited Shexian and Jing-
xian. In this year he climbed Mount Bogui near Xuan-
cheng (STSHQ], no. 12, leaf 7), and in the ninth month
climbed Mount Huang for the second time accompanied
by Cao Fen, the son of Cao Dingwang. Also in this year,
after three years of intermittent effort he stopped work
on a second version of The Sixteen Luohans, which he
subsequently kept in his own possession.

End of the Oboi Regency, marked by Oboi's arrest and
the Kangxi emperor's assumption of power at age fifteen.

1665
In late 1664 or early 1665 Shitao and Hetao continued
on to Qingpu, where they were accepted as disciples of
Lu'an Benyue. However, Lu'an did not detain them in
Qingpu, requiring them instead to see more of the world
(specifically, that of Jiangnan).

1670
Based in Xuancheng. During this year or the nexr, Shitao
(and Hetao?) took over responsibility for Guangjiao
Temple and its ongoing restoration program.

1666

Their travels, which may have begun as early as 1665,
took them through southern Jiangsu (including Suzhou)
and Zhejiang (including Hangzhou), before they moved
west into southern Anhui, probably reaching Xuancheng

1671

Based in Xuancheng at Guangjiao Temple. He painted a
set of twelve hanging scrolls on silk for Cao Dingwang's
birthday (see Figure 159).

1672
Based in Xuancheng at Guangjiao Temple.

1673
Based in Xuancheng at Guangjiao Temple. His friendship
with the Wu family of Xi' nan in Shexian (many of whom
were lay Buddhists), which was to supply him with pa-
trons for the rest of his life, began no later than this year,
when Wu Zhenbo was also sojourning in Xuancheng.

This year saw the first of a series of annual journeys back
to Jiangsu, where Muchen and Lii'an were both based.
During this first trip he stayed at one point at the Jinghui
Monastery in Yangzhou, closely associated with Muchen,
who was then living in Zhenjiang (on the opposite bank
of the Yangzi, facing Yangzhou) and was in failing health.
In Yangzhou, Shitao painted a hanging scroll for a lead-
ing salt merchant of Huizhou origin, Min Shizhang.

Cao Dingwang left his Shexian post in this year. In the last
days of the year, the Rebellion of the Three Feudatories
broke out, seriously threatening the existence of the Qing
dynasty.

Death of the painter Kuncan (1612--<:.1673) at Chang-
gan (also known as Bao'en) Monastery in Nanjing.

1674
Based in Xuancheng at Guangjiao Temple. The rebellion
reached its height in the summer and fall of this year; in
the Xuancheng area a peasant rebellion led Shitao to flee
into the nearby hills at Mount Bogui. His involvement in
the restoration of Guangjiao Temple was commemorated
in this year's Master Shi Planting Pines (see Plate I, Figure
53), painted by Shitao himself, probably in collaboration
with an unidentified portraitist.

Death of Muchen in the sixth month.

1675
Based in Xuancheng at Guangjiao Temple, but made one
journey to the Songjiang area, where Lii'an was based at
Qingpu.

1676
Based in Xuancheng at Guangjiao Temple. In the spring
Shitao again visited Jingxian - this time as a guest of the
recently appointed prefect, Deng Qifen (served 1674-81)
- and stayed there through part of the summer. Later in
the summer (?) he climbed Mount Huang for the third
and last time. In the tenth month he traveled once more
to Jiangsu Province. Though the only trace of his journey
places him in Yangzhou, Lii'an's death that autumn sug-
gests that Shitao may have gone on to Qingpu as well.

Death of Lii'an.

1677
Based in Xuancheng at Guangjiao Temple. In or before
this year the repairs to the temple were completed. In the
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165I
By this year at latest, Shitao was living with his protector
in a temple in the city of Wuchang in Hubei, where they
took the names, respectively, of Yuanji Shitao and Yuan-
liang Hetao. Shitao subsequently referred to Hetao as his
"elder brother," while Herao called Shitao his "younger
brother."

According to Li Lin's Dadizi zbuan (hereafter DDZZ),
Shitao only started to read in this year, at the age of ten,
having begun by collecting (illustrated?) books.

1652-1654

Based in Wuchang. Although somewhat ambiguous, the
account in DDZZ would seem to suggest that he began
to study calligraphy around this time, after learning to
read and before learning to paint.

1655
Based in Wuchang. According to a later inscription, Shi-
tao had begun to study painting by the age of fourteen,
when he produced (an album of) fifty-six orchid paint-
ings. His first teacher (of orchids and bamboo) was a for-
mer Qing magistrate, Chen Yidao (1647 jinshi, d. 1661),
who would later return to official service. Orher artists
with whom he studied informally, possibly during his Wu-
chang sojourn (through c. 1663), include the local Wu-
chang artist Pan Xiaochi; the seal carver, calligrapher, and
Buddhist layman Liang Hong, from nearby Yunmeng;
and the monk-painter Chaoren Luzi, from Sichuan Prov-
Ince.

Based in Wuchang.

1657
Based in Wuchang. Probably early in this year, he made
a journey that took him south via Lake Dongting, where
he visited the Yueyang Tower, into Hunan Province, via
Changsha to Mount Heng. His earliest surviving poems
date from this year.

1658
Based in Wuchang.

Based in Wuchang.

In Zhejiang, Muchen Daomin (1596-1674), a leading
Chan abbot belonging to the Tiantong lineage of the Lin-
ji School, contradicted his earlier Ming loyalist stance by
accepted an invitation from the Shunzhi emperor to go to
Beijing. Muchen's entourage included his disciple Li.i'an
Benyue (d. 1676). When Muchen returned south later the
same year, Lu'an stayed behind.

1660

Based in Wuchang.

1661 before year's end. Over the next few years they would re-
side in several different area temples and monasteries.Based in Wuchang.

Following the death of the Shunzhi emperor from small-
pox, Lu'an returned south, establishing himself at Qing-
pu near Songjiang in southern Jiangsu Province.

1667
Based in Xuancheng, but also sojourned in Shexian,

In Xuancheng, probably in this year, Shitao joined a "po-
etry and painting society" organized by leading Xu an-
cheng literati, including Shi Runzhang (1618-83), Gao
Yong (b. 1622), Mei Qing (1623-97), Wu Sugong (1626-
99), and Mei Geng (1640-<:' 1722).

He also climbed Mount Huang in Huizhou Prefecture for
the first time, commemorating the experience in a impor-
tant hanging scroll (see Figure 158). While staying on the
mountain, he was contacted by the newly appointed pre-
fect, Cao Dingwang (1618-93), who commissioned from
him an album of seventy-two views of Mount Huang (see
Figure 85). In Shexian (Xin'an), which was the major
town of Huizhou Prefecture, Shitao then stayed at Luo-
han Temple within the Taiping Monastery complex as the
guest of the prefect. Cao commissioned him to paint a
handscroll depicting The Sixteen Luohans to commemo-
rate his restoration of the temple, which Shitao completed
after more than a year's work (see Figures ISS, 156). The
merchant families of Huizhou Prefecture, based there and
elsewhere in China, were to prove to be the mainstay of
Shitao's patronage throughout his life.

Signatures and seals:He signed The Sixteen Luobans for-
mally as "grandson" of Muchen Daomin and "son" of
Lu'an Benyue.

1662

Based in Wuchang.

Xuanye (1654-1722) ascended to the throne as the Kang-
xi emperor, but due to his youth political power was exer-
cised by a regency under the leadership of Oboi. Also in
this year, the last of the claimants to the Ming throne was
executed in Yunnan, ending the Southern Ming resis-
tance.

1663
Probably based in Wuchang.

1664
It was most likely sometime in late 1663 or early 1664
that Shitao left Wuchang accompanied by Hetao. Faced,
as Shitao later wrote, with the choice between moving to
Chu (i.e., Hunan, where there was a community of Ming
loyalist monks belonging to the Tiantong branch of the
Linji School) or traveling on to Wu (southern Jiangsu,
where Lu'an was based at Qingpu) in the southeast, the
two men chose the latter course. They traveled first to
Mount Lu in Jiangxi, where they sojourned at the Kaixian
Monastery (with which Muchen had previously been con-
nected) in 1664. An important autobiographical album
now in the Guangdong Provincial Museum may have
been painted during this sojourn, making it Shirao's earli-
est known surviving work (see Figures 47, 48,173)'

Death of the painter Hongren (1610-64).

Signatures and seals: In his signatures to the twelve leaves
of the Guangdong album, Shitao uses only three names,
which he would continue to use for the rest of his life: Shi-
tao, Shitao Ji, and Xiaocheng Ke (guest of Hinayana). He
also uses three seals, which again would be lifelong com-
panions: the double seal reading "Yuanji Shitao" and sin-
gle seals reading "lao Tao" (old Tao) and "famen" (gate
of the Law).

1668

Based in Xuancheng, but also sojourned in Shexian at the
Taiping Monastery.

1669
Based in Xuancheng, but also visited Shexian and Jing-
xian. In this year he climbed Mount Bogui near Xuan-
cheng (STSHQ], no. 12, leaf 7), and in the ninth month
climbed Mount Huang for the second time accompanied
by Cao Fen, the son of Cao Dingwang. Also in this year,
after three years of intermittent effort he stopped work
on a second version of The Sixteen Luohans, which he
subsequently kept in his own possession.

End of the Oboi Regency, marked by Oboi's arrest and
the Kangxi emperor's assumption of power at age fifteen.

1665
In late 1664 or early 1665 Shitao and Hetao continued
on to Qingpu, where they were accepted as disciples of
Lu'an Benyue. However, Lu'an did not detain them in
Qingpu, requiring them instead to see more of the world
(specifically, that of Jiangnan).

1670
Based in Xuancheng. During this year or the nexr, Shitao
(and Hetao?) took over responsibility for Guangjiao
Temple and its ongoing restoration program.

1666

Their travels, which may have begun as early as 1665,
took them through southern Jiangsu (including Suzhou)
and Zhejiang (including Hangzhou), before they moved
west into southern Anhui, probably reaching Xuancheng

1671

Based in Xuancheng at Guangjiao Temple. He painted a
set of twelve hanging scrolls on silk for Cao Dingwang's
birthday (see Figure 159).

1672
Based in Xuancheng at Guangjiao Temple.

1673
Based in Xuancheng at Guangjiao Temple. His friendship
with the Wu family of Xi' nan in Shexian (many of whom
were lay Buddhists), which was to supply him with pa-
trons for the rest of his life, began no later than this year,
when Wu Zhenbo was also sojourning in Xuancheng.

This year saw the first of a series of annual journeys back
to Jiangsu, where Muchen and Lii'an were both based.
During this first trip he stayed at one point at the Jinghui
Monastery in Yangzhou, closely associated with Muchen,
who was then living in Zhenjiang (on the opposite bank
of the Yangzi, facing Yangzhou) and was in failing health.
In Yangzhou, Shitao painted a hanging scroll for a lead-
ing salt merchant of Huizhou origin, Min Shizhang.

Cao Dingwang left his Shexian post in this year. In the last
days of the year, the Rebellion of the Three Feudatories
broke out, seriously threatening the existence of the Qing
dynasty.

Death of the painter Kuncan (1612--<:.1673) at Chang-
gan (also known as Bao'en) Monastery in Nanjing.

1674
Based in Xuancheng at Guangjiao Temple. The rebellion
reached its height in the summer and fall of this year; in
the Xuancheng area a peasant rebellion led Shitao to flee
into the nearby hills at Mount Bogui. His involvement in
the restoration of Guangjiao Temple was commemorated
in this year's Master Shi Planting Pines (see Plate I, Figure
53), painted by Shitao himself, probably in collaboration
with an unidentified portraitist.

Death of Muchen in the sixth month.

1675
Based in Xuancheng at Guangjiao Temple, but made one
journey to the Songjiang area, where Lii'an was based at
Qingpu.

1676
Based in Xuancheng at Guangjiao Temple. In the spring
Shitao again visited Jingxian - this time as a guest of the
recently appointed prefect, Deng Qifen (served 1674-81)
- and stayed there through part of the summer. Later in
the summer (?) he climbed Mount Huang for the third
and last time. In the tenth month he traveled once more
to Jiangsu Province. Though the only trace of his journey
places him in Yangzhou, Lii'an's death that autumn sug-
gests that Shitao may have gone on to Qingpu as well.

Death of Lii'an.

1677
Based in Xuancheng at Guangjiao Temple. In or before
this year the repairs to the temple were completed. In the
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summer he received the visit of a certain Zhong Lang
(r659 jinshi) from Zhejiang, who claimed to have known
Shitao's father when the latter served as a magistrate at
the end of the Ming. From the credence that Shitao initial-
ly gave to this account, it is clear that (a) he was not sure
who his father was and (b) he did not believe his father
to be Zhu Hengjia (who could not have occupied such a
position). Early in the autumn, he made another visit to
Jingxian, where he stayed at the Shuixi Academy. Later
that autumn he made the last of his annual journeys back
to Jiangsu, a dated poem placing him in Suzhou (STSHQj
r z, leaf 4).

1678
Based in Xuancheng through the spring.

At some point during his years in Xuancheng (r667-78)
he took on four painting students: Xiao Zipei, Li Yong-
gong, Xu Shangwen, and Liu Xuexi.

In the summer he accepted an invitation from Xitian
Monastery, located on the north side of Flower-Rain Ter-
race (Yuhua Tai) outside Nanjing's southern city wall.
On the way to Nanjing, he stopped off in Wuhu. He so-
journed in Nanjing, perhaps in the subtemple known as
Huaixie Pavilion - apparently without Hetao - through
the rest of 1678 and r679, into early r680.

1679
Based in Nanjing at Xitian Monastery. In the summer he
visited Yongshou Monastery at Lishui, some one hundred
li to the south of Nanjing, where his host was Zulin Yuan-
lin, from Shexian, another of Muchen's "grandsons."
This monastery would in the 1680s be directed by Zu'an,
whom Shitao had known in Xuancheng when the former
was a monk at the Qingxi Retreat (Qingxi An) on Mount
Xiang (Mingfu r978: 152, 157). Like Shitao and Zulin,
Zu'an was a thirty-sixth generation Linji monk.

Two of Shitao's Xuancheng friends, Shi Runzhang and
Gao Yang, were nominated for, and successful in, the spe-
cial boxue hongru examination of this year in Beijing.
Subsequently appointed to the Hanlin Academy, they
were assigned to work on the Ming History project.

1680

Shitao returned briefly to Xuancheng, gave up his affili-
ation with rhe Guangjiao Temple, and moved formally to
Nanjing. There, in the intercalary eighth month, he took
over from a friend, Weiqin, as the sole monk-in-charge
of a small retreat, the Single Branch Pavilion (Yizhi Ge).
The retreat was located within the precinct of the major
temple of the Qin-Huai area, the very important Chang-
gan (Bao'en) Monastery. Shitao commemorated the move
in a set of poems that he subsequently transcribed or il-
lustrated on several occasions. If Hetao did not accompa-
ny Shitao from Xuancheng, he followed him there before

the end of the year, settling in the nearby Xitian Mona-
stery. For the next three years (through 1682) Shitao con-
centrated on religious study. His friendships in this period
are dominated by Buddhist laymen (Zhang Zong, Tian
Lin [1643-1702 or later], Zhou Jing, various members of
the Wu family from Xi'nan in Huizhou) and monks (He-
tao, Zulin, Shuangxiao, Chengxue).

1686

Based in Nanjing at the Single Branch Pavilion. The first
mention of a planned trip to the capital dates from this
year (seventh month).

From 1680 to 1686 Shitao did not leave the Nanjing area.
During this period three monks from temples in the Qin-
Huai area studied painting with him: Suiyuan, Donglin,
and Xuetian.

1681

Based in Nanjing at the Single Branch Pavilion.

The Rebellion of the Three Feudatories was finally sup-
pressed.

1687
At the turn of the year Shitao moved to Yangzhou alone
in preparation for a journey to Beijing. Before leaving he
wrote a long autobiographical poem, "Song of My Life,"
as a farewell to his Nanjing friends. Herao appears to
have stayed in Nanjing at Xitian Monastery. Soon after
his arrival in Yangzhou, Shitao was introduced to the
city's major literati group, the Spring River Poetry Society,
where he met Yao Man, Wu Qi (1619-94), and Kong
Shangren (r648-I7I8), who was then based in Yangzhou
as a water-control official. That spring, Shitao set off for
Beijing but only got as far as the Grand Canal town of
Qingjiangpu in northern Jiangsu, where the canal meets
the Yellow River. There, it appears that hostile followers
of Muchen's rival, Yulin Tongxiu (1614-75), stole (and
destroyed?) his masterpiece of Buddhist painting, the sec-
ond version of The Sixteen Luohans handscroll, which he
had painted for himself in the late I660s. Shocked and
dejected, he returned to Yangzhou and based himself at
Dashu Tang, probably within the Jinghui Monastery.
Over the next two and a half years he would consolidate
his long-standing social and commercial connections with
Huizhou merchant families, which dominated the econ-
omy of the Yangzhou area.

1682

Based in Nanjing at the Single Branch Pavilion.

1683
By this year Shitao had become friendly with several
prominent Ming loyalists residing in or visiting the Nan-
jing area, including the painters Cheng Sui (1607-92) and
Dai Benxiao (I62r-93) and poets Du Jun (1611-87) and
WuJiaji (r6r8-84). At the same time, he also expressed
interest to a visiting official, Zheng Hushan, in using his
painting to attract imperial favor. His second attempt at
a major Buddhist composition, The Conversion of Hariti
to Buddhism (see Figure 163) was probably painted in
this year.

Signatures and seals: The seal reading "chenseng Yuanji"
(servitor-monk, Yuanji) is first found in an album of po-
etry and painting documenting many of the above friend-
ships that probably dates from the end of 1683 (Shang-
hai Museum).

1684
Based in Nanjing at the Single Branch Pavilion. On the
occasion of his first Southern Tour this year, Kangxi vis-
ited the Changgan Monastery in the eleventh month, an
event at which Shitao was present and was personally
addressed by the emperor. Shitao painted a number of
works in 1684 for Provincial Education Commissioner
Zhao Lun (1636-95), who served in Nanjing from 1682
to 1688, and his son Zhao Zisi (d. 1701).

Signatures and seals: Earliest appearance of the seal read-
ing "Seal of Yuanji, son of Shanguo Yue, grandson of
Tiantong Min" (colophon to Portrait of Ren'an, Metro-
politan Museum of Art).

1688

Based in Yangzhou at Dashu Tang. In the seventh month
he noted his continuing depression due to the theft of The
Sixteen Luohans. .

1689
Based in Yangzhon at Dashu Tang. On the occasion of
Kangxi's visit to Yangzhou in the second month, as part
of his second tour of the South, Shitao was granted an
imperial audience on the road between Pingshan Tang
and the city (see Figure 58). Later he visited temples on
the Yangzi River islands of jinshan and Jiaoshan in the
company of friends. At the end of the year he briefly vis-
ited Nanjing, staying at Xitian Monastery, presumably in
connection with the imminent realization of his long-
planned journey to the capital in search of imperial pa-
tronage; it is likely that he saw Hetao on this occasion.1685

Based in Nanjing at the Single Branch Pavilion. Early in
the year he made a long trip through the outskirts of Nan-
jing in search of plum blossom, documented in a series of
poems that he later often illustrated in paintings.

1690

Traveled to Beijing via the Grand Canal early in spring,
taking up residence in the Qiehan Studio of Wang Feng-

rong (d. 1703), a former vice minister in the Ministry of
Personnel then living in temporary retirement. He would
remain Wang's guest until the seventh month of the fol-
lowing year.

During his sojourn at the Qiehan Studio, he became well-
acquainted with at least two other high officials, receiving
painting commissions from both: Wang Zhi, then minis-
ter in the Ministry of Revenue, and Wang Zehong (1626-
1708), then vice minister in the Ministry of Rites. He also
frequented Manchu aristocrats, notably Bordu (1649-
1708), a great-grandson of the founder of the Qing dy-
nasty, Nurhaci, who became the first of his painting stu-
dents in the capital. His friendship with Bordu's cousin
and close friend, the young Yueduan (r67I-I704), prob-
ably also dates from this time.

1691

In Beijing, in the Qiehan Studio. In the second month, he
painted a major landscape work for Wang Fengrong, Suo-
jin qifeng da caogao (Palace Museum, Beijing), which
bears an inscription hostile to the connoisseurs and taste-
makers of the capital. He also speaks there of his immi-
nent return to the South. A poem datable to 1691 sug-
gests that he had been made the offer of taking charge of
a minor temple in a small town or village in the North,
but he had turned it down.

Through Bordu's mediation, in the second month Shi-
tao undertook a collaborative work with Wang Yuanqi
(I642-r7r5), then serving in the capital as a censor and
much admired as a painter by Kangxi (see Figure 59). In
a similar collaborative work from I69r, Bordu asked
Wang Hui (1632-1717), who had just arrived at the cap-
ital to take charge of the project of depicting Kangxi's
second tour of the South, to complete Shitaos painting
(see Figure 60).

In the seventh month he moved from Wang Fengrong's
home to Ciyuan Temple (a subsidiary temple of Dabei
Monastery in Tianjin), located on the southern edge of
the southern section of Beijing, the "Chinese city." Dur-
ing that autumn, he received the visit ofTu Na, the Man-
chu minister of the Board of Justice. It was probably in
the wake of this visit that the minister's son, Tu Qingge,
became Shitao's second painting student at the capital.
Also in the autumn he sat for a formal portrait as a Chan
master by an unidentified artist, now known only through
a copy (see Figure 61); this work bears an inscription in-
dicating his willingness to remain in the capital in the
event of a suitably exceptional opportunity.

For the winter months, he moved to the Dabei Monastery
in Tianjin. As he arrived in Tianjin he met a monk (Ju-
hui) on his way to the capital, to whom he presented an
important autobiographical poetry manuscript in hand-
scroll form that gathers together several of his most ex-
plicit statements of ambition, apparently in the hope that
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summer he received the visit of a certain Zhong Lang
(r659 jinshi) from Zhejiang, who claimed to have known
Shitao's father when the latter served as a magistrate at
the end of the Ming. From the credence that Shitao initial-
ly gave to this account, it is clear that (a) he was not sure
who his father was and (b) he did not believe his father
to be Zhu Hengjia (who could not have occupied such a
position). Early in the autumn, he made another visit to
Jingxian, where he stayed at the Shuixi Academy. Later
that autumn he made the last of his annual journeys back
to Jiangsu, a dated poem placing him in Suzhou (STSHQj
r z, leaf 4).

1678
Based in Xuancheng through the spring.

At some point during his years in Xuancheng (r667-78)
he took on four painting students: Xiao Zipei, Li Yong-
gong, Xu Shangwen, and Liu Xuexi.

In the summer he accepted an invitation from Xitian
Monastery, located on the north side of Flower-Rain Ter-
race (Yuhua Tai) outside Nanjing's southern city wall.
On the way to Nanjing, he stopped off in Wuhu. He so-
journed in Nanjing, perhaps in the subtemple known as
Huaixie Pavilion - apparently without Hetao - through
the rest of 1678 and r679, into early r680.

1679
Based in Nanjing at Xitian Monastery. In the summer he
visited Yongshou Monastery at Lishui, some one hundred
li to the south of Nanjing, where his host was Zulin Yuan-
lin, from Shexian, another of Muchen's "grandsons."
This monastery would in the 1680s be directed by Zu'an,
whom Shitao had known in Xuancheng when the former
was a monk at the Qingxi Retreat (Qingxi An) on Mount
Xiang (Mingfu r978: 152, 157). Like Shitao and Zulin,
Zu'an was a thirty-sixth generation Linji monk.

Two of Shitao's Xuancheng friends, Shi Runzhang and
Gao Yang, were nominated for, and successful in, the spe-
cial boxue hongru examination of this year in Beijing.
Subsequently appointed to the Hanlin Academy, they
were assigned to work on the Ming History project.

1680

Shitao returned briefly to Xuancheng, gave up his affili-
ation with rhe Guangjiao Temple, and moved formally to
Nanjing. There, in the intercalary eighth month, he took
over from a friend, Weiqin, as the sole monk-in-charge
of a small retreat, the Single Branch Pavilion (Yizhi Ge).
The retreat was located within the precinct of the major
temple of the Qin-Huai area, the very important Chang-
gan (Bao'en) Monastery. Shitao commemorated the move
in a set of poems that he subsequently transcribed or il-
lustrated on several occasions. If Hetao did not accompa-
ny Shitao from Xuancheng, he followed him there before

the end of the year, settling in the nearby Xitian Mona-
stery. For the next three years (through 1682) Shitao con-
centrated on religious study. His friendships in this period
are dominated by Buddhist laymen (Zhang Zong, Tian
Lin [1643-1702 or later], Zhou Jing, various members of
the Wu family from Xi'nan in Huizhou) and monks (He-
tao, Zulin, Shuangxiao, Chengxue).

1686

Based in Nanjing at the Single Branch Pavilion. The first
mention of a planned trip to the capital dates from this
year (seventh month).

From 1680 to 1686 Shitao did not leave the Nanjing area.
During this period three monks from temples in the Qin-
Huai area studied painting with him: Suiyuan, Donglin,
and Xuetian.

1681

Based in Nanjing at the Single Branch Pavilion.

The Rebellion of the Three Feudatories was finally sup-
pressed.

1687
At the turn of the year Shitao moved to Yangzhou alone
in preparation for a journey to Beijing. Before leaving he
wrote a long autobiographical poem, "Song of My Life,"
as a farewell to his Nanjing friends. Herao appears to
have stayed in Nanjing at Xitian Monastery. Soon after
his arrival in Yangzhou, Shitao was introduced to the
city's major literati group, the Spring River Poetry Society,
where he met Yao Man, Wu Qi (1619-94), and Kong
Shangren (r648-I7I8), who was then based in Yangzhou
as a water-control official. That spring, Shitao set off for
Beijing but only got as far as the Grand Canal town of
Qingjiangpu in northern Jiangsu, where the canal meets
the Yellow River. There, it appears that hostile followers
of Muchen's rival, Yulin Tongxiu (1614-75), stole (and
destroyed?) his masterpiece of Buddhist painting, the sec-
ond version of The Sixteen Luohans handscroll, which he
had painted for himself in the late I660s. Shocked and
dejected, he returned to Yangzhou and based himself at
Dashu Tang, probably within the Jinghui Monastery.
Over the next two and a half years he would consolidate
his long-standing social and commercial connections with
Huizhou merchant families, which dominated the econ-
omy of the Yangzhou area.

1682

Based in Nanjing at the Single Branch Pavilion.

1683
By this year Shitao had become friendly with several
prominent Ming loyalists residing in or visiting the Nan-
jing area, including the painters Cheng Sui (1607-92) and
Dai Benxiao (I62r-93) and poets Du Jun (1611-87) and
WuJiaji (r6r8-84). At the same time, he also expressed
interest to a visiting official, Zheng Hushan, in using his
painting to attract imperial favor. His second attempt at
a major Buddhist composition, The Conversion of Hariti
to Buddhism (see Figure 163) was probably painted in
this year.

Signatures and seals: The seal reading "chenseng Yuanji"
(servitor-monk, Yuanji) is first found in an album of po-
etry and painting documenting many of the above friend-
ships that probably dates from the end of 1683 (Shang-
hai Museum).

1684
Based in Nanjing at the Single Branch Pavilion. On the
occasion of his first Southern Tour this year, Kangxi vis-
ited the Changgan Monastery in the eleventh month, an
event at which Shitao was present and was personally
addressed by the emperor. Shitao painted a number of
works in 1684 for Provincial Education Commissioner
Zhao Lun (1636-95), who served in Nanjing from 1682
to 1688, and his son Zhao Zisi (d. 1701).

Signatures and seals: Earliest appearance of the seal read-
ing "Seal of Yuanji, son of Shanguo Yue, grandson of
Tiantong Min" (colophon to Portrait of Ren'an, Metro-
politan Museum of Art).

1688

Based in Yangzhou at Dashu Tang. In the seventh month
he noted his continuing depression due to the theft of The
Sixteen Luohans. .

1689
Based in Yangzhon at Dashu Tang. On the occasion of
Kangxi's visit to Yangzhou in the second month, as part
of his second tour of the South, Shitao was granted an
imperial audience on the road between Pingshan Tang
and the city (see Figure 58). Later he visited temples on
the Yangzi River islands of jinshan and Jiaoshan in the
company of friends. At the end of the year he briefly vis-
ited Nanjing, staying at Xitian Monastery, presumably in
connection with the imminent realization of his long-
planned journey to the capital in search of imperial pa-
tronage; it is likely that he saw Hetao on this occasion.1685

Based in Nanjing at the Single Branch Pavilion. Early in
the year he made a long trip through the outskirts of Nan-
jing in search of plum blossom, documented in a series of
poems that he later often illustrated in paintings.

1690

Traveled to Beijing via the Grand Canal early in spring,
taking up residence in the Qiehan Studio of Wang Feng-

rong (d. 1703), a former vice minister in the Ministry of
Personnel then living in temporary retirement. He would
remain Wang's guest until the seventh month of the fol-
lowing year.

During his sojourn at the Qiehan Studio, he became well-
acquainted with at least two other high officials, receiving
painting commissions from both: Wang Zhi, then minis-
ter in the Ministry of Revenue, and Wang Zehong (1626-
1708), then vice minister in the Ministry of Rites. He also
frequented Manchu aristocrats, notably Bordu (1649-
1708), a great-grandson of the founder of the Qing dy-
nasty, Nurhaci, who became the first of his painting stu-
dents in the capital. His friendship with Bordu's cousin
and close friend, the young Yueduan (r67I-I704), prob-
ably also dates from this time.

1691

In Beijing, in the Qiehan Studio. In the second month, he
painted a major landscape work for Wang Fengrong, Suo-
jin qifeng da caogao (Palace Museum, Beijing), which
bears an inscription hostile to the connoisseurs and taste-
makers of the capital. He also speaks there of his immi-
nent return to the South. A poem datable to 1691 sug-
gests that he had been made the offer of taking charge of
a minor temple in a small town or village in the North,
but he had turned it down.

Through Bordu's mediation, in the second month Shi-
tao undertook a collaborative work with Wang Yuanqi
(I642-r7r5), then serving in the capital as a censor and
much admired as a painter by Kangxi (see Figure 59). In
a similar collaborative work from I69r, Bordu asked
Wang Hui (1632-1717), who had just arrived at the cap-
ital to take charge of the project of depicting Kangxi's
second tour of the South, to complete Shitaos painting
(see Figure 60).

In the seventh month he moved from Wang Fengrong's
home to Ciyuan Temple (a subsidiary temple of Dabei
Monastery in Tianjin), located on the southern edge of
the southern section of Beijing, the "Chinese city." Dur-
ing that autumn, he received the visit ofTu Na, the Man-
chu minister of the Board of Justice. It was probably in
the wake of this visit that the minister's son, Tu Qingge,
became Shitao's second painting student at the capital.
Also in the autumn he sat for a formal portrait as a Chan
master by an unidentified artist, now known only through
a copy (see Figure 61); this work bears an inscription in-
dicating his willingness to remain in the capital in the
event of a suitably exceptional opportunity.

For the winter months, he moved to the Dabei Monastery
in Tianjin. As he arrived in Tianjin he met a monk (Ju-
hui) on his way to the capital, to whom he presented an
important autobiographical poetry manuscript in hand-
scroll form that gathers together several of his most ex-
plicit statements of ambition, apparently in the hope that
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juhui would be helpful to his cause. Through a prominent
monk associated with the Dabei Monastery, Shitao met
two notable Tianjin patrons: the salt merchant and of-
ficial Zhang Lin (d. 1713) and his cousin, Zhang Zhu
(I659-1704).

1692
Shitao returned to Beijing early in the spring with the in-
tention of going back to Yangzhou, but in the end he did
not finally leave for the South until the eighth or ninth
month. His address at this point is not clear, but one sur-
viving painting from the third month was painted in Hai-
chao Temple, located close to Ciyuan Temple.

During the three years he spent in Beijing, Shitao was able
to see several important collections of paintings, includ-
ing those of Bordu, the late Yolo (Prince An, d. 1689,
father ofYueduan), and the late Geng Zhaozhong (I640-
86).

In the autumn, he left Beijing for the South, traveling by
boat along the Grand Canal. In a boat disaster, he lost
his luggage, including accumulated poems, books, and
scrolls.

Back in the South, stopping first in Yangzhou at Jinghui
Monastery, he then set off almost immediately to Nan-
jing, where he sojourned from the tenth month through
the winter of 1692, probably at Xitian Monastery. At this
time he again saw Herao, one of his friends in the South
with whom Shitao had kept in touch by letter during his
northern stay (another being Mei Qing in Xuancheng).

Death of Cheng Sui.

1693
Early in 1693 Shitao moved back to the Yangzhou area.
One of his first acts was to go on a long trip through the
area in search of plum blossom, commemorated in a set
of ninety poems, several of which he later repeatedly il-
lustrated in painting. Another was to take on a new paint-
ing student, a Chan "nephew," Chengchou Gengyin, who
was a follower of Yuanzhi Poyu, the abbot of Jinghui
Monastery. During the summer he can be placed first at
Yousheng Ge, possibly located on the estate of Wang Xue-
chen, a wealthy fellow-member of the Spring River Poetry
Society, and then at Yao Man's Wu Mountain Pavilion,
near Mount Ganquan, northeast of Yangzhou; he stayed
on there into the autumn. At Yousheng Ge he made the
acquaintance of a Chinese bannerman, Zhang Jingjie. By
winter he was back in Yangzhou at Dashu Tang.

Hetao was still alive in this year, inscribing a painting by
Kuncan (Shanghai Museum).

Dai Benxiao died in Nanjing.

1694
Based in the Yangzhou area. Through the spring he con-
tinued to live at Dashu Tang, returning to Wu Mountain

Pavilion in the summer. He spent the rest of the year back
in Yangzhou at the Jinghui Monastery.

Figure 73). He named his studio Dadi Tang in reference
to the Daoist site of Mount Dadi near Hangzhou, and
from this point on presented himself publicly as a Daoist.
In a poem from the spring, he also refers to a Green Lo-
tus Studio (an allusion to the Tang dynasry poet, Li Bai),
here referred to as Qinglian Xiaoge, and later variously
as Qinglian Ge, Qinglian Caoge, Qinglian Caotang.

Signatures and seals: During this year, he signed himself
on one occasion "Dadi Shanren" (poetry manuscript, dat-
able to the late spring or early summer of 1697, Guang-
zhou Art Gallery). In the eleventh month he signed him-
self "Dadizi Shanren" (see Figure 180). The seal "Tenth
Generation of Zan, Azhang" makes its first datable ap-
pearance on the above-mentioned poetry manuscript.

Death of Mei Qing in Xuancheng.

1695
Based in the Yangzhou area. Through the spring he con-
tinued to live at Jinghui Monastery; then, at the beginning
of the summer, he made a brief trip to Hefei in northern
Anhui at the invitation of the former minister Li Tianfu
(I635-99) and the local magistrate Zhang Chunxiu (a
Chinese bannerman). Upon his return, he spent the rest
of the summer in Yizheng, near Yangzhou, as the guest
of a merchant and art collector, Xu Songling. During this
summer he met another important friend and patron,
Huang You, for the first time, and also visited the mer-
chant Zheng Zhaoxin at his celebrated Yizheng estate,
River Village amid White Sand and Verdant Bamboo. He
made a trip back to Yangzhou in the autumn, staying
once more at Jinghui Monastery, but then returned to
Xu's estate in Yizheng, where he seems to have resided
continuously well into the following year.

1698
In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang. Shitao was ill during the win-
ter of 1697-8 and on into the spring. He first met his fu-
ture biographer, Li Lin, in the autumn of 1698. What was
probably the first version of his treatise on painting, en-
titled Huafa beiyuan (see Figure 185), was written (or at
least started) by this year at latest; he would produce sev-
eral other versions thereafter. These bear various names,
of which only Hua pu (Manual of Painting) is certainly
Shitao's own.

Signatures and seals:He first signs himself "Dadizi" in the
autumn of this year (see Figure I03). Although there are
no dated uses of the "Dadizi" seal before 1702, it too may
have come into use as early as this year (see Figure 176).
The earliest dated appearance of the signature "Qing-
xiang Chenren" is in the third month (see Figure 74)·

Death of Zha Shibiao (I615-98) in Yangzhou.

1696
After leaving Yizheng at the end of the spring, Shitao re-
sided briefly in Yangzhou before taking up an invitation
from the Huizhou scholar, economist, and merchant
ChengJun (I638-1704) to pass the summer at the Cheng
family home in Huizhou, where he created a major auto-
biographical handscroll, Calligraphies and Sketches by
Qingxiang (see Figure 72, Plate 2). Cheng jun's four sons
became Shitao's students at this time, with Cheng Ming
(I676-1743 or later) proving to be the most serious. By
the end of his stay, Shitao seems to have decided to leave
the Buddhist sangba. At summer's end he presumably
moved back to Yangzhou in preparation for establishing
his own residence; indeed, it is possible that he moved
into his new home even before the end of the year.

Signatures and seals: In an album datable to this year (see
Figure 67), Shitao signed himself "Dadi Zunzhe" (Abbot
of the Great Cleansing).

Shirao's first indirect contact with his distant cousin, Bada
Shanren (1626-1705), in Nanchang dates from this year.

1699
In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang. In the second month he paint-
ed an important album for a Qing official who may have
been the Nanjing Textile Commissioner, Cao Yin (I6 58-
f71 2). His friendship with three other important patrons
- Cheng Daoguang (Tuiweng), the salt merchant Jiang
Shidong (born c. 1658), and the young Hong Zhengzhi
(I674-1735), also from a Huizhou merchant family and
later a major salt merchant, who became his painting stu-
dent - began no later than this year. In the summer he
started a vegetable garden (probably next to the east wall
of the old city).

Signatures and seals: Two large seals, "yu jin wei shu wei
qingmen" (today a commoner and a poor man) and
"xiangnian Kugua" (Bitter Melon of former years), make
their earliest dated appearance in the second month (Plum
Blossom, hanging scroll, Shanghai Museum [ST 45J)·

In the spring Kangxi visited Yangzhou during his third
Southern Tour.

1697
In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang (Great Cleansing Hall). He
was ill in early I 697. During the spring, he visited a Han-
lin academician, Di Yi, who had come to the city from
Beijing. Direct contact with Bada Shanren (by letter) like-
ly dates from this year. Toward the end of the year he
completed an important commission from Bordu to copy
a handscroll by Qiu Ying, One Hundred Beauties.
Studio names: Shitao took up residence in a two-storied
house in the center of Yangzhou no later than the second
month of 1697, the date of the earliest document execut-
ed there (an inscription to a painting by Bada Shanren, see

I70a
In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang. Wu [ixian became his paint-
ing student no later than this year. On the last night of
the year, Shitao wrote an important series of autobio-
graphical poems that, along with a second group written
a few days later, have survived in the so-called Gengchen
Manuscript of Poems.
Signatures and seals: First dated appearance, in the tenth
month, of a large "Dadi Tang" seal (see Figure II3).

I70I

In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang. He was ill both early in the
year and in the autumn. In the fourth month his Manchu
student Tu Qingge came to Yangzhou and was visited by
Shitao at his lodgings in Tianning Monastery. In the au-
tumn Shitao visited Tu Qingge at Shaobo, to the north of
Yangzhou, where he was serving as an official.

Signatures and seals: The earliest dated use of the name
"Ruoji" is in a signature to a painting from this winter
(Shina nanga taisei 1935-7: vol. 3). The album he painted
for Tu Qingge at the time of the latter's visit to Yangzhou
includes the first appearances of "Lingding Laoren" (or-
phaned old man) as a seal and "Mengdong Sheng" (mud-
dle-headed man) as a signature. A "Mengdong Sheng"
seal is first found in the eleventh month (see Figure 203).

1702

In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang. During the early summer he
made a brief trip to Nanjing, where he visited the tomb
of the Ming founder and saw his old friend Tian Lin.
On present evidence this was his only trip outside the
Yangzhou area after he moved into Dadi Tang; the rea-
son for his visit is unknown (possibly the death of He-
tao?). In Yangzhou, Shitao's friendships with his patrons
Mr. Liu, the unknown owner (Mr. Huang) of Wanglii
Tang, and the unidentified Zheweng date from no later
than 1702.

Signatures and seals: In the third month he used the "]i"
character of his Ming princely name in a signature (see
Figure 184). From this year, too, dates the first appear-
ance of a seal reading "Jingjiang Houren" (Jingjiang de-
scendant) (Li Songan's Studio, hanging scroll, second
month, whereabouts unknown [Fu and Fu 1973: 220]).
Although the first dated appearance of the oval "Dadizi"
seal is also in this year (colophon to a landscape by Puhe,
Yunnan Provincial Museum [Dandang shuhua ji 1963:
23]), it is likely to have come into use much earlier.

1703
In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang. In the course of the year he
painted for Mr. Liu at least thirty album leaves in the
same standard, oversized format, as part of two or per-
haps three albums.
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juhui would be helpful to his cause. Through a prominent
monk associated with the Dabei Monastery, Shitao met
two notable Tianjin patrons: the salt merchant and of-
ficial Zhang Lin (d. 1713) and his cousin, Zhang Zhu
(I659-1704).

1692
Shitao returned to Beijing early in the spring with the in-
tention of going back to Yangzhou, but in the end he did
not finally leave for the South until the eighth or ninth
month. His address at this point is not clear, but one sur-
viving painting from the third month was painted in Hai-
chao Temple, located close to Ciyuan Temple.

During the three years he spent in Beijing, Shitao was able
to see several important collections of paintings, includ-
ing those of Bordu, the late Yolo (Prince An, d. 1689,
father ofYueduan), and the late Geng Zhaozhong (I640-
86).

In the autumn, he left Beijing for the South, traveling by
boat along the Grand Canal. In a boat disaster, he lost
his luggage, including accumulated poems, books, and
scrolls.

Back in the South, stopping first in Yangzhou at Jinghui
Monastery, he then set off almost immediately to Nan-
jing, where he sojourned from the tenth month through
the winter of 1692, probably at Xitian Monastery. At this
time he again saw Herao, one of his friends in the South
with whom Shitao had kept in touch by letter during his
northern stay (another being Mei Qing in Xuancheng).

Death of Cheng Sui.

1693
Early in 1693 Shitao moved back to the Yangzhou area.
One of his first acts was to go on a long trip through the
area in search of plum blossom, commemorated in a set
of ninety poems, several of which he later repeatedly il-
lustrated in painting. Another was to take on a new paint-
ing student, a Chan "nephew," Chengchou Gengyin, who
was a follower of Yuanzhi Poyu, the abbot of Jinghui
Monastery. During the summer he can be placed first at
Yousheng Ge, possibly located on the estate of Wang Xue-
chen, a wealthy fellow-member of the Spring River Poetry
Society, and then at Yao Man's Wu Mountain Pavilion,
near Mount Ganquan, northeast of Yangzhou; he stayed
on there into the autumn. At Yousheng Ge he made the
acquaintance of a Chinese bannerman, Zhang Jingjie. By
winter he was back in Yangzhou at Dashu Tang.

Hetao was still alive in this year, inscribing a painting by
Kuncan (Shanghai Museum).

Dai Benxiao died in Nanjing.

1694
Based in the Yangzhou area. Through the spring he con-
tinued to live at Dashu Tang, returning to Wu Mountain

Pavilion in the summer. He spent the rest of the year back
in Yangzhou at the Jinghui Monastery.

Figure 73). He named his studio Dadi Tang in reference
to the Daoist site of Mount Dadi near Hangzhou, and
from this point on presented himself publicly as a Daoist.
In a poem from the spring, he also refers to a Green Lo-
tus Studio (an allusion to the Tang dynasry poet, Li Bai),
here referred to as Qinglian Xiaoge, and later variously
as Qinglian Ge, Qinglian Caoge, Qinglian Caotang.

Signatures and seals: During this year, he signed himself
on one occasion "Dadi Shanren" (poetry manuscript, dat-
able to the late spring or early summer of 1697, Guang-
zhou Art Gallery). In the eleventh month he signed him-
self "Dadizi Shanren" (see Figure 180). The seal "Tenth
Generation of Zan, Azhang" makes its first datable ap-
pearance on the above-mentioned poetry manuscript.

Death of Mei Qing in Xuancheng.

1695
Based in the Yangzhou area. Through the spring he con-
tinued to live at Jinghui Monastery; then, at the beginning
of the summer, he made a brief trip to Hefei in northern
Anhui at the invitation of the former minister Li Tianfu
(I635-99) and the local magistrate Zhang Chunxiu (a
Chinese bannerman). Upon his return, he spent the rest
of the summer in Yizheng, near Yangzhou, as the guest
of a merchant and art collector, Xu Songling. During this
summer he met another important friend and patron,
Huang You, for the first time, and also visited the mer-
chant Zheng Zhaoxin at his celebrated Yizheng estate,
River Village amid White Sand and Verdant Bamboo. He
made a trip back to Yangzhou in the autumn, staying
once more at Jinghui Monastery, but then returned to
Xu's estate in Yizheng, where he seems to have resided
continuously well into the following year.

1698
In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang. Shitao was ill during the win-
ter of 1697-8 and on into the spring. He first met his fu-
ture biographer, Li Lin, in the autumn of 1698. What was
probably the first version of his treatise on painting, en-
titled Huafa beiyuan (see Figure 185), was written (or at
least started) by this year at latest; he would produce sev-
eral other versions thereafter. These bear various names,
of which only Hua pu (Manual of Painting) is certainly
Shitao's own.

Signatures and seals:He first signs himself "Dadizi" in the
autumn of this year (see Figure I03). Although there are
no dated uses of the "Dadizi" seal before 1702, it too may
have come into use as early as this year (see Figure 176).
The earliest dated appearance of the signature "Qing-
xiang Chenren" is in the third month (see Figure 74)·

Death of Zha Shibiao (I615-98) in Yangzhou.

1696
After leaving Yizheng at the end of the spring, Shitao re-
sided briefly in Yangzhou before taking up an invitation
from the Huizhou scholar, economist, and merchant
ChengJun (I638-1704) to pass the summer at the Cheng
family home in Huizhou, where he created a major auto-
biographical handscroll, Calligraphies and Sketches by
Qingxiang (see Figure 72, Plate 2). Cheng jun's four sons
became Shitao's students at this time, with Cheng Ming
(I676-1743 or later) proving to be the most serious. By
the end of his stay, Shitao seems to have decided to leave
the Buddhist sangba. At summer's end he presumably
moved back to Yangzhou in preparation for establishing
his own residence; indeed, it is possible that he moved
into his new home even before the end of the year.

Signatures and seals: In an album datable to this year (see
Figure 67), Shitao signed himself "Dadi Zunzhe" (Abbot
of the Great Cleansing).

Shirao's first indirect contact with his distant cousin, Bada
Shanren (1626-1705), in Nanchang dates from this year.

1699
In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang. In the second month he paint-
ed an important album for a Qing official who may have
been the Nanjing Textile Commissioner, Cao Yin (I6 58-
f71 2). His friendship with three other important patrons
- Cheng Daoguang (Tuiweng), the salt merchant Jiang
Shidong (born c. 1658), and the young Hong Zhengzhi
(I674-1735), also from a Huizhou merchant family and
later a major salt merchant, who became his painting stu-
dent - began no later than this year. In the summer he
started a vegetable garden (probably next to the east wall
of the old city).

Signatures and seals: Two large seals, "yu jin wei shu wei
qingmen" (today a commoner and a poor man) and
"xiangnian Kugua" (Bitter Melon of former years), make
their earliest dated appearance in the second month (Plum
Blossom, hanging scroll, Shanghai Museum [ST 45J)·

In the spring Kangxi visited Yangzhou during his third
Southern Tour.

1697
In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang (Great Cleansing Hall). He
was ill in early I 697. During the spring, he visited a Han-
lin academician, Di Yi, who had come to the city from
Beijing. Direct contact with Bada Shanren (by letter) like-
ly dates from this year. Toward the end of the year he
completed an important commission from Bordu to copy
a handscroll by Qiu Ying, One Hundred Beauties.
Studio names: Shitao took up residence in a two-storied
house in the center of Yangzhou no later than the second
month of 1697, the date of the earliest document execut-
ed there (an inscription to a painting by Bada Shanren, see

I70a
In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang. Wu [ixian became his paint-
ing student no later than this year. On the last night of
the year, Shitao wrote an important series of autobio-
graphical poems that, along with a second group written
a few days later, have survived in the so-called Gengchen
Manuscript of Poems.
Signatures and seals: First dated appearance, in the tenth
month, of a large "Dadi Tang" seal (see Figure II3).

I70I

In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang. He was ill both early in the
year and in the autumn. In the fourth month his Manchu
student Tu Qingge came to Yangzhou and was visited by
Shitao at his lodgings in Tianning Monastery. In the au-
tumn Shitao visited Tu Qingge at Shaobo, to the north of
Yangzhou, where he was serving as an official.

Signatures and seals: The earliest dated use of the name
"Ruoji" is in a signature to a painting from this winter
(Shina nanga taisei 1935-7: vol. 3). The album he painted
for Tu Qingge at the time of the latter's visit to Yangzhou
includes the first appearances of "Lingding Laoren" (or-
phaned old man) as a seal and "Mengdong Sheng" (mud-
dle-headed man) as a signature. A "Mengdong Sheng"
seal is first found in the eleventh month (see Figure 203).

1702

In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang. During the early summer he
made a brief trip to Nanjing, where he visited the tomb
of the Ming founder and saw his old friend Tian Lin.
On present evidence this was his only trip outside the
Yangzhou area after he moved into Dadi Tang; the rea-
son for his visit is unknown (possibly the death of He-
tao?). In Yangzhou, Shitao's friendships with his patrons
Mr. Liu, the unknown owner (Mr. Huang) of Wanglii
Tang, and the unidentified Zheweng date from no later
than 1702.

Signatures and seals: In the third month he used the "]i"
character of his Ming princely name in a signature (see
Figure 184). From this year, too, dates the first appear-
ance of a seal reading "Jingjiang Houren" (Jingjiang de-
scendant) (Li Songan's Studio, hanging scroll, second
month, whereabouts unknown [Fu and Fu 1973: 220]).
Although the first dated appearance of the oval "Dadizi"
seal is also in this year (colophon to a landscape by Puhe,
Yunnan Provincial Museum [Dandang shuhua ji 1963:
23]), it is likely to have come into use much earlier.

1703
In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang. In the course of the year he
painted for Mr. Liu at least thirty album leaves in the
same standard, oversized format, as part of two or per-
haps three albums.
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Studio names: The first dated instance of the studio name
Gengxin Caotang (Studio for Cultivation of the Heart-
mind) is found in the albums for Mr. Liu (see Figure '4z).
There it is found alongside the name Qinglian Caotang,
which it subsequently seems to replace.
Signatures and seals: Also in the albums for Mr. Liu is
found the latest dated appearance of the "Qingxiang
Chenren" signature (see Figure 153), which subsequently
is replaced by "Qingxiang Yiren."
In the spring Kangxi visited Yangzhou during his fourth
Southern Tour.

1704
In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang. Wang Jueshi became his paint-
ing student no later than this year.
Signatures and seals: "Qingxiang Yiren" appears as a sig-
nature on a painting dedicated to Yueduan, who died in
this year, and must therefore have come into use by 1704
at latest (see Figure 78). The seal "Dadizi, Ji" appears on
the same painting.

Cao Yin was appointed Liang-Huai Salt Commissioner
and moved from Nanjing to Yangzhou.
Death of Yueduan.

1705
In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang.
Signatures and seals: The seal "Ruoji" makes its earliest
dated appearance on a painting from the autumn (see
Figure ZIZ). The vast majority of dated references to his
Ming princely name in signatures or seals date from this
year onward.
In the spring Kangxi visited Yangzhou during his fifth
Southern Tour. Immediately after, Cao Yin set up an edi-
torial office in Tianning Monastery to take charge of an
imperially sponsored printed edition of the Complete Po-
etry of the Tang. An editorial team comprising ten Han-
lin academicians arrived in Yangzhou in the fifth month.
During that summer and autumn, northern Jiangsu was
badly hit by /loods.
Death of Bada Shanren in Nanchang.

1706
In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang.

Printing of the Complete Poetry of the Tang was complet-
ed in the ninth month. As shown by his Playing the Qin
in Front of an Ox (Palace Museum, Beijing), Shitao was
in contact with Cao Yin and at least one of the members
of the Complete Poetry editorial team, Yang Zhongna,
during the period of the printing project.

The Art Museum, Princeton University

Published: Fu and Fu 1973: Z15
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Letters

1707
In Yangzhou at Dadi Tang. He was consistently ill from
at least the summer onward. His final datable paintings
are from the tenth month.

At some point between 1705 and 1707 he completed the
manuscript transcription of his treatise on painting that
was later printed as Hua pu (preface by the publisher, Hu
Qi, dated 17IO).

Because Li Lin states in one of his elegies for Shitao that
Bada Shanren had died two years earlier, Shitao must
have died before the end of this year.

Studio names: As shown by the album Reminiscences of
[inling, Shitao continued to use the names Dadi Caotang
and Gengxin Caotang through the autumn; but in this
year he also introduced the studio name Daben Tang, al-
luding to a building within the Ming palace in Nanjing
that was built in 1368 at the orders of the Ming founder
for the instruction of his sons. By the autumn, this studio
name had become the one he most commonly used in
seals and signatures.

Signatures and seals: Seals not currently known to pre-
date this year include two seals with the legend "Daben
Tang" (see Figure Z20 and Edwards 1967: 186), and oth-
ers with the legends "Daben Tang, Ji" (see Figure zI8),
"Daben Tang, Ruoji" (see Figure ZI7), "Dadizi" (see Fig-
ure zI6), "Qingxiang Yiren" (see Figure 220), and "dong
tu xi mo" (daubs to the east, smears to the west) (Plate
15)·

In the spring Kangxi visited Yangzhou during his sixth
Southern Tour.

,

Twenty-four letters written by Shitao ro nine different re-
cipients are currently known in manuscript form. One
other exists only as a contemporary transcription in
Zhang Chao's Yousheng (n80b). Most of the letters are
business correspondence with patrons (one of them a
government official), but others were sent to a fellow art-
ist, a doctor, and a Daoist priest. All but two date from
the Dadi Tang years, 1697-1707, but more precise dat-
ing within that period is difficult, no dates being given in
the letters. In most cases, however, the internal evidence
of seals and signatures offers some, albeit limited, help.
The format of this presentation largely follows the one
established by Barnhart and Wang for Bada Shanren's
letters in their Master of the Lotus Garden (I990).

I. Ciweng (Wu Qi, 1619-94), c. 1693-4
~~ffi*~~~*~~W~$'*~~~@*o~~-= 0 ~$inB~~}jjIH<iIII 0 llfI1!!\JiJi!lJz'liiJ'i!l'~/J,tt0

~Pj( 0 ffjf(iJiI!lI'?)
Yesterday evening I bothered your servant to take some
calligraphy to you [Ciweng], but I didn't get any word
back. I still have one or two others. Only once I hear from
you [Ciweng], my true friend, will I dare to cancel the re-
quest. Although [my calligraphies] are worthless objects,
still there is a little urgency. With a laugh!
Ji [two characters illegible].

Seal: illegible

2. Zhang Chao (b. 1650), c. 1693-6
ilJfi\lrfiJ*l1fl'fl3iIiiJ'J1.t:Hilif 0 1iHlIjK!)Jl(;fj~!C!tl' 0 ~

*W~~·i!l'~~m'f~~~~A~~illo~~~~z·
I have always been clumsy with words and poetry. It's only
the jinti poetic form that I have perhaps been able to mas-
ter. As for the other forms, I don't practice any of them.
Nor would I dare to publish [my poems] and have them
be subject to the ridicule of others. Please forgive me.
Published (in transcription): Zhang Chao, ed. I780b: wu 14a

3. Bada Shanren, c. 1698-9
~~~~.~+mE'WilJ~~'KM~~Ao.

JIIf:t\+' ilI'i~~tl!i 0 +4'B* '~tt**JiJi~l!Hl! 'W~~
.m~~n~~zn'liiJill·ffjfm~~~~~~'W*~$
~,~~~*'l1fl'f~~'~~'f~~-A~,m}jWm
.;li!:Jlt~~,JU~iitA 0 .;y~*t~JitjJLJSlitJ*1'",','fl,'ilf
J: 'ffjfiik*~~:::RJiIi-R"~/HIil''F~J:~~~~ , tT
*f?jJlll:~tt ' 1lll~-~91 ' ",','iI/IJiJi~ , RP::kI\H::km:!it
ill,Jlt.&~~*o~~*~~~rr~'fJ:'K.n'liiJ
ill0 rfiJif<JiJi'ilf*::k'~/J-:I1l~r 0 i!}uJt1t : ::kiIH'::kIfll;:t,1
:!ito~.~~,ffjf~~~~zA'rfiJJ:-~lfll;oQ~~JSl
.¥.U,-.~~~@,a.o~~••'~W.M!
m$*~~offjfiJil!ll·
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~Pj( 0 ffjf(iJiI!lI'?)
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ilJfi\lrfiJ*l1fl'fl3iIiiJ'J1.t:Hilif 0 1iHlIjK!)Jl(;fj~!C!tl' 0 ~
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~~~~.~+mE'WilJ~~'KM~~Ao.

JIIf:t\+' ilI'i~~tl!i 0 +4'B* '~tt**JiJi~l!Hl! 'W~~
.m~~n~~zn'liiJill·ffjfm~~~~~~'W*~$
~,~~~*'l1fl'f~~'~~'f~~-A~,m}jWm
.;li!:Jlt~~,JU~iitA 0 .;y~*t~JitjJLJSlitJ*1'",','fl,'ilf
J: 'ffjfiik*~~:::RJiIi-R"~/HIil''F~J:~~~~ , tT
*f?jJlll:~tt ' 1lll~-~91 ' ",','iI/IJiJi~ , RP::kI\H::km:!it
ill,Jlt.&~~*o~~*~~~rr~'fJ:'K.n'liiJ
ill0 rfiJif<JiJi'ilf*::k'~/J-:I1l~r 0 i!}uJt1t : ::kiIH'::kIfll;:t,1
:!ito~.~~,ffjf~~~~zA'rfiJJ:-~lfll;oQ~~JSl
.¥.U,-.~~~@,a.o~~••'~W.M!
m$*~~offjfiJil!ll·
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I have heard that you have reached the venerable age of
seventy-four or seventy-five, and that you climb moun-
tains as if flying. Truly you are one of the transcendents.
I shall soon be sixty, and I already find things unbear-
able. In the past ten years, I have noticed specimens of
your calligraphy and paintings acquired by people who
came by here. All are indeed treasured objects, certainly
not to be obtained by simple offers of praises and eulo-
gies by people like myself.

I have received several letters from you, but I have not
been able to make a reply. This is because I have been
troubled by illnesses and have found myself inept in en-
tertaining and corresponding with people. I am not like
this with you alone. People on all sides know about this
shortcoming of mine. It makes me a laughable person.

Today, Mr. Li Songan is returning to Nanzhou [Nan-
chang], so I am sending this letter to you. I would like to
beg of you a small hanging scroll three feet tall and one
foot wide. [It should have,] on a flat bank, an old house
with a few rooms and a few ancient, useless trees, and
in the room on the upper level just an old man, nothing
else around. This will represent Dadizi in his Dadi Tang
[Great Cleansing Hall]. I must at least have this. If there
is any unused paper left, I shall beg you to do a few lines
of your exemplary writing above the painting. This will
truly become my most treasured object.

The picture that you were kind enough to send me
some time ago was too big. My small house cannot hold
it. In your inscription, I beg you to write "Dadizi Dadi
Caorang tu" [A Picture of Dadizi's Great Cleansing
Thatched Hall]. Please do not refer to me as a monk, for
I am a man who wears a hat and keeps his hair, and who
is striving to cleanse everything.

My only regret is rhat I cannot hurry myself to Xijiang
[liangxi] to catch a glimpse of your countenance. The
sickness of old age is with me. What is to be done? What
is to be done?

Xueweng Old Esq. Ji, bowing my head.
Seal: Yanzhong zhi ren wu lao yi (square intaglio)

The Art Museum, Princeton University

Published: Fu and Fu 1973: 210-1 I (followed by an exten-
sive bibliography of earlier publications of the letter; trans-
lation above slightly modified)
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4. Shenlao, c. 1698 or later
LH.1z{f , Jm~ilfll'!l'!l!: " frtl~e l:1i'H~*fili" :kili!

'TiYii"
During the noontime music(?) I will sweep the Zhuning
Hall. Your transcendent excellency.

Sent to Shenlao, the great transcendent. Dadizi, [i,

Seal: Gaomangzi, Ji (square intaglio)

The Art Museum, Princeton University

Published: Fu and Fu 1973: 215

5. Zheweng, c. 1697-1703

~*iUJlt ':=:~ll" 51'~:!"'~*5GA~m; " 5I':f.~
W,,~~~¥z~~~,,~a~~~."*DD"~5I'~
-1Hllll"
So far I have finished three of the hanging-scroll calligra-
phies for you. They are all in the style of Song and Yuan
masters. I did not enjoying doing them, as true connois-
seurs will be able to see, but they will find them interest-
ing. For the past few days I have been kept busy, and have
not [two characters unclear]. I'm having someone take
you the thank-you painting.

To Mr. Zheweng, your ailing younger brother Azhang
bows.
Seal: Dadizi (oval relief)
Shanghai Museum

Published: ST: I I I

A copy of this letter is in the Art Museum, Princeton Univer-
sity.

Yesterday while it was raining I finished the large hanging
scroll painting you commissioned earlier, but I have not
yet added an inscription. I will be writing an inscription
at some point; after the text is drafted it would be worth
your while checking it over.

To Mr. Zheweng. Your ailing brother bows.
Seal:Dadizi (oval relief)
Shanghai Museum
Published: ST: Ir2

9· Zheweng, c. 1697-1703

nu*~~~*5I'~*r~.*~mM~z"~r~$
~"1ik*$f'!'ll"ffl'~-m ,,;W]1i;i\RPllil:DJli;lli)\;!E<p
~"iYii~ll".?;lli~~m;~$"~~ll"
Recently, because the road to your father's home has been
flooded and I have been kept busy at home, I have not
been able to thank him in person. Now I have a guest
about to arrive, and I wondered if I could borrow a bed
from the family residence to use temporarily. I would re-
turn it around the fifth or sixth of the month.

To the honorable Mr. Zheweng. Ji bows.
PS: Please convey my best wishes to Gui? weng.

Seal:Dadizi (oval relief)
Shanghai Museum

Published: ST: Ir3

6. Zheweng, c. 1697-1703

~*~:f~"~~~)\;!E~~:fffiW~~"~*ffir
11} " ~fJlj •• g,;~,~,:!",." ~~j1';'[*W r~ill":fil>l" l:Jli;lli
)\;!E"iYii~ll"
The Luo family shop has not moved. As for Mr. Zhou
Baoye, I still don't know where he went. I have not
known his whereabouts for a long while now. I was de-
lighted to hear that you are well. Due to the collapse of
the room, Ihaven't been out.

Sincerely. To Mr. Zheweng, Ji bows.
Seal: Dadizi (oval relief)
Shanghai Museum

Published: ST: I II

IO. Zheweng, c. 1697-1703

A~*~~~~"ili~~*"m)\;!E~~*~~~Z
mill"$~~~~l:,,~;lli~<p~)\;!E":k~~iYii~ll"
Ever since autumn arrived it has been hotter and drier
than ever: I can neither sit nor stand. I was hoping that
you might be able to come by for poetry in time for the
evening breeze. I have finished with the sheets of paper
[for calligraphy?] you recently sent me, and am sending
them up to you.

To the honorable Mr. Zheweng. Dadizi Ji bows.
Seal: Sibai Feng Zhong Ruoli Weng tushu (square intaglio)
Shanghai Museum

Published: ST: 114

7· Zheweng, c. 1697-1703

mre~~".*ffittWa"-~"~.:f~~~~'
~~ " RP$:f11i:"l:~;lli<p)\;!E" 51'~ Hll1l "
I received the loquats, [But] I didn't know what day they
would be ripe - how amusing! What a shame one can-
not apply alum to your painting.

Sincerely. To Mr. Zheweng, your younger brother Ji
bows.
Seal: Chijue (rectangular relief)
Shanghai Museum

Published: ST: 112

II. Zheweng, c. 1697-1703
!flr.1Wr~" aWJlt~1J§iil" 1I1'i1<~ilIll/&DJf"~JS!$

:1R ~ ~ iYiiRP!flJiiJtt;ll;1+l " 51';ill<~CD"51'~n~J'1iJl' f'& • ~
~"l:~;lli)\;!EffiD"*~5I'~*~1l"
I left home this morning. Now it's sundown and I have
just got back. I received your message yesterday to visit
[your?] studio. But a visitor from afar has suddenly ar-
rived and wants me to go with him straightaway to Zhen-
zhou [Yizheng]. I am afraid of losing [character unclear].
I will do as I hear from you. Thank you.

8. Zheweng, c. 1697-1703

mMilIl*~.II1'~~~~'~*.~"~!fl~~~"
mi ' RP~JE;lliiEz" ~;lli<p)\;!E"j'551'~*~1l"
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To my true friend, Mr. Zheweng. Dadi Azhang bows.
Seal:Lingding laoren [square relief]
Shanghai Museum

Published: ST: 114

12. Zheweng, c. 1702 or later
~:t\JL/H~B11i1,t~~" ll'l:ADl:~~":f-" l:Jli

;llim)\;!E" *.5WJtt " ~1i~1l "
I finished hastily the portrait of your sixth brother [or
cousin], and [am sending it up to you] for your approval.

Respectfully, to Mr. Zheweng. Please [character undeci-
phered] this. Your younger brother, Ji.
Seal:Mengdong Sheng (square intaglio)
Shanghai Museum

Published: ST: 113

13. Zheweng, c. 1702 or later
~.«~"~.DDa."n~~ffi~)\;!E$f'!'I

!R" ~~~~;3;" :fDl/&" ?i£\m~ [remainder of text
missing] Jli;lli)\;!E" *~'T~Jlll "
This year the heat has defeated me. Since autumn arrived
[two characters unclear] daily higher. If it is like this
here, I know it must be even hotter in your residence. I
often think of you, but I do not dare visit. I am afraid of
making a sudden movement .... [remainder of the text
missing]

To Mr. Zheweng. Dadizi bows.
Seal: Mengdong Sheng (?) (square intaglio)
Shanghai Museum

Published:ST: 114

14. Jiang Shidong, c. 1697 or later
~ '!'~S JH'H¥JiiJkE$fl:-yjrj,R1iI*;witl~,~i\I!J~

JIl.:I&1ikI!lJfZ*"mlL~~T' :OCAJi.(~mIiH.ll'~,~MH!l'
~~,~~.~,~a.%,§iil*X;w,,~m~~,~~
mD~"m)\;!E~:=:~'W-*'~*~~;II1'~~-~
B~ " 1&;lli<p)\;!E'*~5I'iYii~1l "
After I and Shucun [Xiang Yin] said goodbye to you at
your residence at midautumn, I fell sick at home, to the
point that you would have thought Bitter Melon's root
was going to break [i.e., the artist was going to die]. On
the Double Ninth I felt better, and a friend sent a palan-
quin to fetch me at dawn so that I could write a bafen
script birthday ping [screen or set of scrolls]. I went each
morning and came back each evening for four days un-
til the commission was completed. When I was home
again I fell ill once more. I have often wanted to speak
with you, but the distance makes it difficult for me to go
to see you. I have still not started work on the three
pieces of paper [for hanging scrolls] and the album that



I have heard that you have reached the venerable age of
seventy-four or seventy-five, and that you climb moun-
tains as if flying. Truly you are one of the transcendents.
I shall soon be sixty, and I already find things unbear-
able. In the past ten years, I have noticed specimens of
your calligraphy and paintings acquired by people who
came by here. All are indeed treasured objects, certainly
not to be obtained by simple offers of praises and eulo-
gies by people like myself.

I have received several letters from you, but I have not
been able to make a reply. This is because I have been
troubled by illnesses and have found myself inept in en-
tertaining and corresponding with people. I am not like
this with you alone. People on all sides know about this
shortcoming of mine. It makes me a laughable person.

Today, Mr. Li Songan is returning to Nanzhou [Nan-
chang], so I am sending this letter to you. I would like to
beg of you a small hanging scroll three feet tall and one
foot wide. [It should have,] on a flat bank, an old house
with a few rooms and a few ancient, useless trees, and
in the room on the upper level just an old man, nothing
else around. This will represent Dadizi in his Dadi Tang
[Great Cleansing Hall]. I must at least have this. If there
is any unused paper left, I shall beg you to do a few lines
of your exemplary writing above the painting. This will
truly become my most treasured object.

The picture that you were kind enough to send me
some time ago was too big. My small house cannot hold
it. In your inscription, I beg you to write "Dadizi Dadi
Caorang tu" [A Picture of Dadizi's Great Cleansing
Thatched Hall]. Please do not refer to me as a monk, for
I am a man who wears a hat and keeps his hair, and who
is striving to cleanse everything.

My only regret is rhat I cannot hurry myself to Xijiang
[liangxi] to catch a glimpse of your countenance. The
sickness of old age is with me. What is to be done? What
is to be done?

Xueweng Old Esq. Ji, bowing my head.
Seal: Yanzhong zhi ren wu lao yi (square intaglio)

The Art Museum, Princeton University

Published: Fu and Fu 1973: 210-1 I (followed by an exten-
sive bibliography of earlier publications of the letter; trans-
lation above slightly modified)
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4. Shenlao, c. 1698 or later
LH.1z{f , Jm~ilfll'!l'!l!: " frtl~e l:1i'H~*fili" :kili!

'TiYii"
During the noontime music(?) I will sweep the Zhuning
Hall. Your transcendent excellency.

Sent to Shenlao, the great transcendent. Dadizi, [i,

Seal: Gaomangzi, Ji (square intaglio)

The Art Museum, Princeton University

Published: Fu and Fu 1973: 215

5. Zheweng, c. 1697-1703

~*iUJlt ':=:~ll" 51'~:!"'~*5GA~m; " 5I':f.~
W,,~~~¥z~~~,,~a~~~."*DD"~5I'~
-1Hllll"
So far I have finished three of the hanging-scroll calligra-
phies for you. They are all in the style of Song and Yuan
masters. I did not enjoying doing them, as true connois-
seurs will be able to see, but they will find them interest-
ing. For the past few days I have been kept busy, and have
not [two characters unclear]. I'm having someone take
you the thank-you painting.

To Mr. Zheweng, your ailing younger brother Azhang
bows.
Seal: Dadizi (oval relief)
Shanghai Museum

Published: ST: I I I

A copy of this letter is in the Art Museum, Princeton Univer-
sity.

Yesterday while it was raining I finished the large hanging
scroll painting you commissioned earlier, but I have not
yet added an inscription. I will be writing an inscription
at some point; after the text is drafted it would be worth
your while checking it over.

To Mr. Zheweng. Your ailing brother bows.
Seal:Dadizi (oval relief)
Shanghai Museum
Published: ST: Ir2

9· Zheweng, c. 1697-1703

nu*~~~*5I'~*r~.*~mM~z"~r~$
~"1ik*$f'!'ll"ffl'~-m ,,;W]1i;i\RPllil:DJli;lli)\;!E<p
~"iYii~ll".?;lli~~m;~$"~~ll"
Recently, because the road to your father's home has been
flooded and I have been kept busy at home, I have not
been able to thank him in person. Now I have a guest
about to arrive, and I wondered if I could borrow a bed
from the family residence to use temporarily. I would re-
turn it around the fifth or sixth of the month.

To the honorable Mr. Zheweng. Ji bows.
PS: Please convey my best wishes to Gui? weng.

Seal:Dadizi (oval relief)
Shanghai Museum

Published: ST: Ir3

6. Zheweng, c. 1697-1703

~*~:f~"~~~)\;!E~~:fffiW~~"~*ffir
11} " ~fJlj •• g,;~,~,:!",." ~~j1';'[*W r~ill":fil>l" l:Jli;lli
)\;!E"iYii~ll"
The Luo family shop has not moved. As for Mr. Zhou
Baoye, I still don't know where he went. I have not
known his whereabouts for a long while now. I was de-
lighted to hear that you are well. Due to the collapse of
the room, Ihaven't been out.

Sincerely. To Mr. Zheweng, Ji bows.
Seal: Dadizi (oval relief)
Shanghai Museum

Published: ST: I II

IO. Zheweng, c. 1697-1703

A~*~~~~"ili~~*"m)\;!E~~*~~~Z
mill"$~~~~l:,,~;lli~<p~)\;!E":k~~iYii~ll"
Ever since autumn arrived it has been hotter and drier
than ever: I can neither sit nor stand. I was hoping that
you might be able to come by for poetry in time for the
evening breeze. I have finished with the sheets of paper
[for calligraphy?] you recently sent me, and am sending
them up to you.

To the honorable Mr. Zheweng. Dadizi Ji bows.
Seal: Sibai Feng Zhong Ruoli Weng tushu (square intaglio)
Shanghai Museum

Published: ST: 114

7· Zheweng, c. 1697-1703

mre~~".*ffittWa"-~"~.:f~~~~'
~~ " RP$:f11i:"l:~;lli<p)\;!E" 51'~ Hll1l "
I received the loquats, [But] I didn't know what day they
would be ripe - how amusing! What a shame one can-
not apply alum to your painting.

Sincerely. To Mr. Zheweng, your younger brother Ji
bows.
Seal: Chijue (rectangular relief)
Shanghai Museum

Published: ST: 112

II. Zheweng, c. 1697-1703
!flr.1Wr~" aWJlt~1J§iil" 1I1'i1<~ilIll/&DJf"~JS!$

:1R ~ ~ iYiiRP!flJiiJtt;ll;1+l " 51';ill<~CD"51'~n~J'1iJl' f'& • ~
~"l:~;lli)\;!EffiD"*~5I'~*~1l"
I left home this morning. Now it's sundown and I have
just got back. I received your message yesterday to visit
[your?] studio. But a visitor from afar has suddenly ar-
rived and wants me to go with him straightaway to Zhen-
zhou [Yizheng]. I am afraid of losing [character unclear].
I will do as I hear from you. Thank you.

8. Zheweng, c. 1697-1703

mMilIl*~.II1'~~~~'~*.~"~!fl~~~"
mi ' RP~JE;lliiEz" ~;lli<p)\;!E"j'551'~*~1l"

LETTERS 333

To my true friend, Mr. Zheweng. Dadi Azhang bows.
Seal:Lingding laoren [square relief]
Shanghai Museum

Published: ST: 114

12. Zheweng, c. 1702 or later
~:t\JL/H~B11i1,t~~" ll'l:ADl:~~":f-" l:Jli

;llim)\;!E" *.5WJtt " ~1i~1l "
I finished hastily the portrait of your sixth brother [or
cousin], and [am sending it up to you] for your approval.

Respectfully, to Mr. Zheweng. Please [character undeci-
phered] this. Your younger brother, Ji.
Seal:Mengdong Sheng (square intaglio)
Shanghai Museum

Published: ST: 113

13. Zheweng, c. 1702 or later
~.«~"~.DDa."n~~ffi~)\;!E$f'!'I

!R" ~~~~;3;" :fDl/&" ?i£\m~ [remainder of text
missing] Jli;lli)\;!E" *~'T~Jlll "
This year the heat has defeated me. Since autumn arrived
[two characters unclear] daily higher. If it is like this
here, I know it must be even hotter in your residence. I
often think of you, but I do not dare visit. I am afraid of
making a sudden movement .... [remainder of the text
missing]

To Mr. Zheweng. Dadizi bows.
Seal: Mengdong Sheng (?) (square intaglio)
Shanghai Museum

Published:ST: 114

14. Jiang Shidong, c. 1697 or later
~ '!'~S JH'H¥JiiJkE$fl:-yjrj,R1iI*;witl~,~i\I!J~

JIl.:I&1ikI!lJfZ*"mlL~~T' :OCAJi.(~mIiH.ll'~,~MH!l'
~~,~~.~,~a.%,§iil*X;w,,~m~~,~~
mD~"m)\;!E~:=:~'W-*'~*~~;II1'~~-~
B~ " 1&;lli<p)\;!E'*~5I'iYii~1l "
After I and Shucun [Xiang Yin] said goodbye to you at
your residence at midautumn, I fell sick at home, to the
point that you would have thought Bitter Melon's root
was going to break [i.e., the artist was going to die]. On
the Double Ninth I felt better, and a friend sent a palan-
quin to fetch me at dawn so that I could write a bafen
script birthday ping [screen or set of scrolls]. I went each
morning and came back each evening for four days un-
til the commission was completed. When I was home
again I fell ill once more. I have often wanted to speak
with you, but the distance makes it difficult for me to go
to see you. I have still not started work on the three
pieces of paper [for hanging scrolls] and the album that



you gave me before. Yesterday I received the gold paper
[for a fan]. ...
To Mr. Daiweng. Dadi Ji bows.

Seal: not known

Palace Museum, Beijing

Published (in transcription): Zheng Wei I962: 47-8; Han
Linde I989: 83-4
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IS. Jiang Shidong, c. I702 or later
~~*~%~*'~~~~'~$~~~~,~m

mo%~~ffi~mW-T-W~~'T-~~mo~~*pm,
;t'll<iiIiJiiIiJiCIiJii-CI* 0 1!tZj[~ ,m~!lIDl ' fi1t*T-~~
~~;~~m~~~~~~'~~Z€~m,~m-~,
m~+='~~~ffl,~~~+~~m,m~~~o~.
zT-"l'f1'mmzm 0 ~ffii#f*'!!lJ/JI'l'~~jf£]j1jJIIH'.,Q.(=t-
~~~-~o~~~~~*,~~~L~L,~~~OOQ.(
~~~rr'~~~~~~~f1'.'~~E+m-~o~
<¥ft/JT-~~,"'~I!Un!J' "P~~~m~ffl 'Jlt~~!IH"
-~'~+-~I'l'~ffl*'T-.~~+=*~o~* •.
W·~·.·.i#f*'.<¥I'l'~~~;~.~~~~~~
E~, I'l'~~~;et<¥IEJl~-~, <Jl;~~~0 ~%~JiJi$Z
m,.mLA~~~**Mmo~~=1!t~~~%~
J:HUl''I'\' 0 H!.\%~~~fI!lA'7J3l<ffi'L'Za'~3l<Utz
a '"P~-~mm 0 1!tLIlI:I)]!\Jii>~A*'+~ AiL 0 ~FJi
~~~~*'ft-~~'~~T-~T-~ffiD~m~mo~
~~T-~~'~*MW~m~~o~~*~~-~,~~
.!J!~, '1'lii1l1kff lH~f<iJ? Jlt~f1n'Iff!:t~, $~mWT-lI 0

JiJiJIUf,\j*iltWJ0 m;$;tIitJl.%~,t5~j<ijjm~0
I went to see you yesterday, because I had something to
discuss. When I saw that you had a lot of guests and that
I wouldn't be able to speak with you, I left. You know
that originally my work was not associated with the gen-
eral run of painting, and that I should not have to paint
screens. I only do it because my household is so large,
and myoid illness is getting worse all the time! When I
exhaust all the xuan and luowen paper on the marker,
and connoisseurs cannot find more, only then do I turn
to satin and silk for my calligraphy and painting; and it
is after silk that I turn to screens. When I get a [folding]
screen, it has twelve [panels for] paintings. The first and
last ones are useless [i.e., because they are much nar-
rower than the others], but the middle ten are fine for
painting. I split the screen into its individual sections and
paint it that way, which means I can't paint it as a [contin-
uous] screen. I know that none of you gentlemen can be
as free with your finances as before, so I charge twenty-
four taels for the whole screen. But if someone wants a
continuous scene, it means standing on a scaffold or a
bench, stretching my arm and craning my neck to reach
the painting, up and down, always moving about or
standing. For painting in these conditions I charge fifty
taels per screen. Now that I'm old I don't have the energy
I used to. It is difficult for me to move the brush around

I
I

vigorously, and even if I can complete the screen there is
still no point. I may ruin one of the panels, then the other
eleven will all be worthless. It is better if! just paint twelve
separate panels. That is what I have been doing for some
years now for the Wu, Xu, Fang, Huang, and Cheng fam-
ilies. Wenxiong has five screens at home that I painted,
and all of them are of that kind. I painted one at the
beginning of this year, and it was also like that. The
screen you ordered yesterday was to be for your master
bedroom, according to the majordomo, Huang. [Then]
yesterday I met your brother, who said that you were go-
ing to offer it to a relative. But you are nothing if not a
true friend of mine; for a dear friend I will paint it even
for nothing. Eight or nine out of ten people judge by
what they hear from others. My whole life depends on
my brush, so I cannot but exhaust my art for a true
friend. Either I don't ask those close to me to pay, or I
take my distance and let my work compete with what is
generally available. Soon half of the silk and alum will
arrive; since you go out early, I am writing to ask how I
should proceed. This letter has been tude and I beg your
forgiveness. I have not yet dared to touch the silver you
sent me.

To Mr. Daiweng. Your ailing younger brother Ji bows.
Seal: not known

Palace Museum, Beijing

Published (in transcription): Zheng Wei I962: 47; Han Linde
I989: 82-3

I 7. Jiang Shidong

~~~~~~"f'c!ltlt*'etllil'A I'l''fl'FJiT-ffim'~"'i'!
~~OO§'%~~~r*zo~~~lIil'lIil'ftz,~g.o
J1IfmplJ\\m0 .!J!~f!~~3l<m,L'-=1J~,HI\UlliIiJiiIiJi
**o1li';$%~ollk~W-liWJto
This tie is one that I have always appreciated, one that
people today don't know about at all. This is the true ap-
pearance of the methods [fa] of the ancients. You should
keep and treasure it. It would give me pleasure to have
the chance to see it from time to time. As soon as the
roads are better, I will visit your residence. Whenever
you have the chance, keep a small place for me in your
thoughts, otherwise my livelihood will gradually be lost.
To Mr. Daiweng. Your younger brother Yuanji bows.

Seal: not known

Palace Museum, Beijing

Published (in transcription): Zheng Wei I962: 47; Han Linde
1989: 83

18. Cheng Daoguang, c. I698 or later
m.!J!~T-~~mo~;t;$m~C1iJiio~A~~o~~

ilJ/J'~HIl@)0 7'dlHl'lltltl 0 T-j[0 Ll!!;$%~ 0 *m'fm
~ 0 7CffHI!:Jl.t!t~0

I completed the screen long ago and dare not hold on to
it too long - I fear you must be thinking about it more
and more each day. I am sending someone to deliver it.
If you have any medicine, my servant will bring it back.
When the weather improves I will come to thank you in
person.

Respectfully. To Mr. Tuiweng. Dadizi bows.
PS: Give my regards to Tiangen as well.

Seal: undeciphered
Collection unknown

Published: Ming Qing huayuan chidu; Fu and Fu '973: 215

I6. Jiang Shidong

~C1%~lJ\\3l<'~X~~;A**m'~XT-~f1'
'1"~~.'$ft~~mo~~-~~~'T-*r~'M
lEWaA*~ilIi '$'!iUrfrflf 0 ~'IBr'fl'j[~-~lI'etJll!
~!i!lL1pj(, ~r~A1~iL~L ' -*r.llJ1lf ' =*~A'1mI:3"
~f!om~%~ffiD'liWm~o
When you came to see me the other day, I was out. And
when [your] person came to get the painting, I could
not add the inscription, because I had a client there.
During this end-of-the-year period it has been consis-
tently cold, and I haven't often ventured out. But on the
first day of New Year I will visit you with a friend, to
wish you all the best for the new year. Apart from this
lotus, I had a sheet of xuan paper that I used today to
paint an ink landscape. I'm having a student take them
to you immediately, partly to seek your opinion, and
partly to make our relationship a little easier in the
future.

To my true friend Mr. Daizhan. Ji bows.
Seal: not known

Palace Museum, Beijing

Published (in transcription): Zheng Wei I962: 47; Han Linde
I989: 83

19· Cheng Daoguang, c. 1702 or later
~C17C~~~lJ\\7o*C1~D%~~~lJ\\3l<~~o=

1!t~ffi*~*o.~~fI!lAo •• M~T- •• o.%~.!J!
lJ\\~~ol!!;$~~JI.%~ot5~*m'fm~o
For the past few days the weather has been truly fine. In
the days to come I would like you to come to my home
for lunch, and I hope that your second brother will come
too. There will be no other guests. I haven't had a conver-
sation with Su Yimen for a long time. Itwould be won-
derful if you could come soon. . .
To Mr. Tuiweng. Your ailing younger brother Dadizi

bows.

Seal:Mengdong Sheng [square intaglio]
Collection unknown

Published: Fu and Fu I973: 2I5
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20. Cheng Daoguang, c. I702 or later
-~C1C1I1il'IIil'.~~.o~.~'fT-.~'~~~JI.

*1'l'3l<z!)f1m0 etBM*m CI* 0 jf\Q.(jfffl~~,Jj;~lJO
ilm 0 ~f<iJA~II'J~Jlt0 ;t~JOOXT-j'iU~0 crr;tmCImfl!l'L'
.~.lJ\\of<iJ~&~$~?ltIT-j[o~~'f~~.~~
.om*T-~mol!!;$;t%~ot5~~m~o
Recently I have spent every day and every minute toiling
with brush and ink. It is all my fault that little Youde did
not turn out well and caused you trouble. He has already
been back here for two days. Your gift of honey tanger-
ines was truly wonderful, Who am I to have this pleasure?
Yet since it is you who offer them, I do not dare refuse.
For several days I have been thinking that Ruolao must
certainly be discouraged. How can he leave once again to
be a sojourner?
Many thanks. My body is constantly troublesome and

depressing. I will never be well.
To Mr. Tuiweng. YOUtailing younger brother Ji bows.

Seal: fangwai xiaoyao [square intaglio]. This seal, known only
from this one impression, can be translated as Wandering Free-
ly beyond This World.

Formerly Sotheby's

Published: Sotheby's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings, 2.9
November 1993, lot 43; from an Album of Letters by Various
Artists

2L Cheng Daoguang, c. I702 or later
~pfl;jH~ 0 7211il'T-IE0 ~ilJHJ> 0 etJS1ili~*o/J,m

W~JiJi",z'll'"l'i'f0 P.Ul!!;~;t~~%~ 0 t5~j<ijjflt~0

My appetite is still not back to normal, and the weather
is bad. Yesterday's medicine was wonderful: Please send
some more today. Will a small painting do to take care
of the matter you mentioned?
To old Mr. Tuiweng. Your ailing younger brother Ji

bows.

Seal:Dadizi (oval relief)

Shanghai Museum

Published: ST: IIO

22. Cheng Daoguang, c. 1702 or later!

7Cjlijjf\;t~;$%~0 ~~~~lIliI'J~mm#.~:Iil$0 ltIT-
-ocrr;t$~'1'o~C1~~T-~o~**A~~o7C~M
~zmol!!;$;t%~ot5~~~~~o
My regards to the old gentleman on this rainy day. Al-
though I enjoy this sort of thing beyond measure, I have
no capacity for it. Many thanks! Ruolao agrees to write
the characters on the box. My calligraphy spirit hasn't
been good for several days, and the results are not satis-
factory. With good weather I will tty again.
To Mr. Tuiweng. Your ailing brother Azhang bows.



you gave me before. Yesterday I received the gold paper
[for a fan]. ...
To Mr. Daiweng. Dadi Ji bows.

Seal: not known

Palace Museum, Beijing

Published (in transcription): Zheng Wei I962: 47-8; Han
Linde I989: 83-4
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IS. Jiang Shidong, c. I702 or later
~~*~%~*'~~~~'~$~~~~,~m

mo%~~ffi~mW-T-W~~'T-~~mo~~*pm,
;t'll<iiIiJiiIiJiCIiJii-CI* 0 1!tZj[~ ,m~!lIDl ' fi1t*T-~~
~~;~~m~~~~~~'~~Z€~m,~m-~,
m~+='~~~ffl,~~~+~~m,m~~~o~.
zT-"l'f1'mmzm 0 ~ffii#f*'!!lJ/JI'l'~~jf£]j1jJIIH'.,Q.(=t-
~~~-~o~~~~~*,~~~L~L,~~~OOQ.(
~~~rr'~~~~~~~f1'.'~~E+m-~o~
<¥ft/JT-~~,"'~I!Un!J' "P~~~m~ffl 'Jlt~~!IH"
-~'~+-~I'l'~ffl*'T-.~~+=*~o~* •.
W·~·.·.i#f*'.<¥I'l'~~~;~.~~~~~~
E~, I'l'~~~;et<¥IEJl~-~, <Jl;~~~0 ~%~JiJi$Z
m,.mLA~~~**Mmo~~=1!t~~~%~
J:HUl''I'\' 0 H!.\%~~~fI!lA'7J3l<ffi'L'Za'~3l<Utz
a '"P~-~mm 0 1!tLIlI:I)]!\Jii>~A*'+~ AiL 0 ~FJi
~~~~*'ft-~~'~~T-~T-~ffiD~m~mo~
~~T-~~'~*MW~m~~o~~*~~-~,~~
.!J!~, '1'lii1l1kff lH~f<iJ? Jlt~f1n'Iff!:t~, $~mWT-lI 0

JiJiJIUf,\j*iltWJ0 m;$;tIitJl.%~,t5~j<ijjm~0
I went to see you yesterday, because I had something to
discuss. When I saw that you had a lot of guests and that
I wouldn't be able to speak with you, I left. You know
that originally my work was not associated with the gen-
eral run of painting, and that I should not have to paint
screens. I only do it because my household is so large,
and myoid illness is getting worse all the time! When I
exhaust all the xuan and luowen paper on the marker,
and connoisseurs cannot find more, only then do I turn
to satin and silk for my calligraphy and painting; and it
is after silk that I turn to screens. When I get a [folding]
screen, it has twelve [panels for] paintings. The first and
last ones are useless [i.e., because they are much nar-
rower than the others], but the middle ten are fine for
painting. I split the screen into its individual sections and
paint it that way, which means I can't paint it as a [contin-
uous] screen. I know that none of you gentlemen can be
as free with your finances as before, so I charge twenty-
four taels for the whole screen. But if someone wants a
continuous scene, it means standing on a scaffold or a
bench, stretching my arm and craning my neck to reach
the painting, up and down, always moving about or
standing. For painting in these conditions I charge fifty
taels per screen. Now that I'm old I don't have the energy
I used to. It is difficult for me to move the brush around

I
I

vigorously, and even if I can complete the screen there is
still no point. I may ruin one of the panels, then the other
eleven will all be worthless. It is better if! just paint twelve
separate panels. That is what I have been doing for some
years now for the Wu, Xu, Fang, Huang, and Cheng fam-
ilies. Wenxiong has five screens at home that I painted,
and all of them are of that kind. I painted one at the
beginning of this year, and it was also like that. The
screen you ordered yesterday was to be for your master
bedroom, according to the majordomo, Huang. [Then]
yesterday I met your brother, who said that you were go-
ing to offer it to a relative. But you are nothing if not a
true friend of mine; for a dear friend I will paint it even
for nothing. Eight or nine out of ten people judge by
what they hear from others. My whole life depends on
my brush, so I cannot but exhaust my art for a true
friend. Either I don't ask those close to me to pay, or I
take my distance and let my work compete with what is
generally available. Soon half of the silk and alum will
arrive; since you go out early, I am writing to ask how I
should proceed. This letter has been tude and I beg your
forgiveness. I have not yet dared to touch the silver you
sent me.

To Mr. Daiweng. Your ailing younger brother Ji bows.
Seal: not known

Palace Museum, Beijing

Published (in transcription): Zheng Wei I962: 47; Han Linde
I989: 82-3

I 7. Jiang Shidong

~~~~~~"f'c!ltlt*'etllil'A I'l''fl'FJiT-ffim'~"'i'!
~~OO§'%~~~r*zo~~~lIil'lIil'ftz,~g.o
J1IfmplJ\\m0 .!J!~f!~~3l<m,L'-=1J~,HI\UlliIiJiiIiJi
**o1li';$%~ollk~W-liWJto
This tie is one that I have always appreciated, one that
people today don't know about at all. This is the true ap-
pearance of the methods [fa] of the ancients. You should
keep and treasure it. It would give me pleasure to have
the chance to see it from time to time. As soon as the
roads are better, I will visit your residence. Whenever
you have the chance, keep a small place for me in your
thoughts, otherwise my livelihood will gradually be lost.
To Mr. Daiweng. Your younger brother Yuanji bows.

Seal: not known

Palace Museum, Beijing

Published (in transcription): Zheng Wei I962: 47; Han Linde
1989: 83

18. Cheng Daoguang, c. I698 or later
m.!J!~T-~~mo~;t;$m~C1iJiio~A~~o~~

ilJ/J'~HIl@)0 7'dlHl'lltltl 0 T-j[0 Ll!!;$%~ 0 *m'fm
~ 0 7CffHI!:Jl.t!t~0

I completed the screen long ago and dare not hold on to
it too long - I fear you must be thinking about it more
and more each day. I am sending someone to deliver it.
If you have any medicine, my servant will bring it back.
When the weather improves I will come to thank you in
person.

Respectfully. To Mr. Tuiweng. Dadizi bows.
PS: Give my regards to Tiangen as well.

Seal: undeciphered
Collection unknown

Published: Ming Qing huayuan chidu; Fu and Fu '973: 215

I6. Jiang Shidong

~C1%~lJ\\3l<'~X~~;A**m'~XT-~f1'
'1"~~.'$ft~~mo~~-~~~'T-*r~'M
lEWaA*~ilIi '$'!iUrfrflf 0 ~'IBr'fl'j[~-~lI'etJll!
~!i!lL1pj(, ~r~A1~iL~L ' -*r.llJ1lf ' =*~A'1mI:3"
~f!om~%~ffiD'liWm~o
When you came to see me the other day, I was out. And
when [your] person came to get the painting, I could
not add the inscription, because I had a client there.
During this end-of-the-year period it has been consis-
tently cold, and I haven't often ventured out. But on the
first day of New Year I will visit you with a friend, to
wish you all the best for the new year. Apart from this
lotus, I had a sheet of xuan paper that I used today to
paint an ink landscape. I'm having a student take them
to you immediately, partly to seek your opinion, and
partly to make our relationship a little easier in the
future.

To my true friend Mr. Daizhan. Ji bows.
Seal: not known

Palace Museum, Beijing

Published (in transcription): Zheng Wei I962: 47; Han Linde
I989: 83

19· Cheng Daoguang, c. 1702 or later
~C17C~~~lJ\\7o*C1~D%~~~lJ\\3l<~~o=

1!t~ffi*~*o.~~fI!lAo •• M~T- •• o.%~.!J!
lJ\\~~ol!!;$~~JI.%~ot5~*m'fm~o
For the past few days the weather has been truly fine. In
the days to come I would like you to come to my home
for lunch, and I hope that your second brother will come
too. There will be no other guests. I haven't had a conver-
sation with Su Yimen for a long time. Itwould be won-
derful if you could come soon. . .
To Mr. Tuiweng. Your ailing younger brother Dadizi

bows.

Seal:Mengdong Sheng [square intaglio]
Collection unknown

Published: Fu and Fu I973: 2I5
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20. Cheng Daoguang, c. I702 or later
-~C1C1I1il'IIil'.~~.o~.~'fT-.~'~~~JI.

*1'l'3l<z!)f1m0 etBM*m CI* 0 jf\Q.(jfffl~~,Jj;~lJO
ilm 0 ~f<iJA~II'J~Jlt0 ;t~JOOXT-j'iU~0 crr;tmCImfl!l'L'
.~.lJ\\of<iJ~&~$~?ltIT-j[o~~'f~~.~~
.om*T-~mol!!;$;t%~ot5~~m~o
Recently I have spent every day and every minute toiling
with brush and ink. It is all my fault that little Youde did
not turn out well and caused you trouble. He has already
been back here for two days. Your gift of honey tanger-
ines was truly wonderful, Who am I to have this pleasure?
Yet since it is you who offer them, I do not dare refuse.
For several days I have been thinking that Ruolao must
certainly be discouraged. How can he leave once again to
be a sojourner?
Many thanks. My body is constantly troublesome and

depressing. I will never be well.
To Mr. Tuiweng. YOUtailing younger brother Ji bows.

Seal: fangwai xiaoyao [square intaglio]. This seal, known only
from this one impression, can be translated as Wandering Free-
ly beyond This World.

Formerly Sotheby's

Published: Sotheby's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings, 2.9
November 1993, lot 43; from an Album of Letters by Various
Artists

2L Cheng Daoguang, c. I702 or later
~pfl;jH~ 0 7211il'T-IE0 ~ilJHJ> 0 etJS1ili~*o/J,m

W~JiJi",z'll'"l'i'f0 P.Ul!!;~;t~~%~ 0 t5~j<ijjflt~0

My appetite is still not back to normal, and the weather
is bad. Yesterday's medicine was wonderful: Please send
some more today. Will a small painting do to take care
of the matter you mentioned?
To old Mr. Tuiweng. Your ailing younger brother Ji

bows.

Seal:Dadizi (oval relief)

Shanghai Museum

Published: ST: IIO

22. Cheng Daoguang, c. 1702 or later!

7Cjlijjf\;t~;$%~0 ~~~~lIliI'J~mm#.~:Iil$0 ltIT-
-ocrr;t$~'1'o~C1~~T-~o~**A~~o7C~M
~zmol!!;$;t%~ot5~~~~~o
My regards to the old gentleman on this rainy day. Al-
though I enjoy this sort of thing beyond measure, I have
no capacity for it. Many thanks! Ruolao agrees to write
the characters on the box. My calligraphy spirit hasn't
been good for several days, and the results are not satis-
factory. With good weather I will tty again.
To Mr. Tuiweng. Your ailing brother Azhang bows.
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Seal: Dadizi (oval relief)
Shanghai Museum
Published: ST: IrO

23. Yiweng
~illi\:'l5ftjj\\\!\~Z,W, 0 IjJj,lHl OJl!tJl.Il( 0 11H1H/llf0.

B 0 l!l! a illi!!\ ' *:Ej:[sic);fjlfj® 0 IIFi!Um~rJJJ\A:, 0

mtt~~oL#jj%~*Ao~~~o
My grateful thanks for thinking compassionately of me.
I can see your excellency as early as tomorrow or the next
day. For a long time now a herd of lions has been terror-
izing my heart. With the weather humid and hot day af-
ter day, it is indeed not easy to bear. Yesterday Su Yimen
asked after you. The inscription on the bamboo painting
is finished.
To the honorable Mr. Yiweng. Ji bows.

Seals: None.
Formerly Sotheby's

Published: Sotheby's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings, 29
November 1993, lot 43; from an Album of Letters by Various
Artists

24. Yiweng, C.1702 or later

%~JttffJIOClifciliii1'f*)j>0 lit [sic )!ll\z ffil''!l' JUril2J<J'Gt£'
z;;RP*,Jil!J!t:oFj®!MilI\' jffifi:oFep:oFimttr.l0 .%~~j®,
~~~~OJ~oljJj~~~~~*~momm:oF~·#jjft
JI,%~ 0 IlJ!~J!~0

May your journey go smoothly and lead to great success.
When it is over,2 should you see the honorable Mr. Wen-
ting [BorduJ, could you tell him that it is only once in a
while that Ican get up straightaway, and that Iam shaky
on my feet. Once you have seen the paintings, if any last-
minute corrections are necessary, they can be done. If
I have the strength tomorrow morning, Iwill certainly
come to send you off.
Respectfully. To Mr. Yiweng. Ji bows.

Seal: Sibai Feng Zhong Ruoli Weng tushu [square intaglio]

Collection unknown

Published: Ming Qing huayuan chidu; Fu and Fu 1973: 21j

25. Yujun, c. 1705 Or later

1i>iBlIH,+zA:IL 0 tf<:'l51!bl~~1JJJJ0 fj!*m~up~
z*o~~:oF~j®~oLT~~~mJl,%~o~AIlJ!~~o
The illness is already eight Or nine tenths receded. I am
grateful for your divine powers. I would like to ask for
another two doses, which should complete the process.
There is no need for you to come in person.
To Mr. Yujun. The ailing Ji bows.

Seal: Dadizi, Ji [square intaglio]

Whereabouts unknown

Published: Fu and Fu 1973: 21j

1698, spring 1699, early 17°1, autumn 17°1, and both the
summer and autumn of 1707. See SLW 211 n. 97.
10. See Appendix 2, letters 10, 13, 2.3.

I r. See Appendix 2, letters 7 and 20, and the section "The
Painter's Desire" in Chapter 10.
12. See Appendix 2, letters 21 and 25.
13. For the album Chrysanthemums bequeathed to Li Lin,

see Li Lin 1708: 7167. Li's preface to his own book acknowl-
edges Shirao as one of the friends who contributed the cost
of printing the book, in Shitao's case through the donation of
a painting for sale.
14. There is no record that anyone else paid for his burial

on Shu Ridge in Yangzhou's northern outskirts.
IS. For the snuffbox, see Zheng Zhuolu 1961: 34-j. The

ritual vessel is mentioned in a 1701 painting inscription in
which he lists his teachers and students (SLW 133-8). For a
rubbing that Shitao owned and later gave away, see Appendix
2, letter 17j while his letter does not identify the rubbing in
question, DDZTHSB 4/8j-6 records a 1704 colophon to a
copy of the Chunhua ge tie, in which Shira a claims to have
seen more than ten versions and insists on the necessity for cal-
ligraphers to own a copy of that compendium. The writing
brush is known through the 170j calligraphy with which he
thanked the monk for the gift (Edwards 1967: cat. no. 34).
On the paintings by Bada, see the section "Shitao and Bacia
Shanren" in Chapter j.

16. From the inscription to Gazing at the Waterfall at Cui-
iiao Peak (see Figure (26).

17. DDZZ.
18. From the inscription to a A Lesson in Hoeing, 1700

(see Figure (89). See SLW 288.

Notes

ONE. SHITAO, YANGZHOU, AND MODERNITY

I. It was in 1710 that Kangxi initiated the first of the nu-
merous political trials of literati that were to mark the eigh-
teenth century. For a recent comprehensive study of this trial
of Dai Mingshi and others, see Durand 1992.
2. ZhengXie 1979: 16j.
3. This is misleading. Although Shitao's work was popular

in Yangzhou throughout the eighteenth century, due largely to
his continued favor among collectors from Huizhou merchant
families, he had much more than a simply local reputation.
At the time Zheng Xie made these remarks, in the second
quarter of the eighteenth century, Shitao was influential on
such non-Yangzhou painters as Zhang Geng, Hua Yan, Li
Fangying, and Gao Fenghan. Later in the century, his works
were collected in Beijing (Weng Fanggang [1733-1818], for
example, owned a number of his paintings) and Guangzhou,
where he was an important influence on late-eighteenth- and
early-nineteenth-cenrury painting by local artists.
4. For a general study of this problem, see Durand 1992.
5. As established by Richard Barnhart and Wang Fangyu

in Master of the Lotus Garden (1990; hereafter, Master).
6. None of the many descriptions of Shitao comment on his

height, suggesting that he was neither notably short nor nota-
bly tall.
7. Tao Wei, "Presented to Old Dadi," in his Cuanxiang (ap-

pendix to Tao Ji n.d., Zhouche ji).
8. Tao Ji, "Two Poems Presented to Monk Shitao," in

Zhouche ji, cited in QXLRT] 2Ib.
9. Even the very incomplete record we have of his illnesses

in the years after 1696 paints a sad picture: He is known to
have been ill in early 1697, in the winter of 1697-8, spring

337
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Seal: Dadizi (oval relief)
Shanghai Museum
Published: ST: IrO

23. Yiweng
~illi\:'l5ftjj\\\!\~Z,W, 0 IjJj,lHl OJl!tJl.Il( 0 11H1H/llf0.

B 0 l!l! a illi!!\ ' *:Ej:[sic);fjlfj® 0 IIFi!Um~rJJJ\A:, 0

mtt~~oL#jj%~*Ao~~~o
My grateful thanks for thinking compassionately of me.
I can see your excellency as early as tomorrow or the next
day. For a long time now a herd of lions has been terror-
izing my heart. With the weather humid and hot day af-
ter day, it is indeed not easy to bear. Yesterday Su Yimen
asked after you. The inscription on the bamboo painting
is finished.
To the honorable Mr. Yiweng. Ji bows.

Seals: None.
Formerly Sotheby's

Published: Sotheby's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings, 29
November 1993, lot 43; from an Album of Letters by Various
Artists

24. Yiweng, C.1702 or later

%~JttffJIOClifciliii1'f*)j>0 lit [sic )!ll\z ffil''!l' JUril2J<J'Gt£'
z;;RP*,Jil!J!t:oFj®!MilI\' jffifi:oFep:oFimttr.l0 .%~~j®,
~~~~OJ~oljJj~~~~~*~momm:oF~·#jjft
JI,%~ 0 IlJ!~J!~0

May your journey go smoothly and lead to great success.
When it is over,2 should you see the honorable Mr. Wen-
ting [BorduJ, could you tell him that it is only once in a
while that Ican get up straightaway, and that Iam shaky
on my feet. Once you have seen the paintings, if any last-
minute corrections are necessary, they can be done. If
I have the strength tomorrow morning, Iwill certainly
come to send you off.
Respectfully. To Mr. Yiweng. Ji bows.

Seal: Sibai Feng Zhong Ruoli Weng tushu [square intaglio]

Collection unknown

Published: Ming Qing huayuan chidu; Fu and Fu 1973: 21j

25. Yujun, c. 1705 Or later

1i>iBlIH,+zA:IL 0 tf<:'l51!bl~~1JJJJ0 fj!*m~up~
z*o~~:oF~j®~oLT~~~mJl,%~o~AIlJ!~~o
The illness is already eight Or nine tenths receded. I am
grateful for your divine powers. I would like to ask for
another two doses, which should complete the process.
There is no need for you to come in person.
To Mr. Yujun. The ailing Ji bows.

Seal: Dadizi, Ji [square intaglio]

Whereabouts unknown

Published: Fu and Fu 1973: 21j

1698, spring 1699, early 17°1, autumn 17°1, and both the
summer and autumn of 1707. See SLW 211 n. 97.
10. See Appendix 2, letters 10, 13, 2.3.

I r. See Appendix 2, letters 7 and 20, and the section "The
Painter's Desire" in Chapter 10.
12. See Appendix 2, letters 21 and 25.
13. For the album Chrysanthemums bequeathed to Li Lin,

see Li Lin 1708: 7167. Li's preface to his own book acknowl-
edges Shirao as one of the friends who contributed the cost
of printing the book, in Shitao's case through the donation of
a painting for sale.
14. There is no record that anyone else paid for his burial

on Shu Ridge in Yangzhou's northern outskirts.
IS. For the snuffbox, see Zheng Zhuolu 1961: 34-j. The

ritual vessel is mentioned in a 1701 painting inscription in
which he lists his teachers and students (SLW 133-8). For a
rubbing that Shitao owned and later gave away, see Appendix
2, letter 17j while his letter does not identify the rubbing in
question, DDZTHSB 4/8j-6 records a 1704 colophon to a
copy of the Chunhua ge tie, in which Shira a claims to have
seen more than ten versions and insists on the necessity for cal-
ligraphers to own a copy of that compendium. The writing
brush is known through the 170j calligraphy with which he
thanked the monk for the gift (Edwards 1967: cat. no. 34).
On the paintings by Bada, see the section "Shitao and Bacia
Shanren" in Chapter j.

16. From the inscription to Gazing at the Waterfall at Cui-
iiao Peak (see Figure (26).

17. DDZZ.
18. From the inscription to a A Lesson in Hoeing, 1700

(see Figure (89). See SLW 288.

Notes

ONE. SHITAO, YANGZHOU, AND MODERNITY

I. It was in 1710 that Kangxi initiated the first of the nu-
merous political trials of literati that were to mark the eigh-
teenth century. For a recent comprehensive study of this trial
of Dai Mingshi and others, see Durand 1992.
2. ZhengXie 1979: 16j.
3. This is misleading. Although Shitao's work was popular

in Yangzhou throughout the eighteenth century, due largely to
his continued favor among collectors from Huizhou merchant
families, he had much more than a simply local reputation.
At the time Zheng Xie made these remarks, in the second
quarter of the eighteenth century, Shitao was influential on
such non-Yangzhou painters as Zhang Geng, Hua Yan, Li
Fangying, and Gao Fenghan. Later in the century, his works
were collected in Beijing (Weng Fanggang [1733-1818], for
example, owned a number of his paintings) and Guangzhou,
where he was an important influence on late-eighteenth- and
early-nineteenth-cenrury painting by local artists.
4. For a general study of this problem, see Durand 1992.
5. As established by Richard Barnhart and Wang Fangyu

in Master of the Lotus Garden (1990; hereafter, Master).
6. None of the many descriptions of Shitao comment on his

height, suggesting that he was neither notably short nor nota-
bly tall.
7. Tao Wei, "Presented to Old Dadi," in his Cuanxiang (ap-

pendix to Tao Ji n.d., Zhouche ji).
8. Tao Ji, "Two Poems Presented to Monk Shitao," in

Zhouche ji, cited in QXLRT] 2Ib.
9. Even the very incomplete record we have of his illnesses

in the years after 1696 paints a sad picture: He is known to
have been ill in early 1697, in the winter of 1697-8, spring
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NOTES TO PP. 4-19

19· See Appendix 2, letter 10; Li Lin 1708: 7/49; and, for
the full painting inscription, SLW 289-9°.
20. See Appendix 2, letter 9.
21. It should be noted, however, that this has never been

proven. A certain caution is necessary since in Shitao's Yang-
zhou inscriptions of the late 16805 and early r6905 the studio
name, Hall of the Great Tree (Dashu Tang), is not found on
paintings executed in jinghui Monastery. Conversely, paint-
ings executed in the Hall of the Great Tree do not indicate the
location of the studio.
22. According to Lynn Struve, "in the mid-seventeenth cen-

tury the population of the city proper could hardly have ex-
ceeded 3°0,000." Struve, ed. and trans. 1993: 269 n. 17. Its
population c. 1843 was closer to 15°,000. See Finnane 1985:
118-19.
23. Spence 1966: 16.
24· On the pre-Qing development of Yangzhou, see Fin-

nane 1985, chap. I.

25· The watercourse seemingly leading north opposite the
gate tower does exist and corresponded at the time to a sec-
ond water gate to the left of Zhenhuai Gate, not shown in
the painting.
26. J. B. Du Halde, The General History of China (trans-

lated from the French). 4 vols. London: ]. Watts. Du HaJde
1741: vol. I, 141. Cited by Finnane 1985: 28I.
27· Finnane 1985: 282-3.
28. From a manuscript of poems datable to 1697. SeeMing

and Qing Painting from the Guangzhou Art Gallery (I986),
cat. nos. 34.9-14.
29· Di Yt's account of learning the Manchu language is in

Zhang Chao, ed. '990 (yiji, 1700): 225-6.
3°· YZHFL 9, headings 61-2. Although Li Dou's preface

to his work was written in 1795, the book was written over
a period of several decades.
31. In a poem entitled "On Passing the Monk Shitao's For-

,merHome," the early-eighteenth-century Yangzhou poet Min
Hua writes: "Today the colors of the spring waters outside the
house gate /Still seem stained with the traces of his ablutions."
QXLRT] 2Ia.
32. SLW 30I.
33. DDZZ.
34· YZHFL 9, headings 55-7.
35· Shitao refers to the Tianning Monastery address in a

1687 (summer) inscription on the painting Fine Rain and
Dragon Pines in the Shanghai Museum 1ST 3), under the rath-
er obscure name "Huacang Xiayuan," or "Huacang Auxiliary
Monastery." The term "Huacang" has no meaning in itself; it
must refer to the preservation (cang) of the /vuatamasaea Sutra
(H~ayan jing) in the Surra Preservation Hall (Cangjing Yuan),
which was located within Tianning Monastery's "auxiliary
monastery" in the monastery's East Garden. The tradition that
the earliest translation of the Auatarnasah a Sutra into Chinese
had been undertaken at Tianning Monastery was the temple's
great claim to fame and was embodied architecturally in two
symbolically important buildings: the Avaramasakn Hall in the
main part of the complex and the Sutra Preservation Hall in
its "auxiliary monastery." Shitao's reference to the monastery
is thus that of a Buddhist insider (YZHFL 4, headings 7, 44,
5°)·
36. See the section "The Floods of 1705" in Chapter 3.

37· Li Gan 1992. For a late-sixteenth-century account of
Yangzhou fashions, see Brook 1998: 220; for a late-eighteenth-
century one, see YZHFL 9, heading 18.
38. Finnane 1985.
39· For a discussion of the full set of songs in relation to

the handscroll, see SLW 252-69.
40. For an eyewitness account of the massacre, see Struve,

ed. and trans. 1993: 28-48.
41. For various contemporary references to a postal ser-

vice, see the correspondence between Zhang Chao and Kong
Shangren (Gu Guorui and Liu Hui 198Ia,b). On travel in this
period, see Brook 1988. On the banking system and Yang-
zhou's involvement in interregional trade, see Finnane 1985.
42· See Giddens 1990. Naturally, I do not subscribe to Gid-

dens's Eurocentric view of the history of modernity, which has
been critiqued by other sociological theorists such as Roland
Robertson (1995) and]an Nederveen Pieterse (I995).
43· Spence 1966; Finnane 1985.
44· On merchant philanthropy in Yangzhou, see the biog-

raphies in LHYFZ 1693; also Finnane 1985: 91-2,170-83.
45· Rowe 1989: 4.
46. The presence of indentured servantry and slavery in

Yangzhou can be inferred from the prominence of merchant
families from Huizhou, a region where these practices were
particularly strong. On the increase in bondservants, see Bro-
kaw 199" 8-9.
47· Giddens '990: 27.
48. The terminology of dominant and dominated class

fractions is Pierre Bourdieu's (1991). American historiography
of China continues generally to shy away from any analogy
with the European bourgeoisie, even as it moves toward a the-
ory of urban and local elites. Thus Joseph Esherick and Mary
Rankin, for example, argue that "[gjiven the frequent overlap
between merchant and gentry resources and strategies, late
imperial merchants do not generally fit the model of the Euro-
pean bourgeoisie, which originated as a legally, socially and
occupationally distinct estate" (eds. 1990: 13). However, the
more useful analogy may be not between merchants and the
bourgeoisie but between the diversified elite, in which both
merchants and gentry found a place, and the bourgeoisie.
Moreover, the analogy does not have to be based on a shared
model; what may be more helpful is an analogous relation to
economic power. T. J. Clark's definition of the difference be-
tween bourgeoisie and petit-bourgeoisie does not strike me as
essentially different from the social situation prevailing in Shi-
tao's Yangzhou: "A bourgeois, for me, is someone possessing
the wherewithal to intervene in at least some of the important
economic decisions shaping his or her own life (and those of
others). A bourgeois, for me, is someone expecting (reason-
ably) to pass on that power to the kids. A petty bourgeois is
Someone who has no such leverage or security, and certainly
no such dynastic expectations, but who nonetheless identifies
wholeheartedly with those who do. Of course this means that
everything depends, from age to age and moment to moment,
on the particular forms in which such identifications can take
place" (I994: 35 n. 9).
49· Ropp 1981; Naquin and Rawski 1987: 232-6j Rowe

1989: 2-5, 1990, 1992: Ij Clunas 1991: 4.
50. Rowe 1992: I.

5L Rowe '989: 3-4.
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52. Clunas 199f.
53. Ibid., 17L
54. Ibid.
55. Yu Ying-shih 1987; Tan Tingbin 1990; Shan Guoqiang

'992.
56. In addition to Lan Ying and Ding Yunpeng as docu-

mented by Shan Guoqiang (ibid.), another case in point is Wu
Bin's well-known friendship with Mi Wanzhong (Cahill
1982b). For Wei Zhihuang's frequentation of elite circles, see
Kim 1985: vol. 2, 32.
57. Both Wu Bin and Chen Hongshou did have a tenuous

connection with the court, receiving appointments as sheren
(secretariat drafter), Wu in 1628 and Chen in 1640. Kim
1985: vol. 2, 43 n. '57 and 46 n. 164-
58. Conversely, court taste itself was influenced by urban

developments, as can be seen from the decorative objects pro-
duced for the court in the early seventeenth century.
59. Pears r988.
60. This is the context for the popularity of theories of

sudden enlightenment, as adopted by Dong Qichang and oth-
ers.
61. A. J. Hay 1992. In a variant of this view, Chun-shu and

Shelley (Hsueh-lun) Chang, in their wide-ranging study of Li
Yu and seventeenth-century culture (Chang and Chang 1992:
345-9), see what they call the "encounter with modernity"
as extending into the early Qing before falling prey to the ide-
ological offensive from the Qing state. While I would not dis-
pute the fact that the Qing state moved increasi~gly agg.res-
sively into the central ideological space of urban life, I believe
that this did not so much suppress modernity as change its
language.
62. Rowe 1990: 243. For similar assessments, see Spence

and Wills, eds. 1979: xvii; Rawski 1985: 10.
63. Naquin and Rawski 1987: 105.
64. Metzger 1972; Naquin and Rawski 1987: 21-7; Song

Dexuan 1990: 59-69.
65. Kerr 1986.
66. Rosenzweig 1973, 1974-5, 1989.
67. Clunas, it should be said, is skeptical of this, noting

the disappearance of taste as an issue in published discourse
(1991). However, what made taste a compelling issue in the
late Ming was the realization that social status was. not, ~f~er
all, immutable; anything bearing on this sudden SOCialfluidity
was a matter of wide concern. The fall of the Ming dynasty
inevitably rendered such rapid changes suspect, a shift reflect-
ed in the replacement of discourses of status advancement
with discourses of social stability (see Brokaw '99')' It would
be a mistake, however, to infer from this shift in disco~rs~ that
the substance of sociocultural change (as opposed to Its Inter-
pretation) had radically changed. At best, it may have slowed
down; more important, by 1700 it was a much more ~aml~lar
and thus less noteworthy phenomenon. The Kangxi-period
fascination with fashion is discussed in the section "The Am-
biguous Sbi" in Chapter 2.
68. Balandier '985, esp. 132; Kubler '962.
69. A.]. Hay 1992: 4.16.
70. Ryckmans 1970: 38.
71. This and the preceding quotation are from Chapter

Three of Shitao's treatise on painting, Hua pu. For transla-
tions, see Ryckmans 1970: 32; Strassberg 1989: 65·

72. For illuminating discussions of European examples, see
Alpers 1988 and Koerner '993.
73. Although the Euro-American category of the aesthetic

is alien to the Chinese context, this argument owes a debt to
the philosophical arguments of Andrew Bowie (I997) on sub-
jectivity and the aesthetic.
74. For a similar argument in a very different context, see

Andrew Hemingway's 1992 study of the painting of Consta-
ble.

TWO. THE CONSPICUOUS CONSUMPTION
OF TIME

I. As indicated by its tide, this chapter is indebted in its
general orientation to Thorstein Veblen's classic sociological
study The Theory of the Leisure Class (Veblen 1994). As my
use of the concept of distinction suggests, the analysis also
owes much to the work of a more recent sociologist, Pierre
Bourdieu.
2. Cynthia Brokaw points out that the late Ming and early

Qing "was ... the time when tenants and bondservants were
expressing their dissatisfaction with status restrictions through
renr-resisrance struggles and outright rebellion" (1991: 201).
3. Mann '997: 38.
4. A reference to bondservants, i.e., those in indentured ser-

vitude, a status that could in some circumstances be hereditary.
5. My translation draws partly on Fiedler 1998.
6. Ye Xian'en 1983; Wiens 1990.
7. Mann '997: 38-9.
8. lowe the term "sociomoral" to Brokaw 1991.
9. Iconographically, the painting appears to be related to

a Song dynasty theme represented in an anonymous Southern
Song album leaf in square format in the Museum of Fine Arts,
Boston, Returning from a Village Feast (Wu T'ung 1997:
205-6).
10. Brokaw 1991: 7-8, citing Wiens 1973.
II. Rowe 1990: 251.
12. Ibid.: 22-5; Mann 1997' 57.
'3. Weidner 1988.
14. Gao Qipei, Travel Impressions, album, 1708, leaf 10,

Shanghai Museum. Reproduced in Ruitenbeek 1992: 122.
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Zhang ]ingjie.
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Mengzhu's account of meeting Lu'an Benyue (n.d.: 9/r2a-
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16. Luohan Leaning on an Old Tree, hanging scroll

(Shanghai Museum), reproduced in ST 22.
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tao's landscape representation is a denial of the "taskscape"
of which any real landscape is an embodiment.
21. On Shirao's exploration of the busy man's relation to

leisure in an inscription to the Landscapes for Liu Shitou, Mu-
seum of Fine Arts, Boston, see the section "The 1703 Albums
for Mr. Liu" (and Figure 153) in Chapter 8.
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36. See the section "The Floods of 1705" in Chapter 3.
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12. Ibid.: 22-5; Mann 1997' 57.
'3. Weidner 1988.
14. Gao Qipei, Travel Impressions, album, 1708, leaf 10,
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22. From the Landscapes Painted during Leisure from Ill-
ness, see Fu and Fu 1973: 254.
23. I here borrow the terminology of Niklas Luhmann

(1993: 778-9).
24. For a modern historical account of these events, see

Wakeman 1985. For a contemporary accunr, see Struve, ed.
and trans. 1993: 64-5. A systematic late-seventeenth-century
account of changes in dress between Ming and Qing is Ye
Mengzhu n.d.: 8/3a-6a.
25· "There are certainly contemporary regulations on

dress, but they were not established for my generation in the
wilderness. Formerly, when I traveled in the cities ofWu, Chu,
and Yue (south-central China and Jiangnan), I saw many who
wore the wide-sleeved gown with stitched roundel. In the
western and northern areas of jin, Zheng, and Wei I also saw
many who wore felt and horse-hair hats. For several decades
they did not change, and the authorities never arrested them
for bleach of regulations." Li Gan 1992 (in Zhang Chao and
Wang Zhuo, eds. '992: er;i): r r/aa.
26. Li Lin 1708: 7167.
27· Balandier 1985: 100-4.
28. On the early origins of this practice, see Keightley 1990.

On the Ming, see Huang Zhanyue 1988j Rawski 1988. Huang
seems to suggest that the practice also extended in some cases
to wives and concubines of members of the gentry. Different
forms of accompanying-in-death were also used in Manchu
aristocratic burials in the seventeenth century, including that
of the Shunzhi emperor in 1660. The practice was finally abol-
ished in 1673 (Huang Zhanyue 1988; Rawski 1988).
29· The classical reference was the Liji, which stipulates:

"Three years are considered as the extreme limit of mourning;
but though (his parents) are out of sight, a son does not forget
them." Legge, trans. 1968: 124.
30. The locus classicus of the paradigm is found in the an-

cient classic of statecraft, The Book of Documents (Shu jing):
Jizi, prince of the Shang, convinced of the passage of the man-
date to the Zhou, accepted the status of a Zhou servitor. On
voluntary servitude in reference to the Yuan period and the
painting of Zhao Mengfu, see J. S. Hay 1989.
31. Jennifer Jay (1991) has found this to be true for the

Song-Yuan transition as well.
32. The following analysis is indebted to Paul Ricoeur's

Time and Narrative (1990), particularly the section "Histor-
ical Intentionality" in vol. I, 175-23°, and his discussion of
different forms of historical time, "Between Lived Time and
Universal Time," in vol. 3, 104-26.
33· For a development of this idea in relation to paintings

by Zhang Peng and Gong Xian, see J. S. Hay 1994b.
34· For the concept of the means of reproduction of the dy-

nastic system, see Elman 1991. Also relevant here is the Gram-
scian idea "that cultural domination works by consent. " Gauri
Viswanathan, Masks of Conquest: Literary Study and British
Rule in India (New York: Columbia University Press, 1989),
I, cited in Roy 1994: 84.
35· Cited by Wang Sizhi and Liu Pengyun in an analysis of

evolving yimin stances that argues against taking the political
opposition of the yimin too much at face value. Wang and Liu
1989.
36. Cf. the concept of "internal emigration," which has

been applied to the work of certain painters who remained
in Germany after the Nazis took power. See Elliott 1990.

37. See, for example, his Wintry Landscape with Figures
(1691) and The Apricot Flower Studio (1696), both in the col-
lection of the Palace Museum, Beijing, reproduced in Gugong
bowuyuan cang Qing dai Yangzhou huajia zuopin, nos. 6-7.
38. Or, in Chen jiru's second simile, "like the characters

that can still be seen after the candle by which one was writ-
ing finally goes out." Liang Weiqu 1986: 8lra.
39. My argument here and below is indebted to Pierre

Bourdieu's theoretical essay "The Production of Belief: Con-
tribution to an Economy of Symbolic Goods" (1993'). Yuan
Mei in the eighteenth century recognized the yimin strategy of
investment, denouncing one of Shirao's writer friends, Du jun,
for having made a reputation for himself "on the ruins of the
nation." Durand 1992: 346 n. 84-
40. For a discussion of this painting and its inscribed poem,

see SLW 480-3.
41. See the section "The Functionalist Ethic" in Chapter 8.
42. Letter 18; see Appendix 2.
43- For a more detailed discussion of Shitaos relationship

with Wu Yuqiao, which also led to a portrait of Wu in 1698,
see SLW 35'-8. On Shitao's relationship with the Wu family,
including Wu Yuqiao, see Wang Shiqing 1987.
44. SLW 246-8.
45. On the biehao tu, or "sobriquet picture," as a genre,

see Clapp 1991; Liu Jiu'an '993; Chou '997.
46. Liu Miao '985: 409-11.
47- Unfortunately, this is one of four original leaves that

were lost and were later replaced by copies commissioned by
its Republican-period owner, Pang Yuanji, from Zhang Da-
qian,
48. Liu Miao '985'
49- Another example among Shitao's patrons was the Xu

family based in Yizheng, near Yangzhou. Xu Songling pursued
examination studies before going into business, and both his
brother and his uncle were jinshi graduates serving in govern-
ment. See Wang Shiqing '98,a.
50. Liu Miao '985: 408-9.
51. Esherick and Rankin, eds. 1990: 12.
52. "For Mr. Fei Dushan's Seventieth Birthday," from Luo-

fan lou wenji, 24, cited in Zhang Haipeng and Wang Ting-
yuan, eds. 1985: 386-7.
53· Bol '992: 32.
54· Ibid.: 75·
55· "We use 'elite' because it can encompass all people-

gentry, merchants, militarists, community leaders - at the top
of local structures and because the diverse resources of elite
families often place them in more than one functional cate-
gory" (Esherick and Rankin, eds. 1990: 12).
56. For earlier texts of this kind, see Hsi 1972.
57· LHYFZ 1693: 27/40b; 27/47a-49a.
58. Ibid.: 26/47a-48b.
59· Xu Songling, as a stipend student (linsheng), obtained

(by purchase?) a secretariat drafter (zhongshu sheren) position
(Wang Shiqing 198Ia). His brother Xu Huanling served as
Hedong Salt Commissioner (LHYFZ 1748: 361'33). Cheng
[un was a supplementary tribute student (bu gongsheng), not
in Yangzhou but in Renhe in Zhejiang (LHYFZ 1748: 33h4a;
Zhu Yizun 1983: 7719I>-Ioa). Of his four sons, Cheng Jie
gained the jinsbi degree in '709, Cheng Qi and Cheng Zhe
were both tribute students (Yangzhou) who served as depart-
mental vice magistrates (zhou tongzhi), and Cheng Ming was

82. For an account of just such an occasion, when Xiao
was the guide for the Liang-Huai Salt Commissioner, Cao Yin
(1658-'712), see Cao Yin 1978: 7/16b.
83. Li Lin's colophon to the lost painting, which he saw in

Shitao's studio, is in Li Lin 1708: 19177. For Chen Pengnian's
colophon to a portrait of Xiao, not necessarily the same one,
see Chen Pengnian 1762: 10/4a.
84. Kong Shangren 1962: 459.
85. There is now a large literature on the cultural activities

of Huizhou merchant families, including Ye Xian'en 1983;
Liu Miao 1985. On Huizhou collecting of paintings, both old
and contemporary, see Kuo 1989.
86_ The name of Cheng Songgao comes up in Jinqing tang

shi, in Zhuo Erkan's record of a poetry gathering in the late
1680s at which other acquaintances of Shitao were present
(1960: 24b). The Cheng Songgao (Cheng Yan) with the rank
of secretariat drafter (sheren) is mentioned by Zha Shenxing,
who met him in Xuancheng in 1696, at which time Cheng
came to see him from Tongcheng (Zha Shenxing 1986: 594-
5). Either of these men, who may in fact be one and the same,
is more likely to be the Songgao mentioned here than the much
more famous Hangzhou remnant subject Mao like (I633-
1708) who was identified as the patron by Lippe '962.
87. Plaks 1987: 51.
88. Cited by ibid.: 50.
89. The use of the term was pioneered by James Cahill

(1982a) and then taken up in relation to painting by Andrew
Plaks (1991). POI a vely different use of the term, see A. J.
Hay '992: 4.14.
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a National University student (taixuesheng) (Zhu Yizun 1983:
77/8b-l0a).Huang You (see "The Travels of Huang You" in
Chapter 3) became magistrate of Zhaozhou in Yunnan. Huang
jixian as a tribute student (Yangzhou) became magistrate of
Chengwu County in Shandong (Li Lin 1708: 5/99a) and later
district magistrate [zhixian] of Jianyang in Fujian (LHYFZ
1748: 36lr4b). Xiang Yin was a tribure student (Yangzhou)
and served as prefect of Yan'an in Shenxi (LHYFZ 1748: 361
14b). Hong Zhengzhi (another student of Shitao) was granted
official lank by imperial decree in the Qianlong period (Zhang
Haipeng and Wang Tingyuan, eds. 1985: 383-4). This list is
undoubtedly incomplete.
60. Yao Tinglin 1982: 165.
61. Ye Mengzhu n.d.: 8/5a.
62. Li Gan 1992. Descended as he was from a prominent

gentry family, it is not entirely surprising that he prefaced his
essay on social customs with an excoriation of the decline in
social values since the mid-sixteenth century, which he feared
was only likely to continue.
63. Ye Mengzhu n.d.: 8lra-6a.
64. Vinograd 1992a: 48-55.
65_ For an extended discussion of these three portraits, see

SLW 353-81.
66. Yu Zhiding and Shen Ying, Whiling Away the Summer,

hanging scroll, r696, Nelson Gallery-Atkins Museum of Art.
Reproduced in Eight Dynasties of Chinese Painting, cat. no.
258.
67· Brokaw 1991.
68. On the basis of signatures and seals. See SLW 330 n.

96. The painting has also been discussed by Aschwin Lippe
(1962) and by Richard Barnhart (1983).
69. My translations of this and other texts inscribed on the

painting are modified from earlier ones by Lippe 1962.
70. Ruan Yuan 1920: 6lr5b.
71. On Sui references in Shitao's paintings of Yangzhou's

northwestern outskirts, see SLW 252-72.
72. At the beginning of the nineteenth century, a specific

site was identified by Ruan Yuan and Yi Bingshou (1754-
18 I 5) as the location of the tomb. They had a stele elected,
with an inscription written by Yi Bingshou, that still stands
today.
73. For examples of the use of "Precious City" to describe

the Ming mausoleum, see Kong Shangren 1962: 145·
74. Master, cat. no. 7·
75. These letters are translated in full in Appendix 2.
76. Whereabouts unknown. Reproduced in Tanaka Kenryo

'945: vol. I.
77- According to Wang Shiqing (personal communication),

a copy of this rare anthology is in the library of the Shehui
Kexueyuan, Beijing.
78. Strassberg 1983: 365-6.
79· WDQS, juan 97.
80. Su was present when the artist painted a Huangshan

handscroll in 1700 (see Figure 107), which Shitao dedicat-
ed to him. Shitao also allowed him to inscribe his 1674 self-
portrait. In addition, he mentions Su Pi in two letters (Appen-
dix 2, letters 19 and 23), in one of which he complains th~t
Su never comes to see him any more. According toWang Shi-
qing (personal communication), Su was the son of Su Weilie,
zi Wugong, hao Pisano
81. Li Lin '708: 15/4Ia fl.

•

THREE. THE COMMON CLAIM ON DYNASTIC
NARRATIVE

I, For an exhaustive study, see Durand 1992.
2. Wu I970; Durand 1992: 189-218.
3. See Pei Xihuang n.d.: 2h7a-41b, Pei Mi 1938: 207/13-

zb; Hummel 1943; Yang Xiangkui 1985; and the section
"The Functionalist Ethic" in Chapter 8.
4. This aspect of the work brings to mind the slightly ear-

lier travel paintings of Huang Xiangjian (16°9-73) document-
ing his 1651-3 journey from Suzhou to distant Yunnan to find
and bring back his parents. See Struve, ed. and trans. 1993:
162-78.
5. For another, contemporary example of a handscroll

painting of ancestral tombs, see Chen Pengnian 1762: shiji,
3/3Ib.
6. YangXiangkui 1985: 267.
7. Hummel '943: 240; YZFZ 33/131>-'4a.
8. Xie Guozhen 1981.
9. Zheng Da 1962.
10. Fei Xihuang n.d. 3/46a-50a. Pei Xihuang knew Dai

Mingshi well, both men having frequented the circle of Huang
Zhuolai in Beijing c. 1696. See Durand 1992: 106 n. 58,126
nn·3,4·
II. Zhuo Erkan, ed. 1960: 40-3, 2)8-43.
12. Ibid.: 42.
13. Fei Mi n.d. Yanfeng shichao (manuscript copy), tiyong

25a.
14. Pei Xihuang 1970.
15. Fei Xihuang n.d.: 2/27a-4Ib, "Fei Zhongwen xian-

sheng jiazhuan."
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22. From the Landscapes Painted during Leisure from Ill-
ness, see Fu and Fu 1973: 254.
23. I here borrow the terminology of Niklas Luhmann

(1993: 778-9).
24. For a modern historical account of these events, see

Wakeman 1985. For a contemporary accunr, see Struve, ed.
and trans. 1993: 64-5. A systematic late-seventeenth-century
account of changes in dress between Ming and Qing is Ye
Mengzhu n.d.: 8/3a-6a.
25· "There are certainly contemporary regulations on

dress, but they were not established for my generation in the
wilderness. Formerly, when I traveled in the cities ofWu, Chu,
and Yue (south-central China and Jiangnan), I saw many who
wore the wide-sleeved gown with stitched roundel. In the
western and northern areas of jin, Zheng, and Wei I also saw
many who wore felt and horse-hair hats. For several decades
they did not change, and the authorities never arrested them
for bleach of regulations." Li Gan 1992 (in Zhang Chao and
Wang Zhuo, eds. '992: er;i): r r/aa.
26. Li Lin 1708: 7167.
27· Balandier 1985: 100-4.
28. On the early origins of this practice, see Keightley 1990.

On the Ming, see Huang Zhanyue 1988j Rawski 1988. Huang
seems to suggest that the practice also extended in some cases
to wives and concubines of members of the gentry. Different
forms of accompanying-in-death were also used in Manchu
aristocratic burials in the seventeenth century, including that
of the Shunzhi emperor in 1660. The practice was finally abol-
ished in 1673 (Huang Zhanyue 1988; Rawski 1988).
29· The classical reference was the Liji, which stipulates:

"Three years are considered as the extreme limit of mourning;
but though (his parents) are out of sight, a son does not forget
them." Legge, trans. 1968: 124.
30. The locus classicus of the paradigm is found in the an-

cient classic of statecraft, The Book of Documents (Shu jing):
Jizi, prince of the Shang, convinced of the passage of the man-
date to the Zhou, accepted the status of a Zhou servitor. On
voluntary servitude in reference to the Yuan period and the
painting of Zhao Mengfu, see J. S. Hay 1989.
31. Jennifer Jay (1991) has found this to be true for the

Song-Yuan transition as well.
32. The following analysis is indebted to Paul Ricoeur's

Time and Narrative (1990), particularly the section "Histor-
ical Intentionality" in vol. I, 175-23°, and his discussion of
different forms of historical time, "Between Lived Time and
Universal Time," in vol. 3, 104-26.
33· For a development of this idea in relation to paintings

by Zhang Peng and Gong Xian, see J. S. Hay 1994b.
34· For the concept of the means of reproduction of the dy-

nastic system, see Elman 1991. Also relevant here is the Gram-
scian idea "that cultural domination works by consent. " Gauri
Viswanathan, Masks of Conquest: Literary Study and British
Rule in India (New York: Columbia University Press, 1989),
I, cited in Roy 1994: 84.
35· Cited by Wang Sizhi and Liu Pengyun in an analysis of

evolving yimin stances that argues against taking the political
opposition of the yimin too much at face value. Wang and Liu
1989.
36. Cf. the concept of "internal emigration," which has

been applied to the work of certain painters who remained
in Germany after the Nazis took power. See Elliott 1990.

37. See, for example, his Wintry Landscape with Figures
(1691) and The Apricot Flower Studio (1696), both in the col-
lection of the Palace Museum, Beijing, reproduced in Gugong
bowuyuan cang Qing dai Yangzhou huajia zuopin, nos. 6-7.
38. Or, in Chen jiru's second simile, "like the characters

that can still be seen after the candle by which one was writ-
ing finally goes out." Liang Weiqu 1986: 8lra.
39. My argument here and below is indebted to Pierre

Bourdieu's theoretical essay "The Production of Belief: Con-
tribution to an Economy of Symbolic Goods" (1993'). Yuan
Mei in the eighteenth century recognized the yimin strategy of
investment, denouncing one of Shirao's writer friends, Du jun,
for having made a reputation for himself "on the ruins of the
nation." Durand 1992: 346 n. 84-
40. For a discussion of this painting and its inscribed poem,

see SLW 480-3.
41. See the section "The Functionalist Ethic" in Chapter 8.
42. Letter 18; see Appendix 2.
43- For a more detailed discussion of Shitaos relationship

with Wu Yuqiao, which also led to a portrait of Wu in 1698,
see SLW 35'-8. On Shitao's relationship with the Wu family,
including Wu Yuqiao, see Wang Shiqing 1987.
44. SLW 246-8.
45. On the biehao tu, or "sobriquet picture," as a genre,

see Clapp 1991; Liu Jiu'an '993; Chou '997.
46. Liu Miao '985: 409-11.
47- Unfortunately, this is one of four original leaves that

were lost and were later replaced by copies commissioned by
its Republican-period owner, Pang Yuanji, from Zhang Da-
qian,
48. Liu Miao '985'
49- Another example among Shitao's patrons was the Xu

family based in Yizheng, near Yangzhou. Xu Songling pursued
examination studies before going into business, and both his
brother and his uncle were jinshi graduates serving in govern-
ment. See Wang Shiqing '98,a.
50. Liu Miao '985: 408-9.
51. Esherick and Rankin, eds. 1990: 12.
52. "For Mr. Fei Dushan's Seventieth Birthday," from Luo-

fan lou wenji, 24, cited in Zhang Haipeng and Wang Ting-
yuan, eds. 1985: 386-7.
53· Bol '992: 32.
54· Ibid.: 75·
55· "We use 'elite' because it can encompass all people-

gentry, merchants, militarists, community leaders - at the top
of local structures and because the diverse resources of elite
families often place them in more than one functional cate-
gory" (Esherick and Rankin, eds. 1990: 12).
56. For earlier texts of this kind, see Hsi 1972.
57· LHYFZ 1693: 27/40b; 27/47a-49a.
58. Ibid.: 26/47a-48b.
59· Xu Songling, as a stipend student (linsheng), obtained

(by purchase?) a secretariat drafter (zhongshu sheren) position
(Wang Shiqing 198Ia). His brother Xu Huanling served as
Hedong Salt Commissioner (LHYFZ 1748: 361'33). Cheng
[un was a supplementary tribute student (bu gongsheng), not
in Yangzhou but in Renhe in Zhejiang (LHYFZ 1748: 33h4a;
Zhu Yizun 1983: 7719I>-Ioa). Of his four sons, Cheng Jie
gained the jinsbi degree in '709, Cheng Qi and Cheng Zhe
were both tribute students (Yangzhou) who served as depart-
mental vice magistrates (zhou tongzhi), and Cheng Ming was

82. For an account of just such an occasion, when Xiao
was the guide for the Liang-Huai Salt Commissioner, Cao Yin
(1658-'712), see Cao Yin 1978: 7/16b.
83. Li Lin's colophon to the lost painting, which he saw in

Shitao's studio, is in Li Lin 1708: 19177. For Chen Pengnian's
colophon to a portrait of Xiao, not necessarily the same one,
see Chen Pengnian 1762: 10/4a.
84. Kong Shangren 1962: 459.
85. There is now a large literature on the cultural activities

of Huizhou merchant families, including Ye Xian'en 1983;
Liu Miao 1985. On Huizhou collecting of paintings, both old
and contemporary, see Kuo 1989.
86_ The name of Cheng Songgao comes up in Jinqing tang

shi, in Zhuo Erkan's record of a poetry gathering in the late
1680s at which other acquaintances of Shitao were present
(1960: 24b). The Cheng Songgao (Cheng Yan) with the rank
of secretariat drafter (sheren) is mentioned by Zha Shenxing,
who met him in Xuancheng in 1696, at which time Cheng
came to see him from Tongcheng (Zha Shenxing 1986: 594-
5). Either of these men, who may in fact be one and the same,
is more likely to be the Songgao mentioned here than the much
more famous Hangzhou remnant subject Mao like (I633-
1708) who was identified as the patron by Lippe '962.
87. Plaks 1987: 51.
88. Cited by ibid.: 50.
89. The use of the term was pioneered by James Cahill

(1982a) and then taken up in relation to painting by Andrew
Plaks (1991). POI a vely different use of the term, see A. J.
Hay '992: 4.14.
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a National University student (taixuesheng) (Zhu Yizun 1983:
77/8b-l0a).Huang You (see "The Travels of Huang You" in
Chapter 3) became magistrate of Zhaozhou in Yunnan. Huang
jixian as a tribute student (Yangzhou) became magistrate of
Chengwu County in Shandong (Li Lin 1708: 5/99a) and later
district magistrate [zhixian] of Jianyang in Fujian (LHYFZ
1748: 36lr4b). Xiang Yin was a tribure student (Yangzhou)
and served as prefect of Yan'an in Shenxi (LHYFZ 1748: 361
14b). Hong Zhengzhi (another student of Shitao) was granted
official lank by imperial decree in the Qianlong period (Zhang
Haipeng and Wang Tingyuan, eds. 1985: 383-4). This list is
undoubtedly incomplete.
60. Yao Tinglin 1982: 165.
61. Ye Mengzhu n.d.: 8/5a.
62. Li Gan 1992. Descended as he was from a prominent

gentry family, it is not entirely surprising that he prefaced his
essay on social customs with an excoriation of the decline in
social values since the mid-sixteenth century, which he feared
was only likely to continue.
63. Ye Mengzhu n.d.: 8lra-6a.
64. Vinograd 1992a: 48-55.
65_ For an extended discussion of these three portraits, see

SLW 353-81.
66. Yu Zhiding and Shen Ying, Whiling Away the Summer,

hanging scroll, r696, Nelson Gallery-Atkins Museum of Art.
Reproduced in Eight Dynasties of Chinese Painting, cat. no.
258.
67· Brokaw 1991.
68. On the basis of signatures and seals. See SLW 330 n.

96. The painting has also been discussed by Aschwin Lippe
(1962) and by Richard Barnhart (1983).
69. My translations of this and other texts inscribed on the

painting are modified from earlier ones by Lippe 1962.
70. Ruan Yuan 1920: 6lr5b.
71. On Sui references in Shitao's paintings of Yangzhou's

northwestern outskirts, see SLW 252-72.
72. At the beginning of the nineteenth century, a specific

site was identified by Ruan Yuan and Yi Bingshou (1754-
18 I 5) as the location of the tomb. They had a stele elected,
with an inscription written by Yi Bingshou, that still stands
today.
73. For examples of the use of "Precious City" to describe

the Ming mausoleum, see Kong Shangren 1962: 145·
74. Master, cat. no. 7·
75. These letters are translated in full in Appendix 2.
76. Whereabouts unknown. Reproduced in Tanaka Kenryo

'945: vol. I.
77- According to Wang Shiqing (personal communication),

a copy of this rare anthology is in the library of the Shehui
Kexueyuan, Beijing.
78. Strassberg 1983: 365-6.
79· WDQS, juan 97.
80. Su was present when the artist painted a Huangshan

handscroll in 1700 (see Figure 107), which Shitao dedicat-
ed to him. Shitao also allowed him to inscribe his 1674 self-
portrait. In addition, he mentions Su Pi in two letters (Appen-
dix 2, letters 19 and 23), in one of which he complains th~t
Su never comes to see him any more. According toWang Shi-
qing (personal communication), Su was the son of Su Weilie,
zi Wugong, hao Pisano
81. Li Lin '708: 15/4Ia fl.

•

THREE. THE COMMON CLAIM ON DYNASTIC
NARRATIVE

I, For an exhaustive study, see Durand 1992.
2. Wu I970; Durand 1992: 189-218.
3. See Pei Xihuang n.d.: 2h7a-41b, Pei Mi 1938: 207/13-

zb; Hummel 1943; Yang Xiangkui 1985; and the section
"The Functionalist Ethic" in Chapter 8.
4. This aspect of the work brings to mind the slightly ear-

lier travel paintings of Huang Xiangjian (16°9-73) document-
ing his 1651-3 journey from Suzhou to distant Yunnan to find
and bring back his parents. See Struve, ed. and trans. 1993:
162-78.
5. For another, contemporary example of a handscroll

painting of ancestral tombs, see Chen Pengnian 1762: shiji,
3/3Ib.
6. YangXiangkui 1985: 267.
7. Hummel '943: 240; YZFZ 33/131>-'4a.
8. Xie Guozhen 1981.
9. Zheng Da 1962.
10. Fei Xihuang n.d. 3/46a-50a. Pei Xihuang knew Dai

Mingshi well, both men having frequented the circle of Huang
Zhuolai in Beijing c. 1696. See Durand 1992: 106 n. 58,126
nn·3,4·
II. Zhuo Erkan, ed. 1960: 40-3, 2)8-43.
12. Ibid.: 42.
13. Fei Mi n.d. Yanfeng shichao (manuscript copy), tiyong

25a.
14. Pei Xihuang 1970.
15. Fei Xihuang n.d.: 2/27a-4Ib, "Fei Zhongwen xian-

sheng jiazhuan."
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16. Fei Xihuang n.d.: 3hra-b, "Yerian Shajiangba xian-
mu ji."
17. Fei Xihuang 1970: 4!I2a.
18. In the Record of the White Deer Peach Blossom Spring,

he states that the refugee families had fled to White Deer Cliff
seventy years before. However, in his poem on visiting the fam-
ily gravesite, he writes: "You ask me to look back across six-
ty years" (Fei Xihuang n.d.: 3/Ia). Averaging out the two fig-
ures, this gives a rough date for his trip around the early I7IOS.

19. Fei Xihuang n.d.: 3/ra. For the earlier, descriptive part
of the text, see SLW 421-2.

20. Ruan Yuan 1920: 4/9b-Ioa.
21. Li Lin 1708: r9/65.
22. SeeYang Shiji's colophon to Shitac's portrait of Huang,

Crossing the Ridge.
23. Master, 63·
24. See Yang Shiji's colophon to Shitao's portrait of Huang,

Crossing the Ridge.
25. Landscapes of the Highest Class, Sumitomo Collection,

leaves 2 and 6. Reproduced in Sen-oku hakko kan: Chugoku
kaiga, sho, cat. no. 2I.
26. Struve 1979.
27. DDZTHSB 1/21-2.
28. Li Lin (1708: 7/36b) has a poem written on the occa-

sion of Huang's departure. Although undated, it closely fol-
lows a poem from mid-autumn 1697.
29. Tian Lin 1727: xia/3la ff.; Tang Sunhua 1979: 12/4a;

Chen Pengnian r762: 312a ff. 72.
30. Li Lin 1708: 5158b ff.
3I. This refers to the rout of Li Zicheng by combined Man-

chu and Wu Sangui forces on 27 May 1644. See Wakeman
1985: 310-13·
32. The painting is undated, but it is clear from the colo-

phons that Huang took it south with him on his journey, so it
must have been painted before the end of 1699. It stands to
reason, meanwhile, that he commissioned it after his return
from the North, which cannot have been much before the end
of 1698. A dating c. 1699 thus seems reasonable.
33. With the exception, that is, of Shitao's "self-portrait"

of 1674, Master Shi Planting Pines (see Figure 54, Plate I), to
which I also believe a professional portraitist must have con-
tributed.
34· Qiao Yin, zi Fuwu, hao Donghu, from Baoying, who

later attained high oflice (see Wu Jiaji 1980: 20)).
35· Biography in the Jin dynasty text Gaoshi zhuan (Ac-

counts of Aloof Scholars).
36. Colophon to Shirao's illustrations to the Poems of

Huang Yanlu.
37. Xu Xu 1984: 92-100.
38. Qu Dajun 1974: juan 3, 65-6.
39· On Liu Shishu, from Baoying, see Ruan Yuan 1920:

IO/IIb.
40. This, at any rate, is how he presents the commission in

his inscription to the leaf that must originally have closed the
first album. Wang Fangyu (1978: 463) notes a collection of
Huang's poetry entitled Yuanci shan ji (From One Mountain
to the Next), but according to Huang's relative, Huang Jixian,
none of Huang You's poetry was published during his own
lifetime. Following his death in Yunnan - almost immediately
followed in n,un by that of his son, who had accompanied him
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there - his accumulated poetry was largely lost. It was only lat-
er; though the good oflices of a grandnephew by marriage, that
132 surviving poems were published under the title Zi shu gao
with a preface by Huang jixian. This preface, which is the
most important source of information on Huang You's life,
can be consulted in Jiao Xun 1992: 161r7b-19b.
41. Eighteen of the leaves in the Zhile Lou Collection have

been published in a folio reproduction, Shitao xie Huang Yan-
iii shiyi ceoThe remaining five leaves were not acquired for the
collection until a later date, but were then published with the
others in Rao Zongyi 1975: 28-43. The four leaves in Beijing
are reproduced in STSHQ] pls. 191-194. For a detailed study,
see Kohara Hironobu 1990.
42. Li Lin 1708: r8/52a fl.
43. Hearn 1988.
44. Fu 1965; A. J. Hay 1978: 296-318. Huang You could

not have failed to know that in his own period the great Zhe-
jiang loyalist, Huang Zongxi (1610-95), had venerated Wen
Tianxiang and Xie Ao (as well as that other Song loyalist,
Deng Mu [1247-1306], of nearby Mount Dadi). Fu 1965.
45· Minzhong jihie 36a. In these first few leaves of the al-

bum, the trees and houses by which we measure scale are kept
relatively small: the recession is solidly established; and the ex-
ecution is rather restrained. There existed in the seventeenth
century a well-established tradition of topographical paintings
that had exactly these characteristics and that, like these album
leaves, aimed to seize the natural wonders, qi, of landscape.
The travel paintings of the Su-Song artists Shen Shichong (ac-
tive c. 1607-after 1640), Zhang Hong (1577-1652 or later),
and later Huang Xiangjian (16°9-73) - Huang Xiangjian's al-
bums in particular, themselves the representation of an obses-
sional journey in search of the artist's parents in faraway Yun-
nan (Struve, ed. and trans. 1993) - offer a close precedent for
Shitao's project.
46. Qu Dajun r996: vol. 8, 1965.
47· ]]ZL] 256-9; Fu 1965: 46-7; Struve 1984: 75-98;

Wakeman 1985: 11°7-15.
48. "Night jar" by the Jiangxi poet Fu Dingquan, in Zhuo

Erkan, ed. 1960: 113-14. See also Fei Mi's poem, "Looking
West," cited earlier in this chapter (section "The Ancestral
Tombs of the Fei Family").
49· Xu Xu 1984: 92-4-
50. Struve 1984: 122-4.
51. Discussed in the section "From Qingxiang to Xu an-

cheng: 1644-1677" in Chapter 4.
52. Struve 1984: 81-2.
53· Cheng Tingzuo 1936: juan 12. In the collection of the

Palace Museum, Beijing, is a "collaborative" album compris-
ing six landscape paintings by Shitao and six calligraphies by
Cheng Jing'e on facing leaves (STSHQ] pls, 241-246). Un-
dated and unsigned, on the basis of seals and style the paint-
ings can be tentatively placed in the early 1700s.
54· The other colophon-writers were Hong Jiazhi and Xian

Zhu. See the section "jingjiang Descendant" in Chapter 5.
55· Li Lin 1708: 9/61b.
56. Ruan Yuan 1920: 4/9b-l0a.
57· Fei Xihuang 1970: qiyan guti Sh. Fei mentions that he

himself had not yet been able to travel to Sichuan. Since Fei's
journey can be dated, albeit rather approximately, to around
the early 1710S, Huang's Sichuan journey must have taken

place sometime during the years following the winter of 1704-
5, when Li Guosong and Xian Zhu wrote colophons for the
Album Illustrating Poems by Huang Yanlic in Yangzhou.
58. jiao Xun 1992: 161r8a-b; Yunnan tongzhi 1736:

218/32a.
59· Huang no doubt saw the imperial entourage on more

than one occasion himself. Also relevant are a number of eye-
witness accounts of these tours and campaigns by partici-
pants, which were published in Yangzhou in 1700 and 1703
by Zhang Chao: Dong Wenyi 1990; Gao Shiqi 1990a-o;
Kong Shangren 1990; Wang Shizhen 1990; Xu Bingyi 1990.
60. Gugong bowuyuan Ming Qing dang'anbu, ed. 1975:

28-31·
61. For the chronology of the 1705 tour, I have relied on

Zhongguo diyi lishi dang'anguan, ed. 1984; Zhongguo renmin
daxue Qing shi yanjiusuo, ed. 1988.
62. Spence 1966; Wu 1970.
63. Durand 1992: 22I.
64· Wu 1970.
65. Strassberg 1983: rr8-21.
66. Gugong bowuyuan Ming Qing dang'anbu, ed. 1975,

1976.
67. Each leaf bears a seal reading, "Seen by Ziqing," which

happens to be Cao Yin's zi.
68. Zhongguo renmin daxue Qing shi yanjiusuo, ed. 1988:

26I.
69. Shanghai Museum, reproduced in Zhongguo gudai

shuhua tumu, vol. 5 [1990]: 72. Such poems about floods were
something of a Yangzhou specialty: See LHYFZ 1693: 2284
for a 1659 example by Sun Zhiwei, and p. 2244 for a 1680
example by Wu Jiaji; and Li Lin 1708: 9178a fOI a poem on
the 17°5 flooding.
70. Zhongguo renmin daxue Qing shi yanjiusuo, ed. 1988:

312.
71. The painting is dedicated to Shanlao, or "old Shan,"

which may be a reference to Zhang Chao's zi, Shanlai.
72. There exists a landscape fan from 1702 dedicated by

Shitao to a Mr. Cangzhou, who may be Chen Pengnian (zi
Cangzhou), then serving as magistrate of Shanyang in north-
ern jiangsu. See Chugoku kaiga ten 1980, cat. no. 47.
73· Durand 1992: 222.
74. Another example is Shitao's Portrait of Hong Zhengzhi,

which still bears thirty-one colophons, most dating from Hong
Zhengzhi's lifetime, including officials, merchants, remnant
subjects, professional writers, artists, and family members. See
SLW 359-67; Fu and Fu 1973: 284-93. See also the discus-
sion of the colophon contributors to Shitao's album Orchids
for Hong Zhengzhi in Chapter 5 (section "Jingjiang Descen-
dant").
75· Yuchu xinahi (Zhang Chao, ed. r954); Tanji congshu

(Zhang Chao and Wang Zhuo, eds. 1992); Zhaodai congshu
(Zhang Chao, ed. 1990; Zhang Chao and Zhang Jian, eds.
1990; Zhang Chao, Yang Fuji, and Shen Maohui, eds. 1990).
Zhang Chao expressly excluded wilderness history from the
Zhaodai congshu. (See Durand 1992: 154.) In addition to
Zhuo Erkan's anthology of poems Mingmo sibai jia yimin
shi, there were several others by men whom Shitao also knew
personally: one by Ni Yongqing (1688); Deng Hanyi's Tian-
xia mingjia shiguan (1672)j and Zhu Guan's Guochao shi-
zheng.

76. See Chidu oucun and Yousheng (Zhang Chao, comp.
1780a,b).
77· Zhang Chao 1991. For examples, see the opening of

the section "The Dadi Tang Enterprise: Artist and Patrons"
in Chapter 6.

FOUR. ZHU RUOJI'S DESTINIES

I. Here and elsewhere my translation of "Song of My Life"
draws on those by Fong (1976) and Kent (1995: 277-83).
2. From the so-called "Gengchen (1700-1) Manuscript of

Poems," whereabouts unknown, reproduced in Fu and Pu
1973: 221.
3. Santangelo 1992.
4· Giddens 1990: 34.
5· Shitao claimed all his life to be a native of nearby Quan-

zhou (Qingxiang), but this can be explained in terms of his
Buddhist history and may also have been intended to camou-
flage his true origins. On the long-controversial question of his
birth date, see SLW 60 n. 3.
6. Most scholars have accepted that Shitao's father was

Zhu Hengjia. However, like the question of Shirao's birth-
place, to which it is closely related, that of his father's identity
does not yet permit a definitive answer. While there is no doubt
that Shitao came to believe himself to be the heir to the Prince-
dom of jingjiang, neither he nor any of his contemporaries
seems ever to have claimed that he was the son of Zhu Heng-
jia. Against this, it might be argued that this claim is in any
case implicit in the claim to be heir, and that it would have
been dangerous to declare oneself the son of an avowed claim-
ant to the Ming throne. In his 1677 "Poem for Zhong Yu-
xing," however (see below, n. 53), Shirao's mention of "a hun-
dred brothers" implies that the massacre affected the extended
family: "Brothers" in this context is a general term extend-
ing to cousins. Moreover, Shitao there seems persuaded by
Zhong's claims that theirs were "linked families" and their
two fathers "extremely close," and that Shitao's father had
served as a prefect (which would make it impossible that he
was the prince of Jingjiang). Although upon reflection Shitao
may well have given Zhong's account less credence (he never
again alludes to it), the fact that he took it seriously at all in-
dicates, as recognized by Wu T'ung in 1967, that he did not
know exactly who his father was. Thus, if the possibility that
Shitao was indeed the son of Zhu Hengjia cannot be entirely
ruled out, it is much more plausible that Shitao's father was a
brother or cousin of Hengjia who died in the I645 massacre.
If,as his poem indicates, he believed himself to be the sole sur-
vivor in his generation of the same massacre, then the prince-
dom would effectively have fallen to him in the end. It would
have done so only in the end, however, for there was a final
prince of jingjiang in Guilin after Zhu Hengjia's defeat: a cer-
tain Zhu Hengzhen, brother or cousin of Hengjia, who lasted
until 1650 when Qing forces entered Guilin.
7. This is the name under which he is listed in Complete

Register of the Five Lamps (Wudeng quan shu [WDQS]), a
biographical history of the Chan School published in 1693.
Li Lin confirms this in his biography: "Dadizi's ming is Yuanji,
and his zi is Smtao."
8. This explanation was first proposed by Mingfu (1978:

22-4)· Mingfu speculates that Shitao's family on his mother's
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16. Fei Xihuang n.d.: 3hra-b, "Yerian Shajiangba xian-
mu ji."
17. Fei Xihuang 1970: 4!I2a.
18. In the Record of the White Deer Peach Blossom Spring,

he states that the refugee families had fled to White Deer Cliff
seventy years before. However, in his poem on visiting the fam-
ily gravesite, he writes: "You ask me to look back across six-
ty years" (Fei Xihuang n.d.: 3/Ia). Averaging out the two fig-
ures, this gives a rough date for his trip around the early I7IOS.

19. Fei Xihuang n.d.: 3/ra. For the earlier, descriptive part
of the text, see SLW 421-2.

20. Ruan Yuan 1920: 4/9b-Ioa.
21. Li Lin 1708: r9/65.
22. SeeYang Shiji's colophon to Shitac's portrait of Huang,

Crossing the Ridge.
23. Master, 63·
24. See Yang Shiji's colophon to Shitao's portrait of Huang,

Crossing the Ridge.
25. Landscapes of the Highest Class, Sumitomo Collection,

leaves 2 and 6. Reproduced in Sen-oku hakko kan: Chugoku
kaiga, sho, cat. no. 2I.
26. Struve 1979.
27. DDZTHSB 1/21-2.
28. Li Lin (1708: 7/36b) has a poem written on the occa-

sion of Huang's departure. Although undated, it closely fol-
lows a poem from mid-autumn 1697.
29. Tian Lin 1727: xia/3la ff.; Tang Sunhua 1979: 12/4a;

Chen Pengnian r762: 312a ff. 72.
30. Li Lin 1708: 5158b ff.
3I. This refers to the rout of Li Zicheng by combined Man-

chu and Wu Sangui forces on 27 May 1644. See Wakeman
1985: 310-13·
32. The painting is undated, but it is clear from the colo-

phons that Huang took it south with him on his journey, so it
must have been painted before the end of 1699. It stands to
reason, meanwhile, that he commissioned it after his return
from the North, which cannot have been much before the end
of 1698. A dating c. 1699 thus seems reasonable.
33. With the exception, that is, of Shitao's "self-portrait"

of 1674, Master Shi Planting Pines (see Figure 54, Plate I), to
which I also believe a professional portraitist must have con-
tributed.
34· Qiao Yin, zi Fuwu, hao Donghu, from Baoying, who

later attained high oflice (see Wu Jiaji 1980: 20)).
35· Biography in the Jin dynasty text Gaoshi zhuan (Ac-

counts of Aloof Scholars).
36. Colophon to Shirao's illustrations to the Poems of

Huang Yanlu.
37. Xu Xu 1984: 92-100.
38. Qu Dajun 1974: juan 3, 65-6.
39· On Liu Shishu, from Baoying, see Ruan Yuan 1920:

IO/IIb.
40. This, at any rate, is how he presents the commission in

his inscription to the leaf that must originally have closed the
first album. Wang Fangyu (1978: 463) notes a collection of
Huang's poetry entitled Yuanci shan ji (From One Mountain
to the Next), but according to Huang's relative, Huang Jixian,
none of Huang You's poetry was published during his own
lifetime. Following his death in Yunnan - almost immediately
followed in n,un by that of his son, who had accompanied him
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there - his accumulated poetry was largely lost. It was only lat-
er; though the good oflices of a grandnephew by marriage, that
132 surviving poems were published under the title Zi shu gao
with a preface by Huang jixian. This preface, which is the
most important source of information on Huang You's life,
can be consulted in Jiao Xun 1992: 161r7b-19b.
41. Eighteen of the leaves in the Zhile Lou Collection have

been published in a folio reproduction, Shitao xie Huang Yan-
iii shiyi ceoThe remaining five leaves were not acquired for the
collection until a later date, but were then published with the
others in Rao Zongyi 1975: 28-43. The four leaves in Beijing
are reproduced in STSHQ] pls. 191-194. For a detailed study,
see Kohara Hironobu 1990.
42. Li Lin 1708: r8/52a fl.
43. Hearn 1988.
44. Fu 1965; A. J. Hay 1978: 296-318. Huang You could

not have failed to know that in his own period the great Zhe-
jiang loyalist, Huang Zongxi (1610-95), had venerated Wen
Tianxiang and Xie Ao (as well as that other Song loyalist,
Deng Mu [1247-1306], of nearby Mount Dadi). Fu 1965.
45· Minzhong jihie 36a. In these first few leaves of the al-

bum, the trees and houses by which we measure scale are kept
relatively small: the recession is solidly established; and the ex-
ecution is rather restrained. There existed in the seventeenth
century a well-established tradition of topographical paintings
that had exactly these characteristics and that, like these album
leaves, aimed to seize the natural wonders, qi, of landscape.
The travel paintings of the Su-Song artists Shen Shichong (ac-
tive c. 1607-after 1640), Zhang Hong (1577-1652 or later),
and later Huang Xiangjian (16°9-73) - Huang Xiangjian's al-
bums in particular, themselves the representation of an obses-
sional journey in search of the artist's parents in faraway Yun-
nan (Struve, ed. and trans. 1993) - offer a close precedent for
Shitao's project.
46. Qu Dajun r996: vol. 8, 1965.
47· ]]ZL] 256-9; Fu 1965: 46-7; Struve 1984: 75-98;

Wakeman 1985: 11°7-15.
48. "Night jar" by the Jiangxi poet Fu Dingquan, in Zhuo

Erkan, ed. 1960: 113-14. See also Fei Mi's poem, "Looking
West," cited earlier in this chapter (section "The Ancestral
Tombs of the Fei Family").
49· Xu Xu 1984: 92-4-
50. Struve 1984: 122-4.
51. Discussed in the section "From Qingxiang to Xu an-

cheng: 1644-1677" in Chapter 4.
52. Struve 1984: 81-2.
53· Cheng Tingzuo 1936: juan 12. In the collection of the

Palace Museum, Beijing, is a "collaborative" album compris-
ing six landscape paintings by Shitao and six calligraphies by
Cheng Jing'e on facing leaves (STSHQ] pls, 241-246). Un-
dated and unsigned, on the basis of seals and style the paint-
ings can be tentatively placed in the early 1700s.
54· The other colophon-writers were Hong Jiazhi and Xian

Zhu. See the section "jingjiang Descendant" in Chapter 5.
55· Li Lin 1708: 9/61b.
56. Ruan Yuan 1920: 4/9b-l0a.
57· Fei Xihuang 1970: qiyan guti Sh. Fei mentions that he

himself had not yet been able to travel to Sichuan. Since Fei's
journey can be dated, albeit rather approximately, to around
the early 1710S, Huang's Sichuan journey must have taken

place sometime during the years following the winter of 1704-
5, when Li Guosong and Xian Zhu wrote colophons for the
Album Illustrating Poems by Huang Yanlic in Yangzhou.
58. jiao Xun 1992: 161r8a-b; Yunnan tongzhi 1736:

218/32a.
59· Huang no doubt saw the imperial entourage on more

than one occasion himself. Also relevant are a number of eye-
witness accounts of these tours and campaigns by partici-
pants, which were published in Yangzhou in 1700 and 1703
by Zhang Chao: Dong Wenyi 1990; Gao Shiqi 1990a-o;
Kong Shangren 1990; Wang Shizhen 1990; Xu Bingyi 1990.
60. Gugong bowuyuan Ming Qing dang'anbu, ed. 1975:

28-31·
61. For the chronology of the 1705 tour, I have relied on

Zhongguo diyi lishi dang'anguan, ed. 1984; Zhongguo renmin
daxue Qing shi yanjiusuo, ed. 1988.
62. Spence 1966; Wu 1970.
63. Durand 1992: 22I.
64· Wu 1970.
65. Strassberg 1983: rr8-21.
66. Gugong bowuyuan Ming Qing dang'anbu, ed. 1975,

1976.
67. Each leaf bears a seal reading, "Seen by Ziqing," which

happens to be Cao Yin's zi.
68. Zhongguo renmin daxue Qing shi yanjiusuo, ed. 1988:

26I.
69. Shanghai Museum, reproduced in Zhongguo gudai

shuhua tumu, vol. 5 [1990]: 72. Such poems about floods were
something of a Yangzhou specialty: See LHYFZ 1693: 2284
for a 1659 example by Sun Zhiwei, and p. 2244 for a 1680
example by Wu Jiaji; and Li Lin 1708: 9178a fOI a poem on
the 17°5 flooding.
70. Zhongguo renmin daxue Qing shi yanjiusuo, ed. 1988:

312.
71. The painting is dedicated to Shanlao, or "old Shan,"

which may be a reference to Zhang Chao's zi, Shanlai.
72. There exists a landscape fan from 1702 dedicated by

Shitao to a Mr. Cangzhou, who may be Chen Pengnian (zi
Cangzhou), then serving as magistrate of Shanyang in north-
ern jiangsu. See Chugoku kaiga ten 1980, cat. no. 47.
73· Durand 1992: 222.
74. Another example is Shitao's Portrait of Hong Zhengzhi,

which still bears thirty-one colophons, most dating from Hong
Zhengzhi's lifetime, including officials, merchants, remnant
subjects, professional writers, artists, and family members. See
SLW 359-67; Fu and Fu 1973: 284-93. See also the discus-
sion of the colophon contributors to Shitao's album Orchids
for Hong Zhengzhi in Chapter 5 (section "Jingjiang Descen-
dant").
75· Yuchu xinahi (Zhang Chao, ed. r954); Tanji congshu

(Zhang Chao and Wang Zhuo, eds. 1992); Zhaodai congshu
(Zhang Chao, ed. 1990; Zhang Chao and Zhang Jian, eds.
1990; Zhang Chao, Yang Fuji, and Shen Maohui, eds. 1990).
Zhang Chao expressly excluded wilderness history from the
Zhaodai congshu. (See Durand 1992: 154.) In addition to
Zhuo Erkan's anthology of poems Mingmo sibai jia yimin
shi, there were several others by men whom Shitao also knew
personally: one by Ni Yongqing (1688); Deng Hanyi's Tian-
xia mingjia shiguan (1672)j and Zhu Guan's Guochao shi-
zheng.

76. See Chidu oucun and Yousheng (Zhang Chao, comp.
1780a,b).
77· Zhang Chao 1991. For examples, see the opening of

the section "The Dadi Tang Enterprise: Artist and Patrons"
in Chapter 6.

FOUR. ZHU RUOJI'S DESTINIES

I. Here and elsewhere my translation of "Song of My Life"
draws on those by Fong (1976) and Kent (1995: 277-83).
2. From the so-called "Gengchen (1700-1) Manuscript of

Poems," whereabouts unknown, reproduced in Fu and Pu
1973: 221.
3. Santangelo 1992.
4· Giddens 1990: 34.
5· Shitao claimed all his life to be a native of nearby Quan-

zhou (Qingxiang), but this can be explained in terms of his
Buddhist history and may also have been intended to camou-
flage his true origins. On the long-controversial question of his
birth date, see SLW 60 n. 3.
6. Most scholars have accepted that Shitao's father was

Zhu Hengjia. However, like the question of Shirao's birth-
place, to which it is closely related, that of his father's identity
does not yet permit a definitive answer. While there is no doubt
that Shitao came to believe himself to be the heir to the Prince-
dom of jingjiang, neither he nor any of his contemporaries
seems ever to have claimed that he was the son of Zhu Heng-
jia. Against this, it might be argued that this claim is in any
case implicit in the claim to be heir, and that it would have
been dangerous to declare oneself the son of an avowed claim-
ant to the Ming throne. In his 1677 "Poem for Zhong Yu-
xing," however (see below, n. 53), Shirao's mention of "a hun-
dred brothers" implies that the massacre affected the extended
family: "Brothers" in this context is a general term extend-
ing to cousins. Moreover, Shitao there seems persuaded by
Zhong's claims that theirs were "linked families" and their
two fathers "extremely close," and that Shitao's father had
served as a prefect (which would make it impossible that he
was the prince of Jingjiang). Although upon reflection Shitao
may well have given Zhong's account less credence (he never
again alludes to it), the fact that he took it seriously at all in-
dicates, as recognized by Wu T'ung in 1967, that he did not
know exactly who his father was. Thus, if the possibility that
Shitao was indeed the son of Zhu Hengjia cannot be entirely
ruled out, it is much more plausible that Shitao's father was a
brother or cousin of Hengjia who died in the I645 massacre.
If,as his poem indicates, he believed himself to be the sole sur-
vivor in his generation of the same massacre, then the prince-
dom would effectively have fallen to him in the end. It would
have done so only in the end, however, for there was a final
prince of jingjiang in Guilin after Zhu Hengjia's defeat: a cer-
tain Zhu Hengzhen, brother or cousin of Hengjia, who lasted
until 1650 when Qing forces entered Guilin.
7. This is the name under which he is listed in Complete

Register of the Five Lamps (Wudeng quan shu [WDQS]), a
biographical history of the Chan School published in 1693.
Li Lin confirms this in his biography: "Dadizi's ming is Yuanji,
and his zi is Smtao."
8. This explanation was first proposed by Mingfu (1978:

22-4)· Mingfu speculates that Shitao's family on his mother's
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side may have been a Quanzhou one. In "Song of My Life,"
Shitao writes of his Buddhist faith before he speaks of the
journey north from Guangxi to Wuchang. It seems likely,
therefore, that despite Li Lin's statement that "A servant in
the palace carried him to safety, and they fled to Wuchang
where he was tonsured and became a monk," Shitao entered
the Buddhist church while he was still in Guangxi, probably
in Quanzhou.
9. DDZZ: "A servant in the palace carried him to safety,

and they fled to Wuchang where he was tonsured and became
a monk."
10. In an album of landscapes in the Guangdong Provincial

Museum (see Figures 47, 48) datable to around 1664 (see be-
low, n. 21), Shitao refers to a certain Xiaota Si, or Small Pa-
goda Temple, as yet unidentified. See STSHQj pl. 362.
II. The explanation of this curious passage may be that the

books in question were illustrated books, as suggested to me
by joseph Chang (personal communication).
12. Chen is mentioned by Shitao in the inscription to a late

hanging scroll of orchids, bamboo, and rocks now in a Prince-
ton private collection: "In the past I humbly studied orchid and
bamboo painting under Mr. Chen Zhen'an [Yidao] of Yebo
Mountain in Wuchang. My teacher had served as county mag-
istrate of Meng County in Honan. At first he did not know
how to paint. In the district was a hermit, skilled at flowers,
grass, bamboo, and trees. My teacher received training from
this man. After I got to know him [MI. Chen], my blush came
to be in accordance with my method. J felt I had gained some-
thing" (translation by Matthew Ketcher, modified). In r6S9
Chen took up a more senior post as a prefect in Zhejiang
Province. SeeWang Shiqing 1986. For Shitao's other painting
teachers in Wuchang, see the discussion of local art worlds in
the section "The Early Qing Att World" in Chapter 8.
13· This journey is mentioned by Li Lin in his biography:

"Later, he traveled from Wuchang to jingmen, then crossed
Lake Dongting, and went on to Changsha and Mount Heng
before coming back. Talented and stubborn, when he encoun-
tered injustices he always found a solution. Any money he ac-
quired, he spent, saving nothing." In addition to the 1687 fan
reproduced here (Figure 46) - whose evocation of travels "thir-
ty years before" can refer only to his visit to Mount Heng, thus
establishing the date of the journey as c. 1657 - three other
memory depictions of the journey through Hunan are repro-
duced in this book (Figures 4S, 81, and 82).
14. For a different translation see Fong 1976.
15· The Tiantong lineage was named for the Tiantong

Monastery near Ningbo in Zhejiang, where its founder, Miyun
Yuanwu, taught. During the Shunzhi and Kangxi reigns, the
Tiantong lineage was more important than the other main Lin-
ji lineage, Panshan. On Chan lineages in the early Qing period,
see Du ]iwen and Wei Daoru 1993: 575-615. On the Tianrong
Monastery, see Brook 1993.
16. Hanyue Facang's leading followers were Jude Hongli

(1600-67) and Jiqi Hongchu (r60S-72). In Hunan, thelineage
was notably represented by]infu Yuanzhi and Chuyi Yuanyu.
See Du jiwen and Wei Daoru 1993: 589-90.
I7· On Muchen Daomin and Lu'an Benyue and their in-

volvement in politics, see Chen Yuan 1962; Fong 1976: 18.
18. Given the fact that he subsequently chose not to return

to Chu but instead to enter the orbit of Muchen Daomin, one

may wonder whether he did not come into contact with the
Wuchang master Tuituo, a direct disciple of Muchen and the
abbot of Wuchang's Yuantong Monastery. On Tuituo, see
WDQS, juan 75.
19. "Song of My Life." For a different translation see Fong

1976.
20. See Mingfu r978: ISO. DDZZ states only that "After

living there [WuchangJ for a long time, he left Wuchang again
for Yue [Zhejiang]." Shitao's visit to Mount Lu is dated by an
inscription to the "Hermit of the Stone Abode" section of the
Hermits handscroll: "In the year jiachen [1664] while I was
staying at Mount Lu's Kaixian Monastery, I drew this at the
White Dragon Rock" (see Figure So).
21. This album in the Guangdong Provincial Museum, long

known to exist but only recently published in full, has in the
past always been dated to 1657 on the basis of this inscription.
However, another leaf is signed as having been painted [hua]
at "the Dragon Altar Rock at Kaixian [Monastery]," which
can only be the Kaixian Monastery on Mount Lu where he so-
journed immediately after leaving Wuchang c. 1663-4. Al-
though it is just barely possible that Shitao visited Mount Lu
as early as his trip southward c. 1657, this is not supported by
any references elsewhere either to that trip or to his visit to
Mount Lu. More likely, the r657 date in his inscription refers
to the composition of the inscribed poem to which it is at-
tached. (For other examples of this confusing practice, see an
album in the Palace Museum, Beijing, with a colophon by the
artist dating its execution unambiguously to the year 1680, but
which includes leaves inscribed with the dates 1667, 1669,
1673, and 1677 [STSHQj pis. 1-15]). It is also possible, by
extension, that the Kaixian Monastery leaf, which has no in-
scribed poem, is a re-creation of a pictorial composition orig-
inally created at Mount Lu and, therefore, that the album was
painted at a still later date. However, the limitations of the art-
ist's pictorial craft in this album are consistent with a date
somewhat earlier than two works from 1667: The Sixteen
Luohans (Figures IS 5, IS6) and Views of Mount Huang (see
Figure 85; for the entire album, see STSHQ] pis. 217-230;
Wai-kam Ho, ed. 1992: vol. I, pI. IS 8). In the absence of any
other example of an inscription where Shitao can be shown to
have used the verb hua in the context of a temporal disjunc-
tion between composition and execution, a tentative dating
of the album to c. 1664 seems reasonable.
22. This handscroll was first discussed in Zheng Wei 1962.
23· Zheng Wei 1962. Zheng Xiao's book was not neces-

sarily Shitao's specific source - for a late-seventeenth-century
discussion of the literature of the jingnan troubles, see Mei
Wending 1995: 145-7.
24· Zhuangzi, "Rang wang."
25· That is, Vulture Peak, where the Buddha was said to

have preached the Lotus Sutra.
26. On the centrality within the Chan tradition of the rit-

ual of "ascending the Dharma Hall" ("during which the mas-
ter conferred the essentials of his teaching on his disciples"),
see Faure 1991: 293.
27· This is the way Shitao describes himself in his signature

to Sixteen Luohans (Figures 155, 156), completed in 1667. In
years to come, he would use a seal bearing a variation 00 this
self-appellation, "Seal of Yuaoji, son of Shanguo Yue, grand~
son of Tiantong Min."

,

28. The three peaks of Zhu are situated to the west of the
city of Hangzhou, and also gave their name to a major Hang-
zhou temple.
29. Translation from Fong 1976, modified.
30. Wang Shiqing suggests a 1666 date for their arrival in

Xuancheng on the basis of Li Lin's statement in DDZZ that
Shirao stayed in Xuancheng for fifteen years (1978: n. 15).
Yang Chenbin (r98 S: S6) notes four separate Xuancheng tem-
ple addresses for Hetao and Shitao.
31. Cao (1659 jinshi), after an initial appointment to the

Hanlin Academy, had served in various positions in the Board
of Punishments. In Shexian he took the lead in restoring both
the Ziyang Academy and a local temple, Luohan Si. See Shi
Runzhang 1982: 5hob--22a, 28/6b-8a. Biographies are to be
found in Li Huan, cornp. 1985: 218h8a-30b; Xu Shichang,
comp. r985: 19/rSb--I6b; Zhu Ruchen, comp. 1985: r/r j a.
I am indebted to an unpublished seminar paper by Philip Hu
(r99S) for details of Cao's career;
32. For further details, see Wang Shiqing 1982; Zhang Zi-

nmg 1993.
33· Wang Shiqing 1982. Biographies of Cao Fen are to be

found in Xu Shichang, comp. 198 S: 191r6a-b; Feng jinbo,
comp. 1985: 6/8b; Li junzhi, compo 1985: yi shang Fb-3P.
I am indebted to Hu 1995 for details of Cao Fen's career.
34. See his signature to The Sixteen Luohans of 1667.
35. A recently published poem entitled "Sending Mr. Sun

Yuli Back to Court, and Thinking of the Two Academicians,
Shi Yuhan and Gao Yuanhuai," shows that Shitao kept in con-
tact with Shi Runzhang and Gao Yong after their entry into
the Hanlin Academy. The poem is the second in the Callig-
raphy Manuscript for Monk ]uhui (formerly Christie'S, Fine
Chinese Paintings, Calligraphy, and Rubbings, New York, 18
September, 1996, lot 189).
36. On Shi Runzhang, see Shi Nianzeng n.d.; Hummel

1943: 651; and Zhao Yongji's very useful survey of early Qing
poetry (1993), which includes an extended discussion of Shi
Runzhang. On Gao Yong, see Mingfu 1978: 177-8. On Mei
Qing, see Yang Chen bin 1985, 1986; on his nephew Mei
Geng, see Hu Yi 1984. Xu Dun's date of birth is established
by a poem by Mei Wending (r995: 194).
37. One source states that Hetao lived elsewhere, at Mount

Gu: Xuancheng xianzhi, juan 28, cited in ST 122 n. 3·
38. In his "Biography of Dadizi," Li Lin states: "At the time

there was a poetry and painting society in Xuancheng, and
they invited him to join their activities. As there was the for-
mer lecture hall of Huangbo in the Guangjiao Temple at jing-
ring, he settled there. He [now] always referred to himself as
Guest of Hinayana. By this time he was thirty years old." Tak-
ing Shitao's birth date as 1642, Wang Shiqing has interpret-
ed this to mean that Shitao settled formally in Guangjiao Tem-
pie in 1671 (1979a: n. II). However, he had been associ~t-
ed in some way with the temple for some years before thIS,
since in his "Song of My Life" he states that "at the lecture
hall of the Chan mastet Huangbo we stayed fot mote than
ten years." Since he moved from Xuancheng to Nanjing c.
1679-80, this pushes his stay at the temple back into the late
1660s.
39. On the early stages of reconstruction of the temple, see

Shi Runzhang's account (1982: 26/4b--Sb).
40. Wang Shiqing 1982.

41. Wakeman 1985: II08. See ibid.. I099-II20 for a full
account of the Rebellion of the Three Feudatories.
42. Shirao's inscription to the "Old Man of the Xiang Riv-

er" section (3) of the handscroll Hermits includes the follow-
ing sentence: "In the year jiayin [1674J at midsummer I was
staying at the South Lake at Xuancheng." His inscription to
a related painting, The Wilderness Man of Hanbin (see Figure
52), which may have originally been another section of the
same handscroll, includes another informative sentence: "In
the year iiayin [1674J I was keeping away from the armies at
Mount Bogui's Platform of the Immortals." Boguishan is a
mountain near Xuancheng. According to Shi Nianzeng (n.d.:
3/3a-b), in the wake of Wu Sangui's rebellion there was a peas-
ant rising in the nearby Shexian area; on the third day of the
ninth month Shexian itself fell into rebel hands. When the
news reached Xuancheng, the population fled into the sur-
rounding countryside, only returning several weeks later when
the uprising had been put down by official troops. Shitao's
1674 Guanyin Bodhisattva hanging scroll (see Figure IS7)
might be understood as an offering of thanks for having sur-
vived the local troubles unharmed.
43. This story first appears in the Hou Han shu, but is also

found in such later sources as the Song encyclopedia Taiping
yulan.
44. Curiously, Shi Runzhang, in what appears to be one of

the lost early colophons (recorded in his collected works), ex-
plicitly notes that the painting was by Mei Qing - probably
insisting on this point because he was aware of the possibility
of confusion caused by the similarity of the two artists' styles
(1982: 221r7a, "Song on Master Shi's Planting Pines"). Shi
even goes so far as to draw attention to the similarity of the
two artists' work in the opening lines of his poem. Shi, as a
friend of both men, ought to be a reliable informant, and it is
true that Shitao's own inscription does not unambiguously
confirm him to have been the artist. However, another lost ear-
lycolophon, by Qu Dajun (cited by Han Linde 1989: 31) and
an early inscription on the painting by Tang Yansheng both
appear to take Shirao to be the artist. Although Mei Qing's
work of this period is not well studied, the setting of this paint-
ing is in every way comparable to Shitao's other Xuancheng-
period work, so that simply on stylistic grounds Shi's puzzling
colophon (to a second painting? or a mistake?) has to be dis-
counted.
45. Vinograd r992a: 61.
46. For example, on his 1683 transcription of a poem dedi-

cated to a Qing official, Zheng Hushan; on the 1689 painting
The Seas Are at Peace and the Rivers Are Pure (see Figure 57);
on a transcription of his 1689 poems welcoming Kangxi to the
South on a fan; and on the 1692 Calligraphy Manuscript for
Monk [uhui, all discussed later in this chapter.
47. Shitao's ttip to Songjiang in 1675 is established by a

poem by Mei Qing (Tianyan ge houji, juan 2) cited by Fu Bao-
shi 1948: 52. Various other traces of the journey exist. These
include a painting depicting the Songjiang area in an impor-
tant album probably ftom the second half of 169S, reproduced
in Zhongguo hua 1986(2): 37; an undated album recorded in
Pang Yuanji 1971a: 15!I2a ff., which according to Shitao's in-
scription on leaf 6 was at least partly painted in the Songjiang
area; a poem in an album manuscript probably executed c.
1693 in which he takes his leave of a monk friend, Zhida, in
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side may have been a Quanzhou one. In "Song of My Life,"
Shitao writes of his Buddhist faith before he speaks of the
journey north from Guangxi to Wuchang. It seems likely,
therefore, that despite Li Lin's statement that "A servant in
the palace carried him to safety, and they fled to Wuchang
where he was tonsured and became a monk," Shitao entered
the Buddhist church while he was still in Guangxi, probably
in Quanzhou.
9. DDZZ: "A servant in the palace carried him to safety,

and they fled to Wuchang where he was tonsured and became
a monk."
10. In an album of landscapes in the Guangdong Provincial

Museum (see Figures 47, 48) datable to around 1664 (see be-
low, n. 21), Shitao refers to a certain Xiaota Si, or Small Pa-
goda Temple, as yet unidentified. See STSHQj pl. 362.
II. The explanation of this curious passage may be that the

books in question were illustrated books, as suggested to me
by joseph Chang (personal communication).
12. Chen is mentioned by Shitao in the inscription to a late

hanging scroll of orchids, bamboo, and rocks now in a Prince-
ton private collection: "In the past I humbly studied orchid and
bamboo painting under Mr. Chen Zhen'an [Yidao] of Yebo
Mountain in Wuchang. My teacher had served as county mag-
istrate of Meng County in Honan. At first he did not know
how to paint. In the district was a hermit, skilled at flowers,
grass, bamboo, and trees. My teacher received training from
this man. After I got to know him [MI. Chen], my blush came
to be in accordance with my method. J felt I had gained some-
thing" (translation by Matthew Ketcher, modified). In r6S9
Chen took up a more senior post as a prefect in Zhejiang
Province. SeeWang Shiqing 1986. For Shitao's other painting
teachers in Wuchang, see the discussion of local art worlds in
the section "The Early Qing Att World" in Chapter 8.
13· This journey is mentioned by Li Lin in his biography:

"Later, he traveled from Wuchang to jingmen, then crossed
Lake Dongting, and went on to Changsha and Mount Heng
before coming back. Talented and stubborn, when he encoun-
tered injustices he always found a solution. Any money he ac-
quired, he spent, saving nothing." In addition to the 1687 fan
reproduced here (Figure 46) - whose evocation of travels "thir-
ty years before" can refer only to his visit to Mount Heng, thus
establishing the date of the journey as c. 1657 - three other
memory depictions of the journey through Hunan are repro-
duced in this book (Figures 4S, 81, and 82).
14. For a different translation see Fong 1976.
15· The Tiantong lineage was named for the Tiantong

Monastery near Ningbo in Zhejiang, where its founder, Miyun
Yuanwu, taught. During the Shunzhi and Kangxi reigns, the
Tiantong lineage was more important than the other main Lin-
ji lineage, Panshan. On Chan lineages in the early Qing period,
see Du ]iwen and Wei Daoru 1993: 575-615. On the Tianrong
Monastery, see Brook 1993.
16. Hanyue Facang's leading followers were Jude Hongli

(1600-67) and Jiqi Hongchu (r60S-72). In Hunan, thelineage
was notably represented by]infu Yuanzhi and Chuyi Yuanyu.
See Du jiwen and Wei Daoru 1993: 589-90.
I7· On Muchen Daomin and Lu'an Benyue and their in-

volvement in politics, see Chen Yuan 1962; Fong 1976: 18.
18. Given the fact that he subsequently chose not to return

to Chu but instead to enter the orbit of Muchen Daomin, one

may wonder whether he did not come into contact with the
Wuchang master Tuituo, a direct disciple of Muchen and the
abbot of Wuchang's Yuantong Monastery. On Tuituo, see
WDQS, juan 75.
19. "Song of My Life." For a different translation see Fong

1976.
20. See Mingfu r978: ISO. DDZZ states only that "After

living there [WuchangJ for a long time, he left Wuchang again
for Yue [Zhejiang]." Shitao's visit to Mount Lu is dated by an
inscription to the "Hermit of the Stone Abode" section of the
Hermits handscroll: "In the year jiachen [1664] while I was
staying at Mount Lu's Kaixian Monastery, I drew this at the
White Dragon Rock" (see Figure So).
21. This album in the Guangdong Provincial Museum, long

known to exist but only recently published in full, has in the
past always been dated to 1657 on the basis of this inscription.
However, another leaf is signed as having been painted [hua]
at "the Dragon Altar Rock at Kaixian [Monastery]," which
can only be the Kaixian Monastery on Mount Lu where he so-
journed immediately after leaving Wuchang c. 1663-4. Al-
though it is just barely possible that Shitao visited Mount Lu
as early as his trip southward c. 1657, this is not supported by
any references elsewhere either to that trip or to his visit to
Mount Lu. More likely, the r657 date in his inscription refers
to the composition of the inscribed poem to which it is at-
tached. (For other examples of this confusing practice, see an
album in the Palace Museum, Beijing, with a colophon by the
artist dating its execution unambiguously to the year 1680, but
which includes leaves inscribed with the dates 1667, 1669,
1673, and 1677 [STSHQj pis. 1-15]). It is also possible, by
extension, that the Kaixian Monastery leaf, which has no in-
scribed poem, is a re-creation of a pictorial composition orig-
inally created at Mount Lu and, therefore, that the album was
painted at a still later date. However, the limitations of the art-
ist's pictorial craft in this album are consistent with a date
somewhat earlier than two works from 1667: The Sixteen
Luohans (Figures IS 5, IS6) and Views of Mount Huang (see
Figure 85; for the entire album, see STSHQ] pis. 217-230;
Wai-kam Ho, ed. 1992: vol. I, pI. IS 8). In the absence of any
other example of an inscription where Shitao can be shown to
have used the verb hua in the context of a temporal disjunc-
tion between composition and execution, a tentative dating
of the album to c. 1664 seems reasonable.
22. This handscroll was first discussed in Zheng Wei 1962.
23· Zheng Wei 1962. Zheng Xiao's book was not neces-

sarily Shitao's specific source - for a late-seventeenth-century
discussion of the literature of the jingnan troubles, see Mei
Wending 1995: 145-7.
24· Zhuangzi, "Rang wang."
25· That is, Vulture Peak, where the Buddha was said to

have preached the Lotus Sutra.
26. On the centrality within the Chan tradition of the rit-

ual of "ascending the Dharma Hall" ("during which the mas-
ter conferred the essentials of his teaching on his disciples"),
see Faure 1991: 293.
27· This is the way Shitao describes himself in his signature

to Sixteen Luohans (Figures 155, 156), completed in 1667. In
years to come, he would use a seal bearing a variation 00 this
self-appellation, "Seal of Yuaoji, son of Shanguo Yue, grand~
son of Tiantong Min."

,

28. The three peaks of Zhu are situated to the west of the
city of Hangzhou, and also gave their name to a major Hang-
zhou temple.
29. Translation from Fong 1976, modified.
30. Wang Shiqing suggests a 1666 date for their arrival in

Xuancheng on the basis of Li Lin's statement in DDZZ that
Shirao stayed in Xuancheng for fifteen years (1978: n. 15).
Yang Chenbin (r98 S: S6) notes four separate Xuancheng tem-
ple addresses for Hetao and Shitao.
31. Cao (1659 jinshi), after an initial appointment to the

Hanlin Academy, had served in various positions in the Board
of Punishments. In Shexian he took the lead in restoring both
the Ziyang Academy and a local temple, Luohan Si. See Shi
Runzhang 1982: 5hob--22a, 28/6b-8a. Biographies are to be
found in Li Huan, cornp. 1985: 218h8a-30b; Xu Shichang,
comp. r985: 19/rSb--I6b; Zhu Ruchen, comp. 1985: r/r j a.
I am indebted to an unpublished seminar paper by Philip Hu
(r99S) for details of Cao's career;
32. For further details, see Wang Shiqing 1982; Zhang Zi-

nmg 1993.
33· Wang Shiqing 1982. Biographies of Cao Fen are to be

found in Xu Shichang, comp. 198 S: 191r6a-b; Feng jinbo,
comp. 1985: 6/8b; Li junzhi, compo 1985: yi shang Fb-3P.
I am indebted to Hu 1995 for details of Cao Fen's career.
34. See his signature to The Sixteen Luohans of 1667.
35. A recently published poem entitled "Sending Mr. Sun

Yuli Back to Court, and Thinking of the Two Academicians,
Shi Yuhan and Gao Yuanhuai," shows that Shitao kept in con-
tact with Shi Runzhang and Gao Yong after their entry into
the Hanlin Academy. The poem is the second in the Callig-
raphy Manuscript for Monk ]uhui (formerly Christie'S, Fine
Chinese Paintings, Calligraphy, and Rubbings, New York, 18
September, 1996, lot 189).
36. On Shi Runzhang, see Shi Nianzeng n.d.; Hummel

1943: 651; and Zhao Yongji's very useful survey of early Qing
poetry (1993), which includes an extended discussion of Shi
Runzhang. On Gao Yong, see Mingfu 1978: 177-8. On Mei
Qing, see Yang Chen bin 1985, 1986; on his nephew Mei
Geng, see Hu Yi 1984. Xu Dun's date of birth is established
by a poem by Mei Wending (r995: 194).
37. One source states that Hetao lived elsewhere, at Mount

Gu: Xuancheng xianzhi, juan 28, cited in ST 122 n. 3·
38. In his "Biography of Dadizi," Li Lin states: "At the time

there was a poetry and painting society in Xuancheng, and
they invited him to join their activities. As there was the for-
mer lecture hall of Huangbo in the Guangjiao Temple at jing-
ring, he settled there. He [now] always referred to himself as
Guest of Hinayana. By this time he was thirty years old." Tak-
ing Shitao's birth date as 1642, Wang Shiqing has interpret-
ed this to mean that Shitao settled formally in Guangjiao Tem-
pie in 1671 (1979a: n. II). However, he had been associ~t-
ed in some way with the temple for some years before thIS,
since in his "Song of My Life" he states that "at the lecture
hall of the Chan mastet Huangbo we stayed fot mote than
ten years." Since he moved from Xuancheng to Nanjing c.
1679-80, this pushes his stay at the temple back into the late
1660s.
39. On the early stages of reconstruction of the temple, see

Shi Runzhang's account (1982: 26/4b--Sb).
40. Wang Shiqing 1982.

41. Wakeman 1985: II08. See ibid.. I099-II20 for a full
account of the Rebellion of the Three Feudatories.
42. Shirao's inscription to the "Old Man of the Xiang Riv-

er" section (3) of the handscroll Hermits includes the follow-
ing sentence: "In the year jiayin [1674J at midsummer I was
staying at the South Lake at Xuancheng." His inscription to
a related painting, The Wilderness Man of Hanbin (see Figure
52), which may have originally been another section of the
same handscroll, includes another informative sentence: "In
the year iiayin [1674J I was keeping away from the armies at
Mount Bogui's Platform of the Immortals." Boguishan is a
mountain near Xuancheng. According to Shi Nianzeng (n.d.:
3/3a-b), in the wake of Wu Sangui's rebellion there was a peas-
ant rising in the nearby Shexian area; on the third day of the
ninth month Shexian itself fell into rebel hands. When the
news reached Xuancheng, the population fled into the sur-
rounding countryside, only returning several weeks later when
the uprising had been put down by official troops. Shitao's
1674 Guanyin Bodhisattva hanging scroll (see Figure IS7)
might be understood as an offering of thanks for having sur-
vived the local troubles unharmed.
43. This story first appears in the Hou Han shu, but is also

found in such later sources as the Song encyclopedia Taiping
yulan.
44. Curiously, Shi Runzhang, in what appears to be one of

the lost early colophons (recorded in his collected works), ex-
plicitly notes that the painting was by Mei Qing - probably
insisting on this point because he was aware of the possibility
of confusion caused by the similarity of the two artists' styles
(1982: 221r7a, "Song on Master Shi's Planting Pines"). Shi
even goes so far as to draw attention to the similarity of the
two artists' work in the opening lines of his poem. Shi, as a
friend of both men, ought to be a reliable informant, and it is
true that Shitao's own inscription does not unambiguously
confirm him to have been the artist. However, another lost ear-
lycolophon, by Qu Dajun (cited by Han Linde 1989: 31) and
an early inscription on the painting by Tang Yansheng both
appear to take Shirao to be the artist. Although Mei Qing's
work of this period is not well studied, the setting of this paint-
ing is in every way comparable to Shitao's other Xuancheng-
period work, so that simply on stylistic grounds Shi's puzzling
colophon (to a second painting? or a mistake?) has to be dis-
counted.
45. Vinograd r992a: 61.
46. For example, on his 1683 transcription of a poem dedi-

cated to a Qing official, Zheng Hushan; on the 1689 painting
The Seas Are at Peace and the Rivers Are Pure (see Figure 57);
on a transcription of his 1689 poems welcoming Kangxi to the
South on a fan; and on the 1692 Calligraphy Manuscript for
Monk [uhui, all discussed later in this chapter.
47. Shitao's ttip to Songjiang in 1675 is established by a

poem by Mei Qing (Tianyan ge houji, juan 2) cited by Fu Bao-
shi 1948: 52. Various other traces of the journey exist. These
include a painting depicting the Songjiang area in an impor-
tant album probably ftom the second half of 169S, reproduced
in Zhongguo hua 1986(2): 37; an undated album recorded in
Pang Yuanji 1971a: 15!I2a ff., which according to Shitao's in-
scription on leaf 6 was at least partly painted in the Songjiang
area; a poem in an album manuscript probably executed c.
1693 in which he takes his leave of a monk friend, Zhida, in
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Songjiang (unpublished, Toyo Bunka Archives, no. Ar6-r44);
and a painting illustrating a poem written at Changmen in Su-
zhou in an album from 1683 now in the Shanghai Museum
(STH] pl. 8).
48. "Magistrate Deng" was identified as Deng Qifen by

Wang Shiqing (r979a: 12). Deng served as magistrate of Jing-
quan during r674-8r and rebuilt rhe Shuixi Academy to help
students preparing for the examinations. He was also a pa-
tron of Mei Geng, supporting him in his studies in 1677-8
(see Hu Yi r984; Mei Geng 1990). A landscape by Shitao
from 1676 dedicated to Magistrate Deng is reproduced in
Sbenzbou guoguang ji, vol. 16. Shitao also evoked his r676
stay in Jingxian in albums in which he reminisced about his
former travels. See the following: the inscription to leaf 3 of
an album recorded in Pang Yuanji r97,a: I5!I2 ff. (from
which we know he stayed in the area from the spring through
the summer of 1676); a leaf from a mid-I690S album that il-
lustrates a poem dated 1676 (Zhongguo hua 1986(2): xxx);
and leaves 3 and 7 of Eight Views of the South in the British
Museum (Edwards r967: r34, 136).
49. Wang Shiqing r982.
50. Album painted for Wang Ji (1623-89), recorded in Pei

Jingfu 1937' I6/8b. In 1679, WangJi participated successful-
ly in the extraordinary boxue hongru examination. Richard
Strassberg (r989: 20) states that in r676 "Shitao traveled to
Kunshan to participate in the funeral [for Lu'an] and stayed
over into 1677 to aid in the erection of a memorial stupa."
51. The 1677 visit to ]iangsu is known from a landscape

album painted in 1680 (Palace Museum, Beijing). STSHQ]
pI. 4.
52. See Mingfu r978: r53.
53· The existence of the calligraphy handscroll of the r677

"Poem for Zhong Yuxing" was noted by Wu T'ung (1967).
It is reproduced and discussed in Xie Zhiliu (r979). For a full
translation and detailed discussion that interprets the word-
ing and meaning of the text differently from borh Wu and Xie,
see SLW 6r-2 n. 5.
54· The invitation to visit the Xitian Monastery is known

from a 1678 inscription by Wang Shimao to Shitao's self-
portrait, Master Shi Planting Pines, of 1674. See Wang Shiqing
1980. Shitao is known to have been in the Nanjing area dur-
ing pan or all of r678, 1679 and early 1680. During this pe-
riod he was associated not only with the Xitian Monastery
itself, but also (probably through Zu'an, see following nore)
with a subtemple of the monastery, the Huaixie Pavilion, and
with the Yongshou Monastery at Lishui, some one hundred Ii
south ofNanjing. One painting executed at Lishui in 1679 sur-
vives (Zhang and Hu 1969: vol. 3, no. 81), as well as one later
visual recollection of a local site, Eastern Mount Lu (see Shi
Runzhang 1982: 3r/9a-b) (STSHQj pI. 283, Central Academy
of Arts and Crafts, Beijing).
55· Zulin Yuanlin, hao Yushan, from a Shexian family, was

a monk of the Yongshou Monastery at Lishui, located some
one hundred Ii south of Nanjing. Another of Shitao's close
monk friends was Zu'an, whom he knew both in Xuancheng
and in Nanjing, where he became the abbot of Yongshou
Monastery. In later years Shirao would speak extremely warm-
ly of Zu'an, whose religious commitment and simplicity he ad-
mired. See a calligraphy in Shenyang Palace Museum, repro-
duced in STSHQ] pI. 392.
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56. According to Strassberg (1989: 21), who gives no
source, Master Qin was the monk Weiqin, former occupant
of the Single Branch Pavilion, who had become abbot of the
Fajie Temple at Ningguo.
57. Translation modified from Fong r976.
58. Mei Qing I69I. Hetao also contributed a colophon in

1680 to an album by Shitao (STSHQj pl. 12).
59. My translation owes much to that of Richard Vinograd

(I992a: 62). Vinograd interprets the reference to illness as a
metaphor for a spiritual crisis, but the poems he wrote com-
memorating his arrival confirm that he was recuperating from
a physical illness.
60. See Shitao's "Seven Poems on My Arrival at Chang-

gan's Single Branch Pavilion in the intercalary eighth month of
gengshen [1680]," inscribed on a landscape handscroll in the
Shanghai Museum (see Figure 55). According to Bordu: "the
pavilion is located west of Shui Stream and next to Xiaohe;
impressively solitary and out of the way, it stands up among
the wrens' nests." (Wenting sbiji, juan 2, cited in ST I 22 n. 12).
6r. Among the latter, one particularly notes Tian Lin, Wu

Canxi, and Zhou jing. Characteristic of this milieu is a 1680
landscape album by Shitao (Palace Museum, Beijing, STSHQj
pis. 1-14), dedicated to the as-yet-unidentified Wu Canxi, for
whom he also painted a landscape hanging scroll the follow-
ing year (Shanghai Museum, ST 26). The album bears colo-
phons by three Buddhist monks, including Hetao and a Fu-
jianese monk-painter, Chengxue (original name, Hu Jing). See
also the section "The Artist as Chan Master" in Chapter 9.
62. "Seven Poems on My Arrival at Changgan's Single

Branch Pavilion ... " (as in n. 60).
63· Wakeman 1985: 1119-20.
64· On the ruse as a fundamental figure of the exercise of

power, see Ba1andier 1985: 111-28.
65· On the various aspects of this offensive in the late

I670S and early I680s, see Spence 1966: 124-8; Kessler 1976;
Wakeman 1985: 1083; Meng Zhaoxin 1987; Song Dexuan
r990.
66. Zhongguo renmin daxue Qing shi yanjiusuo, ed. 1988:

entry fOI 23 September 1683. From two poems by Shi Run-
zhang ('982: 23/r8b-r9a; 38hob), it is known that Zheng
Hushan (Hushan is probably his zi) earlier held low-level po-
sitions at the capital (successively as zhonghan and sheren);
he is also described by Shi as a military man, possibly mean-
ing that he was a bannerman.
67· Xue Yongnian r987.
68. The Zhaos were a prominent gentry family in Laiyang,

Shandong. Zhao Lun's father died in 1643 in the defense of
Laiyang against the Manchu forces of Hong Taiji. Zhao Lun
himself gained the jinshi degree in r658 at the age of twenty-
three. He served as Education Commissioner from 1682 to
1688. See Li Yimang's colophon to a painting attributed to
Shi'ao (STSHQ] pI. 36); Wang Shiqing 1986.
69· The poems ale included in the Calligraphy Manuscript

for Monk ]uhui (see below, n. 109).
70• Itwas probably the efforts of those years that allowed

Shitao to be included in WDQS as Chan master of the Single
Branch Pavilion.
71. On Bada Shanren's reactions to Kangxi's Southern

Tours, see Mastel; 18, 102-4, 199-200.
72. Spence 1966: 127; Wu 1970: 31.

73. See also a hanging scroll of plum blossom and bamboo
in the Nanjing Museum evoking a visit to Linggu Monastery
and the Xiaoling mausoleum (STSHQj pl. 344). Plum blossom
in this period quickly came to serve as a ubiquitous memorial
to the "Bright" dynasty. In his Duhua lu, Zhou Lianggong
records the extreme instance of a Nanjing plum-blossom spe-
cialist, Yao Ruoyi, who "collected plum-blossom petals from
Zhongshan and painted in some trunks and branches, because
he imagined the branch and trunks as [sticks of] incense that
could recall the spirits of the dead." Translation adapted from
Kim 1985: vol. 2, 162.
74. Other friends mentioned include Zhang Yi, son of a

martyred Ming general (Strassberg '983: 205-8); Zhang
Zong, a dedicated lay Buddhist (biography by Xian Zhu in
Zhang Chao, ed., 1954: juan 16); and Wu jiaji, a well-known
Ming loyalist poet from the Yangzhou area (Chaves 1986).
For an overview of Shitao's Nanjing friends and acquain-
tances, see Zheng Zhuolu 1961: 17-26.
75. Li Lin 1708.
76. Ibid.: juan r5.
77. Guangwu Di (r. 25-57 C.E.) was the first emperor of the

Eastern Han dynasty. He belonged to the Liu family which had
reigned as the Western Han dynasty until Wang Mang usurped
power in 9 C.E. Zhaolie (r. 221-3 C.E.) was the first emperor
of the Shu-Han dynasty. The fact that his family name was Liu
Bei justified the use of the name "Han" for his dynasty. Liezu
was the founder of the Southern Tang dynasty, an orphan who
changed his name to Li Bian when he took the name Tang for
his dynasty, claiming to be a Tang imperial descendant.
78. In a painting inscription recorded in Yamamoto Teijiro

1932 that is dated to the seventh month of 1686, he already
speaks of going north (ST n. r6). He also menrions his plan
in the inscription to an unpublished handscroll for Zhou jing
in the winter of 1686 (Streams and Mountains without End,
C. C. Wang Family Collection), in another for the monk Zhiqi
also in the winter of 1686 (painting inscription in Tingfeng lou
shuhua ji, cited by Han Linde '989: 42-3), and again in the
undated "Song of My Life." .
79. Many years later, writing of the winter of 1687, he Sim-

ply says, "at that time I had wanted to make a journey to the
North but was unable to carry out my wish, and so I end-
ed up living on the Han [i.e., in Yangzhou] for a number of
years" (inscription to the album Miniature Landscapes, 169.9,
of which one leaf is illustrated here [see Figure 104]). My dIS-
cussion here generally follows Joseph Chang (Zhang Zining
'993, especially pp. 80-2).
80. The patron was Chang Hanqian (b. 1634), for whom

he had painted a set of twelve paintings on silk in 1683.
81. Zhang Zining 1993. Many years lat~r,Li Lin i~ hi,S

biography also mentioned this theft, reporting that Shltao s
depression lasted for three years. As pointed out by Joseph
Chang (i.e., Zhang Zining) in a lecture delivered at Yale Dill-
versity Art Gallery, his depressed state can also be seen III twO

painting inscriptions: to a 1687 Landscape of Mount Heng
(see Figure 46), and a 1690 landscape handscroll (Barnhart
et al. 1994: cat. no. 48, see below, n. 88).
82. Du Jiwen and Wei Daoru 1993: 598-603.
83. Zhuo Erkan (r960: r6) Iecords a visit that Zhuo, to-

gether with Fei Mi, Xiao Cuo (Zhengyi), and others, made to
see Shitao at the Jinghui Monastery in the late I680s.

84. These are the first four lines of an eight-line poem, itself
the first of two that Shirao elsewhere transcribed together: first,
on a calligraphy fan (Christie's New York, Fine Chinese Paint-
ings and Calligraphy, 23 November 1991, lot 123), and sec-
ond, in the 1692 Calligraphy Handscroll for Monk]uhui. In
the fan transcription they are titled "Welcoming His Imperial
Majesty's Visit in the Year [isi [r689J"; the handscroll tran-
scription has the title "Two Poems Respectfully Recounting
His Imperial Majesty's Southern Inspection Tour."
85. We can thus add one detail to a reading of the dragon-

mountain in the painting as the emperor: the curious flamelike
forms toward the center are inspired by the sight of Kangxi
in his dragon-embroidered robes.
86. Shi Shuqing I98r.
87. Wang Shiqing 1982; Mingfu r978: r53 ff.
88. Barnhart et al. '994: 172-5. The poem reads: "The

mountains look like rain but there is no rain /The paper win-
dows are suddenly bright, suddenly dark /The mountains are
pale, the rocks are pale, and the pines are pale, /The glinting
light of the ebbing water mirrors a disturbed heart" (trans.
Heping Liu). Dedicated to a certain Wuweng, otherwise un-
identified, the painting depicts an empty temple looking over
a river. The prominence of the temple, reminiscent of slightly
earlier handscrolls such as First Arrival at the Single Branch
Pavilion (see Figure 55) or Ten Thousand Ugly Inkblots (see
Figure 167) suggests that the recipient was a layman or Bud-
dhist monk. The jisi (1689) date makes it certain that it was
painted in Nanjing rather than Yangzhou, since he was still in
Nanjing in the first days of gengwu (1690). See Wang Shiqing
1982.
89. From a poem by Tian Lin that was written after see-

ing Shitao in Nanjing at the beginning of 1690. See Tian Lin
1727: shangl r».
90. In his painting inscriptions Shitao refers to this patron

under the name of Shen'an, which was identified by Mingfu
(1978) as the sobriquet of Wang Fengrong, zi Wushu, r648
iinshi. Wang Fengrong served as vice minister in the Ministry
of Personnel in 1688-9. When he returned to government ser-
vice at the end of 1692 it was as vice minister in the Ministry
of Rites, a position he held until his death in r703. See Qing
dai zhiguan nianbiao (r980).
91. The painting in question was executed at the Old Ding-

lin Temple at Mount Tianyin in the southern outskirts of Nan-
jing (Shanghai Museum, ST 57). That mountain is illustrated
in leaf 2 of the album Eight Views of the South (British Mu-
seum), reproduced in Edwards 1967: 133·
92. Shitao's sojourn at the Qiehan Studio is represented by

the following works: a recorded painting of the Three Gorges
painted in the Qiehan Studio in the second month of 1690
(noted by Han Linde 1989: 52); a handscroll of Bamboo, Or-
chids, and Rocks painted for Shen'an during the first days of
summer 1691 (Sotheby's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings,
18 March 1997); an inscription added there to the above-
mentioned 1685 handscroll of plum blossom "on a winter's
day," which must be the winter of 1690-1, since he spent the
following winter in Tianjin (Shanghai Museum, ST 57); the
handscroll entitled Suojin qifeng da caogao (STSHQj pI. 60,
Palace Museum, Beijing), painted there in the second month
of 1691, from which it is known that the Qiehan Studio be-
longed to Shen'an; and an album of landscapes begun in the
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Songjiang (unpublished, Toyo Bunka Archives, no. Ar6-r44);
and a painting illustrating a poem written at Changmen in Su-
zhou in an album from 1683 now in the Shanghai Museum
(STH] pl. 8).
48. "Magistrate Deng" was identified as Deng Qifen by

Wang Shiqing (r979a: 12). Deng served as magistrate of Jing-
quan during r674-8r and rebuilt rhe Shuixi Academy to help
students preparing for the examinations. He was also a pa-
tron of Mei Geng, supporting him in his studies in 1677-8
(see Hu Yi r984; Mei Geng 1990). A landscape by Shitao
from 1676 dedicated to Magistrate Deng is reproduced in
Sbenzbou guoguang ji, vol. 16. Shitao also evoked his r676
stay in Jingxian in albums in which he reminisced about his
former travels. See the following: the inscription to leaf 3 of
an album recorded in Pang Yuanji r97,a: I5!I2 ff. (from
which we know he stayed in the area from the spring through
the summer of 1676); a leaf from a mid-I690S album that il-
lustrates a poem dated 1676 (Zhongguo hua 1986(2): xxx);
and leaves 3 and 7 of Eight Views of the South in the British
Museum (Edwards r967: r34, 136).
49. Wang Shiqing r982.
50. Album painted for Wang Ji (1623-89), recorded in Pei

Jingfu 1937' I6/8b. In 1679, WangJi participated successful-
ly in the extraordinary boxue hongru examination. Richard
Strassberg (r989: 20) states that in r676 "Shitao traveled to
Kunshan to participate in the funeral [for Lu'an] and stayed
over into 1677 to aid in the erection of a memorial stupa."
51. The 1677 visit to ]iangsu is known from a landscape

album painted in 1680 (Palace Museum, Beijing). STSHQ]
pI. 4.
52. See Mingfu r978: r53.
53· The existence of the calligraphy handscroll of the r677

"Poem for Zhong Yuxing" was noted by Wu T'ung (1967).
It is reproduced and discussed in Xie Zhiliu (r979). For a full
translation and detailed discussion that interprets the word-
ing and meaning of the text differently from borh Wu and Xie,
see SLW 6r-2 n. 5.
54· The invitation to visit the Xitian Monastery is known

from a 1678 inscription by Wang Shimao to Shitao's self-
portrait, Master Shi Planting Pines, of 1674. See Wang Shiqing
1980. Shitao is known to have been in the Nanjing area dur-
ing pan or all of r678, 1679 and early 1680. During this pe-
riod he was associated not only with the Xitian Monastery
itself, but also (probably through Zu'an, see following nore)
with a subtemple of the monastery, the Huaixie Pavilion, and
with the Yongshou Monastery at Lishui, some one hundred Ii
south ofNanjing. One painting executed at Lishui in 1679 sur-
vives (Zhang and Hu 1969: vol. 3, no. 81), as well as one later
visual recollection of a local site, Eastern Mount Lu (see Shi
Runzhang 1982: 3r/9a-b) (STSHQj pI. 283, Central Academy
of Arts and Crafts, Beijing).
55· Zulin Yuanlin, hao Yushan, from a Shexian family, was

a monk of the Yongshou Monastery at Lishui, located some
one hundred Ii south of Nanjing. Another of Shitao's close
monk friends was Zu'an, whom he knew both in Xuancheng
and in Nanjing, where he became the abbot of Yongshou
Monastery. In later years Shirao would speak extremely warm-
ly of Zu'an, whose religious commitment and simplicity he ad-
mired. See a calligraphy in Shenyang Palace Museum, repro-
duced in STSHQ] pI. 392.
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56. According to Strassberg (1989: 21), who gives no
source, Master Qin was the monk Weiqin, former occupant
of the Single Branch Pavilion, who had become abbot of the
Fajie Temple at Ningguo.
57. Translation modified from Fong r976.
58. Mei Qing I69I. Hetao also contributed a colophon in

1680 to an album by Shitao (STSHQj pl. 12).
59. My translation owes much to that of Richard Vinograd

(I992a: 62). Vinograd interprets the reference to illness as a
metaphor for a spiritual crisis, but the poems he wrote com-
memorating his arrival confirm that he was recuperating from
a physical illness.
60. See Shitao's "Seven Poems on My Arrival at Chang-

gan's Single Branch Pavilion in the intercalary eighth month of
gengshen [1680]," inscribed on a landscape handscroll in the
Shanghai Museum (see Figure 55). According to Bordu: "the
pavilion is located west of Shui Stream and next to Xiaohe;
impressively solitary and out of the way, it stands up among
the wrens' nests." (Wenting sbiji, juan 2, cited in ST I 22 n. 12).
6r. Among the latter, one particularly notes Tian Lin, Wu

Canxi, and Zhou jing. Characteristic of this milieu is a 1680
landscape album by Shitao (Palace Museum, Beijing, STSHQj
pis. 1-14), dedicated to the as-yet-unidentified Wu Canxi, for
whom he also painted a landscape hanging scroll the follow-
ing year (Shanghai Museum, ST 26). The album bears colo-
phons by three Buddhist monks, including Hetao and a Fu-
jianese monk-painter, Chengxue (original name, Hu Jing). See
also the section "The Artist as Chan Master" in Chapter 9.
62. "Seven Poems on My Arrival at Changgan's Single

Branch Pavilion ... " (as in n. 60).
63· Wakeman 1985: 1119-20.
64· On the ruse as a fundamental figure of the exercise of

power, see Ba1andier 1985: 111-28.
65· On the various aspects of this offensive in the late

I670S and early I680s, see Spence 1966: 124-8; Kessler 1976;
Wakeman 1985: 1083; Meng Zhaoxin 1987; Song Dexuan
r990.
66. Zhongguo renmin daxue Qing shi yanjiusuo, ed. 1988:

entry fOI 23 September 1683. From two poems by Shi Run-
zhang ('982: 23/r8b-r9a; 38hob), it is known that Zheng
Hushan (Hushan is probably his zi) earlier held low-level po-
sitions at the capital (successively as zhonghan and sheren);
he is also described by Shi as a military man, possibly mean-
ing that he was a bannerman.
67· Xue Yongnian r987.
68. The Zhaos were a prominent gentry family in Laiyang,

Shandong. Zhao Lun's father died in 1643 in the defense of
Laiyang against the Manchu forces of Hong Taiji. Zhao Lun
himself gained the jinshi degree in r658 at the age of twenty-
three. He served as Education Commissioner from 1682 to
1688. See Li Yimang's colophon to a painting attributed to
Shi'ao (STSHQ] pI. 36); Wang Shiqing 1986.
69· The poems ale included in the Calligraphy Manuscript

for Monk ]uhui (see below, n. 109).
70• Itwas probably the efforts of those years that allowed

Shitao to be included in WDQS as Chan master of the Single
Branch Pavilion.
71. On Bada Shanren's reactions to Kangxi's Southern

Tours, see Mastel; 18, 102-4, 199-200.
72. Spence 1966: 127; Wu 1970: 31.

73. See also a hanging scroll of plum blossom and bamboo
in the Nanjing Museum evoking a visit to Linggu Monastery
and the Xiaoling mausoleum (STSHQj pl. 344). Plum blossom
in this period quickly came to serve as a ubiquitous memorial
to the "Bright" dynasty. In his Duhua lu, Zhou Lianggong
records the extreme instance of a Nanjing plum-blossom spe-
cialist, Yao Ruoyi, who "collected plum-blossom petals from
Zhongshan and painted in some trunks and branches, because
he imagined the branch and trunks as [sticks of] incense that
could recall the spirits of the dead." Translation adapted from
Kim 1985: vol. 2, 162.
74. Other friends mentioned include Zhang Yi, son of a

martyred Ming general (Strassberg '983: 205-8); Zhang
Zong, a dedicated lay Buddhist (biography by Xian Zhu in
Zhang Chao, ed., 1954: juan 16); and Wu jiaji, a well-known
Ming loyalist poet from the Yangzhou area (Chaves 1986).
For an overview of Shitao's Nanjing friends and acquain-
tances, see Zheng Zhuolu 1961: 17-26.
75. Li Lin 1708.
76. Ibid.: juan r5.
77. Guangwu Di (r. 25-57 C.E.) was the first emperor of the

Eastern Han dynasty. He belonged to the Liu family which had
reigned as the Western Han dynasty until Wang Mang usurped
power in 9 C.E. Zhaolie (r. 221-3 C.E.) was the first emperor
of the Shu-Han dynasty. The fact that his family name was Liu
Bei justified the use of the name "Han" for his dynasty. Liezu
was the founder of the Southern Tang dynasty, an orphan who
changed his name to Li Bian when he took the name Tang for
his dynasty, claiming to be a Tang imperial descendant.
78. In a painting inscription recorded in Yamamoto Teijiro

1932 that is dated to the seventh month of 1686, he already
speaks of going north (ST n. r6). He also menrions his plan
in the inscription to an unpublished handscroll for Zhou jing
in the winter of 1686 (Streams and Mountains without End,
C. C. Wang Family Collection), in another for the monk Zhiqi
also in the winter of 1686 (painting inscription in Tingfeng lou
shuhua ji, cited by Han Linde '989: 42-3), and again in the
undated "Song of My Life." .
79. Many years later, writing of the winter of 1687, he Sim-

ply says, "at that time I had wanted to make a journey to the
North but was unable to carry out my wish, and so I end-
ed up living on the Han [i.e., in Yangzhou] for a number of
years" (inscription to the album Miniature Landscapes, 169.9,
of which one leaf is illustrated here [see Figure 104]). My dIS-
cussion here generally follows Joseph Chang (Zhang Zining
'993, especially pp. 80-2).
80. The patron was Chang Hanqian (b. 1634), for whom

he had painted a set of twelve paintings on silk in 1683.
81. Zhang Zining 1993. Many years lat~r,Li Lin i~ hi,S

biography also mentioned this theft, reporting that Shltao s
depression lasted for three years. As pointed out by Joseph
Chang (i.e., Zhang Zining) in a lecture delivered at Yale Dill-
versity Art Gallery, his depressed state can also be seen III twO

painting inscriptions: to a 1687 Landscape of Mount Heng
(see Figure 46), and a 1690 landscape handscroll (Barnhart
et al. 1994: cat. no. 48, see below, n. 88).
82. Du Jiwen and Wei Daoru 1993: 598-603.
83. Zhuo Erkan (r960: r6) Iecords a visit that Zhuo, to-

gether with Fei Mi, Xiao Cuo (Zhengyi), and others, made to
see Shitao at the Jinghui Monastery in the late I680s.

84. These are the first four lines of an eight-line poem, itself
the first of two that Shirao elsewhere transcribed together: first,
on a calligraphy fan (Christie's New York, Fine Chinese Paint-
ings and Calligraphy, 23 November 1991, lot 123), and sec-
ond, in the 1692 Calligraphy Handscroll for Monk]uhui. In
the fan transcription they are titled "Welcoming His Imperial
Majesty's Visit in the Year [isi [r689J"; the handscroll tran-
scription has the title "Two Poems Respectfully Recounting
His Imperial Majesty's Southern Inspection Tour."
85. We can thus add one detail to a reading of the dragon-

mountain in the painting as the emperor: the curious flamelike
forms toward the center are inspired by the sight of Kangxi
in his dragon-embroidered robes.
86. Shi Shuqing I98r.
87. Wang Shiqing 1982; Mingfu r978: r53 ff.
88. Barnhart et al. '994: 172-5. The poem reads: "The

mountains look like rain but there is no rain /The paper win-
dows are suddenly bright, suddenly dark /The mountains are
pale, the rocks are pale, and the pines are pale, /The glinting
light of the ebbing water mirrors a disturbed heart" (trans.
Heping Liu). Dedicated to a certain Wuweng, otherwise un-
identified, the painting depicts an empty temple looking over
a river. The prominence of the temple, reminiscent of slightly
earlier handscrolls such as First Arrival at the Single Branch
Pavilion (see Figure 55) or Ten Thousand Ugly Inkblots (see
Figure 167) suggests that the recipient was a layman or Bud-
dhist monk. The jisi (1689) date makes it certain that it was
painted in Nanjing rather than Yangzhou, since he was still in
Nanjing in the first days of gengwu (1690). See Wang Shiqing
1982.
89. From a poem by Tian Lin that was written after see-

ing Shitao in Nanjing at the beginning of 1690. See Tian Lin
1727: shangl r».
90. In his painting inscriptions Shitao refers to this patron

under the name of Shen'an, which was identified by Mingfu
(1978) as the sobriquet of Wang Fengrong, zi Wushu, r648
iinshi. Wang Fengrong served as vice minister in the Ministry
of Personnel in 1688-9. When he returned to government ser-
vice at the end of 1692 it was as vice minister in the Ministry
of Rites, a position he held until his death in r703. See Qing
dai zhiguan nianbiao (r980).
91. The painting in question was executed at the Old Ding-

lin Temple at Mount Tianyin in the southern outskirts of Nan-
jing (Shanghai Museum, ST 57). That mountain is illustrated
in leaf 2 of the album Eight Views of the South (British Mu-
seum), reproduced in Edwards 1967: 133·
92. Shitao's sojourn at the Qiehan Studio is represented by

the following works: a recorded painting of the Three Gorges
painted in the Qiehan Studio in the second month of 1690
(noted by Han Linde 1989: 52); a handscroll of Bamboo, Or-
chids, and Rocks painted for Shen'an during the first days of
summer 1691 (Sotheby's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings,
18 March 1997); an inscription added there to the above-
mentioned 1685 handscroll of plum blossom "on a winter's
day," which must be the winter of 1690-1, since he spent the
following winter in Tianjin (Shanghai Museum, ST 57); the
handscroll entitled Suojin qifeng da caogao (STSHQj pI. 60,
Palace Museum, Beijing), painted there in the second month
of 1691, from which it is known that the Qiehan Studio be-
longed to Shen'an; and an album of landscapes begun in the
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Qiehan Studio and completed at Ciyuan Temple in the seventh
month of the same year (see Figure 171). There also exists an
undated hanging scroll painted in the Qiehan Studio, Hunting
in Autumn (see Figure 90), which is a facsimile copy of a Ming
dynasty "barbarian" hunting scene. A landscape purportedly
painted in the Qiehan Studio in the autumn of 1690 (STH] no.
38) is a spurious modern work.
93· Wang Zehong (1626-1708), zi Juanlai, hao Haolu,

from Huanggang in Hubei, was a 1655 jinshi who held the
rank of vice minister in the Ministry of Rites from 1690 to
1699 but would later rise to the rank of minister (Qing dai
zhiguan nianbiao 1980). He had spent most of the 16805 in
Nanjing, where he owned a fine garden (Deng Zhicheng 1965:
936; Mingfu 1978: r90; Wang Shiqing 1982; Kim 1985: vol.
2,124; Zhang Zining 1988; Hu 1995). Wang was the recip-
ient of Shadows of Old Trees, painted in the third month of
1691 (see Figure 89). He also invited Shitao to join an outing
in the outskirts of the city, which gave rise to a commemora-
tive landscape hanging scroll (Yiyuan duoying 23 [r984]: 22).
94· Wang Zhi, zi Chenyue, bao Renyue, from Fushan in

Shandong, served as viceroy of Fujian and Zhejiang from r688
to the fifth month of r689 and was in the emperor's entou-
rage at the time of the latter's visit to Yangzhou. He was then
recalled to the capital, where he served as minister in the Min-
istry of Revenue (Wu T'ung 1967: 58). Two long poems ad-
dressed to him by Shitao have survived: One, originally in-
scribed on a painting of Beijing after a snowfall, is recorded in
DDZTHSB 1/8-9; the other, originally the inscription to a
now-lost painting of the Xianxia Ling mountain pass joining
Zhejiang and Fujian, is among the old poems transcribed on
Shirao's 1696 handscroll Calligraphies and Sketches by Qing-
xiang (see Figure 72). Both poems date from 1690. According
to the latter poem, the Xianxia Ling painting was part of a
double commission, Wang Zhi having also requested a pine
painting. Finally, a fourth painting from 1690 has recently
come to light: a large and formal hanging scroll on a birthday
theme, depicting chrysanthemums, rocks, and a wutong tree
(Christie's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings and Calligra-
phy, r5 September r998, lot 142).
95· He saw, for example, works from the collection of

Geng Zhaozhong (1640-86). See his inscription to Cranes in
the Pines and Fish in the River, recorded in DDZTHSB J/70.
On Geng Zhaozhong's collection, see Lawton 1976. It was no
doubt also through Bordu's good offices that he visited the pal-
ace of the late Prince An, Yolo (?-1689), and viewed its collec-
tions, probably as the guest of Yolo's son and Bordu's close
friend, Yueduan (poetry manuscript album c. 1693, private
collection, Princeton).
96. In his preface to Chen Ding's Zhu pu (Bamboo Man-

ual), Zhang Chao notes that "the presem Emperor loves bam-
boo" and memions an "Ode to Bamboo" by Kangxi. Zhang
Chao, ed. 1990 (yiji, 1700): 3'3.
97· For a discussion of these two collaborative works, see

Fu and Fu 1973: 49-51.
98• See a set of poems sent to Yueduan in Beijing in the

above-mentioned (n. 95) poetry manuscript album c. 1693.
For a Dadi Tang-period orchid painting dedicated to Yue-
duan, see Figure 78.
99· See Chen Zuwu 1992: 2°9-13. The li-ch'i question is

explored in more detail in Chapters 8 ("Shitao on Craft: The
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Integrity of Painting") and 9 ("The Metaphysics of Indepen-
dence").
100. In addition to the contacts noted above, there are

Wang Yuanqi's words of praise: "I canot know all the painters
in the country, but south of the Yangzi, one must recommend
Shitao as the greatest. He has achieved aspects which both
Shigu [Wang Hui] and I cannot attain." QXLRT] 19a.
toI. Although the name of Gao Shiqi (1645-1703) imme-

diately comes to mind, Gao is unlikely to be the target since
he was not in Beijing at the same time as Shitao.
102. The poems are included in the Calligraphy Manu-

script for Monk ]uhui.
103· See his inscription to Suojin qifeng da caogao, paint-

ed in the second month of r691 (Palace Museum, Beijing,
STSHQ] pis. 60-70).
104· On Xuezhuang and Xinshu Fuqian, see Shi Shuqing

1981.
105· Shirao's move to Ciyuan Temple can be dated fairly

precisely, since an album initiated in the Qiehan Studio as a
final thank-you to Wang Fengrong was completed in Ciyuan
Temple in the seventh month of 169r (see Figure 171). In ad-
dition, in his poem thanking Tu Na for his visit at the temple
that autumn, he mentions that he had just newly moved there
(see n. 106). Ciyuan Temple was a small temple that had been
renovated not long before (1674): see Xu Daoling 1996: r7J.
For the topography of the area, see Beijing lishi ditu ji.
106. Tu Na was minister in the Ministry of Justice from

1689 to 1697, and his visit is known from a poem transcribed
on Calligraphies and Sketches by' Qingxiang (see Figure 72).
Shitao's 1701 visit to see Tu Qingge at Shaobo, where he was
overseeing flood-repair efforts was discussed in the section
"The Floods of 1705" in Chapter J.
107. The translation and interpretation offered here, which

Correct several errors in my prior study of this text in SL ~
are heavily indebted to Shi-yee Fiedler's unpublished paper
"From Buddhism to Daoism: A Study on Shitao's Sketches of
Calligraphy and Painting" (1998), generously made available
to me by the author.
108. Another second-generation disciple of Muchen, Zu-

zhen Yuanyu (1629-95), abbot of Mount Tai's Puzhao Mon-
astery, took up a similar stance at the time of Muchen and
Lu'an's association with the throne, though he later attracted
Kangxi's interest during the 1684 Southern Tour and answered
questions from the emperor's representative, Gao Shiqi (Deng
Zhicheng 1965: 52o-r).
109. Calligraphy Manuscript for Monk ]uhui. The entries

are as follows: I. "Seven Poems on Arriving at the Single
Branch [Pavilion] at Qin-Huai in the Eighth Month of the
Year Gengshen [r680]"; 2. "Sending Off Sun Yuli on His Re-
turn Journey to Court, with Greetings to the Academicians Shi
Yushan and Gao Yuanhuai"; 3. "East of the Yangzi [i.e., in
Nanjing] on an Autumn's Day, Remembering Baiyun and the
Other Commoners and Hermits"; 4. "Six Poems on the Pago-
da at Changgan [Monastery], Composed in the Single Branch
Pavilion"; 5. "Two Poems on Meeting the Emperor at Chang-
gao [Monastery] and Being Munificently Questioned"; 6.
"Two Poems Respectfully Recounting His Imperial Majesty's
Southern Inspection Tour"; 7. "Song of My Life, Taking Leave
at the Single Branch [Pavilion] of All My Friends East of the
Yangzi [i.e., in Nanjing]"; 8. two poems on visits to jinshan

and jiaoshan, respectively; 9. "Expression of My Feelings on
Humankind Day [seventh day of the first month] in the Cap-
ital; ro. "Written in Reply to the Various Friends Who Have
Asked Me Why I Do Not Establish a Temple [kai tang] and
Live in the World;" II. poem and dedication to ]uhui. The
ninth entry was written in Beijing on the seventh day of the
first month of what can only be r69I (on the equivalent day
of 1690 he was still in Nanjing, and on that of 1692 in Tian-
jin). Shitao's meeting with ]uhui in Tianjin, therefore, must
have taken place either during the winter of 1691-2 or when
he passed through Tianjin again in the autumn of 1692 on his
way back home. In the last line of the poem to juhui, Shitao
evokes their shared renewal of their decision to return south,
affirming that this time they will not waver. In his own case
this reads most easily as a reference to his change of heart in
1691 and thus argues in favor of the former date, since there
were altogether two changes of heart before he finally left in
the autumn of r692. The fact that Shitao drops no Beijing
names is probably an indication that the bulk of the handscroll
was written out quite some time prior to its presentation to
]uhui. With the exception of the dedication to Juhui and the
two preceding entries, all the others predate his arrival in the
North, suggesting that he originally put together the manu-
script as a kind of calling card. The reasons for some of his
choices require explanation. The second entry, for example,
evokes three officials from Xuancheng, one of whom (Sun
Zhuo) was a particular favorite of Kangxi (Xuancheng xian-
zhi: r6l19a-20a); the other two (Shi Runzhang and Gao Yong)
were among those scholars nominated for, and successful in,
the 1679 boxue hongru examination. The fourth entry is de-
voted to a Ming dynastic site, the "porcelain pagoda" at
Changgan Monastery, originally constructed at the orders of
the Yongle emperor; however, it was certainly included here
because Kangxi had had the pagoda restored in 1679. The
eighth entry includes a reference to a titleboard in the imperial
hand bestowed by Kangxi on Liuyun Pavilion on the Yangzi
River island of ]inshan. Finally, entries 9-11 have a rather dif-
ferent character from the others, encapsulating his northern
stay in a cycle of ambition, doubts and, finally, disappoint-
ment.
110. In the imperially sponsored record of Chan monks

under the Qing dynasty, Shigao is listed as abbot of Anhua
Temple at Fangshan near Beijing (WDQS, juan 81), but there
are many records conecting him with the Dabei Monastery in
Tianjin (Cui Jin 1987). Shitao also knew another of Shigao's
disciples in addition to Zhang Zhu: Liang Hong, a Buddhist
layman from Hubei who was a calligrapher and seal carver,
and who had once given him tips on painting (see WDQS 49I,
which records several lay disciples of Shigao). On Liang Hong
(zi Chongci), see also Mei Wending 1995: 157-8.
III. The Zhang cousins owed their wealth to the family

salt business, but both men had in the past served in govern-
ment positions in the capital, and Zhang Lin was about to re~
sume an official career. On Shitao's stay in Tianjin, see CUI
jin r987. On the Zhang cousins, see also Mingfu 1978:
170-1; Durand 1992: 155-9; and Fiedler 1998. In the sum-
mer of 1705, Zhang Lin was indicted for corruption a~d .had
all his property confiscated (including, presumably, pamtmgs
by Shitao).
II2. Fu Baoshi 1948: 70.

113· Shitao subsequently transcribed his farewell poem on
the 1696 handscroll Calligraphies and Sketches by Qingxia.,g
(see Figure 72). See Fong 1976: 24; Fiedler 1998.
114· Translation modified from Fong 1976: 23. The poem

is inscribed on Calligraphies and Sketches by Qingxiang, 1696
(see Figure 72).
115· On the date of Shitao's departure, see SLW 84 n. III;

Wang Shiqing 1982. Shitao's final stopover in Tianjin is known
from a poem by Zhang Zhu. See Cui Jin 1987.
116. For the late Ming I here borrow the formulation of

Susan Mann (1997: 22).
II7· Wu 1990: 235-7.
118. See Vinograd (199Ia, I992a), for this development

in portraiture.

FIVE. THE ACKNOWLEDGMENT OF ORIGINS

1. Wang Shiqing 1982. See also SLW 84 n. IIr, 85 n. It3.
2. Zulin Yuanlin was one of Shitao's former hosts at the

Xitian Monastery in 1678-9.
3. The inscription reads in part: "You look just the same

but perhaps you've forgotten past times-/You were obstinate
then in your liking of simple poverty.! .. .IAlas! This old
Huangbo monk in the mountains,/So erudite and enlightened,
and yet he has to come back here./How can there be no-one
in the world who appreciates his worth? IThe Ancients un-
fairly hold down his talent." SeeZhang Yuejun xiansheng, ...
1978: 234-5· For further information on this Nanjing stay,
see SLW 32-4,84-5 nn. 111-13, 118.
4. The poems are included in a poetry manuscript album

probably executed c. 1693 (private collection, Princeton).
5. There is also a pun here on the literal meaning of ii: to

help, to aid. Many years later, this poem would find an echo
in a rare seal reading "What help can I bring?" ["Wo he ji zhi
you?"]
6. That is, the Hall of the Great Tree in Jinghui Monastery.
7. I am translating by "luxury and decadence" the meta-

phor "flower affairs of the Six Dynasties."
8. A reference to one of Shirao's appellations, Monk Bit-

ter Melon.
9. These sentiments are echoed in another poem from ap-

proximately the same moment, which he added to his 1683
Landscapes and Poetry (Shanghai Museum, ST 72). There he
evokes his unhappiness in the North, his happiness to be back
in the South, and the futility of pursuing imperial patronage.
The poem is all the more resonant given that this album con-
tains the 1683 poem in which he asked Zheng Hushan to pro-
mote him to the emperor.
10. See Wu Qi 1982: 5125a-26a.
II. Shitao mentions Wu Mountain Pavilion in a set of three

poems that he wrote c. 1693-4 about plum blossom at Mount
Ganquan. See QXLRTJ 7a-b.
12. From his inscription to a 1693 landscape painting for

Wu Zhenbo (see Figure 93).
13. For an extended interpretation of this album, see Yang

r994·
14. The leaf is reproduced in Edwards r967: r08. For a

translation of the inscription, see the discussion of the trans-
regional art world in the section "The Early Qing Art World"
in Chapter 8.



NOTES TO PP. 105-8

Qiehan Studio and completed at Ciyuan Temple in the seventh
month of the same year (see Figure 171). There also exists an
undated hanging scroll painted in the Qiehan Studio, Hunting
in Autumn (see Figure 90), which is a facsimile copy of a Ming
dynasty "barbarian" hunting scene. A landscape purportedly
painted in the Qiehan Studio in the autumn of 1690 (STH] no.
38) is a spurious modern work.
93· Wang Zehong (1626-1708), zi Juanlai, hao Haolu,

from Huanggang in Hubei, was a 1655 jinshi who held the
rank of vice minister in the Ministry of Rites from 1690 to
1699 but would later rise to the rank of minister (Qing dai
zhiguan nianbiao 1980). He had spent most of the 16805 in
Nanjing, where he owned a fine garden (Deng Zhicheng 1965:
936; Mingfu 1978: r90; Wang Shiqing 1982; Kim 1985: vol.
2,124; Zhang Zining 1988; Hu 1995). Wang was the recip-
ient of Shadows of Old Trees, painted in the third month of
1691 (see Figure 89). He also invited Shitao to join an outing
in the outskirts of the city, which gave rise to a commemora-
tive landscape hanging scroll (Yiyuan duoying 23 [r984]: 22).
94· Wang Zhi, zi Chenyue, bao Renyue, from Fushan in

Shandong, served as viceroy of Fujian and Zhejiang from r688
to the fifth month of r689 and was in the emperor's entou-
rage at the time of the latter's visit to Yangzhou. He was then
recalled to the capital, where he served as minister in the Min-
istry of Revenue (Wu T'ung 1967: 58). Two long poems ad-
dressed to him by Shitao have survived: One, originally in-
scribed on a painting of Beijing after a snowfall, is recorded in
DDZTHSB 1/8-9; the other, originally the inscription to a
now-lost painting of the Xianxia Ling mountain pass joining
Zhejiang and Fujian, is among the old poems transcribed on
Shirao's 1696 handscroll Calligraphies and Sketches by Qing-
xiang (see Figure 72). Both poems date from 1690. According
to the latter poem, the Xianxia Ling painting was part of a
double commission, Wang Zhi having also requested a pine
painting. Finally, a fourth painting from 1690 has recently
come to light: a large and formal hanging scroll on a birthday
theme, depicting chrysanthemums, rocks, and a wutong tree
(Christie's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings and Calligra-
phy, r5 September r998, lot 142).
95· He saw, for example, works from the collection of

Geng Zhaozhong (1640-86). See his inscription to Cranes in
the Pines and Fish in the River, recorded in DDZTHSB J/70.
On Geng Zhaozhong's collection, see Lawton 1976. It was no
doubt also through Bordu's good offices that he visited the pal-
ace of the late Prince An, Yolo (?-1689), and viewed its collec-
tions, probably as the guest of Yolo's son and Bordu's close
friend, Yueduan (poetry manuscript album c. 1693, private
collection, Princeton).
96. In his preface to Chen Ding's Zhu pu (Bamboo Man-

ual), Zhang Chao notes that "the presem Emperor loves bam-
boo" and memions an "Ode to Bamboo" by Kangxi. Zhang
Chao, ed. 1990 (yiji, 1700): 3'3.
97· For a discussion of these two collaborative works, see

Fu and Fu 1973: 49-51.
98• See a set of poems sent to Yueduan in Beijing in the

above-mentioned (n. 95) poetry manuscript album c. 1693.
For a Dadi Tang-period orchid painting dedicated to Yue-
duan, see Figure 78.
99· See Chen Zuwu 1992: 2°9-13. The li-ch'i question is

explored in more detail in Chapters 8 ("Shitao on Craft: The
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Integrity of Painting") and 9 ("The Metaphysics of Indepen-
dence").
100. In addition to the contacts noted above, there are

Wang Yuanqi's words of praise: "I canot know all the painters
in the country, but south of the Yangzi, one must recommend
Shitao as the greatest. He has achieved aspects which both
Shigu [Wang Hui] and I cannot attain." QXLRT] 19a.
toI. Although the name of Gao Shiqi (1645-1703) imme-

diately comes to mind, Gao is unlikely to be the target since
he was not in Beijing at the same time as Shitao.
102. The poems are included in the Calligraphy Manu-

script for Monk ]uhui.
103· See his inscription to Suojin qifeng da caogao, paint-

ed in the second month of r691 (Palace Museum, Beijing,
STSHQ] pis. 60-70).
104· On Xuezhuang and Xinshu Fuqian, see Shi Shuqing

1981.
105· Shirao's move to Ciyuan Temple can be dated fairly

precisely, since an album initiated in the Qiehan Studio as a
final thank-you to Wang Fengrong was completed in Ciyuan
Temple in the seventh month of 169r (see Figure 171). In ad-
dition, in his poem thanking Tu Na for his visit at the temple
that autumn, he mentions that he had just newly moved there
(see n. 106). Ciyuan Temple was a small temple that had been
renovated not long before (1674): see Xu Daoling 1996: r7J.
For the topography of the area, see Beijing lishi ditu ji.
106. Tu Na was minister in the Ministry of Justice from

1689 to 1697, and his visit is known from a poem transcribed
on Calligraphies and Sketches by' Qingxiang (see Figure 72).
Shitao's 1701 visit to see Tu Qingge at Shaobo, where he was
overseeing flood-repair efforts was discussed in the section
"The Floods of 1705" in Chapter J.
107. The translation and interpretation offered here, which

Correct several errors in my prior study of this text in SL ~
are heavily indebted to Shi-yee Fiedler's unpublished paper
"From Buddhism to Daoism: A Study on Shitao's Sketches of
Calligraphy and Painting" (1998), generously made available
to me by the author.
108. Another second-generation disciple of Muchen, Zu-

zhen Yuanyu (1629-95), abbot of Mount Tai's Puzhao Mon-
astery, took up a similar stance at the time of Muchen and
Lu'an's association with the throne, though he later attracted
Kangxi's interest during the 1684 Southern Tour and answered
questions from the emperor's representative, Gao Shiqi (Deng
Zhicheng 1965: 52o-r).
109. Calligraphy Manuscript for Monk ]uhui. The entries

are as follows: I. "Seven Poems on Arriving at the Single
Branch [Pavilion] at Qin-Huai in the Eighth Month of the
Year Gengshen [r680]"; 2. "Sending Off Sun Yuli on His Re-
turn Journey to Court, with Greetings to the Academicians Shi
Yushan and Gao Yuanhuai"; 3. "East of the Yangzi [i.e., in
Nanjing] on an Autumn's Day, Remembering Baiyun and the
Other Commoners and Hermits"; 4. "Six Poems on the Pago-
da at Changgan [Monastery], Composed in the Single Branch
Pavilion"; 5. "Two Poems on Meeting the Emperor at Chang-
gao [Monastery] and Being Munificently Questioned"; 6.
"Two Poems Respectfully Recounting His Imperial Majesty's
Southern Inspection Tour"; 7. "Song of My Life, Taking Leave
at the Single Branch [Pavilion] of All My Friends East of the
Yangzi [i.e., in Nanjing]"; 8. two poems on visits to jinshan

and jiaoshan, respectively; 9. "Expression of My Feelings on
Humankind Day [seventh day of the first month] in the Cap-
ital; ro. "Written in Reply to the Various Friends Who Have
Asked Me Why I Do Not Establish a Temple [kai tang] and
Live in the World;" II. poem and dedication to ]uhui. The
ninth entry was written in Beijing on the seventh day of the
first month of what can only be r69I (on the equivalent day
of 1690 he was still in Nanjing, and on that of 1692 in Tian-
jin). Shitao's meeting with ]uhui in Tianjin, therefore, must
have taken place either during the winter of 1691-2 or when
he passed through Tianjin again in the autumn of 1692 on his
way back home. In the last line of the poem to juhui, Shitao
evokes their shared renewal of their decision to return south,
affirming that this time they will not waver. In his own case
this reads most easily as a reference to his change of heart in
1691 and thus argues in favor of the former date, since there
were altogether two changes of heart before he finally left in
the autumn of r692. The fact that Shitao drops no Beijing
names is probably an indication that the bulk of the handscroll
was written out quite some time prior to its presentation to
]uhui. With the exception of the dedication to Juhui and the
two preceding entries, all the others predate his arrival in the
North, suggesting that he originally put together the manu-
script as a kind of calling card. The reasons for some of his
choices require explanation. The second entry, for example,
evokes three officials from Xuancheng, one of whom (Sun
Zhuo) was a particular favorite of Kangxi (Xuancheng xian-
zhi: r6l19a-20a); the other two (Shi Runzhang and Gao Yong)
were among those scholars nominated for, and successful in,
the 1679 boxue hongru examination. The fourth entry is de-
voted to a Ming dynastic site, the "porcelain pagoda" at
Changgan Monastery, originally constructed at the orders of
the Yongle emperor; however, it was certainly included here
because Kangxi had had the pagoda restored in 1679. The
eighth entry includes a reference to a titleboard in the imperial
hand bestowed by Kangxi on Liuyun Pavilion on the Yangzi
River island of ]inshan. Finally, entries 9-11 have a rather dif-
ferent character from the others, encapsulating his northern
stay in a cycle of ambition, doubts and, finally, disappoint-
ment.
110. In the imperially sponsored record of Chan monks

under the Qing dynasty, Shigao is listed as abbot of Anhua
Temple at Fangshan near Beijing (WDQS, juan 81), but there
are many records conecting him with the Dabei Monastery in
Tianjin (Cui Jin 1987). Shitao also knew another of Shigao's
disciples in addition to Zhang Zhu: Liang Hong, a Buddhist
layman from Hubei who was a calligrapher and seal carver,
and who had once given him tips on painting (see WDQS 49I,
which records several lay disciples of Shigao). On Liang Hong
(zi Chongci), see also Mei Wending 1995: 157-8.
III. The Zhang cousins owed their wealth to the family

salt business, but both men had in the past served in govern-
ment positions in the capital, and Zhang Lin was about to re~
sume an official career. On Shitao's stay in Tianjin, see CUI
jin r987. On the Zhang cousins, see also Mingfu 1978:
170-1; Durand 1992: 155-9; and Fiedler 1998. In the sum-
mer of 1705, Zhang Lin was indicted for corruption a~d .had
all his property confiscated (including, presumably, pamtmgs
by Shitao).
II2. Fu Baoshi 1948: 70.

113· Shitao subsequently transcribed his farewell poem on
the 1696 handscroll Calligraphies and Sketches by Qingxia.,g
(see Figure 72). See Fong 1976: 24; Fiedler 1998.
114· Translation modified from Fong 1976: 23. The poem

is inscribed on Calligraphies and Sketches by Qingxiang, 1696
(see Figure 72).
115· On the date of Shitao's departure, see SLW 84 n. III;

Wang Shiqing 1982. Shitao's final stopover in Tianjin is known
from a poem by Zhang Zhu. See Cui Jin 1987.
116. For the late Ming I here borrow the formulation of

Susan Mann (1997: 22).
II7· Wu 1990: 235-7.
118. See Vinograd (199Ia, I992a), for this development

in portraiture.

FIVE. THE ACKNOWLEDGMENT OF ORIGINS

1. Wang Shiqing 1982. See also SLW 84 n. IIr, 85 n. It3.
2. Zulin Yuanlin was one of Shitao's former hosts at the

Xitian Monastery in 1678-9.
3. The inscription reads in part: "You look just the same

but perhaps you've forgotten past times-/You were obstinate
then in your liking of simple poverty.! .. .IAlas! This old
Huangbo monk in the mountains,/So erudite and enlightened,
and yet he has to come back here./How can there be no-one
in the world who appreciates his worth? IThe Ancients un-
fairly hold down his talent." SeeZhang Yuejun xiansheng, ...
1978: 234-5· For further information on this Nanjing stay,
see SLW 32-4,84-5 nn. 111-13, 118.
4. The poems are included in a poetry manuscript album

probably executed c. 1693 (private collection, Princeton).
5. There is also a pun here on the literal meaning of ii: to

help, to aid. Many years later, this poem would find an echo
in a rare seal reading "What help can I bring?" ["Wo he ji zhi
you?"]
6. That is, the Hall of the Great Tree in Jinghui Monastery.
7. I am translating by "luxury and decadence" the meta-

phor "flower affairs of the Six Dynasties."
8. A reference to one of Shirao's appellations, Monk Bit-

ter Melon.
9. These sentiments are echoed in another poem from ap-

proximately the same moment, which he added to his 1683
Landscapes and Poetry (Shanghai Museum, ST 72). There he
evokes his unhappiness in the North, his happiness to be back
in the South, and the futility of pursuing imperial patronage.
The poem is all the more resonant given that this album con-
tains the 1683 poem in which he asked Zheng Hushan to pro-
mote him to the emperor.
10. See Wu Qi 1982: 5125a-26a.
II. Shitao mentions Wu Mountain Pavilion in a set of three

poems that he wrote c. 1693-4 about plum blossom at Mount
Ganquan. See QXLRTJ 7a-b.
12. From his inscription to a 1693 landscape painting for

Wu Zhenbo (see Figure 93).
13. For an extended interpretation of this album, see Yang

r994·
14. The leaf is reproduced in Edwards r967: r08. For a

translation of the inscription, see the discussion of the trans-
regional art world in the section "The Early Qing Art World"
in Chapter 8.
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15. The works from the summer of 1695 include Land-
scapes for Chaomin (fifth month), reproduced in Dafeng tang
mingji, vol. 2, pis. 29-33; Lake Chao, hanging scroll for
Zhang Chunxiu (see Figure 92); Landscapes of the Highest
Class, for Huang You (see Figures 64,65, So); Flowers and
Figures, for Huang You (see Figures 192, 204, 206); Land-
scapes, see Zhongguo hua 1986(2): 37-9; 1986(3): 50-I. For
the dating of the last three albums, see SLW 89 n. "43.
16. Li Tianfu had been Grand Secretary of the Hall of Mil-

itary Glory (rank raj. This trip is discussed at greater length
in Chapter 6 (section "The Monk-Painter as Professional").
17. Again, see the section "The Monk-Painter as Profes-

sional" in Chapter 6.
18. For example, Li Guosong (1672 fugongsheng, 16841u-

ren), Wang Xiru (r684 gongsheng), Sang Zhi (gongsheng, date
not ascertained).
19. The album is recorded in Lu Xinyuan 1891: 36/rrb.

Qilao has been tentatively identified as Wang Hongwen from
Jianzhou in Liaoning (Wang Shiqing 198rb: n. 2). However,
the name of a Chan monk of the same generation as Shitao,
Buqi, has also been suggested (Mingfu 1978: 170). The latter
suggestion may find some confirmation in the fact that one of
the recorded leaves was painted in a what appears to be a hall
of a Buddhist temple, Suoluo Tang.
20. Present whereabouts unknown. Reproduced in Ed-

wards 1967: 110.
2I. On this iconography in the painting of Kuncan, and a

consideration of this and related images by Shirao, see Vine-
grad 1992a: 55-63.
22. Wang Shiqing 1981a.
23. From a set of five poems inscribed on an unpublished

album from 1701 dedicated to the official Wang Ziquan, in the
Palace Museum, Beijing.
24. The two temples were Dongxiao Gong and Tianzhu

Guan.
25. On the Dragon Gate branch of Quanzhen Daoism in

the seventeenth and eighteenth centuries, see Ren Jiyu, ed.
1990: 651-61.
26. Looking at the Mountains at Yuhang, 1693, Shanghai

Museum (see Figure 174). SeeWai-kam Ho, ed. 1992: vol. I,
cat. no. 159. The recipient was the Chinese bannerman Zhang
Jingjie.
27. Lee and Ho 1968: 95.
28. Huang jixian, zi Zhongbin, from Tandu in Shexian.

For his official career, see above, Chapter 2, n. 59.
29· Vinograd 1978.
30. J. S. Hay 1994b, "999·
3I. For this interpretation of the Great Cleansing, see Fong

"976.
32. In the Sumitomo Collection.
33. For example, the Landscapes for Yu Daoren (see Fig-

ures 168, 169). See the section "The Artist as Chan Master"
in Cha prer 9.
34. When Shitao had filst met him, that spring, he added

a colophon to a painting by Hongren that Cheng owned. See
JJZLJ; Wang Shiqing '978.
35· This is pointed out by Sarah E. Fraser (1989), who also

makes the point that for certain images he probably consulted
preexisting sketches.
36. In his farewell poem, he places himself within a nation-

al landscape. The poem for Wang Zhi celebrates his recent

tour of duty as governor-general of Fuiian and Zhejiang in
1688-9· Wu T'ung 1967: 58.
37. For a useful discussion of Shitao's use of the peng meta-

phor, see Fiedler 1998.
38. It is a measure of the porosity of the boundary between

the national and transregional frames of reference that since
Shitao's departure from Beijing, Zhang Lin had entered official
life and was now, like the artist, in Anhui, serving as a provin-
cial judge. On Zhang Lin's official career, see Durand 1992:
155-9·
39. Vinograd 1992a: 62.
40. See, for example, Hong Zhengzhi's 1720 colophon to

Shitao's Streams and Mountains without End in the C. C.
Wang Family Collection.
4I. This Chan title can be traced back only as far as 173 I,

when Wang Yichen, editor of Dadizi tihua shiba (DDZTHSB),
made a manuscript copy of an earlier manuscript. See Zheng
Zhuolu 1961: 78.
42. For example, writer-scholar Huang Yun (introduced

below in the section "jingjiang Descendant"): See his colo-
phon to Shitao's Orchids for Hong Zhengzhi, recorded in
DDZTHSB 2/40-8.
43. Postscript to a poem written for Shitao, in Tao Wei

(n.d.),
44· See SLW 197 n. "9.
45. Li Lin 1708: 9160b.
46. Liang Peilan 1708: ji 7.
47· Colophon to Shirao's Orchids for Hong Zhengzhi,

recorded in DDZTHSB 2/40-8.
48. Poems in the Beijing Library manuscript copy of Bor-

du's poetry collection Wenting shiii, cited by Han Linde 1989:
79-80.
49. Other nearby Daoist temples included Wudang Xing-

dong, which was also "outside the Great East Gate"; Cuiling
Gong, which stood next to Shrine of Master Dong in the New
City; and Doulao Gong, next to Red Bridge at the beginning
of Baozhang Lake. See YZFZ 251r9b.
50. As pointed out by Mingfu 1978: 129-30.
5I. Prominent lineages were associated with the temples

Tianzhu Guan and Dongxiao Gong, respectively. After an ap-
parent hiatus of some ten or eleven years, the abbotship of
Tianzhu Guan passed to Wang Qingxu (Wang Dongyang) in
the spring of 1696. The abbot of Dongxiao Gong at this time
(?) was Bei Changji. See Min Puzhi 1992-4.
52· See Edwards 1967: I07-8 (leaves C and F). Although

Shitao could conceivably have seen Bada Shanren's work in
Beijing, it is more likely that he was familiar with it from the
collections of men who belonged to Huizhou families with in-
terests and/or family connections in both Nanchang and Yang-
zhou, and who might themselves be based in Yangzhou, Hui-
zhou, or - as was the case for Huang Lii - in Nanchang. While
it is not yet possible to say where Shitao would have seen Bada
Shamen's work at this early date, we know of the two paint-
ers' connections with collectors of Huizhou origin such as
Wang Banting, whose departure from Nanchang Bada Shan-
ren mentions in a letter that Wang Fangyu has dated to around
I695 (Mastel:, 282). Some years later, in 1699, the same Wang
Banting solicited a colophon from Shit'ao for a painting in his
collection by the Huizhou artist Zheng Min (Zhongguo gudai
shuhua tumuJ vol. 5 [1990], Hu: 1-33072, Shanghai Muse-
um). Another probable Huizhou family collector of Bada
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Shanren's work is the Tuiweng for whom he painted the cele-
brated Anwan Album in 1694, Various possible identifications
of this person have been explored and rejected by Barnhart
and Wang (Master, 240 n. 127; Wang Fangyu 1978). Howev-
er, there exists a plausible candidate within the world of Yang-
zhou collectors in the person of Cheng Daoguang (zi Tuifu),
who would later become a close friend and customer of Shi-
tao (see the discussion in the section "The Dadi Tang Enter-
prise: Artist and Patron" in Chapter 6).
53· Reproduced in Wang Zidou 1983, I: 220-1. Where-

abouts unknown.
54· Translation by Wang Fangyu (Master, 62).
55. Master, 62.
56. Ibid.
57· Ibid., 168-9·
58. Master; Fong "959. Both Barnhart and Fong omit linli

in their translation, as did Iin an earlier discussion of this doc-
ument (SLW 107), where I followed the same interpretation.
59· On this basis, Fu Shen (1984: 28-9) suggested that the

term xianqu was simply a metaphoric reference to becoming
an immortal, i.e., a Daoisr.
60. Master, 32.
6I. Although its first dated appearance is on a painting

from early 1699 (Plum Blossoms, hanging scroll, Shanghai
Museum: see ST 45), this is likely predated by its appearance
on the manifesto-like Qingxiang Dadizi's Reminiscence of the
Thirty-six Peaks (see Plate 3).
62. Master, 284-5.
63· Translation by Wang Fangyu, slightly modified (Master,

63)· In another misunderstanding, in the poem preceding this
Bacia Shanren refers to Shitao as being seventy years of age.
Bada also refers to Shitao as "Abbot Shitao" in a letter from
c. 1699 (Master, 283).
64· Pei Jingfu 1937: 16!I2a. A number of superb surviving

works by Shitao passed through this collecror's hands, so the
record cannot be discounted. A monochrome landscape, this
one bears a respectful dedication from "Qingxiang Xiazunzhe
di" to "Bada zhangxiong xiansheng."
65· Master, 284-5.
66. It is very likely that Cheng did so, to judge by a record-

ed letter to Bada from the Yangzhou-based writer and publish-
er Zhang Chao, who mentions Cheng juri's name by way of
introduction to his own request for two fans and an album.
According to Zhang, Cheng had already "exchanged silk and
satin with Bada," that is, had previously commissioned work
from him. Master, 285; Wang Shiqing 1984: 203.
67. Ibid., 64.
68. A convenient summary of the extensive bibliography

on this letter through 1971 can be found in the catalog entry
on the letter in Fu and Fu 1973: 210-24. For the other docu-
ment usually taken as evidence of their direct relationship, the
supposed Shitao inscription to a supposed lost Bada Shanren
painting for Shitao, see n. 69.
69. In the present century this letter has given rise to some

mischief in the hands of its former owner, Zhang Daqian, well
known as a master forger of works by Shitao, Bada Shanren,
and others. A forgery of the letteI itself was the least of his
"contributions," for it, along with his invention of a picture
corresponding to the large work by Bada Shanren, Dad; cao-
tang tu, mentioned in Shitao's letter, was easily exposed (Fong
"959). The real damage has been that caused by Zhang's role
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(whether knowingly or not) in a hoax of a more elaborate and
imaginative kind. Zhang claimed to have owned the original
Dadi caotang tu before fleeing Shanghai. By his account, the
painting then possessed a colophon by Shitao that was set into
the scroll mounting; when he left Shanghai, he had this colo-
phon removed and took it with him, leaving the painting it-
self behind. "Subsequent efforts to recover it from his family
failed," goes the story. The colophon itself cannot be seen to-
day, any more than the painting; but a photograph of the colo-
phon does exist. Despite Zhang's known history as a forger
and hoaxer, his curious story was accepted, and the colophon,
dated to the summer of 1698, became not only one of the pri-
mary documents for the reconstruction of Shitao's relationship
with Bada Shanren, but also - due to its fascinating content _
a key exhibit in the interpretation of Shitao's relationship to
Ming loyalism. (The text of the colophon reads, in part: "You
and I fell ill on the same day, IBarely born into the world, we
found Heaven and Earth quaking./You, Bade, were homeless,
yet you stayed near horne; II, Qingxiang, traveled the Four
Seas, merely causing my temples to whiten./You heard that I
was living on the Han River [i.e., in Yangzhou],/And that near
a stream I had built the Great Cleansing Hall./You sent this
huge painting: Daring to Cleanse [Zhen kan di]; lIn the blaz-
ing, steaming heat of July, it sends forth an autumnal frost. I
I know that you mean: "How can you bear to cleanse?" ["He
kan di"];/Your words ring in my ears as I traverse the dust
and sand [life outside the priesthood] - IAs soon as I read
them, [1 see] ten thousand years slip through my fingers,/I can
now only wash everything away into a great void and listen
for the thunder"). Moreover, because the colophon includes
information that seemingly throws light on Shitao's inscription
to Bada Shanren's Narcissus handscroll (which at one point
Zhang owned), acceptance of the colophon as genuine per-
verted the interpretation of the handscroll, reinforcing if not
imposing the ideas that in the early 1690S Shitao believed Bacia
to have died, did not know that Bada and Xuege were one and
the same, and was finally enlightened by Cheng Jing'e (see, for
example, my own earlier discussion in SLW 106-10). The col-
ophon, furthermore, offered the seductive scenario of the im-
peccably loyalist Bada Shanren reproaching Shirao for his for-
mer collaborationist conduct, to Shirao's great shame, and it
laid the basis for an interpretation of the Great Cleansing in
primarily political terms (i.e., cleansing of that collaboration),
downplaying the religious dimension (see, e.g., Fong 1976).
However, the colophon does not stand up to documentary

examination: Two of its six seals, as well as both of the names
in the signature, came into use only at a significantly later date.
All dependable dated appearances of the oval relief "Lao Tao"
seal and the square intaglio" Meng dong sheng" seal are from
1701 onward. Similarly, Shitao seems to have begun to use the
name "Qingxiang yiren" in signatures only in 1704 or not
long before. Finally, all dated examples of the imperial ming,
Ruoji, in signatures are from 1701 onward, the earliest exam-
ple being a landscape seemingly painted for Bordu in the win-
ter of 1701, reproduced in Shina nanga taisei 1935--'7: vol 3.
Since this survey is based on dated examples alone, it is not
absolutely precise; nevertheless, there hardly seems to be a suf-
ficient margin of error to account for so many anomalies. In
addition, to my eyes the final seal impression reading "Sibai
feng zhong, Ruoli weng tushu," is sufficiently different from
the impression found on the 1703 albums for Mr. Liu (see Fig-
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15. The works from the summer of 1695 include Land-
scapes for Chaomin (fifth month), reproduced in Dafeng tang
mingji, vol. 2, pis. 29-33; Lake Chao, hanging scroll for
Zhang Chunxiu (see Figure 92); Landscapes of the Highest
Class, for Huang You (see Figures 64,65, So); Flowers and
Figures, for Huang You (see Figures 192, 204, 206); Land-
scapes, see Zhongguo hua 1986(2): 37-9; 1986(3): 50-I. For
the dating of the last three albums, see SLW 89 n. "43.
16. Li Tianfu had been Grand Secretary of the Hall of Mil-

itary Glory (rank raj. This trip is discussed at greater length
in Chapter 6 (section "The Monk-Painter as Professional").
17. Again, see the section "The Monk-Painter as Profes-

sional" in Chapter 6.
18. For example, Li Guosong (1672 fugongsheng, 16841u-

ren), Wang Xiru (r684 gongsheng), Sang Zhi (gongsheng, date
not ascertained).
19. The album is recorded in Lu Xinyuan 1891: 36/rrb.

Qilao has been tentatively identified as Wang Hongwen from
Jianzhou in Liaoning (Wang Shiqing 198rb: n. 2). However,
the name of a Chan monk of the same generation as Shitao,
Buqi, has also been suggested (Mingfu 1978: 170). The latter
suggestion may find some confirmation in the fact that one of
the recorded leaves was painted in a what appears to be a hall
of a Buddhist temple, Suoluo Tang.
20. Present whereabouts unknown. Reproduced in Ed-

wards 1967: 110.
2I. On this iconography in the painting of Kuncan, and a

consideration of this and related images by Shirao, see Vine-
grad 1992a: 55-63.
22. Wang Shiqing 1981a.
23. From a set of five poems inscribed on an unpublished

album from 1701 dedicated to the official Wang Ziquan, in the
Palace Museum, Beijing.
24. The two temples were Dongxiao Gong and Tianzhu

Guan.
25. On the Dragon Gate branch of Quanzhen Daoism in

the seventeenth and eighteenth centuries, see Ren Jiyu, ed.
1990: 651-61.
26. Looking at the Mountains at Yuhang, 1693, Shanghai

Museum (see Figure 174). SeeWai-kam Ho, ed. 1992: vol. I,
cat. no. 159. The recipient was the Chinese bannerman Zhang
Jingjie.
27. Lee and Ho 1968: 95.
28. Huang jixian, zi Zhongbin, from Tandu in Shexian.

For his official career, see above, Chapter 2, n. 59.
29· Vinograd 1978.
30. J. S. Hay 1994b, "999·
3I. For this interpretation of the Great Cleansing, see Fong

"976.
32. In the Sumitomo Collection.
33. For example, the Landscapes for Yu Daoren (see Fig-

ures 168, 169). See the section "The Artist as Chan Master"
in Cha prer 9.
34. When Shitao had filst met him, that spring, he added

a colophon to a painting by Hongren that Cheng owned. See
JJZLJ; Wang Shiqing '978.
35· This is pointed out by Sarah E. Fraser (1989), who also

makes the point that for certain images he probably consulted
preexisting sketches.
36. In his farewell poem, he places himself within a nation-

al landscape. The poem for Wang Zhi celebrates his recent

tour of duty as governor-general of Fuiian and Zhejiang in
1688-9· Wu T'ung 1967: 58.
37. For a useful discussion of Shitao's use of the peng meta-

phor, see Fiedler 1998.
38. It is a measure of the porosity of the boundary between

the national and transregional frames of reference that since
Shitao's departure from Beijing, Zhang Lin had entered official
life and was now, like the artist, in Anhui, serving as a provin-
cial judge. On Zhang Lin's official career, see Durand 1992:
155-9·
39. Vinograd 1992a: 62.
40. See, for example, Hong Zhengzhi's 1720 colophon to

Shitao's Streams and Mountains without End in the C. C.
Wang Family Collection.
4I. This Chan title can be traced back only as far as 173 I,

when Wang Yichen, editor of Dadizi tihua shiba (DDZTHSB),
made a manuscript copy of an earlier manuscript. See Zheng
Zhuolu 1961: 78.
42. For example, writer-scholar Huang Yun (introduced

below in the section "jingjiang Descendant"): See his colo-
phon to Shitao's Orchids for Hong Zhengzhi, recorded in
DDZTHSB 2/40-8.
43. Postscript to a poem written for Shitao, in Tao Wei

(n.d.),
44· See SLW 197 n. "9.
45. Li Lin 1708: 9160b.
46. Liang Peilan 1708: ji 7.
47· Colophon to Shirao's Orchids for Hong Zhengzhi,

recorded in DDZTHSB 2/40-8.
48. Poems in the Beijing Library manuscript copy of Bor-

du's poetry collection Wenting shiii, cited by Han Linde 1989:
79-80.
49. Other nearby Daoist temples included Wudang Xing-

dong, which was also "outside the Great East Gate"; Cuiling
Gong, which stood next to Shrine of Master Dong in the New
City; and Doulao Gong, next to Red Bridge at the beginning
of Baozhang Lake. See YZFZ 251r9b.
50. As pointed out by Mingfu 1978: 129-30.
5I. Prominent lineages were associated with the temples

Tianzhu Guan and Dongxiao Gong, respectively. After an ap-
parent hiatus of some ten or eleven years, the abbotship of
Tianzhu Guan passed to Wang Qingxu (Wang Dongyang) in
the spring of 1696. The abbot of Dongxiao Gong at this time
(?) was Bei Changji. See Min Puzhi 1992-4.
52· See Edwards 1967: I07-8 (leaves C and F). Although

Shitao could conceivably have seen Bada Shanren's work in
Beijing, it is more likely that he was familiar with it from the
collections of men who belonged to Huizhou families with in-
terests and/or family connections in both Nanchang and Yang-
zhou, and who might themselves be based in Yangzhou, Hui-
zhou, or - as was the case for Huang Lii - in Nanchang. While
it is not yet possible to say where Shitao would have seen Bada
Shamen's work at this early date, we know of the two paint-
ers' connections with collectors of Huizhou origin such as
Wang Banting, whose departure from Nanchang Bada Shan-
ren mentions in a letter that Wang Fangyu has dated to around
I695 (Mastel:, 282). Some years later, in 1699, the same Wang
Banting solicited a colophon from Shit'ao for a painting in his
collection by the Huizhou artist Zheng Min (Zhongguo gudai
shuhua tumuJ vol. 5 [1990], Hu: 1-33072, Shanghai Muse-
um). Another probable Huizhou family collector of Bada
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Shanren's work is the Tuiweng for whom he painted the cele-
brated Anwan Album in 1694, Various possible identifications
of this person have been explored and rejected by Barnhart
and Wang (Master, 240 n. 127; Wang Fangyu 1978). Howev-
er, there exists a plausible candidate within the world of Yang-
zhou collectors in the person of Cheng Daoguang (zi Tuifu),
who would later become a close friend and customer of Shi-
tao (see the discussion in the section "The Dadi Tang Enter-
prise: Artist and Patron" in Chapter 6).
53· Reproduced in Wang Zidou 1983, I: 220-1. Where-

abouts unknown.
54· Translation by Wang Fangyu (Master, 62).
55. Master, 62.
56. Ibid.
57· Ibid., 168-9·
58. Master; Fong "959. Both Barnhart and Fong omit linli

in their translation, as did Iin an earlier discussion of this doc-
ument (SLW 107), where I followed the same interpretation.
59· On this basis, Fu Shen (1984: 28-9) suggested that the

term xianqu was simply a metaphoric reference to becoming
an immortal, i.e., a Daoisr.
60. Master, 32.
6I. Although its first dated appearance is on a painting

from early 1699 (Plum Blossoms, hanging scroll, Shanghai
Museum: see ST 45), this is likely predated by its appearance
on the manifesto-like Qingxiang Dadizi's Reminiscence of the
Thirty-six Peaks (see Plate 3).
62. Master, 284-5.
63· Translation by Wang Fangyu, slightly modified (Master,

63)· In another misunderstanding, in the poem preceding this
Bacia Shanren refers to Shitao as being seventy years of age.
Bada also refers to Shitao as "Abbot Shitao" in a letter from
c. 1699 (Master, 283).
64· Pei Jingfu 1937: 16!I2a. A number of superb surviving

works by Shitao passed through this collecror's hands, so the
record cannot be discounted. A monochrome landscape, this
one bears a respectful dedication from "Qingxiang Xiazunzhe
di" to "Bada zhangxiong xiansheng."
65· Master, 284-5.
66. It is very likely that Cheng did so, to judge by a record-

ed letter to Bada from the Yangzhou-based writer and publish-
er Zhang Chao, who mentions Cheng juri's name by way of
introduction to his own request for two fans and an album.
According to Zhang, Cheng had already "exchanged silk and
satin with Bada," that is, had previously commissioned work
from him. Master, 285; Wang Shiqing 1984: 203.
67. Ibid., 64.
68. A convenient summary of the extensive bibliography

on this letter through 1971 can be found in the catalog entry
on the letter in Fu and Fu 1973: 210-24. For the other docu-
ment usually taken as evidence of their direct relationship, the
supposed Shitao inscription to a supposed lost Bada Shanren
painting for Shitao, see n. 69.
69. In the present century this letter has given rise to some

mischief in the hands of its former owner, Zhang Daqian, well
known as a master forger of works by Shitao, Bada Shanren,
and others. A forgery of the letteI itself was the least of his
"contributions," for it, along with his invention of a picture
corresponding to the large work by Bada Shanren, Dad; cao-
tang tu, mentioned in Shitao's letter, was easily exposed (Fong
"959). The real damage has been that caused by Zhang's role
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(whether knowingly or not) in a hoax of a more elaborate and
imaginative kind. Zhang claimed to have owned the original
Dadi caotang tu before fleeing Shanghai. By his account, the
painting then possessed a colophon by Shitao that was set into
the scroll mounting; when he left Shanghai, he had this colo-
phon removed and took it with him, leaving the painting it-
self behind. "Subsequent efforts to recover it from his family
failed," goes the story. The colophon itself cannot be seen to-
day, any more than the painting; but a photograph of the colo-
phon does exist. Despite Zhang's known history as a forger
and hoaxer, his curious story was accepted, and the colophon,
dated to the summer of 1698, became not only one of the pri-
mary documents for the reconstruction of Shitao's relationship
with Bada Shanren, but also - due to its fascinating content _
a key exhibit in the interpretation of Shitao's relationship to
Ming loyalism. (The text of the colophon reads, in part: "You
and I fell ill on the same day, IBarely born into the world, we
found Heaven and Earth quaking./You, Bade, were homeless,
yet you stayed near horne; II, Qingxiang, traveled the Four
Seas, merely causing my temples to whiten./You heard that I
was living on the Han River [i.e., in Yangzhou],/And that near
a stream I had built the Great Cleansing Hall./You sent this
huge painting: Daring to Cleanse [Zhen kan di]; lIn the blaz-
ing, steaming heat of July, it sends forth an autumnal frost. I
I know that you mean: "How can you bear to cleanse?" ["He
kan di"];/Your words ring in my ears as I traverse the dust
and sand [life outside the priesthood] - IAs soon as I read
them, [1 see] ten thousand years slip through my fingers,/I can
now only wash everything away into a great void and listen
for the thunder"). Moreover, because the colophon includes
information that seemingly throws light on Shitao's inscription
to Bada Shanren's Narcissus handscroll (which at one point
Zhang owned), acceptance of the colophon as genuine per-
verted the interpretation of the handscroll, reinforcing if not
imposing the ideas that in the early 1690S Shitao believed Bacia
to have died, did not know that Bada and Xuege were one and
the same, and was finally enlightened by Cheng Jing'e (see, for
example, my own earlier discussion in SLW 106-10). The col-
ophon, furthermore, offered the seductive scenario of the im-
peccably loyalist Bada Shanren reproaching Shirao for his for-
mer collaborationist conduct, to Shirao's great shame, and it
laid the basis for an interpretation of the Great Cleansing in
primarily political terms (i.e., cleansing of that collaboration),
downplaying the religious dimension (see, e.g., Fong 1976).
However, the colophon does not stand up to documentary

examination: Two of its six seals, as well as both of the names
in the signature, came into use only at a significantly later date.
All dependable dated appearances of the oval relief "Lao Tao"
seal and the square intaglio" Meng dong sheng" seal are from
1701 onward. Similarly, Shitao seems to have begun to use the
name "Qingxiang yiren" in signatures only in 1704 or not
long before. Finally, all dated examples of the imperial ming,
Ruoji, in signatures are from 1701 onward, the earliest exam-
ple being a landscape seemingly painted for Bordu in the win-
ter of 1701, reproduced in Shina nanga taisei 1935--'7: vol 3.
Since this survey is based on dated examples alone, it is not
absolutely precise; nevertheless, there hardly seems to be a suf-
ficient margin of error to account for so many anomalies. In
addition, to my eyes the final seal impression reading "Sibai
feng zhong, Ruoli weng tushu," is sufficiently different from
the impression found on the 1703 albums for Mr. Liu (see Fig-
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ure 134), as seen from its squarer form and different spacing
of the three rows of characters, to suggest that the seal is spu-
rious. Finally, alrhough rhe calligraphy has generally been ac-
cepted as Shitao's, the calligrapher responsible for the col-
ophon had at least one mannerism entirely alien to Shitao:
giving a blunt, straight form, thick toward its end, to those
oblique strokes brushed from top righr ro bortom left. The
colophon is a forgery (though not necessarily by Zhang Da-
qian himself) - Doe of many to have bedeviled modern schol-
arship.
On Zhang Daqian's activities as a forger of Shitao's work,

see Fu and Fu 1973: 314-21; Fu Sherr 1991. One elaborate
Shitao hoax by Zhang is the Portrait of Ren'an (Metropoliran
Museum of Art), which has a perfectly genuine set of colo-
phons, including one by Shitao that confirms that he had sup-
plied the landscape setting for the original portrait. To explain
the unconvincing painting that now accompanies the colo-
phons, Zhang claimed that he had been dissatisfied with the
portrait figure, and had cut it out, replacing it with a figure
of his own creation -leaving Shitao's landscape setting intact.
The present portrait figure was indeed done on a separate
piece of paper; and Zhang even supplied a separate cut-out
Qing portrait figure as proof. Nonetheless, the landscape set-
ting with its Shitao inscription (which identifies the portraitist
as a Mr. Zhang) is in this writer's opinion a spurious work
from Zhang's own hand.
70. A landscape by Bada for a Yangzhou merchant patron,

Jiang Shidong, is recorded in DDZTHSB 4/8 I as having been
completed by Shitao in I699.
7I. Shitao's three leaves are now mounted together with

seven leaves by Bada Shanren, which may not be those that
were in the album that Li Guosong saw (seeMasterj 189-90).
The owner of the original album was Huang jixian, for whom
Shirao painted the album Reminiscences of Qin-Huai in
r696 (see Figures 67-7I); in his colophon dated to the first
month of 1702, he states that he is taking this new album
with him on a journey to Jianyang (in Fujian). Huang was
taking up the post of county magistrate there (LHYFZ I748;
Ruan Yuan 1920: ro/r rb). On other aspects of Huang's of-
ficial career, see above, Chapter 2, n. 59.
72. The Shenxi imperial descendant was Xian Zhu, dis-

cussed later in this chapter (see the section "Jingjiang Descen-
dant"). The Yunnan imperial descendant was Puhe (1592-
1683), one of whose works was acquired by Shitao's patron
and friend, Mr. Liu; Liu invited Shitao to add a colophon to
the painting in I702 (Dandang shuhua ji I963: 23).
73. The colophon was written by Zhu Kanpu "in the Geng-

xin Caotang," thus in 1703 or later (see Appendix I). This
man was presumably of the same generation and lineage as
Zhu Kanzhu, whose genealogy is discussed by Wang Fangyu
in Masterj 29. In addition, Bada Shanren's grandson visited
Yangzhou in 1705 after the death of Bada, where he met Shi-
tao's biographer, Li Lin, and in all likelihood would have met
Shitao as well.
74. One ofYueduan's several sobriquets was Honglan Zhu-

ren (Master of the Red Orchid [Studio]).
75. Thus on the eve of the imperial visit to Yangzhou in

1699, he painted an album of miscellaneous subjects that, as
Isuggested in Chapter 3 (section "The Floods of I70S"), in-
cludes two leaves that effectively praise Qing government -

one of horses and the other of a rain-soaked countryside (see
Figures 42, 43). In 1705, Desolate Autumn in Huai-Yangcan
be taken as an indirect response to the imperial visit to the area
a few months earlier and is, as I have tried to show, basically
friendly to Kangxi. Richard Barnhart notes of Bada: "By the
time of Kangxi's third Southern Tour, in 1699, Bada's reaction
was quite different [from his earlier rage]. Then, he began to
paint heroic eagles and hawks, deer, egrets, cranes, and wild
geese as if they were symbols of his own private lost imperial
realm, an almost vanished Ming counterpart to the colorful
and dramatic imperial pageantry and symbolism of Kangxi
and the Manchus" (Master, I8).
76. Other Ming prince-painters of the time made similar

indexical disclosures of their princely identity through seals.
One example is Lanjiang, whose seals included "Taizu Gao
huangdi xuanzun." Lu Xinyuan 1891: 6h4b.
77. The earliest datable appearance of "Zan zhi shi shicun

Azhang" is on two of the leaves of a Poetry Manuscript dat-
able to I697, reproduced in Ming and Qing Painting from the
Guangzhou Art Gallery (I986), cat. no. 34.9-I4. "Azhang,"
on the other hand, appears (in signatures) as early as his in-
scriptions to Four Incarnations of Sun Zongyi (1612-83) by
an unidentified artist, which, if genuine, were written at some
point between 1678 and Sun Zongyi's death in 1683 (Christie's
New York, Fine Chinese Paintings and Calligraphy, 25 No-
vember 1991, lot 182).
78. Li Lin 1708: juan IS.
79. This is a continuation of the text on Zhao Mengfu cit-

ed above, in the section "From Xuancheng to Beijing: 1678-
I692" in Chapter 4.
80. Sima Qian I993: 337-40.
8r. The poem is entitled "On the Art of Painting: A Ded-

ication to General Cao Ba." The seal reading "Yu jin wei shu
wei qingrnen" has its first datable appearance on a hanging
scroll of plum blossom in the Shanghai Museum dated to the
second month of yimao, I699. See STH] no. 48.
82. The appendix is translated in SLW 204 n. 52.
83. According to a recorded colophon written by Yuan

Dun in 1758 to a now lost painting by Shitao, "Mr. Hong Gai-
hua studied painting with the master. He obtained a very de-
tailed sequence [of events?] recorded by the master himself."
QXLRT] I7a. See also Hong Zhengzhi's I720 colophon to
the unpublished Streams and Mountains without End in the
C. C. Wang Family Collection.
84. For the inscriptions and colophons to twelve of the

leaves, see DDZTHSB 2/40--8. Huang Yun's colophon at the
end of that selection includes the sentence, "Today [Shitao]
has painted a hundred thousand sheets for Yenzou Daoxiong
[Hong Zhengzhi]."
85. Apart from his colophon to the Shitao--Bada collabora-

tive album for Huang Jixian, Li Guosong also contributed col-
ophons to three of Shitao's paintings for Huang You: Land-
scapes of the Highest Class, I695 (see Figures 64, 65, 80);
Crossing the Ridge, I699 (see Figure 33); and the double Il-
lustrations to the Poems of Huang YanlU, 1701-2 (see Plate 10;
Figures I8, 34-40, 45).
86. Jiang wrote colophons for at least eight works by Shi-

tao, including Shitao and Jiang Heng's collaborative portrait
of Wu Yuqiao (Wang Shiqing I987: I7), one of Jiang's own
patrons (see below, Chapter 6, n. 73); a landscape handscrolJ
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from before r zoo - Jiang's poem is cited by Hong Zhengzhi
in his own 1720 colophon to Streams and Mountains without
End in the C. C. Wang Family Collection; Crossing the Ridge,
painted for Huang You c. 1699, for which Jiang wrote his col-
ophon in 1707 (see Figure 33); a 1700 album for Wu Cheng-
xia, reproduced in Shina nanga taisei 1935-7: vol. 6; a 1702
handscroll for Luo Qingshan (formerly Christie's New York);
Hong Zhengzhi's orchid album, for which Jiang wrote his col-
ophon in the summer of I704, DDZTHSB I/40--I; the hand-
scroll Pavilion of Twin Purities, probably for the monk Geng-
yin, Palace Museum, Beijing, with Jiang's colophon written in
the autumn of I707 (Xu Bangda, ed. I984b: 772-3); and the
q06 Portrait of Hong Zhengzhi (see Figure 27), to which he
contributed c. 1708-9 (see Fu and Fu 1973: 290-1, for a dis-
cussion of Jiang in the context of his colophon to this portrait).
Zhuo Erkan's (196o) collection of yimin poetry includes work
by Jiang Shijie's father (Cai), uncle (Gai), and brother (Anjie).
87. Cheng Songling I98 5. According to Richard Strassberg

(1983), who has examined Kong Shangren's involvement with
Yangzhou loyalists while working at the end of the 1680s as
a water-control official on the staff of Sun Zaifeng in northern
Jiangsu: "Huang was another of those who fit the personality
type of the 'heroic loyalist,' which K'ung found so appealing.
He was politically reclusive, having rejected government ser-
vice under the Ch'ing. Somewhat impoverished, notoriously
eccentric, yet extremely erudite and dynamic, he expressed a
proud, defiant attitude toward life's vicissitudes." Huang Yun,
in one of his several inscriptions to Hong Zhengzhi's album,
complains that although he has known Shitao for thirty years
and loves his painting, he has only been able to obtain the odd
work.
88. Wang Shiqing I98 r b. For a translation of Hong Jiazhi's

colophon, see SLW 366. Shirao painted at least one work for
Hong Jiazhi (who mentions it in his inscription to his nephew
Hong Zhengzhi's orchid album). Hong Jiazhi also contributed
colophons to Shitao's portrait of his nephew (Sackler Collec-
tion) and to the handscroll Twin Purities Pavilion (Shuangqing
gel, Palace Museum, Beijing (Xu Bangda, ed. I984b: 772-3).
On Hong jiazhi's travels, see Hong Jiazhi n.d.
89. Zhixi laoren shi and Quanying tang ci. As noted in

Master, 63.
90. YZFZ; Shen Deqian, comp. I979. Xian Zhu also con-

tributed colophons to three of Shirao's works for Huang You:
Landscapes of the Highest Class (see Figures 64, 65, 80);
Crossing the Ridge (see Figure 33); Illustrations to the Poems
of Huang Yanlu (see Plate IO; Figures r8, 34-40, 45)·
9I. Bada's colophon was cited earlier (section "Shitao and

Bada Shamen") as an example of his insistence on referring to
Shitao as a Buddhist monk. Xian Zhu's colophon reads: "Xue-
ge, west of the Yangzi, lives at Shangyou;/Kugua has stayed
for years now in Yangzhou./Both men have followed the cra-
ziest of paths/But their brush-and-ink is of the very best."
92. The loyalist figures still to be introduced include Wang

Xiru, Wang Zhongru, Wu Sugong, and Huang Sheng. See also
SLW 428 n. 46.
93. "Ruoji" appears as part of a signature on a painting re-

produced in Shina nanga taisei 1935-7: vol 3, a landscape
seemingly painted for Bordu in the winter of 1701. The "Ji"
signature appears on the painting Clouds and Mountains from
the third month of I702 (see Figure I84)·

94. The earliest appearance of the "jingjiang Houren" seal
known to me is on Li Songan's Studio, dated to the second
month of 1702 (Fu and Fu 1973: 220). Shitao also incorpo-
rates this name into a signature on leaf 3 of the four leaves
from the 1703 albums for Mr. Liu in the Beishan Tang Col-
lection.
95. Li Lin 1708: 19193a. See also another poem, ibid.,

9164a.
96. Qu Yuan is traditionally ascribed the aurhorship of The

Songs of Chu, and Zuoqiu Ming that of the Zuo zhuan.
97. Shiwei, by Shitao's Nanjing friend Tian Lin, includes

two poems for the year 1702 that concern Shitao. One was
written to thank Shirao for the gift of a painting of bamboo;
the second is a parting painting, "Sending Off Dadizi to Go
Back to Guangling [Yangzhou]" (Tian Lin r727: 9/43a). A
surviving painting, Clouds and Mountains (see Figure 184),
was painted at Wulong Tan, which lies between Nanjing and
Yangzhou, in the third month of 1702. Another painting (un-
dated) in the Nanjing Museum, depicting Qingliang Terrace,
located just inside the city wall in the southwest corner of the
city, may also be relared to this visit (STSHQ] pis. 34'-342).
Shirao's poem inscribed on the painting is a reflection on the
rise and fall of dynasties: Although Qingliang Terrace was not
itself a Ming dynastic site, the parallel with recent history is
made explicit in the accompanying colophon by an unidenti-
fied remnant subject.
98. Hetao wrote two poems in 1692 for the fiftieth birth-

day of Tian Lin, and at one point mentions that Shitao has sent
him word that he is coming back to Nanjing (Tian Lin 1727:
shang/r5a). In 1693 he wrote an authenticating inscription for
an unsigned painting by Kuncan in the Shanghai Museum.
Zhongguo gudai shuhua tumu, vol. 4 [I990]: Hu I-2497.
One might also wonder, more prosaically, whether he did not
make the journey at the request of some important patron, but
Shitao tended to publicize his patronage when it was of such
importance, and there are no traces of anything like this for
the Nanjing trip.
99. In addition to their common use in signatures from late

1705 onward, the two names are also found in a number of
seals. "]i" is found as part of two seals: The first, reading "Da-
dizi.}i," has its earliest datable appearance on an orchid paint-
ing dedicated to Yueduan, who died in 1704 (see Figure 78).
The second reads "Daben Tang, ji'' and can be seen on the al-
bum Reminiscences of jinling, autumn of 1707 (see Figures
218,219). "Ruoji" also appears in two seals: The first, which
simply reads "Ruoji," has a first dated appearance (autunm of
1705) on Landscape Painted on the Double Ninth (see Figure
212). The second reads "Daben Tang, Ruoji" and can be seen
here on a leaf from the 1707 Reminiscences of jinling (see Fig-
ure 217)·
100. Spence 1966.
101. This new name never entirely displaced the name Dadi

Tang. See, for example, "Riding the Clouds," from Reminis~
cences of ]inling (see Figure u8).
I02. As first pointed out by Wu Tung (I967: 6I), citing

Ming huiyao.
I03. Reproduced in STSHQ] pI. 34I.
104. A poem follows: "The ears of millet sing their song,

lamenting the fallen dynasty. /The earthen steps will not bear
my weight; I lean on the tumble-down wall. II invite you to
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ure 134), as seen from its squarer form and different spacing
of the three rows of characters, to suggest that the seal is spu-
rious. Finally, alrhough rhe calligraphy has generally been ac-
cepted as Shitao's, the calligrapher responsible for the col-
ophon had at least one mannerism entirely alien to Shitao:
giving a blunt, straight form, thick toward its end, to those
oblique strokes brushed from top righr ro bortom left. The
colophon is a forgery (though not necessarily by Zhang Da-
qian himself) - Doe of many to have bedeviled modern schol-
arship.
On Zhang Daqian's activities as a forger of Shitao's work,

see Fu and Fu 1973: 314-21; Fu Sherr 1991. One elaborate
Shitao hoax by Zhang is the Portrait of Ren'an (Metropoliran
Museum of Art), which has a perfectly genuine set of colo-
phons, including one by Shitao that confirms that he had sup-
plied the landscape setting for the original portrait. To explain
the unconvincing painting that now accompanies the colo-
phons, Zhang claimed that he had been dissatisfied with the
portrait figure, and had cut it out, replacing it with a figure
of his own creation -leaving Shitao's landscape setting intact.
The present portrait figure was indeed done on a separate
piece of paper; and Zhang even supplied a separate cut-out
Qing portrait figure as proof. Nonetheless, the landscape set-
ting with its Shitao inscription (which identifies the portraitist
as a Mr. Zhang) is in this writer's opinion a spurious work
from Zhang's own hand.
70. A landscape by Bada for a Yangzhou merchant patron,

Jiang Shidong, is recorded in DDZTHSB 4/8 I as having been
completed by Shitao in I699.
7I. Shitao's three leaves are now mounted together with

seven leaves by Bada Shanren, which may not be those that
were in the album that Li Guosong saw (seeMasterj 189-90).
The owner of the original album was Huang jixian, for whom
Shirao painted the album Reminiscences of Qin-Huai in
r696 (see Figures 67-7I); in his colophon dated to the first
month of 1702, he states that he is taking this new album
with him on a journey to Jianyang (in Fujian). Huang was
taking up the post of county magistrate there (LHYFZ I748;
Ruan Yuan 1920: ro/r rb). On other aspects of Huang's of-
ficial career, see above, Chapter 2, n. 59.
72. The Shenxi imperial descendant was Xian Zhu, dis-

cussed later in this chapter (see the section "Jingjiang Descen-
dant"). The Yunnan imperial descendant was Puhe (1592-
1683), one of whose works was acquired by Shitao's patron
and friend, Mr. Liu; Liu invited Shitao to add a colophon to
the painting in I702 (Dandang shuhua ji I963: 23).
73. The colophon was written by Zhu Kanpu "in the Geng-

xin Caotang," thus in 1703 or later (see Appendix I). This
man was presumably of the same generation and lineage as
Zhu Kanzhu, whose genealogy is discussed by Wang Fangyu
in Masterj 29. In addition, Bada Shanren's grandson visited
Yangzhou in 1705 after the death of Bada, where he met Shi-
tao's biographer, Li Lin, and in all likelihood would have met
Shitao as well.
74. One ofYueduan's several sobriquets was Honglan Zhu-

ren (Master of the Red Orchid [Studio]).
75. Thus on the eve of the imperial visit to Yangzhou in

1699, he painted an album of miscellaneous subjects that, as
Isuggested in Chapter 3 (section "The Floods of I70S"), in-
cludes two leaves that effectively praise Qing government -

one of horses and the other of a rain-soaked countryside (see
Figures 42, 43). In 1705, Desolate Autumn in Huai-Yangcan
be taken as an indirect response to the imperial visit to the area
a few months earlier and is, as I have tried to show, basically
friendly to Kangxi. Richard Barnhart notes of Bada: "By the
time of Kangxi's third Southern Tour, in 1699, Bada's reaction
was quite different [from his earlier rage]. Then, he began to
paint heroic eagles and hawks, deer, egrets, cranes, and wild
geese as if they were symbols of his own private lost imperial
realm, an almost vanished Ming counterpart to the colorful
and dramatic imperial pageantry and symbolism of Kangxi
and the Manchus" (Master, I8).
76. Other Ming prince-painters of the time made similar

indexical disclosures of their princely identity through seals.
One example is Lanjiang, whose seals included "Taizu Gao
huangdi xuanzun." Lu Xinyuan 1891: 6h4b.
77. The earliest datable appearance of "Zan zhi shi shicun

Azhang" is on two of the leaves of a Poetry Manuscript dat-
able to I697, reproduced in Ming and Qing Painting from the
Guangzhou Art Gallery (I986), cat. no. 34.9-I4. "Azhang,"
on the other hand, appears (in signatures) as early as his in-
scriptions to Four Incarnations of Sun Zongyi (1612-83) by
an unidentified artist, which, if genuine, were written at some
point between 1678 and Sun Zongyi's death in 1683 (Christie's
New York, Fine Chinese Paintings and Calligraphy, 25 No-
vember 1991, lot 182).
78. Li Lin 1708: juan IS.
79. This is a continuation of the text on Zhao Mengfu cit-

ed above, in the section "From Xuancheng to Beijing: 1678-
I692" in Chapter 4.
80. Sima Qian I993: 337-40.
8r. The poem is entitled "On the Art of Painting: A Ded-

ication to General Cao Ba." The seal reading "Yu jin wei shu
wei qingrnen" has its first datable appearance on a hanging
scroll of plum blossom in the Shanghai Museum dated to the
second month of yimao, I699. See STH] no. 48.
82. The appendix is translated in SLW 204 n. 52.
83. According to a recorded colophon written by Yuan

Dun in 1758 to a now lost painting by Shitao, "Mr. Hong Gai-
hua studied painting with the master. He obtained a very de-
tailed sequence [of events?] recorded by the master himself."
QXLRT] I7a. See also Hong Zhengzhi's I720 colophon to
the unpublished Streams and Mountains without End in the
C. C. Wang Family Collection.
84. For the inscriptions and colophons to twelve of the

leaves, see DDZTHSB 2/40--8. Huang Yun's colophon at the
end of that selection includes the sentence, "Today [Shitao]
has painted a hundred thousand sheets for Yenzou Daoxiong
[Hong Zhengzhi]."
85. Apart from his colophon to the Shitao--Bada collabora-

tive album for Huang Jixian, Li Guosong also contributed col-
ophons to three of Shitao's paintings for Huang You: Land-
scapes of the Highest Class, I695 (see Figures 64, 65, 80);
Crossing the Ridge, I699 (see Figure 33); and the double Il-
lustrations to the Poems of Huang YanlU, 1701-2 (see Plate 10;
Figures I8, 34-40, 45).
86. Jiang wrote colophons for at least eight works by Shi-

tao, including Shitao and Jiang Heng's collaborative portrait
of Wu Yuqiao (Wang Shiqing I987: I7), one of Jiang's own
patrons (see below, Chapter 6, n. 73); a landscape handscrolJ
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from before r zoo - Jiang's poem is cited by Hong Zhengzhi
in his own 1720 colophon to Streams and Mountains without
End in the C. C. Wang Family Collection; Crossing the Ridge,
painted for Huang You c. 1699, for which Jiang wrote his col-
ophon in 1707 (see Figure 33); a 1700 album for Wu Cheng-
xia, reproduced in Shina nanga taisei 1935-7: vol. 6; a 1702
handscroll for Luo Qingshan (formerly Christie's New York);
Hong Zhengzhi's orchid album, for which Jiang wrote his col-
ophon in the summer of I704, DDZTHSB I/40--I; the hand-
scroll Pavilion of Twin Purities, probably for the monk Geng-
yin, Palace Museum, Beijing, with Jiang's colophon written in
the autumn of I707 (Xu Bangda, ed. I984b: 772-3); and the
q06 Portrait of Hong Zhengzhi (see Figure 27), to which he
contributed c. 1708-9 (see Fu and Fu 1973: 290-1, for a dis-
cussion of Jiang in the context of his colophon to this portrait).
Zhuo Erkan's (196o) collection of yimin poetry includes work
by Jiang Shijie's father (Cai), uncle (Gai), and brother (Anjie).
87. Cheng Songling I98 5. According to Richard Strassberg

(1983), who has examined Kong Shangren's involvement with
Yangzhou loyalists while working at the end of the 1680s as
a water-control official on the staff of Sun Zaifeng in northern
Jiangsu: "Huang was another of those who fit the personality
type of the 'heroic loyalist,' which K'ung found so appealing.
He was politically reclusive, having rejected government ser-
vice under the Ch'ing. Somewhat impoverished, notoriously
eccentric, yet extremely erudite and dynamic, he expressed a
proud, defiant attitude toward life's vicissitudes." Huang Yun,
in one of his several inscriptions to Hong Zhengzhi's album,
complains that although he has known Shitao for thirty years
and loves his painting, he has only been able to obtain the odd
work.
88. Wang Shiqing I98 r b. For a translation of Hong Jiazhi's

colophon, see SLW 366. Shirao painted at least one work for
Hong Jiazhi (who mentions it in his inscription to his nephew
Hong Zhengzhi's orchid album). Hong Jiazhi also contributed
colophons to Shitao's portrait of his nephew (Sackler Collec-
tion) and to the handscroll Twin Purities Pavilion (Shuangqing
gel, Palace Museum, Beijing (Xu Bangda, ed. I984b: 772-3).
On Hong jiazhi's travels, see Hong Jiazhi n.d.
89. Zhixi laoren shi and Quanying tang ci. As noted in

Master, 63.
90. YZFZ; Shen Deqian, comp. I979. Xian Zhu also con-

tributed colophons to three of Shirao's works for Huang You:
Landscapes of the Highest Class (see Figures 64, 65, 80);
Crossing the Ridge (see Figure 33); Illustrations to the Poems
of Huang Yanlu (see Plate IO; Figures r8, 34-40, 45)·
9I. Bada's colophon was cited earlier (section "Shitao and

Bada Shamen") as an example of his insistence on referring to
Shitao as a Buddhist monk. Xian Zhu's colophon reads: "Xue-
ge, west of the Yangzi, lives at Shangyou;/Kugua has stayed
for years now in Yangzhou./Both men have followed the cra-
ziest of paths/But their brush-and-ink is of the very best."
92. The loyalist figures still to be introduced include Wang

Xiru, Wang Zhongru, Wu Sugong, and Huang Sheng. See also
SLW 428 n. 46.
93. "Ruoji" appears as part of a signature on a painting re-

produced in Shina nanga taisei 1935-7: vol 3, a landscape
seemingly painted for Bordu in the winter of 1701. The "Ji"
signature appears on the painting Clouds and Mountains from
the third month of I702 (see Figure I84)·

94. The earliest appearance of the "jingjiang Houren" seal
known to me is on Li Songan's Studio, dated to the second
month of 1702 (Fu and Fu 1973: 220). Shitao also incorpo-
rates this name into a signature on leaf 3 of the four leaves
from the 1703 albums for Mr. Liu in the Beishan Tang Col-
lection.
95. Li Lin 1708: 19193a. See also another poem, ibid.,

9164a.
96. Qu Yuan is traditionally ascribed the aurhorship of The

Songs of Chu, and Zuoqiu Ming that of the Zuo zhuan.
97. Shiwei, by Shitao's Nanjing friend Tian Lin, includes

two poems for the year 1702 that concern Shitao. One was
written to thank Shirao for the gift of a painting of bamboo;
the second is a parting painting, "Sending Off Dadizi to Go
Back to Guangling [Yangzhou]" (Tian Lin r727: 9/43a). A
surviving painting, Clouds and Mountains (see Figure 184),
was painted at Wulong Tan, which lies between Nanjing and
Yangzhou, in the third month of 1702. Another painting (un-
dated) in the Nanjing Museum, depicting Qingliang Terrace,
located just inside the city wall in the southwest corner of the
city, may also be relared to this visit (STSHQ] pis. 34'-342).
Shirao's poem inscribed on the painting is a reflection on the
rise and fall of dynasties: Although Qingliang Terrace was not
itself a Ming dynastic site, the parallel with recent history is
made explicit in the accompanying colophon by an unidenti-
fied remnant subject.
98. Hetao wrote two poems in 1692 for the fiftieth birth-

day of Tian Lin, and at one point mentions that Shitao has sent
him word that he is coming back to Nanjing (Tian Lin 1727:
shang/r5a). In 1693 he wrote an authenticating inscription for
an unsigned painting by Kuncan in the Shanghai Museum.
Zhongguo gudai shuhua tumu, vol. 4 [I990]: Hu I-2497.
One might also wonder, more prosaically, whether he did not
make the journey at the request of some important patron, but
Shitao tended to publicize his patronage when it was of such
importance, and there are no traces of anything like this for
the Nanjing trip.
99. In addition to their common use in signatures from late

1705 onward, the two names are also found in a number of
seals. "]i" is found as part of two seals: The first, reading "Da-
dizi.}i," has its earliest datable appearance on an orchid paint-
ing dedicated to Yueduan, who died in 1704 (see Figure 78).
The second reads "Daben Tang, ji'' and can be seen on the al-
bum Reminiscences of jinling, autumn of 1707 (see Figures
218,219). "Ruoji" also appears in two seals: The first, which
simply reads "Ruoji," has a first dated appearance (autunm of
1705) on Landscape Painted on the Double Ninth (see Figure
212). The second reads "Daben Tang, Ruoji" and can be seen
here on a leaf from the 1707 Reminiscences of jinling (see Fig-
ure 217)·
100. Spence 1966.
101. This new name never entirely displaced the name Dadi

Tang. See, for example, "Riding the Clouds," from Reminis~
cences of ]inling (see Figure u8).
I02. As first pointed out by Wu Tung (I967: 6I), citing

Ming huiyao.
I03. Reproduced in STSHQ] pI. 34I.
104. A poem follows: "The ears of millet sing their song,

lamenting the fallen dynasty. /The earthen steps will not bear
my weight; I lean on the tumble-down wall. II invite you to
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look upon the site of the extravagance of six dynasties./What
resemblance does it bear to the time of the Hall of the Great
Foundation?"

lOS. The major document of that history of concealment
is the 1677 poem "Poem for Zhong Yuxing," discussed above,
Chapter 4, n. 53.

106. The earliest dated appearance of this as a seal is on
leaf 4 of the Landscapes Painted at Wanglu Tang of '702. See
Ishikawa Jun et al. 1976: fig. 14I.
107. For example, The Orphan of the Zhao Family (play).
108. From the inscription to a leaf in a 1684 album of land-

scapes in the Palace Museum, Beijing. Reproduced in Xu Bang-
da, ed. 1984b: 77I.

109. Guilin shi wenwu guanli weiyuanhui 1980: 4-7.
110. As seen from Li Guosong's colophon, cited earlier in

this chapter. The album was painted for Huang Jixian, the re-
cipient of the 1696 Reminiscences of Qin-Huai; ironically,
Huang took it with him on his journey to Jianyang in Fujian,
where he was taking up an appointment as magistrate.

III. The poem, taken on its own, suggests that he saw a
musician during his visit; but the painting, by placing the fig-
ure at the center of the scene, where it functions as the psycho-
logical subject of the represented experience, implies Shirao's
identi.fication with this musician and thus an autobiographical
reference. Naturally, Shitao need not have had any musical
skill himself.

112. Leaf 2, reproduced in Edwards 1967: cat. no. 17B.
II3· Reproduced in STSHQJ pI. '74. This signature was

probably added at a later date (as discussed in the section "The
Dadi Tang Enterprise: Production Strategies" in Chapter 6).

SIX. THE ARTIST-ENTREPRENEUR

I. The question has received general treatment in a recent
pioneering study by James Cahill (1994) on the Ming-Qing
period. I am indebted to Cahill's clear exposition of many ba-
sic conventions. The growing literature includes Hsu 1987;
Shan Guoqiang 1992; Burkus-Chasson 1994; and McDermott
1997· See also the reconstruction of Xu Wei's professional
practice in Ryor 1998.

2. Neither work survives. Shitao reused his inscription to
the 1657 painting on a leaf of the Landscapes, Flowers, and
Bamboo painted c. 1664 (see Figure 47). For the handscroll,
see jin Huan, Shibai zhai shuhua lu: xingjuan, cited in Wang
Shiqing 1978.
3· Translation from Fong '976, slightly modified. Cao was

from Zhili Province.
4· The passage continues: "When the paintings were fin-

ished, each one resembled a famous Song or Yuan master's
style. But the brushwork had no fixed method; sometimes it
was heavy and sometimes delicate, and he [only] required of
each leaf that it be executed freely and personally. The brush
followed his imagination, and without consciously striving
after the Ancients his methods concurred with theirs. "

5· On the surviving Huangshan album leaves, illustrated in
STSHQJ pIs. 217-230, see Edwards '992: '77-9; and Zhang
Zining 1993. The Sixteen Luohans handscroll commemorated
Cao Dingwang's work in restoring Luohan Temple in Shexian.
See Zhang Zining, ibid.

6. The obvious candidate is the prefect's son, Cao Fen, who
was a friend of Shitao. The reference to "snowy pines" (song-

xue) in the dedication both evokes Zhao Mengfu (hao Song-
xue Daoren) in relation to Cao Dingwang and identifies the
birthday function of the work through the pines' symbolism
of longevity. For another Xuancheng-period allusion to Zhao
in a painting for a Qing official, see Figure 54.

7. Shitao's paintings for this family over a thirty-year peri-
od include the following:
For Wu Erchun: Orchids and Bamboo, handscroll, recorded

in Pang Yuanji 1971a, juan 4.
For Wu Zhenbo (zi Jingyuan, hao jianshan, eldest son of

Wu Erchun): Wutong Tree and Rock, hanging scroll, 1674,
Jilin Provincial Museum, reproduced in Yiyuan duoying 6
(1979): I3; Bamboo, Rocks, and Plum Blossom, hanging
scroll, 1679, commissioned as a gift for Mr. Huaizu, repro-
duced in ST 41j Looking at Plum Blossom, hanging scroll on
silk, Shanghai Museum, reproduced in Yiyuan duoying 36
(1987): 6; Landscapes, album, 1684, recorded in jin Huan,
Shibai zhai shuhua lu (n.d.): xiahan, chouji; Thoughts of
Xi'nan, hanging scroll, 1693 (see Figure 93); Landscape and
Calligraphy, handscroll, c. 1701 or later, Beijing Cultural Rel-
ics Bureau, cited by Wang Shiqing 1979b, '987a: 'S.

For Wu Chengxia (zi Yusheng, hao Xiangu, eldest son of
Wu Zhenbo): Landscape, hanging scroll, 1686, recorded in
Hu Jitang c. 1839: shang/4Ib-42a; Landscapes for Yu Daoren
(see Figures 168, 169); Plum Blossom and Bamboo, fan, c.
1687-9, reproduced in Gugong bowuyuan cang Ming Qing
shanmian shuhua ji, vol. 4 (1991): pl. 64; Landscapes, album,
1700 or earlier, reproduced in Shina nanga taisei 1935-7: vol.
6; Walking toward a Mountain Retreat, hanging scroll, 1703
(see Plate II); Seclusion by the Crane Stream, handscroll, c.
1705 or later, reproduced in Christie's New York, Fine Chinese
Paintings, Calligraphy, and Rubbings, 18 September '996, no.
189.

For Wu Chengxun (zi Mingchi, first cousin of Wu Cheng-
xia): Pine and Chrysanthemum, handscroll or hanging scroll,
known from a poem by Mei Qing (Wang Shiqing '987: 16).

For Wu Yuqiao (zi Nangao, bao Yiyuan, born 1679, neph-
ew of Wu Chengxun): Portrait of Wu Yuqiao (collaboration
with Jiang Heng), c. 1698, handscroll (see Figure 28); The
Blue-Green Screen of the Southern Mountains, hanging scroll,
1699 (see Figure 2S); Eight Views of Xi' nan, album, 1700 (see
Figure 26); Vegetables and Praying Mantis, handscroll, 1700
(Li Yeshuang '973: 'S6-7); Landscapes and Calligraphies, un-
dated, Shanghai Museum (bears Wu Yuqiao's collector's seals).
For Wu Canxi, Landscape Album, 1680 (STSHQJ pis. 1-

15)·
For Wu Qi (zi Yuanci, hao Tingweng, 1619-94), Landscape

of Mount Heng, 1687 (see Figure 46).
For Wu Qipeng (zi Yunyi, hao Ganyu, nephew of Wu Qi):

Miniature Landscapes, 1699 (see Figure 104); Mr. Yunyi's Re-
turn to Xin'an, hanging scroll, 1704 (whereabouts unknown).

Shitao is also known to have been close friends with at least
two other members of the family, Wu Chengli (zi Maoshu,
brother of Wu Chengxun, father ofWu Yuqiao, 1662-91, see
Wang Shiqing 1987: 16) and Wu Ai (zi Jiren, see Li Lin 1708:
15/8 S; Wang Shiqing '987: II), who would presumably have
owned paintings by him.
8. For WangJie (zi Changyu, 1634-?): Gazing at the Water-

fall from a Stone Bridge, hanging scroll, 1672, reproduced in
Edwards 1967: 29. For Wang Ji (zi Zhouci): Landscapes, al-
bum, 1676, recorded in PeiJingfu '937: 16/8b.

9· See Wang Shiqing r982. On Min Shizhang (zi Xiang-
nan, hao Huaihai), see YZFZ 32!r7a-b; Wang Shiqing, ibid.
For his grandson, Min Changhong (zi Zaidong, hao Kuang-
zhai), Shitao during the Dadi Tang years painted a superb
hanging scroll of plum blossoms, reproduced in Omura 1945:
vol. 7.

10. According to DDZZ, Shitao disposed of this collection
before moving to Nanjing. Interestingly, Li's description of the
manner in which he did so (see above, Chapter 4, in the sec-
tion "From Xuancheng to Beijing: 1678-1692"), while silent
on the economic dimension, is suggestive of a procedure not
unlike a modern house or apartment sale.

II. Deng Qifen's generosity with money is noted by Shi-
tao's friend, Mei Geng, whose studies Deng supported in
1677-8 (Hu Yi 1984; Mei Geng 1990). Two works painted by
Shitao for Deng Qifen during this period survive: a landscape
hanging scroll (Shenzhou guoguang ji, vol. 16), and a horse
painting (see Figure 54). The inscription to a third is recorded
in DDZTHSB 1/7-8. For the record of a 1686 painting for
Deng, see QXLRT] r j a. Circa 1693-4 Deng saw Shitao again
when he passed through Yangzhou, at which time Shitao re-
inscribed the third of the above-mentioned early paintings
(DDZTHSB 1/7-8).

12. When he completed the screen, Shitao wrote a colo-
phon for it in handscroll format, which reads in part: "This
year Mr. Chang Hanqian celebrated his fiftieth birthday, and
sent silk to me at the Yizhi Ge in Nanjing commanding me
to execute a painting. In my barren solitude, I sought and ob-
tained an image of old pines and strange rocks; [the person]
standing cranelike at the cave door is the honorable immortal
himself just after dispersing the chess pieces" (STSHQJ pl. 32).
This is the same man whom Shitao would seek out at Qing-
jiangpu in 1688 during his first aborted journey to the North.

13. My translation draws heavily on a rendering of the en-
tire inscription by Shane McCausland in an unpublished paper
(McCausland '994).
I4. In other words (the percentages don't add up), he had

mostly received calligraphies from Shitao. This unpublished
handscroll, Streams and Mountains without End (e. e. Wang
Family Collection), is the same one that was later acquired by
Hong Zhengzhi (see the section "jingjiang Descendant" in
Chapter 5). Two other works painted by Shirao for Zhou Jing
survive: Teaching the [Book of] Changes, hanging scroll, 1680,
collection unknown; and Paintings and Calligraphies for Zhou
ling, album (see Figure 16S).
'5. Fang 1976: 22.
16. See above, n. 7.
'7. Zhao Lun (zi Shugong, hao Langxian), from Shandong

Province, served as Provincial Education Commissioner from
1682 to 1688; Zhao Zisi (zi Wenshui, hao Ren'an, Mengsu
shanren). Shitao painted for the father the large horizontal
hanging scroll Fishing in a Mountain Stream (see Figure 164),
apparently while enjoying the latter's hospitality; and he con-
tributed the landscape setting to a portrait of Zhao Zisi, of
which the colophons survive today, attached to what in this
author's opinion is a spurious portrait (Metropolitan Museum
of Art). He also added inscriptions to an album of paintings
by another monk, Shuangxiao (formerly Shanghai Museum)
dedicated to Zhao Zisi (ST 83-4). A landscape hanging scroll
in the Sichuan Provincial Museum (STSHQJ vol. I, pI. 36)
bearing an inscription that purports to have been written in

the official residence of Education Commissioner Zhao Lang
on the third day (of the New Year), 1684, is clearly a forgery.

18. Shitao inscribed a painting by the Huizhou painter Wu
Youhe (from the same family as Wu Zhenbo) in the summer
of 1688. See Zhongguo meishu quanji, huihua bian 1988: vol.
9, no. 'S3 (Shanghai Museum).
'9· Shanghai Museum (ST pI. 3). Virtually the same in-

scription is found on another landscape hanging scroll painted
in Nanjing for a different recipient in the sevenrh month of
1686 (STH] no. '7, Shanghai Museum). This kind of stan-
dardization is in itself indicative of large demand for his work,
obliging him to have ready-made solutions at his disposal.
20. On Yao Man, see Wu Qi 1982: 2129a-30a.
2I. Kong Shangren (1962: 38) records one meeting of the

society in the spring of 1687 at which twenty-four people were
present, including Shirao, Gong Xian, Zha Shibiao, Wu Qi, Ni
Yongqing, and Zhuo Erkan. For a literary portrait of Wu Qi,
see jin Zhixing 1990; and for two contemporary biographies,
]iao Xun 1992: 473-7. Wu Qi's poem on climbing Mount
Heng is in his Linhui tang quanji (1982: 13!I9a-b).
22. Translation by Richard Strassberg (I983: 172-3).
23. Shitao evokes Zhang Lin's wealth and generous hospi-

tality in a poem thanking him for an invitation to a gathering
at his house; this poem he later transcribed onto Calligraphies
and Sketches by Qingxiang (see Figure 72).

24· Zhang Jingjie later acquired other works by Shitao as
well, including a landscape album (Shanghai Museum, see
Figure 98) and a portrait (DDZTHSB 1/6-7). In this writer's
opinion, two other works in the Shanghai Museum (ST 46,
92-5) are not genuine. Zhang was a distant relative of Gao Qi-
pei, and was the go-between for the commission from a third
party of Gao's album Travel Impressions (Shanghai Museum)
in 1708. See Ruitenbeek 1992: 250.

25. See Du Cheng's colophons to two works: The Conver-
sion of Hariti to Buddhism (see Figure 163); and a landscape
hanging scroll now in a Hong Kong private collection (Sorhe-
by's New York, Paintings by Ming and Qing Masters from the
Lok Tai Hsien Collection, 22 April 1976, lot 42).
26. This coincides roughly with Zhang Chao's offer to pub-

lish some of his poetry. See Appendix 2, letter I.

27· On Shitac's journey to Hefei, see Wang Shiqing 1982.
Zhang Chunxiu, zi Zimin, hao Jianyang, was a Chinese ban-
nerman originally from Liaoyang. According to the late-
seventeenth-century Tuhui baojian xuzuan, Zhang painted in
the modes of Dong Yuan, Mi Fu, and Ni Zan, and was good
at copying old paintings, of which he was a collector. He was
also a calligrapher and seal carver.

28. Xu Songling (zi Yirnin, alternate zi Cangxue, hao
Bo'an, Jing'an), was the son of Xu Chengyuan and nephew of
Xu Chengxuan and Xu Chengjia. Although he obtained the
rank of secretariat drafter (zhongshu sheren) as a stipend stu-
dent (/insheng), he stayed in the business world, as had his fa-
ther and uncles. See Wang Shiqing 1981a.

29. See Gong's inscription to the handscroll for Xu Yimin,
recorded in Shao Songnian '904: 8/sa-6b, cited in Silbergeld
'98I.
30. Recorded in Huang Binhong 196r: 18S-6. Silbergeld

(1981) gives a very different interpretation of the relationship
between Gong and Xu.

31. For the complete letter, see Liu Haisu and Wang Dao-
yun, eds. 1988: 177.
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look upon the site of the extravagance of six dynasties./What
resemblance does it bear to the time of the Hall of the Great
Foundation?"

lOS. The major document of that history of concealment
is the 1677 poem "Poem for Zhong Yuxing," discussed above,
Chapter 4, n. 53.

106. The earliest dated appearance of this as a seal is on
leaf 4 of the Landscapes Painted at Wanglu Tang of '702. See
Ishikawa Jun et al. 1976: fig. 14I.
107. For example, The Orphan of the Zhao Family (play).
108. From the inscription to a leaf in a 1684 album of land-

scapes in the Palace Museum, Beijing. Reproduced in Xu Bang-
da, ed. 1984b: 77I.

109. Guilin shi wenwu guanli weiyuanhui 1980: 4-7.
110. As seen from Li Guosong's colophon, cited earlier in

this chapter. The album was painted for Huang Jixian, the re-
cipient of the 1696 Reminiscences of Qin-Huai; ironically,
Huang took it with him on his journey to Jianyang in Fujian,
where he was taking up an appointment as magistrate.

III. The poem, taken on its own, suggests that he saw a
musician during his visit; but the painting, by placing the fig-
ure at the center of the scene, where it functions as the psycho-
logical subject of the represented experience, implies Shirao's
identi.fication with this musician and thus an autobiographical
reference. Naturally, Shitao need not have had any musical
skill himself.

112. Leaf 2, reproduced in Edwards 1967: cat. no. 17B.
II3· Reproduced in STSHQJ pI. '74. This signature was

probably added at a later date (as discussed in the section "The
Dadi Tang Enterprise: Production Strategies" in Chapter 6).

SIX. THE ARTIST-ENTREPRENEUR

I. The question has received general treatment in a recent
pioneering study by James Cahill (1994) on the Ming-Qing
period. I am indebted to Cahill's clear exposition of many ba-
sic conventions. The growing literature includes Hsu 1987;
Shan Guoqiang 1992; Burkus-Chasson 1994; and McDermott
1997· See also the reconstruction of Xu Wei's professional
practice in Ryor 1998.

2. Neither work survives. Shitao reused his inscription to
the 1657 painting on a leaf of the Landscapes, Flowers, and
Bamboo painted c. 1664 (see Figure 47). For the handscroll,
see jin Huan, Shibai zhai shuhua lu: xingjuan, cited in Wang
Shiqing 1978.
3· Translation from Fong '976, slightly modified. Cao was

from Zhili Province.
4· The passage continues: "When the paintings were fin-

ished, each one resembled a famous Song or Yuan master's
style. But the brushwork had no fixed method; sometimes it
was heavy and sometimes delicate, and he [only] required of
each leaf that it be executed freely and personally. The brush
followed his imagination, and without consciously striving
after the Ancients his methods concurred with theirs. "

5· On the surviving Huangshan album leaves, illustrated in
STSHQJ pIs. 217-230, see Edwards '992: '77-9; and Zhang
Zining 1993. The Sixteen Luohans handscroll commemorated
Cao Dingwang's work in restoring Luohan Temple in Shexian.
See Zhang Zining, ibid.

6. The obvious candidate is the prefect's son, Cao Fen, who
was a friend of Shitao. The reference to "snowy pines" (song-

xue) in the dedication both evokes Zhao Mengfu (hao Song-
xue Daoren) in relation to Cao Dingwang and identifies the
birthday function of the work through the pines' symbolism
of longevity. For another Xuancheng-period allusion to Zhao
in a painting for a Qing official, see Figure 54.

7. Shitao's paintings for this family over a thirty-year peri-
od include the following:
For Wu Erchun: Orchids and Bamboo, handscroll, recorded

in Pang Yuanji 1971a, juan 4.
For Wu Zhenbo (zi Jingyuan, hao jianshan, eldest son of

Wu Erchun): Wutong Tree and Rock, hanging scroll, 1674,
Jilin Provincial Museum, reproduced in Yiyuan duoying 6
(1979): I3; Bamboo, Rocks, and Plum Blossom, hanging
scroll, 1679, commissioned as a gift for Mr. Huaizu, repro-
duced in ST 41j Looking at Plum Blossom, hanging scroll on
silk, Shanghai Museum, reproduced in Yiyuan duoying 36
(1987): 6; Landscapes, album, 1684, recorded in jin Huan,
Shibai zhai shuhua lu (n.d.): xiahan, chouji; Thoughts of
Xi'nan, hanging scroll, 1693 (see Figure 93); Landscape and
Calligraphy, handscroll, c. 1701 or later, Beijing Cultural Rel-
ics Bureau, cited by Wang Shiqing 1979b, '987a: 'S.

For Wu Chengxia (zi Yusheng, hao Xiangu, eldest son of
Wu Zhenbo): Landscape, hanging scroll, 1686, recorded in
Hu Jitang c. 1839: shang/4Ib-42a; Landscapes for Yu Daoren
(see Figures 168, 169); Plum Blossom and Bamboo, fan, c.
1687-9, reproduced in Gugong bowuyuan cang Ming Qing
shanmian shuhua ji, vol. 4 (1991): pl. 64; Landscapes, album,
1700 or earlier, reproduced in Shina nanga taisei 1935-7: vol.
6; Walking toward a Mountain Retreat, hanging scroll, 1703
(see Plate II); Seclusion by the Crane Stream, handscroll, c.
1705 or later, reproduced in Christie's New York, Fine Chinese
Paintings, Calligraphy, and Rubbings, 18 September '996, no.
189.

For Wu Chengxun (zi Mingchi, first cousin of Wu Cheng-
xia): Pine and Chrysanthemum, handscroll or hanging scroll,
known from a poem by Mei Qing (Wang Shiqing '987: 16).

For Wu Yuqiao (zi Nangao, bao Yiyuan, born 1679, neph-
ew of Wu Chengxun): Portrait of Wu Yuqiao (collaboration
with Jiang Heng), c. 1698, handscroll (see Figure 28); The
Blue-Green Screen of the Southern Mountains, hanging scroll,
1699 (see Figure 2S); Eight Views of Xi' nan, album, 1700 (see
Figure 26); Vegetables and Praying Mantis, handscroll, 1700
(Li Yeshuang '973: 'S6-7); Landscapes and Calligraphies, un-
dated, Shanghai Museum (bears Wu Yuqiao's collector's seals).
For Wu Canxi, Landscape Album, 1680 (STSHQJ pis. 1-

15)·
For Wu Qi (zi Yuanci, hao Tingweng, 1619-94), Landscape

of Mount Heng, 1687 (see Figure 46).
For Wu Qipeng (zi Yunyi, hao Ganyu, nephew of Wu Qi):

Miniature Landscapes, 1699 (see Figure 104); Mr. Yunyi's Re-
turn to Xin'an, hanging scroll, 1704 (whereabouts unknown).

Shitao is also known to have been close friends with at least
two other members of the family, Wu Chengli (zi Maoshu,
brother of Wu Chengxun, father ofWu Yuqiao, 1662-91, see
Wang Shiqing 1987: 16) and Wu Ai (zi Jiren, see Li Lin 1708:
15/8 S; Wang Shiqing '987: II), who would presumably have
owned paintings by him.
8. For WangJie (zi Changyu, 1634-?): Gazing at the Water-

fall from a Stone Bridge, hanging scroll, 1672, reproduced in
Edwards 1967: 29. For Wang Ji (zi Zhouci): Landscapes, al-
bum, 1676, recorded in PeiJingfu '937: 16/8b.

9· See Wang Shiqing r982. On Min Shizhang (zi Xiang-
nan, hao Huaihai), see YZFZ 32!r7a-b; Wang Shiqing, ibid.
For his grandson, Min Changhong (zi Zaidong, hao Kuang-
zhai), Shitao during the Dadi Tang years painted a superb
hanging scroll of plum blossoms, reproduced in Omura 1945:
vol. 7.

10. According to DDZZ, Shitao disposed of this collection
before moving to Nanjing. Interestingly, Li's description of the
manner in which he did so (see above, Chapter 4, in the sec-
tion "From Xuancheng to Beijing: 1678-1692"), while silent
on the economic dimension, is suggestive of a procedure not
unlike a modern house or apartment sale.

II. Deng Qifen's generosity with money is noted by Shi-
tao's friend, Mei Geng, whose studies Deng supported in
1677-8 (Hu Yi 1984; Mei Geng 1990). Two works painted by
Shitao for Deng Qifen during this period survive: a landscape
hanging scroll (Shenzhou guoguang ji, vol. 16), and a horse
painting (see Figure 54). The inscription to a third is recorded
in DDZTHSB 1/7-8. For the record of a 1686 painting for
Deng, see QXLRT] r j a. Circa 1693-4 Deng saw Shitao again
when he passed through Yangzhou, at which time Shitao re-
inscribed the third of the above-mentioned early paintings
(DDZTHSB 1/7-8).

12. When he completed the screen, Shitao wrote a colo-
phon for it in handscroll format, which reads in part: "This
year Mr. Chang Hanqian celebrated his fiftieth birthday, and
sent silk to me at the Yizhi Ge in Nanjing commanding me
to execute a painting. In my barren solitude, I sought and ob-
tained an image of old pines and strange rocks; [the person]
standing cranelike at the cave door is the honorable immortal
himself just after dispersing the chess pieces" (STSHQJ pl. 32).
This is the same man whom Shitao would seek out at Qing-
jiangpu in 1688 during his first aborted journey to the North.

13. My translation draws heavily on a rendering of the en-
tire inscription by Shane McCausland in an unpublished paper
(McCausland '994).
I4. In other words (the percentages don't add up), he had

mostly received calligraphies from Shitao. This unpublished
handscroll, Streams and Mountains without End (e. e. Wang
Family Collection), is the same one that was later acquired by
Hong Zhengzhi (see the section "jingjiang Descendant" in
Chapter 5). Two other works painted by Shirao for Zhou Jing
survive: Teaching the [Book of] Changes, hanging scroll, 1680,
collection unknown; and Paintings and Calligraphies for Zhou
ling, album (see Figure 16S).
'5. Fang 1976: 22.
16. See above, n. 7.
'7. Zhao Lun (zi Shugong, hao Langxian), from Shandong

Province, served as Provincial Education Commissioner from
1682 to 1688; Zhao Zisi (zi Wenshui, hao Ren'an, Mengsu
shanren). Shitao painted for the father the large horizontal
hanging scroll Fishing in a Mountain Stream (see Figure 164),
apparently while enjoying the latter's hospitality; and he con-
tributed the landscape setting to a portrait of Zhao Zisi, of
which the colophons survive today, attached to what in this
author's opinion is a spurious portrait (Metropolitan Museum
of Art). He also added inscriptions to an album of paintings
by another monk, Shuangxiao (formerly Shanghai Museum)
dedicated to Zhao Zisi (ST 83-4). A landscape hanging scroll
in the Sichuan Provincial Museum (STSHQJ vol. I, pI. 36)
bearing an inscription that purports to have been written in

the official residence of Education Commissioner Zhao Lang
on the third day (of the New Year), 1684, is clearly a forgery.

18. Shitao inscribed a painting by the Huizhou painter Wu
Youhe (from the same family as Wu Zhenbo) in the summer
of 1688. See Zhongguo meishu quanji, huihua bian 1988: vol.
9, no. 'S3 (Shanghai Museum).
'9· Shanghai Museum (ST pI. 3). Virtually the same in-

scription is found on another landscape hanging scroll painted
in Nanjing for a different recipient in the sevenrh month of
1686 (STH] no. '7, Shanghai Museum). This kind of stan-
dardization is in itself indicative of large demand for his work,
obliging him to have ready-made solutions at his disposal.
20. On Yao Man, see Wu Qi 1982: 2129a-30a.
2I. Kong Shangren (1962: 38) records one meeting of the

society in the spring of 1687 at which twenty-four people were
present, including Shirao, Gong Xian, Zha Shibiao, Wu Qi, Ni
Yongqing, and Zhuo Erkan. For a literary portrait of Wu Qi,
see jin Zhixing 1990; and for two contemporary biographies,
]iao Xun 1992: 473-7. Wu Qi's poem on climbing Mount
Heng is in his Linhui tang quanji (1982: 13!I9a-b).
22. Translation by Richard Strassberg (I983: 172-3).
23. Shitao evokes Zhang Lin's wealth and generous hospi-

tality in a poem thanking him for an invitation to a gathering
at his house; this poem he later transcribed onto Calligraphies
and Sketches by Qingxiang (see Figure 72).

24· Zhang Jingjie later acquired other works by Shitao as
well, including a landscape album (Shanghai Museum, see
Figure 98) and a portrait (DDZTHSB 1/6-7). In this writer's
opinion, two other works in the Shanghai Museum (ST 46,
92-5) are not genuine. Zhang was a distant relative of Gao Qi-
pei, and was the go-between for the commission from a third
party of Gao's album Travel Impressions (Shanghai Museum)
in 1708. See Ruitenbeek 1992: 250.

25. See Du Cheng's colophons to two works: The Conver-
sion of Hariti to Buddhism (see Figure 163); and a landscape
hanging scroll now in a Hong Kong private collection (Sorhe-
by's New York, Paintings by Ming and Qing Masters from the
Lok Tai Hsien Collection, 22 April 1976, lot 42).
26. This coincides roughly with Zhang Chao's offer to pub-

lish some of his poetry. See Appendix 2, letter I.

27· On Shitac's journey to Hefei, see Wang Shiqing 1982.
Zhang Chunxiu, zi Zimin, hao Jianyang, was a Chinese ban-
nerman originally from Liaoyang. According to the late-
seventeenth-century Tuhui baojian xuzuan, Zhang painted in
the modes of Dong Yuan, Mi Fu, and Ni Zan, and was good
at copying old paintings, of which he was a collector. He was
also a calligrapher and seal carver.

28. Xu Songling (zi Yirnin, alternate zi Cangxue, hao
Bo'an, Jing'an), was the son of Xu Chengyuan and nephew of
Xu Chengxuan and Xu Chengjia. Although he obtained the
rank of secretariat drafter (zhongshu sheren) as a stipend stu-
dent (/insheng), he stayed in the business world, as had his fa-
ther and uncles. See Wang Shiqing 1981a.

29. See Gong's inscription to the handscroll for Xu Yimin,
recorded in Shao Songnian '904: 8/sa-6b, cited in Silbergeld
'98I.
30. Recorded in Huang Binhong 196r: 18S-6. Silbergeld

(1981) gives a very different interpretation of the relationship
between Gong and Xu.

31. For the complete letter, see Liu Haisu and Wang Dao-
yun, eds. 1988: 177.
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32. On Wu ]iaji, a well-known Yangzhou area loyalist and
poet, see Chaves 1986. Shitao met Wu in Nanjing in 1683 and
mentions him in a poem from that year (Landscapes and Po-
etry, Shanghai Museum, ST 70; Calligraphy Manuscript for
Monk fuhui, r692, Christie's New York, Fine Chinese Paint-
ings, Calligraphy, and Rubbings, 18 September "996, lor 189).
Shitao's only known contact with Gong Xian was at his first
visit to the Spring River Poetry Society in 1687_
33· Shanghai Museum, reproduced in ST 43.
34· Known works by Shitao for Xu Songling include Or-

chids and Bamboo, handscroll, 1695, Beijing Cultural Relics
Bureau, cited in Wang Shiqing 19813; Long Whistling in the
Breeze, c. 1695 (reproduced in ST 43); Landscape of Mount
Huang, handscroll, 1699 (this commissioned by Xu's friends
as a gift) (see Figure 16); Figure in Ink, recorded in Jin Huan
n.d.: xiezhuan; title board, recorded in Tao Wei, Cuanxiang.
Passing through Yizheng on his way to Hefei, Shirao left be-
hind an album of landscapes (formerly Zhang Daqian Collec-
tion) as a present for a certain Mr. Chacmin, who was not at
home when he called. Mr. "Chaomin" has never been satis-
factorily identified, but could conceivably (if Sbirao was not
yet well acquainted with Xu Songling) be an error for Yimin
(the character min is the same in each case). If so, it provides
a glimpse of the way in which Shitao introduced himself to
an important patron.
35· For a biography, see LHYFZ 1748: 33/42a.
36. See Zhu Yizun's epitaph inscription (1983: 77/8b-l0a).
37· For a now out-of-date list of Shitao's paintings for Hui-

zhou patrons over the course of his life, see SLW 656-67.
38. The inscription is quoted in Chapter 5 (section "Yang-

zhou and Beyond: 1693-1696").
39· The book was by Zheng Yu (1298-1358). See Wang

Shiqing 1981b.
40. See ibid. For Xian Zhu's sojourn at the River Village,

which lasted for several years, see Xian's own account in jiao
Xun "992: 696.
41. The handscroll is recorded in QXLRT] jb-aa and is

discussed in Wang Shiqing 1981b. Shirao's accompanying po-
ems were later appended to the entry on the estate in the [ia-
qing edition of the local gazetteer for Yizheng, Yizheng xian
xuzhi.

42• Landscapes of the Highest Class, leaf 3, Sumiromo Col-
lection. The three albums for Huang You are Landscapes of
the Highest Class (see Figures 64, 65, 80); Flowers and Fig-
ures (see Figures 192, 204, 206); Landscapes in Ink and Color,
album, recorded in DDZTHSB 1121-2. There is also a folding
fan from the summer of 1695, reproduced in Gugong bowu-
yuan cang Ming Qing shanmian shuhua ji, vol. 3: pI. 8I.
43· Inscription to a 1693 landscape painting for Wu Zhen-

bo (see Figure 93) cited in Chapter 5 (section "Yangzhou and
Beyond: 1693-1696").
44· In addition to the inscription cited here, see the one just

cited in n. 43.
45· This is Shitao's sole contribution to the commentaries

included in Zhang Chao's Shadows of Secret Dreams (1991).
46. Unfortunately, there is as yet no general study of the

economic practice of early Qing artists. However, the follow-
ing studies provide useful information: Master; Rosenzweig
"974-5; Silbergeld 1981; Huang Yongquan 1984; Kim '985,
"989, 1996; Cahill 1993; Burkus-Chasson 1994-
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47. Silbergeld 1981.
48. A major contemporary source is Wu Qizhen 1962. For

a modern study, see Kuo 1989.
49· Gong Xian noted in 1682 that Xu Songling was then

"collecting paintings from everywhere." Apart from Gong
himself, Luo Mu, Gu Fuzhen, and Shitao can also be associat-
ed wirh Xu Songling (see Shao Songnian "904: 8/sa-6b, where
both Luo Mu and Gu Fuzhen are mentioned). Cheng jun, as
we have seen, owned paintings by Hongren and Shirao, and
several Huizhou figures owned works by both Bada Shanren
and Shitao.
50. Kim 1996.
51· Song's collection included works by Cheng Zhengkui

(1604-76), Wu Hong (active c. 1653-79), Liu Yu (active late
seventeenth century), Luo Mu (1622-17°8), Zha Shibiao
(16I5-98), and even such uncompromising loyalists as Kun-
can and Bada Shanren. For Cheng Zhengkui's liangshan wo-
you tu, see Wang Maolin 1979: 14/6b; for two hanging scrolls
presented to Song by Wu Hong, see Song Luo 1973; for Liu
Yu's association with Song in Nanchang, see ibid.; for Luo
Mu, see ibid.; for Zha Shibiao's association with Song, see
Xiao Yanyi 198]: 252; for Kuncan's Sleeping in a Tree, see
Song Luo, ibid., for a set of six or possibly more scrolls by
Bada Shanren owned by Song, see Mastel; 120-3. It is also
worth noting that Song inscribed a painting by Mei Geng in
1700 when the latter visited him in Yangzhou (see Hu Yi
1984). Although Shitao is not known to have painted for Song
Luo, it is almost unlikely that he did not, given Song's numer-
ous visits to Yangzhou and the regularity with which Shitao
painted for Qing officials before and after 1697. For Song's
own painting see Wen Fong et al. 1984: 43-4. Another, less
noteworthy example of an official who was a collector is Kong
Shangren, who actively sought out Shitao, Zha Shibiao, and
Gong Xian. When he left Yangzhou, local painters presented
him with a collective album, which suggests that he had been
a good patron to them (Strassberg r983).
52. Useful information can be found in Andrews 1986.
53· For Zong Yuanding, see YZHFL 2, heading "4. For

Zhang Xun's activity as a painter in Yangzhou, see Kim 1985:
vol. 2, 125. For Gu Fuzhen, see SLW 530 n. 34,632 n. 16; Wu
Qi "982: 61r9a-20a; Chou "994: 61-3, 1998: 90-1.
54· For Wen Mingshi, Wu Qiusheng, and Huang jun'an,

see Zhang Geng 1963: xulu, 88-9; YZHFL 2, heading 33. For
Jiao Xun, see Li Fang "923: 3/3b. FOl Shi Yuan, see: YZHFL
2, heading "5; Yiyuan duoying 28 (1986): 42-3. For Wang
Zheng, see Chou and Brown "989: 72-3. Other less well-
known Yangzhou artists include Xiong Minhui, a juren of
1645 (Li Fang "923: rlrb), and Shi Yue (Li Fang "923: 1/4a).
55· For a study of Cheng Sui's activity as a calligrapher and

painter in Yangzhou, see Andrews 1986: 10 ft. See also Sun
Zhiwei 1979: qianji. 5!I4b, xuji, 4/raa; Jin Zhixing 1990.
Cheng Sui was already in Yangzhou when Zhou Lianggong
served there in 1645-6 (see Kim 1985: vol. 1,76). He moved
from Yangzhou to Nanjing in 1679.
56. Andrews 1986: 14 H.; Hearn 1992a; Sun Zhiwei 1979:

houji, 6/5 b.
57· Xiao Yanyi 1987: 261.
58. For Gong Xian's early activity as a painter in Yangzhou,

see Kim I985: vol. 2, IOC n. 358; Sun Zhiwei 1979: qianji,
5/qb; Zong Yuanding "97": 302.

59· Kim 1985: vol. 2, 175; Rogers 1996a: 38-9. Rogers
publishes an undated landscape hanging scroll with an admir-
ing inscription by Zha Shibiao written in 1664. Rogers dis-
cusses a disagreement between Shi Lin and one of his more es-
tablished commercial rivals that was cited by Zhou Lianggong
in his Duhua lu; it should be noted that the disagreement was
not with Zheng Zhong, as stated by Rogers, but with Zhang
Chong. See Kim, ibid.
60. Wu Jiaji 1980: 196.
61. Xu Kai "990: 477.
62. On Dian Daoren, see YZHFL 2) heading 3 I; Wen Fong

er al. 1984: 41Q-II. In 1707, Dian Daoren inscribed an early
painting by Shitao, now in the Kanaoka Collection, Tokyo.
The two men also had a mutual friend in Tian Lin, who ex-
changed poems with Dian Daoren in 1702 (Tian Lin 1727:
shang/44b).
63· Sun Zhiwei "979: qianji, 5/9a; Wang Maolin "979:

4/7b (1666 visit).
64· Sun Zhiwei "979: qianji, 4/qb; Zong Yuanding "97":

"7"-2,388-39. See]]ZL] "3" n. 30.
65· For the Yangzhou activity of Wang Zunsu, zi Xuandu,

see Liu Haisu and Wang Daoyun, eds. 1988: 18, 114.
66. Wu Jiaji 1980: 238.
67· Sun Zhiwei "979: xuji, 51r6b (in 1674); Zong Yuan-

ding 1971: 217; Liu Haisu and Wang Daoyun, eds. 1988:
33·
68. Wu Jiaji "980: 81 (in 1664); ibid. 468. See ]]ZL] "F

n.28.
69· See the discussion of Gong Xian's relationship with Xu

Songling in the earlier section "The Monk-Painter as Profes-
sional. "
70. See the section "Shitao and Bada Shanren" in Chap-

ter 5.
7!. Shi Pang was from Taihu in Anhui, but lived in Yang-

zhou. Master, 64.
72. Andrews 1986: 7. See Whitfield 1969: 108 for an al-

bum painted by Wang Hui in Yangzhou; it bears a colophon
by Ye Rong, there wrongly attributed to the better-known Ye
Xin.
73. See) for example, a landscape hanging scroll dedicated

to Wu Yuqiao (Zhongguo gudai shuhua tumu, vol. 5, Hu: 1-

3318).
74. See Yun Shouping's letter to Zhang Chao in Yousheng

chuji (Zhang Chao, cornp. "780b), jia/7b.
75· Andrews and Yoshida "98": 34 (in 1676); Christie's

New York, 25 November 1991, lot 171 (undated).
76. Shitao's paintings, inscriptions, and colophons for

Huang Ziqing (zi Suting) include Illustrations to Poems by Du
Fu, album, c. 1703-4 (see Figure 116), Shoto Museum of Art
(Ishikawa Jun et a!. 1976: 43-5); Illustrations to Song and
Yuan Poems, album, c. 1705-6 (see Figure 14), Hong Kong
Museum of Art (Ishikawa Jun et al. 1976: 71-6); a 1706 in-
scription to one of Shitao's own early paintings, of two horses
(Sotheby's New York, sale no. 5212, "3 June "984, lot 44);
Landscapes, 17°6, of which four leaves (formerly Higashi-
yama Collection) are in the collection of the Shoto Museum
of Art (Edwards 1967: cat. no. 40), another seven are in a
Japanese private collection and are unpublished, and one was
sold at Sotheby's New YOlk (Fine Chinese Paintings, 29 May
1991, lot 35); and Flowers and Fruit, c. 1707 (see Figure 125),

Shanghai Museum (ST 101-2). If the Mr. Huang who owned
Facing-the-Verdure Hall (Wanglii Tang) was in fact Huang
Ziqing, then three other works can be added to this list:
Landscapes Painted at Wanglit Tang, 1702 (see Figures 9,
105, 200), Ostasiatiska Museet, Stockholm (Edwards 1967:
cat. no. 32; Ishikawa Jun et al. 1976: 168); a 1703 painting
recorded as having been painted for the owner of Wangcai
Tang, the cai very likely being an error for lu (QXLRT] 19a);
and Cat and Butterfly, hanging scroll, 1704, in collaboration
with Cheng Ming and a painter surnamed Xie (Christie's
New York, Fine Chinese Paintings and Calligraphy, 19 Sep-
tember 1997, lot 82), where the owner of Wanglu Tang is
identified as a Mr. Huang. There also exists a hanging scroll
dedicated to the owner ofWanglu Tang in the Drenowatz Col-
lection, illustrating Tao Yuanming's Returning Home, but ac-
cording to Li (1984: 214-17), it is not genuine.
77· There do exist two letters to Cheng jun from another

painter, Zha Shibiao, which appeared at auction as part of an
album of Qing artists' letters (Sotheby's New York, Fine Chi-
nese Paintings, 29 November 1993, lot 43). In one, Zha Shi-
biao dismisses an attributed Dong Qichang calligraphy that
had been sent to him for his authentication. In the other, he
tries to set up a meeting with Cheng.
78. Two characters are unclear.
79· Wuxi Municipal Museum, reproduced in STSHQ] pis.

403-410. The scroll is undated, but judging by the seals dates
from the beginning of the 1700s. The painting Narcissus,
Bamboo, and Rock (Zhongguo wenwu jizhen "985: 218-19),
purportedly painted for Zheweng in 1702, appears to be a
modern forgery. Its inscription corresponds to one recorded in
DDZTHSB 3/57, which, if irself genuine, would establish Zhe-
weng's date of birth as 1653.
80. On the use of alum to bring out mineral colors, see

Wang Gai "992.
81. Wan zhi liezhuan gao 2/39a.
82. On Jiang Shidong and rhe Jiang family, see YZHFL 12;

and Wang Shiqing 1978. Perhaps the most famous member of
the family is the great mid-eighteenth-century salt merchant
and cultural patron Jiang Chun.
83· Zheng Wei 1962: 47-8; Han Linde 1989: 82-4- The

letters were probably once part of a collection of Letters from
Former Friends of the Jiang Family begun by Jiang Shidong.
See Wang Shiqing 1978.
84· Yangzhou merchant demand for paintings is discussed

in the first section ("The Yangzhou Market for Painting") of
Chapter 7.
85. The only Fang to whom Iam currently able to connect

Shitao is Fang Xiong (b. 1631), a Daoist from a Shexian fam-
ily, who inscribed the Orchids for Hong Zhengzhi. See ]]ZL]
104, 133 n. 56.
86. For the 1759 price list of Zheng Xie, see Hsu 1987:

232-44. Price lists were certainly used in late-seventeenth-
century Yangzhou, as seen from the example of Zhang Xun,
who, "when [he] returned horne from beyond the border ...
found his house destroyed. Thus he bad to sell his paintings
to earn a living. He pasted up a small sign, saying "for the
price of 'so much' a fan" and "for a price of 'so much' a hang-
ing scroll.'" See Kim 1985: vol. 2, 125.
87. Wuran 1966: 272, cited by Cahill (1994: 56). 1 have

amended Cahill's translation, which translates qian as "cents,"
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32. On Wu ]iaji, a well-known Yangzhou area loyalist and
poet, see Chaves 1986. Shitao met Wu in Nanjing in 1683 and
mentions him in a poem from that year (Landscapes and Po-
etry, Shanghai Museum, ST 70; Calligraphy Manuscript for
Monk fuhui, r692, Christie's New York, Fine Chinese Paint-
ings, Calligraphy, and Rubbings, 18 September "996, lor 189).
Shitao's only known contact with Gong Xian was at his first
visit to the Spring River Poetry Society in 1687_
33· Shanghai Museum, reproduced in ST 43.
34· Known works by Shitao for Xu Songling include Or-

chids and Bamboo, handscroll, 1695, Beijing Cultural Relics
Bureau, cited in Wang Shiqing 19813; Long Whistling in the
Breeze, c. 1695 (reproduced in ST 43); Landscape of Mount
Huang, handscroll, 1699 (this commissioned by Xu's friends
as a gift) (see Figure 16); Figure in Ink, recorded in Jin Huan
n.d.: xiezhuan; title board, recorded in Tao Wei, Cuanxiang.
Passing through Yizheng on his way to Hefei, Shirao left be-
hind an album of landscapes (formerly Zhang Daqian Collec-
tion) as a present for a certain Mr. Chacmin, who was not at
home when he called. Mr. "Chaomin" has never been satis-
factorily identified, but could conceivably (if Sbirao was not
yet well acquainted with Xu Songling) be an error for Yimin
(the character min is the same in each case). If so, it provides
a glimpse of the way in which Shitao introduced himself to
an important patron.
35· For a biography, see LHYFZ 1748: 33/42a.
36. See Zhu Yizun's epitaph inscription (1983: 77/8b-l0a).
37· For a now out-of-date list of Shitao's paintings for Hui-

zhou patrons over the course of his life, see SLW 656-67.
38. The inscription is quoted in Chapter 5 (section "Yang-

zhou and Beyond: 1693-1696").
39· The book was by Zheng Yu (1298-1358). See Wang

Shiqing 1981b.
40. See ibid. For Xian Zhu's sojourn at the River Village,

which lasted for several years, see Xian's own account in jiao
Xun "992: 696.
41. The handscroll is recorded in QXLRT] jb-aa and is

discussed in Wang Shiqing 1981b. Shirao's accompanying po-
ems were later appended to the entry on the estate in the [ia-
qing edition of the local gazetteer for Yizheng, Yizheng xian
xuzhi.

42• Landscapes of the Highest Class, leaf 3, Sumiromo Col-
lection. The three albums for Huang You are Landscapes of
the Highest Class (see Figures 64, 65, 80); Flowers and Fig-
ures (see Figures 192, 204, 206); Landscapes in Ink and Color,
album, recorded in DDZTHSB 1121-2. There is also a folding
fan from the summer of 1695, reproduced in Gugong bowu-
yuan cang Ming Qing shanmian shuhua ji, vol. 3: pI. 8I.
43· Inscription to a 1693 landscape painting for Wu Zhen-

bo (see Figure 93) cited in Chapter 5 (section "Yangzhou and
Beyond: 1693-1696").
44· In addition to the inscription cited here, see the one just

cited in n. 43.
45· This is Shitao's sole contribution to the commentaries

included in Zhang Chao's Shadows of Secret Dreams (1991).
46. Unfortunately, there is as yet no general study of the

economic practice of early Qing artists. However, the follow-
ing studies provide useful information: Master; Rosenzweig
"974-5; Silbergeld 1981; Huang Yongquan 1984; Kim '985,
"989, 1996; Cahill 1993; Burkus-Chasson 1994-
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47. Silbergeld 1981.
48. A major contemporary source is Wu Qizhen 1962. For

a modern study, see Kuo 1989.
49· Gong Xian noted in 1682 that Xu Songling was then

"collecting paintings from everywhere." Apart from Gong
himself, Luo Mu, Gu Fuzhen, and Shitao can also be associat-
ed wirh Xu Songling (see Shao Songnian "904: 8/sa-6b, where
both Luo Mu and Gu Fuzhen are mentioned). Cheng jun, as
we have seen, owned paintings by Hongren and Shirao, and
several Huizhou figures owned works by both Bada Shanren
and Shitao.
50. Kim 1996.
51· Song's collection included works by Cheng Zhengkui

(1604-76), Wu Hong (active c. 1653-79), Liu Yu (active late
seventeenth century), Luo Mu (1622-17°8), Zha Shibiao
(16I5-98), and even such uncompromising loyalists as Kun-
can and Bada Shanren. For Cheng Zhengkui's liangshan wo-
you tu, see Wang Maolin 1979: 14/6b; for two hanging scrolls
presented to Song by Wu Hong, see Song Luo 1973; for Liu
Yu's association with Song in Nanchang, see ibid.; for Luo
Mu, see ibid.; for Zha Shibiao's association with Song, see
Xiao Yanyi 198]: 252; for Kuncan's Sleeping in a Tree, see
Song Luo, ibid., for a set of six or possibly more scrolls by
Bada Shanren owned by Song, see Mastel; 120-3. It is also
worth noting that Song inscribed a painting by Mei Geng in
1700 when the latter visited him in Yangzhou (see Hu Yi
1984). Although Shitao is not known to have painted for Song
Luo, it is almost unlikely that he did not, given Song's numer-
ous visits to Yangzhou and the regularity with which Shitao
painted for Qing officials before and after 1697. For Song's
own painting see Wen Fong et al. 1984: 43-4. Another, less
noteworthy example of an official who was a collector is Kong
Shangren, who actively sought out Shitao, Zha Shibiao, and
Gong Xian. When he left Yangzhou, local painters presented
him with a collective album, which suggests that he had been
a good patron to them (Strassberg r983).
52. Useful information can be found in Andrews 1986.
53· For Zong Yuanding, see YZHFL 2, heading "4. For

Zhang Xun's activity as a painter in Yangzhou, see Kim 1985:
vol. 2, 125. For Gu Fuzhen, see SLW 530 n. 34,632 n. 16; Wu
Qi "982: 61r9a-20a; Chou "994: 61-3, 1998: 90-1.
54· For Wen Mingshi, Wu Qiusheng, and Huang jun'an,

see Zhang Geng 1963: xulu, 88-9; YZHFL 2, heading 33. For
Jiao Xun, see Li Fang "923: 3/3b. FOl Shi Yuan, see: YZHFL
2, heading "5; Yiyuan duoying 28 (1986): 42-3. For Wang
Zheng, see Chou and Brown "989: 72-3. Other less well-
known Yangzhou artists include Xiong Minhui, a juren of
1645 (Li Fang "923: rlrb), and Shi Yue (Li Fang "923: 1/4a).
55· For a study of Cheng Sui's activity as a calligrapher and

painter in Yangzhou, see Andrews 1986: 10 ft. See also Sun
Zhiwei 1979: qianji. 5!I4b, xuji, 4/raa; Jin Zhixing 1990.
Cheng Sui was already in Yangzhou when Zhou Lianggong
served there in 1645-6 (see Kim 1985: vol. 1,76). He moved
from Yangzhou to Nanjing in 1679.
56. Andrews 1986: 14 H.; Hearn 1992a; Sun Zhiwei 1979:

houji, 6/5 b.
57· Xiao Yanyi 1987: 261.
58. For Gong Xian's early activity as a painter in Yangzhou,

see Kim I985: vol. 2, IOC n. 358; Sun Zhiwei 1979: qianji,
5/qb; Zong Yuanding "97": 302.

59· Kim 1985: vol. 2, 175; Rogers 1996a: 38-9. Rogers
publishes an undated landscape hanging scroll with an admir-
ing inscription by Zha Shibiao written in 1664. Rogers dis-
cusses a disagreement between Shi Lin and one of his more es-
tablished commercial rivals that was cited by Zhou Lianggong
in his Duhua lu; it should be noted that the disagreement was
not with Zheng Zhong, as stated by Rogers, but with Zhang
Chong. See Kim, ibid.
60. Wu Jiaji 1980: 196.
61. Xu Kai "990: 477.
62. On Dian Daoren, see YZHFL 2) heading 3 I; Wen Fong

er al. 1984: 41Q-II. In 1707, Dian Daoren inscribed an early
painting by Shitao, now in the Kanaoka Collection, Tokyo.
The two men also had a mutual friend in Tian Lin, who ex-
changed poems with Dian Daoren in 1702 (Tian Lin 1727:
shang/44b).
63· Sun Zhiwei "979: qianji, 5/9a; Wang Maolin "979:

4/7b (1666 visit).
64· Sun Zhiwei "979: qianji, 4/qb; Zong Yuanding "97":

"7"-2,388-39. See]]ZL] "3" n. 30.
65· For the Yangzhou activity of Wang Zunsu, zi Xuandu,

see Liu Haisu and Wang Daoyun, eds. 1988: 18, 114.
66. Wu Jiaji 1980: 238.
67· Sun Zhiwei "979: xuji, 51r6b (in 1674); Zong Yuan-

ding 1971: 217; Liu Haisu and Wang Daoyun, eds. 1988:
33·
68. Wu Jiaji "980: 81 (in 1664); ibid. 468. See ]]ZL] "F

n.28.
69· See the discussion of Gong Xian's relationship with Xu

Songling in the earlier section "The Monk-Painter as Profes-
sional. "
70. See the section "Shitao and Bada Shanren" in Chap-

ter 5.
7!. Shi Pang was from Taihu in Anhui, but lived in Yang-

zhou. Master, 64.
72. Andrews 1986: 7. See Whitfield 1969: 108 for an al-

bum painted by Wang Hui in Yangzhou; it bears a colophon
by Ye Rong, there wrongly attributed to the better-known Ye
Xin.
73. See) for example, a landscape hanging scroll dedicated

to Wu Yuqiao (Zhongguo gudai shuhua tumu, vol. 5, Hu: 1-

3318).
74. See Yun Shouping's letter to Zhang Chao in Yousheng

chuji (Zhang Chao, cornp. "780b), jia/7b.
75· Andrews and Yoshida "98": 34 (in 1676); Christie's

New York, 25 November 1991, lot 171 (undated).
76. Shitao's paintings, inscriptions, and colophons for

Huang Ziqing (zi Suting) include Illustrations to Poems by Du
Fu, album, c. 1703-4 (see Figure 116), Shoto Museum of Art
(Ishikawa Jun et a!. 1976: 43-5); Illustrations to Song and
Yuan Poems, album, c. 1705-6 (see Figure 14), Hong Kong
Museum of Art (Ishikawa Jun et al. 1976: 71-6); a 1706 in-
scription to one of Shitao's own early paintings, of two horses
(Sotheby's New York, sale no. 5212, "3 June "984, lot 44);
Landscapes, 17°6, of which four leaves (formerly Higashi-
yama Collection) are in the collection of the Shoto Museum
of Art (Edwards 1967: cat. no. 40), another seven are in a
Japanese private collection and are unpublished, and one was
sold at Sotheby's New YOlk (Fine Chinese Paintings, 29 May
1991, lot 35); and Flowers and Fruit, c. 1707 (see Figure 125),

Shanghai Museum (ST 101-2). If the Mr. Huang who owned
Facing-the-Verdure Hall (Wanglii Tang) was in fact Huang
Ziqing, then three other works can be added to this list:
Landscapes Painted at Wanglit Tang, 1702 (see Figures 9,
105, 200), Ostasiatiska Museet, Stockholm (Edwards 1967:
cat. no. 32; Ishikawa Jun et al. 1976: 168); a 1703 painting
recorded as having been painted for the owner of Wangcai
Tang, the cai very likely being an error for lu (QXLRT] 19a);
and Cat and Butterfly, hanging scroll, 1704, in collaboration
with Cheng Ming and a painter surnamed Xie (Christie's
New York, Fine Chinese Paintings and Calligraphy, 19 Sep-
tember 1997, lot 82), where the owner of Wanglu Tang is
identified as a Mr. Huang. There also exists a hanging scroll
dedicated to the owner ofWanglu Tang in the Drenowatz Col-
lection, illustrating Tao Yuanming's Returning Home, but ac-
cording to Li (1984: 214-17), it is not genuine.
77· There do exist two letters to Cheng jun from another

painter, Zha Shibiao, which appeared at auction as part of an
album of Qing artists' letters (Sotheby's New York, Fine Chi-
nese Paintings, 29 November 1993, lot 43). In one, Zha Shi-
biao dismisses an attributed Dong Qichang calligraphy that
had been sent to him for his authentication. In the other, he
tries to set up a meeting with Cheng.
78. Two characters are unclear.
79· Wuxi Municipal Museum, reproduced in STSHQ] pis.

403-410. The scroll is undated, but judging by the seals dates
from the beginning of the 1700s. The painting Narcissus,
Bamboo, and Rock (Zhongguo wenwu jizhen "985: 218-19),
purportedly painted for Zheweng in 1702, appears to be a
modern forgery. Its inscription corresponds to one recorded in
DDZTHSB 3/57, which, if irself genuine, would establish Zhe-
weng's date of birth as 1653.
80. On the use of alum to bring out mineral colors, see

Wang Gai "992.
81. Wan zhi liezhuan gao 2/39a.
82. On Jiang Shidong and rhe Jiang family, see YZHFL 12;

and Wang Shiqing 1978. Perhaps the most famous member of
the family is the great mid-eighteenth-century salt merchant
and cultural patron Jiang Chun.
83· Zheng Wei 1962: 47-8; Han Linde 1989: 82-4- The

letters were probably once part of a collection of Letters from
Former Friends of the Jiang Family begun by Jiang Shidong.
See Wang Shiqing 1978.
84· Yangzhou merchant demand for paintings is discussed

in the first section ("The Yangzhou Market for Painting") of
Chapter 7.
85. The only Fang to whom Iam currently able to connect

Shitao is Fang Xiong (b. 1631), a Daoist from a Shexian fam-
ily, who inscribed the Orchids for Hong Zhengzhi. See ]]ZL]
104, 133 n. 56.
86. For the 1759 price list of Zheng Xie, see Hsu 1987:

232-44. Price lists were certainly used in late-seventeenth-
century Yangzhou, as seen from the example of Zhang Xun,
who, "when [he] returned horne from beyond the border ...
found his house destroyed. Thus he bad to sell his paintings
to earn a living. He pasted up a small sign, saying "for the
price of 'so much' a fan" and "for a price of 'so much' a hang-
ing scroll.'" See Kim 1985: vol. 2, 125.
87. Wuran 1966: 272, cited by Cahill (1994: 56). 1 have

amended Cahill's translation, which translates qian as "cents,"
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presumably mistaking qian for copper cash. The list also has
prices for calligraphy and seal carving:
Calligraphy: Small-standard (xiaokai) script: 3 raels, down

to 3 qian. Middle-sized cursive: 5 taels, down to 3 qian. Large-
character calligraphy: 5 taels, down to 5 qian.
Seal-carving: Stone: 5 qian. Bronze: I tael, 5 qian. Jade: 2

taels.
88. The fact that Wan's cheapest fan cost 0.5 raels, whereas

Wen Jia a hundred years earlier painted four fans for Xiang
Yuanbian for the same price, is one measure of the effect of
the intervening inflation on prices for painting. Letter from
Wen Jia to Xiang Yuanbian, cited by Shan Guoqiang 1992: 3-
10.
89. Lu Liuliang, Mai yiwen. Not all editions of Lu's col-

lected works include the price lists attached to this text, which
can conveniently be consulted in Huang Miaozi 1982. My
thanks to Pierre-Henri Durand for supplying me with a reprint
of Lu's full text. For his discussion of writing fees in the price
lists, see Durand 1992: 122.
90. Huang Zongyan (1616-86), who was the younger

brother of Huang Zongxi (see Huang Miaozi 1982), offered
only: "Northern School landscapes: 0.3 taels per fan." The
young Wu Zhizhen (1640-1717) offered paintings that were
either of bamboo or of flowers, plants, and perhaps birds:
"Bamboo paintings: 0.1 raels per fan. Studies from nature: 0.1
taels per fan. [The same] with color added: 0.2 taels per fan."
91. "A large hanging scroll costs 6 taels, a medium-sized

one is 4, a small scroll costs 2. [Calligraphy] coupler and
streamer are I tae! a pair, while album leaves and fans are 0.5
taels each." Translation modified from Hsu 198]: 232-3. For
the original text, see Wang and Zhou 1991: 421.
92. These calculations may help to explain why Wang Hui,

in the 1660s, considered a sum of 1.6 taels to be an insult-
ing payment for one of his labor-intensive handscrolls. The
evidence as regards this incident is, I think, misconstrued
by Hong-nam Kim (1989). The handscroll commissions are
known through a surviving letter by the patron, Wang Shimin,
first published by Victoria Contag.What the letter reveals is
that Wang Shimin had set Wang Hui to work on five hand-
scrolls and had wanted to pay him 8 taels for the five. Wang
Hui, furious, stopped working on the scrolls and returned
home, effectively forcing Wang Shimin to raise more money to
pay him properly. He did come back to finish the scrolls, ap-
parently on the promise of a further payment, which did not
fully meet his expectations. Kim wrongly assumes that Wang
Hui accepted the 8 taels as full payment, and goes on to use
this as the basis for an estimate of the painter's annual income
that drastically underestimates his earning capacity. Thirty
years later, when Wang Hui was widely spoken of as the great-
est painter in the empire, Gao Shiqi spent 4 taels to acquire a
handscroll, probably secondhand. Kim judges Gao Shiqi's
4-tad payment for a Wang Hui handscroll to be "a fabulous
sum," but this is unlikely unless it was a minor work. (Inci-
dentally, a secondhand handscroll by Wan Shouqi cost him
only I tad.)
93· For court artists' salaries, see Yang Boda 1991: 341-2.
94· Xue Yongnian 1991: 32.
95· On the basis of a 2-tael unit price for hanging scrolls

and a I-tael unit price for small formats.
96. DDZTHSB 4/8I.
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97. Shanghai Museum, see ST 1°7.
98. DDZTHSB 4/84-S. For a partial translation of the in-

scription, see below, Chapter 8 (section "The Functionalist
Ethic"). On the Huang Gongwang composition in question,
see Xu Bangda I984a: vol. 2, 72-6.
99. Xiang Yin, flam Yizheng (ancestral home Shexian). My

thanks to Wang Shiqing for this identification. Xiang was re-
lated to the former official and painter Qiao Lai (1642-94),
from the Baoying Qiao family (see DDZTHSB 4/81-2). He
must have been a man of some considerable means, since he
was the publisher of several works, including editions of the
Shuijing zhu and rhe Shanhai jing, poetry by the Tang poets
Wang Wei (Wang Moji ji) and Wei Yingwu (Wei Suzhou ji), an
eight-volume work on clerical script calligraphy by a contem-
porary writer, Gu Ai (Li bian) (for the above, see YZFZ 3SI
18a), and a collection of poetry by the remnant subject Huang
Kui (YZFZ 331r6a). Xiang later served as prefect of Yan'an in
Shenxi (see LHYFZ 1748: 36/qb). Shitao dedicated a poem
to him in 1697 (Ming and Qing Painting from the Guangzhou
Art Gallery, 1986, cat. no. 38), and in 1699 at Dadi Tang,
Xiang identified an anonymous plum-blossom painting that
Shitao had inscribed as the work of his relative, Qiao Lai.
100. Wang Maolin 1979: Islrla-I3b (in 1671).
101. This practice is described in great detail in the mid-

eighteenth-century novel The Dream of the Red Chamber
(Hong/ou meng), or The Story of the Stone (Shitou ji) by Cao
Xueqin.
102. Fan Lai, cited by Hsi 1972: 167. Hsi notes that "when

Fan Hao retired from business ... his life became much sim-
pler and his household staff was greatly reduced" (169).
103. For Cheng Daoguang's names (zi Daixi, hao Tuifu)

and biographical information, see Li Lin 1708: 18h17. The
circle of friends is documented by numerous texts in the same
source. Another possible candidate is a certain Wu Tuizhai,
who accompanied Shirao on an outing to the site of Zhuxi Pa-
vilion (see Figure II) in 17°1, along with Huang You and one
of Shitao's students, Wang Jueshi. Unfortunately, nothing more
is known about this individual.
104. Cheng Daoguang is here identified as Tuilao.
105. In his preface to a posthumous collection of Huang

You's poetry, Huang jixian identifies Huang You as a relative
of his grandfather's generation and Cheng Daoguang as his el-
der sister's husband. See Jiao Xun 1992: 690-1. In addition to
the patronage of painting, one might note that Huang Jixian
contributed 30 taels toward printing Li Lin's collected works.
ro6. YZFZ 31/30b-JIa.
ro7· Ibid. 3I/JIa-b.
108. Jin Xingyao 1989: 226-30.
109. Li Lin 1708: Preface.
110. Cheng contributed a colophon to Shitao's portrait of

Huang You, Crossing the Ridge (see Figure 33), and a preface
to Wang Zhonglu's Xizhai ji.
III. See Kohara Hironobu 1990, fig. 29, for the painting.

On the 1662 Red Bridge gathering, see Meyer-Fang 1998. FOI
Huang's friendship with Wang Shizhen, see Jiao Xun 1992:
69°·
112. Su Pi (zi Yimen) was one of Shitao's companions in the

outing represented in Drunk in Autumn Woods. See above,
the section "The Staging of Literati Life" in Chapter 2. "Ruo-
lao," Old Ruo, may be one of the participants in the exchange

from Shadows of Secret Dreams (Zhang Chao, 1991) cited
at the head of this section, Li Ruojin (Li Gan, 1626-?), who
belonged to the same family as Li Lin.
II3· On the Anwan album, see Sen-oku hakko kan: Chu-

goku kaiga. sho 1981: cat. no. 15.
114. For a letter to his physician, Yujun, see Appendix 2,

letter 25.
115· Cahill 1994. See, for example, Shitao's 1705 calligra-

phy executed following the gift of a Ming imperial porcelain-
handled writing brush (Edwards 1967: cat. no. 34).
116. For a list of the relevant inscriptions, see SLW 211 n.

97. For the illness in the early summer of 1699, see a painting
inscription recorded in Fu Baoshi 1948: 87.
117· "On a spring day in the year jimao [1699], amid wind

and rain, I took pleasure in the fact that no visitors had come."
Inscription to a landscape fan in the collection of the Metro-
politan Museum of Art. See also the inscription to the Land-
scapes Painted during Leisure from lliness, 17°1, in Fu and
Fu 1973: 244, 2S4-
118. See ibid.: 244,254. For a longer excerpt from the in-

scription, see the end of this section.
119. For a negative view of this development in Yangzhou

painting from Shitao and Zha Shibiao onward, see Cahill
199°·
120. In Shitao's time, the term xieyi did not yet have its lat-

er implication of free, gestural execution; rather, it was applied
more widely to abbreviated images of all sorts, even ones that
were painstakingly painted.
121. Whereabouts unknown, reproduced in Shitao heshang

lanzhu ce (n.p., n.d.), Central Academy of Fine Arts Library,
Beijing.
I22. Yangzhou painters had long used analogous strate-

gies: At the end of the Ming dynasty, for example, the impov-
erished Yangzhou artist Zhang Qi (zi Zhengfu, 157S-1648)
"daily accompanied in leisure the shidaifu worthies of the pre-
fecture. These gentleman brought along singing girls and wit-
ty guests, and as they drank poked fun at each other. Once
[Zhang] was tipsy he sang songs and chanted poems, or took
up a brush and painted figures, grasses and trees, and insects
and fish, all bold and free [xiaosa] with unusual accomplish-
ment. Those who liked them competed in taking out money
to request them; their requests were immediately granted, and
when he received the money he went back to drinking, submis-
sive and comented." Wang Maolin 1979: 5!I6a, and see also
Jiao Xun 1992: 81r7b-20a. For decades before Shitao setded
in Yangzhou, Zha Shibiao had been a master of extemporane-
ous xiaosa painting. When Wang Shidan, a younger relative
of Wang Zhongru and Wang Xiru, visited the studio of Gu Fu-
zhen, Shitao's contemporaty, Gu obligingly turned out a work
in the Mi style - which, among the narrow range of modes of
this very careful painter, was probably the one best suited to
extemporary painting. Although one suspects that it would
have seemed to us quite tame, nevertheless, as described by
Wang Shidan, the performance was a spectacular event. Wang
Shidan 1979: 2/4a fl.
123. Fraser 1989.
124. See also SLW 480-7.
125. See also ibid., 487-9. The recipient, Wu Qipeng, zi

Yunyi, was a "nephew" of Wu Qi, as seen from a poem by the
latter dedicated to him (1982: 20/33a).

126. Sotheby's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings and Cal-
ligraphy, 23 March 1998, lot IS.
127. Hua pu (Shirao 1962a), Chapter Fourteen, "The Sea-

sons."
I28. See Fu and Fu 1973: 244, 2S4, for the album leaf and

a discussion.
129. According to the Xinghua xianzhi (1970 reprint), Wu

Xiangfeng, who contributed a colophon to Shitao's Orchids
for Hong Zhengzhi, studied painting with Lan Ying when Lan
stayed at his family's home. Gong Xian's close follower, Lu
Qian, who later became a Qing official, probably studied with
Gong in Yangzhou. Zha Shibiao had many students; for a list,
see Xiao Yanyi 1987: 261.
130. On this painting, of which a version is in the Palace

Museum, Beijing, see SLW 133-8; Wang Shaozun 1982.
13L See Zhongguo shufa dacheng 1995: 164-S. The two

sides of the fan appear to have been inscribed at different
dates: The two poems on one side of the fan were inscribed
in 1705, but the citations from Daoist texts on the other side
were probably transcribed some years earlier.
132. The four known paintings for Cheng Zhe (zi Shengji)

are Love of Lotuses (see Figure 109); Clouds and Mountains
without End, handscroll, recorded in Lu Xinyuan 1891:
36!Iob; Sitting on a Bridge (see Figure 106); and Landscape
Fan, 1706, reproduced in Shina nanga taisei 1935-7: vol. 8,
140. Cheng Zhe as a tribute student eventually served as de-
partmental vice magistrate (LHYFZ 1748: 32124a; Zhu Yizun
1983: 7119b-roa). For the anthology of poetry edited by
Wang Shizhen see YZFZ 3S1r8a. Cheng's own book was en-
tided Rongcha lishuo.
133· Like Cheng Zhe, Cheng Qi obtained a post as depart-

mental vice magistrate (Zhu Yizun 1983: 7119b-Ioa).
134. The plum-blossom album and landscape hanging

scroll are mentioned by Hong himself in a colophon recorded
in Pang Yuanji 197Ia: I5/I7a.
135. His continuing contacts with his two monk students,

Donglin and Gengyin, are discussed in Chapter 6 (section
"The Artist as Chan Master"); those with the Manchu Tu
Qingge, in Chapter 3 (section "The Floods of 170S").
136. Metropolitan Museum of Art. Reproduced in Fu and

Fu 1973: SO.
I37· Zhongguo gudai shuhua tumu, vol. 5, Hu: 1-3428.
138. Correspondence between Zhang Chao and Yueduan

published in Chidu oucun (Zhang Chao, compo 1780a) shows
that he used Zhang as an agent to acquire a screen by Zha Shi~
biao, as well as old paintings (Xu Wei; anonymous Yuan).
Yueduan also sent Zhang two of his own paintings on satin.
The same source contains correspondence between Zhang and
Bordu.
139· DDZTHSB 3/7I-S; SLW 670-9.
140. QXLRT] I2b-I3a.
14I. DDZTHSB 3171-9.
142. Ibid·,3/7S-7·
143. On Zha Shibiao's lavish life-style, see Jin Zhixing

199°·

SEVEN. PAINTINGS AS COMMODITIES

I. In the absence of a catalogue raisonne, and of any sys-
tematic scholarly treatment of the main groups of forgeries
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presumably mistaking qian for copper cash. The list also has
prices for calligraphy and seal carving:
Calligraphy: Small-standard (xiaokai) script: 3 raels, down

to 3 qian. Middle-sized cursive: 5 taels, down to 3 qian. Large-
character calligraphy: 5 taels, down to 5 qian.
Seal-carving: Stone: 5 qian. Bronze: I tael, 5 qian. Jade: 2

taels.
88. The fact that Wan's cheapest fan cost 0.5 raels, whereas

Wen Jia a hundred years earlier painted four fans for Xiang
Yuanbian for the same price, is one measure of the effect of
the intervening inflation on prices for painting. Letter from
Wen Jia to Xiang Yuanbian, cited by Shan Guoqiang 1992: 3-
10.
89. Lu Liuliang, Mai yiwen. Not all editions of Lu's col-

lected works include the price lists attached to this text, which
can conveniently be consulted in Huang Miaozi 1982. My
thanks to Pierre-Henri Durand for supplying me with a reprint
of Lu's full text. For his discussion of writing fees in the price
lists, see Durand 1992: 122.
90. Huang Zongyan (1616-86), who was the younger

brother of Huang Zongxi (see Huang Miaozi 1982), offered
only: "Northern School landscapes: 0.3 taels per fan." The
young Wu Zhizhen (1640-1717) offered paintings that were
either of bamboo or of flowers, plants, and perhaps birds:
"Bamboo paintings: 0.1 raels per fan. Studies from nature: 0.1
taels per fan. [The same] with color added: 0.2 taels per fan."
91. "A large hanging scroll costs 6 taels, a medium-sized

one is 4, a small scroll costs 2. [Calligraphy] coupler and
streamer are I tae! a pair, while album leaves and fans are 0.5
taels each." Translation modified from Hsu 198]: 232-3. For
the original text, see Wang and Zhou 1991: 421.
92. These calculations may help to explain why Wang Hui,

in the 1660s, considered a sum of 1.6 taels to be an insult-
ing payment for one of his labor-intensive handscrolls. The
evidence as regards this incident is, I think, misconstrued
by Hong-nam Kim (1989). The handscroll commissions are
known through a surviving letter by the patron, Wang Shimin,
first published by Victoria Contag.What the letter reveals is
that Wang Shimin had set Wang Hui to work on five hand-
scrolls and had wanted to pay him 8 taels for the five. Wang
Hui, furious, stopped working on the scrolls and returned
home, effectively forcing Wang Shimin to raise more money to
pay him properly. He did come back to finish the scrolls, ap-
parently on the promise of a further payment, which did not
fully meet his expectations. Kim wrongly assumes that Wang
Hui accepted the 8 taels as full payment, and goes on to use
this as the basis for an estimate of the painter's annual income
that drastically underestimates his earning capacity. Thirty
years later, when Wang Hui was widely spoken of as the great-
est painter in the empire, Gao Shiqi spent 4 taels to acquire a
handscroll, probably secondhand. Kim judges Gao Shiqi's
4-tad payment for a Wang Hui handscroll to be "a fabulous
sum," but this is unlikely unless it was a minor work. (Inci-
dentally, a secondhand handscroll by Wan Shouqi cost him
only I tad.)
93· For court artists' salaries, see Yang Boda 1991: 341-2.
94· Xue Yongnian 1991: 32.
95· On the basis of a 2-tael unit price for hanging scrolls

and a I-tael unit price for small formats.
96. DDZTHSB 4/8I.
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97. Shanghai Museum, see ST 1°7.
98. DDZTHSB 4/84-S. For a partial translation of the in-

scription, see below, Chapter 8 (section "The Functionalist
Ethic"). On the Huang Gongwang composition in question,
see Xu Bangda I984a: vol. 2, 72-6.
99. Xiang Yin, flam Yizheng (ancestral home Shexian). My

thanks to Wang Shiqing for this identification. Xiang was re-
lated to the former official and painter Qiao Lai (1642-94),
from the Baoying Qiao family (see DDZTHSB 4/81-2). He
must have been a man of some considerable means, since he
was the publisher of several works, including editions of the
Shuijing zhu and rhe Shanhai jing, poetry by the Tang poets
Wang Wei (Wang Moji ji) and Wei Yingwu (Wei Suzhou ji), an
eight-volume work on clerical script calligraphy by a contem-
porary writer, Gu Ai (Li bian) (for the above, see YZFZ 3SI
18a), and a collection of poetry by the remnant subject Huang
Kui (YZFZ 331r6a). Xiang later served as prefect of Yan'an in
Shenxi (see LHYFZ 1748: 36/qb). Shitao dedicated a poem
to him in 1697 (Ming and Qing Painting from the Guangzhou
Art Gallery, 1986, cat. no. 38), and in 1699 at Dadi Tang,
Xiang identified an anonymous plum-blossom painting that
Shitao had inscribed as the work of his relative, Qiao Lai.
100. Wang Maolin 1979: Islrla-I3b (in 1671).
101. This practice is described in great detail in the mid-

eighteenth-century novel The Dream of the Red Chamber
(Hong/ou meng), or The Story of the Stone (Shitou ji) by Cao
Xueqin.
102. Fan Lai, cited by Hsi 1972: 167. Hsi notes that "when

Fan Hao retired from business ... his life became much sim-
pler and his household staff was greatly reduced" (169).
103. For Cheng Daoguang's names (zi Daixi, hao Tuifu)

and biographical information, see Li Lin 1708: 18h17. The
circle of friends is documented by numerous texts in the same
source. Another possible candidate is a certain Wu Tuizhai,
who accompanied Shirao on an outing to the site of Zhuxi Pa-
vilion (see Figure II) in 17°1, along with Huang You and one
of Shitao's students, Wang Jueshi. Unfortunately, nothing more
is known about this individual.
104. Cheng Daoguang is here identified as Tuilao.
105. In his preface to a posthumous collection of Huang

You's poetry, Huang jixian identifies Huang You as a relative
of his grandfather's generation and Cheng Daoguang as his el-
der sister's husband. See Jiao Xun 1992: 690-1. In addition to
the patronage of painting, one might note that Huang Jixian
contributed 30 taels toward printing Li Lin's collected works.
ro6. YZFZ 31/30b-JIa.
ro7· Ibid. 3I/JIa-b.
108. Jin Xingyao 1989: 226-30.
109. Li Lin 1708: Preface.
110. Cheng contributed a colophon to Shitao's portrait of

Huang You, Crossing the Ridge (see Figure 33), and a preface
to Wang Zhonglu's Xizhai ji.
III. See Kohara Hironobu 1990, fig. 29, for the painting.

On the 1662 Red Bridge gathering, see Meyer-Fang 1998. FOI
Huang's friendship with Wang Shizhen, see Jiao Xun 1992:
69°·
112. Su Pi (zi Yimen) was one of Shitao's companions in the

outing represented in Drunk in Autumn Woods. See above,
the section "The Staging of Literati Life" in Chapter 2. "Ruo-
lao," Old Ruo, may be one of the participants in the exchange

from Shadows of Secret Dreams (Zhang Chao, 1991) cited
at the head of this section, Li Ruojin (Li Gan, 1626-?), who
belonged to the same family as Li Lin.
II3· On the Anwan album, see Sen-oku hakko kan: Chu-

goku kaiga. sho 1981: cat. no. 15.
114. For a letter to his physician, Yujun, see Appendix 2,

letter 25.
115· Cahill 1994. See, for example, Shitao's 1705 calligra-

phy executed following the gift of a Ming imperial porcelain-
handled writing brush (Edwards 1967: cat. no. 34).
116. For a list of the relevant inscriptions, see SLW 211 n.

97. For the illness in the early summer of 1699, see a painting
inscription recorded in Fu Baoshi 1948: 87.
117· "On a spring day in the year jimao [1699], amid wind

and rain, I took pleasure in the fact that no visitors had come."
Inscription to a landscape fan in the collection of the Metro-
politan Museum of Art. See also the inscription to the Land-
scapes Painted during Leisure from lliness, 17°1, in Fu and
Fu 1973: 244, 2S4-
118. See ibid.: 244,254. For a longer excerpt from the in-

scription, see the end of this section.
119. For a negative view of this development in Yangzhou

painting from Shitao and Zha Shibiao onward, see Cahill
199°·
120. In Shitao's time, the term xieyi did not yet have its lat-

er implication of free, gestural execution; rather, it was applied
more widely to abbreviated images of all sorts, even ones that
were painstakingly painted.
121. Whereabouts unknown, reproduced in Shitao heshang

lanzhu ce (n.p., n.d.), Central Academy of Fine Arts Library,
Beijing.
I22. Yangzhou painters had long used analogous strate-

gies: At the end of the Ming dynasty, for example, the impov-
erished Yangzhou artist Zhang Qi (zi Zhengfu, 157S-1648)
"daily accompanied in leisure the shidaifu worthies of the pre-
fecture. These gentleman brought along singing girls and wit-
ty guests, and as they drank poked fun at each other. Once
[Zhang] was tipsy he sang songs and chanted poems, or took
up a brush and painted figures, grasses and trees, and insects
and fish, all bold and free [xiaosa] with unusual accomplish-
ment. Those who liked them competed in taking out money
to request them; their requests were immediately granted, and
when he received the money he went back to drinking, submis-
sive and comented." Wang Maolin 1979: 5!I6a, and see also
Jiao Xun 1992: 81r7b-20a. For decades before Shitao setded
in Yangzhou, Zha Shibiao had been a master of extemporane-
ous xiaosa painting. When Wang Shidan, a younger relative
of Wang Zhongru and Wang Xiru, visited the studio of Gu Fu-
zhen, Shitao's contemporaty, Gu obligingly turned out a work
in the Mi style - which, among the narrow range of modes of
this very careful painter, was probably the one best suited to
extemporary painting. Although one suspects that it would
have seemed to us quite tame, nevertheless, as described by
Wang Shidan, the performance was a spectacular event. Wang
Shidan 1979: 2/4a fl.
123. Fraser 1989.
124. See also SLW 480-7.
125. See also ibid., 487-9. The recipient, Wu Qipeng, zi

Yunyi, was a "nephew" of Wu Qi, as seen from a poem by the
latter dedicated to him (1982: 20/33a).

126. Sotheby's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings and Cal-
ligraphy, 23 March 1998, lot IS.
127. Hua pu (Shirao 1962a), Chapter Fourteen, "The Sea-

sons."
I28. See Fu and Fu 1973: 244, 2S4, for the album leaf and

a discussion.
129. According to the Xinghua xianzhi (1970 reprint), Wu

Xiangfeng, who contributed a colophon to Shitao's Orchids
for Hong Zhengzhi, studied painting with Lan Ying when Lan
stayed at his family's home. Gong Xian's close follower, Lu
Qian, who later became a Qing official, probably studied with
Gong in Yangzhou. Zha Shibiao had many students; for a list,
see Xiao Yanyi 1987: 261.
130. On this painting, of which a version is in the Palace

Museum, Beijing, see SLW 133-8; Wang Shaozun 1982.
13L See Zhongguo shufa dacheng 1995: 164-S. The two

sides of the fan appear to have been inscribed at different
dates: The two poems on one side of the fan were inscribed
in 1705, but the citations from Daoist texts on the other side
were probably transcribed some years earlier.
132. The four known paintings for Cheng Zhe (zi Shengji)

are Love of Lotuses (see Figure 109); Clouds and Mountains
without End, handscroll, recorded in Lu Xinyuan 1891:
36!Iob; Sitting on a Bridge (see Figure 106); and Landscape
Fan, 1706, reproduced in Shina nanga taisei 1935-7: vol. 8,
140. Cheng Zhe as a tribute student eventually served as de-
partmental vice magistrate (LHYFZ 1748: 32124a; Zhu Yizun
1983: 7119b-roa). For the anthology of poetry edited by
Wang Shizhen see YZFZ 3S1r8a. Cheng's own book was en-
tided Rongcha lishuo.
133· Like Cheng Zhe, Cheng Qi obtained a post as depart-

mental vice magistrate (Zhu Yizun 1983: 7119b-Ioa).
134. The plum-blossom album and landscape hanging

scroll are mentioned by Hong himself in a colophon recorded
in Pang Yuanji 197Ia: I5/I7a.
135. His continuing contacts with his two monk students,

Donglin and Gengyin, are discussed in Chapter 6 (section
"The Artist as Chan Master"); those with the Manchu Tu
Qingge, in Chapter 3 (section "The Floods of 170S").
136. Metropolitan Museum of Art. Reproduced in Fu and

Fu 1973: SO.
I37· Zhongguo gudai shuhua tumu, vol. 5, Hu: 1-3428.
138. Correspondence between Zhang Chao and Yueduan

published in Chidu oucun (Zhang Chao, compo 1780a) shows
that he used Zhang as an agent to acquire a screen by Zha Shi~
biao, as well as old paintings (Xu Wei; anonymous Yuan).
Yueduan also sent Zhang two of his own paintings on satin.
The same source contains correspondence between Zhang and
Bordu.
139· DDZTHSB 3/7I-S; SLW 670-9.
140. QXLRT] I2b-I3a.
14I. DDZTHSB 3171-9.
142. Ibid·,3/7S-7·
143. On Zha Shibiao's lavish life-style, see Jin Zhixing

199°·

SEVEN. PAINTINGS AS COMMODITIES

I. In the absence of a catalogue raisonne, and of any sys-
tematic scholarly treatment of the main groups of forgeries
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(with the partial exception of Zhang Daqian's), any estimate
must be speculative.
2. Cahill '963, 1967; Andrews 1986; Rogers I996a,b.
3· On Xiao Chen, see YZFZ 33h4b; Sun Zhiwei '979:

wenji, 4/9bj Rogers 199Gb. For Wang Jiazhen, see Wu jiaji
1980: 2)8.
4· Wang Maclin, for example, in his Bai chi wutong ge ji

(1979), includes the texts of his colophons and poems to
some thirty or forty contemporary portraits.
5· Sun Zhiwei '979: xuji, 5II6b (in 1674), 5h5a; shiyu,

I/6a; Wang Maolin '979: I4/4b (in 1676); Vinograd I992a.
6. For Dai Cang, see Sun Zhiwei 1979: qianji, 3/r 3 b,

j/a rb, 9II8a (two references); xuji, r/zb (in 1666), 4/4a (in
167'); shiyu: 2IIb; Wang Maclin '979: I3II3b (two refer-
ences for 1674 and 1675); Wu Jiaji 1980: 91, 98 (in 1666).
7· Typical examples are Xiao Chen's designs for a 1684

guidebook to Mount Huang, and Gu Fuzhen's 1689 hand-
scroll depicting a nearby Yangzi River landscape including the
islands of Jiaoshan and Jinshan (Chou 1998: cat. no. 7).
8. See YZFZ 32/353. For Gu Fuzhen as portraitist, see Fang

Junyi 1877: 2Ih5a.
9· Zhou Lianggong discusses Zhang's workshop in Yang-

zhou in relation to another painter, Shi Lin. See Kim 1985:
vol. 2, 175-6.
10. For Zhang Gong, see Zong Yuanding 1971: 793.
II. For an album painted in Yangzhou in 1642, see Chris-

tie's Swire Hong Kong, Fine Chinese Classical Paintings and
Calligraphy, )0 October '994, no. 72. For his early Qing so-
journ, see Zong Yuanding 1971: 228-30.
12. See Cahill 1963, 1966; Murck 1991. Yuan Yao's dates

are controversial- see Barnhart 1983: 113j Chou and Brown
1985: Il7-I8. One artist working in this direction, Wang Yun
(1652-1735), left the city for the court, and eventually par-
ticipated in the team of artists who worked on the Southern
Tour project under Wang Hui's direction.
13· YZHPL 2, heading 17, also notes a painter of flowers

and plants, Tang He.
14· For Yu Yuan, zi Wanzhi, see YZHFL 2, heading 34;

Zhang Geng '963: xulu, 89.
'S· Wang Maolin '979: ]inqin ci (1676 preface), zhong-

diaolrb.
16. See, for example, Wang MaDlin's 1677 colophon to an

insect and bird album in '979: I5II)b.
'7· DDZTHSB )/72. This proud claim, it should be said,

appears in his inscription to a copy of a figure composition
known as One Hundred Beauties in a version attributed to
that most artisanal of career painters, Qiu Ying (which is dis-
cussed in Chapter 6, section "The Dadi Tang Enterprise: Stu-
dents as Patrons").
18. Zhou Lianggong '979: xialr 5/I7a.
19· Xiao Yanyi 198]: 252.
20. Ho and Delbanco 1992: )5.
21. See the landscape fan reproduced in ST 105.
22. This is a line from a poem that he inscribed, together

with others, on a 1699 hanging scroll of plum blossom in the
Shanghai Museum (ST 45) as well as a much larer album en-
tirely devoted to plum blossom (The Art Museum, Princeton
University; see Pu and Fu 1973: 294-301).
23· China Art Gallery, Beijing. Reproduced in Yiyuan duo-

ying 28 (1986): 28-33.

24· jin Zhixing '990: 494.
25· Shanghai Museum, reproduced in ST 34.
26. Christie's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings and Cal-

ligraphy, 2 June 1992, lot 75. One can see Shitao pushing the
iconography of virtue in a popular direction in the hanging
scroll Orchids and Bamboo, where he begins the inscription
with a couplet by Wang Wei. See ST 44.
27· If, as I suspect, such illustrations of Li Bai's songs were

a staple of his decorative production, this would explain why
Shitao in 17°1, writing specifically about his life as a painter
in Yangzhou, mentions that he has been happy "singing the
songs of Li Bai'' - Li Bai (hao Qinglian), after whom he named
one of his painting studios, the Qinglian Caotang (SLW 136;
Wang Shaozun '982).
28. Wang Shidan, friend and patron of Gu Fuzhen, refers

to Gu as a specialist of "planked road" and Taohua Yuan pic-
tures (1979: I2/9b-Iob).
29· QXLRT] r a-r b. The Qiao family also patronized Yu

Zhiding (Vinograd '992a: 5'-3), Gu Fuzhen (Fang Junyi
1877: 2125a), and Zha Shibiao (Xiao Yanyi 1987: 25)).
30. For the hibiscus painting, formerly in the Shanghai Mu-

seum, see ST 51.
3I. SLW 301-8.
32. One also finds this in an album of illustrations to Du

Fu's poems by Gu Fuzhen in his customary jeweled style, now
in the Shanghai Museum.
33· One album of illustrations to poems by Du Fu in the

collection of the Guangdong Provincial Museum is illustrated
in STSHQ] pis. ) 5)-3 59, and another was recently sold at
auction (Sotheby's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings and Cal-
ligraphy, 2) March 1998, lot '5). The Appendix to QXLRT]
records an album of illustrations to poems by Li Bai. Shitao's
illustrations to Song and Yuan poems may in some way be
related to a book that had recently been published with some
fanfare in Yangzhou: Wu Qi's anthology of Song, jin, and
Yuan poetry, Song ]in Yuan shiyong ()O juan). See Wu Qi
1982: 2/roa-b; Jiao Xun 1992: 772.
34· One also notes his formal calligraphic transcription of

the Daode jing, again in the booklike form of an album (see
Figure 187). The process went full circle when what was pre~
sumably originally an album~format transcription of his own
treatise on painting became the basis in 1710 for a facsimile
printed edition, Hua pu (see Figure 186).
35· For the portrait of Zhang Jingjie, see DDZTHSB 1/6-

7· For the portrait of Xiao CUD, see SLW 278-80.
36. Shitao also supplied the setting for a now-lost Portrait

of Yingfu Listening to the Sounds of Autumn. See Wang Shi-
shen's (1686-1759) later inscription in Bian Xiaoxuan, ed.
'985: 7)·
37· For the painting of Li Lin's studio, see Vinograd 1995;

for the depiction of Li Pengnian's studio, see Fu and Fu 1973:
220; and for the depiction of Wu Zhenbo's home, see Christie's
New York, Fine Chinese Paintings, Calligraphy, and Rubbings,
18 Seprember 1996, lot 189.
38. On this painting, see SLW 346-50.
39· In the Lanqian Shanguan Collection, Taiwan. The

painting is reproduced in Ishikawa Jun et a1. 1976: fig. 13.
40. See Jiang Chenying 1982: 15/rla on professional writ-

ing in Yangzhou.
41. Li Lin 1708.
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42. Formerly Christie's New York. Baoweng is the hao of
Luo Qingshan, zi Youzhang, born 1642. For the same patron,
Shitao illustrated some of the poems solicited by Cheng Sui's
uncle, the celebrated Ming official Zheng Yuanxun, to com-
memorate the yellow peonies in his Ying Yuan garden (see Fig-
ure 114).
43· For the same patron, Wu Qipeng (zi Yunyi), Shirao

painted a very fine parting painting on the occasion of his re-
turn to Huizhou in 1699 (Omura 1945: vol. 7). Above a parr-
ing scene rise the mountains of Huangshan. The Yangzhou de-
parture and Huizhou destination are thus fused within a single
image faithful to the close social relationship between the two
areas.
44· The Huizhou painter and calligrapher Wang Zhan-

ruo and Shitao's Xinghua friend Wang Xiru are two of the
Yangzhou-based calligraphers who produced copies of early
calligraphies on the basis of rubbings. For Wang Zhanruo's
calligraphic facsimiles, see Sun Zhiwei 1979: qianji: 518b,
9/roa; wenji: 2125a. Xiao Chen's copy of Li Tang's Caiwei tu
is in the collection of the Shanghai Museum. According to Wu
Rongguang, cited in Sun Dianqi, ed. 1982: 447-8, the Kangxi-
period owner of this scroll commissioned several facsimile
copies. For a superb copy by Zha Shibiao of a handscroll at-
tributed to the Song artist Mi Youren, complete down to the
colophons, see Sidney Moss, Ltd. 1991. For Zheng Min's
(16)3-83) facsimile copy of Hongren's copy of a Huang
Gongwang handscroll, see Christie's New York 1994. Shitao's
colophon to a Zheng Min facsimile of a Ni Zan painting is
recorded in DDZTHSB 4/83-4.
45· Li Lin 1708: juan '9.
46. On this painting, see Fu and Fu 1973: 256-60.
47· Appropriations were, it should be said, par for the

Course in Shitao's Yangzhou. James Cahill long ago pointed
out (1966) that an uncharacteristic landscape by Yuan Jiang,
using rounded forms and "alum dots," must be Yuan's attempt
at a "Shirao." Li Yin, for his part, tried his hand at Zha Shi~
biao's style with a Ni Zan-type river landscape on which he
declared: "I have rarely practiced Ni's old-fashioned simplic-
ity,!! leave ir to Zha Biao [sic] to build up his capital.! .... 1
If Zha gets up and sees my brushwork too lit's sure to make
both of you open your eyes!" (Li Yin, Autumn Landscape,
private collection, Japan).
48. Hashimoto collection, Shodo Museum of Art, repro-

duced in Chugoku kaiga ten '980: 59.
49· Perhaps it was in reaction to these claims by an artist

used to large-scale decorative formats that Zha Shibiao, echo-
ing Shitao, insists on the difficulty of the small-scale format:
"When painters try to capture the structure of a thousand
miles in a square foot of paper, their greatest difficulty is with
album leaves. Both the hills and valleys [i.e., the illusion] and
the brush and ink [i.e., rhe material surface] have to be equally
successful to create a harmonious result. People today who
specialize in the Six Laws [of painting] should not disregard
my words" (Hu Jitang c. 18)9: IlIsa).
50. Translation by Cahill 1963: 269.
51. For an alternative translation, see Burkus-Chasson

1996: 186.
52. In a recorded 1699 inscription, Shitao makes a com-

ment on the connoisseurship of his fellow painters that imme-
diately brings to mind Li Yin: "In fact, they have never seen
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the true appearance of the Ancients; the works they have seen
are all fakes. If they had a real work in from of them, rhey
wouldn't recognize it." DDZTHSB 4/84-5.
53· An earlier version of this argument on the similarities

between the two artists' inscriptions was presented in SLW
559-62. In a more recent discussion, Anne Burkus-Chasson,
who translates the relevant part of Shitao's inscription rather
differently, has instead stressed the differences (1996: 181).

EIGHT. THE PAINTER'S CRAFT

I. On this painting, of which a version is in the Palace Mu-
seum, Beijing, see SLW 133-8; Wang Shaozun 1982.
2. "Qingxiang had a song which he chanred east of the

Yangzi [i.e., in Anhui],/Early on four gentlemen of Xuanzhou
wasted their time [with me] (Xiao Zipei, Li Yonggong, Xu
Shangwen, Liu Xuexi)./From the temples of Qin-Huai [Nan-
jing] IThree talents emerged (Suiyuan, Donglin, Xuetian)."
Though most of the men mentioned here remain unidentified,
Donglin's name appears in the manuscript of poems that Shi-
tao presented to Zheng Hushan in 1683; many years later,
in 17°1, he would join Shitao on an outing in Yangzhou (see
the end of the section "The Artist as Chan Master" in Chap-
ter 9).
3· An album of orchids and bamboo - Tu Qingge's special-

ity - that Shitao painted for Tu a decade later at the govern-
ment hostel in Tianning Monastery in Yangzhou in 1701 was
not only an extemporaneous performance for the needs of a
social occasion, but also a demonstration work for a student.
Reproduced in Gao Yong 1926-9.
4· Chengchou Gengyin was a (Buddhist) nephew of Yuan-

zhi Poyu, the abbot of Jinghui Monastery. Today there sur-
vives a teaching album, apparently painted for Gengyin in
early 1693, which has been published independently under
the title Shitao shanshui tuyong (Japanese private collection).
There also exists a double-album leaf calligraphy commis-
sioned in the 1700S by three members of the Lu family from
Hai'an, to the east of Yangzhou, to commemorate a sutra
reading by Gengyin in the South Garden (Sotheby's New York,
Fine Chinese Paintings, 1 June 1992, lot 57). He would later
take over the Ciyun Retreat in Yangzhou (Mingfu 1979: 159-
60), whose Pavilion of the Twin Purities Shitao depicted in a
handscroll of the 1700S now in the Palace Museum, Beijing
(Xu Bangda, ed. I984b: 772-3). See also QXLRT] IIb for an
outing to Pingshan Tang in Gengyin's company.
5· Shitao also painted two fine landscape fans for this stu~

dent, and when Wu needed an important painting as a gift for
his mother it was naturally to Shirao that he turned: Lake Po-
yang Seen from Mount Lu, fan, 1700, Shanghai Museum (ST
ID5); landscape fan, 1705 (Rao Zongyi '975, pis. 1-2); Aus-
picious Orchid, hanging sctoll, 1699, recorded in DDZTHSB
2/55.
6. Wang Shuxia was the recipient of a calligraphy hand-

scroll, collection unknown, reproduced in LiYeshuang 1973:
'56-7.
7. Li Lin (1708: 15/85) recounts that Shirao introduced to

him a young poet resident in Yangzhou named Wu Ai (zi ]iren)
from a Xi'nan family who wanted Li Lin to write a preface for
a collection of poems. Li Lin describes Wu Ai as a long-time
student of Shitao. On Wu Ai, see Wang Shiqing 1987: 100-1I.



NOTES TO PP. 178-91

(with the partial exception of Zhang Daqian's), any estimate
must be speculative.
2. Cahill '963, 1967; Andrews 1986; Rogers I996a,b.
3· On Xiao Chen, see YZFZ 33h4b; Sun Zhiwei '979:

wenji, 4/9bj Rogers 199Gb. For Wang Jiazhen, see Wu jiaji
1980: 2)8.
4· Wang Maclin, for example, in his Bai chi wutong ge ji

(1979), includes the texts of his colophons and poems to
some thirty or forty contemporary portraits.
5· Sun Zhiwei '979: xuji, 5II6b (in 1674), 5h5a; shiyu,

I/6a; Wang Maolin '979: I4/4b (in 1676); Vinograd I992a.
6. For Dai Cang, see Sun Zhiwei 1979: qianji, 3/r 3 b,

j/a rb, 9II8a (two references); xuji, r/zb (in 1666), 4/4a (in
167'); shiyu: 2IIb; Wang Maclin '979: I3II3b (two refer-
ences for 1674 and 1675); Wu Jiaji 1980: 91, 98 (in 1666).
7· Typical examples are Xiao Chen's designs for a 1684

guidebook to Mount Huang, and Gu Fuzhen's 1689 hand-
scroll depicting a nearby Yangzi River landscape including the
islands of Jiaoshan and Jinshan (Chou 1998: cat. no. 7).
8. See YZFZ 32/353. For Gu Fuzhen as portraitist, see Fang

Junyi 1877: 2Ih5a.
9· Zhou Lianggong discusses Zhang's workshop in Yang-

zhou in relation to another painter, Shi Lin. See Kim 1985:
vol. 2, 175-6.
10. For Zhang Gong, see Zong Yuanding 1971: 793.
II. For an album painted in Yangzhou in 1642, see Chris-

tie's Swire Hong Kong, Fine Chinese Classical Paintings and
Calligraphy, )0 October '994, no. 72. For his early Qing so-
journ, see Zong Yuanding 1971: 228-30.
12. See Cahill 1963, 1966; Murck 1991. Yuan Yao's dates

are controversial- see Barnhart 1983: 113j Chou and Brown
1985: Il7-I8. One artist working in this direction, Wang Yun
(1652-1735), left the city for the court, and eventually par-
ticipated in the team of artists who worked on the Southern
Tour project under Wang Hui's direction.
13· YZHPL 2, heading 17, also notes a painter of flowers

and plants, Tang He.
14· For Yu Yuan, zi Wanzhi, see YZHFL 2, heading 34;

Zhang Geng '963: xulu, 89.
'S· Wang Maolin '979: ]inqin ci (1676 preface), zhong-

diaolrb.
16. See, for example, Wang MaDlin's 1677 colophon to an

insect and bird album in '979: I5II)b.
'7· DDZTHSB )/72. This proud claim, it should be said,

appears in his inscription to a copy of a figure composition
known as One Hundred Beauties in a version attributed to
that most artisanal of career painters, Qiu Ying (which is dis-
cussed in Chapter 6, section "The Dadi Tang Enterprise: Stu-
dents as Patrons").
18. Zhou Lianggong '979: xialr 5/I7a.
19· Xiao Yanyi 198]: 252.
20. Ho and Delbanco 1992: )5.
21. See the landscape fan reproduced in ST 105.
22. This is a line from a poem that he inscribed, together

with others, on a 1699 hanging scroll of plum blossom in the
Shanghai Museum (ST 45) as well as a much larer album en-
tirely devoted to plum blossom (The Art Museum, Princeton
University; see Pu and Fu 1973: 294-301).
23· China Art Gallery, Beijing. Reproduced in Yiyuan duo-

ying 28 (1986): 28-33.

24· jin Zhixing '990: 494.
25· Shanghai Museum, reproduced in ST 34.
26. Christie's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings and Cal-

ligraphy, 2 June 1992, lot 75. One can see Shitao pushing the
iconography of virtue in a popular direction in the hanging
scroll Orchids and Bamboo, where he begins the inscription
with a couplet by Wang Wei. See ST 44.
27· If, as I suspect, such illustrations of Li Bai's songs were

a staple of his decorative production, this would explain why
Shitao in 17°1, writing specifically about his life as a painter
in Yangzhou, mentions that he has been happy "singing the
songs of Li Bai'' - Li Bai (hao Qinglian), after whom he named
one of his painting studios, the Qinglian Caotang (SLW 136;
Wang Shaozun '982).
28. Wang Shidan, friend and patron of Gu Fuzhen, refers

to Gu as a specialist of "planked road" and Taohua Yuan pic-
tures (1979: I2/9b-Iob).
29· QXLRT] r a-r b. The Qiao family also patronized Yu

Zhiding (Vinograd '992a: 5'-3), Gu Fuzhen (Fang Junyi
1877: 2125a), and Zha Shibiao (Xiao Yanyi 1987: 25)).
30. For the hibiscus painting, formerly in the Shanghai Mu-

seum, see ST 51.
3I. SLW 301-8.
32. One also finds this in an album of illustrations to Du

Fu's poems by Gu Fuzhen in his customary jeweled style, now
in the Shanghai Museum.
33· One album of illustrations to poems by Du Fu in the

collection of the Guangdong Provincial Museum is illustrated
in STSHQ] pis. ) 5)-3 59, and another was recently sold at
auction (Sotheby's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings and Cal-
ligraphy, 2) March 1998, lot '5). The Appendix to QXLRT]
records an album of illustrations to poems by Li Bai. Shitao's
illustrations to Song and Yuan poems may in some way be
related to a book that had recently been published with some
fanfare in Yangzhou: Wu Qi's anthology of Song, jin, and
Yuan poetry, Song ]in Yuan shiyong ()O juan). See Wu Qi
1982: 2/roa-b; Jiao Xun 1992: 772.
34· One also notes his formal calligraphic transcription of

the Daode jing, again in the booklike form of an album (see
Figure 187). The process went full circle when what was pre~
sumably originally an album~format transcription of his own
treatise on painting became the basis in 1710 for a facsimile
printed edition, Hua pu (see Figure 186).
35· For the portrait of Zhang Jingjie, see DDZTHSB 1/6-

7· For the portrait of Xiao CUD, see SLW 278-80.
36. Shitao also supplied the setting for a now-lost Portrait

of Yingfu Listening to the Sounds of Autumn. See Wang Shi-
shen's (1686-1759) later inscription in Bian Xiaoxuan, ed.
'985: 7)·
37· For the painting of Li Lin's studio, see Vinograd 1995;

for the depiction of Li Pengnian's studio, see Fu and Fu 1973:
220; and for the depiction of Wu Zhenbo's home, see Christie's
New York, Fine Chinese Paintings, Calligraphy, and Rubbings,
18 Seprember 1996, lot 189.
38. On this painting, see SLW 346-50.
39· In the Lanqian Shanguan Collection, Taiwan. The

painting is reproduced in Ishikawa Jun et a1. 1976: fig. 13.
40. See Jiang Chenying 1982: 15/rla on professional writ-

ing in Yangzhou.
41. Li Lin 1708.
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42. Formerly Christie's New York. Baoweng is the hao of
Luo Qingshan, zi Youzhang, born 1642. For the same patron,
Shitao illustrated some of the poems solicited by Cheng Sui's
uncle, the celebrated Ming official Zheng Yuanxun, to com-
memorate the yellow peonies in his Ying Yuan garden (see Fig-
ure 114).
43· For the same patron, Wu Qipeng (zi Yunyi), Shirao

painted a very fine parting painting on the occasion of his re-
turn to Huizhou in 1699 (Omura 1945: vol. 7). Above a parr-
ing scene rise the mountains of Huangshan. The Yangzhou de-
parture and Huizhou destination are thus fused within a single
image faithful to the close social relationship between the two
areas.
44· The Huizhou painter and calligrapher Wang Zhan-

ruo and Shitao's Xinghua friend Wang Xiru are two of the
Yangzhou-based calligraphers who produced copies of early
calligraphies on the basis of rubbings. For Wang Zhanruo's
calligraphic facsimiles, see Sun Zhiwei 1979: qianji: 518b,
9/roa; wenji: 2125a. Xiao Chen's copy of Li Tang's Caiwei tu
is in the collection of the Shanghai Museum. According to Wu
Rongguang, cited in Sun Dianqi, ed. 1982: 447-8, the Kangxi-
period owner of this scroll commissioned several facsimile
copies. For a superb copy by Zha Shibiao of a handscroll at-
tributed to the Song artist Mi Youren, complete down to the
colophons, see Sidney Moss, Ltd. 1991. For Zheng Min's
(16)3-83) facsimile copy of Hongren's copy of a Huang
Gongwang handscroll, see Christie's New York 1994. Shitao's
colophon to a Zheng Min facsimile of a Ni Zan painting is
recorded in DDZTHSB 4/83-4.
45· Li Lin 1708: juan '9.
46. On this painting, see Fu and Fu 1973: 256-60.
47· Appropriations were, it should be said, par for the

Course in Shitao's Yangzhou. James Cahill long ago pointed
out (1966) that an uncharacteristic landscape by Yuan Jiang,
using rounded forms and "alum dots," must be Yuan's attempt
at a "Shirao." Li Yin, for his part, tried his hand at Zha Shi~
biao's style with a Ni Zan-type river landscape on which he
declared: "I have rarely practiced Ni's old-fashioned simplic-
ity,!! leave ir to Zha Biao [sic] to build up his capital.! .... 1
If Zha gets up and sees my brushwork too lit's sure to make
both of you open your eyes!" (Li Yin, Autumn Landscape,
private collection, Japan).
48. Hashimoto collection, Shodo Museum of Art, repro-

duced in Chugoku kaiga ten '980: 59.
49· Perhaps it was in reaction to these claims by an artist

used to large-scale decorative formats that Zha Shibiao, echo-
ing Shitao, insists on the difficulty of the small-scale format:
"When painters try to capture the structure of a thousand
miles in a square foot of paper, their greatest difficulty is with
album leaves. Both the hills and valleys [i.e., the illusion] and
the brush and ink [i.e., rhe material surface] have to be equally
successful to create a harmonious result. People today who
specialize in the Six Laws [of painting] should not disregard
my words" (Hu Jitang c. 18)9: IlIsa).
50. Translation by Cahill 1963: 269.
51. For an alternative translation, see Burkus-Chasson

1996: 186.
52. In a recorded 1699 inscription, Shitao makes a com-

ment on the connoisseurship of his fellow painters that imme-
diately brings to mind Li Yin: "In fact, they have never seen
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the true appearance of the Ancients; the works they have seen
are all fakes. If they had a real work in from of them, rhey
wouldn't recognize it." DDZTHSB 4/84-5.
53· An earlier version of this argument on the similarities

between the two artists' inscriptions was presented in SLW
559-62. In a more recent discussion, Anne Burkus-Chasson,
who translates the relevant part of Shitao's inscription rather
differently, has instead stressed the differences (1996: 181).

EIGHT. THE PAINTER'S CRAFT

I. On this painting, of which a version is in the Palace Mu-
seum, Beijing, see SLW 133-8; Wang Shaozun 1982.
2. "Qingxiang had a song which he chanred east of the

Yangzi [i.e., in Anhui],/Early on four gentlemen of Xuanzhou
wasted their time [with me] (Xiao Zipei, Li Yonggong, Xu
Shangwen, Liu Xuexi)./From the temples of Qin-Huai [Nan-
jing] IThree talents emerged (Suiyuan, Donglin, Xuetian)."
Though most of the men mentioned here remain unidentified,
Donglin's name appears in the manuscript of poems that Shi-
tao presented to Zheng Hushan in 1683; many years later,
in 17°1, he would join Shitao on an outing in Yangzhou (see
the end of the section "The Artist as Chan Master" in Chap-
ter 9).
3· An album of orchids and bamboo - Tu Qingge's special-

ity - that Shitao painted for Tu a decade later at the govern-
ment hostel in Tianning Monastery in Yangzhou in 1701 was
not only an extemporaneous performance for the needs of a
social occasion, but also a demonstration work for a student.
Reproduced in Gao Yong 1926-9.
4· Chengchou Gengyin was a (Buddhist) nephew of Yuan-

zhi Poyu, the abbot of Jinghui Monastery. Today there sur-
vives a teaching album, apparently painted for Gengyin in
early 1693, which has been published independently under
the title Shitao shanshui tuyong (Japanese private collection).
There also exists a double-album leaf calligraphy commis-
sioned in the 1700S by three members of the Lu family from
Hai'an, to the east of Yangzhou, to commemorate a sutra
reading by Gengyin in the South Garden (Sotheby's New York,
Fine Chinese Paintings, 1 June 1992, lot 57). He would later
take over the Ciyun Retreat in Yangzhou (Mingfu 1979: 159-
60), whose Pavilion of the Twin Purities Shitao depicted in a
handscroll of the 1700S now in the Palace Museum, Beijing
(Xu Bangda, ed. I984b: 772-3). See also QXLRT] IIb for an
outing to Pingshan Tang in Gengyin's company.
5· Shitao also painted two fine landscape fans for this stu~

dent, and when Wu needed an important painting as a gift for
his mother it was naturally to Shirao that he turned: Lake Po-
yang Seen from Mount Lu, fan, 1700, Shanghai Museum (ST
ID5); landscape fan, 1705 (Rao Zongyi '975, pis. 1-2); Aus-
picious Orchid, hanging sctoll, 1699, recorded in DDZTHSB
2/55.
6. Wang Shuxia was the recipient of a calligraphy hand-

scroll, collection unknown, reproduced in LiYeshuang 1973:
'56-7.
7. Li Lin (1708: 15/85) recounts that Shirao introduced to

him a young poet resident in Yangzhou named Wu Ai (zi ]iren)
from a Xi'nan family who wanted Li Lin to write a preface for
a collection of poems. Li Lin describes Wu Ai as a long-time
student of Shitao. On Wu Ai, see Wang Shiqing 1987: 100-1I.



32. Shitao's admiration for Chen is attested by an undat-
ed colophon to one of Chen's paintings, known through a lat-
er transcription in an unpublished album in the Shanghai Mu-
seum: "'Without reading ten thousand chapters, how can one
execute paintings? Without traveling ten thousand li, how can
one compose poetry?' Thus ordinary men understand ordi-
nary principles, and say and do ordinary things, whereas men
who are out of the ordinary have insights that are out of the
ordinary. Zhanghou [Chen Hongshou] painred figures wirh
strange forms and eccentric faces. In the past, people had a
saying: 'Tears will kill a beautiful woman, laughter will kill a
ghost.' It is precisely the 'water without the ripples' [a straight
face?] that gives a flavor beyond the idea. Zhanghou is the
one who inherited the robes and begging bowl of [Wu] Daozi
and Longmian [Li Gonglin]." Cited by Zheng Wei "990: lI8.
Shirao's earliest response to Dong Qichang (whom Shitao
cites at the beginning of the above text) is a 1671 landscape
hanging scroll (Musee Guimet, see Edwards 1967: cat. no. 2).
33. For Muchen's formulation of this problem in terms of

local dialects, see Du Jiwen andWei Daoru 1993: 588. Shitao's
discussion of regional schools, quoted below, directly echoes
Muchen's text.
34. Cahill 1982a.
35. In this can be seen the influence of a certain "heroic"

interpretation of abstract expressionism on postwar studies
of Chinese painting, as well as the heritage of a late Qing and
Republican period interpretation of the Individualists as pre-
cursors of a modern iconoclastic attitude. See J. S. Hay 1994a.
36. One did not have to come from the gentry to be a lit-

erarus: Tang Yin's father was a restaurant owner. Literati sta-
tus was acquirable.
37. Dong Qichang, Huachan shi suibi.
38. I am indebted here to Craig Clunas's argument on sta-

tus anxiety with regard to the related phenomenon of literati
"tasternaking" in the late Ming. See Clunas 1991.
39. For a particularly clear example, see Lu Liuliang's "On

the Selling of One's Artistic and Literary Skills" (Mai yiwen),
to which some of the price-lists discussed in Chapter 6 are ap-
pended (Huang Miaozi 1982).
40. Sun Zhiwei "979: qianji: 5/12b-r3a.
4I. I borrow this term from Pierre Bourdieu's discussion

of the European case: "The autonomization of intellectual
and artistic production is thus correlative with the constitution
of a socially distinguishable category of professional artists or
intellectuals who are less inclined to recognize rules other than
the specifically intellectual or artistic traditions handed down
by their predecessors, which serve as a point of departure or
tupture." (1993": r12-13)·
42. See Gong Xian's famous 1669 inscription to Zhau

Lianggong's album of paintings by contemporary artists, in
Liu Haisu and Wang Daoyun, eds. 1988: vol. 1, r58-9. The
most accurate English translation of this long and important
text is Kim 1985: vol. 3, 10-11.

43. ]]ZL] 97; Paintings of the Ming and Qing Dynasties
from the Guangzhou Art Gallery, cat. no. 3 I.

44. ]]ZL] 98. Wang Ji, patton of Shitao and Yu Zhiding,
begins his poem on Hongren's grave with the words, «A hun-
dred flowering plums upon a painting master's grave." UIZLJ
169). For a contemporary description of Cheng Sui as a hua-
shi, see Cai Xingyi 1987: 269.

NOTES TO PP. 200-2 NOTES TO PP. 202-6

8. One fan in the Matsumaru Collection, Tokyo, is in-
scribed with Chapter Eight of the treatise; another in the
Shanghai Museum (see Figure 185) bearsa transcription of an
early version of Chapter One. Among the likely one-off dem-
onstration works is Clouds and Mountains (see Figure 184),
painted for an unidentified recipient during his trip to Nanjing
in 1702.
9. Following Liu's colophon in Figure 77 is a seal reading

"Liu Lang," probably alluding to the legendary Liu Chen, who
returned from a brief visit to faryland to discover that the dy-
nasty had changed. See note II for Liu's likely identity.

10. Wang Yichen, the compiler of DDZTHSB, saw a ver-
sion of the treatise at Liu's home in Guangdong. According to
Zheng Zhuolu (1961: ro8) this is noted by Wang Yicben in
his 173 I preface to the treatise'sNanjing Librarymanuscript.
II. Shitao's dedicatory leaves in these albums (discussed

below, in the section "The 1703 Albums for Mr. Liu"! iden-
tify Liu as a wealthy man. One plausible identification of Mr.
Liu (discovered at the proof-reading stage) is LiuXiting, zi or
hao Xiaoshan, National Univerity student, who, along with
Zhang Chao, was among those who helped pay for the print-
ing of a book compiled by Yueduan, Zhongxiang a (Song Lyr-
ics by Ladies), c. 1690, fascimile reprint, Shanghai: Dadong
shuju, "933: fanli/3a.

12. My argument in this section is again indebted theoret-
ically to Pierre Bourdieu (1993a,b).
13. For his studies of orchid and bamboo painting with the

former official Chen Yidao, see above, Chapter 4, n. 12. The
unidentified "Pan Xiaochi of Wuchang" is mentioned in the
appendix to his 1701 inscription listing his own students (see
below, n. 14). So, roo, is Chaoren Luzi under the name "Luzi
Ren of Zhongjiang." Chaoren Luzi was a Linji Chan master
of the thirty-sixth generation who at one point taught at
Huanggang in Hubei (WDQS, juan 92; Mingfu 1978: 173).
Liang Hong (Liang Chongci) was a seal carver and calligra-
pher as well as Buddhist layman (WDQS 49r; Mei Wending
"995: "57-8).
14. One source is the appendix to his 170I inscription to

the handscroll Account of My Feelings, which lists his own
students and states: "I think back on my friends and teachers,
people who understood painting. Starting in Xuancheng, in
our painting group there were Mei Qushan [Mei Qing], Mei
Xueping [Mei Geng], Gao Yuanhuai [Gao Yong], Cai Xiao-
yuan, LuDingsheng, WangZhichu, and Xu Banshanwho fol-
lowed the same path in poetry and painting. As for those who
g~veme advi~e separately, such as Luzi Ren of Zhongjiang,
LIangChongcl of Yunzhong, or PanXiaochi of Wuchang, how
could I enumerate them all?" (SLW 133-8; Wang Shaozun
1982). A second source is an assessment of Xuancheng mas-
ters, of uncertain date of composition, originally sent to an in-
tere~ted friend in ~uizhou and later included in a poetry man-
uscnpt c. 1693 (pnvate collection, Princeton).The poem reads
as follows: "For literature and painting/Recently the Xuan-
c.hengarea has been recognized as outstanding. /1 particularly
lIke [Xu] Banshan,lWbo splashes the ink and .. .lHe emulates
the brushstrokes of [Wang] Xizhi/[Turning out] ten thousand
just as easily as a single one./lndependent and in healthy old
age lis the untrammeled old Quyan [Mei Qingj; II also like
Xuepmgzl [Mel Geng] IWhose btush descends like the pure
bteeze.lXiaoyuan [Cai Yao] comes ftom Huangshan -/His

spirit has absorbed supernatural skills .... " Lu Hui (zi Ding-
sheng), known for his figures and flowers, and the landscapist
Cai Yao (Yuyou, Xiaoyuan) were both from Xuancheng
(Xuancheng xianzhi 1739 22/4a; Yao Wengwang c. 1979:
310-n); Wang Zhichu is still unidentified. Jiang Zhu met
Shitao when he visited Xuancheng in the 1675; see Jiang Zhu
'932: 6a-b.
15. Shitao mentions Cheng Sui and Dai Benxiao in his

1683 album of poetry and painting in the Shanghai Museum
(ST 69-70). On his friendship with Dai, see Xue Yongnian
1987. He recalls a poem presented to him by Wang Gai in the
album Wilderness Colors in the Metropolitan Museum of Art
(Fong and Fu 1973). Among the monk-painters who can be
linked to him ate Chengxue (Hu jing), who inscribed a 1680
landscape album by Shitao (STSHQ] pl. 14; on this artist, see
Rogers 1998: 48, 200; and Shuangxiao, whose album Shitao
inscribed (ST 83-4).

16. Landscapes of the Highest Class (colophons repro-
duced in Shina Nanga taisei r935-7: suppl. vol. I, pis. r58-
69), and Flowers and Figures (see Fu and Fu 1973: 186-201).
17. On Huang Kui, a sojourner in the larger Yangzhou

area who was originally from Shanyin in Zhejiang, see YZFZ
33!I6a. His writings were published (see Appendix I, n. I) by
a wealthy Yizheng friend of Shitao, Xiang Yin.
18. Sotheby's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings, 18 March

1997, no. 21. Song Cao, from Yancheng near Yangzhou, was
one of the Yangzhou-area remnant subjects nominated for the
boxue hongru examination in I679·

"9. Cat and Butterfly, hanging scroll, 1704, collabotation
among Shitao, Cheng Ming, and an artist surnamed Xie
(Christie's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings and Calligraphy,
19 September "997, lot 82).
20. It was Mr. Liu who asked Shitao in I702 to add a col-

ophon to Puhe's (1593-1683) landscape hanging scroll (Dan-
dang shuhua ji 1963: 23). For his 1696 colophon to a hand-
scroll by Hongren, see ]]ZL] 79; for his colophon to a
landscape handscroll by Zheng Min in the Shanghai Muse-
um, see Zhongguo gudai shuhua tumu (vol. 5, Hu: 1~3072);
for his inscription to a large hanging scroll of Huangshan pines
by Yizhi, a Huangshan monk-painter and follower of Xue-
zhuang, see DDZTHSB 4/84; for his inscriptions to Bada
Shanren's Narcissus handscroll (see Figure 73), see abov~,
Chaptet 5 (section "Shitao and Bada Shamen"). In 1699 Shl-
tao wrote a colophon for a copy of a Huang Gongwang com~
position by a Huizhou artist, Wang Jun (Qiujian) (DDZTHSB
4/84-5), who is identified by Zhou Lianggong in his Duhua lu
asthe teachet of Yao Ruoyi (Kim 1985: vol. 2, 160-1). A few
years later, in 1704, Shitao completed Wang's unfinished C~py
of Huang Gongwang's Fuchun Mountains handscroll, addmg
a highly informative and admiring inscription (Sotheby'sNe"":
York, Fine Chinese PaintingsJ I June 1992, lot 56. Pre-Dadl
Tang-period inscriptions and colophons for paintings by
Zheng Min and Kuncan are recotded in DDZTHSB 4/82-3;
a landscape hanging scroll by Kuncan with a Nanjing-petiod
inscription by Shitao is reproduced in Siren 1958: vol. 6,. . Wu
p. 380; a landscape hanging scroll by the HUlzhou attlst .
Youhe beating a 1688 inscription by Shitao is reproduced m
Zhongguo meishu quanji, huihua bian 1988: 9, no. 153
(Shanghai Museum); and a fan painting by Shitao of plum
blossom and bamboo in the Museum fur Ostasiatische Kunst,

Koln, bears an inscription by the artist transcribing another
inscription that he had originally written for a handscroll by
the Anhui artist Zhao Cheng (1581-1654 or later).
21. See Kim 1985, 1996.
22. Song Wan, cited by Kim 1985: vol. I, 170.
23. The artists Lan Ying (Hangzhou) and Xie Bin (from Fu-

jian, but Nanjing-based) were both involved in the compila-
tion of Tuhui baojian xuzuan. One can observe the same trans-
regional awareness in literature, in the [ate-seventeenth-century
passion for anthologizing specific kinds of contemporary writ-
ing -letters, essays, poems, biographies - by writers from all
over the country. See, for example, Zhang Chao's various pub-
lications.
24. The painter was WangJun (see above, n. 20). The colo-

phon translation appears within the section "The Functional-
ist Ethic."
25. Huang Lu was a nephew of Huang Yun. The leaf is re-

produced in Edwards 1967: 108. Translation of Shitao's in-
scription slightly modified from Fu and Fu 1973: 52-3, where
the critical terminology used by Shitao is discussed. Kuncan
(from Hubei), Cheng Zhengkui (from Hubei, 1604-76), and
Chen Shu (from the Songjiang area, still active 1687) were all
based in Nanjing. Zha Shibiao, Hongren, and Cheng Suiwere
all of Huizhou ancestry, but Zha Shibiao spent most of his
career in Yangzhou, and Cheng Sui spent most of his in Yang-
zhou and Nanjing. Bada Shanrenwas based in Nanchang, Mei
Qing in Xuancheng, but Mei Geng, being an official, was
more peripatetic.
26. Zhang Chao, preface to "Secrets of Painting" by Kong

Yanshi (son of Kong Shangrenl, in Zhang Chao, ed. 1990 (yiji,
1700): 277·
27. The Kangxi court was summoning artists at least as

early as 1667. Entries in the Tuhui baojian xuzuan (juan 2)
show that summonses in that year were a source of prestige
for three artists: Cheng Hu, Shen Shuyu, and Wang Chongjie.
So, too, was the 1671 summons to Gu Ming to paint a por-
trait of Kangxi, and an undated summons to Yang Zhimao for
the same purpose.
28. Rosenzweig 1973·
29. That Wang Yuanqi's remark also had negative implica-

tions was pointed out by Joseph Chang (Zhang Zining (988).
Note that there also exists what purports to be a Dadi Tang-
period collaboration between Shitao and Wang Yuanqi, a
hanging scroll depicting bamboo and rocks (whereabouts un-
known) that is dedicated by Shitao to Wang Shan (1645-
1728),1670 jinshiJ who in addition to a successful political ca-
reer at the capital was also an amateur painter. Wang Yuanqi
himself is one possible candidate to be the dedicatee of another
late bamboo painting in the Palace Museum, Beijing (STSHQ]
pI. 380).
30. Wang Hui commemorated his own double prominence

in the transregional and national art worlds by printing a vast
collection of the admiring words of praise that he had received
over the years, Qinghui zengyan (Wang Hui, camp. 1994)·
Naturally, the first entry is the emperor's.
31. The situation of Chinese professional painters seems

broadly comparable to that of their Renaissance-early modern
counterparts in Europe, who did their best to have the choice
between the patronage of the cities and that of the court. See
Warnke "993.



32. Shitao's admiration for Chen is attested by an undat-
ed colophon to one of Chen's paintings, known through a lat-
er transcription in an unpublished album in the Shanghai Mu-
seum: "'Without reading ten thousand chapters, how can one
execute paintings? Without traveling ten thousand li, how can
one compose poetry?' Thus ordinary men understand ordi-
nary principles, and say and do ordinary things, whereas men
who are out of the ordinary have insights that are out of the
ordinary. Zhanghou [Chen Hongshou] painred figures wirh
strange forms and eccentric faces. In the past, people had a
saying: 'Tears will kill a beautiful woman, laughter will kill a
ghost.' It is precisely the 'water without the ripples' [a straight
face?] that gives a flavor beyond the idea. Zhanghou is the
one who inherited the robes and begging bowl of [Wu] Daozi
and Longmian [Li Gonglin]." Cited by Zheng Wei "990: lI8.
Shirao's earliest response to Dong Qichang (whom Shitao
cites at the beginning of the above text) is a 1671 landscape
hanging scroll (Musee Guimet, see Edwards 1967: cat. no. 2).
33. For Muchen's formulation of this problem in terms of

local dialects, see Du Jiwen andWei Daoru 1993: 588. Shitao's
discussion of regional schools, quoted below, directly echoes
Muchen's text.
34. Cahill 1982a.
35. In this can be seen the influence of a certain "heroic"

interpretation of abstract expressionism on postwar studies
of Chinese painting, as well as the heritage of a late Qing and
Republican period interpretation of the Individualists as pre-
cursors of a modern iconoclastic attitude. See J. S. Hay 1994a.
36. One did not have to come from the gentry to be a lit-

erarus: Tang Yin's father was a restaurant owner. Literati sta-
tus was acquirable.
37. Dong Qichang, Huachan shi suibi.
38. I am indebted here to Craig Clunas's argument on sta-

tus anxiety with regard to the related phenomenon of literati
"tasternaking" in the late Ming. See Clunas 1991.
39. For a particularly clear example, see Lu Liuliang's "On

the Selling of One's Artistic and Literary Skills" (Mai yiwen),
to which some of the price-lists discussed in Chapter 6 are ap-
pended (Huang Miaozi 1982).
40. Sun Zhiwei "979: qianji: 5/12b-r3a.
4I. I borrow this term from Pierre Bourdieu's discussion

of the European case: "The autonomization of intellectual
and artistic production is thus correlative with the constitution
of a socially distinguishable category of professional artists or
intellectuals who are less inclined to recognize rules other than
the specifically intellectual or artistic traditions handed down
by their predecessors, which serve as a point of departure or
tupture." (1993": r12-13)·
42. See Gong Xian's famous 1669 inscription to Zhau

Lianggong's album of paintings by contemporary artists, in
Liu Haisu and Wang Daoyun, eds. 1988: vol. 1, r58-9. The
most accurate English translation of this long and important
text is Kim 1985: vol. 3, 10-11.

43. ]]ZL] 97; Paintings of the Ming and Qing Dynasties
from the Guangzhou Art Gallery, cat. no. 3 I.

44. ]]ZL] 98. Wang Ji, patton of Shitao and Yu Zhiding,
begins his poem on Hongren's grave with the words, «A hun-
dred flowering plums upon a painting master's grave." UIZLJ
169). For a contemporary description of Cheng Sui as a hua-
shi, see Cai Xingyi 1987: 269.
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8. One fan in the Matsumaru Collection, Tokyo, is in-
scribed with Chapter Eight of the treatise; another in the
Shanghai Museum (see Figure 185) bearsa transcription of an
early version of Chapter One. Among the likely one-off dem-
onstration works is Clouds and Mountains (see Figure 184),
painted for an unidentified recipient during his trip to Nanjing
in 1702.
9. Following Liu's colophon in Figure 77 is a seal reading

"Liu Lang," probably alluding to the legendary Liu Chen, who
returned from a brief visit to faryland to discover that the dy-
nasty had changed. See note II for Liu's likely identity.

10. Wang Yichen, the compiler of DDZTHSB, saw a ver-
sion of the treatise at Liu's home in Guangdong. According to
Zheng Zhuolu (1961: ro8) this is noted by Wang Yicben in
his 173 I preface to the treatise'sNanjing Librarymanuscript.
II. Shitao's dedicatory leaves in these albums (discussed

below, in the section "The 1703 Albums for Mr. Liu"! iden-
tify Liu as a wealthy man. One plausible identification of Mr.
Liu (discovered at the proof-reading stage) is LiuXiting, zi or
hao Xiaoshan, National Univerity student, who, along with
Zhang Chao, was among those who helped pay for the print-
ing of a book compiled by Yueduan, Zhongxiang a (Song Lyr-
ics by Ladies), c. 1690, fascimile reprint, Shanghai: Dadong
shuju, "933: fanli/3a.

12. My argument in this section is again indebted theoret-
ically to Pierre Bourdieu (1993a,b).
13. For his studies of orchid and bamboo painting with the

former official Chen Yidao, see above, Chapter 4, n. 12. The
unidentified "Pan Xiaochi of Wuchang" is mentioned in the
appendix to his 1701 inscription listing his own students (see
below, n. 14). So, roo, is Chaoren Luzi under the name "Luzi
Ren of Zhongjiang." Chaoren Luzi was a Linji Chan master
of the thirty-sixth generation who at one point taught at
Huanggang in Hubei (WDQS, juan 92; Mingfu 1978: 173).
Liang Hong (Liang Chongci) was a seal carver and calligra-
pher as well as Buddhist layman (WDQS 49r; Mei Wending
"995: "57-8).
14. One source is the appendix to his 170I inscription to

the handscroll Account of My Feelings, which lists his own
students and states: "I think back on my friends and teachers,
people who understood painting. Starting in Xuancheng, in
our painting group there were Mei Qushan [Mei Qing], Mei
Xueping [Mei Geng], Gao Yuanhuai [Gao Yong], Cai Xiao-
yuan, LuDingsheng, WangZhichu, and Xu Banshanwho fol-
lowed the same path in poetry and painting. As for those who
g~veme advi~e separately, such as Luzi Ren of Zhongjiang,
LIangChongcl of Yunzhong, or PanXiaochi of Wuchang, how
could I enumerate them all?" (SLW 133-8; Wang Shaozun
1982). A second source is an assessment of Xuancheng mas-
ters, of uncertain date of composition, originally sent to an in-
tere~ted friend in ~uizhou and later included in a poetry man-
uscnpt c. 1693 (pnvate collection, Princeton).The poem reads
as follows: "For literature and painting/Recently the Xuan-
c.hengarea has been recognized as outstanding. /1 particularly
lIke [Xu] Banshan,lWbo splashes the ink and .. .lHe emulates
the brushstrokes of [Wang] Xizhi/[Turning out] ten thousand
just as easily as a single one./lndependent and in healthy old
age lis the untrammeled old Quyan [Mei Qingj; II also like
Xuepmgzl [Mel Geng] IWhose btush descends like the pure
bteeze.lXiaoyuan [Cai Yao] comes ftom Huangshan -/His

spirit has absorbed supernatural skills .... " Lu Hui (zi Ding-
sheng), known for his figures and flowers, and the landscapist
Cai Yao (Yuyou, Xiaoyuan) were both from Xuancheng
(Xuancheng xianzhi 1739 22/4a; Yao Wengwang c. 1979:
310-n); Wang Zhichu is still unidentified. Jiang Zhu met
Shitao when he visited Xuancheng in the 1675; see Jiang Zhu
'932: 6a-b.
15. Shitao mentions Cheng Sui and Dai Benxiao in his

1683 album of poetry and painting in the Shanghai Museum
(ST 69-70). On his friendship with Dai, see Xue Yongnian
1987. He recalls a poem presented to him by Wang Gai in the
album Wilderness Colors in the Metropolitan Museum of Art
(Fong and Fu 1973). Among the monk-painters who can be
linked to him ate Chengxue (Hu jing), who inscribed a 1680
landscape album by Shitao (STSHQ] pl. 14; on this artist, see
Rogers 1998: 48, 200; and Shuangxiao, whose album Shitao
inscribed (ST 83-4).

16. Landscapes of the Highest Class (colophons repro-
duced in Shina Nanga taisei r935-7: suppl. vol. I, pis. r58-
69), and Flowers and Figures (see Fu and Fu 1973: 186-201).
17. On Huang Kui, a sojourner in the larger Yangzhou

area who was originally from Shanyin in Zhejiang, see YZFZ
33!I6a. His writings were published (see Appendix I, n. I) by
a wealthy Yizheng friend of Shitao, Xiang Yin.
18. Sotheby's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings, 18 March

1997, no. 21. Song Cao, from Yancheng near Yangzhou, was
one of the Yangzhou-area remnant subjects nominated for the
boxue hongru examination in I679·

"9. Cat and Butterfly, hanging scroll, 1704, collabotation
among Shitao, Cheng Ming, and an artist surnamed Xie
(Christie's New York, Fine Chinese Paintings and Calligraphy,
19 September "997, lot 82).
20. It was Mr. Liu who asked Shitao in I702 to add a col-

ophon to Puhe's (1593-1683) landscape hanging scroll (Dan-
dang shuhua ji 1963: 23). For his 1696 colophon to a hand-
scroll by Hongren, see ]]ZL] 79; for his colophon to a
landscape handscroll by Zheng Min in the Shanghai Muse-
um, see Zhongguo gudai shuhua tumu (vol. 5, Hu: 1~3072);
for his inscription to a large hanging scroll of Huangshan pines
by Yizhi, a Huangshan monk-painter and follower of Xue-
zhuang, see DDZTHSB 4/84; for his inscriptions to Bada
Shanren's Narcissus handscroll (see Figure 73), see abov~,
Chaptet 5 (section "Shitao and Bada Shamen"). In 1699 Shl-
tao wrote a colophon for a copy of a Huang Gongwang com~
position by a Huizhou artist, Wang Jun (Qiujian) (DDZTHSB
4/84-5), who is identified by Zhou Lianggong in his Duhua lu
asthe teachet of Yao Ruoyi (Kim 1985: vol. 2, 160-1). A few
years later, in 1704, Shitao completed Wang's unfinished C~py
of Huang Gongwang's Fuchun Mountains handscroll, addmg
a highly informative and admiring inscription (Sotheby'sNe"":
York, Fine Chinese PaintingsJ I June 1992, lot 56. Pre-Dadl
Tang-period inscriptions and colophons for paintings by
Zheng Min and Kuncan are recotded in DDZTHSB 4/82-3;
a landscape hanging scroll by Kuncan with a Nanjing-petiod
inscription by Shitao is reproduced in Siren 1958: vol. 6,. . Wu
p. 380; a landscape hanging scroll by the HUlzhou attlst .
Youhe beating a 1688 inscription by Shitao is reproduced m
Zhongguo meishu quanji, huihua bian 1988: 9, no. 153
(Shanghai Museum); and a fan painting by Shitao of plum
blossom and bamboo in the Museum fur Ostasiatische Kunst,

Koln, bears an inscription by the artist transcribing another
inscription that he had originally written for a handscroll by
the Anhui artist Zhao Cheng (1581-1654 or later).
21. See Kim 1985, 1996.
22. Song Wan, cited by Kim 1985: vol. I, 170.
23. The artists Lan Ying (Hangzhou) and Xie Bin (from Fu-

jian, but Nanjing-based) were both involved in the compila-
tion of Tuhui baojian xuzuan. One can observe the same trans-
regional awareness in literature, in the [ate-seventeenth-century
passion for anthologizing specific kinds of contemporary writ-
ing -letters, essays, poems, biographies - by writers from all
over the country. See, for example, Zhang Chao's various pub-
lications.
24. The painter was WangJun (see above, n. 20). The colo-

phon translation appears within the section "The Functional-
ist Ethic."
25. Huang Lu was a nephew of Huang Yun. The leaf is re-

produced in Edwards 1967: 108. Translation of Shitao's in-
scription slightly modified from Fu and Fu 1973: 52-3, where
the critical terminology used by Shitao is discussed. Kuncan
(from Hubei), Cheng Zhengkui (from Hubei, 1604-76), and
Chen Shu (from the Songjiang area, still active 1687) were all
based in Nanjing. Zha Shibiao, Hongren, and Cheng Suiwere
all of Huizhou ancestry, but Zha Shibiao spent most of his
career in Yangzhou, and Cheng Sui spent most of his in Yang-
zhou and Nanjing. Bada Shanrenwas based in Nanchang, Mei
Qing in Xuancheng, but Mei Geng, being an official, was
more peripatetic.
26. Zhang Chao, preface to "Secrets of Painting" by Kong

Yanshi (son of Kong Shangrenl, in Zhang Chao, ed. 1990 (yiji,
1700): 277·
27. The Kangxi court was summoning artists at least as

early as 1667. Entries in the Tuhui baojian xuzuan (juan 2)
show that summonses in that year were a source of prestige
for three artists: Cheng Hu, Shen Shuyu, and Wang Chongjie.
So, too, was the 1671 summons to Gu Ming to paint a por-
trait of Kangxi, and an undated summons to Yang Zhimao for
the same purpose.
28. Rosenzweig 1973·
29. That Wang Yuanqi's remark also had negative implica-

tions was pointed out by Joseph Chang (Zhang Zining (988).
Note that there also exists what purports to be a Dadi Tang-
period collaboration between Shitao and Wang Yuanqi, a
hanging scroll depicting bamboo and rocks (whereabouts un-
known) that is dedicated by Shitao to Wang Shan (1645-
1728),1670 jinshiJ who in addition to a successful political ca-
reer at the capital was also an amateur painter. Wang Yuanqi
himself is one possible candidate to be the dedicatee of another
late bamboo painting in the Palace Museum, Beijing (STSHQ]
pI. 380).
30. Wang Hui commemorated his own double prominence

in the transregional and national art worlds by printing a vast
collection of the admiring words of praise that he had received
over the years, Qinghui zengyan (Wang Hui, camp. 1994)·
Naturally, the first entry is the emperor's.
31. The situation of Chinese professional painters seems

broadly comparable to that of their Renaissance-early modern
counterparts in Europe, who did their best to have the choice
between the patronage of the cities and that of the court. See
Warnke "993.
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45. Colophon to Wang jun's 1699 copy of a composi-
tion by Huang Gongwang (see above, n. 20), recorded in
DDZTHSB 4/84-5.
46. Benjamin Elman, in an important analysis of the pro-

fessionalization of scholarship in the late seventeenth and eigh-
teenth centuries (1984' 88-137), has sought to define profes-
sionalism on the basis of Western sociological definitions. It
seems to me that a historically and culturally specific definition
cannot avoid the traditional Chinese sociological discourse of
the simin, "the four categories of the people."
47. From the artist's postscript to an album recorded in

Pang Yuanji I97Ib. Translation by jerome Silbergeld (1974'
265-6), slightly modified.
48. In a Japanese private collection. Reproduced in Tana-

ka Kenro 1945: vol. 2.
49. For particularized contemporary statements of this

view, see Hsi 1972: 143.
50. On Wang Daokun and other defenders of the social

worth of commerce, such as the Yangzhou philosopher Wang
Gen, see Hsi 1972.
51. My summary is based on the following essays in

LHYFZ r693' "Merchants' Feelings" (Shang qing) r 5/4a-6b;
"Brief Account of the Complaints of Liang-Huai Salt Mer-
chants" (Liang-Huai yanshang kuqing shulue) 26/39a-49b;
"Response to the Brief Account of Complaints" (Kuqingshu-
lue huo wen) 26/50a-56a; and numerous biographies of mer-
chants in the same work.
52. Peterson 1979: 72-3; Rawski 1985: 28; Ch'ien 1986.
53. Elman 1984. See also Guy 1987.
54. There are many studies of "practical" statecraft in-

cluding, on the Kangxi goverment side, Spence 1966; Song
Dexuan 1990; and, on the "wilderness" side, Wakeman 1985.
55. For the latter areas, a convenient summary is Chang

and Chang 1992: 28S-303; see also Henderson 1977: 122-41,
56. Brook 1988; Clunas 1991; Widmer 1992. Numerous

manual-type texts are included in Zhang Chao's two anthol-
ogies published in Yangzhou, Tanii congshu (Zhang Chao and
Wang Zhuo, eds. r992) and Zhaodai congshu (Zhang Chao,
ed. r990; Zhang Chao and Zhang jian, eds. 1990).
57. Xiao Gang 1989.
~8. Kong Yanshi 1700; Pang 1976; GongXian 1990; Wang

Gal 1992' 29lra-I7b.
59. See Kim 1985.
60. On the Huafa beryuan, see the section "Oneness and

the P~rfected Man: .Shitao's Treatise on Painting" in Chapter
9· With the exception of the Hua pu, the earliest survivin". g
~anuscnpt versl,ons are one WIth a 1728 postscript in the Na-
tlO~al Central LI~rary, .Taipei, and another with a 1731 post-
senpt by Wang Yichen m the Nanjing Library. On the aurhen-
ttcrty of the Hua pu and the question of the treatise's vario. d . I us
recensions an tit. es, see SLW 447-So; Huang Lanpo 1963:
70-4; Koh~ra Hironobu 1965; R!ckmans 1970: 167-73;
Chou 1977· 162-71; Nakamura Shigeo 1985: 13S-8; Srrass-
~erg 1989: 123-S. There are English translations ofthe trea-
tise by Earle Coleman (1978) and more recently by Richard
Strassberg (~989), but th~ best translation into a Western lan-
guage remams that by Pierre Ryckmans into Fre h ( ).. nc 1970.
On the InterpretatIon of the text see' Huang L 6. anpo 19 3'
Chou 1969, 1978; Ryckmans r970; Coleman I978;Jiang Yi:
han r982; Nakamura Shlgeo 1985; Strassberg 1989.

61. From Chapter Six of the treatise. Translation from
Strassberg r989' 69·
62. Translation from ibid.: 66, modified.
63. Ryckmans r970; Strassberg 1989.
64. The thirty leaves are divided today among four collec-

tions: Museum of Fine Arts, Boston (twelve), Nelson-Atkins
Museum of Art (twelve), Beishan Tang Collection, Hong Kong
(four), and Osrasiatiska Museer Stockholm (two). Chu-tsing
Li has suggested that there were originally three twelve-leaf
albums, which would mean that the six Stockholm and Hong
Kong leaves belong to a third twelve-leaf album, of which the
other six leaves have been lost (1992: 172-7). Since one of the
Boston leaves is dated to the spring of 1703, one of the Kan-
sas leaves to the fall of 1703, and one of the Stockholm leaves
to a summer day, this is certainly plausible. However, it is also
possible that the leaves, whatever total number they eventually
reached, were originally mounted together or in some other
combination that has since been disrupted. All four surviving
groups of leaves passed through the Yangzhou collection of
Ma Yueguan (1688-1755) and his brother Ma Yuelu, presum-
ably together.
65. On Wang Yuanqi's writings on painting, see Pang 1976.
66. A. j. Hay, 1992, 4.12-4.13.
67. Like all important philosophic terms, li and ch'i are se-

mantically very rich. These particular translations, though
obviously inadequate, seem to me less misleading than many
other choices that could have been made. I use the Wade-Giles
transliteration ch'i here to distinguish this character from qi,
meaning "strange" or "extraordinary."
68. Cheng 1970.
69. A. j. Hay 1985, 1991.
70. Ho and Delbanco 1992: 35·
71. Cheng 1970.
72. Translation from Tomita and Tseng 1961' z4, slightly

modified.
73. Translation from Cahill 1982b, 99, slightly modified.
74. Translation from Strassberg 1989: 61-2.
75· From ibid.: 71, modified.
76. Translation from Li 1992' '73, slightly modified.
77. For explanations of these terms, see Strassberg 1989:

II6-I8.
78. Shitao's relationship to Dong Qichang is discussed in

Chapter 9 (section "The Artist as Chan Master").
79. Translation from Strassberg 1989: 80-1, slightly mod-

ified.
80. See Chaizhang's Talks on Painting, translated by jerome

Silbergeld (1974' 200); Banqian's Instructional Remarks on
Painting (ibid.: rn).
81. From Gong Xian's inscription on the facing page to leaf

H of his album Landscapes and Trees in the Metropolitan Mu-
seum of Art (1979.499).
82. In this context Wang Fuzhi's (1619-92) thought pro-

vides a revealing parallel. Both Frederic Wakeman (1985) and
j F w; g's "re-ean- ran\ois Billeter (1970) have insisted upon wan
lationism." As Wakeman puts it, "Wang Fuzhi ... firmly be;
lieved that universalities were imbedded in the pluralIties ~
particular relationships. Individual relationships held their

. "( 85'own eXigency, and acted according to their own laws 19 .
ro87-8).
83· Cahill I982a.

84. Vinograd I992b: 18/7-9. The term "ernie" refers to a
an ethnographical perspective that uses the concepts and cat-
egories relevant and meaningful to the culture under analysis
{vs. that of the anthropologist, which would be "eric").
85. On Shitao's approach to vision and visual cognition, see

Burkus-Chasson 1996.
86. Reinforcing the Song reference, Shitao here echoes Guo

Xi's famous statement on illusionism: "To look at a particu-
lar painting puts you in the corresponding frame of mind, as
though you were really on the point of going there; this is the
wonderful power of painting beyond its mere mood" (trans-
lation from Bush and Shih 1985' 153-4)·
87. Cahill I982a.
88. Zhang Chao, preface to You Tong's "Bamboo Stalk

Poems on Foreign Countries" (Waiguo zhuzhi ci), in Zhang
Chao, ed. 1990' 54. In his colophon following the text, Zhang
describes the Western concept of a world that is round, and of
round-the-world travel. Following You Tong's text in this com-
pilation is "An Essential Account of the Western Regions"
(Xifang yaoji} by Pere Verbiest and two other missionaries.
Zhang's preface to this text speculates that if the Chinese take
China to be the center and Europe to be the West, perhaps
Europeans take Europe to be the center and China to be the
East. His colophon praises Western technology, mathematics,
and astronomy, and advocates contact with Chinese-speaking
Westerners to elucidate difficult questions.
89. I would like to acknowledge my debt here to Burkus-

Chasson (1996). Burkus-Chasson views Shitao's theories of
vision as relatively conservative, in contrast to explicit contem-
porary engagements with Western visual technologies, where-
as I would like to argue for a disguised experimentation.
90. "On the water's surface, reflections of dearing clouds,

and on the rocks, moss -/Layer upon layer, heaped up in the
painting. /Struck by the loveliness of the autumn light, this her-
mit remains;lTwilight, and Istill cannot bear to return home."
91. The introduction of an almost theatrical handling of

light, itself a scenic device, links Shitao to such other masters
of dramatic lighting effects as Yuan Jiang in Yangzhou, Lu Wei
in Songjiang, and the scholar-official and finger painter Gao
Qipei. Time will tell whether this phenomenon of the 1690S
and 1700S is related to the arrival of Jesuit painters at court,
with their use of a fixed light source.
92. The winter example, "When the road is endless, the

brush precedes [the traveler];/The cold chills the pond but his
ink flows all the smoother," is illustrated in the 1702 Land-
scapes Painted at WanglU Tang (see Figure lOS)·
93. See Chaves 1983.
94. See Vinograd I992b.
95. For Dong Qichang, see particularly Ho and Delbanco

1992; Vinograd I992b. For Gong Xi an, see particularly Wil-
son 1969.
96. This text is also inscribed on a spring 1692 landscape

hanging scroll for a Mr. Bochang (see Figure 170). My trans-
lation draws on that of Richard Strassberg (1989' F)·
97. Translation modified from Tomita and Tseng 1961: 24·
98. Translation from ibid.: 23, with interpolations.
99. Shitao was favorably compared with Yun Shouping in

1693 by one of Shitao's friends and patrons, Zhang Jingjie
(Zhongguo gudai shuhua tumu, vol. 5, Hu: 1-3120 [7], Shang-
hai Museum).

100. It is worth noting that one of Wang Shimin's sons,
Wang Shu (1636-99) paid a visit to Shitao in Xuancheng in
the I670S. See Wang Shu 1981: 412b.
101. Bourdieu 1993a: 116-17.
102. An earlier version of the same text appears on a fan

in the Museum fur Ostasiatische Kunst, Koln.
103. Three other leaves from the same album, in a private

collection, are illustrated here (see Figures 24, 30, 181). The
album is likely to date from around r698-9. The poem in
question also appears together with several others on a fan
face in the Cheng Xun Tang Collection (The Cheng Xun Tang
Collection of Painting and Calligraphy on Fans, cat. no. r 34),
which probably dates from the late I690s. The poem is there
followed by the dedication, "Painted under the flowering plum
at the Leisure-Cultivation Pavilion, and given to the Owner of
the Stone Pavilion." The other face of the fan is in the Metro-
politan Museum of Art.
104. DDZTHSB 3/7r-5.

NINE. PAINTING AS PRAXIS

I. The term "reexperiencing" is Richard Vinograd's. See his
theoretical discussion of this issue in Vinograd 1991b.
2. Only two scholars, Mingfu and Nakamura Shigeo, nei-

ther of them art historians, have taken Shitao's Chan practice
of painting seriously enough to delve into it in detail. Iam in-
debted to both in the account that follows.
3. On the Caodong-Linji division, see Buswell 1987.
4. For a vivid description of a visit to Lu'an Benyue by lo-

cal Songjiang literati, see Ye Mengzhu n.d.: 9!I2a-I3b. On
the Tiantong Monastery tradition of monk-poets, see the nu-
merous references in Li Yesi (1622-80) 1988. Two collections
of poetry by Muchen are extant today: see Appendix I, n. 1.
5. On late Ming lay Buddhism, see Brook r993·
6. Faure 1991' 63-5.
7. On The Sixteen Luohans, see Hearn 1992; Zhang Zi-

ning 1993; Kent 1995' 223-64. On the Chan cult of arhats
(luohans), see Faure r99" 266-72.
8. See Zhang Zining r993; Kent 1995: 284-8.
9. Hearn 1992.
10. For a vivid and awestruck description of a gathering

of Linji masters (at which Muchen would certainly have been
present) on the occasion of the death of Miyun Yuanwu at
Tiantong Temple, Mizu, see Li Yesi 1988: 644-5.
II. Following this line of interpretation, it would not be

surprising if Shitao's personal aspirations to join their number,
made explicit in the inscription, were also embodied within the
picture through a self-representation as arhat. The suggestion
has been made by Maxwell Hearn (r991.), logically enough,
that this should be the arhat holding the bottle from which the
dragon surges, but this seems to me unlikely given the hirsute
appearance of the arhat; on the other hand, there is another,
young-looking arhat seated in meditation within a cave, whose
appearance is more compatible with Shirao's many other self-
representations.
12. For Hongren, see Kuo 1990. For Xuezhuang, see Zhu

Yunhui 1980; Wai-kam Ho, ed. 1992: vol. 2, 191. For Kun-
can, see Zhang Zining 1987; Cahill 1991. For the Buddhist
character of Dai Benxiao's Huangshan paintings, see Nishiga-
mi Minoru 1981, 1987; Edwards 1992: 149-S1.
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combination that has since been disrupted. All four surviving
groups of leaves passed through the Yangzhou collection of
Ma Yueguan (1688-1755) and his brother Ma Yuelu, presum-
ably together.
65. On Wang Yuanqi's writings on painting, see Pang 1976.
66. A. j. Hay, 1992, 4.12-4.13.
67. Like all important philosophic terms, li and ch'i are se-

mantically very rich. These particular translations, though
obviously inadequate, seem to me less misleading than many
other choices that could have been made. I use the Wade-Giles
transliteration ch'i here to distinguish this character from qi,
meaning "strange" or "extraordinary."
68. Cheng 1970.
69. A. j. Hay 1985, 1991.
70. Ho and Delbanco 1992: 35·
71. Cheng 1970.
72. Translation from Tomita and Tseng 1961' z4, slightly

modified.
73. Translation from Cahill 1982b, 99, slightly modified.
74. Translation from Strassberg 1989: 61-2.
75· From ibid.: 71, modified.
76. Translation from Li 1992' '73, slightly modified.
77. For explanations of these terms, see Strassberg 1989:

II6-I8.
78. Shitao's relationship to Dong Qichang is discussed in

Chapter 9 (section "The Artist as Chan Master").
79. Translation from Strassberg 1989: 80-1, slightly mod-

ified.
80. See Chaizhang's Talks on Painting, translated by jerome

Silbergeld (1974' 200); Banqian's Instructional Remarks on
Painting (ibid.: rn).
81. From Gong Xian's inscription on the facing page to leaf

H of his album Landscapes and Trees in the Metropolitan Mu-
seum of Art (1979.499).
82. In this context Wang Fuzhi's (1619-92) thought pro-

vides a revealing parallel. Both Frederic Wakeman (1985) and
j F w; g's "re-ean- ran\ois Billeter (1970) have insisted upon wan
lationism." As Wakeman puts it, "Wang Fuzhi ... firmly be;
lieved that universalities were imbedded in the pluralIties ~
particular relationships. Individual relationships held their

. "( 85'own eXigency, and acted according to their own laws 19 .
ro87-8).
83· Cahill I982a.

84. Vinograd I992b: 18/7-9. The term "ernie" refers to a
an ethnographical perspective that uses the concepts and cat-
egories relevant and meaningful to the culture under analysis
{vs. that of the anthropologist, which would be "eric").
85. On Shitao's approach to vision and visual cognition, see

Burkus-Chasson 1996.
86. Reinforcing the Song reference, Shitao here echoes Guo

Xi's famous statement on illusionism: "To look at a particu-
lar painting puts you in the corresponding frame of mind, as
though you were really on the point of going there; this is the
wonderful power of painting beyond its mere mood" (trans-
lation from Bush and Shih 1985' 153-4)·
87. Cahill I982a.
88. Zhang Chao, preface to You Tong's "Bamboo Stalk

Poems on Foreign Countries" (Waiguo zhuzhi ci), in Zhang
Chao, ed. 1990' 54. In his colophon following the text, Zhang
describes the Western concept of a world that is round, and of
round-the-world travel. Following You Tong's text in this com-
pilation is "An Essential Account of the Western Regions"
(Xifang yaoji} by Pere Verbiest and two other missionaries.
Zhang's preface to this text speculates that if the Chinese take
China to be the center and Europe to be the West, perhaps
Europeans take Europe to be the center and China to be the
East. His colophon praises Western technology, mathematics,
and astronomy, and advocates contact with Chinese-speaking
Westerners to elucidate difficult questions.
89. I would like to acknowledge my debt here to Burkus-

Chasson (1996). Burkus-Chasson views Shitao's theories of
vision as relatively conservative, in contrast to explicit contem-
porary engagements with Western visual technologies, where-
as I would like to argue for a disguised experimentation.
90. "On the water's surface, reflections of dearing clouds,

and on the rocks, moss -/Layer upon layer, heaped up in the
painting. /Struck by the loveliness of the autumn light, this her-
mit remains;lTwilight, and Istill cannot bear to return home."
91. The introduction of an almost theatrical handling of

light, itself a scenic device, links Shitao to such other masters
of dramatic lighting effects as Yuan Jiang in Yangzhou, Lu Wei
in Songjiang, and the scholar-official and finger painter Gao
Qipei. Time will tell whether this phenomenon of the 1690S
and 1700S is related to the arrival of Jesuit painters at court,
with their use of a fixed light source.
92. The winter example, "When the road is endless, the

brush precedes [the traveler];/The cold chills the pond but his
ink flows all the smoother," is illustrated in the 1702 Land-
scapes Painted at WanglU Tang (see Figure lOS)·
93. See Chaves 1983.
94. See Vinograd I992b.
95. For Dong Qichang, see particularly Ho and Delbanco

1992; Vinograd I992b. For Gong Xi an, see particularly Wil-
son 1969.
96. This text is also inscribed on a spring 1692 landscape

hanging scroll for a Mr. Bochang (see Figure 170). My trans-
lation draws on that of Richard Strassberg (1989' F)·
97. Translation modified from Tomita and Tseng 1961: 24·
98. Translation from ibid.: 23, with interpolations.
99. Shitao was favorably compared with Yun Shouping in

1693 by one of Shitao's friends and patrons, Zhang Jingjie
(Zhongguo gudai shuhua tumu, vol. 5, Hu: 1-3120 [7], Shang-
hai Museum).

100. It is worth noting that one of Wang Shimin's sons,
Wang Shu (1636-99) paid a visit to Shitao in Xuancheng in
the I670S. See Wang Shu 1981: 412b.
101. Bourdieu 1993a: 116-17.
102. An earlier version of the same text appears on a fan

in the Museum fur Ostasiatische Kunst, Koln.
103. Three other leaves from the same album, in a private

collection, are illustrated here (see Figures 24, 30, 181). The
album is likely to date from around r698-9. The poem in
question also appears together with several others on a fan
face in the Cheng Xun Tang Collection (The Cheng Xun Tang
Collection of Painting and Calligraphy on Fans, cat. no. r 34),
which probably dates from the late I690s. The poem is there
followed by the dedication, "Painted under the flowering plum
at the Leisure-Cultivation Pavilion, and given to the Owner of
the Stone Pavilion." The other face of the fan is in the Metro-
politan Museum of Art.
104. DDZTHSB 3/7r-5.

NINE. PAINTING AS PRAXIS

I. The term "reexperiencing" is Richard Vinograd's. See his
theoretical discussion of this issue in Vinograd 1991b.
2. Only two scholars, Mingfu and Nakamura Shigeo, nei-

ther of them art historians, have taken Shitao's Chan practice
of painting seriously enough to delve into it in detail. Iam in-
debted to both in the account that follows.
3. On the Caodong-Linji division, see Buswell 1987.
4. For a vivid description of a visit to Lu'an Benyue by lo-

cal Songjiang literati, see Ye Mengzhu n.d.: 9!I2a-I3b. On
the Tiantong Monastery tradition of monk-poets, see the nu-
merous references in Li Yesi (1622-80) 1988. Two collections
of poetry by Muchen are extant today: see Appendix I, n. 1.
5. On late Ming lay Buddhism, see Brook r993·
6. Faure 1991' 63-5.
7. On The Sixteen Luohans, see Hearn 1992; Zhang Zi-

ning 1993; Kent 1995' 223-64. On the Chan cult of arhats
(luohans), see Faure r99" 266-72.
8. See Zhang Zining r993; Kent 1995: 284-8.
9. Hearn 1992.
10. For a vivid and awestruck description of a gathering

of Linji masters (at which Muchen would certainly have been
present) on the occasion of the death of Miyun Yuanwu at
Tiantong Temple, Mizu, see Li Yesi 1988: 644-5.
II. Following this line of interpretation, it would not be

surprising if Shitao's personal aspirations to join their number,
made explicit in the inscription, were also embodied within the
picture through a self-representation as arhat. The suggestion
has been made by Maxwell Hearn (r991.), logically enough,
that this should be the arhat holding the bottle from which the
dragon surges, but this seems to me unlikely given the hirsute
appearance of the arhat; on the other hand, there is another,
young-looking arhat seated in meditation within a cave, whose
appearance is more compatible with Shirao's many other self-
representations.
12. For Hongren, see Kuo 1990. For Xuezhuang, see Zhu

Yunhui 1980; Wai-kam Ho, ed. 1992: vol. 2, 191. For Kun-
can, see Zhang Zining 1987; Cahill 1991. For the Buddhist
character of Dai Benxiao's Huangshan paintings, see Nishiga-
mi Minoru 1981, 1987; Edwards 1992: 149-S1.
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13. On the date of the Sumiromo Huangshan album, see
SLW 431-2 n. 64; Ishikawa jun et a1. 1976: 160.
14. On Tang Yansheng, seeJin Zhixing 1990. Long before

Shitao became interested in the Dadi name, Tang used it for
his studio. See Shi Runzhang 1982: 22/8b-9a, where it is also
noted that one of Tang's sobriquets was the Woodcutter of
Huangshan.

IS. For example, a 1672 hanging scroll for WangJie depict-
ing a figure on a natural rock bridge, bringing to mind the fa-
mous rock bridge at Mount Tianrai (Edwards 1967: 29).

16. Mei Qing 1691, juan 12.

17. As far as the image is concerned, that is; a further four-
character inscription reads "dingsi [1669] at Shuixi," which
is presumably a reference to the Shuixi Academy reconstruct-
ed by Deng Qifen in Jingxian. Perhaps Shitao means that the
association with the Iron-Feet Daoist came to him in Shuixi
(jingxian), following his second ascent of Huangshan.

18. Shi Runzhang, too, cites the story of the Iron-Feet Dao-
ist in a poem entitled "Gazing at Mount Heng" (Shi Runzhang
1982: 34/4a). Much later in his life, Shitao created a memo-
rable depiction of Zhuchong Peak in leaf II of his Illustrations
to the Poems of Huang Yaniu in the Zhile Lou Collection.

19. On the Chan analogy in poetry, see Lynn 1987.
20. On Tan Yuanchun, and this album, see Fang 1991. ji-

weng has not been identified, but one candidate is a certain
Jiang ]ihu who makes several appearances in the poems that
Jiang Zhu wrote during his visit to Xuancheng in the 1670S
(Jiang Zhu 1932), and who studied calligraphy with Wu Su-
gong (Mei Wending 1995: 148).

21. The album may have been painted for Wu Yanhuai,
who is mentioned by Shitao in an inscription to a Xuancheng-
period album in the Shanghai Museum (Zhongguo gudai shu-
hua tumu, vol. 5, Hu: 1-3'47 [6]). On Su Shi and Chan see
Lynn 1987.

22. In his early album in the Guangdong Provincial Muse-
um, reproduced in STSHQJ pI. 363.
23. The handscroll is in the collection of the T. Y. Chao

Family Foundation, Hong Kong. Shitao wrote his poems in the
company of Wu Zhenbo from Shexian. On Wu Zhenbo and
his family, see above, Chapter 6 (section "The Monk-Painter
as Professional"). Wang Shiqing 1979h, 1987.

24· Faure 1991: 41 n. 17.
25. Buswell 1987.
26. WDQS; Nakamura Shigeo 1985.
27· Shitao kept The Conversion of Hariti to Buddhism in

his own possession (it bears a colophon written for Shitao in
1693), along with his second version of The Sixteen Luohans
(stolen in 1687), and his 1674 «self-portrait" (see Figure 53),
which bears various inscriptions postdating his return from
Beijing.

28. On the Hariti theme, see Murray 1981.
29· The painting is reproduced in ST 135. It appears to be

based on a woodblock print from one of the series of "Fifty-
three Manifestations of Guanyin" (Chugoku no yofuga ten:
336-54). Richard Kent (1995) has argued that some figures in
The Sixteen Luohans also have a woodblock print source, as
is certainly the case for the undated Luohan Leaning on an
Old Tree (ST 22) as well.

30. The portrait is known from a poem by Shi Runzhang
(1982: 21/4b-P)·

31. This seal reappears on a number of much later works.
See SLW 330 n. 96.
32. McCausland (1994).
33. See Shitao's inscription to Shuangxiao's painting of

pomegranate and bamboo in the Shanghai Museum (ST 84).
34. The fact that Shitao's teacher, Lu'an, had been based

near Dong's home town of Songjiang may also have played
some role in his interest in Dong. His most explicit references
to Dong before the 1680s are two paintings (1671, 1679) il-
lustrating a text that evokes the Southern School lineage. The
1671 painting (Mountain Landscape, Musee Guirnet, repro-
duced in Edwards 1967: 100) visually alludes to Dong's paint-
ing; the 1679 painting (Qiujian /anying tu, Shanghai Museum,
reproduced in ST 26) makes a point of not doing so.
35. Translation modified from Edwards 1967: 36-7.
36. The album was painted for Wu Zhenbo. See jin Huan

n.d.: xiahan, chouji.
37. On Dong's theory of "raw" and "ripe," see Yang Xin

1992.
38. DDZTHSB 1/30.
39. This text is recorded in DDZTHSB as a colophon to

a painting executed in Hangzhou in 1657/1717. In 1657 Shi-
tao had not yet left the Hunan-Hubei area and by 1717 he
was dead, so it must be assumed that the painting is spurious.

40. Du Yin, zi Canglue, from Huanggang in Hubei, was the
younger brother of the more famous Du Jun (1611-87), whom
Shitao mentions in a 1683 poem, and was probably related to
the poet Du Cheng, whom Shitao frequented in 1693, at which
time he wrote a colophon for The Conversion of Hariti to
Buddhism. For a biography of Du Yin, see Fang BaD 1963:
122.
41. The pairing of Dong Yuan and Mi Fu is anticipated in

an inscription to one leaf in a 1682 album of landscapes (col-
lection unknown). Reproduced and discussed in Fu and Fu
1973: 44-6.
42. Translation from ibid.: 46, modified.
43. On Wu Zhenbo and Wu Chengxia, see above, Chapter

6 (section "The Monk-Painter as Professional"). The latter's
Daoist commitment is noted by Shitao in the inscription to a
painting for Wu Zhenbo (see Figure 93). Although the Land-
scapes for Yu Daoren has been attributed to the mid-r eyos
(Cahill 1982a), both the fa-centered discourse of the inscrip-
tion and the improvised, organic landscapes seen in leaves 2-4
are more at home in the period before his Beijing journey than
after his return to the South. Compare leaf 2 of a 1684 land-
scape album in the Palace Museum, Beijing (Xu Bangda, ed.
1984b: 770); Ten Thousand Ugly Inkblots, 1685 (see Figure
167); The Island Mountain of Penglai, hanging scroll, 1687,
Shanghai Museum (STH] no. 19).
44. The earliest dated appearance of the seal known to me

follows Shitao's 1680 colophon to his album Landscapes for
Wu Canxi of the same year. STSHQ] pl. 13.
45. On the Shitao canon and its place in moderntist) narra-

tives of Chinese painting history, see J. S. Hay 1994a.
46. Recorded in Hu Jitang c. 1839: shang/41b-42a.
47. Muchen Daomin 1980: 78; Wang Shiqing 1987: II.
48. Wu Qi 1982: II/5b-6b.
49. See above, n. 21.
50. The name of Wu Canxi is very similar to that of Wu

Canru, a lay-Buddhist friend of the painter Hongren who had

in the later 1660s or 1670S, painted at the beginning of the
1690S in Tianjin (ST 4, Shanghai Museum).
65· On Huang Gongwang's Daoist career, see A. J. Hay

1978.
66. On the art-historical note that he added after the Li Bai

poem, see SLW 559-61.
67· Unidentified private collection, mainland China, photo-

graph in author's possession.
68. The experiments with a Daoist iconography include

Long Whistling in the Breeze, a hanging scroll of bamboo
painted at Xu Songling's Liugeng Garden, on which is im-
pressed the seal "preserve and nourish divine harmony" (re-
produced in ST 43).
69· The dating of this handscroll is difficult. The earliest

dated appearance of the oval "Dadizi" seal is 17°2, but it
seems likely that it came into use much earlier. The calligra-
phy may be compared with the 1697 poetry manuscript in the
Guangzhou Art Gallery (Ming and Qing Painting from the
Guangzhou Art Gallery, cat. no. 38.9-14), and with the in-
scription to a 1698 bamboo hanging scroll (Christie's New
York, Important Classical Chinese Paintings, 28 November
1990, no. 30).
70. See Strassberg 1994: 297-302.
71. See Richard Barnhart's discussion of this painting

(1983: 1°3-4)·
72. This painting is sometimes doubted, in part because it

was once owned by Zhang Daqian. However, it carves out
space and structures form in a way entirely alien to Zhang,
who had a twentieth-century fascination with surface. There
is one early collector's seal, only partly decipherable, in the
lower right-hand corner.
73· Schipper 1982: 145·
74. In addition to this painting and his 1697 reinscription

of the 1667 hanging scroll, a number of other paintings and
descriptions of Huangshan from the Dadi Tang years show
that it took on an intense Daoist significance for him. See in
particular his 1699 Huangshan handscroll for Xu Songling
(see Figure 16), which bears a long inscription, and his 1700
Huangshan handscroll for Su Pi (zi Yimen) (see Figure 107),
in the inscription to which he remembers his decisive visit to
the Peak of First Realization (which inspired his thoughts of
the Iron-Feet Daoist).

75. On Mount Tiantai, see Munakara 1990: 122-3.
76. For earlier studies of this painting in relation to Daoist

inner alchemy, see SLW 155-62,576-7; Kuo 1987; Burkus-
Chasson 1996. The following discussion is indebted to
Burkus-Chasson's research and translations, and follows her
in the use of the term "visuality." My convergent conclusion
on the importance of luminosity in the painting, on the oth-
er hand, was arrived at separately and by a different route.
77. Tiantong Temple in Zhejiang, of which Muchen be-

came the abbot, was popularly known as Little Mount Lu. See
Li Yesi 1988: 443, 646.
78. Burkus-Chasson 1996: 189 n. 3.
79. Owen 1981: 136.
80. In regard to some correspondences, see SLW 158-9.
81. Translation modified from Burkus-Chasson 1996: 186.
82. Burkus-Chasson 1996: 178.
83. Burkus-Chasson, commenting on the relationship be-

tween the image and this part of the text, instead stresses the
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at least one brother who was also a lay Buddhist UJZL] 128
nn. 32, 35); however, the eventual family connection is still un-
clear.
51. See Wang Shiqing 1987.
52. From [inmen shichao, cited in CuiJin 1987: 313.
53· The poem continues: "Your painting doesn't try to be

charming, lIt falls outside the ancient fa and comes instead
from your self. lOne can't use the criteria of ancient fa to judge
it: IYou're happy with it - why would you care if it pleases
your contemporaries or not? II remember when I first saw one
of your works/All I could find to say was that it was just a
game. /How could Ihave guessed that when I saw you brush
in hand lIt would be as far from careless as this? IYou capture
the idea beyond the idea lAnd even the irreality in reality.lIf
there are any traces that can be traced back [to formulae} I[For
you J it would be as if you had collected the dregs of the An-
cients. /With your strange character you make your own sol-
itary way,/Your extraordinary brush strikes the paper and
jumps up again./Vulgar silk and satin you leave empty in
piles, 10nly painting the palace paper of the Song and Ming
dynasties. IWho is there in the world to appreciate your paint-
ing? IYou just shake YOUl head and laugh endlessly!"

54. On the Chan metaphor of the circle, the classic study
is by Paul Demieville, translated as "The Mirror of the Mind"
(Demieville 1987).
55· Suojin qifeng da caogao, handscroll, 1691, Palace Mu-

seum, Beijing (STSHQJ pl. 60). See Vinograd 1992b.
56. For other discussions of this text and the development

of Shitao's art theory, see Chou 1977; Cahill 1982aj Zhang
Zining 1988; Strassberg 1989; Vinograd 1992b.

57. Faure (1991: 24) points out the centrality of "erring"
as an early Chan ideal.

58. Vinograd 1978. Another example of his response to
classicizing painting is his monumental 1691 landscape hand-
scroll for the same patron, entitled Suojin qifeng da caogao
(seen. 55).
59· Landscapes (twelve leaves), now in a Japanese private

collection. This album has been published as Shitao shanshui
tuyong. On Gengyin's lineage, see Mingfu 1978: 159-60.

60. See, notably, an undated album of landscapes in the
Tang Family Collection.
61. Yang 1994.
62. In 1699, for example, he was visited by the Tianjin

monk Shigao, whom he had known in the North (see Cui Jin
1987), and in 17°5, a monk whom Shitao calls Jiaogong pre-
sented him with an imperial Ming porcelain-handled brush
(Edwards 1967: 168). For his ongoing contact with his monk-
student Gengyin, including a thoroughly Chan encomium to
commemorate a sutra reading by Gengyin, see above, Chapter
8, n. 4.
63. The poems are inscribed at the end of his superb plum-

blossom handscroll from that year in the Palace Museum, Bei-
jing (see Figure 213).

64. Particularly noteworthy are rwo exuberant landscape
hanging scrolls from the later 1680s, one depicting the sacred
island-mountain of Penglai, that were probably intended as
birthday paintings but whose Daoist significance is not for that
reason to be discounted (STH] no. 19, Shanghai Museum; ST
2, Shanghai Museum). See also a hanging-scroll depiction of
Mount Huayang near Jingxian in Anhui, which he had visited
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13. On the date of the Sumiromo Huangshan album, see
SLW 431-2 n. 64; Ishikawa jun et a1. 1976: 160.
14. On Tang Yansheng, seeJin Zhixing 1990. Long before

Shitao became interested in the Dadi name, Tang used it for
his studio. See Shi Runzhang 1982: 22/8b-9a, where it is also
noted that one of Tang's sobriquets was the Woodcutter of
Huangshan.

IS. For example, a 1672 hanging scroll for WangJie depict-
ing a figure on a natural rock bridge, bringing to mind the fa-
mous rock bridge at Mount Tianrai (Edwards 1967: 29).

16. Mei Qing 1691, juan 12.

17. As far as the image is concerned, that is; a further four-
character inscription reads "dingsi [1669] at Shuixi," which
is presumably a reference to the Shuixi Academy reconstruct-
ed by Deng Qifen in Jingxian. Perhaps Shitao means that the
association with the Iron-Feet Daoist came to him in Shuixi
(jingxian), following his second ascent of Huangshan.

18. Shi Runzhang, too, cites the story of the Iron-Feet Dao-
ist in a poem entitled "Gazing at Mount Heng" (Shi Runzhang
1982: 34/4a). Much later in his life, Shitao created a memo-
rable depiction of Zhuchong Peak in leaf II of his Illustrations
to the Poems of Huang Yaniu in the Zhile Lou Collection.

19. On the Chan analogy in poetry, see Lynn 1987.
20. On Tan Yuanchun, and this album, see Fang 1991. ji-

weng has not been identified, but one candidate is a certain
Jiang ]ihu who makes several appearances in the poems that
Jiang Zhu wrote during his visit to Xuancheng in the 1670S
(Jiang Zhu 1932), and who studied calligraphy with Wu Su-
gong (Mei Wending 1995: 148).

21. The album may have been painted for Wu Yanhuai,
who is mentioned by Shitao in an inscription to a Xuancheng-
period album in the Shanghai Museum (Zhongguo gudai shu-
hua tumu, vol. 5, Hu: 1-3'47 [6]). On Su Shi and Chan see
Lynn 1987.

22. In his early album in the Guangdong Provincial Muse-
um, reproduced in STSHQJ pI. 363.
23. The handscroll is in the collection of the T. Y. Chao

Family Foundation, Hong Kong. Shitao wrote his poems in the
company of Wu Zhenbo from Shexian. On Wu Zhenbo and
his family, see above, Chapter 6 (section "The Monk-Painter
as Professional"). Wang Shiqing 1979h, 1987.

24· Faure 1991: 41 n. 17.
25. Buswell 1987.
26. WDQS; Nakamura Shigeo 1985.
27· Shitao kept The Conversion of Hariti to Buddhism in

his own possession (it bears a colophon written for Shitao in
1693), along with his second version of The Sixteen Luohans
(stolen in 1687), and his 1674 «self-portrait" (see Figure 53),
which bears various inscriptions postdating his return from
Beijing.

28. On the Hariti theme, see Murray 1981.
29· The painting is reproduced in ST 135. It appears to be

based on a woodblock print from one of the series of "Fifty-
three Manifestations of Guanyin" (Chugoku no yofuga ten:
336-54). Richard Kent (1995) has argued that some figures in
The Sixteen Luohans also have a woodblock print source, as
is certainly the case for the undated Luohan Leaning on an
Old Tree (ST 22) as well.

30. The portrait is known from a poem by Shi Runzhang
(1982: 21/4b-P)·

31. This seal reappears on a number of much later works.
See SLW 330 n. 96.
32. McCausland (1994).
33. See Shitao's inscription to Shuangxiao's painting of

pomegranate and bamboo in the Shanghai Museum (ST 84).
34. The fact that Shitao's teacher, Lu'an, had been based

near Dong's home town of Songjiang may also have played
some role in his interest in Dong. His most explicit references
to Dong before the 1680s are two paintings (1671, 1679) il-
lustrating a text that evokes the Southern School lineage. The
1671 painting (Mountain Landscape, Musee Guirnet, repro-
duced in Edwards 1967: 100) visually alludes to Dong's paint-
ing; the 1679 painting (Qiujian /anying tu, Shanghai Museum,
reproduced in ST 26) makes a point of not doing so.
35. Translation modified from Edwards 1967: 36-7.
36. The album was painted for Wu Zhenbo. See jin Huan

n.d.: xiahan, chouji.
37. On Dong's theory of "raw" and "ripe," see Yang Xin

1992.
38. DDZTHSB 1/30.
39. This text is recorded in DDZTHSB as a colophon to

a painting executed in Hangzhou in 1657/1717. In 1657 Shi-
tao had not yet left the Hunan-Hubei area and by 1717 he
was dead, so it must be assumed that the painting is spurious.

40. Du Yin, zi Canglue, from Huanggang in Hubei, was the
younger brother of the more famous Du Jun (1611-87), whom
Shitao mentions in a 1683 poem, and was probably related to
the poet Du Cheng, whom Shitao frequented in 1693, at which
time he wrote a colophon for The Conversion of Hariti to
Buddhism. For a biography of Du Yin, see Fang BaD 1963:
122.
41. The pairing of Dong Yuan and Mi Fu is anticipated in

an inscription to one leaf in a 1682 album of landscapes (col-
lection unknown). Reproduced and discussed in Fu and Fu
1973: 44-6.
42. Translation from ibid.: 46, modified.
43. On Wu Zhenbo and Wu Chengxia, see above, Chapter

6 (section "The Monk-Painter as Professional"). The latter's
Daoist commitment is noted by Shitao in the inscription to a
painting for Wu Zhenbo (see Figure 93). Although the Land-
scapes for Yu Daoren has been attributed to the mid-r eyos
(Cahill 1982a), both the fa-centered discourse of the inscrip-
tion and the improvised, organic landscapes seen in leaves 2-4
are more at home in the period before his Beijing journey than
after his return to the South. Compare leaf 2 of a 1684 land-
scape album in the Palace Museum, Beijing (Xu Bangda, ed.
1984b: 770); Ten Thousand Ugly Inkblots, 1685 (see Figure
167); The Island Mountain of Penglai, hanging scroll, 1687,
Shanghai Museum (STH] no. 19).
44. The earliest dated appearance of the seal known to me

follows Shitao's 1680 colophon to his album Landscapes for
Wu Canxi of the same year. STSHQ] pl. 13.
45. On the Shitao canon and its place in moderntist) narra-

tives of Chinese painting history, see J. S. Hay 1994a.
46. Recorded in Hu Jitang c. 1839: shang/41b-42a.
47. Muchen Daomin 1980: 78; Wang Shiqing 1987: II.
48. Wu Qi 1982: II/5b-6b.
49. See above, n. 21.
50. The name of Wu Canxi is very similar to that of Wu

Canru, a lay-Buddhist friend of the painter Hongren who had

in the later 1660s or 1670S, painted at the beginning of the
1690S in Tianjin (ST 4, Shanghai Museum).
65· On Huang Gongwang's Daoist career, see A. J. Hay

1978.
66. On the art-historical note that he added after the Li Bai

poem, see SLW 559-61.
67· Unidentified private collection, mainland China, photo-

graph in author's possession.
68. The experiments with a Daoist iconography include

Long Whistling in the Breeze, a hanging scroll of bamboo
painted at Xu Songling's Liugeng Garden, on which is im-
pressed the seal "preserve and nourish divine harmony" (re-
produced in ST 43).
69· The dating of this handscroll is difficult. The earliest

dated appearance of the oval "Dadizi" seal is 17°2, but it
seems likely that it came into use much earlier. The calligra-
phy may be compared with the 1697 poetry manuscript in the
Guangzhou Art Gallery (Ming and Qing Painting from the
Guangzhou Art Gallery, cat. no. 38.9-14), and with the in-
scription to a 1698 bamboo hanging scroll (Christie's New
York, Important Classical Chinese Paintings, 28 November
1990, no. 30).
70. See Strassberg 1994: 297-302.
71. See Richard Barnhart's discussion of this painting

(1983: 1°3-4)·
72. This painting is sometimes doubted, in part because it

was once owned by Zhang Daqian. However, it carves out
space and structures form in a way entirely alien to Zhang,
who had a twentieth-century fascination with surface. There
is one early collector's seal, only partly decipherable, in the
lower right-hand corner.
73· Schipper 1982: 145·
74. In addition to this painting and his 1697 reinscription

of the 1667 hanging scroll, a number of other paintings and
descriptions of Huangshan from the Dadi Tang years show
that it took on an intense Daoist significance for him. See in
particular his 1699 Huangshan handscroll for Xu Songling
(see Figure 16), which bears a long inscription, and his 1700
Huangshan handscroll for Su Pi (zi Yimen) (see Figure 107),
in the inscription to which he remembers his decisive visit to
the Peak of First Realization (which inspired his thoughts of
the Iron-Feet Daoist).

75. On Mount Tiantai, see Munakara 1990: 122-3.
76. For earlier studies of this painting in relation to Daoist

inner alchemy, see SLW 155-62,576-7; Kuo 1987; Burkus-
Chasson 1996. The following discussion is indebted to
Burkus-Chasson's research and translations, and follows her
in the use of the term "visuality." My convergent conclusion
on the importance of luminosity in the painting, on the oth-
er hand, was arrived at separately and by a different route.
77. Tiantong Temple in Zhejiang, of which Muchen be-

came the abbot, was popularly known as Little Mount Lu. See
Li Yesi 1988: 443, 646.
78. Burkus-Chasson 1996: 189 n. 3.
79. Owen 1981: 136.
80. In regard to some correspondences, see SLW 158-9.
81. Translation modified from Burkus-Chasson 1996: 186.
82. Burkus-Chasson 1996: 178.
83. Burkus-Chasson, commenting on the relationship be-

tween the image and this part of the text, instead stresses the
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at least one brother who was also a lay Buddhist UJZL] 128
nn. 32, 35); however, the eventual family connection is still un-
clear.
51. See Wang Shiqing 1987.
52. From [inmen shichao, cited in CuiJin 1987: 313.
53· The poem continues: "Your painting doesn't try to be

charming, lIt falls outside the ancient fa and comes instead
from your self. lOne can't use the criteria of ancient fa to judge
it: IYou're happy with it - why would you care if it pleases
your contemporaries or not? II remember when I first saw one
of your works/All I could find to say was that it was just a
game. /How could Ihave guessed that when I saw you brush
in hand lIt would be as far from careless as this? IYou capture
the idea beyond the idea lAnd even the irreality in reality.lIf
there are any traces that can be traced back [to formulae} I[For
you J it would be as if you had collected the dregs of the An-
cients. /With your strange character you make your own sol-
itary way,/Your extraordinary brush strikes the paper and
jumps up again./Vulgar silk and satin you leave empty in
piles, 10nly painting the palace paper of the Song and Ming
dynasties. IWho is there in the world to appreciate your paint-
ing? IYou just shake YOUl head and laugh endlessly!"

54. On the Chan metaphor of the circle, the classic study
is by Paul Demieville, translated as "The Mirror of the Mind"
(Demieville 1987).
55· Suojin qifeng da caogao, handscroll, 1691, Palace Mu-

seum, Beijing (STSHQJ pl. 60). See Vinograd 1992b.
56. For other discussions of this text and the development

of Shitao's art theory, see Chou 1977; Cahill 1982aj Zhang
Zining 1988; Strassberg 1989; Vinograd 1992b.

57. Faure (1991: 24) points out the centrality of "erring"
as an early Chan ideal.

58. Vinograd 1978. Another example of his response to
classicizing painting is his monumental 1691 landscape hand-
scroll for the same patron, entitled Suojin qifeng da caogao
(seen. 55).
59· Landscapes (twelve leaves), now in a Japanese private

collection. This album has been published as Shitao shanshui
tuyong. On Gengyin's lineage, see Mingfu 1978: 159-60.

60. See, notably, an undated album of landscapes in the
Tang Family Collection.
61. Yang 1994.
62. In 1699, for example, he was visited by the Tianjin

monk Shigao, whom he had known in the North (see Cui Jin
1987), and in 17°5, a monk whom Shitao calls Jiaogong pre-
sented him with an imperial Ming porcelain-handled brush
(Edwards 1967: 168). For his ongoing contact with his monk-
student Gengyin, including a thoroughly Chan encomium to
commemorate a sutra reading by Gengyin, see above, Chapter
8, n. 4.
63. The poems are inscribed at the end of his superb plum-

blossom handscroll from that year in the Palace Museum, Bei-
jing (see Figure 213).

64. Particularly noteworthy are rwo exuberant landscape
hanging scrolls from the later 1680s, one depicting the sacred
island-mountain of Penglai, that were probably intended as
birthday paintings but whose Daoist significance is not for that
reason to be discounted (STH] no. 19, Shanghai Museum; ST
2, Shanghai Museum). See also a hanging-scroll depiction of
Mount Huayang near Jingxian in Anhui, which he had visited
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disjunction between the two: "The reader/spectator ... moves
back and forth between two competing forms of attention, the
subject of the poem's ecstatic flight to the stars and the watch-
ful figures in the mountainscape who observe misty trees"
(ibid.: 176).
84. Schipper 1982: 22[-6.
8S. Xia Wenyan's Tuhui baojian (c. IJ6S). See Burkus-

Chasson 1996: 188 n. 32.
86. The color reproduction in ST 5 of this painting, a hang-

ing scroll in the Shanghai Museum, is entirely misleading.
87. From an undated monochrome landscape painting in a

Hong Kong private collection.
88. See Ryckmans 1970: 48.
89. The terms meng and mengyang originate in the Yijing

(Book of Changes), in the sentence: "The work ofthe sage is
to cultivate [yang] rightness from the basis of chaos [meng]."
For an excellent discussion of mengyang, see Ryckmans 1970:
48.
90. The fan is undated, but not undatable. Shima signs it

as having been written in the Great Cleansing Hall, thus plac-
ing it after 1696. The distinctive calligraphy, meanwhile, is
closely comparable to that of certain other texts he wrote out
at the beginning of his Dadizi period, placing it in 1697, or at
latest 1698. Shitao wrote out the fan for a certain Xiyu, "elder
brother in the Dao," who can possibly be identified with a mi-
nor Nanjing calligrapher of the time, Wang Guan. A fan paint-
ing in the Shanghai Museum dedicated to Xiyu that may orig-
inally have been the other side of the same fan is reproduced
in Zhongguo gudai shuhua tumu, vol. 5, Hu: 1-JI89). The
same Xiyu requested a second fan from Shitao in 1700, and
though the painting itself cannot be seen, a very interesting in-
scription is recorded that bears on our discussion: "My elder
brother Xiyu sent this fan to me. In the past I was willing to
'explicate the yellow' [i.e., explicate the Daoist principles of
the Way of the Yellow Emperor]. Today I use my hand to ex-
plain, while you must use your eyes to listen, beca use I do not
want others to know. Is this how it should be or not? In jest!"
(QXLRT] za}. It is tempting to think that the Huafa beiyuan
fan is a memento of the earlier occasion Shirao mentions, when
he "explicated the yellow" to Xiyu. Is it only coincidence that
"explication" (shuo) is the term he uses to describe the text in
his dedication?
91. The text is as follows: "In remote antiquity there were

no methods [fa]; the Primordial Simplicity [Taipu] had not yet
disintegrated. When the Primordial Simplicity disintegrated,
then methods were established. When methods were estab-
lished, they were established by men who had left the world.
What does this have to do with me? It is not to bring about
the disintegration of the Primordial Simplicity that I establish
methods. Nor does Oneness [YiJ establish methods in order to
reintegrate the Primordial Simplicity. [Instead], this is the es-
tablishment of the One-stroke [yihua] in the present, as One-
ness casts off the past. If the past is not cast off, then the pres-
ent cannot establish a means of painting. Painting is guided
by the heart-mind [xin]; the One-stroke is visible in Heaven.
When people have painting in them but do not paint, then they
go against their Heaven-given heart-mind, placing the Dao in
peril. Now, the Dao and painting are completely commensu-
rate. The One-stroke gives birth to the Dao. Outside the Dao
there can be no painting; outside painting there can be no Dao.

j

When painting is complete, the Dao is complete. Of the thou-
sand skills and the ten thousand transformations, there is not
one that does not begin and end in painting. The cyclical rev-
olutions of past and present are fixed in painting. When paint-
ing receives fixity, and cycles begin to revolve, this is painting.
Painting is the root of the ten thousand phenomena. It ban-
ishes the blindness in the ignorant, and gives residence to mys-
terious subtlety [xuanwel] on the basis of the One-stroke. Thus
men do not realize that the One-stroke comes from the estab-
lishment of methods in the wake of the disintegration of the
Primordial Simplicity. However, in painting, though I possess
methods I am not restricted to them." Shitao begins by inter-
preting "methods" (fa) in anthropological terms as fundamen-
tal patterns of purposeful human behavior. It is only in the fi-
nal sentence that fa is allowed to become simply the painting
methods of the treatise's title. The elasticity of meaning of fa,
passing from a philosophical to a merely theoretical level, is
paralleled in the way Shitao speaks of painting, though here
he uses two separate terms, yihua (the One-stroke) and hua
(painting). Both the vocabulary (the Primordial Simplicity,
Oneness, the Dao, mysterious subtlety) and the logic of Shi-
tao's argument make it absolutely clear that the philosophical-
religious context is Daoist.
92. Schipper 1982; Kohn 1993.
93. "What people know of Qingxiang [Shitao] is that his

use of brush and ink is lofty, archaic, strange and original;
they see his painting as inaccessible and difficult. They do not
realize his extreme detachment, his transcendence of thought,
his attainment of nonaction. He nourished his awareness at
Kuanglu [Mount Lu] and jingting, living with the trees and
the stones, wandering with the deer and the wild pigs. He long
submitted his destiny to the eight trigrarns of Heaven and
Earth. Then, when he came to be stimulated to encompass the
principles of the world, he painted decisively, and had the
means to do so."
94- These conceptual changes are accompanied by impor-

tant modifications of the rhetorical presentation of the argu-
ment. Largely eliminated from this version is his earlier con-
cern with the issue of Ancients and Moderns, rooted in his
individualist quarrel with classicizing artists. Not that the is-
sue is abandoned - it survives at the end of the first paragraph,
and receives separate, monumental treatment in Chapter Three
of the treatise - but its subordination here allows Shitao to fo-
cus his argument more narrowly on the significance of praxis.
9S· Strassberg 1989: 54-6.
96. Ibid.: 57.
97. The Hua pu version of the first chapter significantly

abbreviates the text at a number of points, in the interest, it
would seem, of eliminating repetitions and arriving at a more
economical expression of Shitao's ideas. The final citation is
also dearly attributed to Confucius, which is not the case in
the Huayu lu version.
98. Ryckmans 1970; Strassberg 1989.
99. For more comprehensive interpretations of the text

see: Huang Lanpo 1963; Chou 1969, 1977; Ryckmans 1970;
Chou 1978; Coleman 1978; Jiang Yihan 1982; Nakamura
Shigeo 1985; Strassberg 1989.
ICO. Yinyun is another term derived from the Yijing (Book

of Changes). See Ryckmans 1970: 58-9.
101. Schipper 1982: S9.
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114· Brokaw 1991: 240.
lIS. Ibid.
116. For an extensive compilation of official and private

texts documenting the attempts at control, see Wang Liqi
1981.
"7· Furth 1990: 198.
1I8. Holmgren 1985; Rowe 1992.
119· Struve, ed. and trans. 1993.
120. Translation from Brokaw 1991: 18-19.
121. A. J. Hay 1992: 4.12.
122. Among plentiful examples: On the Donglin thinker

Liu Zongzhou's emphasis on physical appearance and deport-
ment, see Brokaw 1991: 128-38; on Donglin support for com-
mercialism, see Peterson 1979: 71-3; on Li Zhi's championing
of so-called heterodox literature, see Billeter 1979; on Wang
Fuzhi's moral philosophy, see Wakeman 1985: 1087-90, who
uses the term" functionalist" to describe it.
123. A. J. Hay 1984.
124. A. J. Hay 1992: 4.15.
I2S· Ibid.: 4.14-4.15.
126. Wang Yuanqi's landscape structures are notable for

their accommodation of the autonomy of individual compo-
nents; the overall hierarchical order is negotiated rather than
simply conforming to a preexisting schema.
127. Of course, forms can play an integrative role, too. As

James L.Watson (1988) points out, the performance of ritual
could be as important as belief. Nonetheless, this is integration
at a different level, and of a different kind, from that of an op-
erative belief system. In my view of the rhetorical nature of
Qing orthodoxy, lowe a methodological debt to Michel de
Certeau's (1988) interpretation of the evolving relationship
between French rulers and Catholicism in the seventeenth and
eighteenth centuries.
128. As such, Shitao's utopianism owed much to that of Li

Zhi who, as jean-Francois Billeter (1979) has shown, aimed
at a renewal of public ethics, not hesitating to expose the mul-
tiple contradictions of the ideology of the dynastic COsmosin
the process. However, whereas the political problem of the
state was central in Li Zhi's thinking, Shitao's reference point
beyond painting and religion was the social problem of eco-
nomic survival within urban society.

NOTES TO PP. 276-84

102. Chapters Nine through Eleven form a group devoted
to the structure of the pictorial illusion, from the rnicrostruc-
turallevel of texturing, to composition, and then the combi-
nation of motifs within the composition. In Chapters Twelve
to Fourteen, Shitao turns to the motifs themselves, with sep-
arate discussions of forests and trees, ocean waves, and the
ways of creating atmosphere and mood.
103. One has the impression that Chapter Seventeen, "In-

tegrating Calligraphy," was included at this point because
there was no other place for it, yet it could not be left out.
104· Secularization is especially clear in scientific thought.

Chang and Chang (1992: 295) argue for the emergence of a
new cosmology in the work of the scientific writers Zhu Cai-
yu (1536-16If), Tang Hezheng (r537-1619), Wang Zheng
(1571-1644), and Song Yingxing: "They raised fundamental
doubts about the intellectual ground and validity of traditional
Confucian conceptions and interpretations of the supreme su-
pernatural T'ien (Heaven), redefined the relations between na-
ture and man, and advanced new theories about the structure
of the universe." See also Henderson 1977, 1984.
lOS· Furth r990: 206. See also Rowe r992: 7-8.
106. Writing on intellectual dissent against orthodox fam-

ily values in the Qing, Furth (1990: 206) states: "Dissent ...
involved no religiously or cosmically based belief system. The
dissenters' weapon was satire directed at ritual hypocrisy; their
rebellion led more to an evasion of the core structure of Chi-
nese familialism than to demands for its transformation."
107. For example, the late Ming novel The Romance of the

Three Teachings, studied in Berling 1985.
108. Rowe 1992.
109. A good example of this discourse is the Yangzhou-

merchant apologia, "Account of the Bitter Feeling of the
Liang-Huai Salt Merchants," in LHYFZ 1693: 1985-2006.
Merchants on long journeys "risked their bodies [shi qi shen]."
The average consumer was "the single body of a standard per-
son [zhangren yi shen]" (1997-8). The merchant needs mid-
dlemen because he is "only one body [bu guo -yi shen e-]" who
"has no means of dividing up his body [wu fenshen zhi fashi]
(1992). The fragile finances of most salt merchants mean that
"they are like men with an internal illness. To look at them
physically from the outside, they all seem strong men. To
watch them eat and move around they also seem to surpass
ordinary men. But when their inner illness strikes, they die
suddenly and no medicine can save them" (1994). On the
individual struggle for survival, see also Berling 1985: 214·
Also relevant is the new importance of autobiography; see
Wu 1990.
110. Berling 1985: 216. The theme of self-reliance recurs

constantly in writing by and about Huizhou merchants.
III. On prices and societal "illness," see LHYFZ 1693:

t998.
112. On social roles as noninrerchangeable, see LHYFZ

1693: 2007. On commerce as a naturally self-regulating or-
ganism that government intervention was likely to damage,
see ibid.: fI93.
113. The numerous accounts of merchant philanthropy in

LHYFZ 1693 make recurrent reference to the numbers of bod-
ies saved (and the amount of money spent). For a comprehen-
sive example, see the biography of Fang Ruting by Shitao's pa-
tron, Cheng Jun (ibid.: 2123-7).

TEN. PAINTINGS AS COMMODITIES

I. Master, 15-16.
2. Vinograd 1992a: 55.
3. Vinograd 1991b: 176-202.
4. Clunas I99L
5. The charge of eclecticism that used to be made against

later Chinese painters is about as close to a general recognition
of this practice as act history has come.

6. Landscape Album, 1702, leaf 12, China Art Gallery, Bei-
jing (reproduced in Zhongguo gudai shuhua tumu, vol. 1: 48).
7. See above, Chapter 1 (section "Painting and Moderni-

ty in Jiangnan").
8. The text continues: "Zhanghou [Chen Hongshou] is the

one who inherited the robes and begging bowl of (Wu] Daozi
and Longrnian [Li Gonglin]." Both of these artists were fa-
mous as lay-Buddhist artists. This text was originally com-
posed by Shirao for a colophon to one of Chen's paintings of
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disjunction between the two: "The reader/spectator ... moves
back and forth between two competing forms of attention, the
subject of the poem's ecstatic flight to the stars and the watch-
ful figures in the mountainscape who observe misty trees"
(ibid.: 176).
84. Schipper 1982: 22[-6.
8S. Xia Wenyan's Tuhui baojian (c. IJ6S). See Burkus-

Chasson 1996: 188 n. 32.
86. The color reproduction in ST 5 of this painting, a hang-

ing scroll in the Shanghai Museum, is entirely misleading.
87. From an undated monochrome landscape painting in a

Hong Kong private collection.
88. See Ryckmans 1970: 48.
89. The terms meng and mengyang originate in the Yijing

(Book of Changes), in the sentence: "The work ofthe sage is
to cultivate [yang] rightness from the basis of chaos [meng]."
For an excellent discussion of mengyang, see Ryckmans 1970:
48.
90. The fan is undated, but not undatable. Shima signs it

as having been written in the Great Cleansing Hall, thus plac-
ing it after 1696. The distinctive calligraphy, meanwhile, is
closely comparable to that of certain other texts he wrote out
at the beginning of his Dadizi period, placing it in 1697, or at
latest 1698. Shitao wrote out the fan for a certain Xiyu, "elder
brother in the Dao," who can possibly be identified with a mi-
nor Nanjing calligrapher of the time, Wang Guan. A fan paint-
ing in the Shanghai Museum dedicated to Xiyu that may orig-
inally have been the other side of the same fan is reproduced
in Zhongguo gudai shuhua tumu, vol. 5, Hu: 1-JI89). The
same Xiyu requested a second fan from Shitao in 1700, and
though the painting itself cannot be seen, a very interesting in-
scription is recorded that bears on our discussion: "My elder
brother Xiyu sent this fan to me. In the past I was willing to
'explicate the yellow' [i.e., explicate the Daoist principles of
the Way of the Yellow Emperor]. Today I use my hand to ex-
plain, while you must use your eyes to listen, beca use I do not
want others to know. Is this how it should be or not? In jest!"
(QXLRT] za}. It is tempting to think that the Huafa beiyuan
fan is a memento of the earlier occasion Shirao mentions, when
he "explicated the yellow" to Xiyu. Is it only coincidence that
"explication" (shuo) is the term he uses to describe the text in
his dedication?
91. The text is as follows: "In remote antiquity there were

no methods [fa]; the Primordial Simplicity [Taipu] had not yet
disintegrated. When the Primordial Simplicity disintegrated,
then methods were established. When methods were estab-
lished, they were established by men who had left the world.
What does this have to do with me? It is not to bring about
the disintegration of the Primordial Simplicity that I establish
methods. Nor does Oneness [YiJ establish methods in order to
reintegrate the Primordial Simplicity. [Instead], this is the es-
tablishment of the One-stroke [yihua] in the present, as One-
ness casts off the past. If the past is not cast off, then the pres-
ent cannot establish a means of painting. Painting is guided
by the heart-mind [xin]; the One-stroke is visible in Heaven.
When people have painting in them but do not paint, then they
go against their Heaven-given heart-mind, placing the Dao in
peril. Now, the Dao and painting are completely commensu-
rate. The One-stroke gives birth to the Dao. Outside the Dao
there can be no painting; outside painting there can be no Dao.

j

When painting is complete, the Dao is complete. Of the thou-
sand skills and the ten thousand transformations, there is not
one that does not begin and end in painting. The cyclical rev-
olutions of past and present are fixed in painting. When paint-
ing receives fixity, and cycles begin to revolve, this is painting.
Painting is the root of the ten thousand phenomena. It ban-
ishes the blindness in the ignorant, and gives residence to mys-
terious subtlety [xuanwel] on the basis of the One-stroke. Thus
men do not realize that the One-stroke comes from the estab-
lishment of methods in the wake of the disintegration of the
Primordial Simplicity. However, in painting, though I possess
methods I am not restricted to them." Shitao begins by inter-
preting "methods" (fa) in anthropological terms as fundamen-
tal patterns of purposeful human behavior. It is only in the fi-
nal sentence that fa is allowed to become simply the painting
methods of the treatise's title. The elasticity of meaning of fa,
passing from a philosophical to a merely theoretical level, is
paralleled in the way Shitao speaks of painting, though here
he uses two separate terms, yihua (the One-stroke) and hua
(painting). Both the vocabulary (the Primordial Simplicity,
Oneness, the Dao, mysterious subtlety) and the logic of Shi-
tao's argument make it absolutely clear that the philosophical-
religious context is Daoist.
92. Schipper 1982; Kohn 1993.
93. "What people know of Qingxiang [Shitao] is that his

use of brush and ink is lofty, archaic, strange and original;
they see his painting as inaccessible and difficult. They do not
realize his extreme detachment, his transcendence of thought,
his attainment of nonaction. He nourished his awareness at
Kuanglu [Mount Lu] and jingting, living with the trees and
the stones, wandering with the deer and the wild pigs. He long
submitted his destiny to the eight trigrarns of Heaven and
Earth. Then, when he came to be stimulated to encompass the
principles of the world, he painted decisively, and had the
means to do so."
94- These conceptual changes are accompanied by impor-

tant modifications of the rhetorical presentation of the argu-
ment. Largely eliminated from this version is his earlier con-
cern with the issue of Ancients and Moderns, rooted in his
individualist quarrel with classicizing artists. Not that the is-
sue is abandoned - it survives at the end of the first paragraph,
and receives separate, monumental treatment in Chapter Three
of the treatise - but its subordination here allows Shitao to fo-
cus his argument more narrowly on the significance of praxis.
9S· Strassberg 1989: 54-6.
96. Ibid.: 57.
97. The Hua pu version of the first chapter significantly

abbreviates the text at a number of points, in the interest, it
would seem, of eliminating repetitions and arriving at a more
economical expression of Shitao's ideas. The final citation is
also dearly attributed to Confucius, which is not the case in
the Huayu lu version.
98. Ryckmans 1970; Strassberg 1989.
99. For more comprehensive interpretations of the text

see: Huang Lanpo 1963; Chou 1969, 1977; Ryckmans 1970;
Chou 1978; Coleman 1978; Jiang Yihan 1982; Nakamura
Shigeo 1985; Strassberg 1989.
ICO. Yinyun is another term derived from the Yijing (Book

of Changes). See Ryckmans 1970: 58-9.
101. Schipper 1982: S9.

I

I

114· Brokaw 1991: 240.
lIS. Ibid.
116. For an extensive compilation of official and private

texts documenting the attempts at control, see Wang Liqi
1981.
"7· Furth 1990: 198.
1I8. Holmgren 1985; Rowe 1992.
119· Struve, ed. and trans. 1993.
120. Translation from Brokaw 1991: 18-19.
121. A. J. Hay 1992: 4.12.
122. Among plentiful examples: On the Donglin thinker

Liu Zongzhou's emphasis on physical appearance and deport-
ment, see Brokaw 1991: 128-38; on Donglin support for com-
mercialism, see Peterson 1979: 71-3; on Li Zhi's championing
of so-called heterodox literature, see Billeter 1979; on Wang
Fuzhi's moral philosophy, see Wakeman 1985: 1087-90, who
uses the term" functionalist" to describe it.
123. A. J. Hay 1984.
124. A. J. Hay 1992: 4.15.
I2S· Ibid.: 4.14-4.15.
126. Wang Yuanqi's landscape structures are notable for

their accommodation of the autonomy of individual compo-
nents; the overall hierarchical order is negotiated rather than
simply conforming to a preexisting schema.
127. Of course, forms can play an integrative role, too. As

James L.Watson (1988) points out, the performance of ritual
could be as important as belief. Nonetheless, this is integration
at a different level, and of a different kind, from that of an op-
erative belief system. In my view of the rhetorical nature of
Qing orthodoxy, lowe a methodological debt to Michel de
Certeau's (1988) interpretation of the evolving relationship
between French rulers and Catholicism in the seventeenth and
eighteenth centuries.
128. As such, Shitao's utopianism owed much to that of Li

Zhi who, as jean-Francois Billeter (1979) has shown, aimed
at a renewal of public ethics, not hesitating to expose the mul-
tiple contradictions of the ideology of the dynastic COsmosin
the process. However, whereas the political problem of the
state was central in Li Zhi's thinking, Shitao's reference point
beyond painting and religion was the social problem of eco-
nomic survival within urban society.
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102. Chapters Nine through Eleven form a group devoted
to the structure of the pictorial illusion, from the rnicrostruc-
turallevel of texturing, to composition, and then the combi-
nation of motifs within the composition. In Chapters Twelve
to Fourteen, Shitao turns to the motifs themselves, with sep-
arate discussions of forests and trees, ocean waves, and the
ways of creating atmosphere and mood.
103. One has the impression that Chapter Seventeen, "In-

tegrating Calligraphy," was included at this point because
there was no other place for it, yet it could not be left out.
104· Secularization is especially clear in scientific thought.

Chang and Chang (1992: 295) argue for the emergence of a
new cosmology in the work of the scientific writers Zhu Cai-
yu (1536-16If), Tang Hezheng (r537-1619), Wang Zheng
(1571-1644), and Song Yingxing: "They raised fundamental
doubts about the intellectual ground and validity of traditional
Confucian conceptions and interpretations of the supreme su-
pernatural T'ien (Heaven), redefined the relations between na-
ture and man, and advanced new theories about the structure
of the universe." See also Henderson 1977, 1984.
lOS· Furth r990: 206. See also Rowe r992: 7-8.
106. Writing on intellectual dissent against orthodox fam-

ily values in the Qing, Furth (1990: 206) states: "Dissent ...
involved no religiously or cosmically based belief system. The
dissenters' weapon was satire directed at ritual hypocrisy; their
rebellion led more to an evasion of the core structure of Chi-
nese familialism than to demands for its transformation."
107. For example, the late Ming novel The Romance of the

Three Teachings, studied in Berling 1985.
108. Rowe 1992.
109. A good example of this discourse is the Yangzhou-

merchant apologia, "Account of the Bitter Feeling of the
Liang-Huai Salt Merchants," in LHYFZ 1693: 1985-2006.
Merchants on long journeys "risked their bodies [shi qi shen]."
The average consumer was "the single body of a standard per-
son [zhangren yi shen]" (1997-8). The merchant needs mid-
dlemen because he is "only one body [bu guo -yi shen e-]" who
"has no means of dividing up his body [wu fenshen zhi fashi]
(1992). The fragile finances of most salt merchants mean that
"they are like men with an internal illness. To look at them
physically from the outside, they all seem strong men. To
watch them eat and move around they also seem to surpass
ordinary men. But when their inner illness strikes, they die
suddenly and no medicine can save them" (1994). On the
individual struggle for survival, see also Berling 1985: 214·
Also relevant is the new importance of autobiography; see
Wu 1990.
110. Berling 1985: 216. The theme of self-reliance recurs

constantly in writing by and about Huizhou merchants.
III. On prices and societal "illness," see LHYFZ 1693:

t998.
112. On social roles as noninrerchangeable, see LHYFZ

1693: 2007. On commerce as a naturally self-regulating or-
ganism that government intervention was likely to damage,
see ibid.: fI93.
113. The numerous accounts of merchant philanthropy in

LHYFZ 1693 make recurrent reference to the numbers of bod-
ies saved (and the amount of money spent). For a comprehen-
sive example, see the biography of Fang Ruting by Shitao's pa-
tron, Cheng Jun (ibid.: 2123-7).

TEN. PAINTINGS AS COMMODITIES

I. Master, 15-16.
2. Vinograd 1992a: 55.
3. Vinograd 1991b: 176-202.
4. Clunas I99L
5. The charge of eclecticism that used to be made against

later Chinese painters is about as close to a general recognition
of this practice as act history has come.

6. Landscape Album, 1702, leaf 12, China Art Gallery, Bei-
jing (reproduced in Zhongguo gudai shuhua tumu, vol. 1: 48).
7. See above, Chapter 1 (section "Painting and Moderni-

ty in Jiangnan").
8. The text continues: "Zhanghou [Chen Hongshou] is the

one who inherited the robes and begging bowl of (Wu] Daozi
and Longrnian [Li Gonglin]." Both of these artists were fa-
mous as lay-Buddhist artists. This text was originally com-
posed by Shirao for a colophon to one of Chen's paintings of
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women and later transcribed on one of a group of album
leaves in the Shanghai Museum (reproduced in Zhongguo
gudai shuhua tumu, vol. 4, Hu: 1-2747). The other texts tran-
scribed on these album leaves predate the album to which they
originally belonged (they are now mounted together with al-
bum leaves by Bacia Shanren) by some years.
9· My argument in this chapter owes a theoretical debt to

Guattari (1984) and de Certeau (r984).
10. Translation from Silbergeld 1974: 268.
II. I borrow here the terminology of Teresa Brennan

(1993: 82 ff.), but cannor agree with her speculation that "the
notion of psychical containment ... may be historically and
culturally specific to the modern West."
12. Master, 19.
13· I noted earlier that externally the construction of a fe-

male aesthetic in painting permitted the constitution of the pic-
torial self as male territory; while the development of Sino--
Western painting similarly isolated the ethnically foreign in a
way that made possible a self-conscious conception of paint-
ing as Chinese. To which it might be added that both of these
forbidden realms were nonetheless constantly plundered, a
fact that had to be repressed internally in order to preserve
their "inferior" alterity as a source of authority. The cracks in
the system became more visible in the eighteenth century.
14· Translation modified from Vinograd '995: 67.
IS· See also the autobiography of Mao Qiling (r6'3-

1716), discussed by Wu (1990: 173-86).
16. Li Lin also gives another account of a dream by Shitao

in his "Record of a Dream Journey of Dadizi." The journey
took Shitao on a dream visit to Li Lin, and was recorded by
the artist in the form of a painting. The text, the painting, and
Shirac's other reported dreams are discussed in Vinograd 1995.
17· Yuan Qixu (zi Shidan, bao Zhongjiang), from Xuan-

cheng, lived in Wuhu. According to Jin Zhixing (1703: 495-6)
he cultivated a heroic, virile persona in his poetry, prose, and
calligraphy.
18. Compendium of Literature from the Sandalwood Table

(Zhang Chao and Wang Zhuo, eds. 1992) was first published
in three volumes between 1695 and 1697; Compendium of
Literature of the Present Age (Zhang Chao, ed. 1990; Zhang
Chao and Zhang Jian, eds. 1990) followed, again in three vol-
umes, between 1697 and 1703.
19· Jiang Zhilan, "Xiangxue tang leshi," in Zhang Chao

and Wang Zhuo, eds. 1992: yuji, shanglIoa-b; Shi Qing, "Yi-
quan yashi," ibid.: shang!I4a-b
20. Ding Xiongfei, "jiuxi ta ji," in Zhang Chao and Wang

Zhuo, eds. 1992: erii, juan 38.
21. For ink, see Zhang Renxi, "Xue tang mo pin" (Zhang

Chao and Wang Zhuo, eds. 1992: erji, juan 40); Song Luo,
"Man tang mo pin" (ibid.: erji, juan 41). For seal paste, see
Wang Haojing, "Zini fa dingmu" (ibid.: erji, juan 45). For
inkstones, see Gao Zhao, "Duanxi yanshi kao" (ibid.: chuji,
juan 45); Yu Huai, "Yan lin" (Zhang Chao, ed. 1990: jiaji,
76-80). For litchis, see Chen Ding, "Lizhi pu" (ibid.: jiaji,
87-9)· For hortensia, see Zhu Xianzu, "Zhanhua zhi" (ibid.:
bingji, 500-2). For crabs, see Zhu Renhuo, "Xu xie pu" (ibid.:
bingji, 5°8-9). For fish, see Chen Jian, "Jiangnan yuxian pin"
(Zhang Chao and Wang Zhuo, eds. I992: chuJi, juan 48). For
Yinshan tea, see Zhou Gaoqi, "Yin cha xi" (ibid.: erji, juan
47); Mao Xiang, "Yinshan huichao" (Zhang Chao, ed. t990:
jiaji,75-6).
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22. Ding Xiongfei, "Guhuan she yue," in Zhang Chao and
Wang Zhuo, eds. 1992: erii, juan 31.

23· Shi Chongjie, "Qing xie," in Zhang Chao and Wang
Zhuo, eds. 1992: yuji, shang/19a-b; Fang Xiangying, "Gen
tang shi xie," ibid.: yuji, shang/33a-35aj Wu Sugong, "Doufu
xie," ibid.: yuji, shang/r7a-18b.
24· Zhang Jin, "Fangyuan qingyu," in Zhang Chao and

Wang Zhuo, eds. 1992: erji, juan 32.
25· Song Qin, "Renpu butu," in Zhang Chao and Wang

Zhuo, eds. 1992: erji, juan 3.
26. For a poem thanking Shitao for a meal, see Li Lin 1708:

7/49.
27· Finnane 1985: 297.
28. I wonder if all the citations are not an indication that

the Cloud Cliff Library (Yunyan Shuwu) where Shitao painted
the album was a bookshop that sold paintings. On another
occasion at the same site Shitao wrote a colophon for a paint-
ing of Huangshan pines by Xuezhuang's student, the monk-
painter Yizhi. See DDZTHSB 4/84.
29· This painting is badly damaged and much retouched.
30. The essay is translated in full in SLW 288-90.
3I. From his album of orchid paintings, discussed above in

Chapter 5 (section "Jingjiang Descendant"). See DDZTHSB
2/42-3.
32· A note by Shitao to this line reads: "In the old city of

Yangzhou there is a Makeup Pavilion where the wife of Chang
Yuchun lived at the beginning of the Ming dynasty." Chang
Yuchun (13 30-69) was one of Zhu Yuanzhang's leading gen-
erals.
33· Xiao Cuo, for example, had a vegetable gardener de-

liver vegetables to Li Lin as a gift. Li Lin 1708: 7/68a.
34· Reproduced in Exhibition of Paintings of the Ming and

Ching Periods, cat. no. 46(a).
35· Four leaves are reproduced in ST 85-6. The album is

dedicated to a certain Feng Liao'an, who is also mentioned in
a poem in a 1683 album of poetry, also in the Shanghai Mu-
seum (ST 69).
36. Translation modified from Fu and Fu 1973: 241.
37· It is perhaps worth noting that one of his most tender

early memory paintings, an illustration of a 1667 poem in the
1680 Landscapes for Wu Canxi (Palace Museum, Beijing), de-
picts a young servant waiting anxiously at the gate for the art-
ist, who had lost track of the time and was late in returning
home (STSHQ] pl. 10).
38. A. J. Hay: I994a. The same went for rocklike moun-

tains, bringing to mind the phallic "sugarloaf" mountains that
served Shitao as a lifetime landscape signature. The furious en-
ergy that sometimes went into them betrays the displacement
from a libidinal realm. Then again, a sexual metaphor was
fundamental to the Chinese concept of landscape, written into
its cosmogonic structure as a process of yin-yang interaction
between mountain and water. If this metaphor was highlighted
by Shitao in a Daoist rhetoric of landscape representation, and
thus had a respectable philosophic alibi, there exist paintings
in which the metaphor itself was pushed toward a more explic-
itly sexual formulation than the rhetoric required, incorporat-
ing allusions to the most private recesses of the body. In the
Landscapes for Yu Daoren (c. 1686-9) is one, a cleft hill rem-
iniscent of thighs or buttocks, the thin line of the waterfall
opening around a slitlike form, as shrubs sprout hairlike above
(Edwards 1967: 147). This is one waterfall at which the male

inhabitants of the painting do gaze. Hardly less explicit is the
shrub-covered mound in a leaf of the Landscapes for Yao Man
(1693), in the folds of which nestles a bubbling spring (Ming
and Qing Painting from the Guangzhou Art Gallery, 1986: cat.
no. 34.4). Nestled against it, an iconic building stares out like
a displaced human face. The inscription admits literally to the
unspeakable: "When a painting reaches the soundlessness [of
poetry], how does one dare add a poem?" In Sbirao's 1698
portrait [with Jiang Heng] of Wu Yuqiao, the slit of the front
of the young man's overrobe is echoed by a cleft in the bank
on which he stands, at the end of which sits an appropriately
phallic rock to provide a displaced metaphor of virility (see
Figure 28).
39. I here borrow John Hay's "dictionary-equivalent"

translation (A. J. Hay 1984: I03). He also offers an explan-
atory rendering on p. 135. Hay's article is the best discussion
of the issues surrounding the aesthetics of the trace in Chinese
painting.
40. Cahill 198,a: 2I8-25.
41. From Chapter Sixteen of Shitao's treatise, translated

above, Chapter 9 (section "Oneness and the Perfected Man:
Shirao's Treatise on Painting").
42. Chaves 1983.
43. Palace Museum, Beijing. Reproduced in folio form as

Daoji huace (1960). A similar album, of landscape subjects,
painted just a couple of months later, is in the National His-
tory Museum, Taiwan.
44. Plum Blossom, hanging scroll, 1699, Shanghai Muse-

um (STH] no. 48; ST 45).
45. Hibiscus, Lotus, and Rock (see Figure 194)·
46. Flowers, dated 1707, leaf 12, formerly Christie's. Re-

produced in Edwards 1967: 186.
47. See Wanli's Porcelain-handled Brush, a calligraphy

hanging scroll from 1705 in the University of Michigan Mu-
seum of Art (Edwards 1967: 168), and other examples dis-
cussed later in this section.
48. Ryckmans 1970: 87-8.
49. Other extreme works include a 1706 landscape album

painted for Huang Ziqing in 1706, now split between the
Hashimoto Collection and another Japanese private collection
(see Edwards 1967: 178-9 for four leaves); and an unpub-
lished landscape hanging scroll in the Zhenjiang Museum.
50. Illustrations to Poems by Zhu Yunming, album, c.

17°7, formerly Christie's (see Figure II8 for one leaf).
51. See A. J. Hay I994b.
52. On the economy of psychical energy, see Brennan 1993:

102-17.
53. Gu Guorui and Liu Hui I98Ib.
54. Cynthia Brokaw (1991: 176) notes in seventeenth- and

eighteenth-century moral ledgers an "effort to persuade ledger
users to 'rest in their status' (anfen) or 'take pleasure in the
fate bestowed by heaven' (letian anming)."
55. For the concept of habitability, see de Certeau 1984.
56. For vivid descriptions of this situation, see the early-

eighteenth-century novel The Unofficial History of the Schol-
ars (Rulin waishi).
57. I borrow this distinction between strategies and tactics

from de Certeau 1984.
58. Yu Binshuo I983.
59. Reproduced in Fu and Fu 1973: 306.
60. Li Lin 1708: 7/67.

I. On the basis of the close similarity of the calligraphy to
letter 21.

2. Shitao appears to have written by error the character
wan, "evening, late" instead of wan, "to complete."

61. Vinograd I99Ib.
62. Although Cangzhou is the hao of Chen Pengnian, Chen

was still under house arrest in Nanjing in the autumn of 1705
and could not have made a visit to Yangzhou. The Cangzhou
in question is someone whom Shitao knew in Beijing: See Shi-
tao's 1691 handscroll (Museum of Fine Arts, Boston) for the
birthday of a certain Tongjun, which bears an inscribed poem
matching Cangzhou's rhyme (Ishikawa Jun et al. 1976: 62-3).
63. Flowers, dated 1707 formerly Christie's (see Figures

198, 220); Reminiscences of Jinling, Sackler Collection (see
Figures 214-219); Flowers and Fruit (see Figure 125; dat-
ed simply to autumn, this album bears seals that were not
in use until after the autumn of 1706); Chrysanthemums, be-
queathed to Li Lin, recorded in Li Lin 1708: 7167; Land-
scapes and Calligraphies (twelve each), remounted as a hand-
scroll, recorded in Cheng Linsheng, ed. 1925; Terrace of the
Yellow Emperor at Huangshan, hanging scroll, Tianjin Munic-
ipal Museum (see Plate 15; dated to the tenth month, again
this work bears seals that were not in use as early as that
month of 1706); Landscape, hanging scroll, Zhenjiang Mu-
seum (unpublished).
64. From another of his four elegies. Li Lin 1708: 7167.
65. QXLRT] r8b; Ruan Yuan 1920.
66. See Wu Jiaji 1980: 75.
67. Barnhart 1972: 63. The poem speaks in fact of two

trees, and there exists another illustration of the same poem,
in an album from late 17°4 for his student Wang Jueshi, in
which he painted both (Jingyuan Zhai Collection, reproduced
in Suzuki, ed. 1982-3: vol. 1,331 lA30-003, 5lro]).
68. Reproduced in Fu and Fu 1973: 304.
69. Reproduced in Edwards 1967: 18+

APPENDIX ONE. CHRONOLOGY OF SHITAO'S LIFE

I. The following is a list, by author's name and entry num-
ber, of collected poetry and/or prose works by thirty-six
friends and acquaintances of Shitao that could not be consult-
ed for this study but are listed in a recently published index of
rare books and manuscripts (Zhongguo guji shanben shumu
1996): Chaoyong 12973; Chen Ding II 517; Chen Pengnian
12852,12853,12854; Chen Yixi 12684.12685,12686; Dai
Benxiao 11560; Fei Xihuang 13421; Gao Yong 12433; Gong
Xian 10938; Huang Kui 11565, 12699; Huang Sheng 11583;
Huang Yun 11561; Li Guosong 12790; Li Tianfu 11921; Mei
Geng 12765; Mei Qing 11855, 11856, 11857, 11858; Mu-
chen Daomin 1°9°2, 10903; Qu Dajun 121°3, 12104, 121°7,
12108; Sang Zhi II448; Shi Pang 13438, 13439; Tang Zu-
ming 13410; Wang Fengrong 11920; Wang Hongdu 12969;
Wang Shihong 12919, 12920; Wang Zehong 11811; Wang
Zhongru 12175, 12176; Wang Wei 12779; Wu Canxi 12241;
Wu Chengli 12535; Wu Sugong rr633, rr634; Xian Zhu
13480; Yang Zhongna 12848; Yueduan 13445, 13446; Zha
Shibiao 11357; Zhang Chao 12711, 12712, 12713; Zhang
Zhu 12705; Zhou Sisheng rr978, II979.

APPENDIX TWO. LETTERS
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women and later transcribed on one of a group of album
leaves in the Shanghai Museum (reproduced in Zhongguo
gudai shuhua tumu, vol. 4, Hu: 1-2747). The other texts tran-
scribed on these album leaves predate the album to which they
originally belonged (they are now mounted together with al-
bum leaves by Bacia Shanren) by some years.
9· My argument in this chapter owes a theoretical debt to

Guattari (1984) and de Certeau (r984).
10. Translation from Silbergeld 1974: 268.
II. I borrow here the terminology of Teresa Brennan

(1993: 82 ff.), but cannor agree with her speculation that "the
notion of psychical containment ... may be historically and
culturally specific to the modern West."
12. Master, 19.
13· I noted earlier that externally the construction of a fe-

male aesthetic in painting permitted the constitution of the pic-
torial self as male territory; while the development of Sino--
Western painting similarly isolated the ethnically foreign in a
way that made possible a self-conscious conception of paint-
ing as Chinese. To which it might be added that both of these
forbidden realms were nonetheless constantly plundered, a
fact that had to be repressed internally in order to preserve
their "inferior" alterity as a source of authority. The cracks in
the system became more visible in the eighteenth century.
14· Translation modified from Vinograd '995: 67.
IS· See also the autobiography of Mao Qiling (r6'3-

1716), discussed by Wu (1990: 173-86).
16. Li Lin also gives another account of a dream by Shitao

in his "Record of a Dream Journey of Dadizi." The journey
took Shitao on a dream visit to Li Lin, and was recorded by
the artist in the form of a painting. The text, the painting, and
Shirac's other reported dreams are discussed in Vinograd 1995.
17· Yuan Qixu (zi Shidan, bao Zhongjiang), from Xuan-

cheng, lived in Wuhu. According to Jin Zhixing (1703: 495-6)
he cultivated a heroic, virile persona in his poetry, prose, and
calligraphy.
18. Compendium of Literature from the Sandalwood Table

(Zhang Chao and Wang Zhuo, eds. 1992) was first published
in three volumes between 1695 and 1697; Compendium of
Literature of the Present Age (Zhang Chao, ed. 1990; Zhang
Chao and Zhang Jian, eds. 1990) followed, again in three vol-
umes, between 1697 and 1703.
19· Jiang Zhilan, "Xiangxue tang leshi," in Zhang Chao

and Wang Zhuo, eds. 1992: yuji, shanglIoa-b; Shi Qing, "Yi-
quan yashi," ibid.: shang!I4a-b
20. Ding Xiongfei, "jiuxi ta ji," in Zhang Chao and Wang

Zhuo, eds. 1992: erii, juan 38.
21. For ink, see Zhang Renxi, "Xue tang mo pin" (Zhang

Chao and Wang Zhuo, eds. 1992: erji, juan 40); Song Luo,
"Man tang mo pin" (ibid.: erji, juan 41). For seal paste, see
Wang Haojing, "Zini fa dingmu" (ibid.: erji, juan 45). For
inkstones, see Gao Zhao, "Duanxi yanshi kao" (ibid.: chuji,
juan 45); Yu Huai, "Yan lin" (Zhang Chao, ed. 1990: jiaji,
76-80). For litchis, see Chen Ding, "Lizhi pu" (ibid.: jiaji,
87-9)· For hortensia, see Zhu Xianzu, "Zhanhua zhi" (ibid.:
bingji, 500-2). For crabs, see Zhu Renhuo, "Xu xie pu" (ibid.:
bingji, 5°8-9). For fish, see Chen Jian, "Jiangnan yuxian pin"
(Zhang Chao and Wang Zhuo, eds. I992: chuJi, juan 48). For
Yinshan tea, see Zhou Gaoqi, "Yin cha xi" (ibid.: erji, juan
47); Mao Xiang, "Yinshan huichao" (Zhang Chao, ed. t990:
jiaji,75-6).
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22. Ding Xiongfei, "Guhuan she yue," in Zhang Chao and
Wang Zhuo, eds. 1992: erii, juan 31.

23· Shi Chongjie, "Qing xie," in Zhang Chao and Wang
Zhuo, eds. 1992: yuji, shang/19a-b; Fang Xiangying, "Gen
tang shi xie," ibid.: yuji, shang/33a-35aj Wu Sugong, "Doufu
xie," ibid.: yuji, shang/r7a-18b.
24· Zhang Jin, "Fangyuan qingyu," in Zhang Chao and

Wang Zhuo, eds. 1992: erji, juan 32.
25· Song Qin, "Renpu butu," in Zhang Chao and Wang

Zhuo, eds. 1992: erji, juan 3.
26. For a poem thanking Shitao for a meal, see Li Lin 1708:

7/49.
27· Finnane 1985: 297.
28. I wonder if all the citations are not an indication that

the Cloud Cliff Library (Yunyan Shuwu) where Shitao painted
the album was a bookshop that sold paintings. On another
occasion at the same site Shitao wrote a colophon for a paint-
ing of Huangshan pines by Xuezhuang's student, the monk-
painter Yizhi. See DDZTHSB 4/84.
29· This painting is badly damaged and much retouched.
30. The essay is translated in full in SLW 288-90.
3I. From his album of orchid paintings, discussed above in

Chapter 5 (section "Jingjiang Descendant"). See DDZTHSB
2/42-3.
32· A note by Shitao to this line reads: "In the old city of

Yangzhou there is a Makeup Pavilion where the wife of Chang
Yuchun lived at the beginning of the Ming dynasty." Chang
Yuchun (13 30-69) was one of Zhu Yuanzhang's leading gen-
erals.
33· Xiao Cuo, for example, had a vegetable gardener de-

liver vegetables to Li Lin as a gift. Li Lin 1708: 7/68a.
34· Reproduced in Exhibition of Paintings of the Ming and

Ching Periods, cat. no. 46(a).
35· Four leaves are reproduced in ST 85-6. The album is

dedicated to a certain Feng Liao'an, who is also mentioned in
a poem in a 1683 album of poetry, also in the Shanghai Mu-
seum (ST 69).
36. Translation modified from Fu and Fu 1973: 241.
37· It is perhaps worth noting that one of his most tender

early memory paintings, an illustration of a 1667 poem in the
1680 Landscapes for Wu Canxi (Palace Museum, Beijing), de-
picts a young servant waiting anxiously at the gate for the art-
ist, who had lost track of the time and was late in returning
home (STSHQ] pl. 10).
38. A. J. Hay: I994a. The same went for rocklike moun-

tains, bringing to mind the phallic "sugarloaf" mountains that
served Shitao as a lifetime landscape signature. The furious en-
ergy that sometimes went into them betrays the displacement
from a libidinal realm. Then again, a sexual metaphor was
fundamental to the Chinese concept of landscape, written into
its cosmogonic structure as a process of yin-yang interaction
between mountain and water. If this metaphor was highlighted
by Shitao in a Daoist rhetoric of landscape representation, and
thus had a respectable philosophic alibi, there exist paintings
in which the metaphor itself was pushed toward a more explic-
itly sexual formulation than the rhetoric required, incorporat-
ing allusions to the most private recesses of the body. In the
Landscapes for Yu Daoren (c. 1686-9) is one, a cleft hill rem-
iniscent of thighs or buttocks, the thin line of the waterfall
opening around a slitlike form, as shrubs sprout hairlike above
(Edwards 1967: 147). This is one waterfall at which the male

inhabitants of the painting do gaze. Hardly less explicit is the
shrub-covered mound in a leaf of the Landscapes for Yao Man
(1693), in the folds of which nestles a bubbling spring (Ming
and Qing Painting from the Guangzhou Art Gallery, 1986: cat.
no. 34.4). Nestled against it, an iconic building stares out like
a displaced human face. The inscription admits literally to the
unspeakable: "When a painting reaches the soundlessness [of
poetry], how does one dare add a poem?" In Sbirao's 1698
portrait [with Jiang Heng] of Wu Yuqiao, the slit of the front
of the young man's overrobe is echoed by a cleft in the bank
on which he stands, at the end of which sits an appropriately
phallic rock to provide a displaced metaphor of virility (see
Figure 28).
39. I here borrow John Hay's "dictionary-equivalent"

translation (A. J. Hay 1984: I03). He also offers an explan-
atory rendering on p. 135. Hay's article is the best discussion
of the issues surrounding the aesthetics of the trace in Chinese
painting.
40. Cahill 198,a: 2I8-25.
41. From Chapter Sixteen of Shitao's treatise, translated

above, Chapter 9 (section "Oneness and the Perfected Man:
Shirao's Treatise on Painting").
42. Chaves 1983.
43. Palace Museum, Beijing. Reproduced in folio form as

Daoji huace (1960). A similar album, of landscape subjects,
painted just a couple of months later, is in the National His-
tory Museum, Taiwan.
44. Plum Blossom, hanging scroll, 1699, Shanghai Muse-

um (STH] no. 48; ST 45).
45. Hibiscus, Lotus, and Rock (see Figure 194)·
46. Flowers, dated 1707, leaf 12, formerly Christie's. Re-

produced in Edwards 1967: 186.
47. See Wanli's Porcelain-handled Brush, a calligraphy

hanging scroll from 1705 in the University of Michigan Mu-
seum of Art (Edwards 1967: 168), and other examples dis-
cussed later in this section.
48. Ryckmans 1970: 87-8.
49. Other extreme works include a 1706 landscape album

painted for Huang Ziqing in 1706, now split between the
Hashimoto Collection and another Japanese private collection
(see Edwards 1967: 178-9 for four leaves); and an unpub-
lished landscape hanging scroll in the Zhenjiang Museum.
50. Illustrations to Poems by Zhu Yunming, album, c.

17°7, formerly Christie's (see Figure II8 for one leaf).
51. See A. J. Hay I994b.
52. On the economy of psychical energy, see Brennan 1993:

102-17.
53. Gu Guorui and Liu Hui I98Ib.
54. Cynthia Brokaw (1991: 176) notes in seventeenth- and

eighteenth-century moral ledgers an "effort to persuade ledger
users to 'rest in their status' (anfen) or 'take pleasure in the
fate bestowed by heaven' (letian anming)."
55. For the concept of habitability, see de Certeau 1984.
56. For vivid descriptions of this situation, see the early-

eighteenth-century novel The Unofficial History of the Schol-
ars (Rulin waishi).
57. I borrow this distinction between strategies and tactics

from de Certeau 1984.
58. Yu Binshuo I983.
59. Reproduced in Fu and Fu 1973: 306.
60. Li Lin 1708: 7/67.

I. On the basis of the close similarity of the calligraphy to
letter 21.

2. Shitao appears to have written by error the character
wan, "evening, late" instead of wan, "to complete."

61. Vinograd I99Ib.
62. Although Cangzhou is the hao of Chen Pengnian, Chen

was still under house arrest in Nanjing in the autumn of 1705
and could not have made a visit to Yangzhou. The Cangzhou
in question is someone whom Shitao knew in Beijing: See Shi-
tao's 1691 handscroll (Museum of Fine Arts, Boston) for the
birthday of a certain Tongjun, which bears an inscribed poem
matching Cangzhou's rhyme (Ishikawa Jun et al. 1976: 62-3).
63. Flowers, dated 1707 formerly Christie's (see Figures

198, 220); Reminiscences of Jinling, Sackler Collection (see
Figures 214-219); Flowers and Fruit (see Figure 125; dat-
ed simply to autumn, this album bears seals that were not
in use until after the autumn of 1706); Chrysanthemums, be-
queathed to Li Lin, recorded in Li Lin 1708: 7167; Land-
scapes and Calligraphies (twelve each), remounted as a hand-
scroll, recorded in Cheng Linsheng, ed. 1925; Terrace of the
Yellow Emperor at Huangshan, hanging scroll, Tianjin Munic-
ipal Museum (see Plate 15; dated to the tenth month, again
this work bears seals that were not in use as early as that
month of 1706); Landscape, hanging scroll, Zhenjiang Mu-
seum (unpublished).
64. From another of his four elegies. Li Lin 1708: 7167.
65. QXLRT] r8b; Ruan Yuan 1920.
66. See Wu Jiaji 1980: 75.
67. Barnhart 1972: 63. The poem speaks in fact of two

trees, and there exists another illustration of the same poem,
in an album from late 17°4 for his student Wang Jueshi, in
which he painted both (Jingyuan Zhai Collection, reproduced
in Suzuki, ed. 1982-3: vol. 1,331 lA30-003, 5lro]).
68. Reproduced in Fu and Fu 1973: 304.
69. Reproduced in Edwards 1967: 18+

APPENDIX ONE. CHRONOLOGY OF SHITAO'S LIFE

I. The following is a list, by author's name and entry num-
ber, of collected poetry and/or prose works by thirty-six
friends and acquaintances of Shitao that could not be consult-
ed for this study but are listed in a recently published index of
rare books and manuscripts (Zhongguo guji shanben shumu
1996): Chaoyong 12973; Chen Ding II 517; Chen Pengnian
12852,12853,12854; Chen Yixi 12684.12685,12686; Dai
Benxiao 11560; Fei Xihuang 13421; Gao Yong 12433; Gong
Xian 10938; Huang Kui 11565, 12699; Huang Sheng 11583;
Huang Yun 11561; Li Guosong 12790; Li Tianfu 11921; Mei
Geng 12765; Mei Qing 11855, 11856, 11857, 11858; Mu-
chen Daomin 1°9°2, 10903; Qu Dajun 121°3, 12104, 121°7,
12108; Sang Zhi II448; Shi Pang 13438, 13439; Tang Zu-
ming 13410; Wang Fengrong 11920; Wang Hongdu 12969;
Wang Shihong 12919, 12920; Wang Zehong 11811; Wang
Zhongru 12175, 12176; Wang Wei 12779; Wu Canxi 12241;
Wu Chengli 12535; Wu Sugong rr633, rr634; Xian Zhu
13480; Yang Zhongna 12848; Yueduan 13445, 13446; Zha
Shibiao 11357; Zhang Chao 12711, 12712, 12713; Zhang
Zhu 12705; Zhou Sisheng rr978, II979.

APPENDIX TWO. LETTERS



an gc.
anfen ~?t
Azhang 1"'1*
bafen Ai}
baimiao sllli
banqiao :!lim
baoyang tianhe IMtx'fll
bense *i5
biluo llf!ll!
bian !\'\!
biehaoru ~U>lli1!lJ
bimo !!l"lll
boxue hongru 1W~~fr!j
bu gongsheng filil"t OE
bu guo yi shen er /f~~!itJ+
bu ru guiqu /f~~§iil*
buyi <Ii*'
cairen ~ A
cang Jij<
caogao 1j[filj
ch'i :if«
chao Jlil
chi (mad) mJ
chi (unit of length, just over I fr) R
chou ~
ci tfI!J
Daben Tang ;k*:§t
Dadi Caotang ;k1lf.1j[:§t
Dadi Tang ;kllf.:§t

Glossary

daibi It ..
Dao l!t
daochang l!t1ll
daoshi l!t±
dian (crazy) AA
dian (dot; blot) !/!Ii
ding J!I:
dongtian OO:7C

duos hi ~'"
fa ~
fanhua :1\''1'
fangwai :njr
fengwei ~""
fugongsheng flftl"t OE
furen llA
gao filj
Gengxin Caotang '1JH,,1j[:§t
gong I

gongan *~
gongsheng ROE
guai II
guan ill
guren /tl.A
hangdang ff#
hanmojia 1ill!l\*
hao lit
He kan di Wmififi
hu :li
hua llI:

huajia m*
huafa beiyuan ll!~WJjj(
huan i!J
huan su l!!ill
huaren lGA
huashi lGfliIj
huizhe li'/1l'
ji
Jla
jianmin 1lJiR;
J ieren fJfIA
jin (unit of currency » I tael of silver)

Jit
jin (today; modern) ~
jing (scene; view) :*
jing (stillness) ill'
jingshen *111'1'
jinren (people of recent times)
jinren (Moderns [vs. Ancients])
jinshi m±
Juan '(J;
junzi ;g1"
juren 'lfl>A
kai tang 1lIJ:§t
kuang !E
kuang Chan !Ell\!
kuangren !EA
Kugua Heshang *JJl.'fIl[l,j
kun (female cosmic principle) J1!l
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kun (giant mythological fish) !II.
kunpeng ~.I!m
letian anming ~7C9:*
Ii (plum) $
li (unit of length, about Y3 mile) .!!!.
Ii (structural order) I!l!
liang (unit of currency, just over I oz.
of silver) iii

liang (good) 1Jl
liangzhi 1Jl~
ling m
lingding ""T
lingqi l!l:i<\
lingzhi l!l::l::
linli il!<iIIJIl
linsheng el't
luowen !!I:t
meng iii\!
mengyang iiI\!'<l'
ming (name; fame) ~
ming (destiny) 11ir
mingzhu BAlli<
lOU PiX
nong J:l
nuzr :9;'1'-
peng IlIll
pI 'lIil

{Iiiplan
pm ~
pmg m
pinghua iWtffl
po ~
ql 'i\f
gian (male cosmic principle) *l:
qian (unit of currency, IIIO tae! of
silver) ~

gian xing wei kuai m~~tR
qilin IlIllIIi
qm 'lI'
qmg til
Qingxiang ii'Hlii
Qingxiang Daoren i1'iltllltlA
qishi 'i\f±
qiyun shengdong i<\lf\)'t!lllJ
qu :l!B
shang jllj
shancai ~llt
shanshui upJ<
shen (body) J't
sherr (divine; spirit; imagination)
sheng (raw) 't
sheng (musical instrument) ~
shenshang iiJI1jllj

GLOSSARY

sheren 1':A
shi (scholar; member of educated
elite) ±

shi (dynamic force of forms) lil<
shi (exterior appearance; decoration)

fiiIJ
shi (lyric poem; poetry) ~
shi (master; teacher) flffi
shi (practicality) fl
shi min gong shang ± ll\I jllj
shi qi shen ,Ul;J't
shidaifu ±*01<
shihua she ~lH±
shihuazhe 1filll'1'f
shimin sixiang rP~.~,tJjl
shiren ~A
Shitao 15m
shixue P!~
shou (receptivity) :5t
shu AA
shuo iilI,
S1 ,fI,
sihao tMf
smun [Q13!;

su 11>
SUI !If.
Taipu ;k~
taixuesheng ;tc~1:
tie I~
tongjing iIIJIl:ll!
wang 1'::
wangsun II*
warunang Iii~
wenren xA
wenren hua :tAli!
wo ~
wu 1m
wu fenshen zhi fashi 1m*~z~:tt
wufa I!\;'!
XI mP;
xi an (transcendent; immortal) 1'l1J

xian (county) !If.
xian (leisure) I'¥I and r"j
xlang $R
xianqu {~2<
xiaoji tj'1t
xiaokai IJ\~
Xlaosa r.lIiill
Xiazunzhe Wiilliw
xibi iIll'1l!
XleYI 1flfJ
XIng JI!
xingqing t't1li

xmyan
xrucat
Xu an
xuanwet E~
xuling ~m
ya m
yao Jlli!
yaobing Jlli!lI<J
ye lff
yeren !IfA
yeshi !If J!:
yi (idea; conception) yg
Yi (Oneness)
yi (untrammeled) lSl
yihua -:ill'
yimin (remnant subject) ~fI',
yimin (hermit) lSlfl',
yingchou hua I.I1HiliI:ill'
yingxiong bense :;>1;:1$* {5
ymyang [ij;1!J!
ymyun i!ii1l\
you 'If
yu 11k
yuanji (planning ahead) mifl'
Yuanji (name) W-ii'!
yuefu jq!JIit
yun J)I!
zhang (older; oldest) i<t
zhang (unit of length, just over 10 ft)
;t

zhangren yi shen i<tA-J't
zhen ;ll;
Zhen kan di ;ll;J'I!if(i
zheng if
zhenren Jf.A
zhi 'I't
zhiji 9'Ilc,
zhiren ~A
zhixian 9'Illil\
zhonghan '!' ~
zhongshi zhi dao
zhongshu sheren
zhongtang '!':!i!:
zhou tongzhi #1 i'1l~
zhu Jill<
zhuzhi ci ittt)f,ij

STH] Xie Zhiliu JlI:llEIlP, ed. I960. Shitao buaii 1'i1Jil'ill'JIl (Se-
lection of Paintings by Shitao}. Shanghai: Shanghai renmin
meishu chubanshe.

STSHQj Shitao shuhua quanii 1'illll1'Im~JI! (Collected Callig-
raphy and Paintings of Shitao), 2 vols. 1995. Tianjin: Tianjin
renmin meishu chubanshe.

WDQS Chaoyong ;ijjjJ<, ed. I996. Wudeng quan shu 3i!!f!£~f
(Complete Register of the Five Lamps). Reprint of 1693 edition.
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depictions of, 93, 348094
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posr-r eya visitors from, I71, 313, 32.8,
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Bowie, Andrew, 339073
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Brook, Timothy
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Flowers
Caodong tvil~School, 107, 239
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Chaog, Joseph, 102, 344nII, 347nn79,81,
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Chartier, Roger, xviii
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Cheng Ming ~qt!t (1676-1743 or later), 3,

176, 200, 202, 328, 357n76
Cheng Qi W!1\:, I76, 340n59
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247,310,310, 311, 3I8,32I
Eastern Mount Lu IJ\Jt[lII (Jiangsu),

346n54
Eastern paradise, 240
Edwards, Richard, xx
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Elman, Benjamin, 207, 34on34, 364n46
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248
Englandc a r
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Europe, xvii, 19-20, 22, 220, 232, 283,
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53
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Fang Xiong :!f!l!l (b. I63I), 357n85
Fang Yizhi 1JJV.~ (16n-71), 202
Fanghu 1Jff. (Daoist paradise), 214
Fangshan mLlJ (Zhili),349nlIo
Fanli Monastery 'l=J1lil (Yangzhou), 10,

I2, 125
Faure, Bernard, 344n26, 367n57
Fei ]ingyu Jiti!!!.1!1 (1599-1671),61-2
Fei Mi :tiM (1625-17°1), 60-3
as Ming loyalist, 61-2, 66, .102, 134,
342n48

as philosopher, 60, 81, 207-8
poetry (trans.), 62
Shitao and, 60, 60-I, 190, 347n83

Fei Xicong Jtf£:t*, 61-2
Fei Xihuang j!tj)jJJi (b. 1664), 60-4, 70,

74,186, 295,297, 37Illl
poetry (trans.), 63
see also SAl: The Ancestral Tombs of the

Fei Family; The Peach Blossom Spring
Feilai Peak ~*i.l:, 141, 141
Feng He i1.!i~, poetry (trans.), 67
Feng Liao'an 71,~~JiIj;,370n35
Feng Qi !IJj}lj (I559-I603), 288
Fengle River !I!i* (Shexian), 42, 45
Fiedler, Shi-yee, 348nI07
Finnane, Antonia, 8
Five Clouds Temple lL~~ (Wuyun Si)

(Nanjing),250
Flower-Rain Terrace WifE. (Yuhua Tai)

(Nanjing), Pl. 9,141,286,3°9,312,
)26

Fong, Wen C., 147, 350np, 351n58
Fraser, Sarah E., "on35
Fu Dingquao "'~r.:Jti,342n48
Fu Shen "'$, xx, 351059
Fu Xi t'\., 214
Fujian 1i~,20, 348n94, 350n36
artists from, 346n61, 363n23
Huang Jixian in, 341n59, 352071,

354nIIo
Huang You's travels through, PI. 10, 67,
68,70

Wang Xian's journey to, 191, I92, 313
Fulin :m~ (1638-61), see Shunzhi

39I

Fuchun River gPfn: (Zhejiang), 69,69
Furth, Charlotte, 369nl06
Fushan nILlJ (Shandong),348n94
Fuzhou :mffl (Pujian], 71,84,323

Ganges River, 240
Gansu ttli, 62
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xvi, 287, 288, 304, 364n56, 370m8

Compendium of Writings of the Present Age
lIBt\:;ilff (Zhaodai congshu), xvi, 81,
82, 287, 304, 364056, 370n18

Complete Poetry of the Tang, The 3':Jl!"f
(Quan Tang shi), xvi, 10, 81, 330

Complete Register of the Five Lamps
lLiIl'3':l!! (Wudeng quanshu), 97,
343n7, 346n7°

Confucius itT, 268, 274, 368n97
Comag, Victoria, 358n92
Cuijiao Peak ~BNJlr!, I96
Cuiling Gong ¥iI.'8' (Yangzhou), 350n49

Daode jing m~~,169, 244, 269, 272,
274,275, 360n34

Dashu Tang *;fitt-g (Hall of the Great Tree)
(Yangzhou}, 4, II3, 327, 328, 338nlI

de Bary, Theodore, 55
De Certeau, Michel, xvii, 369llI27, 37009,

371nn55,57
Delbanco, Dawn Ho, 181, 210

Demieville, Paul, ,67n54
Deng Hanyi llililill (d. I688), 343n75
Deng Mu ~1lt (1247-1306),342n44
Deng Qifen mfJt, 94-5,146,325, 366n17;

see also SAl: Horse and Groom
Di Yi ~w,8, 313, 328, 338029
Dian Daoren AA-rn:A (Hu Da), 161
Ding Yunpeng T~.(1547-1628),20,

240, 339n56
Dong Qichang i!'J';1'\ (I555-I636),

357n77
influence of, II4, 184, 204, 228, 230, 254
painting of, 20, 21, 2I7, 219, 280
Shitao's responses to, 87, 184, IS5 (Fig.
112),203,212,214,216,228-9,249-
50,256

theory of painting, 203, 2°5, 212, 219,
228,250,256
"literati painting," 18o, 186, 205, 206,
207, 208, 209, 219, 339n60

Dong Yuan Iiw. (d. 962), 1I0, 251, 282,
355n27

Dong Zhongshu 1I1~;ff(c. 179--c. 104
B.C.E.), 10

Donglin **,148,257,257,279,327,
359n135, 36In2, 369n122

Dongxiao Gong ifilJ~',§ (Mount Dadi),
350nn24.51

Dorgon $"J!if:f{ (1612-5°),323
Doulao Gong [Hj:!lt',§ (Yangzhou),350049
Dragon Gate ~r,(branch of Quanzhen

School), II9
Dream of the Red Chamber, The j[[~l"

(Honglou meng), 35 8moI
Du Cheng ft*, 149-50, 366n40
Du Fu ;f11fl (712-7°), 132, 173, 187, I88,

191,261,264,3°6,360032
Du ]ingxian ;f.t:llUf, 90
Du Jun tiiil (I6II-87), )26, 34on39,

366n4°
Du Mu ti!fJ1 (803-52), '4
Du Yin ft!tt (1617-93),25°; see also SAl:

Ten Thousand Ugly Inkblots
Duanzong YIffl*, Song emperor (r. 1276-7),

7'Duhua lu, see Notes on Viewing Paintings
Durand, Pierre-Henri, 75

Da Ming huidian :k'!JJit!ll! (Collected
Statutes of the Great Ming), 47

Dabei Monastery *i1lllJG (Tianjin), 108,
327-8

Daben Tang :k*:!i'; (Hall of the Great
Foundation) (Yangzhou), I36-7, 330

Dadi Grotto Heaven *$ifilJ~ (Mount
Dadi), II9, 138, 259

Dadi Tang *~1it(Great Cleansing Hall)
(Yangzhou)

depictions of, 39,41,43, 128,264,314,
315,332, 351n69

as home, 1, 2, 8-9, 84, 144, 154, 171,
173,176,186,193,268,272,281,
282,3°6,312,313,314,328,329,330

as painting studio, 124, 127, 131, 199,
2°4, 265, 301, 329, 353nI01, 358n99,
368n90

as place of business, I, 144, 154, 170,
176, 178, 179, 184, 189, 199, 204, 3°5

Dadizi zhuan *~T~, see Li Lin, Shitao
and, Biography of Dadizi

Dai Benxiao _*4: (162I-93), 328, 37101
painting of, 181, 241, 279
Shitao and, 100, 172, I74, r82, 201, 245,

326
Dai Cang _1f, 179, 189
Dai Mingshi l!<i';t!t (1653-17I3), 57-8,

337n1,34In10
Dali :kJJl1 (Yunnan), 64

Earth Mountain ± L1J , see East Mountain
East Garden *~(Tianning Monastery),

338n35
East Mountain *LlJ (Nanjing), 141, 181,

247,310,310, 311, 3I8,32I
Eastern Mount Lu IJ\Jt[lII (Jiangsu),

346n54
Eastern paradise, 240
Edwards, Richard, xx
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Elliott, David, 340n36
Elman, Benjamin, 207, 34on34, 364n46
Emerald Cliff Record >fI1ll!i (Biyan lui,

248
Englandc a r
Esherick, Joseph, 46, 338048
Essay on the Peach Blossom Spring

fJ~ltill"i:C, 63-4, u6
Europe, xvii, 19-20, 22, 220, 232, 283,

338n48,365n88

Facing-the-Verdure Hall ~tlk1it (Wanglii
Tang), 202, 329, 357076

Fahai Temple fti:#it~ (Yangzhou), 13, I5,
53

Fajie Temple fti:!J1.~ (Nanjing}, 346056
Fan Hao, 167
Fan Kuan ffiJl (c. 960-1030), 280
Fan Lai, 358nl02
Fang Ruting 1J:!l~m, 369nII3
Fang Xiong :!f!l!l (b. I63I), 357n85
Fang Yizhi 1JJV.~ (16n-71), 202
Fanghu 1Jff. (Daoist paradise), 214
Fangshan mLlJ (Zhili),349nlIo
Fanli Monastery 'l=J1lil (Yangzhou), 10,

I2, 125
Faure, Bernard, 344n26, 367n57
Fei ]ingyu Jiti!!!.1!1 (1599-1671),61-2
Fei Mi :tiM (1625-17°1), 60-3
as Ming loyalist, 61-2, 66, .102, 134,
342n48

as philosopher, 60, 81, 207-8
poetry (trans.), 62
Shitao and, 60, 60-I, 190, 347n83

Fei Xicong Jtf£:t*, 61-2
Fei Xihuang j!tj)jJJi (b. 1664), 60-4, 70,

74,186, 295,297, 37Illl
poetry (trans.), 63
see also SAl: The Ancestral Tombs of the

Fei Family; The Peach Blossom Spring
Feilai Peak ~*i.l:, 141, 141
Feng He i1.!i~, poetry (trans.), 67
Feng Liao'an 71,~~JiIj;,370n35
Feng Qi !IJj}lj (I559-I603), 288
Fengle River !I!i* (Shexian), 42, 45
Fiedler, Shi-yee, 348nI07
Finnane, Antonia, 8
Five Clouds Temple lL~~ (Wuyun Si)

(Nanjing),250
Flower-Rain Terrace WifE. (Yuhua Tai)

(Nanjing), Pl. 9,141,286,3°9,312,
)26

Fong, Wen C., 147, 350np, 351n58
Fraser, Sarah E., "on35
Fu Dingquao "'~r.:Jti,342n48
Fu Shen "'$, xx, 351059
Fu Xi t'\., 214
Fujian 1i~,20, 348n94, 350n36
artists from, 346n61, 363n23
Huang Jixian in, 341n59, 352071,

354nIIo
Huang You's travels through, PI. 10, 67,
68,70

Wang Xian's journey to, 191, I92, 313
Fulin :m~ (1638-61), see Shunzhi

39I

Fuchun River gPfn: (Zhejiang), 69,69
Furth, Charlotte, 369nl06
Fushan nILlJ (Shandong),348n94
Fuzhou :mffl (Pujian], 71,84,323

Ganges River, 240
Gansu ttli, 62
Ganzhou • .ffl (Jiangxi), 129
Gao Cen il'1i~ (second half of r zrh C.), 120
Gao Fenghan jl!IjJijl,@ (I683-I7491, 166,

337n3
Gao Qipei ~;It/Jjl, (:1.660-1734), 30, 202,

2°4,301, 355n24, 365n91
Gao Shiqi iUi±ilf (I645-I703), 48,

348nnrol,108,358n92
Gao Xiang ;/Ij~ (I688-I753), I66
Gao Yong iYiM:: (b. 1622), 92,98,201,325,

326, 348-9nI09, 371n1
Gao Yu i\'li;J!i, 120
Gaojiayan Dyke i0i~{J:IW (jiangsu),79
Gaomin Temple ~~~ (Yangzhou), 17-18
Garden of Shadows and Reflections ~lnJ

(Ying Yuan), 186, I87, 361n42
Gautama Buddha, 83, 134, 137
GengJingzhong JtI:.~'~" 70, 71
Geng Zhaazhong Jtl:.GfL'ir~ (1640-86),328,

348n95
Gengxin Caotang tlHY1;t:!it (Studio far

Cultivation of the Heart·mind)
(Yangzhou), 176, 330, 352n73

Gengyin :M:M, 190, 200, 256, 257, 328,
353n86,359nI35

Giddens, Anthony, 18, 84, 338n42
Goldfish Pond .1fl:fM1t!!. (Beijing), 107, 108
Gong Dingzi n~.(r616-73), 151
Gong Xian aft (1619-89),155,204,23°,

355021, 356n32, 3590I29, 371111
art of, 120, 142, 221, 3401133
theory of painting, 206-'7, 208, 209, 217,
2.l8, 228, 285

Yangzhou·area patrons of, 151-2, 161,
201-2, 356049

Gongan School, 226, 280, 287, 300, 303
Grand Canal, 77
Kangxi's travel 011, 74, 77
Shitao and
depictions of, Pl. 2, 27, 32, 33,34, 112,

I24-5, .171

travel on, 102, II2, 327, 328
and Yangzhou, 4, 6, 8, 80

Great Cleansing Grotto *-M:11ilJ~ (Mount
Dadi),3

Great Cleansing Hall j;:iili1it, see Dadi Tang
Great East Gate ::*:Jf!r~ (Yangzhou), 8-9,

la, 281, 35°1149
Grear Wall *llt, 65
Green Dragon Mouotain WfflWJ (Qinglang

Shan) (Nanjing), 3 I 8, 32.I

Green Lotus Studio 1f1l1,i:!it (Qinglian
Caotang), 268, 329, 330, 3601127

Greenberg, Clement, xvii
Gu Ai liilHi'li,35 8n99
Gu Fuzheo 8:?<ttR (1634-1716 or later)
art of, I96 (Fig. 127), 179, 186, 220,
359n122,360032
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as literati professional, 160, 179, 186,
356°49, 359nr22, 3600°7,29

Shitao's pictorial responses to, 194,196
(Fig. 126)

Gu Kaizhi 191Itz (c. 34S-C. 406), 230, 242-
Gu Ming 1Mi~, 363027
Gil Zhuo DJi!, 203

Gu Zixing Rffi gjti, 161
Guan Tong tJm~ (active c. 9°7-23), 210,

251
Guandao tang ji fn!'i:~,6:z.
Guangdong JlJIi!, 86, 108, 145, 36:z.nIO
Huang Yell's travels to, 48, 65. 66-7, 67,
68, 71, 71-2, 72

loyalism in, 64, 71-2
Shirac's paintings of, 65, 66-7, 68, 71,
7I~2, 72, 189,191

Guangjiao Temple Jlt!J:$f (Xuancheng), Pl.
L, 92, 94. 94-5, 97, r08, 244, 246,
25I, 325. 326

Guangling !.lilt. see Yangzhou
Guangling shishi 1l~t.f.,64
Guangwudi 1tfttW, Han emperor

(c. 25-57), lor
Guangxi Jliffl, 6I, 104, 131, 136, T37. 145
Huang You's travels in, 67, 68, 72
Shirao's earliest years in, xvi, 2, 84, 86,
323,344n8

Guangzhou Jl1t1 (Guangdong), 22, 67, 68,
71,337n3

Guanyin Uif Bodhisattva, 241,242,247,
248, 257, 292

Guanyin Sutra, 90
Guattari, Felix, 370n9
Guazhou JIlftj (Jiangsu),4
Gucheng at~ (Zhili), 27, .I22
Guilin tE# (Guangxi), xvi, 67, 71, 72, 84,

138,323,343n6
Guizhou :ft:l+I, 202
Gukou ~ Q , see Quanzhou
Guo Pu Will (276-324),288
Guo Xi ~,tm (c. 1010-90), 280,3°8
Li Yin and, 194, 195,197, 197-8
Shitao and, Pi. 12, 129, 194, 195, 197-8,
224-5,229,251,252,270,365n86

Yuan Jiang and, 35
Guofeng ~~, r82
Guxiu nrn~, 179
Hai'an #fj;:1i( (Jiangsu), 361n4
Haichao Temple ~JlII~ (Beijing), 108, 328
Hainan #fj;i¥i, 72, 72
Halde, pere Jean-Baptiste du (.1674-1743),

10
Hall of the Great Foundation .**1it

(Nanjing), 136-7; see also Daben Tang
Hall of the Great Tree ::ktM1it, see Dashu

Tang
Han River f1SiI (Yangzhou), 53, 3I2,

351069
Han Yu <r;:@: (768-824), 87-8, 95
Hangzhou tJtffl (Zhejiang), 3, 54, 69, 74,

II9, 259, 329, 341n86, 345n28,
366n39

artists in and from, 20, 161, 179, 194,
202, 363n23
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Shitao and
paintings of, 65, 141, I41
VISitSto, 91,141,324

Hanlin Academy ~$f\.~, 8, 57,92,313,
326,328,33°,345°31

Hanyue Facang *~7*ii:, 88
Hariti, 247, 247
Harless Wilderness Historian, 70
Hay, A. John, xvi, 21-2, 2°9-1°, 279-80,

296, 341089, 371n39
Hearn, Maxwell K., 241, 365nII
Hebei fliJ:l~,202
Hefei ilJj'~, 151, 328, 356n34
Hemingway, Andrew, 339n74
Henan jiiJ1¥J, 83, 202, 206, 344n12
Hengzhou illifM (Hunan), 72, 86
Hermit of the Stone Abode 15pi!lt (Shihu

Nang), 66, 90,91,93
Hetao ~1fJ (Yuanliang Herao)
(1644-65),86,89,91,141,239,268,
309, 324

(1666-79),91,92,94,245,324,325,326
(1680-6), 97, 326, 346nn58,61
(1687-),102,1°4, Il2, IJ6, 327, 328,
329

History of Devastation Jr'Lif (Huang shu),
62

History .of Hermits ~~~ (Yimin shi), 41
Ho, Wal-kam, 181, 210
Hong Jiazhi #t8tA (1645-1712), 134, 182,

342n54
Hong Sheng ~Ht(1645-1704), 151
Hong Taiji lltteJli (1592-1643),323,

346n68
Hong Zhengzhi #tiEffl' (1674-1735),

133-4,176,200. 234,329,341n59,
350n40, 355°14; see also SAl: Orchids
(album); Plum Blossoms, Bamboo, and
Rock; Portrait of Hong Zhengzhi

Honglou meng, see The Dream of the Red
Chamber

Hongren 5Lt. (1610-64),71,201.206,
241, 324,356n49,361044, 366n50

as qishi painter, 114, 202
Shitao and
col~p~oos to paintings by, 202, 350n 34
stylistic allusions to, 122, I24-5, 152,

184, 245
Hongwu emperor #tiEt, 90, 99, 13 I,

37°°32
Hou Han shu fiil1t, 345n43
Hu Jing i\IJ!li'i (Chengxue), 326, 346n61,

362015
Hu, Philip, 3450n31>33
Hu Qi ~f)t, 214,272,330
Hu Renyu q.gff~, 148; see also SAl:

Drinking Tea
Hu Yukun M.li~ (active c. 1640-72), 120
Hua pu .~ (A Manual of Painting), see SI:

manuals and treatises, Shitao's
Hua Yan '1<"" (1682-1756), 337n3
Huacang Auxiliary Monastery ~.r~

(Huacang Xiayuan) (Yangzhou),
338n35

Huaihai nE#ff, area of, 206
Huai River 7tfoJ, 77, 79,83, II2

Huai'an i1f~ (jiangsu}, 78, 165
Huaisu 11:~, 248
Huaixie Pavilion 1t~Hl (Nanjing), 326,

346n54
Huaixue 1l~,245
Huang Gongwang it0~ (1269-1354),

280
early Qing copies of paintings by, 127,

167, 36r044, 362n20, 364n45
Shirao and
comments on, 210, 229, 230;
stylistic allusions to, 69, 69, 151,258-
9,259

Zha Shibiao's stylistic allusions to, 184,
184, 202

Huang jixian .w~,.120, 154, 168, JI2,
34204°, 352n85, 358nl05

in Fujian, 341n59, 352n71, 3540110
see also SAl: album of painting and
calligraphy by Shitao and Bada
Shanren; Reminiscences of Qin-Huai

Huang Jun'an jt~Jtt, 160
Huang Kui j[~, 201, 358n99, 37.101
Huang Lu itif, 113, 126, 128, 152, 202,

256, 350n 52; see also SAl: Landscapes
for Huang Lu

Huang Ming yimin zhuan ~ljJHt(:%f.'J, .133
Huang Sheng iii:£. (1622-96),201,

353n92,371nl
Huang Tingjian 1tM~ (I045-II05), 288
Huang Xiangjian jiioJlf: (r609-73),

341n4, 342n45
Huang You itX (1661-C. 1725)
Bada Shanren and, 64, 73, 74, 128
interest in wilderness history, 62, 64, 70-2
Li Lin and, 64, 65, 67, 68,72, .168,
342n28

poetry (trans.), 70, 72, 73
Shitao and, 53, 120, IJ3, 154, 168, 191,
328, 358n103

travels of, 64-74, 191, 34Ill59
and Yangzhou-area Ming loyalism, I.I6,

134,168,352085,353nn86,90
see also SAl: Crossing the Ridge; Flowers
and Figures; lllustrations to the Poems
of Huang YanlU; Landscapes of the
Highest Class

Huang Yun jt~, 134, 304, 304, 350n42,
352n84, 363n25, 371n1

poetry (trans.), 305
Huang Zhanyue .~ffi,340n28
Huang Zhuolai, 341n1o
Huang Ziqing itTw, J62, 202, 371049;

see also SAl: Flowers and Fruit;
Illustrations to Poems by Du Pu;
lllustrations to Song and Yuan Poems

Huang Zixi ftr:ij} (1612-72), 165
Huang Zongxi jb~.(.1610-95),40,

342n44,358n90
Huang Zongyan it*ik (1616-86),358n90
Huangbo Xiyun w~:ffi"~ (died c. 85°),92,

108, 244,345n38
Huanggang jfIMJ (Hubei), 348n93, 362013,

366n4°
Huanghai .#i, see Mount Huang
Huangshan ihlJ, see Mount Huang

Huangting neijing jing .~j7;j~~
(Scripture on the Inner Phosphors of
the Yellow Court), 127

Huayu lu .. mt~, see 51: manuals and
treatises, Shitao's

Hubei ~:!~,260, 362013, 366n39
art world of, 201, 202, 206
natives of, 348093, 349nIIo, 363n25,

366n4°
Shirao's childhood and youth in, 2, 86,
324

see also Wuchang
Huizhou ~~tl(Anhui}, 20, 362nI4
estates, 42-3, 44, 45, 45,5°,122,189,

19°,328
families, 369nIIo
as collectors/patrons, 54,91, 337n3,
341n85,350052

merchant connections to Yangzhou, 27,
3.1,41,45,161,167,168,184,
338n46,361n43

officials in, see Cao Dingwang
painting and painters of, 22,91, 160, 179,

184,200,202,2°3,206,245,3°0,
355n18, 361n44, 362020

Shitao and
patron families, 27, 45, 325; (1666-89),

146,147, .I48, 325, 326, 327; (1693-
17°7),42-3,48,54,91, .123, 133,
Isr, 152, 164, 168, 184, 193, 328,
329

visits to, 91,122,325,328; see also
Shexian

Huizhou ;m;~f1 (Guangdong),71
Huizong m*=, Song emperor (r. IIOI-25),

126
Hunan 1!JjJ¥j, 88, 93, 366n39
art world of, 201, 202, 206
Huang You's travels in, 67, 68, 72, 86
Shitao's travels in, 86, 86, 87, 88, 89, 148,
312, 324, 344013

see also Mouot Heng

Illustrations to Tang Poems 1t~.~(Tang
shi huapu), 187

Ingold, Tim, 339n20
Iron-Feet Daoist m,llmA, 244, 244, 266,

318

Jade Maiden .:Ei.~, 292
Jay, Jennifer, 340n31
Jiading BlE: (Jiangsu), 20
Jian River mm (Fujian), Pl. 10, 70
Jiang Anjie 'li''!i'l$ (b. 1632), 353n86
Jiang-Chu i[;ti!, 202, 206
Jiang Chun rrW., 357n82
Jiaog Cai ~*(1607-73), 134, 353n86
Jiang Gai 'li'1f<, 353n86
Jiang Hanzheng rr*~,161
Jiang Heng ~f![, Pi. 14. 48, 49,65,179,

189, 352n86, 371n38
Jiang-Huai iIlIf, 53
Jiang Jihu :JPf"*m;, 366n20; see also SAl:

Landscapes for Jiweng
Jiang Kai rrlm, 163
Jiang Qianli YIT j! , 12
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Jiang Shidong iIt!:ttt (born c. 1658), 163,
176,234,329

patronage of Shirao, 163-4, 166-7, 177,
352°7°

Shitac's letters to, 144, 163-4, 166, 167,
170,180,185-6,194,2°5,333-5

see also SAl: Orchids and Rocks
Jiang Shijie 'li'1fl$ (1647-17°9),124,

133-4, 161
poetry [trans.], 133

Jiang Xun ¥Im, 163
Jiang Yuan iIl! (d. 1664 or 1665), 161
Jiang Zhu ¥Itt, 201, 366n20
Jiangdu iI.U, see Yangzhou
Jiangnan um (lower Yangzi valley), 65,

98
as cultural macroregion
Ming, xix, 19-21,46, 53, IIO, 279
early Qing, 21-2, 23, 56, 160, 201,

202, 204, 279, 287, 288, 324
politics of, 75, 77, 102

Jiangsu Uil, 160
northern (Jiangbei), 2, Il2, 327, 343n72
artists, 165,201,202,206
environmental problems in, 8, 18, 35,
74,77-9,33°, 353n87

Shitao's early travels in, 88, 90, 91. 92,
94,324,325,326

southern, 259
artists, 161, 201, 202, 203, 206, 230
Huang You's travels in, 65, 68

Jiangxi UW, 129, 160, 268, 332
artists, 15 r, 202, 206
Huang You's travels in, 65, 67, 68, 69,
70,73

Shirao's travels in, 89, 324
see also Mount Lu; Nanchang

Jianwen ~>C emperor, 90
Jianyang ~1Wi (Fujian), 70, 341059,

352n71,354nno
Jianzhou :@;ffl (Liaoning),350nI9
Jiao Run ~~, 160
Jiaoshan ~LlJ (jiangsu), 327, 3490109,

360n7
Jie Yu tt., 268
Jin Nong ~~ (1687-1764), 166
jinfu Yuanzhi 5ftJiliit1i, 3440I 5
Jing Hao ffiJ$ (late 9th -early loth C.),

210, 251
jingdezhen :itmJA (Jiangxi), 20, 22
Jinghui Monastery iWf!~ (Yangzhou)
monks of, 92,199,256,325,36104
Shitao and, 4, 92, Il2, II3, 325, 327,
328, 338n21, 347n83, 349n6

Jingjiang ~tLprincedom of, 84, 86, 96,
131-2,136,323,329,34306

Jingling School jf;~iJt(, 244, 280
Jingmen ffljr~ (Hubei), 144, 344013
Jingxian ~fMt (Anhui), 94, 101, 141. 201,

318,321,325, 366m7, 367n64
public buildings, constructed/restored, 95,
346n48,366n17

Jinling ~IJ,see Nanjing
Jinshan 5ftW (Jiangsu), 327. 348-9nlo9,

36007
Jigi Hongchu .il!l5LflIl (1605-72),344"'5

•
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Jiweng *$, 366020; see a/so SAl:

Landscapes for Jiweng
Jizi ~T (r arh C. B.C.E.), 340n30
Jude Hongli ~lfj5lAt (I600-67), 344nI5
juhui §:~, 108, 1I0, 327-8, 3490109
Juran §:~ (active c. 960-80), 2JO, 213,

229

Kaixian Monastery Im%~ (Mount Lu), 89,
90, 268, 324

Kangxi Jift.!m emperor (Xuanye r.
1662-1722),324,325

artists and, 104, J07, 363111127,3°
Buddhist monks and, 88, 104, 107,
348nl08

calligraphy of, 17, 349n109
Daoism and, II9
imperial succession and, 58, 80-1
poetry (rrans.), 75
policies of, 10, 57, 77, 99,136,203,278,
33701

Shitao and, 18, 90, 97, 98-9, 99, 100,
102-4,106,107,108,109,133,326,
327,345046

Southern Tours of, 17
first (1684), 22, 98, 99, 102, 105, 326,
3480108

second (1689), 22,68,77,102,105,
176,327

third (1699), 22,34,77,329
fourth (1703), 330
fifth (1705), 18,74-5,77-9,80,81,
330

see also Waog Hui , supervision of
Southern Tour paintings

visits to Yangzhou. xvi, .T7-I8
(1689),14,18,50,75,102,1°3.327
(1699),75,131,329,33°
(17°5),35,74.75,77,131

Kent, Richard, 366n29
Kim, Hong-nam, 358n92
Kohara Hirol1obu, xx
Kong Shangren J'L~jf (,648-17I8),53,

54,148,235,327, 353n87, 355n21,
356n51, 363n26

Kong Wenzhong J'L:>tj<p, 27
Kong Yanshi fL{i'Jt.rt., 203, 363n26
Kuncan J£1l (1612-73),114,121,202,

204,239,325
art of, 121, 241, 328, 350n2J, 353n98,
356n51,362n20

Kunshao FlLIJ (Jiaogsu),346050

Labyrinth of Desire ilW (Mi Lou)
(Yangzhou), 80

Laiyang ill<1lJ> (Shandong), 346n68
Lake Chao JIlI!Jj (Anhui), 32, I53
Lake Dongting i1PJli!.Wl (Hunan), 86, 87,

110,138, T39, 1:40, .140-1, 144, 181,
312,313, 324. 344nI3

Lake Poyang Ij)~~ (Jiangxi), 182
Lake Tai j<;1!Jj (Jiang,u), 259
Lan Ying ~~ (1585-1664 or later), 20.

179,339n56, 3590129, 363n23
Lanjiang MiI., 182, 352n76
Langyuan OO~ (Daoist paradise), 214
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as literati professional, 160, 179, 186,
356°49, 359nr22, 3600°7,29

Shitao's pictorial responses to, 194,196
(Fig. 126)

Gu Kaizhi 191Itz (c. 34S-C. 406), 230, 242-
Gu Ming 1Mi~, 363027
Gil Zhuo DJi!, 203

Gu Zixing Rffi gjti, 161
Guan Tong tJm~ (active c. 9°7-23), 210,

251
Guandao tang ji fn!'i:~,6:z.
Guangdong JlJIi!, 86, 108, 145, 36:z.nIO
Huang Yell's travels to, 48, 65. 66-7, 67,
68, 71, 71-2, 72

loyalism in, 64, 71-2
Shirac's paintings of, 65, 66-7, 68, 71,
7I~2, 72, 189,191

Guangjiao Temple Jlt!J:$f (Xuancheng), Pl.
L, 92, 94. 94-5, 97, r08, 244, 246,
25I, 325. 326

Guangling !.lilt. see Yangzhou
Guangling shishi 1l~t.f.,64
Guangwudi 1tfttW, Han emperor

(c. 25-57), lor
Guangxi Jliffl, 6I, 104, 131, 136, T37. 145
Huang You's travels in, 67, 68, 72
Shirao's earliest years in, xvi, 2, 84, 86,
323,344n8

Guangzhou Jl1t1 (Guangdong), 22, 67, 68,
71,337n3

Guanyin Uif Bodhisattva, 241,242,247,
248, 257, 292

Guanyin Sutra, 90
Guattari, Felix, 370n9
Guazhou JIlftj (Jiangsu),4
Gucheng at~ (Zhili), 27, .I22
Guilin tE# (Guangxi), xvi, 67, 71, 72, 84,

138,323,343n6
Guizhou :ft:l+I, 202
Gukou ~ Q , see Quanzhou
Guo Pu Will (276-324),288
Guo Xi ~,tm (c. 1010-90), 280,3°8
Li Yin and, 194, 195,197, 197-8
Shitao and, Pi. 12, 129, 194, 195, 197-8,
224-5,229,251,252,270,365n86

Yuan Jiang and, 35
Guofeng ~~, r82
Guxiu nrn~, 179
Hai'an #fj;:1i( (Jiangsu), 361n4
Haichao Temple ~JlII~ (Beijing), 108, 328
Hainan #fj;i¥i, 72, 72
Halde, pere Jean-Baptiste du (.1674-1743),

10
Hall of the Great Foundation .**1it

(Nanjing), 136-7; see also Daben Tang
Hall of the Great Tree ::ktM1it, see Dashu

Tang
Han River f1SiI (Yangzhou), 53, 3I2,

351069
Han Yu <r;:@: (768-824), 87-8, 95
Hangzhou tJtffl (Zhejiang), 3, 54, 69, 74,

II9, 259, 329, 341n86, 345n28,
366n39

artists in and from, 20, 161, 179, 194,
202, 363n23

NAME AND PLACE INDEX

Shitao and
paintings of, 65, 141, I41
VISitSto, 91,141,324

Hanlin Academy ~$f\.~, 8, 57,92,313,
326,328,33°,345°31

Hanyue Facang *~7*ii:, 88
Hariti, 247, 247
Harless Wilderness Historian, 70
Hay, A. John, xvi, 21-2, 2°9-1°, 279-80,

296, 341089, 371n39
Hearn, Maxwell K., 241, 365nII
Hebei fliJ:l~,202
Hefei ilJj'~, 151, 328, 356n34
Hemingway, Andrew, 339n74
Henan jiiJ1¥J, 83, 202, 206, 344n12
Hengzhou illifM (Hunan), 72, 86
Hermit of the Stone Abode 15pi!lt (Shihu

Nang), 66, 90,91,93
Hetao ~1fJ (Yuanliang Herao)
(1644-65),86,89,91,141,239,268,
309, 324

(1666-79),91,92,94,245,324,325,326
(1680-6), 97, 326, 346nn58,61
(1687-),102,1°4, Il2, IJ6, 327, 328,
329

History of Devastation Jr'Lif (Huang shu),
62

History .of Hermits ~~~ (Yimin shi), 41
Ho, Wal-kam, 181, 210
Hong Jiazhi #t8tA (1645-1712), 134, 182,

342n54
Hong Sheng ~Ht(1645-1704), 151
Hong Taiji lltteJli (1592-1643),323,

346n68
Hong Zhengzhi #tiEffl' (1674-1735),

133-4,176,200. 234,329,341n59,
350n40, 355°14; see also SAl: Orchids
(album); Plum Blossoms, Bamboo, and
Rock; Portrait of Hong Zhengzhi

Honglou meng, see The Dream of the Red
Chamber

Hongren 5Lt. (1610-64),71,201.206,
241, 324,356n49,361044, 366n50

as qishi painter, 114, 202
Shitao and
col~p~oos to paintings by, 202, 350n 34
stylistic allusions to, 122, I24-5, 152,

184, 245
Hongwu emperor #tiEt, 90, 99, 13 I,

37°°32
Hou Han shu fiil1t, 345n43
Hu Jing i\IJ!li'i (Chengxue), 326, 346n61,

362015
Hu, Philip, 3450n31>33
Hu Qi ~f)t, 214,272,330
Hu Renyu q.gff~, 148; see also SAl:

Drinking Tea
Hu Yukun M.li~ (active c. 1640-72), 120
Hua pu .~ (A Manual of Painting), see SI:

manuals and treatises, Shitao's
Hua Yan '1<"" (1682-1756), 337n3
Huacang Auxiliary Monastery ~.r~

(Huacang Xiayuan) (Yangzhou),
338n35

Huaihai nE#ff, area of, 206
Huai River 7tfoJ, 77, 79,83, II2

Huai'an i1f~ (jiangsu}, 78, 165
Huaisu 11:~, 248
Huaixie Pavilion 1t~Hl (Nanjing), 326,

346n54
Huaixue 1l~,245
Huang Gongwang it0~ (1269-1354),

280
early Qing copies of paintings by, 127,

167, 36r044, 362n20, 364n45
Shirao and
comments on, 210, 229, 230;
stylistic allusions to, 69, 69, 151,258-
9,259

Zha Shibiao's stylistic allusions to, 184,
184, 202

Huang jixian .w~,.120, 154, 168, JI2,
34204°, 352n85, 358nl05

in Fujian, 341n59, 352n71, 3540110
see also SAl: album of painting and
calligraphy by Shitao and Bada
Shanren; Reminiscences of Qin-Huai

Huang Jun'an jt~Jtt, 160
Huang Kui j[~, 201, 358n99, 37.101
Huang Lu itif, 113, 126, 128, 152, 202,

256, 350n 52; see also SAl: Landscapes
for Huang Lu

Huang Ming yimin zhuan ~ljJHt(:%f.'J, .133
Huang Sheng iii:£. (1622-96),201,

353n92,371nl
Huang Tingjian 1tM~ (I045-II05), 288
Huang Xiangjian jiioJlf: (r609-73),

341n4, 342n45
Huang You itX (1661-C. 1725)
Bada Shanren and, 64, 73, 74, 128
interest in wilderness history, 62, 64, 70-2
Li Lin and, 64, 65, 67, 68,72, .168,
342n28

poetry (trans.), 70, 72, 73
Shitao and, 53, 120, IJ3, 154, 168, 191,
328, 358n103

travels of, 64-74, 191, 34Ill59
and Yangzhou-area Ming loyalism, I.I6,

134,168,352085,353nn86,90
see also SAl: Crossing the Ridge; Flowers
and Figures; lllustrations to the Poems
of Huang YanlU; Landscapes of the
Highest Class

Huang Yun jt~, 134, 304, 304, 350n42,
352n84, 363n25, 371n1

poetry (trans.), 305
Huang Zhanyue .~ffi,340n28
Huang Zhuolai, 341n1o
Huang Ziqing itTw, J62, 202, 371049;

see also SAl: Flowers and Fruit;
Illustrations to Poems by Du Pu;
lllustrations to Song and Yuan Poems

Huang Zixi ftr:ij} (1612-72), 165
Huang Zongxi jb~.(.1610-95),40,

342n44,358n90
Huang Zongyan it*ik (1616-86),358n90
Huangbo Xiyun w~:ffi"~ (died c. 85°),92,

108, 244,345n38
Huanggang jfIMJ (Hubei), 348n93, 362013,

366n4°
Huanghai .#i, see Mount Huang
Huangshan ihlJ, see Mount Huang

Huangting neijing jing .~j7;j~~
(Scripture on the Inner Phosphors of
the Yellow Court), 127

Huayu lu .. mt~, see 51: manuals and
treatises, Shitao's

Hubei ~:!~,260, 362013, 366n39
art world of, 201, 202, 206
natives of, 348093, 349nIIo, 363n25,

366n4°
Shirao's childhood and youth in, 2, 86,
324

see also Wuchang
Huizhou ~~tl(Anhui}, 20, 362nI4
estates, 42-3, 44, 45, 45,5°,122,189,

19°,328
families, 369nIIo
as collectors/patrons, 54,91, 337n3,
341n85,350052

merchant connections to Yangzhou, 27,
3.1,41,45,161,167,168,184,
338n46,361n43

officials in, see Cao Dingwang
painting and painters of, 22,91, 160, 179,

184,200,202,2°3,206,245,3°0,
355n18, 361n44, 362020

Shitao and
patron families, 27, 45, 325; (1666-89),

146,147, .I48, 325, 326, 327; (1693-
17°7),42-3,48,54,91, .123, 133,
Isr, 152, 164, 168, 184, 193, 328,
329

visits to, 91,122,325,328; see also
Shexian

Huizhou ;m;~f1 (Guangdong),71
Huizong m*=, Song emperor (r. IIOI-25),

126
Hunan 1!JjJ¥j, 88, 93, 366n39
art world of, 201, 202, 206
Huang You's travels in, 67, 68, 72, 86
Shitao's travels in, 86, 86, 87, 88, 89, 148,
312, 324, 344013

see also Mouot Heng

Illustrations to Tang Poems 1t~.~(Tang
shi huapu), 187

Ingold, Tim, 339n20
Iron-Feet Daoist m,llmA, 244, 244, 266,

318

Jade Maiden .:Ei.~, 292
Jay, Jennifer, 340n31
Jiading BlE: (Jiangsu), 20
Jian River mm (Fujian), Pl. 10, 70
Jiang Anjie 'li''!i'l$ (b. 1632), 353n86
Jiang-Chu i[;ti!, 202, 206
Jiang Chun rrW., 357n82
Jiaog Cai ~*(1607-73), 134, 353n86
Jiang Gai 'li'1f<, 353n86
Jiang Hanzheng rr*~,161
Jiang Heng ~f![, Pi. 14. 48, 49,65,179,

189, 352n86, 371n38
Jiang-Huai iIlIf, 53
Jiang Jihu :JPf"*m;, 366n20; see also SAl:

Landscapes for Jiweng
Jiang Kai rrlm, 163
Jiang Qianli YIT j! , 12

NAME AND PLACE INDEX

Jiang Shidong iIt!:ttt (born c. 1658), 163,
176,234,329

patronage of Shirao, 163-4, 166-7, 177,
352°7°

Shitac's letters to, 144, 163-4, 166, 167,
170,180,185-6,194,2°5,333-5

see also SAl: Orchids and Rocks
Jiang Shijie 'li'1fl$ (1647-17°9),124,

133-4, 161
poetry [trans.], 133

Jiang Xun ¥Im, 163
Jiang Yuan iIl! (d. 1664 or 1665), 161
Jiang Zhu ¥Itt, 201, 366n20
Jiangdu iI.U, see Yangzhou
Jiangnan um (lower Yangzi valley), 65,

98
as cultural macroregion
Ming, xix, 19-21,46, 53, IIO, 279
early Qing, 21-2, 23, 56, 160, 201,

202, 204, 279, 287, 288, 324
politics of, 75, 77, 102

Jiangsu Uil, 160
northern (Jiangbei), 2, Il2, 327, 343n72
artists, 165,201,202,206
environmental problems in, 8, 18, 35,
74,77-9,33°, 353n87

Shitao's early travels in, 88, 90, 91. 92,
94,324,325,326

southern, 259
artists, 161, 201, 202, 203, 206, 230
Huang You's travels in, 65, 68

Jiangxi UW, 129, 160, 268, 332
artists, 15 r, 202, 206
Huang You's travels in, 65, 67, 68, 69,
70,73

Shirao's travels in, 89, 324
see also Mount Lu; Nanchang

Jianwen ~>C emperor, 90
Jianyang ~1Wi (Fujian), 70, 341059,

352n71,354nno
Jianzhou :@;ffl (Liaoning),350nI9
Jiao Run ~~, 160
Jiaoshan ~LlJ (jiangsu), 327, 3490109,

360n7
Jie Yu tt., 268
Jin Nong ~~ (1687-1764), 166
jinfu Yuanzhi 5ftJiliit1i, 3440I 5
Jing Hao ffiJ$ (late 9th -early loth C.),

210, 251
jingdezhen :itmJA (Jiangxi), 20, 22
Jinghui Monastery iWf!~ (Yangzhou)
monks of, 92,199,256,325,36104
Shitao and, 4, 92, Il2, II3, 325, 327,
328, 338n21, 347n83, 349n6

Jingjiang ~tLprincedom of, 84, 86, 96,
131-2,136,323,329,34306

Jingling School jf;~iJt(, 244, 280
Jingmen ffljr~ (Hubei), 144, 344013
Jingxian ~fMt (Anhui), 94, 101, 141. 201,

318,321,325, 366m7, 367n64
public buildings, constructed/restored, 95,
346n48,366n17

Jinling ~IJ,see Nanjing
Jinshan 5ftW (Jiangsu), 327. 348-9nlo9,

36007
Jigi Hongchu .il!l5LflIl (1605-72),344"'5

•
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Jiweng *$, 366020; see a/so SAl:

Landscapes for Jiweng
Jizi ~T (r arh C. B.C.E.), 340n30
Jude Hongli ~lfj5lAt (I600-67), 344nI5
juhui §:~, 108, 1I0, 327-8, 3490109
Juran §:~ (active c. 960-80), 2JO, 213,

229

Kaixian Monastery Im%~ (Mount Lu), 89,
90, 268, 324

Kangxi Jift.!m emperor (Xuanye r.
1662-1722),324,325

artists and, 104, J07, 363111127,3°
Buddhist monks and, 88, 104, 107,
348nl08

calligraphy of, 17, 349n109
Daoism and, II9
imperial succession and, 58, 80-1
poetry (rrans.), 75
policies of, 10, 57, 77, 99,136,203,278,
33701

Shitao and, 18, 90, 97, 98-9, 99, 100,
102-4,106,107,108,109,133,326,
327,345046

Southern Tours of, 17
first (1684), 22, 98, 99, 102, 105, 326,
3480108

second (1689), 22,68,77,102,105,
176,327

third (1699), 22,34,77,329
fourth (1703), 330
fifth (1705), 18,74-5,77-9,80,81,
330

see also Waog Hui , supervision of
Southern Tour paintings

visits to Yangzhou. xvi, .T7-I8
(1689),14,18,50,75,102,1°3.327
(1699),75,131,329,33°
(17°5),35,74.75,77,131

Kent, Richard, 366n29
Kim, Hong-nam, 358n92
Kohara Hirol1obu, xx
Kong Shangren J'L~jf (,648-17I8),53,

54,148,235,327, 353n87, 355n21,
356n51, 363n26

Kong Wenzhong J'L:>tj<p, 27
Kong Yanshi fL{i'Jt.rt., 203, 363n26
Kuncan J£1l (1612-73),114,121,202,

204,239,325
art of, 121, 241, 328, 350n2J, 353n98,
356n51,362n20

Kunshao FlLIJ (Jiaogsu),346050

Labyrinth of Desire ilW (Mi Lou)
(Yangzhou), 80

Laiyang ill<1lJ> (Shandong), 346n68
Lake Chao JIlI!Jj (Anhui), 32, I53
Lake Dongting i1PJli!.Wl (Hunan), 86, 87,

110,138, T39, 1:40, .140-1, 144, 181,
312,313, 324. 344nI3

Lake Poyang Ij)~~ (Jiangxi), 182
Lake Tai j<;1!Jj (Jiang,u), 259
Lan Ying ~~ (1585-1664 or later), 20.

179,339n56, 3590129, 363n23
Lanjiang MiI., 182, 352n76
Langyuan OO~ (Daoist paradise), 214
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Leisure-Cultivation Pavilion lIM.:$
(Zhongxian Ting), 234

Li Bai $8 (701-62), 310
poetry (trans.), 268-9
Shitao and
identification with, 306, 308, 317,

329
illustrations of poems by: album leaves,
Pl. 7, 142, .I42, 260,312, 3.I3,
360033; hanging scrolls, 186, 197,
I98, 259,261, 266, 268-7°,269,
308-9

Li Cheng $$; (919-67), 126, 197,270,
280

Li Chunfang 'i''lf3\' (I5II-85), 132
Li, Chu-tsing, 364064
Li DOll *4 (active late r Srh C.), 9, .13
Li Fangying 'i'1filf (1695-1755), 337n3
Li Gan '$ii, 12, 47-8, 133, 161, 169,

340025, 359nII2
Li Gonglin $%M (ro49-IIo6), 193,

194-5,242,363°32,36908
Li Guangdi $:J'tJtt! (1652-1718), 105, 235
Li Guosong -*11*. 131, 133. 168, 201,

312, 37Inr
colophons by, 67, 74, 128, 134, 3,43°57,
350018,352071,354oIIO

Li Jinjie *1f~, 312
Li Lin *U (1634-1710), 134, 177,

343n69,352n73
Cheng Daoguang and, 168
family of, 12, 132-3, 168, 359nl12
Huang Jixian and, 35801:05
Huang You and, 64, 65, 67, 68, 72, 168,
342n28

poetry (trans.), 65, 312
Shitao and, 4, 135-6, 193, 287, 329, 330,
361n7, 370nr6
Biography of Dadizi, 4, 9, 42, 58, 86-7,
97,135,136,144,282-3,284,285,
286,324, 343n7, 344nn8,13,
345n38,347n81

elegies for, 312, 317, 318, 371064
literary portrait of, 101, 131-2, 312
paintings received from, 38, 190,
33711I3

Xiao Cuo and, 53, 341n83, 370n33
Zhuo Erkan and, 100-1

Li Liufang *ViE1.f (1575-1629),23°
Li Pengnian ~~1F, 128, 190, 332
Li Qing "l'1II (1602-83),133
Li Shan *i4l (1686-1762),160,166
Li Sixun ~)i!;',wll (651-716),218
Li Songan **,tMf, see Li Pengnian
Li Tang *J!t (c. 105e-after 1130),

361044
Li Tianfu *.*.11 (1635-99),114, 116, 151,

328, 371nI
Li Xu 'i'.~ (1655-1729),75
Li Yin *fi (active c. 1679-17°2)
landscape paintings of, xvi, 30, 31, 34,
164,179,186,195

Shitao and, 194, 195, 197-8, 197, 361052
stylistic allusions to Zha Shibiao, 36rn47
Western painting and, 220

Li Yooggoog '4EJ1<0, 326, 36102

NAME AND PLACE INDEX

Li Yu *7% (1610/II-8o), 339061
Li Zhi *_ (1527-1602),280,3°4,

3690nl22,128
Li Zicheng "l'~J!i; (1605?-45), 323,

342031
Liang Hong ~m,201, 324, 349nIIo,

362014
Liang Peilan ~{ij\1J (1632-17°8), 124,

186,190
Liang-Huai salt administration m71.~p]

(Liang-Huai yanyun si), 4, 6, 18
Liang-Huai yanfa zhi Pfl7tHIrt;ii!;;, 47, 152,

207, 364051
Liaoning 11$, 189
Liaoyang (Liaoning), 355n27
Liezu ?!Hil., founder of Southern Tang

dynasty, 101
Liji m~,34°029
Lingbao School, see Numinous Treasure

School
Linggu Monastery 1i'§~ (Nanjing),

347n73
Lingyin Temple :I:~~ (Hangzhou), 141,

I4I
Linji 1i;fJ!'t School, II9; see also Tiantong

lineage
monks of, 108,241,326, 362n13, 324
philosophical approach of, 219, 239, 254,
280

temples and monasteries of, 88, 92, 102
Linji Yixuan lim~"B: (d. 867),92, 108,

246
Linqing li;rtf (Shandong), 27, 112, 122,

124-5
Linquan gaozhi **~~, 2.24, 270
Linyun .l*~,92
Lishui l'l71< (Jiangsu), 326, 346n054,55
Lirerary Peak Pagoda xdfl:t§ (Yangzhou),

6
Literary Star Pavilion x~M (Yangzhou), 8,

F3
Lirtle Mount Lu IJ\llIl1J, 367n77
Linle Qin-Huai Canal IJ'I~* (Yangzhou),

8,9,10
Liu, Mr. J~~,I32, 136, 232-4, 329
as connoisseul and student of painting,
200,209, 352n072,73, 362n20

identity of, 362nl I
Shitao's 1703 albums for, see Landscapes
(1703, Bei Shan Tang Collection); Land-
scapes (1703, Ostasiatiska Museet);
Landscapes for Liu Shitou; Landscapes
for Liu Xiaoshan

Liu Bang llJ'~(1.206-195 B.CE.), 67
Liu Fengyun flJJJ:t~, 340n35
Liu Lang J~~B,see Mr. Liu
Liu Shishu 1~1~!iB,68
Liu Shirou 'f1'iWi, see Mr. Liu
Liu Xiaoshan 1~/J'IllJ, see Mr. Liu
Liu Xiring '~~JM,362011
Liu Xuexi ,g!:1,£, 326,36102
Liu Yu (Han dynasty), 132
Liu Yu :t9~:ffi (acrive late 17th C.), 356n51
Liu Yuxi ~Jil\l!& (772-842), 249
Liu Zongzhou 'U~U1i] (1578-1656),

3690122

Liugeng Garden IitftmJ (Yangzhou), II8,
367n68

Longwu ~ftt; (regime of Southern Ming,
1645-6),84

Longwu emperor (Zhu Yujian}, 323
Longyou 1lI!1J)f (Zhejiang), 69
Loudong _* (Jiangsu), 22
Lotus Sutra 7*¥~ (Fahua jing), 344n25
Lu Ao 1I1il:, 269
Lu Daqi 8jefl- (1628 jinshi), 61
Lil Hui g~, 20r
Lu Ji IlliM (261-3°3),288
Lii LiuJiang §Il'il>. (1629-83),165-6,279,

363n39
Lu Qian 8M, 3590129
Lu Xiufu 1lliJ'l'1e, 72
Lu Wei Illiall, 365n9I
Lu You ~tuI (1125-1210), 288
Lu Yunshi ~~±,161
Lii'an Benyue ~i'Il'*Y1 (d. 1676),3°,239,

325
as teacher, 92, 97, 104, .1I0, 241,
366n34

Shitao's direct contact with, 90, 9 I, 94,
95,96, 324,325, 346n50

Shunzhi's patronage of, 88,97,99, 104,
324, 348nl08

Luhmann, Niklas, 340n23
Luo Mu H.!& (1622-n08), 151, 161,

356nn49,p
Lua Qingshan li!!!Il1~ (b. 1642),186,

353n86,36I042
Luohan Temple .~1f (Shexian), 325,

345n31,354n5
Luzhou 1it1·H (Sichuan), 134

Mei Geng ;ffiJ1l (I 64O-C. 1722), 114, 201,
202,325,346048, 355nII, 356n51,
37111I

Mei Qing ~11f (1623-97),206,329,
354ll7, 37I01

art of, 92, II4, 181, 202, 203, 345n44
poetry (trans.), 242
Shitao and, 92, 97, 108, 201, 203, 242,

325,328
Meng County .&:1/# (Henan), 344nI 2
Meng Haoran ~7i!l-?'& (689-740), 142, .142
Mi Fu *1t'f (1052-rr07), 184, 193, 218,

251, 282, 355n27
Mi Wanzhong Ji'lilit (1570-<:·1628),

339n56
Mi Youren *o:{: (1074-UP), 218,220,

361044
Mianxian ~~ (Shenxi}, 61
Min ~, region of, 68
Min Changhong I¥H~:!I!I,355n9
Min Hua I'*l¥, 338n31
Min River I¥lIT (Fujian), 70, 71
Min Shizhang l¥ltltilI, 146,325
Ming History 1:!Jl~, 58,326
Mingfu lJfIll, 326, 343-4n8, 365n2
Miyun Yuanwu *~lit.g, 34411I5,

365nlo
Mount Bailong E3 ~l1J (Sichuan), 90
MOUn! Bogui isll!w (Anhui), 93, 325,

345n42
Mount Dadi ::k.MLIJ (Zhejiang), II9, 120,

126, 138,258-9, 259,329,342n44
Mount Emei ~~ l1J (Sichuan), 186, 194,

259, 261, 266
Mount Ganquan 1::t*llJ (Jiangsu), 113, 328
Mount Grdhraklita lit;L1J, 90
Mount Gu MLlJ, 345n37
Mount Heng .jfllJ (Hunan)
Iron-Feet Daoist and, 244, 244, 36601 8
monastic communiry of, 88
Shitao and, 87, 87,14°,144,244,324
Wu Qi and, 148, 355021

Moum Hua ~LIJ (Shenxi), 83, 104, 181
Moum Huang -j[l1J (Anhui)
ascents of, 31, 64, 74, 91, 181, 190
depictions of, 41,107,181,206,241,
360n7,370n28

as emblem of Huizhou identity, 41, 48,
50,73,36In43

monks of, 107
political symbolism of, 31, 41,52
Shitao and
ascents of, 41, 91, 94, 244, 325
depictions of, Pl. 3, Pl. 14, PI. IS, 31,
32-3,43,44,49,64, u8, 138, .145,
.180-1,181,19°,191,241,243,244,
264-6, 361n43

Mount Huayang ¥~LlJ (Anhui),367n64
Mount Jingting :/!jt~llJ (Anhui), 92, 97,

244, 368n93
Mount Lang 00 l1J, 248
Mount Lu llILlJ (Jiangxi), PI. 12, 73, 73,

74, 89, 90, 182, 186, 198, 244,
268-70, 309, 324, 368n93

Mount Luofu ,~1¥LlJ (Guangdong), 71, 189
Mount Song ~Li1 (Henan),83

Ma-Xia School ~,Jjl~,221, 229
Ma Yueguan .Il SJ'il (1688-1755),2)2,

364n64
Ma Yuelu ,l!!§ 13li&, 232, 364n64
Ma Yuzi ,~.liT,146-7; see also SAl:

Energies of the Four Seasons
McCausland, Shane, 366n32
Madman of Chu, 268
Magu RiM, goddess, 190-1
Mahesvara, 108
Maitreya, 103
Makeup Lane 1".dllt" (Yangzhou), 290
Man Clothed in Animal Skins IIUI:~:0(Piqiu

Gong), 66,145-6, I47
Manchuria, 65
Manchus, xvii, I, 21, 22, 58, 2°7,280,323,

3pn75
dignitaries punished, 58, 80-1, 325
style of dress imposed, 2, 37-8,47-8,118,
125

see also 51: Manchu conquest
Mann, Susan, 27, 30, 349nu6
Manual of Painting, A m~ (Hua pu), see 51:

manuals and treatises, Shitao's
Mao like %1lIl1iJ (1633-1708), 34rn86
Mao Qiling -=5~tt (1623-1716),37°015
Marbled Stone Cliff ~;P.fl (Jiangsu), 141,

181,310,3.11
Master Zhang's Grotto ~0j1PJ (Jiangsu), PI.

8, 193, 259-60, 262-5

NAME AND PLACE INDEX

Mount Tai *LlJ (Shandong), 64, 102, JI8,
3480108

Mount Tiantai ;FC3W {Zhejiang], 182,
186,268,269,366015

Mount Tianyin ;FCfPLiJ(Nanjing), 347091
Mount Wutai 1iitLil (Shanxi), 83
Mount Xiang ~l1J (Anhui), 83, 326
Muchen Daomin :kI'JlH1tz (1596-1674),

30,92-3,239,254,325, 34411I8,
3480108,37101

monasteries associated with, 4, 89, 92,
239,268,367°77

as Shirao's dharma "grandfather," 90,92,
102,1°4, IIO, 241, 325, 326, 327

Shunzhi's patronage of, 88, 92, 97, 99,
104, 324

teachings of, 204, 242, 280
Mustard~Seed Garden Manual of Painting,

The *T~"1fUiezi yuan huazhuan),
208,212,2.13,217,2.18,220,23°,
233
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Nanchang T¥i ~ (Jiangxi), 202
artists from, 161, 190; see also Bada
Shamen; Luo Mu

Shitao's patrons in and from, 161; see also
Huang Lu; Li Pengnian
visitors to and from, 73, 128, 152, 191.,

313,35°°52
Nanjing Wig (Jiangsu), 8, 20, 54, 75
calligraphers in and from, 73, 201,
356055,368n90

environs of, 31,41,52,99,120,120,12.1,
122, .123, 142, 181, 247, 290, 3°9-10,
310, 3IT, 318,320,32.1

fall of, 1645, 21, 323
Kangxi's visits to, 54.98, 102, 3490109
loyalism in, 64, 73-4, 98, 99-100, ]26,
347nn73,74

Ming dyoastic sites in, 120, 330, 3490109,

353n97
officials in, 98, 147, ]26, 329, 348°93,
371n62

painters in and from, 100, 120, 121, 15r-
2,160,161,172,179,182,201,202,
206,212,220,325, 347n73, 356n55,
362n20

painting in, 20, 22., 194, 203
public buildings, constructed/restored,
254, 349nl09

Shitao and
patrons in and from, 98, 146-7, 148,

326, 353n97
sojourns in (1678-9), 326; (1680-6),

25,97-100,101-2,105,109,141,
143,146-7,183,203-4,2.46,249,
254,257,286,309,318,326,327,
355019,362n20

students in, 173
visits to, 4, 53, 97, 104, II2, 135-6,

327, ]28, 329
writers and poets in and from, 100, 134,
149, lSI, 250, 313, 353n97, 356n32

Nanping i¥J-'F- (Fujian),70-I
National University (Beijing), 192
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New Prosperity Street 1fT~1!J (Yangzhou),
29°

Ni Yongqing ffi.7'kiW, PI,S, 51, 52-4, 134,
343n75,355021

Ni Zan i5!llt (1301-74)
early Qing copies of paintings by, 361044
early Qing stylistic allusions to, 134, J84,
.184,202, 355n27, 361047

Shirao and
comments on, 210, 229, 232
stylistic allusions to, 151,184, r85, 200,
226,229,232,235,3°3,3°4

Nine Dragon Rapids JL1iIliJil (Fujian}, Pl.
10,7°

Ningbo 'tIiIl (Zhejiang), 344"' 5
Ningguo 'tI1i!J (Anhui), 346n56
Notes on Viewing Paintings if ~ (Duhua

lu), 202, 208, 347"73, 357n59,
362020

Numinous Treasure jiJl (Lingbao) School,
268

Nurhaci ~m'nft$ (1559-1626),129, ]27
Nu Wa -kM1J, 260

Oboi Ji'fi' (d. 1669),324,325
Old Dinglin Temple l'ijE1*#,' (Mount
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Ouyang Xiu ~~1~(1007-72), 14
Owen, Stephen, 268

Pan Xiaochi jfilNni, 201., ]24, 362nI4
Pang Yuanji JiI:JL~ (1864-1949), 34on47
Panshan illlJ lineage, 102, 344nl5
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Parrot Island .~1JtI(Hubei), PI. 7, 160
Pavilion for Summoning Immortals lU~fl1J~,
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Yuan), 28, 62-3, 64,7°, rr6, 186,
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Peak of First Realization .lmffi~ (Mount
Huang), .145, 180-1, 244

Peak of Solitary Elegance .~~ {Duxiu
Feng),138

Pearl River %fi:iI (Guangdong), 71-2
Penglai JI'M{ (Daoist paradise), 177, 214,
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1111ll'¥il!iI!' (Yizheng), lI8, 259

Plaks, Andrew, 54, 341089
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360033; hanging scrolls, 186, 197,
I98, 259,261, 266, 268-7°,269,
308-9
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Li Guosong -*11*. 131, 133. 168, 201,

312, 37Inr
colophons by, 67, 74, 128, 134, 3,43°57,
350018,352071,354oIIO

Li Jinjie *1f~, 312
Li Lin *U (1634-1710), 134, 177,
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landscape paintings of, xvi, 30, 31, 34,
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Shitao and, 194, 195, 197-8, 197, 361052
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Western painting and, 220
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Lil Hui g~, 20r
Lu Ji IlliM (261-3°3),288
Lii LiuJiang §Il'il>. (1629-83),165-6,279,
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Yuan), 28, 62-3, 64,7°, rr6, 186,
I89

Peak of First Realization .lmffi~ (Mount
Huang), .145, 180-1, 244

Peak of Solitary Elegance .~~ {Duxiu
Feng),138

Pearl River %fi:iI (Guangdong), 71-2
Penglai JI'M{ (Daoist paradise), 177, 214,

259, 367n64
Pieterse, Jan Nederveen, 338n42
Pine Wind Hall ¥t)il.1it (Shexian), 122, 124,

152,184
Pingshan Tang .:>F-L.1J1it (Level-with-the-

Mountains Hall) (Yangzhou), 14, IS,
50, 53, 103, 104-5, 192., 1:92, 327,
361n4

Place for Reading to Study the Dao
1111ll'¥il!iI!' (Yizheng), lI8, 259

Plaks, Andrew, 54, 341089
Plum Blossom Mound -tftttfJt (Yangzhou),

17
Poems of Four HU1tdred Remnant Subjects

of the Ming Dynasty 1jIj*l1!Iaocl1lf\\O!i

.



(Mingmo sibai iia yimin shi), see Zhuo
Erkan

Poyu ~.Ii!\\" 256, 328, 36104
Precious Mirror of Painting: Continued

i1~Wit~.(Tuhui baojian xuzuan),
202,363027

Precious Pagoda Wharf )lit. (Baota Wan)
(Yangzhou), 18, 75

Primer in the Methods of Painting .~~ l[i
(Huafa beiyuan), see 51: manuals and
treatises, Shitao's

Prunus Ridge ifiJ1it, see Slender Ridge
Puhe -if1iii (1593-1683),202, 352n72
Pure Land ~±,245, 318
Purple Chamber *,Jf.f, 264
Putian tHE (Fujian), 71
Puzhao Monastery if ,~~"'i¥'(Mount Tal),

3480108

Qianlong ~~ emperor (17II-99,
r. 1736-95), 22

Qiao Baitian ~B E8, 161
Qiao Lai Jill< (1642-94),48, 358n99
Qiao Yin ~9[, 68, 342n34
poetry (trans.), 66

Qiehan Studio H~:Jtf (Beijing), 104-5,
107, 327, 347-8n92, 3480105

Qilao :H~, lI6
Qin-Huai ~m
entertainment area in Nanjing, 8
southern environs of Nanjing, 97, 206,
290,309, 326,327,34801°9, 361n2;
see also Nanjing, environs of

Qio-Huai River ~HtfiiJ (Nanjing), 31, 120,
I20

Qillghui zengyan m~R~a.363n30
Qingjiangpu 1i!fiI.tm (Jiangsu), 77, J02,

32.7,355012
Qingkou n.1o (Jiangsu), 77, 78
Qinglian Caotang, see Green Lotus

Studio
Qingliaog Terrace rwtl?. (Nanjing), 136,

353097
Qiogliu ~V[ (Fujiao), 70
Qinglong Shan, see Green Dragon

Mountain
Qingpu wrm (Jiangsu), 88, 90, 239,324,

325
Qingxi Retreat illm~ (Qingxi An) (Mount

Xiang), 326
Qingxiang l'A'ml, see Quanzhou
Qiu Ying ih.~ (c. 1494--e. 1552), n6, 193,

328,360nI7
Qiufeng wenji ~L"'JtilL 168
Qu Dajun 1Hi:kJ';J(1630-96),64,70-1,72,

345n44,37IOl
Qu Shisi l\l.>tfl: (1590-1651), 323
Qu Yuan f:liiW, 135
Quan Tang shi. see Complete Poetry of the

Tang
Quanzhen School :i:;I:{, II9
Quanzhou ~ffl (Guangxi), 73, 87, 94,147,

154
and Shirao
earliest years in, 84, 86, 323, 343n5

NAME AND PLACE INDEX

in Shirao's signatures and seals, IIO,
137-8,268,301

Quzhou 11i:m (Zhejiang), 69

Rankin, Mary, 46, 338n48
Record of Subjects Who Withdrew

~~I::2\!fC (Xunguo chen ji), 90
Recorded Remarks on Painting of Monk

Bitter Melon 15JIlW MJ_Jm,* (Kugua
besbang huayu lu), see SI: manuals and
treatises, Shirao's

Red Bridge nil (Yangzhou), I}, 14, 15.
I7,53,168,350n49

Renhe f=.fl1l (Zhejiang),340n59
Ricoeur, Paul, 340n32
River Pacification Gate :tier, (Anjiang

Men) (Yangzhou), 6, 7
River Village amid White Sand and Verdant

Bamboo slJ>J'I1t'rlItt (Yizheng},
152-4, IS5, 328

Robertson, Roland, 338n42.
Rogers, Howard, 3 57n 59
Romance of the Three Teachings, The

:=tIllilli!!' • .iE~iil (Sanjiao kaimi
guizheng yanyi), 369nI07

Rowe, William, xvii, 18, 21
Ruan ji 1Vt~ (2IO-63), 229
Ruan Yuan IDt5G (1764-1849), 51-,64,74,

341n72
Ruhn waishi, see The Unofficial History of

the Scholars
Ruoshui iPl7l<. (Daoist paradise), 214
Ryckmans, Pierre, 2°9,274,3°2

Siikyamuni Buddha, 247, 250
Sang Zhi ~%, 201, 350m8, 371n1
San:nao Riv~r =:lYPN (Jiangsu), 90
Schipper, Knstofer, 276
Sha River tvm, 70
Shadows of Secret Dreams .@l~~ (Youmeng

ying), 82, 161, 256, 286,356045
Shan Guoqiang ¥~ij$, 20

Shandong JJ.ot£, 27, I.I2, 203, 34In59,
346068, 348094

Shanghai k#i}:, 47, 2.06, 351n69
Shangqing School, see Upper Purity School
Shanhai jing w~~,358099
Shaohaiguao wl/UII (Zhili), 65
Shanxi L.iJW, 2, 34, 54,83, 161, 202, 206
Shanyang LiIIi (Jiangsu),343n72
Shanyin ilJlII (Zhejiang), 362015
Shao Changheng B''''iiJ (,637-1704),285
Shaob? B~fs (jiangsu), 10, 78, 79, 171, 329
Shaoxmg ~~ (Zhejiang), 20
Shen H~o tt;lJ (1586-1661 or later), 187
Shen Shlchong tt±1E (active c. 1607-after

1640),342°45
Shen Shuyu ttm~, 363n27
Shen Yiog tt'R:, 341066
Shen Zhou ttjlij (1427-'509), Pl. 8, 186,

187, 193, I93. 210, 259,263-5,297,
3°3

Sheng Maoye ~l€. (active c. 1594-164°),
187

Shenxi ~W, 2, 34, 54,61,62, 83, 104,
I29,161,202,2,06'358n99

Shexian At~ (Anhui), 46, 91, 93, 201,
350n28

estates, 42-3, 44, 45,121,124
families, as collectors/patrons.r z r , 163,
358n99

monks in and from, 326, 346n55
officials, see Cao Dingwang
public buildings, constructedlrestored,
325,345031,354n5

Shitao and
patron families, 113, 121, 152, 154,
161,163,172

students from families, 173, 200
visits to, 25,91,92,95,121,146,152,

325; see also Huizhou
Shi Kefa ~jjJl!i (d. 1645), 17
Shi Lin J1ffi;~, 161, 360n9
Shi Pang :on (1676-17°5), 161, 37101
Shi Runzhang !i!i1l!lJ1' (1619-83),92,98,

325,326, 345n44, 348-90109, 366n18
Shi Yuan Dfli:liT:, 160
Shi Yue !i!i'IJL 356054
Shigao t!t~, 108, 367n62
Shitao 15m
artworks by, see SAl: specific type or title
biography of, xvi, 2-4, 57, 83-143
passim, 323-3° passim; see also Chen
Ding, biography of Shitao; Li Lin,
Shitao and, Biography of Dadizj

calligraphy of, xvi, 3,132,144,146,162.,
163,166,167,168,186,324,331,
332,333,334, 335,352n69
scripts and style of, 87, IIO, 128, 162,
167,184,186, loll., 219, 282, 302,
303,313,332,333

colophons and inscriptions to other artists'
works, 127, 202, 206, 284, 362n20,
363n32,370028

death, 134, 285, 312, 316-18, 320, 321,
330
grave, 3, 318

destiny, 84, 99, 113, II4, 121, 126, 134,
141,322,368093

fame, 3, 6, 204, 235-6
family of
by birth, 3, 84,96,97,125,126-9,
131-7,137-8,143,317-18,323,
34306,343-4n8

Buddhist, 90, 326; see also Hetao
forgeries, 348n92, 351-2n69, 352n69,
355noI7,24, 357nn76,79, 366n39; see
also 51: connoisseurship

identity of, 2, rr6, II9, 123, 284, 286,
3°2
Buddhist, xvi, I, 2, 30-1, 112-14, 116,
II8-26, 128, 149, 154, 233, 238-57
passim, 258, 260, 265-6, 268, 277

concealment of, 86, 9°,137,14°,323
Daoist, 2, 3, 113, 116, 118, 121, 123-
6,128,149,238,2.42,244,247-8,
277,283,33I,332,359nI31

literati, 163-4, 205
political, 84, 133
princely, I, 2, 9, 23, 24,31,52,57,84,
89,94,96,100,1°4,1°7,1°9,113.

123, 125, "126,126-9, 131-8, 140-3,
182, 312

professional artistic, 24, II3-I4, II6,
122-3,125-6,135,149,194,206,
207

religious, 84, 121, 12.3, 309
illnesses of, 3, 97, 107, 108, 131, 169-70,
177,285,297,3°2,312,314,317,
329, 330, 337n9

influence of, 2, 204, 33703
personal references to, 38,42, 52-3,
lI8, 144, 162, 163, 167, 168, 169-
7°,314,332,333,334,335,336

names of, xxi, I, 2, 84, 119, 124, 125,
131,135,136,140,147-8,324,328,
329,33°, 351n69, 366nr4; see also
Shirao, seals of

poetry of, 4,10,31,74,78-81,87,102-
4,106,110,112,122,12.5,131,141,
144,145,146,147,151,182,244,
3°9-10,314,324,327,328,331,333
complete poems (trans.), 6, 9, 38, 52,

60,78, 83-4, 98, 99, 1°3-4. 108,
1°9,112-13,116,118,127,134,
135,138,143,154,214,218,23°,
232,233,234,251,2.57,266,27°,
288,29°,294,310, 3Il, 312, 314,
316,316-17,318

cycles (italic pp. = trans. poem or
excerpt); "Bamboo-branch Songs,"
14-15,33; "First Arrival at the Single
Branch Pavilion," 97, 143, 3IB,
34801°9; "New Year's Eve Poems,"
83-4, 102, 134-5, 137; "Ninety
Poems on Plum Blossoms," 328;
"Paying My Respects at the Imperial
Tombs," 135-6; "Poems for
Yueduan," 112-13; "Plum-blossom
Octets," 257,316-17; "River Village
amid White Sand and Verdant Bam-
boo," 356n41; "Searching for Plum
Blossoms," 99, 120

excerpts (trans.), 8, 14, 27, 29, 79-80,
8r, 96, 99,102,107,116,199-200,
247-8,2.57,260,313; from «Song of
My Life," 83,86,87,89,9°,91,97,
145, 348-9nl09

manuscripts, 100, 108, IIO, 134, 137,
162,171,313-14,327-8,338028,
367069,370n35

professionalism of, II3, r:z.6,200, chaps.
6-7 passim, 286
agents and intermediaries, 126-7, 148,
154,166,177

anist-patron relationships, 122.-3, 251,
254,325-9; in Anhui, 91, 95> II4,
rr6, 121,145-6,151,152; in Beijing,
104-5, 148-9; in Nanjing, 145-8,
353n98; in Tianjin, 148-9; in Yang-
zhou area, 102, 113, 116, 118, 148,
149,151,151-2,152,154,161-4,
166-9,170-3,176-7,2.32-6,331-6;
see a/so specific city, region, or patron

business correspondence, 154, 162-4,
166-9,331-6

NAME AND PLACE INDEX

identity as professional artist, 24, 113-
14, 116, 122-3. 12.5-6, 135, 149,
194,2.06,207

payment, 144, 145, 148, 163-4, 169,
176

prices, 163-6, 170, 177, 194
teaching, 149, 173, 176-7

seals of, 3, 110
Azhang IlPlft, 131
baoyang tianbe f*ff:7CfIl, 248, 367n68
bu cong men ru ~~rtA., 2.p
cbenseng Yuanji ~i~j[;iJ!l, 94, 98, 103,
)26

Daben Tang j(.:<$.1it (square, A), 330
Daben Tang **1it (square, B), 330
Daben Tang,]i :k'i':l!:l!ij, 136, 330,
353°99

Daben Tang, Ruoii **1it;e:~,136,
330, 353099

Dadizi :ki!!lii' (oval), )29, 367069
Dndizi *~r(square), 330
Dadi Tang *M1it, 329
Dadizi,]i :ki!!li'flJ!!, 136, 330, 353099
dong tu xi rno *f!:1!!lM.:, 302, 330
famen 1ti:r~, 245, 324
fangwai xiaoyao jjjrHl!tii, 335
Gaornangzi,ji .lfr~,282.
He ke yiri wu cijun? fnJi5J - 8~!!tllt~,
182

Kugua i5 nl, IrO
jing;iang Houren ntn.lfA, 135, 32.9
Lao Tao ~1I, 324, 351069
Lingding Laoren ~T~A, 137, 329
Mengdong Sheng ff1i~, 329, 351069
Qingxiang Gukou ren ttrml-Y lJA.

IIO
Qingxiang Ji Ii'iJlllIll', 137-8
Qingxiang Laoren mml~A, 138
Qingxiang Shjtao mml15l1, 137
Qingxiang Yiren li'imlfftA, 33°
Ruoji :a=ti, 330, 353n99
Shanguo Yue zhi zi, Tiantong Min zhi

sun, Yuanii zhi zhang '€l*-.Fl Z r7(
:I:$ztf,NOj!fZ1f, 90, 110, 326,
344n27

Sibai Feng Zhong Ruoli Weng tushu
1!!18~"':5Sl:~ll!Il!L 35'n69

tou bai zhenran bu shi zj IIlBA~::::F
~:¥, 282

Wo he ji zhi you? 'li(JiiIl!'lZ;fJ, 34905
xiangnian Kugua 1cJ~i5}11. u8, 32.9
Xiangyuan Gukou ren #Il1w.i:t lJA,
rIO,137

Xiazunzhe 1Ii~;g-,no, 147-8, 282.
yu ;in wei shu wei qingmen T4-~!!f.~
liUl, ')2, )29

Yuanji Shitao l!\ilHiJII, 324
rue shan -.W, 137
Zan zhi shishi sun Azhang JrZ -ttltIfi

1fIiJ*, 131, 329
studios and residences of, see Changgan
Monastery; Daben Tang; Dadi Tang;
Dashu Tang; Guangjiao Temple;
jinghui Monastery; Single Branch
Pavilion

397

theory of painting, 250-1, 270-2; see a/so
51: manuals and treatises, Shirao's

travels, 83, 95,102,104,109,112.,114,
121, J40-1, 191
on Grand Canal, 102., IT2, 327, 32.8
in Hunan, 86,86,87,88,89,148, 3I2,
32.4, 344n13

in jiangsu, 88, 90, 91, 92, 94,324,325,
)26

in jiangxi, 89, 32.4
in Zhejiang, 91, 32.4, 344n2o
see also Anhui, Shitac and; Beijing,
Shitao and; Tianjin, Shirao and

Shitou ii, see The Story of the Stone
Shrine of Master Dong 1J!r1iiJ (Dongzi Ci)

(Yangzhou], 10, II. 350n49
Shu Jij, region of, 62-3, 194
Shu Ridge ~lM.I (Yangzhou}, .£5, 53, r r a,

337014
Shuangxiao m-w, 326, 355017, 362.015,

3660 33
Shui;ing zhu 71<*¥.T1, 358n99
Shuixi 7.KIDi, see Jingxian
Shuixi Academy 7.j(IDf.~ (Jingxian),94-5,

326,346048,366n17
Shun ff, Sage Emperor, 66, 90
Shunde JllQ~ (Guangdong), 71
Shunzhi emperor }llRta (Fulin r. 1644-61),

88, 323, 340n28
as patron, 102, 119
of Lii'an Benyue, 88, 97, 99, 1°4,324,
348nl08

of Muchen Daomin, 88, 92, 97, 99,
104,32.4

Sichuan [!9JiI, 33. 61-3, 74, 90, 134, 190,
202,324,342n57

Silbergeld, jerome, 155, 355n30
Single Branch Hall -tt1it (Yizhi Tang)

(Shaoxing), 248
Single Branch Pavilion -ttllf1 (Nanjing),

97,98-9,99.246,247,248.257,319.
326,32.7,346°56

Shitao's poems 00 moving into, 97, 98-9,
143,318,326,348mo9

Slender Ridge lli'~ (Jiaogxi), 65, 66-7, 67,
73

Slender West Lake ~l!Ym.I (Shall Xi Hu),
see Baozhang Lake

Song Cao *If, 202
Song Luo*~(1634-1713),160,181
Song Xu *m (I523-1602?), 280
Song Yingxing *Jfm.£ (1587-?), 369nI°4
Songgotu ~Mill (d. I703?), 58
Songjiang :t'tiI. (Jiangsu), 53,74, 89, 239,

363n25, 365n4, 366034
painting in, 20, 202, 365n91, 366n34
Shitao's visits to, 94, 201, 324, 325

Songs of Chu, The 'HI (Chuci), 88, 89,
89-90, 182., 353n96

South Garden mlm (Yangzhou), 200
South Lake if.ijM (Xuancheng),345n42
South Pond m~ (Yangzhou), 286
Southern Ming mlJJ.l, 61, 67, 71, 72, 84.

88,89,95; see also 51:resistance,
loyalist



(Mingmo sibai iia yimin shi), see Zhuo
Erkan

Poyu ~.Ii!\\" 256, 328, 36104
Precious Mirror of Painting: Continued

i1~Wit~.(Tuhui baojian xuzuan),
202,363027

Precious Pagoda Wharf )lit. (Baota Wan)
(Yangzhou), 18, 75

Primer in the Methods of Painting .~~ l[i
(Huafa beiyuan), see 51: manuals and
treatises, Shitao's

Prunus Ridge ifiJ1it, see Slender Ridge
Puhe -if1iii (1593-1683),202, 352n72
Pure Land ~±,245, 318
Purple Chamber *,Jf.f, 264
Putian tHE (Fujian), 71
Puzhao Monastery if ,~~"'i¥'(Mount Tal),

3480108

Qianlong ~~ emperor (17II-99,
r. 1736-95), 22

Qiao Baitian ~B E8, 161
Qiao Lai Jill< (1642-94),48, 358n99
Qiao Yin ~9[, 68, 342n34
poetry (trans.), 66

Qiehan Studio H~:Jtf (Beijing), 104-5,
107, 327, 347-8n92, 3480105

Qilao :H~, lI6
Qin-Huai ~m
entertainment area in Nanjing, 8
southern environs of Nanjing, 97, 206,
290,309, 326,327,34801°9, 361n2;
see also Nanjing, environs of

Qio-Huai River ~HtfiiJ (Nanjing), 31, 120,
I20

Qillghui zengyan m~R~a.363n30
Qingjiangpu 1i!fiI.tm (Jiangsu), 77, J02,

32.7,355012
Qingkou n.1o (Jiangsu), 77, 78
Qinglian Caotang, see Green Lotus

Studio
Qingliaog Terrace rwtl?. (Nanjing), 136,

353097
Qiogliu ~V[ (Fujiao), 70
Qinglong Shan, see Green Dragon

Mountain
Qingpu wrm (Jiangsu), 88, 90, 239,324,

325
Qingxi Retreat illm~ (Qingxi An) (Mount

Xiang), 326
Qingxiang l'A'ml, see Quanzhou
Qiu Ying ih.~ (c. 1494--e. 1552), n6, 193,

328,360nI7
Qiufeng wenji ~L"'JtilL 168
Qu Dajun 1Hi:kJ';J(1630-96),64,70-1,72,

345n44,37IOl
Qu Shisi l\l.>tfl: (1590-1651), 323
Qu Yuan f:liiW, 135
Quan Tang shi. see Complete Poetry of the

Tang
Quanzhen School :i:;I:{, II9
Quanzhou ~ffl (Guangxi), 73, 87, 94,147,

154
and Shirao
earliest years in, 84, 86, 323, 343n5

NAME AND PLACE INDEX

in Shirao's signatures and seals, IIO,
137-8,268,301

Quzhou 11i:m (Zhejiang), 69

Rankin, Mary, 46, 338n48
Record of Subjects Who Withdrew

~~I::2\!fC (Xunguo chen ji), 90
Recorded Remarks on Painting of Monk

Bitter Melon 15JIlW MJ_Jm,* (Kugua
besbang huayu lu), see SI: manuals and
treatises, Shirao's

Red Bridge nil (Yangzhou), I}, 14, 15.
I7,53,168,350n49

Renhe f=.fl1l (Zhejiang),340n59
Ricoeur, Paul, 340n32
River Pacification Gate :tier, (Anjiang

Men) (Yangzhou), 6, 7
River Village amid White Sand and Verdant

Bamboo slJ>J'I1t'rlItt (Yizheng},
152-4, IS5, 328

Robertson, Roland, 338n42.
Rogers, Howard, 3 57n 59
Romance of the Three Teachings, The

:=tIllilli!!' • .iE~iil (Sanjiao kaimi
guizheng yanyi), 369nI07

Rowe, William, xvii, 18, 21
Ruan ji 1Vt~ (2IO-63), 229
Ruan Yuan IDt5G (1764-1849), 51-,64,74,

341n72
Ruhn waishi, see The Unofficial History of

the Scholars
Ruoshui iPl7l<. (Daoist paradise), 214
Ryckmans, Pierre, 2°9,274,3°2

Siikyamuni Buddha, 247, 250
Sang Zhi ~%, 201, 350m8, 371n1
San:nao Riv~r =:lYPN (Jiangsu), 90
Schipper, Knstofer, 276
Sha River tvm, 70
Shadows of Secret Dreams .@l~~ (Youmeng

ying), 82, 161, 256, 286,356045
Shan Guoqiang ¥~ij$, 20

Shandong JJ.ot£, 27, I.I2, 203, 34In59,
346068, 348094

Shanghai k#i}:, 47, 2.06, 351n69
Shangqing School, see Upper Purity School
Shanhai jing w~~,358099
Shaohaiguao wl/UII (Zhili), 65
Shanxi L.iJW, 2, 34, 54,83, 161, 202, 206
Shanyang LiIIi (Jiangsu),343n72
Shanyin ilJlII (Zhejiang), 362015
Shao Changheng B''''iiJ (,637-1704),285
Shaob? B~fs (jiangsu), 10, 78, 79, 171, 329
Shaoxmg ~~ (Zhejiang), 20
Shen H~o tt;lJ (1586-1661 or later), 187
Shen Shlchong tt±1E (active c. 1607-after

1640),342°45
Shen Shuyu ttm~, 363n27
Shen Yiog tt'R:, 341066
Shen Zhou ttjlij (1427-'509), Pl. 8, 186,

187, 193, I93. 210, 259,263-5,297,
3°3

Sheng Maoye ~l€. (active c. 1594-164°),
187

Shenxi ~W, 2, 34, 54,61,62, 83, 104,
I29,161,202,2,06'358n99

Shexian At~ (Anhui), 46, 91, 93, 201,
350n28

estates, 42-3, 44, 45,121,124
families, as collectors/patrons.r z r , 163,
358n99

monks in and from, 326, 346n55
officials, see Cao Dingwang
public buildings, constructedlrestored,
325,345031,354n5

Shitao and
patron families, 113, 121, 152, 154,
161,163,172

students from families, 173, 200
visits to, 25,91,92,95,121,146,152,

325; see also Huizhou
Shi Kefa ~jjJl!i (d. 1645), 17
Shi Lin J1ffi;~, 161, 360n9
Shi Pang :on (1676-17°5), 161, 37101
Shi Runzhang !i!i1l!lJ1' (1619-83),92,98,

325,326, 345n44, 348-90109, 366n18
Shi Yuan Dfli:liT:, 160
Shi Yue !i!i'IJL 356054
Shigao t!t~, 108, 367n62
Shitao 15m
artworks by, see SAl: specific type or title
biography of, xvi, 2-4, 57, 83-143
passim, 323-3° passim; see also Chen
Ding, biography of Shitao; Li Lin,
Shitao and, Biography of Dadizj

calligraphy of, xvi, 3,132,144,146,162.,
163,166,167,168,186,324,331,
332,333,334, 335,352n69
scripts and style of, 87, IIO, 128, 162,
167,184,186, loll., 219, 282, 302,
303,313,332,333

colophons and inscriptions to other artists'
works, 127, 202, 206, 284, 362n20,
363n32,370028

death, 134, 285, 312, 316-18, 320, 321,
330
grave, 3, 318

destiny, 84, 99, 113, II4, 121, 126, 134,
141,322,368093

fame, 3, 6, 204, 235-6
family of
by birth, 3, 84,96,97,125,126-9,
131-7,137-8,143,317-18,323,
34306,343-4n8

Buddhist, 90, 326; see also Hetao
forgeries, 348n92, 351-2n69, 352n69,
355noI7,24, 357nn76,79, 366n39; see
also 51: connoisseurship

identity of, 2, rr6, II9, 123, 284, 286,
3°2
Buddhist, xvi, I, 2, 30-1, 112-14, 116,
II8-26, 128, 149, 154, 233, 238-57
passim, 258, 260, 265-6, 268, 277

concealment of, 86, 9°,137,14°,323
Daoist, 2, 3, 113, 116, 118, 121, 123-
6,128,149,238,2.42,244,247-8,
277,283,33I,332,359nI31

literati, 163-4, 205
political, 84, 133
princely, I, 2, 9, 23, 24,31,52,57,84,
89,94,96,100,1°4,1°7,1°9,113.

123, 125, "126,126-9, 131-8, 140-3,
182, 312

professional artistic, 24, II3-I4, II6,
122-3,125-6,135,149,194,206,
207

religious, 84, 121, 12.3, 309
illnesses of, 3, 97, 107, 108, 131, 169-70,
177,285,297,3°2,312,314,317,
329, 330, 337n9

influence of, 2, 204, 33703
personal references to, 38,42, 52-3,
lI8, 144, 162, 163, 167, 168, 169-
7°,314,332,333,334,335,336

names of, xxi, I, 2, 84, 119, 124, 125,
131,135,136,140,147-8,324,328,
329,33°, 351n69, 366nr4; see also
Shirao, seals of

poetry of, 4,10,31,74,78-81,87,102-
4,106,110,112,122,12.5,131,141,
144,145,146,147,151,182,244,
3°9-10,314,324,327,328,331,333
complete poems (trans.), 6, 9, 38, 52,

60,78, 83-4, 98, 99, 1°3-4. 108,
1°9,112-13,116,118,127,134,
135,138,143,154,214,218,23°,
232,233,234,251,2.57,266,27°,
288,29°,294,310, 3Il, 312, 314,
316,316-17,318

cycles (italic pp. = trans. poem or
excerpt); "Bamboo-branch Songs,"
14-15,33; "First Arrival at the Single
Branch Pavilion," 97, 143, 3IB,
34801°9; "New Year's Eve Poems,"
83-4, 102, 134-5, 137; "Ninety
Poems on Plum Blossoms," 328;
"Paying My Respects at the Imperial
Tombs," 135-6; "Poems for
Yueduan," 112-13; "Plum-blossom
Octets," 257,316-17; "River Village
amid White Sand and Verdant Bam-
boo," 356n41; "Searching for Plum
Blossoms," 99, 120

excerpts (trans.), 8, 14, 27, 29, 79-80,
8r, 96, 99,102,107,116,199-200,
247-8,2.57,260,313; from «Song of
My Life," 83,86,87,89,9°,91,97,
145, 348-9nl09

manuscripts, 100, 108, IIO, 134, 137,
162,171,313-14,327-8,338028,
367069,370n35

professionalism of, II3, r:z.6,200, chaps.
6-7 passim, 286
agents and intermediaries, 126-7, 148,
154,166,177

anist-patron relationships, 122.-3, 251,
254,325-9; in Anhui, 91, 95> II4,
rr6, 121,145-6,151,152; in Beijing,
104-5, 148-9; in Nanjing, 145-8,
353n98; in Tianjin, 148-9; in Yang-
zhou area, 102, 113, 116, 118, 148,
149,151,151-2,152,154,161-4,
166-9,170-3,176-7,2.32-6,331-6;
see a/so specific city, region, or patron

business correspondence, 154, 162-4,
166-9,331-6
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identity as professional artist, 24, 113-
14, 116, 122-3. 12.5-6, 135, 149,
194,2.06,207

payment, 144, 145, 148, 163-4, 169,
176

prices, 163-6, 170, 177, 194
teaching, 149, 173, 176-7

seals of, 3, 110
Azhang IlPlft, 131
baoyang tianbe f*ff:7CfIl, 248, 367n68
bu cong men ru ~~rtA., 2.p
cbenseng Yuanji ~i~j[;iJ!l, 94, 98, 103,
)26

Daben Tang j(.:<$.1it (square, A), 330
Daben Tang **1it (square, B), 330
Daben Tang,]i :k'i':l!:l!ij, 136, 330,
353°99

Daben Tang, Ruoii **1it;e:~,136,
330, 353099

Dadizi :ki!!lii' (oval), )29, 367069
Dndizi *~r(square), 330
Dadi Tang *M1it, 329
Dadizi,]i :ki!!li'flJ!!, 136, 330, 353099
dong tu xi rno *f!:1!!lM.:, 302, 330
famen 1ti:r~, 245, 324
fangwai xiaoyao jjjrHl!tii, 335
Gaornangzi,ji .lfr~,282.
He ke yiri wu cijun? fnJi5J - 8~!!tllt~,
182

Kugua i5 nl, IrO
jing;iang Houren ntn.lfA, 135, 32.9
Lao Tao ~1I, 324, 351069
Lingding Laoren ~T~A, 137, 329
Mengdong Sheng ff1i~, 329, 351069
Qingxiang Gukou ren ttrml-Y lJA.

IIO
Qingxiang Ji Ii'iJlllIll', 137-8
Qingxiang Laoren mml~A, 138
Qingxiang Shjtao mml15l1, 137
Qingxiang Yiren li'imlfftA, 33°
Ruoji :a=ti, 330, 353n99
Shanguo Yue zhi zi, Tiantong Min zhi

sun, Yuanii zhi zhang '€l*-.Fl Z r7(
:I:$ztf,NOj!fZ1f, 90, 110, 326,
344n27

Sibai Feng Zhong Ruoli Weng tushu
1!!18~"':5Sl:~ll!Il!L 35'n69

tou bai zhenran bu shi zj IIlBA~::::F
~:¥, 282

Wo he ji zhi you? 'li(JiiIl!'lZ;fJ, 34905
xiangnian Kugua 1cJ~i5}11. u8, 32.9
Xiangyuan Gukou ren #Il1w.i:t lJA,
rIO,137

Xiazunzhe 1Ii~;g-,no, 147-8, 282.
yu ;in wei shu wei qingmen T4-~!!f.~
liUl, ')2, )29

Yuanji Shitao l!\ilHiJII, 324
rue shan -.W, 137
Zan zhi shishi sun Azhang JrZ -ttltIfi

1fIiJ*, 131, 329
studios and residences of, see Changgan
Monastery; Daben Tang; Dadi Tang;
Dashu Tang; Guangjiao Temple;
jinghui Monastery; Single Branch
Pavilion

397

theory of painting, 250-1, 270-2; see a/so
51: manuals and treatises, Shirao's

travels, 83, 95,102,104,109,112.,114,
121, J40-1, 191
on Grand Canal, 102., IT2, 327, 32.8
in Hunan, 86,86,87,88,89,148, 3I2,
32.4, 344n13

in jiangsu, 88, 90, 91, 92, 94,324,325,
)26

in jiangxi, 89, 32.4
in Zhejiang, 91, 32.4, 344n2o
see also Anhui, Shitac and; Beijing,
Shitao and; Tianjin, Shirao and

Shitou ii, see The Story of the Stone
Shrine of Master Dong 1J!r1iiJ (Dongzi Ci)

(Yangzhou], 10, II. 350n49
Shu Jij, region of, 62-3, 194
Shu Ridge ~lM.I (Yangzhou}, .£5, 53, r r a,

337014
Shuangxiao m-w, 326, 355017, 362.015,

3660 33
Shui;ing zhu 71<*¥.T1, 358n99
Shuixi 7.KIDi, see Jingxian
Shuixi Academy 7.j(IDf.~ (Jingxian),94-5,

326,346048,366n17
Shun ff, Sage Emperor, 66, 90
Shunde JllQ~ (Guangdong), 71
Shunzhi emperor }llRta (Fulin r. 1644-61),

88, 323, 340n28
as patron, 102, 119
of Lii'an Benyue, 88, 97, 99, 1°4,324,
348nl08

of Muchen Daomin, 88, 92, 97, 99,
104,32.4

Sichuan [!9JiI, 33. 61-3, 74, 90, 134, 190,
202,324,342n57

Silbergeld, jerome, 155, 355n30
Single Branch Hall -tt1it (Yizhi Tang)

(Shaoxing), 248
Single Branch Pavilion -ttllf1 (Nanjing),

97,98-9,99.246,247,248.257,319.
326,32.7,346°56

Shitao's poems 00 moving into, 97, 98-9,
143,318,326,348mo9

Slender Ridge lli'~ (Jiaogxi), 65, 66-7, 67,
73

Slender West Lake ~l!Ym.I (Shall Xi Hu),
see Baozhang Lake

Song Cao *If, 202
Song Luo*~(1634-1713),160,181
Song Xu *m (I523-1602?), 280
Song Yingxing *Jfm.£ (1587-?), 369nI°4
Songgotu ~Mill (d. I703?), 58
Songjiang :t'tiI. (Jiangsu), 53,74, 89, 239,

363n25, 365n4, 366034
painting in, 20, 202, 365n91, 366n34
Shitao's visits to, 94, 201, 324, 325

Songs of Chu, The 'HI (Chuci), 88, 89,
89-90, 182., 353n96

South Garden mlm (Yangzhou), 200
South Lake if.ijM (Xuancheng),345n42
South Pond m~ (Yangzhou), 286
Southern Ming mlJJ.l, 61, 67, 71, 72, 84.

88,89,95; see also 51:resistance,
loyalist



Spence, Jonathan, 6
Spring River Poetry Society ftrr.~1±, 102,

II3, 148, 149, IF, 327, 328, 356032
Square Mountain 1JJ1J (Nanjing}, 141
Stone Dragon Pool 1tDiil!!. (Nanjing), 141
Story of the Stone, The 1tMite. (Shitou ji),

358nI01
Strassberg, Richard, 209, 274, 346n50,

353n87
Struve, Lynn, 65, 338022
Su Pi .Im (Su Yimen), PI. 5, 5°,51, 52-3,

133,168,169,316,335,336,
3580112; see also SAl: Journey to
Mount Huang

Su Shi 1i:~ (1°37-1101),72,183,186,
187,245,246,254,292,294,3°6,
308,309

poetry (trans.), 306
Su WeiHe ~~?!~,34I080
Su Yimen ~~ r~,see Su Pi
Suiyuan MImi, 327, 36m2
Suo Zaifeng ~:fE.!I (1644-89),148,

353n87
Suo Zhiwei ~tt.jl (1620-87), 205-6,

343n69
Sun Zhuo ~-W, 348-90109
Sun Zoogyi ~*.(1612~83), 3F077
Sunrise Pavilioo nt.:¥ (Guangzhou), 71, 71
Surra Preservation Hall ~~~ (Huacang

Auxiliary Monastery), 338n 35
Suzhou ff-ffl (Jiangsu), 46, 54, 74, 170,

191, 339n17
painters and painting in
Ming, 20, 53-4, lIO, 187, 205
early Qing, 43, 124, 134, 161, 202,
34104

Shitao's visits to, 91, 201,324,326,
346047

Taibai Pavilion ::t:atl" (Taibai Ci), 310-12,
3LI

Taicaog *it (Jiangsu), 36, 230
Taihu ::t.W3 (Anhui), 161, 357n71
Taiping Monastery ::t:.lf-~(Shexian), 146,

325
Taiping yulan :k'F1lII'I(, 345n43
Taizhou ~1I'1 School, 279
Taizong, Song emperor *::t:* (r. 976-84),

46
Tan Yuanchuo ~j(;lf (1586-1631),244
Taodu l!l1t (Shexiao), 48, 350028
Taog He t§}%;, 36onI3
Tang Hezheng illlillW: (1537-1619),

3690104
Taog Yansheog ifl~1:. (1616-92), 242,

345044
Taog Yin p,gj; (1470-1523),2°5,363036
Taog Zuming JlHi-n (b. 1601), 161, 20I,

37IOl
Tanji congshu, see Compendium of Writings

from the Sandalwood Table
Tao Ji ~*(1616-99),124, '34
Tao Qian ~lI! (365-427),43,62-3,63,

126,187,188, 229,306,307, 357n76
Tao Wei ~M, 124
Tao Yuanming l'JiIiIl~, see Tao Qian
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Temple of Heaven jCtl! (Beijing), 107
Terrace of the Kings of Yue ~.:E.

(Guaogzhou), 67
Terrace of the Yellow Emperor .fl-._

(Mount Huang), Pl. ~5, 320
Three Gorges =:~(Yaogzi River). 347092
Thunder Pool wtM (Lei Tang) (Yangzhou),

PI.5,51, 52
Tian Lin 1B;;ft;. (1643-1702 or later}, 326,

329, 346n6I, 347089, 353nn97,98,
357062

Tianjin 7i:~ (Zhili), 65, 367n61
Shitao and, 108, 1°9, 148-9, 20I, 254,
327-8,347092, 348-9n109, 367064

Tianning Gate 3C$r~ (Yangzhou), 10
Tianning Monastery k$=i¥' (Yangzhou),

10, I3~ 17,151, 171,329,33°,
338°35,36103

Tianrong jC1[ lineage, 88, 102, 324
Tianrong Monastery 3CJj~ (Zhejiaog),

239, 344n15, 365010, 367077
Tianzhu Guan .7Cf.:lJll (Moum Dadi)J

350nn24,51
Tiger Hill Iff,fi (Suzhou), 54
Toogcheng ;ffIiJJ,qt (Anhui), 54, 202, 341086
Tonglu fljijl!! (Zhejiang), 69
Tu Na 1I&Pl, 108, 235, 327, 348nr05
Tu Qingge III~~.35, 78, 108, 171, 199,

200.327,329,3590135; see also SAl:
Shaobo

Tuhui baojian xuzuan, see Precious Mirror
of Painting: Continued

Tuituo {ijJl, 344018
Tuiweng m~,169, I70, 287, 329, 335,

35 rn 52; see also Cheng Daoguaog

Unnoticed Works of Wilderness History
J!f.t.1!!tt (Yeshi Uluwen), 62

Unofficial History of the Scholars, The
fl1i*"fJl: (Rulin waishi), 371n56

Upper Purity J: Ii\' (Shangqing) School, 168

Veblen, Thorstein, 33901
Verbiesr, Pere Fernaod (1623-88), 365088
Vinograd, Richard, xvi, 218-19, 283, 312,

3490118,350021,36501
on Shitao, 94, 120,123,256,346059,
370016

Visits to the Historical Sites of Jinling
>tllll'l(" I]inling Ian gu), 136

Viswanathan, Gauri, 340n34

Wakeman, Frederic, Jr., 93,364082,
369n122

Wan Shouqi .. am (1603-52),165-6,
358092

Wang Banting ff.4'¥, 35°°52
Wang Cao .I~ (177-217), 229
Waog Chongjie .3:.*i1i, 363027
Wang Daokun 1Ei1!Ei', (1525-93), 207
Wang Faog ffJIfj, I09
WaogFangyu x"1J-¥, 127, 128, 351n52
Wang Fengrong ::EJtI* (d. 1703), 104-5,

106,149,255, 327, 347n88, 34801°5,
371m; see also SAl: Hunting in
Autumn; Landscapes for Wang
Fengrong

Wang Fuzhi ::E;!<Z (1619-9'),279,
364n82,369n122

Wang Gai .3:.~ (active c. 1677-[7°5), 161,
201,208. 2°9, 218, 230, 260; see also
The Mustard-Seed Garden Manual of
Painting

Wang Gen ::E1'l. (1483-1541), 364n50
Wang Guan ffli, 368090
Wang Hongdu ff#t!t, 37101
Wang Hongwen ::E~X, 350nI9; see also

SAl: Paintings and Calligraphies for
Qilao

Waog Hui .3:.. (I632-I717), 161, 203,
204,230,235.348nl00,358092

in Beijing, r05, :107, 201, 327
supervision of Southern Tour paintings,
58,68-9,105,203,327,360nn

Wang ji £iI! (1636-99), '46, 346n50,
363n44

Waog jian .3:.. (1598-1677),23°,256
Wang Jiazhen ff~$, 161, I79
Wang Jie 1E:!Ii' (b. 16)4', '46, 3660I5
WaogJueshi .3:.1i:±, 200, 330, 3580103
WaogJun .:E.~, 167, 202, 363n24, 364045
Wang Maolin tf.~M, 3590122, 36004
Wang Shan ::EtJi (1645-1728), 363n29
Wang Shidan ..:E~:Pt, 3590122, 360n28
Waog Shihong tf.±j!; (r632-1706), 37101
Wang Shimao lE±a, 346n54
Waog Shim in ::ElJiffiN (1592-1680), 36, 230,

358092
Wang Shiqing fftltijlf, 26, 3450n30,J8,

354n6
Wang Shishen 1:E±!l'l (1686-1759), 360n36
Wang Shizhen ::E±iJl: (1634-17II), '7, 48,

168, 176
Wang Shu ..:f1Jj (1636-99),3650100
Wang Shu £il'J (1668-1743),166
Waog Shuxia ..:f~JL 361n6
Wang Sizhi x,\!;I,ra, 340035
Wang Suiyu ff~T, 201
Wang Wei £#11 (699-759), 358n99,

360026
Wang Wei ..:ft1t (1645-1717),37101
Wang Xian ff~, 191, 313; see also SAl:

Beside Yangzi Bridge
Wang Xianzhi ::Eltlz (344-86),250
Waog Xicu ..:f:lm:, 42, 168,172,201,

350018, 353n92, 359n122, 361044
Wang Xizhi .3:.@Z (321-79),25°,362014
Wang Xuechen .3:..~, 1I3, 149, 152,

328
Wang Yangdu 1E1'f1ll' (b. 1647), 201
Wang Yangming .:Elilgij (1472-1529),106,

279
Wang Yi .:Em (276-322),22
Wang Yichen f:EttJJOC, 350n41, 362010,

364n60
Wang Yuaoqi ..:fW:1-~(1642-1715),48,107,

208,2°9,254,3690126
Shitao aod, 105, 106, 201, 203, 256, 327,
3480100

Wang Yun Iii (1652-1735),360012
Wang Zehong £I!l!Sb (1626-1708), 105,

149,235,327,37101; see also SAl:
Shadows of Old Trees

Waog Zhanruo tI.1i;:ff, 361044
Wang Zheng ::E1l'l (1571-1644), 3690I04
Wang Zheng .3:.iE (early Qing), 160
Waog Zhi ..:fit, 105, 327, 350n36
Waog Zhichu ..:E~~, 201
Wang Zhongru ::Ef~lII (1634-98), 168,

171-2, 353n92, 358nno, 3590.I2~,
371nI; see also SAl: Clearing M,st m
Wild Ravines

Wang Ziquan .3:.~ii, 35°023
Wang Zuosu I.~(1602-56),161
Wangcai Tang ~*1it, 357n76
Wanglli Tang ~~1it, see Facing-the-

Verdure Hall
Waoshou Temple 1Jl:J;:~ (Beijing), 107
Watson, James L., 369n127
Wei Suzhou ii 1j!;ll*ltIIIL 358n99
Wei Yan $-fIi (Tang dynasty), 261
Wei Yingwu 1j!;1!1!'\IJi (c. 737-9'), 358099
Wei Zhihuang ~zJlt ('568-<:. 1645),

339n56
Weiqio, 326, 346056
Wen Jia X .. (2501-83), 358n88
Weo Mingshi ;t-n~, 160
Wen Tianxiang x7i:i1' (1236-83),69,

71-2, 342044
Wen Toog xll5J (10181r9-79), 182
Wen Zheogming x-ltgij (1470-1559),21,

205 ) 8
Wendi, Sui emperor 1Ifl:>c'ij'j (r. 590-604, °
Weog Fanggang ~1J~ (1733-1818),

33703
Weoxiong ~JL, 163, 176, 334
West Chamber Romance, The ggJfjjtfC., 292
West Garden ggll (Tianning Mooastery),

10, :13,151
West Island Street WlfH~ (Yangzhou), 9,

311
West Lake ggt4J:I (Hangzhou), 65
Western Garden '[911! (Kaifeog), 194-5
Western paradise, 240, 320
Western Terrace WB: (Zhejiang), 69, 69
White Deer Village silO;M (Shenxi), 61,

63-4
Wilderness Man of Hanbio flllfl A, 93,

93
Wong Gleysteen, Marilyn, xx
Wu ~, region of, 65, 68, 88, 89, 91, 206,

324, 340n25
Wu, Han emperor iliitWi (r. 140-87

B.C.E.), 288 _ _ 18
Wu, Liang emperor ~iit* (r. 502 49),3
Wu, Wei emperor Ui\~3~,see Cao Cao
Wu Ai ~iQ, 354n7, 36107
Wu Bio ~~ (active c. 1568-1626), 20, 21,

280,3390n56,57
Wu Canru ~~3{J], 366-7050
Wu Canxi ~~15', 254, 346n6I, 354n7,

37Inl
Wu Chengli illiJ<Wh (,662-9,),254, 354n7,

37101
Wu Cheogxia ~~Jl, 147, 185,251,254,

261, 353n86, 35407; see also SAl:.
Landscapes for ¥u Daoren; Walking
toward a Mountain Retreat

Wu Chengxun illiJ<llL 354n7
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Wu Daozi 3U1!-=f (c. 689-C· 755), 363n32,
369n8

Wu Erchun ~ ft~, 146, 354°7
Wu family of Xi'nan, 42-3, 45-6, 54, 254,

340043, 354n7
Wu Hong ~*(active c. 1653-79), 356n51
Wu Jiaji ~JUc(1618-84), 62, 152, 326,

343n69,347n74
Wu jixian ~~Jt, 191, 200, 300, 329; see

also SAl: Landscapes and Flowers for
WU [ixian

Wu Li illll!' (1632-1718),36,37
Wu Maoji *N.E=" (1594-1665), ~51, 254
Wu Mountain Pavilion ~J1JJj:- (jiangsu},

II3, II4, 149-5°,328
Wu, Pei-yi, III
WU Qi *~(1619-94),148,327,331,

354n7, 355n21, 3590125, 360033; see
also SAl: Landscape of Mount Heng

Wu Qipeog *0, 193, 210~ ~54n7,
3590125; see also SAl: Mmlature
Landscapes

Wu Qiusheog *tk~, 160
Wu Qizhen ill;ltiil, 356n48
Wu Rongguang illll>J't (1773-1843),

361044
Wu Sangui ~~lt,72, 93, 342n31
Wu Shantao *L1.J1i (1624-1710), 161, 202
Wu Sugoog *.i.":. (1626-99), 201, 325,

353°92,366020,37101
Wu Tuizhai ~~jff, 358n103
Wu Tuog, 96, 343n6
Wu Xiangfeng *~II.,3590129

h . .e sJ.lW 366n20' see also SAl:Wu Yao uat ft-J.:3-l:R, 'h.
Illustrations to Poems by Su S I

Wu Youhe *,)CfD, 355n18, 362021
W Yuqiao ~W;jjt (b. 1679), 42, 45, 254,
u 7n73. see also287 340043,354n7, 35 '
The' Blue-Green Screen of the. Southern
Mountains; Eight Views of XI'nan;
Portrait of Wu Yuqiao

Wu Zhenbo ~.{S,251, 325, 355018,
366n23

patrooage of Shirao
pre-Dadi Tang, 146, 147, 152J 254,
349n12,354n7,356n4~,366n36j
see also Thoughts of X, nan

Dadi Tang period, 190, 354°7
Wu Zhizhen ~Z~ (1640-1717), 166,

358090 8 260Wuchang ID';~ (Hubei), 142, 244,25 ,
Shirao and
departure from, 88, 89, 95, 324,

344n2o
journey south from, 72, 87, 144, 324,

344013
move to, 344nn8,:,86 I 182,201,
paioting teachers ln, 87, 17 ,

344m2
youth in, 25, 86, 87, 142, 144, 203,

168, 31d4'34'!:~tJ'8 (Yangzhou),
Wudang Xmg ong A

35
on
49 h Complete Register ofWudeng quans u, see

the Five Lamps
Wuhu ilIifWJ (Anhui), 326, 370017
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Wujiang *iI (jiangsu], 203
Wujin if;i! {jiangsu}, 54, 161
Wulong Tan ,~Mill(Jiangsu), 353n97
Wuweog .li.~, 347088
Wuzhou mffl (Guaogxi),72

Xian Zhu 5t:lf, 134, 154, 342054, 343n,57,
352072, 3710I; see also SAl: Returning
Home

Xiang River mliI, 72, 86,137,14°,182
Xiang Yin lJitl., 167,313,333,341059,

362017
Xiang Yu ~3P.I (232-202 B.C.E.), 67-8
Xiang Yuanbian lJi5Gtr (1525-96),358088
Xiangshan Monastery m.lL1.J~ (Quanzhou),

86
Xianxia Ling fLiJiR.ijt (Zhejiang), 70, 70,

348n94
Xianzong tUj~,Tang emperor (r. 806-21),

87-8
Xiao Cheo .~ (active c. 1671-97), 10,

13,35,179,194,202,36007,361044
Xiao CUD .~, PI.5,5°,51, 52-4,189,

347n83
Xiao River RlAiiiJ, 182
Xiao Yuocong .~:ftE (1596-1673), 206
Xiao Zhao .tlffi (active c. II3Q-50), 212,

213
Xiao Zipei IFf-11M, J26, 36102
Xiaoliog Mausoleum q:~, see Zhongshan
Xiaota Si IN:1f~(Small Pagoda Temple),

344010
Xiazhen :sua, 1I2, 122
Xie Ao ~Q (1249-95), 69, 71, 342044
Xie Bin ilti~ (h. 1602), 179, 363n23
Xie Lingyun il!;il'l' (385-433),268
Xi'nao m~(Shexiao), 44,45,45,54, J46,

148,153,200,254,325,326,36107
Xin'ao ff~, see Shexian
Xinfan f1i~ (Sichuan). 33, 60-3, 60-1, 190
Xinghua JHt Uiangsu), 132, 161,168,

179, 312, 361044
Xingjiao Temple J!!.~~ (Yangzhou), 313
Xinshu FuqianJ 107
Xiong Minhui ~1I!tV, 356n54 ..
Xiriao Monastery ggX~ (Nan]1ng),97,

104, }26, 327, 328, 349nl
Xizhai;i 1!!llli'lIL 168
Xu Chengjia wt*~, 355n28
Xu Chengxuan 1¥fi¥:.g, 355n28
Xu Chengyuan ii'fiJ<lt (1616-76), 355n28
Xu Daoning mi!. (c. 970-105112), 280
Xu Dun ~tIt (b. 1600),92, 161, 201
Xu Huanling m:-mlt, 340059
Xu Shangweo wtL~, 326, 36102
Xu Soogling m¥~~,162, 163,234,259,

340nn49,367n68
estate of, 116, u8, 121,151-2,259,328
paioting collection of, II6, 121, 151-2,
356n49

see also SAl: Landscape of Mount Huang
Xu Wei MtM (1521-93),20,21, no, 287,

354nl,3590138
Shitao and
illustrations of poems by, 186, I88, 261,
264-5



Spence, Jonathan, 6
Spring River Poetry Society ftrr.~1±, 102,

II3, 148, 149, IF, 327, 328, 356032
Square Mountain 1JJ1J (Nanjing}, 141
Stone Dragon Pool 1tDiil!!. (Nanjing), 141
Story of the Stone, The 1tMite. (Shitou ji),

358nI01
Strassberg, Richard, 209, 274, 346n50,

353n87
Struve, Lynn, 65, 338022
Su Pi .Im (Su Yimen), PI. 5, 5°,51, 52-3,

133,168,169,316,335,336,
3580112; see also SAl: Journey to
Mount Huang

Su Shi 1i:~ (1°37-1101),72,183,186,
187,245,246,254,292,294,3°6,
308,309

poetry (trans.), 306
Su WeiHe ~~?!~,34I080
Su Yimen ~~ r~,see Su Pi
Suiyuan MImi, 327, 36m2
Suo Zaifeng ~:fE.!I (1644-89),148,

353n87
Suo Zhiwei ~tt.jl (1620-87), 205-6,

343n69
Sun Zhuo ~-W, 348-90109
Sun Zoogyi ~*.(1612~83), 3F077
Sunrise Pavilioo nt.:¥ (Guangzhou), 71, 71
Surra Preservation Hall ~~~ (Huacang

Auxiliary Monastery), 338n 35
Suzhou ff-ffl (Jiangsu), 46, 54, 74, 170,

191, 339n17
painters and painting in
Ming, 20, 53-4, lIO, 187, 205
early Qing, 43, 124, 134, 161, 202,
34104

Shitao's visits to, 91, 201,324,326,
346047

Taibai Pavilion ::t:atl" (Taibai Ci), 310-12,
3LI

Taicaog *it (Jiangsu), 36, 230
Taihu ::t.W3 (Anhui), 161, 357n71
Taiping Monastery ::t:.lf-~(Shexian), 146,

325
Taiping yulan :k'F1lII'I(, 345n43
Taizhou ~1I'1 School, 279
Taizong, Song emperor *::t:* (r. 976-84),

46
Tan Yuanchuo ~j(;lf (1586-1631),244
Taodu l!l1t (Shexiao), 48, 350028
Taog He t§}%;, 36onI3
Tang Hezheng illlillW: (1537-1619),

3690104
Taog Yansheog ifl~1:. (1616-92), 242,

345044
Taog Yin p,gj; (1470-1523),2°5,363036
Taog Zuming JlHi-n (b. 1601), 161, 20I,

37IOl
Tanji congshu, see Compendium of Writings

from the Sandalwood Table
Tao Ji ~*(1616-99),124, '34
Tao Qian ~lI! (365-427),43,62-3,63,

126,187,188, 229,306,307, 357n76
Tao Wei ~M, 124
Tao Yuanming l'JiIiIl~, see Tao Qian

NAME AND PLACE INDEX

Temple of Heaven jCtl! (Beijing), 107
Terrace of the Kings of Yue ~.:E.

(Guaogzhou), 67
Terrace of the Yellow Emperor .fl-._

(Mount Huang), Pl. ~5, 320
Three Gorges =:~(Yaogzi River). 347092
Thunder Pool wtM (Lei Tang) (Yangzhou),

PI.5,51, 52
Tian Lin 1B;;ft;. (1643-1702 or later}, 326,

329, 346n6I, 347089, 353nn97,98,
357062

Tianjin 7i:~ (Zhili), 65, 367n61
Shitao and, 108, 1°9, 148-9, 20I, 254,
327-8,347092, 348-9n109, 367064

Tianning Gate 3C$r~ (Yangzhou), 10
Tianning Monastery k$=i¥' (Yangzhou),

10, I3~ 17,151, 171,329,33°,
338°35,36103

Tianrong jC1[ lineage, 88, 102, 324
Tianrong Monastery 3CJj~ (Zhejiaog),

239, 344n15, 365010, 367077
Tianzhu Guan .7Cf.:lJll (Moum Dadi)J

350nn24,51
Tiger Hill Iff,fi (Suzhou), 54
Toogcheng ;ffIiJJ,qt (Anhui), 54, 202, 341086
Tonglu fljijl!! (Zhejiang), 69
Tu Na 1I&Pl, 108, 235, 327, 348nr05
Tu Qingge III~~.35, 78, 108, 171, 199,

200.327,329,3590135; see also SAl:
Shaobo

Tuhui baojian xuzuan, see Precious Mirror
of Painting: Continued

Tuituo {ijJl, 344018
Tuiweng m~,169, I70, 287, 329, 335,

35 rn 52; see also Cheng Daoguaog

Unnoticed Works of Wilderness History
J!f.t.1!!tt (Yeshi Uluwen), 62

Unofficial History of the Scholars, The
fl1i*"fJl: (Rulin waishi), 371n56

Upper Purity J: Ii\' (Shangqing) School, 168

Veblen, Thorstein, 33901
Verbiesr, Pere Fernaod (1623-88), 365088
Vinograd, Richard, xvi, 218-19, 283, 312,

3490118,350021,36501
on Shitao, 94, 120,123,256,346059,
370016

Visits to the Historical Sites of Jinling
>tllll'l(" I]inling Ian gu), 136

Viswanathan, Gauri, 340n34

Wakeman, Frederic, Jr., 93,364082,
369n122

Wan Shouqi .. am (1603-52),165-6,
358092

Wang Banting ff.4'¥, 35°°52
Wang Cao .I~ (177-217), 229
Waog Chongjie .3:.*i1i, 363027
Wang Daokun 1Ei1!Ei', (1525-93), 207
Wang Faog ffJIfj, I09
WaogFangyu x"1J-¥, 127, 128, 351n52
Wang Fengrong ::EJtI* (d. 1703), 104-5,

106,149,255, 327, 347n88, 34801°5,
371m; see also SAl: Hunting in
Autumn; Landscapes for Wang
Fengrong

Wang Fuzhi ::E;!<Z (1619-9'),279,
364n82,369n122

Wang Gai .3:.~ (active c. 1677-[7°5), 161,
201,208. 2°9, 218, 230, 260; see also
The Mustard-Seed Garden Manual of
Painting

Wang Gen ::E1'l. (1483-1541), 364n50
Wang Guan ffli, 368090
Wang Hongdu ff#t!t, 37101
Wang Hongwen ::E~X, 350nI9; see also

SAl: Paintings and Calligraphies for
Qilao

Waog Hui .3:.. (I632-I717), 161, 203,
204,230,235.348nl00,358092

in Beijing, r05, :107, 201, 327
supervision of Southern Tour paintings,
58,68-9,105,203,327,360nn

Wang ji £iI! (1636-99), '46, 346n50,
363n44

Waog jian .3:.. (1598-1677),23°,256
Wang Jiazhen ff~$, 161, I79
Wang Jie 1E:!Ii' (b. 16)4', '46, 3660I5
WaogJueshi .3:.1i:±, 200, 330, 3580103
WaogJun .:E.~, 167, 202, 363n24, 364045
Wang Maolin tf.~M, 3590122, 36004
Wang Shan ::EtJi (1645-1728), 363n29
Wang Shidan ..:E~:Pt, 3590122, 360n28
Waog Shihong tf.±j!; (r632-1706), 37101
Wang Shimao lE±a, 346n54
Waog Shim in ::ElJiffiN (1592-1680), 36, 230,

358092
Wang Shiqing fftltijlf, 26, 3450n30,J8,

354n6
Wang Shishen 1:E±!l'l (1686-1759), 360n36
Wang Shizhen ::E±iJl: (1634-17II), '7, 48,

168, 176
Wang Shu ..:f1Jj (1636-99),3650100
Wang Shu £il'J (1668-1743),166
Waog Shuxia ..:f~JL 361n6
Wang Sizhi x,\!;I,ra, 340035
Wang Suiyu ff~T, 201
Wang Wei £#11 (699-759), 358n99,

360026
Wang Wei ..:ft1t (1645-1717),37101
Wang Xian ff~, 191, 313; see also SAl:

Beside Yangzi Bridge
Wang Xianzhi ::Eltlz (344-86),250
Waog Xicu ..:f:lm:, 42, 168,172,201,

350018, 353n92, 359n122, 361044
Wang Xizhi .3:.@Z (321-79),25°,362014
Wang Xuechen .3:..~, 1I3, 149, 152,

328
Wang Yangdu 1E1'f1ll' (b. 1647), 201
Wang Yangming .:Elilgij (1472-1529),106,

279
Wang Yi .:Em (276-322),22
Wang Yichen f:EttJJOC, 350n41, 362010,

364n60
Wang Yuaoqi ..:fW:1-~(1642-1715),48,107,

208,2°9,254,3690126
Shitao aod, 105, 106, 201, 203, 256, 327,
3480100

Wang Yun Iii (1652-1735),360012
Wang Zehong £I!l!Sb (1626-1708), 105,

149,235,327,37101; see also SAl:
Shadows of Old Trees

Waog Zhanruo tI.1i;:ff, 361044
Wang Zheng ::E1l'l (1571-1644), 3690I04
Wang Zheng .3:.iE (early Qing), 160
Waog Zhi ..:fit, 105, 327, 350n36
Waog Zhichu ..:E~~, 201
Wang Zhongru ::Ef~lII (1634-98), 168,

171-2, 353n92, 358nno, 3590.I2~,
371nI; see also SAl: Clearing M,st m
Wild Ravines

Wang Ziquan .3:.~ii, 35°023
Wang Zuosu I.~(1602-56),161
Wangcai Tang ~*1it, 357n76
Wanglli Tang ~~1it, see Facing-the-

Verdure Hall
Waoshou Temple 1Jl:J;:~ (Beijing), 107
Watson, James L., 369n127
Wei Suzhou ii 1j!;ll*ltIIIL 358n99
Wei Yan $-fIi (Tang dynasty), 261
Wei Yingwu 1j!;1!1!'\IJi (c. 737-9'), 358099
Wei Zhihuang ~zJlt ('568-<:. 1645),

339n56
Weiqio, 326, 346056
Wen Jia X .. (2501-83), 358n88
Weo Mingshi ;t-n~, 160
Wen Tianxiang x7i:i1' (1236-83),69,

71-2, 342044
Wen Toog xll5J (10181r9-79), 182
Wen Zheogming x-ltgij (1470-1559),21,

205 ) 8
Wendi, Sui emperor 1Ifl:>c'ij'j (r. 590-604, °
Weog Fanggang ~1J~ (1733-1818),

33703
Weoxiong ~JL, 163, 176, 334
West Chamber Romance, The ggJfjjtfC., 292
West Garden ggll (Tianning Mooastery),

10, :13,151
West Island Street WlfH~ (Yangzhou), 9,

311
West Lake ggt4J:I (Hangzhou), 65
Western Garden '[911! (Kaifeog), 194-5
Western paradise, 240, 320
Western Terrace WB: (Zhejiang), 69, 69
White Deer Village silO;M (Shenxi), 61,

63-4
Wilderness Man of Hanbio flllfl A, 93,

93
Wong Gleysteen, Marilyn, xx
Wu ~, region of, 65, 68, 88, 89, 91, 206,

324, 340n25
Wu, Han emperor iliitWi (r. 140-87

B.C.E.), 288 _ _ 18
Wu, Liang emperor ~iit* (r. 502 49),3
Wu, Wei emperor Ui\~3~,see Cao Cao
Wu Ai ~iQ, 354n7, 36107
Wu Bio ~~ (active c. 1568-1626), 20, 21,

280,3390n56,57
Wu Canru ~~3{J], 366-7050
Wu Canxi ~~15', 254, 346n6I, 354n7,

37Inl
Wu Chengli illiJ<Wh (,662-9,),254, 354n7,

37101
Wu Cheogxia ~~Jl, 147, 185,251,254,

261, 353n86, 35407; see also SAl:.
Landscapes for ¥u Daoren; Walking
toward a Mountain Retreat

Wu Chengxun illiJ<llL 354n7

NAME AND PLACE INDEX

Wu Daozi 3U1!-=f (c. 689-C· 755), 363n32,
369n8

Wu Erchun ~ ft~, 146, 354°7
Wu family of Xi'nan, 42-3, 45-6, 54, 254,

340043, 354n7
Wu Hong ~*(active c. 1653-79), 356n51
Wu Jiaji ~JUc(1618-84), 62, 152, 326,

343n69,347n74
Wu jixian ~~Jt, 191, 200, 300, 329; see

also SAl: Landscapes and Flowers for
WU [ixian

Wu Li illll!' (1632-1718),36,37
Wu Maoji *N.E=" (1594-1665), ~51, 254
Wu Mountain Pavilion ~J1JJj:- (jiangsu},

II3, II4, 149-5°,328
Wu, Pei-yi, III
WU Qi *~(1619-94),148,327,331,

354n7, 355n21, 3590125, 360033; see
also SAl: Landscape of Mount Heng

Wu Qipeog *0, 193, 210~ ~54n7,
3590125; see also SAl: Mmlature
Landscapes

Wu Qiusheog *tk~, 160
Wu Qizhen ill;ltiil, 356n48
Wu Rongguang illll>J't (1773-1843),

361044
Wu Sangui ~~lt,72, 93, 342n31
Wu Shantao *L1.J1i (1624-1710), 161, 202
Wu Sugoog *.i.":. (1626-99), 201, 325,

353°92,366020,37101
Wu Tuizhai ~~jff, 358n103
Wu Tuog, 96, 343n6
Wu Xiangfeng *~II.,3590129

h . .e sJ.lW 366n20' see also SAl:Wu Yao uat ft-J.:3-l:R, 'h.
Illustrations to Poems by Su S I

Wu Youhe *,)CfD, 355n18, 362021
W Yuqiao ~W;jjt (b. 1679), 42, 45, 254,
u 7n73. see also287 340043,354n7, 35 '
The' Blue-Green Screen of the. Southern
Mountains; Eight Views of XI'nan;
Portrait of Wu Yuqiao

Wu Zhenbo ~.{S,251, 325, 355018,
366n23

patrooage of Shirao
pre-Dadi Tang, 146, 147, 152J 254,
349n12,354n7,356n4~,366n36j
see also Thoughts of X, nan

Dadi Tang period, 190, 354°7
Wu Zhizhen ~Z~ (1640-1717), 166,

358090 8 260Wuchang ID';~ (Hubei), 142, 244,25 ,
Shirao and
departure from, 88, 89, 95, 324,

344n2o
journey south from, 72, 87, 144, 324,

344013
move to, 344nn8,:,86 I 182,201,
paioting teachers ln, 87, 17 ,

344m2
youth in, 25, 86, 87, 142, 144, 203,

168, 31d4'34'!:~tJ'8 (Yangzhou),
Wudang Xmg ong A

35
on
49 h Complete Register ofWudeng quans u, see

the Five Lamps
Wuhu ilIifWJ (Anhui), 326, 370017

399

Wujiang *iI (jiangsu], 203
Wujin if;i! {jiangsu}, 54, 161
Wulong Tan ,~Mill(Jiangsu), 353n97
Wuweog .li.~, 347088
Wuzhou mffl (Guaogxi),72

Xian Zhu 5t:lf, 134, 154, 342054, 343n,57,
352072, 3710I; see also SAl: Returning
Home

Xiang River mliI, 72, 86,137,14°,182
Xiang Yin lJitl., 167,313,333,341059,

362017
Xiang Yu ~3P.I (232-202 B.C.E.), 67-8
Xiang Yuanbian lJi5Gtr (1525-96),358088
Xiangshan Monastery m.lL1.J~ (Quanzhou),

86
Xianxia Ling fLiJiR.ijt (Zhejiang), 70, 70,

348n94
Xianzong tUj~,Tang emperor (r. 806-21),

87-8
Xiao Cheo .~ (active c. 1671-97), 10,

13,35,179,194,202,36007,361044
Xiao CUD .~, PI.5,5°,51, 52-4,189,

347n83
Xiao River RlAiiiJ, 182
Xiao Yuocong .~:ftE (1596-1673), 206
Xiao Zhao .tlffi (active c. II3Q-50), 212,

213
Xiao Zipei IFf-11M, J26, 36102
Xiaoliog Mausoleum q:~, see Zhongshan
Xiaota Si IN:1f~(Small Pagoda Temple),

344010
Xiazhen :sua, 1I2, 122
Xie Ao ~Q (1249-95), 69, 71, 342044
Xie Bin ilti~ (h. 1602), 179, 363n23
Xie Lingyun il!;il'l' (385-433),268
Xi'nao m~(Shexiao), 44,45,45,54, J46,

148,153,200,254,325,326,36107
Xin'ao ff~, see Shexian
Xinfan f1i~ (Sichuan). 33, 60-3, 60-1, 190
Xinghua JHt Uiangsu), 132, 161,168,

179, 312, 361044
Xingjiao Temple J!!.~~ (Yangzhou), 313
Xinshu FuqianJ 107
Xiong Minhui ~1I!tV, 356n54 ..
Xiriao Monastery ggX~ (Nan]1ng),97,

104, }26, 327, 328, 349nl
Xizhai;i 1!!llli'lIL 168
Xu Chengjia wt*~, 355n28
Xu Chengxuan 1¥fi¥:.g, 355n28
Xu Chengyuan ii'fiJ<lt (1616-76), 355n28
Xu Daoning mi!. (c. 970-105112), 280
Xu Dun ~tIt (b. 1600),92, 161, 201
Xu Huanling m:-mlt, 340059
Xu Shangweo wtL~, 326, 36102
Xu Soogling m¥~~,162, 163,234,259,

340nn49,367n68
estate of, 116, u8, 121,151-2,259,328
paioting collection of, II6, 121, 151-2,
356n49

see also SAl: Landscape of Mount Huang
Xu Wei MtM (1521-93),20,21, no, 287,

354nl,3590138
Shitao and
illustrations of poems by, 186, I88, 261,
264-5



400

influenced by, r6, 1:46-7, 171,2°4,210,

2.19, 248, 250,251:-3, 260-1, 268,
280

Xu XU m:M, 342045
Xuancheng gJJa. (Anhui), 92, 94-5, 108,

341086,366020,37°017
artists in and from, 92, 161, 201, 202,

203. 206

officials in, 98, 34911I09
public buildings, constructed/restored, 92,

93-4,95,97,325
Shitao and

early years in, 25. 91-4, 95. 97, 146,
2°3,241,244.245,246,257,324-5,
325,325-6,326,3650100

friends in, 92, 98,100,102,201,245,
325,328,329,346°55,34901°9

students in, 173, 199
Xuande :g:. emperor (Zhu Zhanji, r.

1426-35),126
Xuanpu 1f MIl(Daoist paradise), 214
Xuanye Kif (1654-1722), see Kangxi

emperor
Xue'an ~Jl, 89, 90, 93
Xuege wfI, see Bada Shamen
Xuegong~0, II]

Xuerian ~EB, 327, 36m2
Xuezhuang ~m: (d. 1718), 1°7. 108, 241,

362020,370m,8

Yaimen Ei§:r~ (Guangdong), 68, 72
Yan Guaog f4tJ't (1St C. C.E.), 69
Yan Yi M'~, 179
Yan Yue Mffi, 179, 194
Yan Zhenqing tIl,UP (709-85), 87, 300
Yan'an j$:l( (Shenxi), 34In59, 358n99
Yancheog m~(Jiaogsu), 362m8
Yang Chen bin .m~m,345n30
Yang Shiji m±-a, 342n022,24
Yang Su lJa~ (d. 606),80
Yang Waoli fJOfJt'£ (II 27-1 206), r86, 187
Yang Zhimao m~~,363n27
Yang Zhongna mlfl~,330, 37101
Yangdi, Sui emperor ~niHfI (r. 604-18), 14,

52,75, 80, 81
Yangzhou ffltltl

art market io, 178, 179, 184, 186, 193,
195,337n3

artists visiting, 151, 179, 201, 202
city of, xvi, 2, 3,4,6,7-10,12-15,17-

19,25,31,35,45,47,5°,52,148,
160,186,288,29°,295,313,
3380041,46,48,370n32
depicted (illus.), PI. 5. Map I, 7. 8-11.

12,13,14,15.16.51.68.76.1°4-5.
I92

commerce and trade in, 4, 8, 18, 34, 191,
234. 290

craft specialties of, 12, 20
examinations in, 6, 340-rn59
Fei family and, 60, 62-3
gentry, of area, 132, 161, 168, 235,

}4rn62
graves, of area, 3, 13, 17, 52, 63
history of, 14, 52, 64, 79-80,81,142,

338n24

NAME AND PLACE INDEX

Huang You and, 64, 66, 68, 72, 74
Kangxi's visits to, see Kangxi emperor,

visits to Yangzhou
loyalism in, xvi, 12-13, 17, 52, 84, 102,

116,124,126,134, 168, JI2, 347n74,
356n32.

massacre in (1645), 17.21,74
merchants in, 13, 18, 19, 34, 45, 47, 54,

91,113,133,146,148,160,161,163,
167, 232,234, 338044,350n52,
3690109; see also Huizhou (Anhui),
merchant connections to Yangzhou

officials in, g r, 161, 169, 171; see also
Cao Yin, Kong Shangren; Wang
Shizhen; Zhou Lianggong

painting in, 20,22,30,31,34,43,123,
160-1,165,166, 169, 170, 177, 178,
179,184, r86. 189, 194, 195, 201,
202,204,206,357086,3590nI22,129,
36009,36In47, 365n91

poets in and from, see Fei Mi; Fei
Xihuang; Huang You; Li Guosong;
Li Lin; Min Hua; Spring River Poetry
Society; Sun Zhiwei; Wu Ai; Xiao Cuo;
Zhuo Erkan

private homes (illus.), PI. 13, 13, 68, 174,
237; see also Dadi Tang

public buildings, constructed/restored, 14,
18,74,75

publishing in, 154, 168, 176, 337nI3,
358n99; see also Compendium of
Literature from the Sandalwood Table;
Compendium of Literature of the
Present Age; The Complete Poetry of
the Tang; Shadows of Secret Dreams;
Zhang Chao

Shitao aod
patronage, see Shitao, artist-patlan

relationships, in Yangzhou area
sojourns in: (1687-9 ) 102-4, 141, 148,

199, 20r, 327, 338n21; (1693-6)
112,113, II~ 126, 149, 151, 152,
154,256,306,312,328,338n21;
(1697-17°7), I, 2,23,27,83,123,
135,137,138,141,144,161,173,
238,328,329,33°

students in, 200
visits to: (1673 ) 92,146,201,325;

(1676),94,201,325
see also Dadi Tang

social mores in, 12-13, 47-8, 170, 286,
,87,3)8n37

taste in, 179, 186, 194
tourist sites in, see Baocheng; Baozhang

Lake; Pingshan Tang; Red Bridge; Shu
Ridge; Yangzi Bridge; Zhuxi Ting

see also 51: calligraphy, early Qing, in
Yangzhou; loyalism, Ming, in Yang-
zhou; Bada Shamen, Yangzhou-area
patrons of; Gong Xian, Yangzhou-area
patrons of

Yangzhou huafang iu, see Chronicle of the
Painted Boats of Yangzhou

Yangzi Bridge lI-=f;fl (Yangzhou), 191, 192
Yangzi region, middle-, 201
Yang,i Rive' lJai'lJ: I",m, 18, 83, 86,

112,186,195,314,316,327,
36007

Shirao's depictions of, 102, 103, II6, 116.
121,123,141,142,300.310,311

Yao Man M~§!, II3, 148, 149, 152, 234,
312,327

see also SAl: Landscapes for Yao Man;
Loquats, Bamboo-root, and Melon;
Plum Blossoms (undated); The Terrace
of the Yellow Emperor

Yao Ruoyi M~35Jl, 347n73, 362n20
Yao Tinglin M~j!il!(d. 1697 or later), 47-8
Ye Mengzhu ~g~, 47-8, 339015
Ye Rong 1l€~, 161, 357072
Ye Xin ~Jtli:, 357072
Yellow Crane Tower 1t~~ (Huanghe

Lou) (Wuchang), 89, 142, 142, 144,
258, 268

Yellow Emperor .Wi', 41, 79, 261, 368n90
Yellow River .iii!, 77, 83, 102, 266,267,

327
Yellow Sea it#lt (Huanghai), see Mount

Huang
Yetian !!!JIB (Yangzhou), 60, 63
Yi Bingshou #f=*f'll (1754-1815),34In72
Yi Yin #''1' (Shang dynasty), 43
Yinreng Jillil (I674-I725), 58,74,75,

80-1
Yioshan :Will (tea), 148, 287
Yinzhen JfilM (1678-1735), see Yongzheng

emperor
Ying Yuao, see Garden of Shadows aod

Reflections
Yingzhou l'd+tl (Daoist paradise), 214
Yiweng !J)\~, 169, 170, 336
Yixing 1l~ (Jiangsu), PI. 8. 20, 259,262-5
Yizheng .f( (Jiangsu), 10, 134

Shitao and
patrons in, see Luo Qingshan; Wu

Jixian; Xiang Yin; Xu Songlin; Zheng
Zhaoxin

sojourns in and visits to, 52, u6, u8,
120,151,152,154,155,162,201,
328,333

Yizhi -~, 202,241,370028
Yizhi Ge, see Single Branch Pavilion
Yolo ffi~ (Prince An, d. 1689), 105, 112,

328, 348n95
Yongan ?j(:l( (Fujian),70-1
Yongle ?j(~ emperor, 90, 3490109
Yongshou Monastery ?j(.~ (Lishui), 326,

346n054,55
Yongzheng ~iE emperor (Yiozhen, r.

1723-36),58
Yongzhou j1<.1+1 (Hunan), 72, 86, 86
You Meng fljfii:, 284, 285
You Tong Jt1lPl (1618-17°4), 365n86
Youmeng ying, see Shadows of Secret

Dreams
Yousheng ;tiiJ!L 331
Yousheng Ge titJfM, II3, 149
Yu Binshuo ~jif:m:, 136-7
Yu Yuan It.m, 179
Yu Zhiding ~Z}j8Fl (1647--e. 1716), 48,

179, 189, 341n66, 360n29
Yuan, king of Chu ~5t.3:., 132

Yuan Dun JOIl:1 (b. '7'2), 352n83
Yuan Hongdao :it*ut (1568-1610), 287
Yuan Huang :w:it, 278
Yuan Jiang :&U (active late r rrb-early

r Sth C), xvi, 30, 164, 195, 361n47,
365n91

flowers, fruit, and vegetables, 194
landscape paintings of, xvi, 30, 164, 195

with mansions, 12, I4, 80, 179
of transportation, 31, 34,35, 179,

186
Yuan Mei ;\itt\( (I7I6-98), 34on)9
Yuan Qixu ;\it!1l:1@ (d. 1696), 286-7
Yuan Yao ~Ml, 179
Yuan Zhongjiang jt9=tU, see Yuan Qixu
Yuanci shan ji 5t-l'X-I1J$ (From One Moun-

tain to the Next), 342n40
Yuanliang Hetao JijU3t~1i,see Hetao
Yuantong Monastery OOW-# (Wuchang),

344nl8
Yuanzhi Poyu 5Gtv~,~" see Poyu
Yue ~ (Guangdong and Guangxi), region

of, 64, 68, 86, IIO, 131, 137
Yue ~ (Zhejiang), region of, 65, 68,91,

340n25, 344n2o
Yueduan ffi~ (1671-17°4),176,33°,

362nII,371nl
Shitao's contact with

in Beijing, 105, 327, 328, 348095
post-Beijing, 112, 129, 136, 353n99
see also SAl: Orchids (Tianjin)

Yueyang Tower ffi~~ (Lake Dongtiog),
87,139, 140,140,258,312, 3.I3.
324

Yuhang ~tt (Zhejiang), 3, u9, 258-9
Yujun .:y1f, 170, 336
Yulin Tongx:iu 3i-;ft\'fm~ (1614-75),102,

327
Yuling Il\foi (Zhejiang), 65
Yun Shouping 1!I!1ll'F (1633-90), I6I, 2)0,

365n99
Yunmeng :I:~, 324
Yunnan ~i¥i, 61, 324, 34104, 342n45

Huang You in, 64, 74, 341n59, 342n4°
painting in, 202, 129

Zengcheng m~ (Guaogdoog),71
Zha Shenxing 'l!i'tIH'i (I650-I727),

34In86
Zha Shibiao 'l!i'±1lI (1615-98), I84, 206,

329, 355n21,359nI19, 371nl
copies by, 193, 361n44
Li Yin's stylistic allusions to, 361n47
as literati professional, 54, 170, 177,

357077, 359noI22,I38, 360029,
361n47

Shitao and, II4, 184, 202, 204
Song Luo and, 356n51, 181
students of, 160-1, 359n129
stylistic allusions to Huang Gongwang,

184,184.202.
theory of painting, 361049

Zhang Cao '*t¥i: (Tang dynasty), 22
Zhang Chao lIli1ll (b. I650), 304

and painting, 8r, 128, 351n66, 3590138,
363n26

NAME AND PLACE INDEX

as publisher and editor, xvi, 4, 81, 82,
256,304,331,343n59,355n26,
357n74, 363023, 364n56

as writer, 82, 161, 220-1, 256, 286-7,
348096, 356n45,371nl

Zhang Chong lIl~!, '79, 357n59
Zhang Chunxiu ~fm!1tf, 151, 328, 35°015;

see also SAl:Lake Chao
Zhang Daoling *lltfoi (d. 156), 259
Zhang Daqian *:lcT (1899-1983),

340047,351-2n69,360nl,367n72
Zhang Feng ~.oo. (?-1662), 340nB
Zhang Geng '*J3lt (1685-1760), xxi,

337n3
Zhang Gong ~j(, 179
Zhang Hong *;e (1577-<· 1652), 21,

342n45
Zhang jingjie *::J-1!1J, 149-50, 170, 189,

259,2.61,328, 3390I4, 350n26,
365099; see also SAl: Landscape in the
Style of Ni Zan and Huang Gongwang;
Landscapes (undated, Shanghai
Museum)

Zhang Lin ~~ (d. 1713), 108, 109,122.,
149, J28

Zhang Pengge *_lllI (1649-1725),79
Zhang Qi *~(1575-1648), 359n122
Zhang Qian *i!! (2d C. B.C.E.), 257
Zhang Rong *1lI (443-97),25°
Zhang Shijie *ili:iltt, 72
Zhang Xianzhong 5R.llt~, (1606-47),61-2
Zhang, Xudong, xvii
Zhang Xuo *ffiJ, 160, 357n86

Zhang Yi *'fa, 347074
Zhang Zhu *11 (J659-1704), 108, J22,

149,254-5, J28, 349n1I5, 371nI
poetry (trans.), 254-5, 367053

Zhang Zhupo *rt!ll:,I6I
Zhang Zong *~(1619-94),97,136,326,

347n74
Zhao Cheng mm (1581-1654 or later),

363n2o .
Zhao Ji 1til1:a (1082-II35), see HUizong
Zhao Lingraog ;tiI4-~ (active 1088-1I00),

126 8
Zhao Lun ;Ill;iJ (1636-95), 98~ 147, '47-.'

I SAl- Fishing In a Mountam326; see a so .
Stream

Zhao Mengfu Itil~~m(I2.54-1322), 95,
IOI,126,128,131-2,210,340n30,

352079,35406 6
Zhao Mengjian m~~(II99-U 7 or

before), 89, 126, 127, 132
Zhao Zisi Jte.-=fi11Y (d. n01), I4~, 326
Zhaodai congshu, see CompendIum of

Writings of the Present Age

h I, unlitl;»;;. Emperor (r. 221-3), 101Z ao Ie "J:lfo,'PP ,
Zhaozhou Itilffl (Yunnan), 64, 34~n59
Zhejiang mrrr, 96,325, 340n59, 342n44,

344n12, 348n94,350n36, 362n17
. d f I65 202 206artists 10 an rom, ' ,

Buddhist community in, 32-4, 344nI5,

367n77 " 268
Daoist commumty 10, 119,
Huang You's travels in, B, 65, 67, 68,

69-70

40I

loyalism in, II9, 120, 342.n44
Shitao's travels in, 91, 324, 344020

Zheng Da l\Ill!, 62
Zheng Hushan ~~l1J, 98, 100, 326,

3451146, 349n9, 36m2
Zheng Min ~Bt (16B-83), 202, 35°1152,

361044
Zheng Sixiao "H!.', I4f (1141-13 I8), 182
Zheng Xiao lliI~, 90
Zheng Xie lliI!&' (I693-1765), 2, 165-6,

337n),357n86
Zheng Yu l\IlCE(1298-1358), 356n39
Zheng Yuanxun ~5tWJ (1598-1645),186,

187. 361042
Zheng Zhaoxin JI)¥~, 154, 234, 32.8
Zheng Zhong lliI!ll. )57n59
Zheng Zhuolu lliIl1Iill, 362nIO
Zhenhuai Gate §AilErlj (Yangzhcu), 8, LO,

338n25
Zhenjiang iltrr (jiangsul, 93, 149, 179
Zhenzhou J1,1tI, see Yizheng
Zheweng 11T~~, 162-3, 167, 170, 189, 287,

J29, 332-3
Zhida 'Ill!, 345n47
Zhili 1U)t, 9~, 202, 206, 354n3
Zhiqi ~1E, 347n78
Zhongchang Tong 1Ijl-Rt.;ft. (179-219), 63
Zhong Lang fl~r~,96, 326, 343n6
Zhongshan illlJ (Nanjing), 52, 97, no,

I2I, 135-6, 183, 347n73
Zhoogyuan t:p JJji. , 202.
Zhou Baoye mJ%!:q~, 162, 332
Zhou Duoyi Jr,JlUJi (1017-1073), 183,

I83
Zhou Fang Ji'il1PJ (c. 730-<:· 800), 176, J93
ZhouJing J6Jg, 147, 326, 346n61,

347078; see also SAl: Pai~tings a"d
Calligraphies for Zholl jmg

Zhou Lianggoog J81~I (1612-72), 160,

180-1,205,3561155,363041.; see also
Notes all Viewiltg Pai,rt;llgs

Zhou Sisheng J~JWi!&, 37m1
Zhu Di *t.1t (136°-I414), see Yongle

emperor
Zhu Guan *ti. (1646-I715 or later), 3430

75
Zhu Hengjia *-.;p,;, 71, 71, 84, 323, J26,

343n6
Zhu Hengzhen *,.:f-,fi, 34306
Zhu Kanpu *Jllt$, I32,134, 352n73
Zhu Kanzhu *liit, 352073
Zhu Xi *_ (II3O-uoo), 106
Zhu Xinglong *JIl!t (d. I344), 1)1,

137
Zhu Yizun *att: (1629-17°9), 356n36
Zhu Yuanzhaog *:rr.ll (1328-98), see

Hongwu emperot
Zhu Yujiao *$iJ!, see Longwu emperor
Zhu Yuoming *ftBj] (1461-] 527), 43, 44.

45,45-6,187,189, r89
Zhu Yunwen *fttt (1377-I402), see

Jianwen emperor
Zhu Zaiyu *.xm (1536-I6u), 3690104
Zhu Zanyi *ttift, IJ!, 137
Zhu Zhanji *lffi1! (1399-1435), see

Xuande emperor
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influenced by, r6, 1:46-7, 171,2°4,210,

2.19, 248, 250,251:-3, 260-1, 268,
280

Xu XU m:M, 342045
Xuancheng gJJa. (Anhui), 92, 94-5, 108,

341086,366020,37°017
artists in and from, 92, 161, 201, 202,

203. 206

officials in, 98, 34911I09
public buildings, constructed/restored, 92,

93-4,95,97,325
Shitao and

early years in, 25. 91-4, 95. 97, 146,
2°3,241,244.245,246,257,324-5,
325,325-6,326,3650100

friends in, 92, 98,100,102,201,245,
325,328,329,346°55,34901°9

students in, 173, 199
Xuande :g:. emperor (Zhu Zhanji, r.

1426-35),126
Xuanpu 1f MIl(Daoist paradise), 214
Xuanye Kif (1654-1722), see Kangxi

emperor
Xue'an ~Jl, 89, 90, 93
Xuege wfI, see Bada Shamen
Xuegong~0, II]

Xuerian ~EB, 327, 36m2
Xuezhuang ~m: (d. 1718), 1°7. 108, 241,

362020,370m,8

Yaimen Ei§:r~ (Guangdong), 68, 72
Yan Guaog f4tJ't (1St C. C.E.), 69
Yan Yi M'~, 179
Yan Yue Mffi, 179, 194
Yan Zhenqing tIl,UP (709-85), 87, 300
Yan'an j$:l( (Shenxi), 34In59, 358n99
Yancheog m~(Jiaogsu), 362m8
Yang Chen bin .m~m,345n30
Yang Shiji m±-a, 342n022,24
Yang Su lJa~ (d. 606),80
Yang Waoli fJOfJt'£ (II 27-1 206), r86, 187
Yang Zhimao m~~,363n27
Yang Zhongna mlfl~,330, 37101
Yangdi, Sui emperor ~niHfI (r. 604-18), 14,

52,75, 80, 81
Yangzhou ffltltl

art market io, 178, 179, 184, 186, 193,
195,337n3

artists visiting, 151, 179, 201, 202
city of, xvi, 2, 3,4,6,7-10,12-15,17-

19,25,31,35,45,47,5°,52,148,
160,186,288,29°,295,313,
3380041,46,48,370n32
depicted (illus.), PI. 5. Map I, 7. 8-11.

12,13,14,15.16.51.68.76.1°4-5.
I92

commerce and trade in, 4, 8, 18, 34, 191,
234. 290

craft specialties of, 12, 20
examinations in, 6, 340-rn59
Fei family and, 60, 62-3
gentry, of area, 132, 161, 168, 235,

}4rn62
graves, of area, 3, 13, 17, 52, 63
history of, 14, 52, 64, 79-80,81,142,

338n24

NAME AND PLACE INDEX

Huang You and, 64, 66, 68, 72, 74
Kangxi's visits to, see Kangxi emperor,

visits to Yangzhou
loyalism in, xvi, 12-13, 17, 52, 84, 102,

116,124,126,134, 168, JI2, 347n74,
356n32.

massacre in (1645), 17.21,74
merchants in, 13, 18, 19, 34, 45, 47, 54,

91,113,133,146,148,160,161,163,
167, 232,234, 338044,350n52,
3690109; see also Huizhou (Anhui),
merchant connections to Yangzhou

officials in, g r, 161, 169, 171; see also
Cao Yin, Kong Shangren; Wang
Shizhen; Zhou Lianggong

painting in, 20,22,30,31,34,43,123,
160-1,165,166, 169, 170, 177, 178,
179,184, r86. 189, 194, 195, 201,
202,204,206,357086,3590nI22,129,
36009,36In47, 365n91

poets in and from, see Fei Mi; Fei
Xihuang; Huang You; Li Guosong;
Li Lin; Min Hua; Spring River Poetry
Society; Sun Zhiwei; Wu Ai; Xiao Cuo;
Zhuo Erkan

private homes (illus.), PI. 13, 13, 68, 174,
237; see also Dadi Tang

public buildings, constructed/restored, 14,
18,74,75

publishing in, 154, 168, 176, 337nI3,
358n99; see also Compendium of
Literature from the Sandalwood Table;
Compendium of Literature of the
Present Age; The Complete Poetry of
the Tang; Shadows of Secret Dreams;
Zhang Chao

Shitao aod
patronage, see Shitao, artist-patlan

relationships, in Yangzhou area
sojourns in: (1687-9 ) 102-4, 141, 148,

199, 20r, 327, 338n21; (1693-6)
112,113, II~ 126, 149, 151, 152,
154,256,306,312,328,338n21;
(1697-17°7), I, 2,23,27,83,123,
135,137,138,141,144,161,173,
238,328,329,33°

students in, 200
visits to: (1673 ) 92,146,201,325;

(1676),94,201,325
see also Dadi Tang

social mores in, 12-13, 47-8, 170, 286,
,87,3)8n37

taste in, 179, 186, 194
tourist sites in, see Baocheng; Baozhang

Lake; Pingshan Tang; Red Bridge; Shu
Ridge; Yangzi Bridge; Zhuxi Ting

see also 51: calligraphy, early Qing, in
Yangzhou; loyalism, Ming, in Yang-
zhou; Bada Shamen, Yangzhou-area
patrons of; Gong Xian, Yangzhou-area
patrons of

Yangzhou huafang iu, see Chronicle of the
Painted Boats of Yangzhou

Yangzi Bridge lI-=f;fl (Yangzhou), 191, 192
Yangzi region, middle-, 201
Yang,i Rive' lJai'lJ: I",m, 18, 83, 86,

112,186,195,314,316,327,
36007

Shirao's depictions of, 102, 103, II6, 116.
121,123,141,142,300.310,311

Yao Man M~§!, II3, 148, 149, 152, 234,
312,327

see also SAl: Landscapes for Yao Man;
Loquats, Bamboo-root, and Melon;
Plum Blossoms (undated); The Terrace
of the Yellow Emperor

Yao Ruoyi M~35Jl, 347n73, 362n20
Yao Tinglin M~j!il!(d. 1697 or later), 47-8
Ye Mengzhu ~g~, 47-8, 339015
Ye Rong 1l€~, 161, 357072
Ye Xin ~Jtli:, 357072
Yellow Crane Tower 1t~~ (Huanghe

Lou) (Wuchang), 89, 142, 142, 144,
258, 268

Yellow Emperor .Wi', 41, 79, 261, 368n90
Yellow River .iii!, 77, 83, 102, 266,267,

327
Yellow Sea it#lt (Huanghai), see Mount

Huang
Yetian !!!JIB (Yangzhou), 60, 63
Yi Bingshou #f=*f'll (1754-1815),34In72
Yi Yin #''1' (Shang dynasty), 43
Yinreng Jillil (I674-I725), 58,74,75,

80-1
Yioshan :Will (tea), 148, 287
Yinzhen JfilM (1678-1735), see Yongzheng

emperor
Ying Yuao, see Garden of Shadows aod

Reflections
Yingzhou l'd+tl (Daoist paradise), 214
Yiweng !J)\~, 169, 170, 336
Yixing 1l~ (Jiangsu), PI. 8. 20, 259,262-5
Yizheng .f( (Jiangsu), 10, 134

Shitao and
patrons in, see Luo Qingshan; Wu

Jixian; Xiang Yin; Xu Songlin; Zheng
Zhaoxin

sojourns in and visits to, 52, u6, u8,
120,151,152,154,155,162,201,
328,333

Yizhi -~, 202,241,370028
Yizhi Ge, see Single Branch Pavilion
Yolo ffi~ (Prince An, d. 1689), 105, 112,

328, 348n95
Yongan ?j(:l( (Fujian),70-1
Yongle ?j(~ emperor, 90, 3490109
Yongshou Monastery ?j(.~ (Lishui), 326,

346n054,55
Yongzheng ~iE emperor (Yiozhen, r.

1723-36),58
Yongzhou j1<.1+1 (Hunan), 72, 86, 86
You Meng fljfii:, 284, 285
You Tong Jt1lPl (1618-17°4), 365n86
Youmeng ying, see Shadows of Secret

Dreams
Yousheng ;tiiJ!L 331
Yousheng Ge titJfM, II3, 149
Yu Binshuo ~jif:m:, 136-7
Yu Yuan It.m, 179
Yu Zhiding ~Z}j8Fl (1647--e. 1716), 48,

179, 189, 341n66, 360n29
Yuan, king of Chu ~5t.3:., 132

Yuan Dun JOIl:1 (b. '7'2), 352n83
Yuan Hongdao :it*ut (1568-1610), 287
Yuan Huang :w:it, 278
Yuan Jiang :&U (active late r rrb-early

r Sth C), xvi, 30, 164, 195, 361n47,
365n91

flowers, fruit, and vegetables, 194
landscape paintings of, xvi, 30, 164, 195

with mansions, 12, I4, 80, 179
of transportation, 31, 34,35, 179,

186
Yuan Mei ;\itt\( (I7I6-98), 34on)9
Yuan Qixu ;\it!1l:1@ (d. 1696), 286-7
Yuan Yao ~Ml, 179
Yuan Zhongjiang jt9=tU, see Yuan Qixu
Yuanci shan ji 5t-l'X-I1J$ (From One Moun-

tain to the Next), 342n40
Yuanliang Hetao JijU3t~1i,see Hetao
Yuantong Monastery OOW-# (Wuchang),

344nl8
Yuanzhi Poyu 5Gtv~,~" see Poyu
Yue ~ (Guangdong and Guangxi), region

of, 64, 68, 86, IIO, 131, 137
Yue ~ (Zhejiang), region of, 65, 68,91,

340n25, 344n2o
Yueduan ffi~ (1671-17°4),176,33°,

362nII,371nl
Shitao's contact with

in Beijing, 105, 327, 328, 348095
post-Beijing, 112, 129, 136, 353n99
see also SAl: Orchids (Tianjin)

Yueyang Tower ffi~~ (Lake Dongtiog),
87,139, 140,140,258,312, 3.I3.
324

Yuhang ~tt (Zhejiang), 3, u9, 258-9
Yujun .:y1f, 170, 336
Yulin Tongx:iu 3i-;ft\'fm~ (1614-75),102,

327
Yuling Il\foi (Zhejiang), 65
Yun Shouping 1!I!1ll'F (1633-90), I6I, 2)0,

365n99
Yunmeng :I:~, 324
Yunnan ~i¥i, 61, 324, 34104, 342n45

Huang You in, 64, 74, 341n59, 342n4°
painting in, 202, 129

Zengcheng m~ (Guaogdoog),71
Zha Shenxing 'l!i'tIH'i (I650-I727),

34In86
Zha Shibiao 'l!i'±1lI (1615-98), I84, 206,

329, 355n21,359nI19, 371nl
copies by, 193, 361n44
Li Yin's stylistic allusions to, 361n47
as literati professional, 54, 170, 177,

357077, 359noI22,I38, 360029,
361n47

Shitao and, II4, 184, 202, 204
Song Luo and, 356n51, 181
students of, 160-1, 359n129
stylistic allusions to Huang Gongwang,

184,184.202.
theory of painting, 361049

Zhang Cao '*t¥i: (Tang dynasty), 22
Zhang Chao lIli1ll (b. I650), 304

and painting, 8r, 128, 351n66, 3590138,
363n26

NAME AND PLACE INDEX

as publisher and editor, xvi, 4, 81, 82,
256,304,331,343n59,355n26,
357n74, 363023, 364n56

as writer, 82, 161, 220-1, 256, 286-7,
348096, 356n45,371nl

Zhang Chong lIl~!, '79, 357n59
Zhang Chunxiu ~fm!1tf, 151, 328, 35°015;

see also SAl:Lake Chao
Zhang Daoling *lltfoi (d. 156), 259
Zhang Daqian *:lcT (1899-1983),

340047,351-2n69,360nl,367n72
Zhang Feng ~.oo. (?-1662), 340nB
Zhang Geng '*J3lt (1685-1760), xxi,

337n3
Zhang Gong ~j(, 179
Zhang Hong *;e (1577-<· 1652), 21,

342n45
Zhang jingjie *::J-1!1J, 149-50, 170, 189,

259,2.61,328, 3390I4, 350n26,
365099; see also SAl: Landscape in the
Style of Ni Zan and Huang Gongwang;
Landscapes (undated, Shanghai
Museum)

Zhang Lin ~~ (d. 1713), 108, 109,122.,
149, J28

Zhang Pengge *_lllI (1649-1725),79
Zhang Qi *~(1575-1648), 359n122
Zhang Qian *i!! (2d C. B.C.E.), 257
Zhang Rong *1lI (443-97),25°
Zhang Shijie *ili:iltt, 72
Zhang Xianzhong 5R.llt~, (1606-47),61-2
Zhang, Xudong, xvii
Zhang Xuo *ffiJ, 160, 357n86

Zhang Yi *'fa, 347074
Zhang Zhu *11 (J659-1704), 108, J22,

149,254-5, J28, 349n1I5, 371nI
poetry (trans.), 254-5, 367053

Zhang Zhupo *rt!ll:,I6I
Zhang Zong *~(1619-94),97,136,326,

347n74
Zhao Cheng mm (1581-1654 or later),

363n2o .
Zhao Ji 1til1:a (1082-II35), see HUizong
Zhao Lingraog ;tiI4-~ (active 1088-1I00),

126 8
Zhao Lun ;Ill;iJ (1636-95), 98~ 147, '47-.'

I SAl- Fishing In a Mountam326; see a so .
Stream

Zhao Mengfu Itil~~m(I2.54-1322), 95,
IOI,126,128,131-2,210,340n30,

352079,35406 6
Zhao Mengjian m~~(II99-U 7 or

before), 89, 126, 127, 132
Zhao Zisi Jte.-=fi11Y (d. n01), I4~, 326
Zhaodai congshu, see CompendIum of

Writings of the Present Age

h I, unlitl;»;;. Emperor (r. 221-3), 101Z ao Ie "J:lfo,'PP ,
Zhaozhou Itilffl (Yunnan), 64, 34~n59
Zhejiang mrrr, 96,325, 340n59, 342n44,

344n12, 348n94,350n36, 362n17
. d f I65 202 206artists 10 an rom, ' ,

Buddhist community in, 32-4, 344nI5,

367n77 " 268
Daoist commumty 10, 119,
Huang You's travels in, B, 65, 67, 68,

69-70

40I

loyalism in, II9, 120, 342.n44
Shitao's travels in, 91, 324, 344020

Zheng Da l\Ill!, 62
Zheng Hushan ~~l1J, 98, 100, 326,

3451146, 349n9, 36m2
Zheng Min ~Bt (16B-83), 202, 35°1152,

361044
Zheng Sixiao "H!.', I4f (1141-13 I8), 182
Zheng Xiao lliI~, 90
Zheng Xie lliI!&' (I693-1765), 2, 165-6,

337n),357n86
Zheng Yu l\IlCE(1298-1358), 356n39
Zheng Yuanxun ~5tWJ (1598-1645),186,

187. 361042
Zheng Zhaoxin JI)¥~, 154, 234, 32.8
Zheng Zhong lliI!ll. )57n59
Zheng Zhuolu lliIl1Iill, 362nIO
Zhenhuai Gate §AilErlj (Yangzhcu), 8, LO,

338n25
Zhenjiang iltrr (jiangsul, 93, 149, 179
Zhenzhou J1,1tI, see Yizheng
Zheweng 11T~~, 162-3, 167, 170, 189, 287,

J29, 332-3
Zhida 'Ill!, 345n47
Zhili 1U)t, 9~, 202, 206, 354n3
Zhiqi ~1E, 347n78
Zhongchang Tong 1Ijl-Rt.;ft. (179-219), 63
Zhong Lang fl~r~,96, 326, 343n6
Zhongshan illlJ (Nanjing), 52, 97, no,

I2I, 135-6, 183, 347n73
Zhoogyuan t:p JJji. , 202.
Zhou Baoye mJ%!:q~, 162, 332
Zhou Duoyi Jr,JlUJi (1017-1073), 183,

I83
Zhou Fang Ji'il1PJ (c. 730-<:· 800), 176, J93
ZhouJing J6Jg, 147, 326, 346n61,

347078; see also SAl: Pai~tings a"d
Calligraphies for Zholl jmg

Zhou Lianggoog J81~I (1612-72), 160,

180-1,205,3561155,363041.; see also
Notes all Viewiltg Pai,rt;llgs

Zhou Sisheng J~JWi!&, 37m1
Zhu Di *t.1t (136°-I414), see Yongle

emperor
Zhu Guan *ti. (1646-I715 or later), 3430

75
Zhu Hengjia *-.;p,;, 71, 71, 84, 323, J26,

343n6
Zhu Hengzhen *,.:f-,fi, 34306
Zhu Kanpu *Jllt$, I32,134, 352n73
Zhu Kanzhu *liit, 352073
Zhu Xi *_ (II3O-uoo), 106
Zhu Xinglong *JIl!t (d. I344), 1)1,

137
Zhu Yizun *att: (1629-17°9), 356n36
Zhu Yuanzhaog *:rr.ll (1328-98), see

Hongwu emperot
Zhu Yujiao *$iJ!, see Longwu emperor
Zhu Yuoming *ftBj] (1461-] 527), 43, 44.

45,45-6,187,189, r89
Zhu Yunwen *fttt (1377-I402), see

Jianwen emperor
Zhu Zaiyu *.xm (1536-I6u), 3690104
Zhu Zanyi *ttift, IJ!, 137
Zhu Zhanji *lffi1! (1399-1435), see

Xuande emperor
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Zhuang Zhou Jttj!] (c. 369-286 B.C.E.), see
Zhuangzi

Zhuangzi M.:r, 122, 257

Zhuangzi *-F, 66, 90, 1°7. II3, 127,
274

Zhuchong Peak tlt1E* (Mount Heng},
244.244, 366m8

ZhuningHall ~T~1i!:, I2.4, 332
Zhuo Erkan Ji[mJi- (c. 1650-<:. 1700), 62,

NAME AND PLACE INDEX

82, 133,148, 202, 341086, 347083,
353086,355021

Zhuxi 1t"ffi {Yangzhou},8-rl, 50
Zhuxi Ting 1tW~ (Pavilion West of the

Bamboos) (Yangzhou}, 14, 15,
3S8nro3

Zishugao §iIi.~, 3421140
Ziyang Academy ~~.~ (Shexian),

345°31 Shitao Artwork Index

Zo~g Yuanding *j[;~~(1620-98), 160
Zu ~n mii, 104, 326, 3460°54,55
Zulin Yuanlin m#Im1*, 97, 104, TI2,

326
Zunghars, 58
Zuo zbuan li:~. 353096
Zuoqiu Ming ti~RJ3, 135
Zuzhen Yuanyu w.~j[;.:E (1629-95),

3480108

Welcoming His Imperial Maiesty's Visit
(c. 1689-92), 345046, 347084

handscrolls
Account of My Feelings (1701, authen-
ticity uncertain), 362n14

Bamboo, Orchids, and Rocks (1691),

347°92.
Baoweng's Return to Huangsban
(1702), 191, 353n86

Calligraphy for Chang Hanqian (1683),

355n12
Calligraphy for Wang Shuxia (1700),

36106
Calligraphy Manuscript for Monk [uhui
(c. 1689-92), 108, 32.7-8, 345°46,
347084,348-90109,356°32

Dream Visit to Li Lin's Studio (1701),
190, 370016

Gengchen Manuscript of Poems (I70I),
110,134,137,32.9

Landscape and Calligraphy (c. 1701-7),
354n7

Landscape for Tongjun (1691), 371n62
Landscape for Wuweng (1690),
347nn81,88

Orchids and Bamboo (1695), 356n34
Pavilion of Twin Purities (c. r roos],
3530086,88,36104

Peach Blossom Spring, The (1696),
I26

Plum Blossom (1685), 347n91
Poems (c. early 1700S), 357079
Poem for Zhong Yuxing (1677), 346n53

Note: Alphabetization is word by word; hyphens count as blank spaces. Illustration pages are given in bold italics. Some page numbers for
works illustrated locate text citations of the relevant Figure number. Abbreviation: NPI, Name and Place Index.

extant but not illustrated
albums

Calligraphy (album leaf, c. r yoosl,
36In4

Eight Views of Huangshan (c. 1685),
24'

Flowers and Fruit (c. 1707), 37rn63
Illustrations to Poems by Du Fu (10

leaves) (Dadi Tang period), 360033
Illustrations to Poems by Du Fu
(7 leaves) (c. 16905), 360033

Illustrations to Shen Zhou's Poems on
Fallen Flowers (Dadi Tang period),
186

Landscapes (Xuancheng period),
36602I

Landscapes (1680), 344021, 346061,
3620J5,366044,370035

Landscapes (1684), 138
Landscapes (c. 1695), 345n47, 346n48,
350015

Landscapes (1701),32.9,353°93
Landscapes (17°2),184, 369n6
Landscapes (1704), 371067
Landscapes (1706) 357°76, 371049
Landscapes (c. 17005, with calligraphies
by Cheng Jing'e), 342053

Landscapes and Calligraphies (c. 1693-
6),354°7,369-7°08

Landscapes and Poetry (1683), 1I0,
326,346°47, 349n9, 356032., 362n15

Landscapes fOT Chaomin (1695),
35°015

Landscapes for Wang Zichuan (nOI),

350n2.3
Landscapes for Wu Chengxia (r poo),
353n86,354n7

Orchids and Bamboo (1701), 171,

36103
Plum Branches: Poems and Paintings
(c. 1704-7), 360n22.

Poetry Manuscript (c. 1693), 345-6n47,
348n095,98,349n4

Poetry Manuscript (c. 1697, mounted
together with Landscapes for Yao
Man), 329, 338028, 352n77, 367n69

Shanshui tuyong (1693),256,361°4
fans

Calligraphy for Cheng Ming (c. 1697-
17°5),176

Dream of Mount Huang, A (1695),

356042
Lake Poyang Seen from Mount Lu
(1700),182, 360n21, 36rn5

Landscape for Cangzbou (1702),

343n72
Landscape for Cheng Zhe (1706),

359nI32
Landscape for ]iang Shidong (Dadi
Tang period), 167

Landscape for Wu [ixian (17°5), 36105
Landscape for Xiyu, 368090
Plum Blossom, 3650102
Plum Blossom and Bamboo {c. 1687-
9),354n7

Poems (c. lare 16905), 3650I03

4°3
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353086,355021

Zhuxi 1t"ffi {Yangzhou},8-rl, 50
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Zu ~n mii, 104, 326, 3460°54,55
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326
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Zuo zbuan li:~. 353096
Zuoqiu Ming ti~RJ3, 135
Zuzhen Yuanyu w.~j[;.:E (1629-95),

3480108

Welcoming His Imperial Maiesty's Visit
(c. 1689-92), 345046, 347084

handscrolls
Account of My Feelings (1701, authen-
ticity uncertain), 362n14

Bamboo, Orchids, and Rocks (1691),

347°92.
Baoweng's Return to Huangsban
(1702), 191, 353n86

Calligraphy for Chang Hanqian (1683),

355n12
Calligraphy for Wang Shuxia (1700),

36106
Calligraphy Manuscript for Monk [uhui
(c. 1689-92), 108, 32.7-8, 345°46,
347084,348-90109,356°32

Dream Visit to Li Lin's Studio (1701),
190, 370016

Gengchen Manuscript of Poems (I70I),
110,134,137,32.9

Landscape and Calligraphy (c. 1701-7),
354n7

Landscape for Tongjun (1691), 371n62
Landscape for Wuweng (1690),
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Pavilion of Twin Purities (c. r roos],
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Calligraphy (album leaf, c. r yoosl,
36In4

Eight Views of Huangshan (c. 1685),
24'

Flowers and Fruit (c. 1707), 37rn63
Illustrations to Poems by Du Fu (10

leaves) (Dadi Tang period), 360033
Illustrations to Poems by Du Fu
(7 leaves) (c. 16905), 360033

Illustrations to Shen Zhou's Poems on
Fallen Flowers (Dadi Tang period),
186

Landscapes (Xuancheng period),
36602I

Landscapes (1680), 344021, 346061,
3620J5,366044,370035

Landscapes (1684), 138
Landscapes (c. 1695), 345n47, 346n48,
350015

Landscapes (1701),32.9,353°93
Landscapes (17°2),184, 369n6
Landscapes (1704), 371067
Landscapes (1706) 357°76, 371049
Landscapes (c. 17005, with calligraphies
by Cheng Jing'e), 342053

Landscapes and Calligraphies (c. 1693-
6),354°7,369-7°08

Landscapes and Poetry (1683), 1I0,
326,346°47, 349n9, 356032., 362n15

Landscapes fOT Chaomin (1695),
35°015

Landscapes for Wang Zichuan (nOI),

350n2.3
Landscapes for Wu Chengxia (r poo),
353n86,354n7

Orchids and Bamboo (1701), 171,

36103
Plum Branches: Poems and Paintings
(c. 1704-7), 360n22.

Poetry Manuscript (c. 1693), 345-6n47,
348n095,98,349n4

Poetry Manuscript (c. 1697, mounted
together with Landscapes for Yao
Man), 329, 338028, 352n77, 367n69

Shanshui tuyong (1693),256,361°4
fans

Calligraphy for Cheng Ming (c. 1697-
17°5),176

Dream of Mount Huang, A (1695),

356042
Lake Poyang Seen from Mount Lu
(1700),182, 360n21, 36rn5

Landscape for Cangzbou (1702),

343n72
Landscape for Cheng Zhe (1706),

359nI32
Landscape for ]iang Shidong (Dadi
Tang period), 167

Landscape for Wu [ixian (17°5), 36105
Landscape for Xiyu, 368090
Plum Blossom, 3650102
Plum Blossom and Bamboo {c. 1687-
9),354n7

Poems (c. lare 16905), 3650I03

4°3



Seclusion by the Crane Stream {c. 1705-
7),190,35407

Snow-covered Landscape (1673), 245
Streams and Mountains without End

(1686),133,147,347078,353086,
355014

Suojin qifeng da caogao (1691), 106,
327, 347092, 3480103

Vegetables and Praying Mantis (1700),
354°7

hanging scrolls
Bamboo (1698), 367069
Bamboo, Rocks, and Plum Blossom

(1679),354°7
Cat and Butterfly (1704, with Cheog

Miog and Mr. Xle), 202, 357076
Chrysanthemums, Rocks, and Wutong
Tree (1690), 348094

Eastern Mount Lu (c. 1687-9), 346054
Fine Rain and Dragon Pines (1687),

148,338035
Flood Poem (1705), 343069
Gazing at a Waterfall from a Stone
Bridge (1672), 35408, 366015

Guanyin Bodhisattva (1684), 247
Hibiscus (Dadi Tang period), 186
Island Mountain of Penglai, The (1687),

366°43,367064
Landscape (1679), 346054
Landscape (1681 or earlier), 357062
Landscape (1686), 355019
Landscape (1691), 348093
Landscape (c. 17°7),371063
Landscape for Deng Qifen (1676),

346048,3550II
Landscape for Wu Canxi (1681),3460

61, 35407
Li Songan's Studio (1702), 128,190,

329, 353094
Long Whistling in the Breeze (c. 1695)

152,356034,367068
Looking at Plum Blossom, 35407
Luohan Leaning on an Old Tree,

339016,366029
Mount Huayang (c. 1691-2),367064
Mountain Landscape (1671),363°32,

366034
Mr. Yunyi's Return to Xin'an (1704),

35407,361043
Orchids and Bamboo (Dadi Taog

period),36oo26
Plantain and Rocks (c. late 1680s), 210
Plantain in the Rain (c. 1697-17°3),

176
Playing the Qin in Front of an Ox

(c. 1705-7), 330
Plum Blossom (1699), 329, 360022
Plum Blossom (17°0),35509
Plum Blossom and Bamboo (c. 1680-

6),347073
Poems (c. 1680-6), 346055
Portrait of Magu (Dadi Taog period),

190-T
Qingliang Terrace (c. 1703-7), 136,

353°97
Qiujian lanying tu (1679), 366034

SHITAO ARTWORK INDEX

Teaching the [Book of] Changes (168o),
355°14

Tender Peach, The (c. 1700), 270
Two Horses (1680), 357n76
Wanli's Porcelain-handled Brush (1705),

371047
Wutong Tree and Rock (1674), 35407

forgeries, see NPI: Shirao, forgeries
illustrated
After Shen Zbou's «Bronze Peacock
Inkslab," 193, 193

album of painting and calligraphy by
Shitao and Bada Shanren, 128
"Day Lily," 90, 29I~ 292
"Yueyang Tower," 87, 138, 139, 140,

181,312,344013
albums for Mr. Liu, 136, 200, 205, 209-

10,212-13,218,220,224,226,228,
229, 2.30,232~6, 266,3°2,3°3,33°,
364n64; see also Landscapes (17°3, Bei
Shan Tang Collection}; Landscapes
(1703, Ostasiatiska Museet]; Land-
scapes for Liu Shitou; Landscapes for
Liu Xiaoshan

Ancestral Tombs of the Fei Family, The,
33, 58,60-1, 60-3, 81,190

Autumn Landscape, 176, 184, 185
Autumn Shadows on a Lotus Pond, 183,

295,297
Bamboo and Orchids (Shirao and Wang

Hui), las, 107, 182, 327
Bamboo, Rock, and Pine, 182, 183, 3°1,
303. 329

Bamboo, Vegetables, and Fruit, 170,' 172~
287

Beside Yangzi Bridge, 191, 192, 313
Blue-Green Screen of the Southern Moun-
tains, The, 31,42-3,44,45,46-8,5°,
54,190,301,35407

Calligraphies and Sketches by Qingxiang,
PI.2~2.7,31,32, II2, 121-3, 124-5~
152.,171,184,257, 318, 328,348nl06,
355023

Clearing Mist in Wild Ravines, 4, 42, 171-
2,174

Clouds and Mountains, 271,271,329,
353on93,97,362n8

Conversion of Hariti to Buddhism, The,
247,247,292,326,355025,366°4°

Crossing the Ridge [Portrait of Huang
You] (Shitao and unidentified portrait-
ist?), 37,48, 65-8, 66-7~ 81, 189, 191,
352085, 353n086,88, 358nllo

Dadizi's Portrait of Himself Asleep on an
Ox, Pl. 6, 29-30, III, 296, 316

Desolate Autumn in Huai-Yang, 18,35,
74,76,79-81,191, 352n75

Drinking Tea~ 148, 149
Drunk in Autumn Woods, PI. 5, 14, 28,

31,50, rI, 52.-4, 56,82,133,184,190,
220,316,35801I2

Eight Views of the South, Pl. 9~131, 140-
1,14°-1,181,286, 309-12, 310-11~
344013, 346n48, 347°91

Eight ViewsofXi'nan, 31,43,45,189,
301,354n7

Elegant Gathering in the Western Garden,
The, 193, 194-5~ 292

Energies of the Four Seasons, 146-7,146-
7~248-9

Excerpt from the "Huaia Beiyuan." 272,
273,329,36208

First Arrival at the Single Branch Pavilion,
97, 98-9~ 346n60, 347n88

Fishing in a Mountain Stream, 147, 247-
8,248, 261, 355nI7

Flowers (undated), Pis. 16-17, I86, 294-
5,295-6

Flowers (17°7),136, I83, 298,298,302,
320-1,322, 329, 3710n46,63

Flowers and Figures, 1I6, 134, 154, 201,
256, 292, 293~ 3°4,3°4,3°6,3°7,
35°015,356042,362016

Flowers and Fruit, 194,195,357076,
371062

Flowers, Landscapes, and Calligraphy,
292, 292

Flowers, vegetables, and Fruit, Pis. 18-21,
288, 290

Garden Vista, 154, 156-9~ 186
Gazing at the Waterfall at Cuijiao Peak,
194, 196, 337016

Guanyin Bodhisattva, 239-40, 241, 242,
247, 292, 345042

Hermits, 66, 89, 89-9°,91,96, Ill,
137,138, 145-6, 244,244, 344n2o,
345042

Hibiscus, Lotus, and Rock, 183, 294,294,
371°45

Horse and Groom, 94-5, 96,101, 355nII
Hunting in Autumn, 149, 150, 348n92
Illustrations to Poems by Du Pu, 187,188,

357n76
Illustrations to Poems by SU Shi, 245,246,

254,292

Illustrations to Poems by Tao Yuanming,
187,188

Illustrations to Poems by Zhu Yunming,
173, 187, 189~37105°

Illustrations to Su Shfs Poems on the
Seasons, 187, 306, 308, 308-9

Illustrations to the Poems of Huang Yan!ii,
Pl. 10, 33,33,68-74 68-73, 75~82, 86,
86,168,189,19°,344°13,352085,
353088,366018

Illustrations to Song and Yuan Poems,
26-7,27,187,357°76

Illustrations to Tang Poems, [42, 142,
170,187,189,190,312

Journey to Mount Huang, 31, 180-1~ 181,
244, 341080, 367074

Junks on a Canal, 33,34
Lake Chao, 32, 151, 153~35°015
Landscape (undated), 171, I73
Landscape (1698), 128, 129,176,184,

191, 329
Landscape (17°5), 128-9, z31, 184
Landscape after Ni Zan, 184, 185
Landscape for Mr. BochangJ 108,254,

255,365096
Landscape in the Style of Ni Zan and
Huang Gongwang, 113, 149, 151

Landscape of Mount Heng, 87,87,148,
344n13, 347081, 35407

Landscape of Mount Huang, 31,32-3,
152,19°,356034,367074

Landscape Painted on the Double Ninth,
137,193,314, 3I5, 316,353099

Landscapes (undated, private collection),
6, 7~33

Landscapes (undated, Shanghai Museum),
170, 171

Landscapes (1703, Bei Shan Tang Collec-
tion), 226, 227~303, 353094

Landscapes (1703, Ostasiatiska Museet},
213-14,216,217,351-2069

Landscapes and Flowers for Wu ] ixian,
200, 300-I, 300

Landscapes and Poems, 3, 42, 43, 53,55,
266, 266~ 3650103

Landscapes, Figures, and Flowers, Pl. 4~
28,34-5, 77-8, 77-8~ 182, 183,217,
297, 299~ 3°1,3°1,3°5,352075

Landscapes, Flowers, and Bamboo, 88,
89,258-9,258, 324,344010,354n2,
366022

Landscapes for Huang Lit, II3-14, 115,
126,128,137,152,202,256

Landscapes for jiweng, 244-5,245,251
Landscapes for Liu Shitou, 28, 34, 35, 36,
210,211,212,218,221,222,224,228,
228-9,229,23°,231-2,233-4,234,
237, 329,33902I

Landscapes for Liu Xiaoshan, Pl. 13, 200,
212-13,215, 220, 221,223,225-6,
232,233,235-6,235-6,266,267,3°2

Landscapes for Wang Iengrong, 255, 255-
6, 347-8092, 3480105

Landscapes for Yao Man, 10, I3, 29, 28-
9,113,114, 151, 312, 371038

Landscapes for Yu Daoren, 251,252-3,
35407,370-1038

Landscapes of the Highest Class, 31, 64-
5, 116, LI6-17, 134, 138, 138, 154,
201, 350nI5, 352085, 353088, 356042,
362016

Landscapes Painted at Wanglit Tang, 13,
14,15,173, I75, 297,299,357076,
365092

Landscapes Painted during Leisure from
Illness, 3, 32, 32,170, 217-18, 2I9~
221,3°5,3°5-6,3590117

Lesson in Hoeing, A, 4, 288,290, 3370I8

Lingzhi and Pine, 191, 261, 264-5, 329
Looking at the Mountains at Yuhang, Il9,

149,258-9, 259,350n26
Loquats, Bamboo-root, and Melon, 17°,

172, 288
Lotus Pond, 15, I6~ 135, 183
Lotuses (undated), 186, 188
Lotuses (1697),186-7,292,293
Lotuses in a Vase, PI. 22~186, 190
Lotuses in Moonlight, 53, 183, 257, 257
Love of Lotuses, 109, 183, 183~3590132
Master Shi Planting Pines (Shitao aod un-

identified portraitist?), Pl. I, 2, 31, 93-
4,94-5, III, Ill., 245, 325, 342033,
346n54,366027

SHITAO ARTWORK INDEX

Miniature Landscapes, 172-3,175, 193,
210,347079, 354n7

Mount Emei, 186, 194, 259,261, 266
Mount Huang, 31, 241, 243, 250, 265-6,

325
Mount Tiantai, 186, 267-8,269
On an Audience with the Emperor on the
Road to Pingshan, I4, 1°3-4, 104-5,
1I0,327

Orchids (album; whereabouts unknown),
13I, 133-4,135, 176, 182, 200, 290,
343074, 3500n42,47, 3530086,88,
3570 85,359nI29,36209,370031

Orchids (Nanjing Museum), 129, 132,
132, 176, 182

Orchids (Tianjin People'sPublishing
House), 129, 133, 136, 182, 329,
353°98

Orchids and Rock, 166-7, 167, 182
Orchids, Bamboo, and Rocks (Shirao and

WangYuanqi}, 105, 106, 182,327
Paintings and Calligraphies for Qilao,

u6, r r S, II8
Paintings and Calligraphies for Zhou Jing,

248, 249, 355014
Pavilion West of the Bamboos, The, 14,

15,35801°3
Peach Blossom Spring, The, 28, 62-3, 63-

4,186
Peonies, Bamboo, and Rock, 186, 187,

329
Plum Blossoms (undated}, 17, 17, 148
Plum Blossoms (17°6),183,257,285,

316-17,316-17,367063
Plum Blossom and Bamboo, 169, 169,

183
Plum Blossom, Bamboo, and Rock, 176,
200,201

Plum Blossom, Bamboo, and Rocks, 182,
I82

Portrait of Hong Zhengzhi (Shiraoand
jiang Heog?), Pl. 14, 37, 48,49,176,
179,189,343074,353086

Portrait of Wu Yuqiao {Shitao arid Jiaog
Heog), 37, 48, 49,5°,179,189,
352086,35407,371038

Qingxiang Dadizi's Reminiscence of the
Thirty-six Peaks, Pl. 3,31,38,40-2,5°,
141, 261, 264-6, 268, 268, 274, 276,

35rn61
Reminiscences of jinling, 136,181,

3Il-12, 318,319-21,320,329,
3530099,101,371n63

Reminiscences of Qin-Huai, 119-21,
119_23,124,143,154,328,352071,

354nIIO
Repotting Chrysanthemums, 27, 38,39,

40-2,50,52,194
Returning Home, 154, 155 .
Rocks, Trees, Orchids, and Bamboo (Shl-

tao aod Bada Shamen), 128, L30~182
Scenes of Mount Luofu, 189, 191
Searching for Plum Blossoms, 99, 10o-1~

183,248
Seas Are at Peace and the Rivers Are Pure,
The, 77, 102,103,345046

Shadows of Old Trees, 149, I50, 348093
Shaobo, 35, 78, 79
Sitting on a Bridge, 106,177, 359nI32
Sixteen Luohans, The, 91-2,102,145,
148,239-41, 240-r, 247, 325,
3440021,27, 345°34, 36507, 366029

Smoky Grove, 249, 250
Ten Thousand Ugly Inkblots, xx, 250-1,

251-3,261,347088,366°43
Terrace of the Yellow Emperor, The, PI.

15, 181,3°2,320,329, 371n63
Thoughts of Ki'nan, 152, 153, 34911I2,

35407,356n43
Transcription of the "Daode jing," 274,

275. 3601134
Twelve Landscapes, 30, T46, 242, 243,

325
Vegetables and Fruit, 287, 289
Views of Mount Huang, 91, 145, 145,

344021
Visit to Master Zhang's Grotto, Pl. 8, 193,

259-60, 262-5~ 268, 329
Visiting Dai Benxiao, 4, 172, 173, 174,

182,329
Walking toward a Mountain Retreat, Pl.

II, 31, 184-5, 354n7
Waterfall at Mount Lu, The, PI. 12, 141,

186,194,197-8,198,220,244,268-
70, 274, 276, 308-9

West of the Bamboos, 6, 8,8-11,13,33,
19°

Wilderness Colors, PI. 7, I83, 260, 262-3~
287,312,313,362015

Wilderness Man of Hanbin, The, 93,93
Willow Branches at Pingshan, 192, I92
Yellow Peonies, 186,187, 36I042

recorded, 3, 127, 144, q8, 162, 163, 166,
167,168,169,189,191,193,254-5,
331-6,352083

albums
Chrysanthemums, 3, 38, 317
Illustrations to Poems by Li Bai, 360n33
Landscapes, 345047,346048
Landscapes (1676),34605°,35408
Landscapes (1684), 249-50, 354117
Landscapes in Ink and Color (1696),

65,356042
Orchids (c. 1655), 324
Plum Blossom (Dadi Tang period),

359nI34
format unclear
Bamboo (c. 1702), 353097
Capital after a Snowfall, The (1690),

348094
Figure in Ink, 356034
Landscape for Deng Qifen (1686),

355011
Picture of the Tomb Gate (Dadi Tang

period),317-18
Pine and Chrysanthemum, 354n7
Plum Blossom Branch, 353088
Portrait of Wu Chengli (c. late 1680s),

254
Portrait of Yingfu Listening to the
Sounds of Autumn, 360036

Portrait of Zhang jingjie, 189



Seclusion by the Crane Stream {c. 1705-
7),190,35407

Snow-covered Landscape (1673), 245
Streams and Mountains without End

(1686),133,147,347078,353086,
355014

Suojin qifeng da caogao (1691), 106,
327, 347092, 3480103

Vegetables and Praying Mantis (1700),
354°7

hanging scrolls
Bamboo (1698), 367069
Bamboo, Rocks, and Plum Blossom

(1679),354°7
Cat and Butterfly (1704, with Cheog

Miog and Mr. Xle), 202, 357076
Chrysanthemums, Rocks, and Wutong
Tree (1690), 348094

Eastern Mount Lu (c. 1687-9), 346054
Fine Rain and Dragon Pines (1687),

148,338035
Flood Poem (1705), 343069
Gazing at a Waterfall from a Stone
Bridge (1672), 35408, 366015

Guanyin Bodhisattva (1684), 247
Hibiscus (Dadi Tang period), 186
Island Mountain of Penglai, The (1687),

366°43,367064
Landscape (1679), 346054
Landscape (1681 or earlier), 357062
Landscape (1686), 355019
Landscape (1691), 348093
Landscape (c. 17°7),371063
Landscape for Deng Qifen (1676),

346048,3550II
Landscape for Wu Canxi (1681),3460

61, 35407
Li Songan's Studio (1702), 128,190,

329, 353094
Long Whistling in the Breeze (c. 1695)

152,356034,367068
Looking at Plum Blossom, 35407
Luohan Leaning on an Old Tree,

339016,366029
Mount Huayang (c. 1691-2),367064
Mountain Landscape (1671),363°32,

366034
Mr. Yunyi's Return to Xin'an (1704),

35407,361043
Orchids and Bamboo (Dadi Taog

period),36oo26
Plantain and Rocks (c. late 1680s), 210
Plantain in the Rain (c. 1697-17°3),

176
Playing the Qin in Front of an Ox

(c. 1705-7), 330
Plum Blossom (1699), 329, 360022
Plum Blossom (17°0),35509
Plum Blossom and Bamboo (c. 1680-

6),347073
Poems (c. 1680-6), 346055
Portrait of Magu (Dadi Taog period),

190-T
Qingliang Terrace (c. 1703-7), 136,

353°97
Qiujian lanying tu (1679), 366034
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Teaching the [Book of] Changes (168o),
355°14

Tender Peach, The (c. 1700), 270
Two Horses (1680), 357n76
Wanli's Porcelain-handled Brush (1705),

371047
Wutong Tree and Rock (1674), 35407

forgeries, see NPI: Shirao, forgeries
illustrated
After Shen Zbou's «Bronze Peacock
Inkslab," 193, 193

album of painting and calligraphy by
Shitao and Bada Shanren, 128
"Day Lily," 90, 29I~ 292
"Yueyang Tower," 87, 138, 139, 140,

181,312,344013
albums for Mr. Liu, 136, 200, 205, 209-

10,212-13,218,220,224,226,228,
229, 2.30,232~6, 266,3°2,3°3,33°,
364n64; see also Landscapes (17°3, Bei
Shan Tang Collection}; Landscapes
(1703, Ostasiatiska Museet]; Land-
scapes for Liu Shitou; Landscapes for
Liu Xiaoshan

Ancestral Tombs of the Fei Family, The,
33, 58,60-1, 60-3, 81,190

Autumn Landscape, 176, 184, 185
Autumn Shadows on a Lotus Pond, 183,

295,297
Bamboo and Orchids (Shirao and Wang

Hui), las, 107, 182, 327
Bamboo, Rock, and Pine, 182, 183, 3°1,
303. 329

Bamboo, Vegetables, and Fruit, 170,' 172~
287

Beside Yangzi Bridge, 191, 192, 313
Blue-Green Screen of the Southern Moun-
tains, The, 31,42-3,44,45,46-8,5°,
54,190,301,35407

Calligraphies and Sketches by Qingxiang,
PI.2~2.7,31,32, II2, 121-3, 124-5~
152.,171,184,257, 318, 328,348nl06,
355023

Clearing Mist in Wild Ravines, 4, 42, 171-
2,174

Clouds and Mountains, 271,271,329,
353on93,97,362n8

Conversion of Hariti to Buddhism, The,
247,247,292,326,355025,366°4°

Crossing the Ridge [Portrait of Huang
You] (Shitao and unidentified portrait-
ist?), 37,48, 65-8, 66-7~ 81, 189, 191,
352085, 353n086,88, 358nllo

Dadizi's Portrait of Himself Asleep on an
Ox, Pl. 6, 29-30, III, 296, 316

Desolate Autumn in Huai-Yang, 18,35,
74,76,79-81,191, 352n75

Drinking Tea~ 148, 149
Drunk in Autumn Woods, PI. 5, 14, 28,

31,50, rI, 52.-4, 56,82,133,184,190,
220,316,35801I2

Eight Views of the South, Pl. 9~131, 140-
1,14°-1,181,286, 309-12, 310-11~
344013, 346n48, 347°91

Eight ViewsofXi'nan, 31,43,45,189,
301,354n7

Elegant Gathering in the Western Garden,
The, 193, 194-5~ 292

Energies of the Four Seasons, 146-7,146-
7~248-9

Excerpt from the "Huaia Beiyuan." 272,
273,329,36208

First Arrival at the Single Branch Pavilion,
97, 98-9~ 346n60, 347n88

Fishing in a Mountain Stream, 147, 247-
8,248, 261, 355nI7

Flowers (undated), Pis. 16-17, I86, 294-
5,295-6

Flowers (17°7),136, I83, 298,298,302,
320-1,322, 329, 3710n46,63

Flowers and Figures, 1I6, 134, 154, 201,
256, 292, 293~ 3°4,3°4,3°6,3°7,
35°015,356042,362016

Flowers and Fruit, 194,195,357076,
371062

Flowers, Landscapes, and Calligraphy,
292, 292

Flowers, vegetables, and Fruit, Pis. 18-21,
288, 290

Garden Vista, 154, 156-9~ 186
Gazing at the Waterfall at Cuijiao Peak,
194, 196, 337016

Guanyin Bodhisattva, 239-40, 241, 242,
247, 292, 345042

Hermits, 66, 89, 89-9°,91,96, Ill,
137,138, 145-6, 244,244, 344n2o,
345042

Hibiscus, Lotus, and Rock, 183, 294,294,
371°45

Horse and Groom, 94-5, 96,101, 355nII
Hunting in Autumn, 149, 150, 348n92
Illustrations to Poems by Du Pu, 187,188,

357n76
Illustrations to Poems by SU Shi, 245,246,

254,292

Illustrations to Poems by Tao Yuanming,
187,188

Illustrations to Poems by Zhu Yunming,
173, 187, 189~37105°

Illustrations to Su Shfs Poems on the
Seasons, 187, 306, 308, 308-9

Illustrations to the Poems of Huang Yan!ii,
Pl. 10, 33,33,68-74 68-73, 75~82, 86,
86,168,189,19°,344°13,352085,
353088,366018

Illustrations to Song and Yuan Poems,
26-7,27,187,357°76

Illustrations to Tang Poems, [42, 142,
170,187,189,190,312

Journey to Mount Huang, 31, 180-1~ 181,
244, 341080, 367074

Junks on a Canal, 33,34
Lake Chao, 32, 151, 153~35°015
Landscape (undated), 171, I73
Landscape (1698), 128, 129,176,184,

191, 329
Landscape (17°5), 128-9, z31, 184
Landscape after Ni Zan, 184, 185
Landscape for Mr. BochangJ 108,254,

255,365096
Landscape in the Style of Ni Zan and
Huang Gongwang, 113, 149, 151

Landscape of Mount Heng, 87,87,148,
344n13, 347081, 35407

Landscape of Mount Huang, 31,32-3,
152,19°,356034,367074

Landscape Painted on the Double Ninth,
137,193,314, 3I5, 316,353099

Landscapes (undated, private collection),
6, 7~33

Landscapes (undated, Shanghai Museum),
170, 171

Landscapes (1703, Bei Shan Tang Collec-
tion), 226, 227~303, 353094

Landscapes (1703, Ostasiatiska Museet},
213-14,216,217,351-2069

Landscapes and Flowers for Wu ] ixian,
200, 300-I, 300

Landscapes and Poems, 3, 42, 43, 53,55,
266, 266~ 3650103

Landscapes, Figures, and Flowers, Pl. 4~
28,34-5, 77-8, 77-8~ 182, 183,217,
297, 299~ 3°1,3°1,3°5,352075

Landscapes, Flowers, and Bamboo, 88,
89,258-9,258, 324,344010,354n2,
366022

Landscapes for Huang Lit, II3-14, 115,
126,128,137,152,202,256

Landscapes for jiweng, 244-5,245,251
Landscapes for Liu Shitou, 28, 34, 35, 36,
210,211,212,218,221,222,224,228,
228-9,229,23°,231-2,233-4,234,
237, 329,33902I

Landscapes for Liu Xiaoshan, Pl. 13, 200,
212-13,215, 220, 221,223,225-6,
232,233,235-6,235-6,266,267,3°2

Landscapes for Wang Iengrong, 255, 255-
6, 347-8092, 3480105

Landscapes for Yao Man, 10, I3, 29, 28-
9,113,114, 151, 312, 371038

Landscapes for Yu Daoren, 251,252-3,
35407,370-1038

Landscapes of the Highest Class, 31, 64-
5, 116, LI6-17, 134, 138, 138, 154,
201, 350nI5, 352085, 353088, 356042,
362016

Landscapes Painted at Wanglit Tang, 13,
14,15,173, I75, 297,299,357076,
365092

Landscapes Painted during Leisure from
Illness, 3, 32, 32,170, 217-18, 2I9~
221,3°5,3°5-6,3590117

Lesson in Hoeing, A, 4, 288,290, 3370I8

Lingzhi and Pine, 191, 261, 264-5, 329
Looking at the Mountains at Yuhang, Il9,

149,258-9, 259,350n26
Loquats, Bamboo-root, and Melon, 17°,

172, 288
Lotus Pond, 15, I6~ 135, 183
Lotuses (undated), 186, 188
Lotuses (1697),186-7,292,293
Lotuses in a Vase, PI. 22~186, 190
Lotuses in Moonlight, 53, 183, 257, 257
Love of Lotuses, 109, 183, 183~3590132
Master Shi Planting Pines (Shitao aod un-

identified portraitist?), Pl. I, 2, 31, 93-
4,94-5, III, Ill., 245, 325, 342033,
346n54,366027
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Miniature Landscapes, 172-3,175, 193,
210,347079, 354n7

Mount Emei, 186, 194, 259,261, 266
Mount Huang, 31, 241, 243, 250, 265-6,

325
Mount Tiantai, 186, 267-8,269
On an Audience with the Emperor on the
Road to Pingshan, I4, 1°3-4, 104-5,
1I0,327

Orchids (album; whereabouts unknown),
13I, 133-4,135, 176, 182, 200, 290,
343074, 3500n42,47, 3530086,88,
3570 85,359nI29,36209,370031

Orchids (Nanjing Museum), 129, 132,
132, 176, 182

Orchids (Tianjin People'sPublishing
House), 129, 133, 136, 182, 329,
353°98

Orchids and Rock, 166-7, 167, 182
Orchids, Bamboo, and Rocks (Shirao and

WangYuanqi}, 105, 106, 182,327
Paintings and Calligraphies for Qilao,

u6, r r S, II8
Paintings and Calligraphies for Zhou Jing,

248, 249, 355014
Pavilion West of the Bamboos, The, 14,

15,35801°3
Peach Blossom Spring, The, 28, 62-3, 63-

4,186
Peonies, Bamboo, and Rock, 186, 187,

329
Plum Blossoms (undated}, 17, 17, 148
Plum Blossoms (17°6),183,257,285,

316-17,316-17,367063
Plum Blossom and Bamboo, 169, 169,

183
Plum Blossom, Bamboo, and Rock, 176,
200,201

Plum Blossom, Bamboo, and Rocks, 182,
I82

Portrait of Hong Zhengzhi (Shiraoand
jiang Heog?), Pl. 14, 37, 48,49,176,
179,189,343074,353086

Portrait of Wu Yuqiao {Shitao arid Jiaog
Heog), 37, 48, 49,5°,179,189,
352086,35407,371038

Qingxiang Dadizi's Reminiscence of the
Thirty-six Peaks, Pl. 3,31,38,40-2,5°,
141, 261, 264-6, 268, 268, 274, 276,

35rn61
Reminiscences of jinling, 136,181,

3Il-12, 318,319-21,320,329,
3530099,101,371n63

Reminiscences of Qin-Huai, 119-21,
119_23,124,143,154,328,352071,

354nIIO
Repotting Chrysanthemums, 27, 38,39,

40-2,50,52,194
Returning Home, 154, 155 .
Rocks, Trees, Orchids, and Bamboo (Shl-

tao aod Bada Shamen), 128, L30~182
Scenes of Mount Luofu, 189, 191
Searching for Plum Blossoms, 99, 10o-1~

183,248
Seas Are at Peace and the Rivers Are Pure,
The, 77, 102,103,345046

Shadows of Old Trees, 149, I50, 348093
Shaobo, 35, 78, 79
Sitting on a Bridge, 106,177, 359nI32
Sixteen Luohans, The, 91-2,102,145,
148,239-41, 240-r, 247, 325,
3440021,27, 345°34, 36507, 366029

Smoky Grove, 249, 250
Ten Thousand Ugly Inkblots, xx, 250-1,

251-3,261,347088,366°43
Terrace of the Yellow Emperor, The, PI.

15, 181,3°2,320,329, 371n63
Thoughts of Ki'nan, 152, 153, 34911I2,

35407,356n43
Transcription of the "Daode jing," 274,

275. 3601134
Twelve Landscapes, 30, T46, 242, 243,

325
Vegetables and Fruit, 287, 289
Views of Mount Huang, 91, 145, 145,

344021
Visit to Master Zhang's Grotto, Pl. 8, 193,

259-60, 262-5~ 268, 329
Visiting Dai Benxiao, 4, 172, 173, 174,

182,329
Walking toward a Mountain Retreat, Pl.

II, 31, 184-5, 354n7
Waterfall at Mount Lu, The, PI. 12, 141,

186,194,197-8,198,220,244,268-
70, 274, 276, 308-9

West of the Bamboos, 6, 8,8-11,13,33,
19°

Wilderness Colors, PI. 7, I83, 260, 262-3~
287,312,313,362015

Wilderness Man of Hanbin, The, 93,93
Willow Branches at Pingshan, 192, I92
Yellow Peonies, 186,187, 36I042

recorded, 3, 127, 144, q8, 162, 163, 166,
167,168,169,189,191,193,254-5,
331-6,352083

albums
Chrysanthemums, 3, 38, 317
Illustrations to Poems by Li Bai, 360n33
Landscapes, 345047,346048
Landscapes (1676),34605°,35408
Landscapes (1684), 249-50, 354117
Landscapes in Ink and Color (1696),

65,356042
Orchids (c. 1655), 324
Plum Blossom (Dadi Tang period),

359nI34
format unclear
Bamboo (c. 1702), 353097
Capital after a Snowfall, The (1690),

348094
Figure in Ink, 356034
Landscape for Deng Qifen (1686),

355011
Picture of the Tomb Gate (Dadi Tang

period),317-18
Pine and Chrysanthemum, 354n7
Plum Blossom Branch, 353088
Portrait of Wu Chengli (c. late 1680s),

254
Portrait of Yingfu Listening to the
Sounds of Autumn, 360036

Portrait of Zhang jingjie, 189



406

Shuixi Landscape (c. 1676-7), 3550II
Three Gorges, The (1690), 347092
Xianxia Ling Pass (1690), 348°94

handscrolls
Boating at the River Village (1695),

'54
Clouds and Mountains without End

(Dadi Tang period), 3590132
Cranes in the Pines and Fish in the River

(c. 1706-7), 348u95
Island of Penglai, The (1707),177
Landscape for Zhiqi (1686),347078
Lo.ndscapes and Flowers (c. 1698),IF
Mmghuang Setting off on an Outing

(c. 1703-7), 176, 193
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One Hundred Beauties (1697),176,
193,328,36onI?

Orchids and Bamboo, 35407
Phoenixes (c. 1706-7), 177
PortraitofXiao CUD, 53,189
Sixteen l.uobans, The, 102, 240, 325.
327

Thirteen Views of the River Village
Estate (1695),154

Yellow Crane Tower (I662), 144
Zhuxi, 50

hanging scrolls
Auspicious Orchid (1699), 191, 36In5
Ink Landscape (1696, authenticity un-

clear), 128

Landscape (1686), 347n78
Landscape for Hong Zhengzhi (Dadi

Tang period), 3590134
Landscape for Wu Chengxia (1686),

354u7
multiscroll sets
Calligraphies in the Style of Song and
Yuan Masters (Dadi Tang period),
162,332

Calligraphy in Bafen Script (Dadi Tang
period), 167,333

Peach Blossom Spring, The (r698) 186
wall paintings '
Bamboo Branch (c. late r690s--early

1700S), 9,282

Subject Index

Note: Alphabetization is word by word; hyphens count as blank spaces. Abbreviation: NPI,Name and Place Index; SAl,Shitao Artwork Index.

absorption (jing), 303-6, 308-12
abstract expressionism, xvii, 251, 363n35
academies, 95, 207, 326, 345n31, 346n48,

366m7
actors, 10,27,28,56,194; see also theater
agents, see professionalism
agriculture, 28-9, 34-S, 46, 77, 79
alienation, 21, 31, 121, 204, 239, 281
amateurism, 36, 146, 161, 170, 173, 200,

20S, 206,230, 232
artists and, 91, 105, 129, 149, 176, 199-

201,363029
an (habitability, security), 206, 28S, 303-4,

310,316, 3I7; see also habitability;
security

antiques, 3, 48, 97,1°5,106,195,197,3°1,
359nIrs, 367062

art collecting, 91, 97,146,163; see also
painting, collecting

art market, 20-2, 34, 160-1, 178, 179, 195
Shitao and, xviii, 24, 2S, 36, 125, 146-7,

154,164,177,184,186,193,200-3,
281, 297, 306

see also commerce and trade
art world, 200-3, 203, 204, 230, 235-6
artisans, see social structure, artisans
associations, 3, 254
atmosphere, see visualiry of painting, in

Shitao's work, atmosphere
authenticity, 55, IIO, 242, 282-4, 285, 287,

297,3°0,3°3,3°8
autobiography, 30-1, 102, lOS, 133, 327,

369nI°9

Shirac's art of, 109-II, II3, 138, 142,
14S,324

autonomy, see independence and autonomy

bannermen, Han Chinese, see NPI: Gao
Qipei; Song Luo; Zhang Chunxiu;
Zhang Jingjie; Zheng Hushan

belatedness, xviii, xix, 19, 24, 54-S
biography, 42, 181, 281, 284, 305

collections of, 90, 132-3
examples of, 64, 90, 244
see also NPI: Shitao, biography of

body, 228, 229, 239
and cosmology, 278-81
Daoisr, 244, 251, 260-1, 264-5, 27°
female, 279, 292
imperial, 31, 69
individual, xvii, 22., 52, 229, 278-81,

369nI°9
landscape as, 213, 28o, 296-7, 370-1038
as model for pictorial structure, 279-8 I
in painting, act of, 212, 270-1, 274,

275-6
physical, 241, 279, 295, 3690122
Shirao's, 2, 137, 163, 257, 302, JI4, 334,

335
social, 2S4, 278
unrestrained, 38, 53, 204, 280, 2.54-5
see also desire, sexual; dress and fashion;

NPI: Shitao, illnessesof
books (as objects), 187, 189, 370n28

collecting, 64, 233, 287
depicted in painting, 42, 43

destruction of, 60, 90
in Shirao's possession, 3, 87, 97, II2, 140,

146,324,328
boxue hcngru, see examinations, boxue

hongru
Buddhism (Chan), 281

lay, 53, 104, 108, 239, 242, 245, 246,
248,251, 254. 324, 326, 347nn74,88,
349n110,366-7nso,369n8

lineages of, 102, 24I, 249
and painting, 182, 183, 248, 249, 256,

257,279,297
in Shirao's theory and practice, 93-4,

102, 105, 182-3, 238-42, 244-51,
254-7

ritual in, 144,344026
soteriology in, 238-9, 241, 246, 256
reaching of, 238-42, 244-51, 254-7
see also fa (dharma, Buddhist Law); NFl:

Shirao, biography; Shirao, identity
Buddhism (Lamaist), 108

calculable risk, 84, 286, 305
calligraphy

books on, 202, 358099
early Qing, 126,128,152,165,166,184,

332,3490110, 355n27,362nI3,
366n20,368090,370n17
in Yangzhou, 42, 163, 166, 168, 201,

202,232,3°4-5,361°44
imperial, 17, JI, 349n109
ink rubbings of, 3, 87, 166, 167,316,

335, 337015, 361n44
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Shuixi Landscape (c. 1676-7), 3550II
Three Gorges, The (1690), 347092
Xianxia Ling Pass (1690), 348°94

handscrolls
Boating at the River Village (1695),

'54
Clouds and Mountains without End

(Dadi Tang period), 3590132
Cranes in the Pines and Fish in the River

(c. 1706-7), 348u95
Island of Penglai, The (1707),177
Landscape for Zhiqi (1686),347078
Lo.ndscapes and Flowers (c. 1698),IF
Mmghuang Setting off on an Outing

(c. 1703-7), 176, 193

SHITAO ARTWORK INDEX

One Hundred Beauties (1697),176,
193,328,36onI?

Orchids and Bamboo, 35407
Phoenixes (c. 1706-7), 177
PortraitofXiao CUD, 53,189
Sixteen l.uobans, The, 102, 240, 325.
327

Thirteen Views of the River Village
Estate (1695),154

Yellow Crane Tower (I662), 144
Zhuxi, 50

hanging scrolls
Auspicious Orchid (1699), 191, 36In5
Ink Landscape (1696, authenticity un-

clear), 128

Landscape (1686), 347n78
Landscape for Hong Zhengzhi (Dadi

Tang period), 3590134
Landscape for Wu Chengxia (1686),

354u7
multiscroll sets
Calligraphies in the Style of Song and
Yuan Masters (Dadi Tang period),
162,332

Calligraphy in Bafen Script (Dadi Tang
period), 167,333

Peach Blossom Spring, The (r698) 186
wall paintings '
Bamboo Branch (c. late r690s--early

1700S), 9,282

Subject Index

Note: Alphabetization is word by word; hyphens count as blank spaces. Abbreviation: NPI,Name and Place Index; SAl,Shitao Artwork Index.

absorption (jing), 303-6, 308-12
abstract expressionism, xvii, 251, 363n35
academies, 95, 207, 326, 345n31, 346n48,

366m7
actors, 10,27,28,56,194; see also theater
agents, see professionalism
agriculture, 28-9, 34-S, 46, 77, 79
alienation, 21, 31, 121, 204, 239, 281
amateurism, 36, 146, 161, 170, 173, 200,

20S, 206,230, 232
artists and, 91, 105, 129, 149, 176, 199-

201,363029
an (habitability, security), 206, 28S, 303-4,

310,316, 3I7; see also habitability;
security

antiques, 3, 48, 97,1°5,106,195,197,3°1,
359nIrs, 367062

art collecting, 91, 97,146,163; see also
painting, collecting

art market, 20-2, 34, 160-1, 178, 179, 195
Shitao and, xviii, 24, 2S, 36, 125, 146-7,

154,164,177,184,186,193,200-3,
281, 297, 306

see also commerce and trade
art world, 200-3, 203, 204, 230, 235-6
artisans, see social structure, artisans
associations, 3, 254
atmosphere, see visualiry of painting, in

Shitao's work, atmosphere
authenticity, 55, IIO, 242, 282-4, 285, 287,

297,3°0,3°3,3°8
autobiography, 30-1, 102, lOS, 133, 327,

369nI°9

Shirac's art of, 109-II, II3, 138, 142,
14S,324

autonomy, see independence and autonomy

bannermen, Han Chinese, see NPI: Gao
Qipei; Song Luo; Zhang Chunxiu;
Zhang Jingjie; Zheng Hushan

belatedness, xviii, xix, 19, 24, 54-S
biography, 42, 181, 281, 284, 305

collections of, 90, 132-3
examples of, 64, 90, 244
see also NPI: Shitao, biography of

body, 228, 229, 239
and cosmology, 278-81
Daoisr, 244, 251, 260-1, 264-5, 27°
female, 279, 292
imperial, 31, 69
individual, xvii, 22., 52, 229, 278-81,

369nI°9
landscape as, 213, 28o, 296-7, 370-1038
as model for pictorial structure, 279-8 I
in painting, act of, 212, 270-1, 274,

275-6
physical, 241, 279, 295, 3690122
Shirao's, 2, 137, 163, 257, 302, JI4, 334,

335
social, 2S4, 278
unrestrained, 38, 53, 204, 280, 2.54-5
see also desire, sexual; dress and fashion;

NPI: Shitao, illnessesof
books (as objects), 187, 189, 370n28

collecting, 64, 233, 287
depicted in painting, 42, 43

destruction of, 60, 90
in Shirao's possession, 3, 87, 97, II2, 140,

146,324,328
boxue hcngru, see examinations, boxue

hongru
Buddhism (Chan), 281

lay, 53, 104, 108, 239, 242, 245, 246,
248,251, 254. 324, 326, 347nn74,88,
349n110,366-7nso,369n8

lineages of, 102, 24I, 249
and painting, 182, 183, 248, 249, 256,

257,279,297
in Shirao's theory and practice, 93-4,

102, 105, 182-3, 238-42, 244-51,
254-7

ritual in, 144,344026
soteriology in, 238-9, 241, 246, 256
reaching of, 238-42, 244-51, 254-7
see also fa (dharma, Buddhist Law); NFl:

Shirao, biography; Shirao, identity
Buddhism (Lamaist), 108

calculable risk, 84, 286, 305
calligraphy

books on, 202, 358099
early Qing, 126,128,152,165,166,184,

332,3490110, 355n27,362nI3,
366n20,368090,370n17
in Yangzhou, 42, 163, 166, 168, 201,

202,232,3°4-5,361°44
imperial, 17, JI, 349n109
ink rubbings of, 3, 87, 166, 167,316,

335, 337015, 361n44



--~-----------------~-----------------~----
as model for painting, 148, r86, 205. 214.

218,226,282,300

of past, 43. 87, 101, 186, 232, 248, 250,
303

professional practice of, 42,146,155,
160,165,166

in Shitao's possession, 3. 87, 97. 146, 166,
316,335,337nIS

theory of, 2.10, 249, 250, 302

see also NFl: Bada Shanren, calligraphy of;
Shitao, calligraphy of

caste, see social structure, caste
censorship, 278, 279
dr'i (energy), 226, 260, 285, 286, 287, 303,

364n67
in painting, 210, 2.12, 219.220, 254, 270,

279-80, 281, 297
children, 3, 4,12,18,3°,47,64,80,94.

124, 137, 261, 288, 304-5
cities, 3I 3

V5.countryside, 19-21, 25, 26, 29-30, 31,
}2-4. 35. 46

Y5. state, 2.2, 25, 50
see also NPl: Yangzhou, city of

classicism
as school/tradition, see painting, schools

and traditions of, classicism
in Shitao's painting, 184-5, 230, 259,

354n4
clothes, see fashion and dress
clumsiness, see visuality of painting, in

Shitao's work, clumsiness
cognition, 220, 279
collaboration (with the Qing), 38, 40, 87,

88, r60, 324
Shitao's, 88-9, 95,1°9,134,141,351069;

see a/so imperial patronage
collecting, see art collecting; books,

collecting of; painting, collecting;
NPI: Huizhou (Anbui), families, as
collecrors/patrons; Shexiau, families, as
collectors/patrons

color, see visualiry of painting, in Shirao's
work, color

commerce and trade, 19, 20, 21, 22,28,35,
46,5°,54,122,2°7,208,281

of painting, 144, 160, 184,2°5
Shitao's involvement in, 3, 42, Ill, 121,

146,162,168,169,170,176,178,
179, 180, 209

in Yangzhou, 4,8,18,34,191,234,29°
see a/so art market; market; professional-

ism; social structure, merchants
composition, see visualiry of painting, in

Shitao's work, composition
consumption, see consumerism
consumerism, 20-2, 23, 54, 148, 160, 285,

286, 287, 290, 301-2
cosmology

body-centered, 278-81
dynastic, 25, 50, III, 278, 280
philosophical and religious, 84, 218, 264,

369n104
pictorial, 52, 210, 218, 266,279-80

court painting, see painting, schools and
traditions of, court

SUBJECT INDEX

dao (Way), xviii, II 8, 207-8, 247, 268, 272,
274, 368n91

of painting, 114, 202, 203, 210, 258, 272,
278, 280,290,296, 368n91

Daoism, 278,280, 33 I

Bada Shanren and, 127-8
lay, 248,251, 357n85
and painting, 127, 184, 279, 297, 300

by Shitao, II6, lI8, 121, 183, 220,
224,247-8,251,258-61,264-6,
268-72, 281,3°8,318

theorized by Shitao, II9, 126, 238, 260,
266,270-2,274-7,28I,368nn90,91

sacred geography, II9, 259-60, 268
schools of, II9, 126
see also fa (Daoist method); iconography

of painting; NPI: Shitao, identity, Daoist
death, 127

and Ming-Qing dynastic transition, 17,
37,38,4°,60,61,62,74,84,96,100,
136, 143

ritual related to, 40, 63,97,99,1°5,317-
18,346n50,347n73,365nlo

Shitao's, see NPI: Shitao, death
and Sui-Tang dynastic transition, 14, 17,

80
see also graves; natural disasters; ritual

decorative arts, see material culture
desire, 97, 110.285,286-8,29°,3°0-2,

3'0
sexual, 3, 183,247,292,296,294-7

same-sex, 296, 316
see also sex

destiny, 40,81, 84,2°5,278,286,3°4
of Shuao, see NPI: Shira0, destiny
see also narrative, of destiny

dharma, see fa
disguise, practice of, 283-4, 285, 287-8,

3°4,306,3°8,312
disjunctions, 24, 25, 2°5,283,284,286,

367-8n83
displacement, 41, 122-3, 239, 281, 284,

286,310,322
doubt, xviii, 24. II4, 133, 197, 246, 2.56,

277,278,369n104
dreams, 4,86,282-3,285,286,294,317,

370nl6
dress and fashion, 12-13, 17,30,86,146,

167, r80, 2.84. 338°37
distinctions

religious, 2. 96, II6, II8, 124, 128
seasonal, 37,47,65
social, 28, 43, 47-8,50,233

Manchu custom imposed, 2, 37-8, 47-8,
lI8,125

drinking, see wine
dynasricism, xviii; see also cosmology,

dynastic

economy, 8, 18, 19-21,152,2°5,2°7; see
also commerce and trade

examinations, 6, 27, 27-8, 100-1, 116, 148,
'52

boxue hongru, 58,60,92,98, 100, 163,
326,346050

study for, 6,36,45,95,168,192, 346n48

energy, see cb'i
entertainment, 8, 167, 179, 184, 278, 288
exile, 3I, 41, 61, 72

government administration, 4, 6,18,35,78,
98, IF, 278; see also government
service; water management

government service, 28, 36, 40, 41-2, 47, 54,
77,101,160,233,234, F6, 349nIIl

in central administration, 8, 92, 104-5,
107-8,II4,147,151,313,349nlII,
350n36

in Imperial Silk Manufactory, see NPI: Cao
Yin

in military administration, 61, 350n36
in provincial administration, 61, 64, 74,

78,91,96, 160, 163, 168, 340-1059,
343n72, 344n12, 348n94, 350n38,
352071, 3540IIO, 359n0132,133

in salt administration, see NPI: Cao Yin
graves, 40, 41,58,60,62,63,69,133,136,

183,341°5
Yangzhou-area, 3, 13, 17, 52., 63
see also NPI: Shirao, death, grave; Zhong-

shan

fa (Daoist method), 270, 272, 274-5,
368n91

fa (dharma, Buddhist Law), 204, 245, 247,
248,250,256

fa (painting method/craft), 2, 204, 213, 217,
228,245,249-50,251,254-6,270,
274-5,281,3oo,368n91

fall of the Ming, 57, 62, 64, 80, 99, 138,
279, 21-2; see also Manchu conquest

fame, 81, II4, 116, 202, 203, 204, 236,
302,305,363n30

of Shitao, see NPI:Shitao, fame
family, 161, 167, 168, 278

filial behavior, 40, 43, 46, 48, 5B-64, IF,
'52

of Shitao, see NPI:Shitao, family
see also history, family; memory, familial;

NPI: Huizhou (Anhui), families; Shexian,
families

fashion, see dress and fashion
fiction, III, 179, 286, 3580101, 37In56
fictionality, I II, 194, 2°7, 285
flavor (fengwei), 284, 288, 290
flooding, see natural disasters
food, 9,18,19,28,65,77,81,106,170,

305, 306
beverages, see tea; wine
and famine, 29, 60, 62, 80
and gifting, 148, 162, 168, 288, JI3, 332,

335
meals, 4, 152, 168, 335
restaurants, 4, 8,13,5°
vegetarianism, 3, 4, 64, 73,106,162,168,

182, 260, 286, 287-8, 290, 332, 335
foreign(ers), xix, 8, 19, 22, 69, 220-1, 278,

285, 338n29, 365088; see also Manchu
conquest, Western representation;
NPI: Manchus

functionalist ethic, 23, 50, 200, 205-9, 278,
279,285,3690122

habitability, 303-4, 309-12, 317
hair, see dress and fashion
hermeneutics, 238, 239, 284, 285, 303, 3°8,

309
hermits, see iconography of painting, figures,

hermits
historical commemoration

actions, 17, 69, 97, 99, 135-6, 183
monuments, 10, 17, 87, 310-12, 341n72
paintings, 58, 61, 74, 80, 102, 105, 120,

183,347°73
texts, 87-8, 135-6, 343nn59,69

history
dynastic, 57, 58, 67, 285, 326
family, 60, 19.I
wilderness, 58, 64, 67, 279
see also narrative; NPI: Yangzhou, history

of
hybridiry, xviii, 24-5, 284, 285

iconography of painting, 87, 179, 178-87,
189-95,197-8,256, 344nI2, 352n75,
3590122

animals
deer, 127
horse and groom, 34, 77,94-5, 352n75
ox, riding, 29-30, 296

figures
hermits, 29-30, 89-9°,93,116, 1I8,

145-6,233,244
in landscape, 178-9, 355012
merchants and officials, 28
peasants, 28-9, 35
poets, 306, 308-9
portraiture/self-portraiture, 29-3°,37,

48,65-6,94, III, 116, 122, 123,
176,179,189,254,279,283,296,
317

religious, 190-1, 239-41, 247, 345n42
self-referential, 30-1, 110, 140-1, 143,

241-2, 261, 266, 268, 281, 297, 305,
306,365nIJ

servants and laborers, 26-7
women, 190-1, 292

gardens, 3, 12, 13, 15,45,48, T5I, 160,
183,186,288,348n93

gentry, see social structure, gentry
ghostpainring, see workshop practice
ghosts and spirits, 9,240,247,284,286,

292, 363n32

gifting
of artifacts, 3, 104, 166, 167, 200, 335,

367n62
business-related, 163, 167
by emperor, 17-18, 75, 104
to emperor, T7-18, 75, 102, 107
of flowers, 167, 290, 370n33
of foodstuffs, 148, 162, 168, 288, 313,

332,335
in painting commissions, 148, 169, 197
of paintings, 107, 180

by Shitao, to others, 3, 102, 147, 148,
166, 168, 193, 314, 334, 353n97

Shitao's, used for, 152, 163, 167, 169,
171, 186-7, 190, 191, 192, 361n5
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flowers, 168, 183, 186
chrysanthemums, 38, 348n94
day lily, 290, 292
hibiscus, 292
lotuses, 15, 183, 186-7, 245, 246, 248,

257,292,294,295,320
narcissus, 89, 127
orchids, 122, 129, 182, 191,29°
peach blossom, 270
peonies, 292, 295
plum blossom, 17, 120, 183, 248, 294,
317,320,322, 347n73

f1ower-and-bird, 87, 179
landscape, 1I9, 305-6, Jl8, 320, 370-
1038
Buddhist, 241-2, 245, 247
caves and grotros, 90, 138, 259-60
Daoist, 259-60, 261, 264-6, 268-70,

367n64, 370n38
decorative, 179
history, 57-8, 60-74
memory, 137-8, 138, 140-3, 1I0, 181,

264-6, 308-12, 344n13, 370n37
mood, 1I3-14, 116, 140, 224-6, 3°3,

3°4,3°5,3°6,311,312
mountains, 138, JI8, j zo, 367nn64,74
old masters, 184, 197-8, 226, 228-30,

251,268,270
Peach Blossom Spring, 28, 64, 70, 1I6,

186
political space of, 31,36-7, 37-8, 40-2,

57-82 passim
rain and floods, 28-9, 35, 74-5, 77-81,

103,131,148,3°5,312,314,
3521175

residences and estates, 4T, 42-3, 45,
128,154,189-9°,234,314,332

rocks, 296-7
sobriquets and, 43, 190
social space of, 26-38, 40-3, 45-8, 5°,

52-6, 186
topographic reference, 50, 58, 58, 61,

64,70,74,98,110-1,136, lSI, 178,
190, 241, 247, 259, 353n97, see a/so
Yangzhou

travel, 31, 31-2, 68-74, 186, 19°,
191-2, 318

plants and trees
bamboo, 9, 105, 110, 122, 152, 182,

248,294,367n68
barren trees, 318
pines, 261
plantain, 148
trees, 138, 354n6

poetic themes, 288
classical, 142, 173, 186, 187, 189, 191,

225-6,245,266,168-9
early Qing, 68-74, 189, 295
Ming, 186, 187, 189,191,244-5

vegetables and fruit, 168, 182-3, 248-9,
260

identity, xvi, 23, 26; see also. self;.self-
fashioning; NPI:Shitao, Identity of

ideology, a r, 26, 36, 45,102,160,235,284,

285,369n128
patriarchal, 30, 278-9, 287

of state, 10, 24, 15, 35, 50, 58,98,106,
203,254, 339n6I; see a/so censorship;
literary inquisition

see a/so sumptuary regulations
illusionism, see visualiry of painting, in

Shitac's work, illusionism
imperial family members, 27, 31, 100

painting by, J26-9, 1}2, 134, 182
see also NPI: Bada Shanren; Bordu; Shitao,

Yinreng; Yinzhen; Yueduan; Zhao
Mengfu; Zhao Mengjian

imperial patronage
of Buddhist monks, see NPI: Lti'au Benyue;

Muchen Daomin; Qingyuan; Xinshu
Fuqian; Xuezhuang

Shitao's pursuit of, 1, 92, 94, 95-7, 98-9,
102-9,123,132,135,141,146,281,
326,327,349n9

see also examinations, boxue hongru
incense, 313, 347n73
independence and autonomy

of painting, 207, 277, 278, 280; see also
daD

professional, 22, 42,166,103,230
psychic, 284-6
Shirao's aspiration to, xviii, 24, 97, 109,

II3, 154, 280-1, 285-6, 305, 314
social problematic of, 25, 47, 106, 210,
278-81,286; see also alienation;
opinion

individual, xvi-xvii, 23, 36, 47, 138, 209,
210,212,278,285,3°8; see also
alienation; body, individual; isolation;
independence and autonomy; self;
subjectivity

individualism, xv, 24, 209, 2JO, 128,238,
279, 2Bo, 368n94

inrervisuality, see visualiry of painting, in
Sbitao's work, intervisuality

intimacy, 286, 312-14, 128
irony, 55, 56
isolation, 285, 3°4,3°6, 30B, 312, 317,

)22

jing (absorption), see absorption

labor, 18, 27, 28, 30, 34, 35, 36, 50, 78, 93,
208

investment of, in painting, 164, 170, 194,
358092

landscape, 31-5, 122-3; see also iconogra-
phy of painting

leisure, 26, 28, 30, 31-7, 42, 48, 50, 170,
283,285,288

li, see order
light, see visuality of painting, in Shirao's

work, light
literary inquisition, 57-8, 168, 337m
literary theory, 126,229,286-7,3°0, 303
literati culrure.xs, 20, 21, 53-5, 168, 193,

205,238
literature, III, 179, 191, 229, 27B, 282,

2.88;see also fiction; theater
loyalism

in earlier periods, 68, 69, 71-2, 87-8, 89,
90,101, II9, 137, 342n44
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as model for painting, 148, r86, 205. 214.

218,226,282,300

of past, 43. 87, 101, 186, 232, 248, 250,
303

professional practice of, 42,146,155,
160,165,166

in Shitao's possession, 3. 87, 97. 146, 166,
316,335,337nIS

theory of, 2.10, 249, 250, 302

see also NFl: Bada Shanren, calligraphy of;
Shitao, calligraphy of

caste, see social structure, caste
censorship, 278, 279
dr'i (energy), 226, 260, 285, 286, 287, 303,

364n67
in painting, 210, 2.12, 219.220, 254, 270,

279-80, 281, 297
children, 3, 4,12,18,3°,47,64,80,94.

124, 137, 261, 288, 304-5
cities, 3I 3

V5.countryside, 19-21, 25, 26, 29-30, 31,
}2-4. 35. 46

Y5. state, 2.2, 25, 50
see also NPl: Yangzhou, city of

classicism
as school/tradition, see painting, schools

and traditions of, classicism
in Shitao's painting, 184-5, 230, 259,

354n4
clothes, see fashion and dress
clumsiness, see visuality of painting, in

Shitao's work, clumsiness
cognition, 220, 279
collaboration (with the Qing), 38, 40, 87,

88, r60, 324
Shitao's, 88-9, 95,1°9,134,141,351069;

see a/so imperial patronage
collecting, see art collecting; books,

collecting of; painting, collecting;
NPI: Huizhou (Anbui), families, as
collecrors/patrons; Shexiau, families, as
collectors/patrons

color, see visualiry of painting, in Shirao's
work, color

commerce and trade, 19, 20, 21, 22,28,35,
46,5°,54,122,2°7,208,281

of painting, 144, 160, 184,2°5
Shitao's involvement in, 3, 42, Ill, 121,

146,162,168,169,170,176,178,
179, 180, 209

in Yangzhou, 4,8,18,34,191,234,29°
see a/so art market; market; professional-

ism; social structure, merchants
composition, see visualiry of painting, in

Shitao's work, composition
consumption, see consumerism
consumerism, 20-2, 23, 54, 148, 160, 285,

286, 287, 290, 301-2
cosmology

body-centered, 278-81
dynastic, 25, 50, III, 278, 280
philosophical and religious, 84, 218, 264,

369n104
pictorial, 52, 210, 218, 266,279-80

court painting, see painting, schools and
traditions of, court

SUBJECT INDEX

dao (Way), xviii, II 8, 207-8, 247, 268, 272,
274, 368n91

of painting, 114, 202, 203, 210, 258, 272,
278, 280,290,296, 368n91

Daoism, 278,280, 33 I

Bada Shanren and, 127-8
lay, 248,251, 357n85
and painting, 127, 184, 279, 297, 300

by Shitao, II6, lI8, 121, 183, 220,
224,247-8,251,258-61,264-6,
268-72, 281,3°8,318

theorized by Shitao, II9, 126, 238, 260,
266,270-2,274-7,28I,368nn90,91

sacred geography, II9, 259-60, 268
schools of, II9, 126
see also fa (Daoist method); iconography

of painting; NPI: Shitao, identity, Daoist
death, 127

and Ming-Qing dynastic transition, 17,
37,38,4°,60,61,62,74,84,96,100,
136, 143

ritual related to, 40, 63,97,99,1°5,317-
18,346n50,347n73,365nlo

Shitao's, see NPI: Shitao, death
and Sui-Tang dynastic transition, 14, 17,

80
see also graves; natural disasters; ritual

decorative arts, see material culture
desire, 97, 110.285,286-8,29°,3°0-2,

3'0
sexual, 3, 183,247,292,296,294-7

same-sex, 296, 316
see also sex

destiny, 40,81, 84,2°5,278,286,3°4
of Shuao, see NPI: Shira0, destiny
see also narrative, of destiny

dharma, see fa
disguise, practice of, 283-4, 285, 287-8,

3°4,306,3°8,312
disjunctions, 24, 25, 2°5,283,284,286,

367-8n83
displacement, 41, 122-3, 239, 281, 284,

286,310,322
doubt, xviii, 24. II4, 133, 197, 246, 2.56,

277,278,369n104
dreams, 4,86,282-3,285,286,294,317,

370nl6
dress and fashion, 12-13, 17,30,86,146,

167, r80, 2.84. 338°37
distinctions

religious, 2. 96, II6, II8, 124, 128
seasonal, 37,47,65
social, 28, 43, 47-8,50,233

Manchu custom imposed, 2, 37-8, 47-8,
lI8,125

drinking, see wine
dynasricism, xviii; see also cosmology,

dynastic

economy, 8, 18, 19-21,152,2°5,2°7; see
also commerce and trade

examinations, 6, 27, 27-8, 100-1, 116, 148,
'52

boxue hongru, 58,60,92,98, 100, 163,
326,346050

study for, 6,36,45,95,168,192, 346n48

energy, see cb'i
entertainment, 8, 167, 179, 184, 278, 288
exile, 3I, 41, 61, 72

government administration, 4, 6,18,35,78,
98, IF, 278; see also government
service; water management

government service, 28, 36, 40, 41-2, 47, 54,
77,101,160,233,234, F6, 349nIIl

in central administration, 8, 92, 104-5,
107-8,II4,147,151,313,349nlII,
350n36

in Imperial Silk Manufactory, see NPI: Cao
Yin

in military administration, 61, 350n36
in provincial administration, 61, 64, 74,

78,91,96, 160, 163, 168, 340-1059,
343n72, 344n12, 348n94, 350n38,
352071, 3540IIO, 359n0132,133

in salt administration, see NPI: Cao Yin
graves, 40, 41,58,60,62,63,69,133,136,

183,341°5
Yangzhou-area, 3, 13, 17, 52., 63
see also NPI: Shirao, death, grave; Zhong-

shan

fa (Daoist method), 270, 272, 274-5,
368n91

fa (dharma, Buddhist Law), 204, 245, 247,
248,250,256

fa (painting method/craft), 2, 204, 213, 217,
228,245,249-50,251,254-6,270,
274-5,281,3oo,368n91

fall of the Ming, 57, 62, 64, 80, 99, 138,
279, 21-2; see also Manchu conquest

fame, 81, II4, 116, 202, 203, 204, 236,
302,305,363n30

of Shitao, see NPI:Shitao, fame
family, 161, 167, 168, 278

filial behavior, 40, 43, 46, 48, 5B-64, IF,
'52

of Shitao, see NPI:Shitao, family
see also history, family; memory, familial;

NPI: Huizhou (Anhui), families; Shexian,
families

fashion, see dress and fashion
fiction, III, 179, 286, 3580101, 37In56
fictionality, I II, 194, 2°7, 285
flavor (fengwei), 284, 288, 290
flooding, see natural disasters
food, 9,18,19,28,65,77,81,106,170,

305, 306
beverages, see tea; wine
and famine, 29, 60, 62, 80
and gifting, 148, 162, 168, 288, JI3, 332,

335
meals, 4, 152, 168, 335
restaurants, 4, 8,13,5°
vegetarianism, 3, 4, 64, 73,106,162,168,

182, 260, 286, 287-8, 290, 332, 335
foreign(ers), xix, 8, 19, 22, 69, 220-1, 278,

285, 338n29, 365088; see also Manchu
conquest, Western representation;
NPI: Manchus

functionalist ethic, 23, 50, 200, 205-9, 278,
279,285,3690122

habitability, 303-4, 309-12, 317
hair, see dress and fashion
hermeneutics, 238, 239, 284, 285, 303, 3°8,

309
hermits, see iconography of painting, figures,

hermits
historical commemoration

actions, 17, 69, 97, 99, 135-6, 183
monuments, 10, 17, 87, 310-12, 341n72
paintings, 58, 61, 74, 80, 102, 105, 120,

183,347°73
texts, 87-8, 135-6, 343nn59,69

history
dynastic, 57, 58, 67, 285, 326
family, 60, 19.I
wilderness, 58, 64, 67, 279
see also narrative; NPI: Yangzhou, history

of
hybridiry, xviii, 24-5, 284, 285

iconography of painting, 87, 179, 178-87,
189-95,197-8,256, 344nI2, 352n75,
3590122

animals
deer, 127
horse and groom, 34, 77,94-5, 352n75
ox, riding, 29-30, 296

figures
hermits, 29-30, 89-9°,93,116, 1I8,

145-6,233,244
in landscape, 178-9, 355012
merchants and officials, 28
peasants, 28-9, 35
poets, 306, 308-9
portraiture/self-portraiture, 29-3°,37,

48,65-6,94, III, 116, 122, 123,
176,179,189,254,279,283,296,
317

religious, 190-1, 239-41, 247, 345n42
self-referential, 30-1, 110, 140-1, 143,

241-2, 261, 266, 268, 281, 297, 305,
306,365nIJ

servants and laborers, 26-7
women, 190-1, 292

gardens, 3, 12, 13, 15,45,48, T5I, 160,
183,186,288,348n93

gentry, see social structure, gentry
ghostpainring, see workshop practice
ghosts and spirits, 9,240,247,284,286,

292, 363n32

gifting
of artifacts, 3, 104, 166, 167, 200, 335,

367n62
business-related, 163, 167
by emperor, 17-18, 75, 104
to emperor, T7-18, 75, 102, 107
of flowers, 167, 290, 370n33
of foodstuffs, 148, 162, 168, 288, 313,

332,335
in painting commissions, 148, 169, 197
of paintings, 107, 180

by Shitao, to others, 3, 102, 147, 148,
166, 168, 193, 314, 334, 353n97

Shitao's, used for, 152, 163, 167, 169,
171, 186-7, 190, 191, 192, 361n5
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flowers, 168, 183, 186
chrysanthemums, 38, 348n94
day lily, 290, 292
hibiscus, 292
lotuses, 15, 183, 186-7, 245, 246, 248,

257,292,294,295,320
narcissus, 89, 127
orchids, 122, 129, 182, 191,29°
peach blossom, 270
peonies, 292, 295
plum blossom, 17, 120, 183, 248, 294,
317,320,322, 347n73

f1ower-and-bird, 87, 179
landscape, 1I9, 305-6, Jl8, 320, 370-
1038
Buddhist, 241-2, 245, 247
caves and grotros, 90, 138, 259-60
Daoist, 259-60, 261, 264-6, 268-70,

367n64, 370n38
decorative, 179
history, 57-8, 60-74
memory, 137-8, 138, 140-3, 1I0, 181,

264-6, 308-12, 344n13, 370n37
mood, 1I3-14, 116, 140, 224-6, 3°3,

3°4,3°5,3°6,311,312
mountains, 138, JI8, j zo, 367nn64,74
old masters, 184, 197-8, 226, 228-30,

251,268,270
Peach Blossom Spring, 28, 64, 70, 1I6,

186
political space of, 31,36-7, 37-8, 40-2,

57-82 passim
rain and floods, 28-9, 35, 74-5, 77-81,

103,131,148,3°5,312,314,
3521175

residences and estates, 4T, 42-3, 45,
128,154,189-9°,234,314,332

rocks, 296-7
sobriquets and, 43, 190
social space of, 26-38, 40-3, 45-8, 5°,

52-6, 186
topographic reference, 50, 58, 58, 61,

64,70,74,98,110-1,136, lSI, 178,
190, 241, 247, 259, 353n97, see a/so
Yangzhou

travel, 31, 31-2, 68-74, 186, 19°,
191-2, 318

plants and trees
bamboo, 9, 105, 110, 122, 152, 182,

248,294,367n68
barren trees, 318
pines, 261
plantain, 148
trees, 138, 354n6

poetic themes, 288
classical, 142, 173, 186, 187, 189, 191,

225-6,245,266,168-9
early Qing, 68-74, 189, 295
Ming, 186, 187, 189,191,244-5

vegetables and fruit, 168, 182-3, 248-9,
260

identity, xvi, 23, 26; see also. self;.self-
fashioning; NPI:Shitao, Identity of

ideology, a r, 26, 36, 45,102,160,235,284,

285,369n128
patriarchal, 30, 278-9, 287

of state, 10, 24, 15, 35, 50, 58,98,106,
203,254, 339n6I; see a/so censorship;
literary inquisition

see a/so sumptuary regulations
illusionism, see visualiry of painting, in

Shitac's work, illusionism
imperial family members, 27, 31, 100

painting by, J26-9, 1}2, 134, 182
see also NPI: Bada Shanren; Bordu; Shitao,

Yinreng; Yinzhen; Yueduan; Zhao
Mengfu; Zhao Mengjian

imperial patronage
of Buddhist monks, see NPI: Lti'au Benyue;

Muchen Daomin; Qingyuan; Xinshu
Fuqian; Xuezhuang

Shitao's pursuit of, 1, 92, 94, 95-7, 98-9,
102-9,123,132,135,141,146,281,
326,327,349n9

see also examinations, boxue hongru
incense, 313, 347n73
independence and autonomy

of painting, 207, 277, 278, 280; see also
daD

professional, 22, 42,166,103,230
psychic, 284-6
Shirao's aspiration to, xviii, 24, 97, 109,

II3, 154, 280-1, 285-6, 305, 314
social problematic of, 25, 47, 106, 210,
278-81,286; see also alienation;
opinion

individual, xvi-xvii, 23, 36, 47, 138, 209,
210,212,278,285,3°8; see also
alienation; body, individual; isolation;
independence and autonomy; self;
subjectivity

individualism, xv, 24, 209, 2JO, 128,238,
279, 2Bo, 368n94

inrervisuality, see visualiry of painting, in
Sbitao's work, intervisuality

intimacy, 286, 312-14, 128
irony, 55, 56
isolation, 285, 3°4,3°6, 30B, 312, 317,

)22

jing (absorption), see absorption

labor, 18, 27, 28, 30, 34, 35, 36, 50, 78, 93,
208

investment of, in painting, 164, 170, 194,
358092

landscape, 31-5, 122-3; see also iconogra-
phy of painting

leisure, 26, 28, 30, 31-7, 42, 48, 50, 170,
283,285,288

li, see order
light, see visuality of painting, in Shirao's

work, light
literary inquisition, 57-8, 168, 337m
literary theory, 126,229,286-7,3°0, 303
literati culrure.xs, 20, 21, 53-5, 168, 193,

205,238
literature, III, 179, 191, 229, 27B, 282,

2.88;see also fiction; theater
loyalism

in earlier periods, 68, 69, 71-2, 87-8, 89,
90,101, II9, 137, 342n44
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Ming, 38, 40-1, 56, 66-7. 71-4, 88,92,
99-101, 136
in Guangdong, 64, 71-2
in Nanjing, 64, 73-4, 98, 99-100, 326,
3470073,74

painting, II4. 121, 160, 165, 167. r8I,
3S6oSI

Shitao and, I, 18, 64, 87-9,95.99-
102, 109, 113, 119-20, 123. 140,
182,3Srn69

in Yangzhou, xvi, 12-13, 17. 52, 84,
102,116,124.126,134,168,312,

347°74,356032
in Zhejiang, II9. 120, 342°44

see also resistance, loyalist; wilderness
luxury, 20-2, 75,112, II}, 167. 179, 187,

288

madness, 38, 50, 56, :QI-2, 244, 247. 260-
1,265, 268, 280

Manchu conquest, xvii, 17. 2I~2, 37. 57. 65.
98,279,283; see a/so fall of the Ming

manuals and treatises, 168, 202, 2°7. 208,
212,217-18,230,278,283

Shitao's, 3. 173. 182,208-9,212, 219-20,

224-6,229.230,232,238,280,282,
29°
circulation of, 199, 200, 208, 209
Daoist dimension of, 272, 274-7
recensions and tides, 123-4, 204, 208,
2°9,272,274,329,33°

see also painting, theory of
maps, 7°,98
in present volume, 5, 59, 85

market, 35, 55, 283, 285, 287, 290; see also
art market

material culture, 12, 20-2, 38, 287, 339n58;
see also dress and fashion; gifting;
luxury

medicine, 3, 18, 166, 168, 169, 205, 207,
278,280,335

memory
collective, 17, 62, 69, 72, 74, 81
familial, 61-2
personal, 26, 38, 61, Il2, 182, 284, 305-
6,308,312

political, 57-8,74
see also historical commemoration;
iconography of painting, landscape,
memory

merchants, see social structure, merchants
metaphysics, 1°5-6, 210, 276, 2,79
in Shitao's writings, 24, 218, 2,39, 247,
250, 274, 277-8, 28x

see also philosophy
method, see fa
modernism, xvii, 277, 366n45
modernity, xv, xvii-xviii, 18-19, 19-22,23-

5,84,239,281,283-6,288
money, see professionalism, artists, payment

and prices
Mongol conquest, 68, 71, 72
monochrome, see visuality of painting, in

Shitao's work, monochrome
mood, see iconography of painting, land-

scape, mood

SUBJECT INDEX

moral capital, 28, 30, 31,42,5°,62,181,
194, 305, 306, 309, 312; see also moral
value

moral value
of painter, 55, 160, 180-1, 183, 193, 194
of painting, 23, 179, 182, 207, 295
in society, 21-2, 34,4°,48, 81, 90, 278,
279,371054

see also moral capital; social structure,
sociomoral hierarchy

mourning, 281
personal, 40,60-4,128,129
political, 36,38,40-1,99,101,129,285

music, 28,80,141,318, 354n1II
qin-playing, 10, 48,53,33°
singing, 14,27,90, r02, 136, 302

names, 17, 108,127-8,134, 349nl09
of Shuao, see NPI: Shitao, names of

narrative, 57
of destiny, 83-4, 96,97,1°9, III, 122,

125, 141-2,3°6,311
dynastic, 23,57-8,66,74,81,82,99
historiographic, xvii-xviii, 366n4 5
of life, 95, 104,123,126,141,268,276
and painting, 69, 74, III, 179, 181-2,

269
natural disasters, 18,74,77,278
drought, 28, 29
floods, 8,18,35, 74-5, 77-81, 131, r62,
312,314

obsessions, 3,62,64,69,74,81, 342n45;
see a/so pi

officials
as painters, 106, r8I, 182, 206, 363n29
as patrons of painting, 161, 235
punished, 75, 8r, 349nIII, 371n62
see also government service; NPI: Nanjing,

officials in
opinion (debate, commentary), space of,

23-4, 58,81-2
order
cosmological, 218, 266
ideological, 106; see also ideology, of state
philosophical, 106,279, 286, 287
pictorial, 209-10, 224-5, 276, 277, 280,

369n126
sociopolitical, 18,20,21,46,58,61,70,
9°,93

painting
collecting, 1°5,328; see also NPI: XU

Songling, painting collection of
of early Qing works, n6, 121, 129,
160,167,176,202,205,350-1n52,
359nI38

of old works, 160, 1-76, 186, 355027,
359nI38

of Shitao's work, in r Sth and roth C.,
232, 337n3, 364n64

see also art collecting
connoisseurship
early Qing, 106, 162, 197-8, 200, 232,
256,3°5,327, 353n98, 357077,
361n52

of Shitao's painting, xx, 323, 331,
345n44, 359-6001; see also specific
work (SAIl

see also painting, forgeries; workshop
practice

craft of, 179, 186, 194, 199-200, 205,
206, 208, 286
Shitao's: development of, 203~5,

344n21; theory and practice of, 207,
209, 210, 212-14, 217-21, 224-6,
228-30, 3°2

see a/so visuality of painting; workshop
practice

forgeries, 20, 160, 197, 361n52
of Shitao's work, see NPI:Shirao,
forgeries

see a/so painting, connoisseurship
formats of, 152, 16o, 165-6, 235, 36rn49
in Shitao's work, no, 164~6, 167, 172,

178,191,235,282; albums, 187,
189,23°,3°6, 364n64; screens and
multiscroll works, 154, 163-4, 185-
6,2°5,334

genres of, 87, 170-1, 176, 178-98 passim,
23°,255,256

history of, 20, 21, 22, 226, 228-30, 230,
235-6

iconography of, see iconography of
painting

lyric approach to, xvii, xviii, 23, 24, IIa-
11,210,219,226,248,3°3,3°4; see
also iconography of painting, landscape,
mood

materials, 3,166,2°4,23°,3°2
brushes, 301, 302
ink and pigments, 162-3, 164, 301,
302,332,334

paper, 152, 162, 164-5, 166, 167, 295,
301,302,333,333-4,334,367n53

silk and satin, 164-5, 176, 186, 334,
367"53

mounting of, 10, 28, 155, 166, 176, 177
patronage of, see professionalism, artists,
patronage relationships of; NPI: specific
artist, city, region, or patron
Shirao, see NPI: Shirao, professionalism
of, artist-patron relationships

profession of, 20, 155, 203, 206, 207,
209, 218, 230; see also professionalism,
artists

public of, 47,53, 145,161,23°,232,
234-5

schools and traditions of
classicism, 184-5, 2°3, 204, 230, 250,

280, 281, 368n94; in Beijing, 98,
1°5,106,114,2°3,254,255

court, 20, 58,98,105,166,327,
360m2,363n27

Eccentric, 166, 204
Individualist, xv, 22, 106, lIO, 126,
202,279,283, 363n35; see also qishi

literati painting (wenren hua), 21, 23,
55,110,155,160,179-80,180,
282

local, 22, 202, 203-4, 206; see also
NPI: specific city or region

by monk-painters, 104, 107, 171, 182-
3,199-200,201,257,324,327,
355°17

by prince-painters, 126-9, 132, 182
by scholar-officials, 106, 181, 182, 206,

363n29
wilderness, 116, 128, 142, 16o, 166,

178,179,180,181,184,193,194
by women, 160, 173, 179, 302, 370n13
Zhe, 30, 184, 219

semiotics of, 210, 212-14, 217-21, 224-6,
228-30, 279-80

style of, 204; see also painting, craft of
and semiotics of; visualiry of painting

teaching of, 4, 87, 105, 108, 183, 199-
200,208,2°9,217,23°,317,324,
326,327,328,329,33°; see also paint-
ing, craft of; professionalism, artists

theory of, 199, 208, 209, 230, 254
Dong Qichang, 203, 2°5, 212, 219,
228,250,256; "literati painting,"
180,186,205,206,207,208,209,
219, 339n60

Gong Xian, 206-7, 208, 209, 217, 218,
228, 285

lineage in, 212, 228, 250
Shirao's, 250-1, 270-2; see also man-
uals and treatises, Shitao's

Zha Shibiao, 361n49
see also manuals and treatises; painting,
craft of

peasants, see agriculture; rebellion, of
peasants; social structure, peasants

perception, 219, 220-1, 221-2, 270, 275,
276, 280

performance aesthetic, see visualiry of paint-
ing, in Shirao's work, performance
aesthetic

philanthropy, 18, 47, 148, 207, 254, 278;
see also public buildings

philosophy, 339"73
classical, 10, 274
early Qing, 60, 134, 207-8, 279, 287,

364n82,369n122
Ming, 105-6, 210, 279, 280, 364n50,
3690122

Shitao's, 272, 274-7, 368n91, 3690128
Song, lO6
see also ideology; metaphysics

pi (addiction, obsession), 64, Ill, 287, 288;
see also obsessions

place, 18, 74, 281
plays, see theater
poetry, III, 161, 224-6, 229, 282, 303
by Shitao, see NPI: Shitao, poetry
societies, 92, 102, 108, 113, 148, 149,

151,325
translated
anonymous, 225
Fei Mi, 62
Fei Xihuang, 63
Feng He, 67
Huang You, 70, 72, 73
Huang Yun, 305
Jiang Shijie, 133
Kangx:i,75
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Li Bai, 268-9
Li Lin, 65, 312
Mei Qing, 242
Qiao Yin, 66
Su Shi, 306
Zhang Zhu, 254-5, 367n53

see also iconography of painting, poetic
themes; publishing

poets
classical, 142, 173, 186, 187, 189, 191,
225-6,229,245,266,268-9,288

early Qing, 17, 52, 53, 62, 64, 68, 70,
100,112,134,148,151,152,168,200,
207, 239, 304~5,342n40,343n69,
361n7,371llI

Ming, 186, 187, 189, 191, 244-5, 288
women, 362nII
see also iconography of painting, figures,
poets

politics, see iconography of painting, land-
scape, political space of; ideology;
literary inquisition; loyalism, Ming;
wilderness; NPI: Shirao, identity, political

portraiture, see iconography of pai~ting,
figures, portraiture Iself-portralture

practical learning (shixue), 60, 207, 278
practicality, 207-8, 278, 279
praxis, 238, 258, 272, 274, 277, 278, 280,

281, 368n94
private, 4, r r S, 238, 279, 282-322 passim

vs. public, 13, 23-4, 25, 53, 81-2, 100,
104,108-9,122,135,278,282-3

see also history, wilderness
professionalism
artists
agents and intermediaries for, 30, 126-
7,128,148,151,I55,355n24,
359n138

business correspondence of, 351n66,

357"77 .
career painters (workshop-tramed), 20,
164,178, 179, 18o, 186, 193-4, 206,
208,2°9

literati professionals, 20, 42, 54, 155,
16a-l, 164, 168, 178-80, 194,204,
205-8,313

patronage relationships, 151-2, 358n92
payment and prices, 164-5, 197,
358n92, 359n122 .

of Shitao, see NPI: Shitao, professional-
ism of

see also painting, profession of
nonarrisrs, 19, 23, 30, 37, 42, 54, 161,
208, 239
writers, 133, 165, 168, 191, 195, 201,
302, Jl3

property, 3, 18, 45, 107, 146, 279, 349n111
psychic autonomy, see independence .
public buildings, construction {restoration of
Jingxian, 95, 346n48, 366n17
Nanjing, 254, 349nI°9
Shexian, 325> 345°31, 354n5
Xuancheng, 92, 93-4, 95, 97, 325
Yangzhou, 14, 18, 74, 75
Yizheng, 154
see also philanthropy

public, see opinion; private, vs. public;
sociability

publishing
manuscript, 64, 199, 209, 279, 35°1141,
360°34,364060

print
governmental, xvi, 10,18,81,82
private, 4, 81, 134, 152, 154, 168, 176,
199,208,287,304,3580n99,I05,
360n33,362nII

punishment, 27-8, 41, 71, 84,9°,34°025
of Chinese officials, 75, 81, 3490111.
371062

of loyalists, 37, 62, 69, 136
of Manchu dignitaries, 58, 80-1, 325
see also literary inquisition, 57-8, ] 68,
3370.1

qi (strangeness, originality), 220, 286
aesthetic ideal of, 21, 146, 206, 210, 254,

281
of landscape, 31, 3421145
of people, 3, 181, 282, 285, 286, 303

qing (feeling, subjective experience), 23, IIO,

210,226,290
qishi ("original")
painting by, xv, 21, 22-3, II4, 181, 204-

5,200,2°7,280,281,283,285,286
persona of, 24, 100, 179,207,254-5,
282, 286

see also painting, schools and traditions
of, Individualist

rapture, 244, 251, 266
rebellion, 278
of peasants, in southern Anhui (1674),93,

325
of Three Feudatories (1673-81), 68, 69,
71, 72, 93, 94, 98, 99, 105. 203, 325

of Zhang Xianzhong (1644-6), 61
religion, I, 3,9, 10, 238, 274
sorenology, 238-9, 281, 286
syncretism, 125, 242, 2.48
see also Buddhism; Daoism; iconography
of painting, figures, religious; meta-
physics; ritual

remnant subjects, see loyalism
resistance
loyalist
active, 17,40,65,67-8,71,72,88,9°,
95,99,323,324, 346n68; see also
rebellion; NPI: Fei Mi; Qu Dajun;
Wen Tianxiang

symbolic, 17, 37-8, 38, 40, 69, 100
to market, 301-2, 306
to modernity, 285

restaurants, see food, restaurants
restoration, see public buildings
ritual,369nm06,Il7
Buddhist, 144, 344n26
and dynastic fall, 38, 40, 100-1
death-related, see death, ritual related to

in practice of painting, 238, 239
private, 90, 310, 312
social, 180, 199, 287, 313
see also gifting
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Ming, 38, 40-1, 56, 66-7. 71-4, 88,92,
99-101, 136
in Guangdong, 64, 71-2
in Nanjing, 64, 73-4, 98, 99-100, 326,
3470073,74

painting, II4. 121, 160, 165, 167. r8I,
3S6oSI

Shitao and, I, 18, 64, 87-9,95.99-
102, 109, 113, 119-20, 123. 140,
182,3Srn69

in Yangzhou, xvi, 12-13, 17. 52, 84,
102,116,124.126,134,168,312,

347°74,356032
in Zhejiang, II9. 120, 342°44

see also resistance, loyalist; wilderness
luxury, 20-2, 75,112, II}, 167. 179, 187,

288

madness, 38, 50, 56, :QI-2, 244, 247. 260-
1,265, 268, 280

Manchu conquest, xvii, 17. 2I~2, 37. 57. 65.
98,279,283; see a/so fall of the Ming

manuals and treatises, 168, 202, 2°7. 208,
212,217-18,230,278,283

Shitao's, 3. 173. 182,208-9,212, 219-20,

224-6,229.230,232,238,280,282,
29°
circulation of, 199, 200, 208, 209
Daoist dimension of, 272, 274-7
recensions and tides, 123-4, 204, 208,
2°9,272,274,329,33°

see also painting, theory of
maps, 7°,98
in present volume, 5, 59, 85

market, 35, 55, 283, 285, 287, 290; see also
art market

material culture, 12, 20-2, 38, 287, 339n58;
see also dress and fashion; gifting;
luxury

medicine, 3, 18, 166, 168, 169, 205, 207,
278,280,335

memory
collective, 17, 62, 69, 72, 74, 81
familial, 61-2
personal, 26, 38, 61, Il2, 182, 284, 305-
6,308,312

political, 57-8,74
see also historical commemoration;
iconography of painting, landscape,
memory

merchants, see social structure, merchants
metaphysics, 1°5-6, 210, 276, 2,79
in Shitao's writings, 24, 218, 2,39, 247,
250, 274, 277-8, 28x

see also philosophy
method, see fa
modernism, xvii, 277, 366n45
modernity, xv, xvii-xviii, 18-19, 19-22,23-

5,84,239,281,283-6,288
money, see professionalism, artists, payment

and prices
Mongol conquest, 68, 71, 72
monochrome, see visuality of painting, in

Shitao's work, monochrome
mood, see iconography of painting, land-

scape, mood
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moral capital, 28, 30, 31,42,5°,62,181,
194, 305, 306, 309, 312; see also moral
value

moral value
of painter, 55, 160, 180-1, 183, 193, 194
of painting, 23, 179, 182, 207, 295
in society, 21-2, 34,4°,48, 81, 90, 278,
279,371054

see also moral capital; social structure,
sociomoral hierarchy

mourning, 281
personal, 40,60-4,128,129
political, 36,38,40-1,99,101,129,285

music, 28,80,141,318, 354n1II
qin-playing, 10, 48,53,33°
singing, 14,27,90, r02, 136, 302

names, 17, 108,127-8,134, 349nl09
of Shuao, see NPI: Shitao, names of

narrative, 57
of destiny, 83-4, 96,97,1°9, III, 122,

125, 141-2,3°6,311
dynastic, 23,57-8,66,74,81,82,99
historiographic, xvii-xviii, 366n4 5
of life, 95, 104,123,126,141,268,276
and painting, 69, 74, III, 179, 181-2,

269
natural disasters, 18,74,77,278
drought, 28, 29
floods, 8,18,35, 74-5, 77-81, 131, r62,
312,314

obsessions, 3,62,64,69,74,81, 342n45;
see a/so pi

officials
as painters, 106, r8I, 182, 206, 363n29
as patrons of painting, 161, 235
punished, 75, 8r, 349nIII, 371n62
see also government service; NPI: Nanjing,

officials in
opinion (debate, commentary), space of,

23-4, 58,81-2
order
cosmological, 218, 266
ideological, 106; see also ideology, of state
philosophical, 106,279, 286, 287
pictorial, 209-10, 224-5, 276, 277, 280,

369n126
sociopolitical, 18,20,21,46,58,61,70,
9°,93

painting
collecting, 1°5,328; see also NPI: XU

Songling, painting collection of
of early Qing works, n6, 121, 129,
160,167,176,202,205,350-1n52,
359nI38

of old works, 160, 1-76, 186, 355027,
359nI38

of Shitao's work, in r Sth and roth C.,
232, 337n3, 364n64

see also art collecting
connoisseurship
early Qing, 106, 162, 197-8, 200, 232,
256,3°5,327, 353n98, 357077,
361n52

of Shitao's painting, xx, 323, 331,
345n44, 359-6001; see also specific
work (SAIl

see also painting, forgeries; workshop
practice

craft of, 179, 186, 194, 199-200, 205,
206, 208, 286
Shitao's: development of, 203~5,

344n21; theory and practice of, 207,
209, 210, 212-14, 217-21, 224-6,
228-30, 3°2

see a/so visuality of painting; workshop
practice

forgeries, 20, 160, 197, 361n52
of Shitao's work, see NPI:Shirao,
forgeries

see a/so painting, connoisseurship
formats of, 152, 16o, 165-6, 235, 36rn49
in Shitao's work, no, 164~6, 167, 172,

178,191,235,282; albums, 187,
189,23°,3°6, 364n64; screens and
multiscroll works, 154, 163-4, 185-
6,2°5,334

genres of, 87, 170-1, 176, 178-98 passim,
23°,255,256

history of, 20, 21, 22, 226, 228-30, 230,
235-6

iconography of, see iconography of
painting

lyric approach to, xvii, xviii, 23, 24, IIa-
11,210,219,226,248,3°3,3°4; see
also iconography of painting, landscape,
mood

materials, 3,166,2°4,23°,3°2
brushes, 301, 302
ink and pigments, 162-3, 164, 301,
302,332,334

paper, 152, 162, 164-5, 166, 167, 295,
301,302,333,333-4,334,367n53

silk and satin, 164-5, 176, 186, 334,
367"53

mounting of, 10, 28, 155, 166, 176, 177
patronage of, see professionalism, artists,
patronage relationships of; NPI: specific
artist, city, region, or patron
Shirao, see NPI: Shirao, professionalism
of, artist-patron relationships

profession of, 20, 155, 203, 206, 207,
209, 218, 230; see also professionalism,
artists

public of, 47,53, 145,161,23°,232,
234-5

schools and traditions of
classicism, 184-5, 2°3, 204, 230, 250,

280, 281, 368n94; in Beijing, 98,
1°5,106,114,2°3,254,255

court, 20, 58,98,105,166,327,
360m2,363n27

Eccentric, 166, 204
Individualist, xv, 22, 106, lIO, 126,
202,279,283, 363n35; see also qishi

literati painting (wenren hua), 21, 23,
55,110,155,160,179-80,180,
282

local, 22, 202, 203-4, 206; see also
NPI: specific city or region

by monk-painters, 104, 107, 171, 182-
3,199-200,201,257,324,327,
355°17

by prince-painters, 126-9, 132, 182
by scholar-officials, 106, 181, 182, 206,

363n29
wilderness, 116, 128, 142, 16o, 166,

178,179,180,181,184,193,194
by women, 160, 173, 179, 302, 370n13
Zhe, 30, 184, 219

semiotics of, 210, 212-14, 217-21, 224-6,
228-30, 279-80

style of, 204; see also painting, craft of
and semiotics of; visualiry of painting

teaching of, 4, 87, 105, 108, 183, 199-
200,208,2°9,217,23°,317,324,
326,327,328,329,33°; see also paint-
ing, craft of; professionalism, artists

theory of, 199, 208, 209, 230, 254
Dong Qichang, 203, 2°5, 212, 219,
228,250,256; "literati painting,"
180,186,205,206,207,208,209,
219, 339n60

Gong Xian, 206-7, 208, 209, 217, 218,
228, 285

lineage in, 212, 228, 250
Shirao's, 250-1, 270-2; see also man-
uals and treatises, Shitao's

Zha Shibiao, 361n49
see also manuals and treatises; painting,
craft of

peasants, see agriculture; rebellion, of
peasants; social structure, peasants

perception, 219, 220-1, 221-2, 270, 275,
276, 280

performance aesthetic, see visualiry of paint-
ing, in Shirao's work, performance
aesthetic

philanthropy, 18, 47, 148, 207, 254, 278;
see also public buildings

philosophy, 339"73
classical, 10, 274
early Qing, 60, 134, 207-8, 279, 287,

364n82,369n122
Ming, 105-6, 210, 279, 280, 364n50,
3690122

Shitao's, 272, 274-7, 368n91, 3690128
Song, lO6
see also ideology; metaphysics

pi (addiction, obsession), 64, Ill, 287, 288;
see also obsessions

place, 18, 74, 281
plays, see theater
poetry, III, 161, 224-6, 229, 282, 303
by Shitao, see NPI: Shitao, poetry
societies, 92, 102, 108, 113, 148, 149,

151,325
translated
anonymous, 225
Fei Mi, 62
Fei Xihuang, 63
Feng He, 67
Huang You, 70, 72, 73
Huang Yun, 305
Jiang Shijie, 133
Kangx:i,75
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Li Bai, 268-9
Li Lin, 65, 312
Mei Qing, 242
Qiao Yin, 66
Su Shi, 306
Zhang Zhu, 254-5, 367n53

see also iconography of painting, poetic
themes; publishing

poets
classical, 142, 173, 186, 187, 189, 191,
225-6,229,245,266,268-9,288

early Qing, 17, 52, 53, 62, 64, 68, 70,
100,112,134,148,151,152,168,200,
207, 239, 304~5,342n40,343n69,
361n7,371llI

Ming, 186, 187, 189, 191, 244-5, 288
women, 362nII
see also iconography of painting, figures,
poets

politics, see iconography of painting, land-
scape, political space of; ideology;
literary inquisition; loyalism, Ming;
wilderness; NPI: Shirao, identity, political

portraiture, see iconography of pai~ting,
figures, portraiture Iself-portralture

practical learning (shixue), 60, 207, 278
practicality, 207-8, 278, 279
praxis, 238, 258, 272, 274, 277, 278, 280,

281, 368n94
private, 4, r r S, 238, 279, 282-322 passim

vs. public, 13, 23-4, 25, 53, 81-2, 100,
104,108-9,122,135,278,282-3

see also history, wilderness
professionalism
artists
agents and intermediaries for, 30, 126-
7,128,148,151,I55,355n24,
359n138

business correspondence of, 351n66,

357"77 .
career painters (workshop-tramed), 20,
164,178, 179, 18o, 186, 193-4, 206,
208,2°9

literati professionals, 20, 42, 54, 155,
16a-l, 164, 168, 178-80, 194,204,
205-8,313

patronage relationships, 151-2, 358n92
payment and prices, 164-5, 197,
358n92, 359n122 .

of Shitao, see NPI: Shitao, professional-
ism of

see also painting, profession of
nonarrisrs, 19, 23, 30, 37, 42, 54, 161,
208, 239
writers, 133, 165, 168, 191, 195, 201,
302, Jl3

property, 3, 18, 45, 107, 146, 279, 349n111
psychic autonomy, see independence .
public buildings, construction {restoration of
Jingxian, 95, 346n48, 366n17
Nanjing, 254, 349nI°9
Shexian, 325> 345°31, 354n5
Xuancheng, 92, 93-4, 95, 97, 325
Yangzhou, 14, 18, 74, 75
Yizheng, 154
see also philanthropy

public, see opinion; private, vs. public;
sociability

publishing
manuscript, 64, 199, 209, 279, 35°1141,
360°34,364060

print
governmental, xvi, 10,18,81,82
private, 4, 81, 134, 152, 154, 168, 176,
199,208,287,304,3580n99,I05,
360n33,362nII

punishment, 27-8, 41, 71, 84,9°,34°025
of Chinese officials, 75, 81, 3490111.
371062

of loyalists, 37, 62, 69, 136
of Manchu dignitaries, 58, 80-1, 325
see also literary inquisition, 57-8, ] 68,
3370.1

qi (strangeness, originality), 220, 286
aesthetic ideal of, 21, 146, 206, 210, 254,

281
of landscape, 31, 3421145
of people, 3, 181, 282, 285, 286, 303

qing (feeling, subjective experience), 23, IIO,

210,226,290
qishi ("original")
painting by, xv, 21, 22-3, II4, 181, 204-

5,200,2°7,280,281,283,285,286
persona of, 24, 100, 179,207,254-5,
282, 286

see also painting, schools and traditions
of, Individualist

rapture, 244, 251, 266
rebellion, 278
of peasants, in southern Anhui (1674),93,

325
of Three Feudatories (1673-81), 68, 69,
71, 72, 93, 94, 98, 99, 105. 203, 325

of Zhang Xianzhong (1644-6), 61
religion, I, 3,9, 10, 238, 274
sorenology, 238-9, 281, 286
syncretism, 125, 242, 2.48
see also Buddhism; Daoism; iconography
of painting, figures, religious; meta-
physics; ritual

remnant subjects, see loyalism
resistance
loyalist
active, 17,40,65,67-8,71,72,88,9°,
95,99,323,324, 346n68; see also
rebellion; NPI: Fei Mi; Qu Dajun;
Wen Tianxiang

symbolic, 17, 37-8, 38, 40, 69, 100
to market, 301-2, 306
to modernity, 285

restaurants, see food, restaurants
restoration, see public buildings
ritual,369nm06,Il7
Buddhist, 144, 344n26
and dynastic fall, 38, 40, 100-1
death-related, see death, ritual related to

in practice of painting, 238, 239
private, 90, 310, 312
social, 180, 199, 287, 313
see also gifting



scholarship, 207, 278
seal carving, 136, 160, 165,324, 349nno,

355n27,362m3
seals, 127, 352n76

Shirao's, see NPI: Shitao, seals of
secularization, 278-9, 280
security, 4, 21, 24, 25, 28, 57, 113, 303
economic, 122, 123,3°3,3°4-6,317,

))8n48
in Shitao's painting, 285,3°3, 304-6, 308,
309,310,312

see also an
self, xvi, 23, 55, 56, 180-1, 185, 194, 204,

238,239,279,282,283,3°0
in Shitao's painting, 1I0, 113,179,180-4,
25°,280-1,284,3°5,308

in Shitao's writings, 214, 229, 274, 276,
281

self-consciousness, xviii, 24, 54-5
self-cultivation (zixiu), 97, 125, 186,208,

238,246,281
self-fashioning, 24, II I, 124
self-reliance, 23, 278, 285
sex, 3, 58, 75, 279, 286, 290,292,294-7;

see also desire
shi (member of educated elite), see social

structure
silver, 18, 19, 21, 146, 149, 163-4, 334;

see also professionalism, payment and
pnces

sociability, 4, 81-2,95,239,283,285-6,
3T3-I4, 315, 359m22

gatherings, 68, Il2, 163, 168,192,234,
245,288, )4In86, 355n23

outings, 13, 15, 31, 50, 52-3, 78, 97, 99,
152-3,168, r rg, 257, 348n93, 348-
9nI°9,358n103

see also poetry, societies
social structure, 12-13, 18-19, 19, 20-1, 24,

26-30,36,46-7,50,100,199,2°5,
206, 208, 278,338n48

artisans, 28, 30, 50, 208
painters as, 20, 144, 164, 178, 194,

199, 205, 206, 284
caste, 20, 27-8, 30, 100, 104, 129
class, 19, 20, 27, 30, 47,100,161,296,
)16

gentry, 20, 21, 24,28,30,31,35,36,45,
46-7,48,50,152,160,205,284,
346n68
of Yangzhou area, 132, 161, 168,235,

341n62
jianmin (pariahs), 27, 28, 30
merchants, 144, 199, 207, 208, 278, 285,

28; see also NPl: Huizhou (Anhui),
merchant connections to Yangzhou,
Shexian, families, as collectors/patrons;
Yangzhou, merchants in

peasants, 28-9, 30, 35, 46,79
shi (member of educated elite), 24, 28, 30,

34,35,36,46-8,50, 100,205,206,
234

412 SUBJECT INDEX

sociomoral hierarchy, 28,50,205,206,
207, 208

social theory, 207-8, 239
social unconscious, 24 285
Southern Tours, see NFl:Kangxi, Southern

Tours of; Wang Hui , supervision of
Southern Tour paintings

storytellers, 10, 14, 194
subjectivity, xviii, xix, 23, 2°9-1°, 218,

226, 239,283-5, 303; see also
authenticity; identity; qing; self;
self-consciousness

sumptuary regulations, 12, 50, 278; see also
dress and fashion; ideology

survival, 128, 278, 317,322
economic, 177,205-6, 286, 302,

369n128
physical, 28-9, 61-4, 96,112,136,279,

JI4,316
psychological, 302
symbols of, 17,38

taste, 19-21, 166,184-5,2°7,229,233,
283, 339n67

in Beijing, 106,2°3,255,327
in Yangzhou, 179,186,194

taxation, 22, 50, 125, 166, 207
tea, 8, 20, 148, 287,312-13,313
teaching, 60, 238-9, 277; see also academies;

Buddhism, teaching of; Daoism, and
painting, theorized by Shitao; painting,
teaching of

theater, IO, 38, 40,55-6,137,148,151,
179, 278, 286, 292,294; see also actors

theatricality, 21, 24,48, 53-6, 184, 287,
290, 294, 306

tombs, see graves; NPI: Zhongshan
tourism, 3I, 50, 53, 54, 310
tradition, xvii, xviii, 22, 23, 209, 228, 2.54,

363n41
travels, 18, 26,30,31-2,35,61-4,64-74,

190,202,34In4
of Shitao, see NPI: Shitao, travels; see also
specific city or region

see also iconography of painting, travel;
NPI: Huang You

urban environment, 5,6,8-10,12-15,17,
32-3, 60, 129

value, xvi, xviii, 23, 24, 149, 161, 164, 179,
180,185,194-5,197-8; see also moral
value

values, 282,283,341062
visualiry of painting, 20, 21, 22,195,2°7,

209-10,218-19,367°76
in Shitao's work, 2°3-5, 280-1
atmosphere, 60, 140, 148, 256, 295
classicism, 184-5, 230, 259, 354n4
clumsiness, 184, 297, 300, 301, 302
color, II3-14, 259-61, 288, 292,
294-5

composition, 38, 73-4,121,172-3,
217-18, 244-5, 266, 268, 269. 306,
310, 3Il, 318,320, 347n85

illusionism, 43,52,61,74,79,195,
342n45

inrervisualiry, 128-9, 184-5, 193-4,
226, 228-30, 230, 251

light, 221-2, 259, 269, 269-70
monochrome, 154,245,249,257
performance aesthetic, 171, 183-4,

250, 300
xiaosa ("bold and free") aesthetic, 170-
I, 176, 194, 260-1, 287, 294

see also painting, craft of and theory of

water management, 52, 53, 77-9
Western representation, 220-1, 283,

365nn89,91,370nI3
wilderness (interdynasric}, 24, 36,40-2, 53,

57,66,99,100,114,160,3°5
painting, see painting, schools and

traditions of, wilderness
poetry, 80
see also history, wilderness; mourning,

political
wine, 8, 20, 28, 52, 53, 64, 90, 106, 201,

233, 286, 306, JI3
and painting, 170, 183-4, 287, 290, 301,

359nI22
ritual use of, 62, 63, 318
Shitao's use of, 3, 29, 38, 83, 292, JI2,

314, 316
women, 3, 30, 64, 106, 229, 246-7, 279.

284,285,286, 363n32, 370°32
concubines, 3, 13,48, 287
courtesans and prostitutes, 179, 186, 286,

287,290,292,295-6
entertainers, 15, 80, 136, 359n122
female imagery

flower, 30, 186, 241, 247, 248, 257,
290, 292, 294-6

landscape, 370-1n38
mothers, 151, 191
painters, 160, 173, 179, 3°2, 370013
paintings of, 30, 176, 190-1, 193, 284,

292,369n8
palace women, 40, 80, 136
poets, 362nIl
"respectable" women, 27, 48
widows, 191, 279

woodblock illustration, 187, 189, 203, 204,
212,217-18,230,283,292,344nl1,
360n7,366029

workshop practice, 170-3, 176, 209, 193,
350n35

ghostpainting and workshop production,
xx, 3, 20, 1°7, 160, 172-3, 177

xiaosa aesthetic, see visuality of painting, in
Shitao's work, xiaosa aesthetic

xing (arousal, enthusiasm, excitement), 285,
288, 290, 296., 297



scholarship, 207, 278
seal carving, 136, 160, 165,324, 349nno,

355n27,362m3
seals, 127, 352n76

Shirao's, see NPI: Shitao, seals of
secularization, 278-9, 280
security, 4, 21, 24, 25, 28, 57, 113, 303
economic, 122, 123,3°3,3°4-6,317,

))8n48
in Shitao's painting, 285,3°3, 304-6, 308,
309,310,312

see also an
self, xvi, 23, 55, 56, 180-1, 185, 194, 204,

238,239,279,282,283,3°0
in Shitao's painting, 1I0, 113,179,180-4,
25°,280-1,284,3°5,308

in Shitao's writings, 214, 229, 274, 276,
281

self-consciousness, xviii, 24, 54-5
self-cultivation (zixiu), 97, 125, 186,208,

238,246,281
self-fashioning, 24, II I, 124
self-reliance, 23, 278, 285
sex, 3, 58, 75, 279, 286, 290,292,294-7;

see also desire
shi (member of educated elite), see social

structure
silver, 18, 19, 21, 146, 149, 163-4, 334;

see also professionalism, payment and
pnces

sociability, 4, 81-2,95,239,283,285-6,
3T3-I4, 315, 359m22

gatherings, 68, Il2, 163, 168,192,234,
245,288, )4In86, 355n23

outings, 13, 15, 31, 50, 52-3, 78, 97, 99,
152-3,168, r rg, 257, 348n93, 348-
9nI°9,358n103

see also poetry, societies
social structure, 12-13, 18-19, 19, 20-1, 24,

26-30,36,46-7,50,100,199,2°5,
206, 208, 278,338n48

artisans, 28, 30, 50, 208
painters as, 20, 144, 164, 178, 194,

199, 205, 206, 284
caste, 20, 27-8, 30, 100, 104, 129
class, 19, 20, 27, 30, 47,100,161,296,
)16

gentry, 20, 21, 24,28,30,31,35,36,45,
46-7,48,50,152,160,205,284,
346n68
of Yangzhou area, 132, 161, 168,235,

341n62
jianmin (pariahs), 27, 28, 30
merchants, 144, 199, 207, 208, 278, 285,

28; see also NPl: Huizhou (Anhui),
merchant connections to Yangzhou,
Shexian, families, as collectors/patrons;
Yangzhou, merchants in

peasants, 28-9, 30, 35, 46,79
shi (member of educated elite), 24, 28, 30,

34,35,36,46-8,50, 100,205,206,
234
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sociomoral hierarchy, 28,50,205,206,
207, 208

social theory, 207-8, 239
social unconscious, 24 285
Southern Tours, see NFl:Kangxi, Southern

Tours of; Wang Hui , supervision of
Southern Tour paintings

storytellers, 10, 14, 194
subjectivity, xviii, xix, 23, 2°9-1°, 218,

226, 239,283-5, 303; see also
authenticity; identity; qing; self;
self-consciousness

sumptuary regulations, 12, 50, 278; see also
dress and fashion; ideology

survival, 128, 278, 317,322
economic, 177,205-6, 286, 302,

369n128
physical, 28-9, 61-4, 96,112,136,279,

JI4,316
psychological, 302
symbols of, 17,38

taste, 19-21, 166,184-5,2°7,229,233,
283, 339n67

in Beijing, 106,2°3,255,327
in Yangzhou, 179,186,194

taxation, 22, 50, 125, 166, 207
tea, 8, 20, 148, 287,312-13,313
teaching, 60, 238-9, 277; see also academies;

Buddhism, teaching of; Daoism, and
painting, theorized by Shitao; painting,
teaching of

theater, IO, 38, 40,55-6,137,148,151,
179, 278, 286, 292,294; see also actors

theatricality, 21, 24,48, 53-6, 184, 287,
290, 294, 306

tombs, see graves; NPI: Zhongshan
tourism, 3I, 50, 53, 54, 310
tradition, xvii, xviii, 22, 23, 209, 228, 2.54,

363n41
travels, 18, 26,30,31-2,35,61-4,64-74,

190,202,34In4
of Shitao, see NPI: Shitao, travels; see also
specific city or region

see also iconography of painting, travel;
NPI: Huang You

urban environment, 5,6,8-10,12-15,17,
32-3, 60, 129

value, xvi, xviii, 23, 24, 149, 161, 164, 179,
180,185,194-5,197-8; see also moral
value

values, 282,283,341062
visualiry of painting, 20, 21, 22,195,2°7,

209-10,218-19,367°76
in Shitao's work, 2°3-5, 280-1
atmosphere, 60, 140, 148, 256, 295
classicism, 184-5, 230, 259, 354n4
clumsiness, 184, 297, 300, 301, 302
color, II3-14, 259-61, 288, 292,
294-5

composition, 38, 73-4,121,172-3,
217-18, 244-5, 266, 268, 269. 306,
310, 3Il, 318,320, 347n85

illusionism, 43,52,61,74,79,195,
342n45

inrervisualiry, 128-9, 184-5, 193-4,
226, 228-30, 230, 251

light, 221-2, 259, 269, 269-70
monochrome, 154,245,249,257
performance aesthetic, 171, 183-4,

250, 300
xiaosa ("bold and free") aesthetic, 170-
I, 176, 194, 260-1, 287, 294

see also painting, craft of and theory of

water management, 52, 53, 77-9
Western representation, 220-1, 283,

365nn89,91,370nI3
wilderness (interdynasric}, 24, 36,40-2, 53,

57,66,99,100,114,160,3°5
painting, see painting, schools and

traditions of, wilderness
poetry, 80
see also history, wilderness; mourning,

political
wine, 8, 20, 28, 52, 53, 64, 90, 106, 201,

233, 286, 306, JI3
and painting, 170, 183-4, 287, 290, 301,

359nI22
ritual use of, 62, 63, 318
Shitao's use of, 3, 29, 38, 83, 292, JI2,

314, 316
women, 3, 30, 64, 106, 229, 246-7, 279.

284,285,286, 363n32, 370°32
concubines, 3, 13,48, 287
courtesans and prostitutes, 179, 186, 286,

287,290,292,295-6
entertainers, 15, 80, 136, 359n122
female imagery

flower, 30, 186, 241, 247, 248, 257,
290, 292, 294-6

landscape, 370-1n38
mothers, 151, 191
painters, 160, 173, 179, 3°2, 370013
paintings of, 30, 176, 190-1, 193, 284,

292,369n8
palace women, 40, 80, 136
poets, 362nIl
"respectable" women, 27, 48
widows, 191, 279

woodblock illustration, 187, 189, 203, 204,
212,217-18,230,283,292,344nl1,
360n7,366029

workshop practice, 170-3, 176, 209, 193,
350n35

ghostpainting and workshop production,
xx, 3, 20, 1°7, 160, 172-3, 177

xiaosa aesthetic, see visuality of painting, in
Shitao's work, xiaosa aesthetic

xing (arousal, enthusiasm, excitement), 285,
288, 290, 296., 297




